
Chapter 632 Qju Mu-Cheng's Shock 

"Yes, there are" replied Ye Fan softly without 
hesitation. 

Chen Nan was instantly stunned. 

Her lovely eyes glinted inexplicably as she 
gazed at Ye Fan in a daze. 

Chen Nan was merely touched by the story and 
was just asking randomly. 

She thought Ye Fan would give a vague answer. 

But Ye Fan unexpectedly replied so resolutely! 

It felt as though Ye Fan was absolutely 
confident that immortals existed. 

"Fan, are you for real? Are there really 
immortals in the world?" asked Chen Nan 
again. 

Ye Fan remained expressionless. Then 
moments later, he replied with a smile, "Of 
course, there are! I know because I happen to 
be one." 

Ye Fan's lofty words echoed under the milky 

way. 

Chen Nan instantly laughed nonstop when she 
heard him. 



Chapter 632 Qju Mu-Cheng's Shock 

Her bright melodious laughter sounded lovely 

"Why? Don't you believe me?" said Ye Fan as he 
laughed. 

Chen Nan nodded and said, "I believe you. I 
believe everything Fan says. I just hope you can 
take me along when you rise to take your place 
in heaven one day." 

Ye Fan smiled. A long while later, all he said 
was 'okay. 

"Promise?" asked Chen Nan as she laughed. 

"Deal!" replied Ye Fan readily. 

The corners of Shen Fei's eyes twitched 
nonstop as he listened to their conversation 

Ye Fan was certainly Mr Chu. He was 
unsurpassable when it came to hitting on girls! 

Shen Fei was truly impressed with Ye Fan. 

Ye Fan had power, but Shen Fei was even more 
impressed by how he hit on girls. 

Shen Fei once thought that Ye Fan kept a low 
profile so he could hit on girls. He even 
suspected that was how Ye Fan managed to 

get Qiu Mu-Cheng. 
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Was he hitting on Chen Nan now? 

Weren't they as close as brothers? 

Couldn't Ye Fan let Shen Fei have Chen Nan? 

Shen Fei felt glum about it but didn't dare to 

complain. 

Shen Fei wasn't alone since even Chen Nan 

thought Ye Fan was pandering to her when he 
said so. 

After all, it was common knowledge that 
immortals only exist in fairy tales. 

How could they really exist? 

Time passed quickly as they chatted on their 

way there 

After they arrived at the Mount Yunyang scenic 
district, they showed the staff their tickets. 
Then they were taken to the reception area. 

There weren't a lot of tourists in the scenic 
zone, and there were probably more staff than 
visitors.

Instead, the foot of Mount Yunyang was 
bustling with activity. 

Then again, this was only normal. Only 100 
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visitors were allowed in the hot spring each day, 
so all the visitors were from elite families. All 
the other commoners could only admire it from 
the foot of the mountain. 

The precious commodity was already under the 
tight control of the rich and powerful. 

It was impossible for commoners to access it. 

"Sir, the reception is located in the hotel lobby 
straight ahead. Just go in and wait. Once 
everyone is present, someone will allocate a 
hot spring to you' came the staff's voice from 
the side. 

There was more than one hot spring from the 
sound of it, and they had to be allocated 

accordingly. 

"Brother Fa, let's go over. If we go early, we 
might get a better hot spring 

Shen Fei couldn't wait once he heard about the 
allocation, so he hurried Ye Fan and Chen Nan 
along and ran straight for the luxurious hotel. 

The hotel lobby was particularly Iively. 

Many rich men's sons were chatting with their 
girlfriends' on their arms. 

The waiters walked around, sending red wine. 



Chapter 632 Qju Mu-Cheng's Shock 

At the center of the hall, many youngsters 
embraced each other and did western dances. 

Melodious music reverberated by their ears. 

All sorts of rare delicacies were placed on the 
long table. 

It was every bit an extravagant high society 
event. 

"It looks someone isn't here yet, so we can only 
wait" said Shen Fei. 

The hot spring allocation could only happen 

after all the guests were here. 

Then Shen Fei and Ye Fan found some seats 
and sat down to wait together quietly. 

And Chen Nan went to the bathroom. 

Then a party of three walked in through the 
door 

"Wow! There are so many people here" 
exclaimed one of the pretty girls in delight after 
she walked in through the door. 

But she was so engrossed by the sight that she 
failed to watch her step. 

AH! 

6 
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There was a scream. Su Qian stepped on 
someone's foot and tripped in the process. 

She staggered a few steps and almost fell. 

But Su Qian knew she was at fault, so she 

hurriedly apologized. 

"T'm sorry. I'm sorry. I wasn't paying attention 
I'm really sorry," said Su Qian as she hung her 

head and apologized nervously. 

She knew that all the people in here hailed from 
rich and powerful families from important 
cities. 

Since any random one of them was probably 
Ma Ming-Bo's equal, Su Qian didn't dare to 
provoke them and apologized politely 

"It's okay. I'm fine" said a calm voice quietly. 

But Su Qian shuddered the moment she heard 
this voice. 

The pretty woman behind Su Qian shivered as 
well. 

Both of them raised their heads to look at each 
other almost at the same time. 

Su Qian was so shocked that her eyes nearly 
popped from their sockets when she caught 
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sight of the man's lovely profile. 

"Heavens! Ye..Ye Fan? It's you?! Why are you 
here? No, how did you get in? Did you sneak 
in?" said Su Qian with a nasty expression on her 
face 

Su Qian brought Qiu Mu-Cheng along so that 
she would stay far away from Ye Fan and have 
fun for a day. 

But she didn't expect Ye Fan to turnup 
everywhere they went and even end up 
appearing here. 

Qiu Mu-Cheng was clearly surprised as well. 

Just as she was about to speak, she started 
seething in anger the moment she caught sight 
of Shen Fei. 

This scoundrel! 

Sure enough, Ye Fan got in because of Shen 
Fei. 

Ye Fan didn't listen to a word Qiu Mu-Cheng 
said yesterday. 

How was Ye Fan going to return Shen Fei's 
favors in the future? 

Qiu Mu-Cheng was so mad that fumes were 
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about to spew from her ears. 

Ye Fan ignored Su Qian. Since Ye Fan already 
detested this girlfriend of Qiu Mu-Cheng's, he 
naturally couldn't be bothered with her. 

Instead, he gazed towards Qiu Mu-Cheng, who 
was in front of him, with a profound look in his 

eyes. 

Ye Fan looked at her as he sneered, "I called 
you, but you refused to answer. Shen Fei said 
you might be working. But from the looks of it, 
we were mistaken. The only thing you are busy 
with is having fun with Young Master Ma." 

"Humph. Is it any of your business?" replied Qju 
Mu-Cheng angrily as she remained resentful of 
Ye Fan. 

Ma Ming-Bo undoubtedly noticed Ye Fan was 
around too. 

He instantly sneered, "Fan, don't you think 
you're a little too thick-skinned? Last night, 
Qianqian just broke up with you, but here you 
are, hitting on her best friend? I only used to 
think that people from the countryside were 
poor, but from the looks of it now, they have 
loose morals too." 



Chapter 633 Apologize! 

Ma Ming-Bo was clearly unaware of Ye Fan and 
Qiu Mu-Cheng's relationship. Judging from their 
conversation, he merely thought that Ye Fan 
was shamelessly courting Qiu Mu-Cheng after 
failing to win Su Qian's heart. 

But Ma Ming-Bo had to admit Qju Mu-Cheng 
was a rare beauty. 

So Ma Ming-Bo made plans to hit on both of 
them. 

If Ma Ming-Bo could win them both, he would 
have a girlfriend anda spare. Wouldn't Ma 
Ming-Bo have the time of his life if he could 
take down both these gorgeous ladies? 

Ma Ming-Bo couldn't help feeling upset when 
Ye Fan harassed Qiu Mu-Cheng, so he smiled 
coldly at Ye Fan. 

"Fan, before you attempt to hit on both 
Qianqian and Miss Su, I suggest you take a 
hard look in the mirror and don't overestimate 
yourself. It's tragic how you came out for a 
good time without even bringing a date. Come 
to think of it; it makes sense. Is there any 
woman who wants to hang out with a pauper 
like you? Even if she existed, she is probably 
unwanted and as ugly as hell" sneered Ma 
Ming-Bo with smugness brimming from his 
eyes. 
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After all, Ye Fan didn't even have a date, while 
he was in the company of two stunning 
beauties, so he naturally felt smug about it in 
his heart. An intense sense of superiority 
emerged. 

But shortly after Ma Ming-Bo spoke, a delighted 
voice came from behind. 

"Fan, come here. The scenery over there is 

fantastic! 

Chen Nan had come back from the bathroom 
and was pulling Ye Fan outside. 

But Ma Ming-Bo went dumbstruck when he saw 
who the woman was. 

His face twitched in nervously, and it felt as 
though someone had slapped him in his face. 
"Miss...Miss Chen?" 

"Fan...Fan?" cried Ma Ming-Bo uncontrollably. 

Of course, Ma Ming-Bo knew Chen Nan. 

Before Mr Chu rose to power, Chen Nan's father, 
Chen Ao, was the King of Jiangdong. She was 
Chen Ao's only daughter, and many rich young 
men were mesmerized by her and dreamed of 
winning her hand. 

The same was true for Ma Ming-Bo. 
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Sadly, Chen Nan ignored him even though he 
visited her several times. 

Then Ma Ming-Bo gave up and set his sights on 
something lower and courted Su Qian instead. 

But Ma Ming-Bo didn't dream of seeing Chen 
Nan being so close to Ye Fan and even holding 
hands! 

"How can you do that? Miss Chen, given your 
status, how can you let this country bumpkin 
sully you? Ye Fan, let go of Miss Chen's hand, 
you scum!" shouted Ma Ming-Bo furiously with 
his eyes red. 

"How dare you! How dare you talk to Fan like 
that? Apologize!" 

Chen Nan usually behaved like a little girl in 
front of Ye Fan. 

But she instantly exploded like an angry cat the 
moment Ye Fan was humiliated and started 
reprimanding Ma Ming-Bo coldly. 

Ma Ming-Bo was so upset that he almost 
coughed blood. 

After all, he had courted Chen Nan for months. 
Didn't Chen Nan recognize him at all? 

"Miss Chen, he's Ma Ming-Bo, the eldest son of 
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the Ma family, so he's super influential! He even 
insulted you and said only people who were 
ugly as hell would hang out with Brother Fan" 
said Shen Fei as he sneered and fanned the 
flames. 

Ma Ming-Bo's face turned livid and wanted to 
kick Shen Fei badly. 

"Are you Shen Fei? The Su family might fear 

you, but the Ma family doesn't. The Shen family 
is merely Master Li Er's dog, while the Mas are 
equals with the Lis. How dare you provoke 
me? scolded Ma Ming-Bo with his face dark. 

Shen Fei was fearless. He peeled an orange as 
he said calmly, "You're right, Young Master Ma. 
Your family is powerful, and I, Shen Fei, cant 
afford to offend you, but that doesn't mean no 
one else can. I suggest you apologize now that 
you have pissed Brother Fan off. Or else, even 
your father can't save you! 

"Do you want to die?" asked Ma Ming-Bo 
furiously when Shen Fei gave him such a poor 
attitude. 

Chen Nan had already walked over. She looked 
at Ma Ming-Bo with hostility as she said, "The 
Ma family, right? I remember you. Back then, 
your father, Ma Ying-Dong, once provoked the 
Chen family. In the end, your grandfather made 
him kneel at our door to apologize, so Dad let 
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you off. I thought the Ma family would have 
learned their lesson, but you continue to be 
arrogant. I will say it again. Apologize to Fan" 

Although Chen Nan was a woman, her words 
sounded so imposing that even Ma Ming-Bo's 
back broke into a cold sweat unknowingly. 

In the end, Ma Ming-Bo caved in to Chen Nan's 

might. 

He clenched his fists tightly and looked 
resentfully at Ye Fan. 

"Count yourself lucky,. you brat! On account of 
Miss Chen, I will apologize to you. But Ye Fan, 
how long can Miss Chen protect you for?" 
sneered Ma Ming-Bo as he reluctantly 
apologized and left quickly. 

Su Qian turned and glanced at him before 

pulling Qiu Mu-Cheng away. 

"Mu-Cheng, does Ye Fan know Chen Ao's 
daughter? He's poor, but he sure knows a lot of 
people in high places!" sighed Su Qian 

inconceivably. 

After Ma Ming-Bo left, the place became 

tranquil again. 

"Haha! Miss Chen is so domineering! You sure 
are your father's daughter, and the apple 
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doesn't fall far from the tree" laughed Shen Fei 
as he said. 

Chen Nan was younger than Shen Fei. 

But given the Chen family's influence, Shen Fei 
naturally addressed her as 'Miss'. 

Similarly, even though Shen Fei was older than 
Ye Fan, he called him 'Brother Fan' too. After all, 

he was more capable them him. 

Shen Fei was only good enough to be their 
sidekicks. 

"Humph! They were the ones who insulted Fan!" 
said Chen Nan angrily. 

"Fan, although Ma Ming-Bo apologized, he 
didn't do it wholeheartedly. I'm worried that he 
might target you from now on" said Chen Nan 

Worriedly. 

Shen Fei calmly laughed as he said, "Haha! 
What's there to be afraid of? If things get messy 
and Brother Fan reveals his identity, no matter 
who they are, everyone has to cower in fear!" 

Shen Fei chuckled. 

With Ye Fan around, even if it were the crowned 
prince of the Lei family, Lei Ao-Ting, Shen Fei 
had nothing to fear! 
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Chen Nan laughed too and said, "That's true. 
Fan is too low profile. I almost forgot how 
capable he is. Teehee!" 

Ma Ming-Bo walked across the hall with a glum 
look on his face and headed to a private room 
in the hotel while Chen Nan and the others 
chatted. 

Chen Nan had just used her power to suppress 

Ma Ming-Bo and embarrassed him publicly, so 
he was naturally upset. 

"That area is out of bounds to the general 
public, so l don't think we should go in any 
further?" reminded Su Qian. 

Ma Ming-Bo waved his hand and said deeply. 
"Qianqian, it's fine. Come with me. I'll bring 
everyone in to see a big shot. He's so influential 
that not even Chen Nan can compare to him." 
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