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Chapter 4261: : Qingyun Temple (5)

Xue Zhengxin's courage is good, facing Li Tian and Tang Xiaolong, who have already jumped in 
the air, and are not close to him, there is no trace of fear on their faces.

Huh!

Huh!

The blades in the hands of these venerables cut through the air, making a crisp, harsh sound.

Before Li Tian landed on the ground, the heavenly spear was already in his hand. Facing the attack 
of the two venerables, Li Tian slammed forward, avoiding the attack of the venerable behind him, 
and took advantage of the trend to move the heavenly spear forward. With one pass, he blocked the 
attack of the venerable before him.

Li Tian's wrist spun violently, and the Heavenly Qiong Spear in his hand was like a blue dragon 
coming out of the cave, and the Heavenly Qiong Spear stab at the Venerable in front of him.

One inch is strong!

What's more, Li Tian didn't have the slightest hidden strength in the face of the two venerables. The 
purple electric dragon on the spear of the sky rushed towards that venerable.

A trace of horror appeared involuntarily on the face of that venerable, and he continuously 
teleported to avoid Li Tian's attack.

There was a sneer at the corner of Li Tian's mouth, he suddenly turned around to kill a carbine, and 
stabbed the Venerable behind him who was chasing Li Tian like a tarsal maggot.

The Venerable was slightly surprised when he saw the purple electric dragon on Li Tian's body, but 
this astonishment flashed across his face, and what was revealed was mockery instead.

"The cultivator's ninth-level peak realm possesses such a powerful offensive power. You are really a 
genius. Unfortunately, Lao Tzu is called the terminator genius! Since you are here today, take this 
underground palace as your grave!"

As soon as his voice fell, a figure flashed in front of him!

Suddenly, this figure appeared. With the appearance of this figure, a coercion instantly shrouded his 
body, and then a black light flashed in front of his eyes. Could it be that the black light flashed 
across his neck with chill!

It's too fast!

The venerable hadn't seen clearly what the black shadow appeared, he found that his neck was 
spraying blood continuously!

Gradually, a woman appeared in his pupils.

"How come? How did this woman appear here?"

The face of this venerable man was full of astonishment, and he couldn't understand how Situ 
Ningbing suddenly appeared in a place where the venerable teleportation was imprisoned.



But all this is too late!

The blood in his body is spraying out like a collapsed dam!

In an instant, blood entered the clothes on his chest to get wet, and the venerable knelt to the ground 
weakly, and then fell weakly to the ground.

"Trash! Trash! Two venerables can kill a ninth-level cultivator with trash, what a **** trash!" Xue 
Zhengxin roared angrily.

"My son, I'm afraid this kid is not easy!" said a venerable person beside Xue Zhengxin.

"How to say?"

"This underground palace venerable strongman will be imprisoned by teleportation, but this female 
venerable suddenly appears. This shows that this kid probably has a space treasure that can 
accommodate living people!"

"Haha, caring is chaotic, I didn't even think of this! In that case, what are you waiting for? Follow 
me!" Xue Zhengxin said excitedly.

On the other side, Tang Xiaolong was entangled by the two venerables!

Tang Xiaolong faced the pincer attack of the two venerables. He was passive everywhere. Several 
times he tried to teleport out to protect Li Tian, but the two venerables perfectly cooperated and 
destroyed it!

The idea of these two venerables is very simple. They have an absolute advantage, as long as they 
are going to hold Tang Xiaolong, and then wait until Li Tian is beheaded by the other two 
venerables, so that they can use the four venerables, Even more Venerables joined forces to kill 
Tang Xiaolong!

But they never expected that a female Venerable would suddenly appear, and it was their Venerable 
teammate who was beheaded first.

Riding on the panic of these two venerables, Tang Xiaolong finally got a respite.

"The tenth stage of the Great Perfection Realm of the Tenth Refining Body is really troublesome. It 
has to be prepared for a long time. But fortunately, I finally caught up! Now I should fight back, 
Tang Xiaolong!" Tang Xiaolong grinned. White teeth, heart.

"Laughing? This kid is laughing? He is still in the mood to laugh when he is about to die?"

There was a hint of sarcasm on the faces of the two venerables at the same time. The two looked at 
each other and said at the same time: "The son is already angry and can't drag it down! Solve the 
battle as quickly as possible!"

Huh!

Huh!

When the two of them attacked Tang Xiaolong with coercive force, the attack speed of the blade in 
their hands was faster. They believed that the black monkey in front of them could not avoid their 
attacks by teleporting.

Sure enough, as they expected, Tang Xiaolong stood still and didn't even want to avoid the blade.



Cang!

Cang!

Two consecutive metal-like crashes came from the body of Tang Xiaolong, their blades were curled 
up, but Tang Xiaolong was unscathed! And Tang Xiaolong took the opportunity of these two 
venerables to get close to his body, and both fists hit the two venerable bodies at the same time!

boom!

boom!

Two loud noises rang out from the bodies of these two venerables, and these fists with a gravity of 
more than several hundred thousand catties blasted their bodies apart in an instant!

Two venerables fell to the ground at the same time, Tang Xiaolong completed the venerable double 
kill!

At this time, the venerables who besieged Li Tian saw the black flames on Li Tian's arms and the 
Qiong Spear of the sky, and their faces instantly changed color.

"Blood Spirit Source! It turned out to be the Blood Spirit Source! I didn't expect the blood spirit 
source to be snatched away by this kid!"

Chapter 4262: : The target of all targets (1)

"It turns out to be the blood spirit source, and only by cultivating the blood spirit source can you 
cultivate this kind of black flame spiritual power!"

"It's no wonder that those strong men who came from Lingshan ten years ago said that they didn't 
grab the blood spirit source. It turns out that this blood spirit source was snatched away by this kid, 
and he has been practicing for ten years!"

The square of Qingyun Temple, which was full of murderous intent just now, was quiet for an 
instant. Except for the one-horned Venerable who was still trembling with the vicious dog, all the 
Venerables looked at Li Tian with enthusiasm, and then slowly came towards Li Tianwei!

These venerables have not only the followers of the venerable in blood and faith, but also the 
followers of other royal families and descendants of the domain masters. .

The other cultivators who were lucky enough to not die took this opportunity to seize the time to 
escape, and tens of thousands of cultivators at the level of cultivators escaped on all sides within a 
few minutes.

"My son, those cultivators have escaped!" said the venerable Xue Zhengxin beside him.

Xue Zhengxin’s face was full of excitement. He had completely ignored the fleeing cultivators, and 
said with a smile: “It doesn’t matter, this underground palace is a maze. They can’t escape, even if 
they all escape, the cultivators in this battlefield of death There are many apprentices, and 
everything in Qingyun Palace will be ours sooner or later."

"However, our top priority is to grab the blood spirit source first! We have already missed an 
opportunity. These guys took the initiative to send them to the door. We can't miss it anymore!" Xue 
Zhengxin said.



"Blood Zheng believes, this Netherworld is not only the domain master of the blood domain, you 
too don't take others as a matter? Have you asked us what to do?" A cultivator nine walked out of 
the crowd. Said the man with the highest level of strength.

The corner of Xue Zhengxin's mouth turned up slightly, and he said with a sneer: "Who am I? I 
turned out to be a descendant of the Territory Master of Fragmented Tower! Let me think about it, 
you are the grandson of the first generation of Territory Master of Fragmented Tower? "

"Oh, by the way, in terms of seniority, you should still call me Grandpa Grandpa! Are you talking to 
Grandpa Grandpa?"

"Blood Zhengxin, you..."

"What are you? You are just the grandson of the Lord of the Tower of Fragment. With these 
venerable entourages around you, do you think you are qualified to play with me? I can let you 
enter this underground palace to **** the Supreme Mansion I’ve done my best to you, don’t you 
still want to see if this blood spiritual source is not successful?" Xue Zhengxin sneered.

When the descendants of the Broken Tower Domain Lord entered the Lingshan, they had fought 
with another descendant of the Domain Lord. Only half of the sixty or seventy Venerables around 
him left Lingshan alive!

This allowed the descendants of the Broken Tower Domain Lord to withdraw from the battle for the 
blood spirit source early!

The Thunderbird tribe man next to the descendants of the Broken Tower domain said with a sneer: 
"You can't say that. We are willing to cooperate with you to deal with the Supreme Palace because 
of the spiritual source, but we did not say not to **** the blood spiritual source!"

"I also know that your blood Zhengxin came prepared this time, and the strength is now the 
strongest in this underground palace, but our other emperor and the descendants of the domain 
master are not weak when combined!"

"If you just want to use these few spiritual sources to send us away, it would be too small for us! If 
you want a blood spiritual source, you can, see how much you can take out to convince us!"

The members of the Thunderbird tribe are all pointed monkey cheeks with a pair of wings growing 
on the back, which is somewhat similar to the appearance of the Lei Zhenzi in ancient Chinese 
legends.

Since this Thunderbird man dared to interject, his identity is naturally extraordinary. What's more 
important is that there are nearly forty Venerables surrounding this Thunderbird man. His power is 
second only to this man. Blood is faithful.

Xue Zhengxin glanced at the Thunderbird clan man, with a disdainful expression on his face, and 
said: "Persuade you? It depends on you not worthy to negotiate terms with me! If I remember 
correctly, the Emperor Thunder has not broken through to the domain owner. Realm, and he is still 
under the command of the Lord of the Blood Territory! Even if Lord Thunder sees me, he will call 
me Young Master, what are you?"

"Fortunately, this is the battlefield of death. If you were in the Nether Realm just now, do you 
believe that Lord Thunder will use sky thunder to kill you in order to please the Lord of the Blood 
Domain? Have to wait a thousand years!"



"And you? Do you also want the blood spirit source? Don't forget, if I took you to the Vagrant City 
and I took you to the underground palace, can you **** so many spirit sources?" Xue Zhengxin 
again Pointing to other people and asked.

In addition to the two descendants of Emperor Lei Gong and the domain master of Broken Tower, 
here are the descendants of some powerful experts in the Netherworld.

There are many and few followers of their venerables. The most venerable ones have eleven or two, 
and the fewest ones are only seven or eight!

These super venerable people naturally know that they are not qualified to compete with Xue 
Zhengxin for the blood spirit source, but let them watch Xue Zhengxin take the blood spirit source 
away from Li Tian, and Xue Zhengxin will take the blood spirit source from Li Tian. Things are 
taken away, and their hearts are extremely unbalanced!

"Xuezhengxin, don't be greedy..."

"You want to swallow the things in the Qingyun Temple alone, you want to swallow the blood 
source, you want to swallow this space treasure, don't you think the rest of us are beggars?"

These guys hid behind the shattered tower domain masters and the thunder king emperor's queens, 
talking babbledly.

Looking at the reactions of these people, the faces of the descendants of the Broken Tower Domain 
Lord have more power and confidence.

He took a step forward and said: "Blood believes that I advise you not to be too greedy. Since 
everyone has sacrificed their lives to enter this underground palace, no one is good! Now this 
underground palace is the strongest, but if we join hands, Weak! Do you really want to shoot and 
lose and lose?"

"The descendants of the Lord of the Blood Domain, the descendants of the Lord of the Broken 
Tower, and the descendants of the Emperor Thunder, the three of us are the strongest, but no one 
wants to swallow the blood source, the things in the Azure Cloud Palace, and the space on this kid. 
Treasure! One for each of the three of us!"

"What space treasure?" the blood domain master said stupidly.

"I can see clearly just now, which of the huge monsters and the female venerable all appeared in an 
instant. There must be space treasures on him! You can choose the things in the Qingyun Temple or 
the blood spirit source, but this The treasures in the space must be handed over to me!" said the 
descendants of the Broken Tower domain master.

This space treasure that can hold living people must have reached the realm of space artifacts. The 
descendants of the Broken Tower domain master naturally know that this space artifact is probably 
no worse than the things in the blood spirit source and the Qingyun Temple.

Xue Zhengxin's face is very ugly, but now this situation is completely beyond his control!

There are too many good things exposed on Li Tian, blood Zhengxin really can't swallow it alone!

"Even if the space artifact and blood spirit source are handed over to you, there will still be 490 
years left before the secret realm of the battlefield of death will be opened. Do you really think you 



can leave the battlefield of death alive? Humph, I will promise you first, When the things in the 
Qingyun Temple arrive, I will do it to you!" Xue Zheng thought in confidence.

"Okay, I promise you!"

Chapter 4263: : The target of all targets (2)

The words of those descendants of the domain master, the emperor, and the super venerable Li Tian 
stopped in his ears without falling to the ground. ,

Li Tian feels that he is really dying!

The black flames that were unintentionally released during the battle with those venerables could be 
recognized by these guys as the spiritual power of the blood spirit source. Stealing chickens can't 
eclipse the rice. Now it is impossible to attack the blood Zhengxin, but it has become a target of 
public criticism. .

While avoiding the siege of other venerables, Li Tian paid attention to the changes on the square of 
Qingyun Temple.

The vicious dog is fighting vigorously with the Venerable Unicorn. The vicious dog has the slightest 
tribal disadvantage, and even suppresses the Venerable Unicorn faintly. It seems that there is no way 
this stuff can give Li Tian and the others more help.

I don’t know if Liu You’s brain was caught by the door or kicked by a donkey. This **** was 
rummaging through the dead man’s corpse of the Refugee Supreme. This guy must not help Li Tian. 
Li Tian can only pray. Don't mess with this guy.

Looking at the Qingyun Temple Square, there are probably about 300 venerables belonging to 17 or 
8 forces.

Now Xuezhengxin, the descendants of the Broken Tower domain master, and the descendants of 
Emperor Lei Gong have reached a consensus, but they obviously underestimated the ambitions of 
the other fourteenth and five-party super-venerable descendants, so the fairies have not reached a 
consensus.

Li Tian knew that once these guys reached a consensus, then Li Tian would really become the target 
of the public. Even if Li Tian brought the Three Young Masters and others out of space, Li Tian had 
no chance of winning.

Of course, Li Tian can now abandon the vicious dog and Liu You, and take Situ Ningbing and Tang 
Xiaolong into the space as he did in the Lingshan cave.

The danger of hiding for ten or eight years is naturally relieved!

But Li Tian was reluctant to bear Qingyun!

Fortunately, there are only six or seven venerables who believe in blood are besieging Li Tian and 
the others, which prevents Li Tian, Situ Ningbing and Tang Xiaolong from being in a hurry and can 
barely cope.

Cang!

Cang!



Tang Xiaolong used his body to block behind Li Tian, blocking the two venerables' attacks on Li 
Tian.

But Tang Xiaolong didn't have time to breathe, and once again teleported to the right side of Situ 
Ningbing, using his arms to block the attack of another venerable.

"Li, make a decision quickly, we will be in danger if we drag on like this!" Situ Ningbing said.

Li Tian frowned slightly, and he had an idea immediately.

Huh!

Li Tian teleported to the side of Situ Ningbing, stretched out his hand to send Situ Ningbing into the 
space of Void Yasha, and then Li Tian teleported again and dodged continuously, and brought Tang 
Xiaolong to the space of Void Yasha.

However, Li Tian did not enter the space of Void Yasha, but hid in the space of the Qiong Lance of 
Heaven.

In the space of Void Yasha, Tang Xiaolong saw that Li Tian had not come in, and couldn't help but 
said anxiously: "Why hasn't the little boss come back yet? Did he go to save Liu You? No, if I want 
to save Liu You, I have to follow. Go together, Void Yasha, you send me out!"

Void Yacha gave Tang Xiaolong a white look, and said, "Master Li Tian has already made plans, but 
if you are outside, you will definitely hurt Master Li Tian, so you just stay here obediently!"

Although Situ Ningbing didn't know what Li Tian had planned, but now she could only trust Li 
Tian.

"Xiaolong, there are more than 300 venerables outside. If we go out rashly, we will be in danger. 
Now we can only trust Li Tian. When we need us, we can fight with all our strength!"

...

In the space of the Qiong Spear of the Sky, Li Tian was immediately surrounded by the Third Young 
Master and others as soon as he came out.

"Big brother, what's the situation outside now? When can we fight? Brothers are already gearing up, 
and they are all ready to do a big fight!" Long Aotian said to Li Tian.

"Brother, have you entered the underground palace now? Is Xue Zhengxin right outside? As long as 
I say killing blood Zhengxin, my brothers for the past twenty years are not afraid of death for the 
entourage of the venerable brothers, and they will not give up!" Zhao Ritian also Said.

"Yes! That's right! We want revenge!" the other sages agreed.

Ye Liangchen immediately took out his majesty as his eldest brother and said: "Shut up all to me, 
now let Li Tian make arrangements!".

"I rub? Who is the eldest brother? You or me? I always steal the limelight from Li Tian. If I don't 
have time to be honest with you now, I must teach you a lesson!" Li Tian thought in his heart.

Li Tian roughly said a few words about the situation outside. Hearing that there were more than 300 
venerables outside, these guys immediately shut up and said nothing.

No chance!



If there is only blood right now, they are still full of confidence!

But now that there are so many nobles and so many forces outside, these followers of the Third 
Young Master couldn't help but feel a little discouraged.

Li Tian smiled slightly and said, "Don't look at Xue Zhengxin and they have reached a preliminary 
consensus, but what these guys lack most is trust. Once there is a turmoil, these guys will definitely 
protect themselves first!"

"So, what we have to do now is to destroy their direct mutual trust and let these seventeen or eight 
parties fight each other. Only in this way can we have a chance. It is also very simple to destroy 
their direct mutual trust. Zhao Ritian, you just If anyone wants to let him stand up, I promise to 
fulfill his wish!"

"Is it asking us to go out and commit suicide? Although we are willing to take revenge, but let me 
explode, I don't want to!" These venerables did not dare to look at Li Tian's eyes, lowering their 
heads and thinking wildly.

Blasting is not simply destruction, it is also the destruction of spirit and soul.

People in the Netherworld believe in the reincarnation of life and death. Even if a person dies, they 
will enter the six reincarnations, and they may continue to be human in the next life. But once it 
explodes, the spirit and soul will be destroyed, and the person who exploded will completely 
dissipate.

"Master Li Tian, I am willing!"

Venerable Dongshan stood out!

"I am willing too!"

Venerable Xishan said afterwards.

"And us!"

Venerable Nanshan and Beishan said at the same time.

Seeing Li Tian's entourage, and then looking at their own entourage, the third son of You Ming 
couldn't help feeling a fiery pain on his face.

"It's all a bunch of waste!" Zhao Ritian cursed.

Li Tian didn't pay attention to the three young masters and their entourage, but whispered and 
whispered to the four mountains.

After listening to Li Tian's words, Venerable Four Mountains immediately stated: "Master Li Tian, 
you can safely leave it to us!"

"Okay! As long as you can complete this task, I will release your souls from detention at that time! I 
will let you all be free again!" Li Tian said.

Chapter 4264: : The target of all targets (3)

After Li Tian and others suddenly disappeared, the seven or eight sages who besieged Li Tian were 
the first to be dumbfounded.

"People... where about people?"



These venerables looked at each other as if they wanted to find Li Tian in each other's eyes.

Xue Zhengxin was the first to discover the strangeness here, and his figure flickered several times 
in succession and came to the side of the seven or eight nobles, and shouted angrily at the seven or 
eight nobles, "Where are the people? Bastards, where are they? Can you escape under our noses?"

"Just... just now they were here, but they disappeared in a blink of an eye! Didn't they teleport out 
of the underground palace and escape?" said a venerable.

"Escape? Teleport? You give me a teleport and let me see! They must still be in the square of the 
Qingyun Temple. You will find them separately. Be sure to find them all. As long as you can find 
them, all you have I can promise you all requests!" Xue Zhengxin roared.

Xue Zhengxin knew that if Li Tian disappeared, then the blood source and space treasures would 
disappear with Li Tian disappeared, and the consensus they reached would be meaningless. Once Li 
Tian and the others escape from here, then this In the vast death battlefield, where can Xue 
Zhengxin go to find Li Tian and others?

And now that the other cultivators and trialists have already fled, Xue Zhengxin is currently unable 
to open the Qingyun Temple even if he wants to open it, so Xuezheng's confidence is full of anger.

In the distance, Liu You's stupid lack was still turning over the corpse. This guy suddenly felt the 
energy fluctuations of Li Tian and the others in the Qingyun Temple square disappear. Liu You 
suddenly raised his head and saw that Li Tian and the others had disappeared.

This cargo's reaction was not unpleasant. Before the other venerables turned to look at him, this 
cargo fell to the ground, then secretly put the arm of a corpse on his body, and began to pretend to 
be dead.

"Li Tian, you **** won't leave me alone, will you? If you leave me alone, after I get out alive, I 
must teach you severely!" Liu You thought in his heart.

In the entire Qingyun Temple square, now only the vicious dog and the one-horned Venerable are 
fighting.

Venerable One-horn felt that he was very bitter. He was clearly a powerful second-level Venerable, 
but whether it was a gravity attack or other attacks, he was not as good as the monster in front of 
him.

The size of the vicious dog is too large. If the Venerable One-horned does not fly, then he can only 
attack the limbs of the vicious dog, but the limbs of the vicious dog have heavy scales, and the 
Venerable One-horned attack does not seem to be much. effect.

However, if the Venerable Unicorn flies, his speed, teleportation, etc. will all be affected. When 
fighting Venerable Unicorn, his second-level advantage, which was originally small, disappears!

The one-horned Venerable now especially hopes that Xue Zhengxin can bring other Venerables to 
assist him in attacking the vicious dog, but soon he is disappointed.

Now all the venerables on the Qingyundian square seem to be crazy, looking for something!

Even the venerables at the top of the Qingyun Temple will not let go!

Huh!



Venerable Li Tian and Venerable Dongshan suddenly appeared out of thin air, but because Li Tian's 
teleportation had almost no energy fluctuations, the appearance of him and Venerable Dongshan did 
not attract the attention of other Venerables.

Huh!

Li Tian teleported about ten meters toward the Qingyun Temple, and the Qiqiang spear in his hand 
slammed into the back of a venerable person. The venerable person's reaction was fast enough, 
continuously using teleport to avoid Li. Attack of the day.

The Venerable shouted excitedly: "Here, here!"

The scream of this venerable drew the attention of all other people to him, but his voice hadn't died 
yet, and Li Tian had disappeared.

"where is the guy?"

Xue Zhengxin rushed over excitedly, but was told that Li Tian had disappeared.

"Hmph, I guessed right, this underground palace is special and abnormal, no one can teleport and 
escape from here! Come and see a few people, let me guard the entrance of this underground palace 
to Qingyun Temple, we will come today I don't believe he will never come out!" said Xue 
Zhengxin.

Everyone's attention was on Li Tian, who appeared and disappeared suddenly, and did not notice the 
Venerable Dongshan who had emerged from the more than 300 Venerables.

It is no wonder that these venerables are divided into seventeen or eight powers. These venerables 
do not know each other, even if they see a strange face, they will not be surprised! Besides, their 
primary goal now is Li Tian, the guy who holds a spear and has black flames on his body!

Huh!

Li Tian appeared again!

This time Venerable Nanshan appeared with Li Tian!

In order to act realistically, Venerable Nanshan also had two tricks with Li Tian, and then Venerable 
Nanshan teleported away to avoid Li Tian's spear attack.

And Li Tian had disappeared before the other venerables came around.

"Asshole, let him run away! It's best not to show up next to me, or I will make you regret showing 
up!" said Venerable Nanshan.

"Hmph, don't worry, now the only passageway entrance has been blocked by our Venerable, he can't 
run away!" A Venerable with a few strange symbols tattooed on his forehead said triumphantly to 
Venerable Nanshan.

"Brother is the follower of the **** son? I really envy you, brother. Even if we have become 
venerables, we are forced to work hard at the spiritual source. If you don't want to brother, you must 
not worry about the spiritual source. "Venerable Nanshan asked.

"Fortunately, fortunately! Young Master Blood is quite generous in spirit sources. When we were in 
Lingshan, there were tens of thousands of spirit sources..."



Venerable Character has not finished speaking, Li Tian is already appearing, this Venerable 
Character turned and looked in the direction where Li Tian appeared, and at this moment, Venerable 
Nanshan suddenly attacked Venerable Character.

The character Venerable was shocked and counterattacked subconsciously!

boom!

Venerable Character slapped Venerable Nanshan with a palm, and the body of Venerable Nanshan 
flew out like a broken kite.

boom!

On the other side, Venerable Dongshan also flew out, and fell heavily to the ground. A trace of 
bright red blood dripped from the corner of his mouth, which burst out suddenly and fell to the 
ground motionless!

As Li Tian appeared for the third time, Venerable Xishan immediately shouted loudly: "No, the 
Venerable Xuezhengxin killed someone! The Venerable Xuezhengxin killed someone! What are you 
waiting for, brothers? Don't let us all die here!"

As soon as Venerable Xishan's words fell, he violently attacked Venerable Blood Zhengxin who was 
closest to him.

On the square of Qingyun Temple, hundreds of venerables suddenly became a mess!

"Asshole! That **** started to do it without getting my order? Didn't you get your mother's stuff 
yet?" Xue Zhengxin shouted angrily.

Chapter 4265: : The target of all targets (4)

The yellow mud falls in the crotch, not **** but shit!

Originally, two Venerables were killed in a row, and the Venerables of other forces were in danger. 
Now that they heard the words of blood and faith, what else can these Venerables hesitate!

The Venerables of these small forces have few manpower, but their combat power is no weaker than 
these Venerables of the blood!

In an instant, the three venerables who believed in blood were blasted to pieces!

"Kill! Kill me!"

"Several descendants of Super Venerables even dared to rob the source of the blood spirit with me. 
It's really impatient to live!"

The descendants of the Broken Tower domain master and the Emperor Lei Gong urgently greeted 
their followers, and the venerables of other forces began to besieged the followers of the blood 
Zhengxin.

The battle at the sacred level is naturally powerful!

Even if someone still has doubts in their minds, there are already more than two hundred venerables 
participating in the battle, and the battle can no longer be stopped!

"What shall we do now?" asked the venerable of the descendants of the broken tower domain 
master.



A sneer flashed across the face of the descendants of the Broken Tower domain master, and said: 
"We can't do this to send charcoal in the snow, but how can we miss it when we fall into the stone! 
This blood is believed to have insulted us many times, and now is our best chance for revenge The 
blood believes that we can't kill, but his followers are free!"

The followers of the descendants of the Broken Tower domain participated in the battle, and those 
who were faithful in blood were defeated like a mountain, and venerables were continuously 
beheaded!

"What to do? What do we do now?" The venerables of the descendants of the Thunder King clan 
looked nervously at the Thunderbird clan man and asked.

"Asshole, this is your own dead end, so don't blame me for being rude to you!" Xue Zhengxin's 
heart was angry, but there was no way to vent it, and he roared angrily.

This happened too suddenly, and Zhengxin was caught off guard!

According to Xue Zhengxin's plan, the blood spirit source and Li Tian's spatial treasure were first 
obtained, and he was turning his face at that time, and he also explained to his followers in this way.

But now that you have done it, you can't stay behind!

"Venerable One-horn, get back to me and kill all these bastards!" Xue Zhengxin roared.

Venerable One-horned Hearing Xue Zhengxin's call, he almost cried excitedly.

This guy was already tired of fighting the vicious dog. Hearing the call of Xue Zhengxin, the one-
horned Venerable cast several teleports in a row, avoiding complete attacks, and once again cast 
teleports and rushed into the battle circle.

The one-horned Venerable is the second-level powerhouse of the Venerable. He was beaten like a 
dog in front of the vicious dog, but he fought with the ordinary Venerable. This product is definitely 
worthy of seven or eight ordinary Venerable-level powerhouses.

Because of the participation of Venerable One-horned Venerable, the decadent situation on 
Xuezhengxin's side improved slightly.

But even if the situation improved, it was only a few minutes before the Venerable Xuezhengxin's 
followers had already died.

"Thunderbird, do you plan to keep watching?"

"My lips are dead and my teeth are cold, if I believe that I die here today, do you think you can 
leave the battlefield of death alive? Even if you can leave the battlefield of death alive, do you think 
the blood domain master will spare you? At that time, Lord Thunder will do You are buried 
together!" Xue Zhengxin shouted at the Thunderbird tribe man.

The Thunderbird man’s name is Thunderbird, and when he heard Xue Zhengxin threaten him in this 
way, Thunderbird’s anger that he was holding back broke out instantly.

"Asshole, you are just the grandson of the Blood Domain Lord. You can even threaten me. You dare 
to threaten Emperor Lei! If you want me to die, then I will let you die here first! Give it to me! Give 
it to me kill!"

"Who to kill?"



"Blood Zhengxin!" Thunderbird said viciously.

boom!

boom!

The square of Qingyun Temple was completely in chaos, and the power of Thunderbird, the 
descendant of Emperor Thunder King, joined, and the frustration of Xuezheng Belief that was hard 
to reverse was instantly beaten back to its original shape.

The followers of the blood and faith continue to fall!

The venerables of other forces fell at a similar speed!

In less than ten minutes, the number of Venerables on the Qingyun Temple Square has been reduced 
by seventy to eighty, and this number is still rising as the battle enters the heat!

"Thunderbird, you dare to take action against Lao Tzu. You'd better kill all Lao Tzu's people today. 
Otherwise, as long as you let Lao Tzu leave the battlefield of death alive, you Thunderbird and your 
Thunderbird tribe will be mad by the bloodlord. Revenge! I want your entire race to disappear 
completely in the Nether Realm," Xue Zhengxin roared.

"Xuezhengxin, I don't need you to say that I will kill you too! Just like you killed Huanglou 
Huangzun and Xiyu's queens!" said Thunderbird.

boom!

boom!

The authorities were obsessed with the bystanders, and Liu You lay on the ground and continued to 
play dead just to witness the whole process of Li Tian's plan.

"Li Tian, you're so **** damned. You can use several venerables in the south, east, west, and north 
to make the blood believe in themselves and beat them. It's... really beautiful!"

"After the praying mantis catches the cicada and the oriole, as long as we wait patiently for a while, 
until these guys lose both sides, then this underground palace will be Li Tian and the third son of 
You Ming and they have the final say!"

As the participants in this matter, Venerable Dongshan, Venerable Nanshan, and Venerable Xishan 
also fell on the ground and pretended to be dead, but unlike Venerable Dongshan and Venerable 
Xishan who cared about the battle, Venerable Nanshan recollected the red wine in his mouth.

"God wine, it is really good wine. When the problem here is solved, I must ask Master Li Tian to 
drink this wine called red wine! It's delicious!"

"I wiped it, why is it not my turn to spurt blood and pretend to be dead? But soon I will regain my 
freedom, and I will naturally be indispensable to follow Master Li Tian at that time!" Venerable 
Dongshan Thinking with Venerable Xishan.

The vicious dog crawled lazily on the huge square, his eyes lifted slightly, watching the battle 
between Xue Zhengxin and others.

"Hey, when can I recover my body? When can I speak? That **** woman, you made me like this 
for the future of this man, Li Tian! At first I told you I want to become stronger. Even if I become 
stronger, I am willing to pay any price, but you can't make my body look like this!"



"Besides, are you making me stronger? I'm actually fighting with these **** venerables. If I used 
to... forget it, I can't remember the past, otherwise I want to cry!"

"Take it slowly, as long as the strength of this kid Li Tian reaches the realm of the domain master, 
then I can regain my freedom, and the woman will honor her promise, then..."

At this time, the number of venerables on the square of the Qingyun Temple has drastically reduced. 
There are now less than 20 of the more than 70 venerables of the Blood Zhengxin. The other 
venerables have either died or suffered severe injuries!

"There was a loud noise in the sky, and I made my debut! Now it should be my turn, Li Tian, to 
play!" Li Tian said coquettishly in the Qiong Spear space of the sky.
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Huh!

Li Tian teleported out of the spear of heaven!

There was already a mess outside, and there were fights everywhere, and for a while, no one would 
notice Li Tian who suddenly appeared. .

"My son, we can't stand it anymore, let's send you out!"

"Keep the green hills, don't be afraid that there will be no materials to burn, the secret of the death 
battlefield is still 490 years away, we have a chance to make a comeback, son, I will send you out!"

In less than half an hour, there were less than ten of the followers of Xuezhengxin and those who 
had died. Only a few of them, such as Venerable One-horned, were the first-level peaks and the 
second-level strong men who still had combat power.

And the other sixteen or seven parties suffered equally heavy losses, and the total number of their 
nobles totaled less than one hundred and fifty.

"Don't go! I'd rather break the jade than complete it. Since these **** want to die, then I will fulfill 
them. There are also a few demon blood Yijing pills. Except for the one-horned one, now you all 
give me this demon blood Yijing Dan, I see who will die first!" Xue Zhengxin said with a crazy 
smile on his face.

The faces of those venerables beside Xue Zhengxin showed undecided expressions.

As long as there is a chance to live, who would take the Monster Blood Yijing Pill now?

After all, the side effects of the Demon Blood Yijing Pill are really too great. Once they take the 
Demon Blood Yijing Pill, it is tantamount to cutting off their chances of cultivation and promotion 
in the future.

However, if they don't take the Demon Blood Yijing Pill now, they are likely to be damaged here.

"My son, let's start from the long-term plan, let's get out of here first!" The Venerable One-horned 
has seen the vicious dog in the distance suddenly stand up, ran in this direction, and said anxiously.

The Venerable One-horn is afraid of being beaten by a vicious dog. Now Venerable One-horn has a 
psychological shadow on the vicious dog!

Then the question is, ask for the mental shadow area of Venerable Onehorn!



The blood prince glared viciously at Venerable Onehorn, and said coldly: "Trash, you, a powerful 
second-level dignified Venerable, can't even deal with such a persistent monster. It really 
disappoints me! Now, I am ugly. In the front, whoever dared to tell me about the escape, don’t 
blame me for being rude!"

"I still have three Demon Blood I Ching Pills here. Whoever wants to consume them can swallow 
them now. As long as we have four Venerable Grade II powerhouses, I don't believe who else is our 
opponent on the death battlefield!"

Xue Zhengxin took out a small porcelain bottle from his skin, and wanted to distribute the only 
three demon blood Yijing pills left in the porcelain bottle to his followers, but at this moment, a 
dark shadow suddenly flashed beside him. , And immediately after Xue Zhengxin felt his eyes lit 
up, he disappeared from the Qingyun Temple and appeared in a strange giant stone hall.

There are venerables everywhere in this huge stone hall, there are fifty to sixty, and these venerables 
are now staring at him!

"Xue Zhengxin, you **** bastard, we finally meet again!" Ye Liangchen walked out of the crowd 
and said with a sneer.

Xue Zhengxin’s face was full of shocked expressions, his body trembled slightly, and he said in a 
trembling voice, “Ye...liangchen, haven’t you already disappeared in Lingshan? How come you are 
here? Where is this place? What?"

"Hahaha, of course you want us to disappear! It is a pity that God took care of us and let us meet 
our elder brother Li Tian in Lingshan. Without our eldest brother, we would have been killed by you 
in Lingshan. Come on! How about? Your followers? Now you are in the space artifact of our eldest 
brother, your followers can't protect you anymore, right?" Zhao Ritian said.

"What do you want to do? I'm a descendant of the Blood Domain Lord. If I have three long and two 
short, do you think you can get out of the relationship? Even if the fathers of your three sons of the 
Netherworld are all emperors, but you think three emperors Can Zun join forces to be the opponent 
of the domain master? I advise you to send me out from here now. From then on, we will not get 
into the river!" After the initial panic, Xue Zhengxin quickly calmed down, with a wave on his face 
Said arrogantly.

"What are you doing? Aren't you very awesome at the beginning? When you were in the 
Netherworld, you have embarrassed us many times, and almost killed us in Lingshan. What do you 
think we can do?"

"How about, all of your followers died in front of you, you must be uncomfortable! Hey, our elder 
brother Li Tian is just a simple strategy, let your so-called cooperation fall apart!"

"It's you? So this is a good thing you did?" Xue Zhengxin asked.

"Yes, but this is all to thank you. If you weren't so arrogant and stupid, how could they be fooled so 
easily?"

"Now you can understand how we felt when we ran away like a bereaved dog in Lingshan! I think 
that in the face of your descendants as the master of the blood domain, we will let you die with 
dignity. I advise you not to resist. , So as not to suffer from skin and flesh!" Ye Liangchen said with 
a sneer.



Huh!

Li Tian teleported into the space of the Tian Qiqiong spear, and there was a vicious dog who entered 
the space with Li Tian!

"Big Brother!"

With excited expressions on the faces of the three young masters, the three young masters gathered 
around Li Tian.

Ye Liangchen continued: "Big Brother, now this kid has fallen into our hands, what should Big 
Brother do?"

"I mean to behead this kid. Anyway, this time, the descendants of Emperor Lei Gong and the 
domain master of Broken Tower were shackled for us! Even if we arrived in the Netherworld after 
five hundred years, the three of us did not appear in the underground palace You can also get out of 
the relationship!" Long Aotian said.

"Your sister! Hiding in my space and enjoying it, this kind of good thing is not your turn! If you 
don't get you into the water, this is not my Li Tian style!" Li Tian thought in his heart.

"Then what nonsense? You just kill him! Anyway, Xuezhengxin is the enemy of your Three Young 
Masters, I just provide you with a platform to resolve the conflict! Oh, yes, the demon blood Yijing 
Dan on his body It's mine!" Li Tian said.

Ouch!

As soon as Li Tian's words fell, the venerables behind the Third Young Master immediately 
screamed. Like the Third Young Master, the roar in their hearts had been suffocated for a long time.

"Hahaha, it's not that easy to want me to die!"

Xue Zhengxin suddenly swallowed a demon blood Yijing Pill in his porcelain bottle, and in the next 
second, he teleported out of the Giant Stone Hall with a scream!

boom!

A strong energy wave came from outside the giant stone hall!

boom!

There was constant energy falling from the sky, and this energy fell on Xue Zhengxin's body, and 
Xue Zhengxin's cultivation level almost broke through to Venerable Level 2 almost instantly!

"He... he actually swallowed the Demon Blood Yijing Pill, and now his cultivation has reached the 
second level of the venerable! It's a bit difficult to deal with now!"
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"I rub! What's so bad to deal with? You have more than 60 venerables here, and you three are 
already strong at the venerable level, so many of you can't deal with him just now Is it someone 
who has broken through to the second level of the sage?" Li Tian said dissatisfiedly.

Now that Xue Zhengxin entered the space of the Qiong Lance of the Sky, he was like a beast in a 
cage, no matter how strong his cultivation was, he would not have escaped here without Li Tian.



"What are you still stunned? Do you want to wait for him to completely absorb the source of the 
heavenly descending spirit, make his Venerable second level cultivation more stable, and then let 
him hide in this space and attack you?" Li Tian was a little anxious Roared.

Hearing what Li Tian said, the more than 60 venerables instantly teleported out of the huge stone 
hall and began to besiege Xuezhengxin!

Now that Xue Zhengxin has just broken through the Venerable's second-level realm, his cultivation 
base has not been stabilized, and most importantly, the energy released from his body is unusually 
obvious, so now even if Xue Zhengxin is hiding in the sky, Li Tian and others can Feel the 
existence of blood Zhengxin.

"Brother, or..., do you follow us to deal with Xuezhengxin? It's best to let your vicious dog deal 
with him together, so that we can avoid casualties!" Zhao Ritian said.

Fuck, is it here to wait for me, Li Tian?

Until now, Li Tian couldn't figure out whether it was right or wrong to become brothers with these 
three goods!

They say that these three are the three silly ghosts, but their brains are not stupid, and even the 
clever ones sometimes want to calculate Li Tian.

In fact, Li Tian really misunderstood the three fools of Netherworld.

There are so many things in Li Tian that make the Third Young Master feel that the background and 
strength behind Li Tian must be greater than that of them. What they think more is to tie Li Tian and 
the three of them tightly. Together, it's best to stay in the same boat through storm and stress, and 
share difficulties together!

"Okay, then the four of our brothers joined forces to kill Xuezhengxin, but I said the ugly thing 
ahead. If he has something I want in his body, I must pick it first!" Li Tian said.

"Hey, this is natural, as long as we help our brother get revenge, all the things on his body belong to 
you!" Netherworld said with a smirk.

Huh!

Huh!

Huh!

The figures of Li Tian and others teleported out of the Giant Stone Hall.

Outside the huge stone hall, it has become a battlefield!

The fighting power of the venerable level is huge, and the space and ground of the Qiong Lance of 
the sky is different from the Qingyun Temple, and it is not enough to resist the bombardment of the 
venerable level.

boom!

boom!



Powerful energy constantly impacted the grassland, and the grass and soil on the grass were 
bombarded and flew up. In the strong wind, the grass and the soil flew into the sky and soared in the 
air.

The scent of grass and the smell of earth made Li Tian some enjoyment after entering the battlefield 
of death for ten years, but in the eyes of Xue Zhengxin, he could not see the slightest sense of 
beauty!

The sixty venerables and three of them were divided into twenty battle teams, like tarsus maggots, 
no matter where the blood Zhengxin flees, they can quickly chase and intercept them.

boom!

Xue Zhengxin broke through to the second-level realm of the venerable, but when faced with the 
siege of so many venerables, it was obvious that he had more than enough energy but only the tens 
of seconds for Li Tian and others to speak. His clothes have been blasted to pieces, the clothes are 
ragged, and his body is incomplete!

"It seems that without our hands, these venerables can easily behead the Blood Zhengxin!" Zhao 
Ritian said.

Li Tian nodded slightly.

He is still too high to value the blood integrity, he values the strength of the Venerable's second-
level powerhouse, and he too underestimates the cooperation proficiency and strength of these more 
than sixty Venerables!

The three-person combat method is really powerful. This combat team basically has the power of 
the second-level venerable. Twenty combat teams are equivalent to twenty second-level venerables. 
It is no wonder that there is no blood integrity. Fight back!

"Brother, you must teach me this training method! If this method is passed to the Nether Realm, it 
will definitely kill any existing combat methods in the Nether Realm!" Ye Liangchen said.

The fighting style of these venerables now is like the special forces combat squad in the army. The 
power of individual combat and group combat can increase rapidly, but it is just like the existence 
of special forces in the army.

This way of fighting can only be used in a small area.

Like Ye Liangchen’s national war in the Netherworld, once a national war occurs, the number of 
people participating in the war will be in the tens of millions. Of course, the main fighting forces 
participating in the war are only ordinary cultivators, and there are fewer powerful people at the 
venerable level. .

However, it is the small group of people who are the highest and most powerful of the two 
participating countries, especially the eighth and ninth-level sages, and the emperor. The number 
and strength of these powers are The key to victory!

But since Ye Liangchen wanted to learn, Li Tian would not refuse.

boom!

boom!



Being continuously attacked, Xue Zhengxin had already revealed his defeat. The clothes on his 
body had been blasted to pieces and disappeared, and there were wounds all over his body.

These small wounds were partly because of the attacks of the venerables, but more because the 
spiritual power in Xuezhengxin's body was out of control and burst into his body veins!

"Big brother, I have never fought against a second-level powerhouse of Venerable. Today I don't 
want to miss this opportunity, I will go first!"

Long Aotian jumped from the top of the vicious dog's head, and a flicker of his figure appeared 
beside Xue Zhengxin!

Long Aotian’s body changed to the original face of the dragon clan. His body was covered with a 
thick layer of fiery red scale armor. The fiery red scale armor seemed to be burning in the sun, and 
his arms had become sharp. Dragon Claw!

puff!

Xue Zhengxin was being entangled by the two groups of six venerables. Long Aotian suddenly 
attacked and attacked Xue Zhengxin by surprise. The sharp claws cut Xue Zhengxin's back in an 
instant, opening a nearly one foot wound!

The blood ran down the wound like a waterfall!

"Haha, how can I be missing Zhao Ritian at this time!"

Zhao Ritian laughed wildly, his figure resembling a black smoke, flashing to Xue Zhengxin's side.

Zhao Ritian’s goods seem to be lit up completely, and there is a puff of black smoke all over the 
body. If this black smoke enters the eyes of people, it will make people feel spicy eyes and tears 
will flow. When black smoke is breathed into the body, the body will be paralyzed.

"Big brother, let's go together! This kind of limelight can't be robbed by the two of them, we are the 
four coquettish brothers!" Ye Liangchen said.

Huh!

Ye Liangchen Teleport also joined the battle!

Seeing the Nether three silly join the battle, the other entourages automatically stepped aside, 
cheering on the Nether three silly.

"Go on, vicious dog!" Li Tian shouted.

Chapter 4268: : They did it (1)

"Three silly ghosts! Even if I am a ghost, I won't let you go!"

The anger and hatred of the Three Young Masters towards Xue Zhengxin turned into their crazy 
attacks, and Xue Zhengxin's already shaky body was full of wounds. .

"Being a ghost? Then you also need a chance to be a ghost! This is the magical space of Brother Li 
Tian, even if you die here, your soul will be imprisoned here forever! So, you don't even have a 
chance to be a ghost!" Ye Liangchen Said with a sneer.

"you guys……"



Xuezheng couldn't help being more flustered. Death was not terrible, and he was afraid that he 
would not even be a ghost after he died.

Xue Zhengxin didn't believe what Ye Liangchen said, but he had already tried teleporting just now 
and wanted to teleport out of this space. Unfortunately, he failed. This made Xue Zhengxin even 
more flustered!

"Or you can commit suicide by exploding yourself, maybe your self-detonation can hurt us! Then 
you will have our company on Huangquan Road!" Ye Liangchen continued his verbal attack!

There was too much blood flowing on Xue Zhengxin's body. Now his body was a little weak, his 
eyes were a little tranced, and his concentration was unable to concentrate. Xue Zhengxin even saw 
the third son of the Nether become multiple figures in front of him.

"Blode?"

"Not blew?"

"Blode?"

"Don't blew up!"

Xue Zhengxin staggered and almost fell to the ground.

Inadvertently, Xue Zhengxin had inhaled a lot of black smoke from Zhao Ritian's body. Now the 
spiritual power in his body has completely lost control, and this spiritual power constantly impacts 
his veins and body.

The skin on Xue Zhengxin's body had turned blood red, and his face was full of pain.

puff!

Long Aotian seized this opportunity, his paws slammed into Xue Zhengxin's abdomen, and blood 
splashed on Long Aotian's face from Xue Zhengxin's body.

boom!

Xue Zhengxin slapped Long Aotian's body with a palm. Long Aotian's body just shook slightly, and 
a few wisps of blood flowed out of his body's scale armor, but Long Aotian did not let go of the 
blood Zhengxin.

This guy stretched out his tongue and licked the blood from the corners of his mouth, with a 
hideous expression on his face. In the next second, Long Aotian's arm violently pulled out, and the 
**** internal organs were all pulled by Long Aotian. come out!

And Long Aotian didn't stop attacking because of this, this man opened his blood basin and bit on 
the neck of Xue Zhengxin, like a vampire, starting to **** the blood in Xue Zhengxin's body 
frantically!

Xue Zhengxin's body swayed a few times, weakly leaning on Long Aotian's body, and his eyes were 
vaguely said: "The third son of Nether Ming, I...I know I was wrong, please, adults, don't remember 
the villain, let it go. Me! My blood is faithful, and from now on, as long as there is the third son of 
the Netherworld, there will be no my blood and faith!"

Xue Zhengxin now wants to ask for mercy, but the third son of the Nether Ming will not do this 
kind of thing.



"Guarantee? Do you think we will trust your guarantee? Your guarantee is not as practical as your 
head!" Ye Liangchen sneered.

Huh!

A sharp blade in Ye Liangchen's hand pierced into Xue Zhengxin's head, blood spurted out with 
white brains, and Xue Zhengxin had fallen softly to the ground!

died!

Xue Zhengxin, who was once incomparable, died in the hands of the third son of Nether Master, 
who thought he could dominate the battlefield with the monster blood Yijing Dan.

From the beginning to the end, Li Tian was the existence of soy sauce, and he didn't make a shot at 
all!

Huh!

Li Tian teleported to the third son of the Netherworld, and smiled and said to the third son of the 
Netherworld: "The grievances are rewarded, gratifying! By the way, where is my demon blood 
Yijing Dan?\"

"Master Li Tian, the Demon Blood Yijing Pill you want should be here!" Behind him, a venerable 
teleported to Li Tian, holding three skin bags in his hand to Li Tian, and said flatly.

"How did this skin get into your hands?" Li Tian looked at the venerable questioningly.

The venerable said with some embarrassment: "If you return to the Lord, I did this before entering 
the realm of cultivator. As long as I was given a chance, my masterful skill could even get 
something from the Emperor and not return. Found by them!"

"When I was fighting with Xue Zhengxin just now, I always remembered Li Tian’s words in my 
heart when I was young. I knew that this thing is very important to adults, so I took this thing in my 
hands when I saw the opportunity. Honor your lord!" the venerable said.

A thief, even if he became a powerful person at the venerable level, the shame of the past made him 
unable to raise his head.

If he hadn't put gold on his face, even if he had the title of a thief god, it would not change his 
essence as a thief.

Therefore the venerable awkwardly could not look up.

"I'm good at rubbing!" Li Tian said admiringly.

Three hundred and sixty lines, the best! Maybe this Venerable can be used by Li Tian someday. Li 
Tian looked at this Venerable and said, "What is your name? Would you like to follow me in the 
future?"

This venerable person was overjoyed. For him who was born humble, he already felt very happy to 
be able to enter Yecheng and become a follower of the Third Young Master.

Now, when Li Tian, the eldest brother of the Third Young Master, stretched out an olive branch to 
him, the joy in his heart can be imagined.



"It seems that I am taking this step right, and now Master Li Tian wants me to follow him!" The 
venerable glanced at Ye Liangchen secretly.

Although this Venerable is Ye Liangchen’s follower, his sense of existence is very low. Ye 
Liangchen almost forgets that such a Venerable exists. Now since Li Tian wants this Venerable, Ye 
Liangchen will do it. Favorable favors.

Ye Liangchen said: What do I do? It's your blessing that I appreciate you, why don't you introduce 
yourself to my eldest brother? "

"Master Li Tian, my name is Meng Guang! You can call me Xiao Meng or Xiao Guang. From now 
on, I will follow the adults, and I will not hesitate!" Meng Guang knelt down in front of Li Tian and 
said.

"Get up! Now I have other things to deal with, I will naturally look for you when I am waiting for 
you!" Li Tian said.

After a short pause, Li Tian continued: "The third son of the Netherworld, follow me out! Let the 
other domain masters and the emperor's descendants also see and see your heroic appearance!"

...

Outside the Qingyun Temple, after Xue Zhengxin was kidnapped by Li Tian, those followers of Xue 
Zhengxin no longer had the mind to fight, they fled towards the exit one after another!

The Thunderbird man, the descendants of the Broken Tower Domain Master, and others know that 
if the Blood Domain Master’s followers are allowed to escape, no matter what the final life and 
death of the blood is believed to be, once the secret is opened in 490 years, then these escaped The 
venerable will throw this black pot on people like them.

"Kill! Never let anyone go!"
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There is no need for Thunderbird to shout this sentence, all the venerables present understand this 
truth. .

Today, they dealt with the blood Zhengxin, and they were holding you to death.

Now there are only three poor followers of the blood and faith, and one of them is the one-horned 
one!

This one-horned Venerable originally had a chance to escape, but when he saw Xue Zhengxin being 
taken away by Li Tian suddenly, his heart was somewhat entangled and nervous. When he made up 
his mind, he had already missed the best opportunity.

Dozens of Venerables besieged Venerable One-horn at the same time, no matter how strong he is, he 
will not be able to escape from the end of Blood Zhengxin!

boom!

boom!

The One-horned Venerable continued to withstand the attacks of these other Venerables. The horn 
on his head had already been blasted off, and blood flowed from the root of the horn, staining his 
cheeks blood red.



The One-horned Venerable is a man, a man, and his strength is indeed much stronger than other 
Venerables.

"Killing one is enough, killing two and earning one! Lao Tzu has already killed seven Venerables, 
and I have already earned enough. I really want to see who of you hasn't lived enough to come up 
and die!" Lu roared ferociously.

The seven or eight Venerable One-horned Venerables who were besieging the Venerable One-horn 
just now were stunned by his reality and involuntarily stepped back!

"What are you afraid of? If you retreat now, even if we leave here and wait for us to reach the 
Netherworld, we will not escape death!" The descendants of the Broken Tower domain master 
shouted to his sages.

Soon there was only Venerable Unicorn left among the followers of the blood and faithfulness. The 
blood flowing on his forehead made Venerable Unihorn weaker and his combat power was 
drastically reduced!

The victory or defeat has become a foregone conclusion, and Venerable One-horn seems to have 
seen death beckoning him.

"Hahaha, my one-horned Venerable has been on the battlefield of death for ten years with the blood 
of Zhengxin, but I didn't expect that today will fall to this end, don't you want me to die? Then I will 
die for you to see!" The unicorn group laughed wildly and roared.

Venerable One Horn wanted revenge against Thunderbird and others, and all he could do was blew 
himself up!

At this moment, Li Tian teleported to the square of the Qingyun Temple. The moment he saw Li 
Tian, the eyes of the One-horned Venerable began to burn with angry flames.

"Asshole thing, where did you take our blood boy?" Venerable One-horned teleport continuously, 
rushing towards Li Tian.

Li Tian didn't retreat, but also continuously teleported, rushing towards Venerable Unicorn!

Huh!

Huh!

The two met at a position less than 100 meters in front of the Qingyun Temple. Li Tian carried a 
black flame on his arm and slammed his palm towards Venerable One Horn.

Facing Li Tian's attack, the one-horned Venerable sneered and said: "If you hadn't taken away 
Young Master Xue Zhengxin, we wouldn't have been so defeated. Now let me learn how good you 
are!"

Intersecting the palms, there is no violent impact as imagined!

Li Tian did not move, but the Venerable One Horn instantly disappeared in front of Li Tian.

Li Tianyi is different!

Huh!

Huh!



Almost the moment when Li Tian sent the Venerable One Horn into the Qiong Spear of the Sky, a 
dozen of Venerables teleported to Li Tian's side and surrounded Li Tian.

"Hey, I'm so brave to show up here! Don't you really know how to write death words?" The 
descendants of the Broken Tower domain master sneered and said to Li Tian.

The corners of Li Tian's mouth tilted upwards, revealing a sneer and said, "I can write the dead 
word naturally, but I'm afraid you don't know how terrible death is!"

With that said, Li Tian flipped over, and there was already an extra corpse in his hand, it was the 
corpse of Xue Zhengxin!

"Blood...Blood Zhengxin! You actually killed Xuezhengxin..." These venerables said with surprise 
and joy on their faces.

They were still worried that if the Venerable One-horn escaped, the Lord of the Blood Realm would 
count the disappearance of Xue Zhengxin on their heads. Now it seems that they are worrying too 
much. Since there are people who come out and carry a scapegoat, it is really great Up!

"Hey, you can't say that. I saw that you killed the blood Zhengxin?" Li Tian said with a sneer.

"W...what?" These venerables still don't understand what Li Tian means!

Li Tian continued: "Now that Venerable One-horn is in my hands, you said that if I let Venerable 
One-horn leave the Netherworld alive and promise him benefits, what would you say he would tell 
the Blood Domain Lord?"

Li Tian's words shocked and bewildered all the venerables present.

That's right, Venerable Onehorn is now the only survivor of Venerable Blood Zhengxin. If he insists 
that it is the blood Zhengxin killed by the descendants of Thunderbird and the Broken Tower 
domain master, then they really have no way to remove the suspicion.

"Hehe, your strategy is good, but don’t forget that we still have more than a hundred venerables 
here. As long as we block the entrance of the underground palace, even if you can hide in your 
treasure space, you will be ours sooner or later. Trapped here!" Thunderbird said with a sneer.

"Really? Fortunately, Li Tian never fights unprepared battles! Come out, Third Young Master!" Li 
Tian said with a smile.

As Li Tian's voice just fell, huh! Huh! Several figures appeared behind Li Tian, it was the Third 
Young Master!

And this was just the beginning, those followers of the Third Young Master Nether appeared 
constantly behind the Third Young Master.

The number of the venerables is constantly increasing. The venerable Dongshan, Liu You and 
others who fell on the ground and pretended to be dead suddenly jumped up from the ground, 
shocking the venerable next to them.

Then Venerable Dongshan and others contacted a few teleports and appeared beside Li Tian.

"Master Li Tian, successfully completed the task!" Venerable Dongshan said excitedly.

Ouch!



Ouch!

The vicious dog that was being besieged by the four nobles suddenly roared, its strength suddenly 
increased, swish! The white bone tail behind the vicious dog slammed through the body of a 
venerable like white lightning, and its huge and powerful claws instantly entered a venerable 
teleporter to death!

"Damn, this beast has been hiding his strength!" The venerable shouted in horror.

Huh!

The vicious dog teleported to the back of all the venerables and joined Li Tian's camp.

Huh!

Situ Ningbing appeared to the left of Li Tian!

Huh!

Tang Xiaolong appeared on Li Tian's right!

The Three Nether Masters, their followers, Liu You, the followers of the Supreme Mansion, the four 
mountains in the southeast and the northwest, Tang Xiaolong, the small hot pot, the Xue Ji, the lion 
clan!

All these people have added up to more than ninety people. In addition to the three powerful men 
with the Venerable's second-level strength, Vicious Dog, Li Tian, and Situ Ningbing, Li Tian's 
power is no longer lost to the other sixteen Venerables of the seven forces.

"What about now? Do you think you can still die here?" Li Tian said with a sneer.

In front of Li Tian, the leaders of the 16 or 7 forces looked at each other!

They didn't expect the Third Young Master to be alive, and still standing behind Li Tian.

"Listen well, I will just say a word"

Li Tian paused and then said: "Xue Zhengxin is a descendant of the blood domain master. If you 
want to kill the blood domain master, at least the domain master or the queen is qualified. Then this 
birdman did it? What did the descendants of these domain owners do?"

Chapter 4270: :Who else?

If these 16 or 7 forces join forces to deal with Li Tian, Li Tian would definitely not dare to be so 
rampant. ,

But people don't kill themselves for their own sake, just as Li Tian could easily destroy the 
consensus reached between Xuezhengxin and these 16 or 7 forces, there is no absolute trust among 
these 16 or 7 forces.

What's more, Li Tian has now grasped their lifeblood. Just as Li Tian said, if Li Tian is allowed to 
go out from here, as long as the one-horn reader is conquered by Li Tian, then all people in this 
Qingyun Temple will receive blood. The domain owner's crazy revenge!

These little leaders, the little leaders have their own ghosts in their hearts, looking at each other.



"Haha, boy, we have experienced life and death together, do you want to deceive us with this little 
trick of instigating discord? Scream, listen to me, don't be deceived by this kid! As long as we 
unite , To deal with this kid jointly, we can definitely kill this kid here in Qingyun Palace!" The 
Thunderbird man walked out of the crowd and said with a sneer at Li Tian.

The corner of Li Tian's mouth also showed a slight smile. He did not object to what the Thunderbird 
man said, but slightly nodded and said, "Yes, this bird man said it is right. If you unite against me, I 
will be ninety I am afraid that this venerable person is not the opponent of so many of you. But, 
don’t forget, since I have the ability to make so many people appear with me instantly, then I have a 
way to hide them all, you want to deal with me It doesn't seem to be that simple yet!"

"And, haven't you noticed it? When you were trying your best to fight with Xuezhengxin, who was 
carrying him behind? In just half an hour, all the followers of Xuezhengxin were beheaded. Kill it, 
but don’t you see that some people’s surviving sages are intact? Even if you unite to deal with me 
now, but the mussels fight, the fishermen gain, and finally all the sages of you small forces 
Everyone has been beaten, is it possible for you little leaders to leave here alive?"

"Furthermore, I have already said it! Only the emperor or the queen of the domain master is 
qualified to kill the blood righteous believer. If you want to leave here, I will definitely not stop 
you! Think about it yourself!"

Li Tian's words just said that the leaders of these small forces were in the heart.

That's right, all of the more than sixty venerables who believed in the blood, except for the one-
horned venerate, were beheaded, but the leaders of the small forces also suffered heavy losses.

One of them had a little leader with more than a dozen venerables, and now there were only three 
venerables left by his side. Even if he wanted to deal with Li Tian now, he had more than enough 
energy.

These three Venerables are what he used to save his life in the death battlefield!

"You big guys fight, we little guys don’t intervene! No matter who Xue Zhengxin was killed by 
him, I don’t know. I have only been to Vagrant City, I have never entered the Supreme Mansion, nor 
have I been to the underground palace, let alone I have seen you!"

The leader turned and said to the three nobles behind him: "Let's go!"

After speaking, the leader did not stay at all, and led his venerables to rush up the steps across the 
square. Seeing that Li Tian, the Thunderbird man, the descendants of the Broken Tower domain 
master, etc. did not intend to chase him, they quickly The ground rushed out of Qingyundi Square 
and rushed into the passage!

"The gods are suffering from fighting with mortals. You should solve these things yourself! Let's go 
too!"

Seeing that the first force left the Qingyun Temple square smoothly, the hearts of the leaders of the 
other small forces also began to shake, and soon someone jumped out and fled the Qingyun Temple 
square with their followers!

The Thunderbird man's face is a bit ugly! He knew that this so-called alliance was not reliable, but 
he didn't expect it to be so untestable.



Those sixteen or seven forces ran away in just a few minutes. The number of venerables in the 
Qingyundian square has been reduced by another thirty. If the situation continues, then this situation 
will face him. Will be even worse!

"You can't sit and wait, you must take advantage of the absolute advantage you have now to drag 
the other forces into the water!" The Thunderbird man thought in his heart.

"Everyone, have you forgotten our original intention to come here? We are in danger, as long as we 
kill the boy in front of us, then the treasures in the Qingyun Temple, the space treasures on this man, 
and the blood source are all Ours! Now that there are six or seven less people competing with us, 
we have a greater chance of getting the treasure. What are you waiting for? Do it!" The Thunderbird 
man shouted.

The other forces have not made any response yet, and a venerable person behind the Thunderbird 
man takes the lead.

"I'll take this kid's life first!"

Huh!

This venerable teleportation flashed out from behind the Thunderbird man, and then continuously 
used teleportation, teleporting to a place two or three meters away from Li Tian, the blade in his 
hand slashed towards Li Tian with a cold light.

And at this moment, several powerful pressures suddenly fell in the sky, and the wheels were on the 
man in an instant. It was the vicious dog, Situ Ningbing, Liu You and other three who 
simultaneously controlled the venerable man with gravity attacks. .

Before the blade of the man's hand fell on Li Tian, the spear of the sky in Li Tian's hand slammed 
forward!

Zizi!

Four or five purple electric dragons carried black flames, and swarmed into the body of this 
venerable along the Qiong Lance of the sky.

Before the venerable uttered a scream, his body muscles were swallowed by the purple electric 
dragon and black flames, and the bones of his body turned into ashes as they turned, and there were 
several crystals in the ashes. Something fell to the ground.

It may be that the stones in his body were burned into a glass shape, or it may be other things in his 
skin.

Shock!

All the venerables on the Qingyundian square were shocked by the power of Li Tian's simple 
attack!

The leaders of those small forces led their entourage and kept backing away. These venerables 
shook their heads and muttered to themselves with a fearful expression on their faces.

"Impossible, this guy is so powerful? How is this possible?"

"He only has a ninth-level cultivator realm. Even if the gravitational coercion was not released from 
him just now, but...this...this is too abnormal!"



It is impossible, but this is true!

be quiet!

The entire Qingyundian square is very quiet!

Only the sound of heartbeat and breathing!

There was a trace of panic on the Thunderbird man's face, and he stepped back a few steps!

It was also a ninth-level cultivation base, and he felt the fear of death in Li Tian!

The corner of Li Tian's mouth turned up slightly, sneered, and said angrily: "Who else? Who else is 
going to die!"
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