
A Killer 4891

Chapter 4891: : Change your fate against the sky

The beast boy was personable and said with a smile: "Before asking this question, should you 
introduce yourself first?"

"Before you tell me your purpose, I am afraid I cannot confess to you!" Li Tian said.

The Beast Boy was not angry. He still smiled and said, "It doesn't matter, even if you don't 
introduce it, I know who you are!"

With that said, there is already an egg-sized metal ball in the hand of the beast boy. The metal ball is 
jet black. The light shines on the metal ball, and it does not reflect light, just like this ball. It's 
normal to absorb the light!

The beast boy placed the metal ball in his hand steadily on the ground, and then released a trace of 
spiritual power from his arm into the metal ball, smiled, and continued: "Compared to you The 
picture is quite familiar!"

With the spiritual power injected by the beast boy, the metal ball suddenly turned into a transparent 
bright color.

Immediately afterwards, Li Tian saw that some pictures appeared in this metal ball!

Seeing these pictures, Li Tian couldn't help being taken aback!

"This... how is this possible?"

It was the first time Situ Ningbing saw such a scene, and turned to look at Li Tian, "This is the Red 
Wing God outfit?"

Li Tian nodded slightly.

Li Tian couldn't figure out why the battle scene between him and the bandit leader appeared in this 
metal ball?

Is the camera technology of this metal world N hundred times more advanced than the earth world?

Even if the camera technology is more advanced than the earth world, how did the camera picture 
be sent out!

Could it be...

Li Tian once again thought of the soul gathering star where the bandit leader had escaped!

The beast boy seemed to have guessed Li Tian’s thoughts, and said with a smile: “The metal world 
is different from other worlds in many ways. In the metal world, different metals have different 
properties and have different effects. Now you see This picture of is from the bandit leader who was 
beaten by you and finally lost his body. But fortunately, at least the picture quality of this picture is 
really poor and pitiful. If you don’t have a Red Wing costume, even if you stand in front of me, You 
may not recognize that the person in this picture is you!"

Li Tian didn't know if he should be a little happy at this time.



"However, you have also seen that this picture has finally been fixed on a space battleship with the 
design of the spirit clan. Therefore, I suspect that now in this region, maybe the powerhouses in 
other regions have already begun to act. Looking for the space battleship of the Spirit Clan! And 
you... and the Spirit Clan in your hands and behind you, even daring to drive the space battleship 
with the design of the Spirit Clan grandly!" said the beast boy, he casually Moving forward, the 
metal ground of the space battleship at the foot of Li Tian and Situ Ningbing gradually became 
transparent. Looking through the transparent ground, Li Tian saw that the small space battleship of 
the Qi Ling clan really had the logo of the Qi Ling clan. .

No wonder there are always some desperate attacks on this small space battleship along the way, no 
wonder the Shining bandit will follow this space battleship just now, and even seem to be ready to 
do it!

The Bull Head Sword behind Li Tian and the ponytail spear in his hand trembled slightly, as if 
acknowledging their mistakes.

This is not the time for Li Tian and these two careless guys to settle accounts.

"Then what is your purpose? Is it also a Red Wing God outfit?" Li Tian still asked vigilantly.

The beast boy suddenly laughed, and he laughed very happily, as if he had heard the most funny 
joke in the world, "No...I think you have misunderstood! Although the red wing **** outfit can 
improve cultivation, it is the same. It will make people's temperament change drastically, even... 
well, let alone these useless..."

Beast Boy's words have not been finished yet, the ponytail spear in Li Tian's hand broke free from 
Li Tian's hand and instantly turned into a metal human form, and the bull head sword behind Li 
Tian also changed into a huge metal human form, jumping from behind Li Tian Down.

"You... how did you know?"

The things that the Red Wing God's outfit can greatly change human temperament are recorded on 
the wall paintings in the clan treasure space ring of the spirit clan, and this clan treasure of the spirit 
clan has been seen by an outsider like Li Tian. Only a few super-domain master-level experts in the 
Qi Ling clan have seen it, and even the Rat Head Sword has never known.

But Beast Boy did not rush to answer the question of Bull Head Sword and Horsetail Gun, but stuck 
out his tongue, and then a metal cube was taken out by Beast Boy from under his tongue.

Seeing this metal square, Li Tian already understood.

I am afraid that the metal and steel orcs also have the space ring of the clan treasure of the spirit 
clan.

"I don't need to explain it now, right?"

The beast boy put the metal cube back under his tongue, and then said: "I am not interested in the 
Red Slash God costume, so you can rest assured that I will not plunder, and for your safety, I can 
even provide protection for you. But the premise is that you have to remove that **** Artifact Clan 
pattern!"



"Impossible! This pattern is the totem of our Spirit Clan and the symbol of our Spirit Clan! If we 
remove this pattern, then our Spirit Clan is really the same as the exterminator...there is no 
difference!" Ponytail is firmly opposed.

The beast boy shook his head slightly.

He was only making suggestions, and whether or not he would accept it was the Qi Spirit Race's 
own business.

The Beast Boy’s target was Li Tian alone, and he had no obligation to protect the Spirit Clan.

Li Tian expressed his strong contempt for the two super domain master-level powerhouses who are 
incapable of transforming the ancients, and they are **** near extinction. What else is holding this 
pattern?

Could this pattern help the spirit clan to improve cultivation?

Or could this pattern help the spirit clan rise?

This pattern must be erased, otherwise this goal is too obvious, Li Tian will definitely not let him 
and his people stay on the space battleship of the Spirit Race!

"Beast boy, what is your purpose?" Li Tian asked.

The Bull Head Sword, the Horsetail Spear, and Situ Ningbing looked at the Beast Boy at the same 
time. They were also concerned about this.

"Everyone is smart, and I am willing to talk to smart people! My purpose is very simple. As far as I 
know, the weapons that have appeared in the hands of twelve strong men have been returning one 
after another in the past few hundred years. In the metal world, my beast boy can help you find 
these twelve weapons!" said the beast boy.

"Then, you want to borrow my power... No, to be precise, it should be the power of these twelve 
weapons tearing open the void, and then..." Li Tian said.

The beast boy snapped his fingers, pointed at Li Tian, and said, "Yes, this is it!"

"This metal world is a sacred place for foreign powerhouses to practice. Here, various miracles are 
often born, and some people can even break through from the venerable level to the super domain 
master realm in just a few years. So all kinds of foreign races continue to enter the metal world, and 
the metal world is becoming more and more prosperous. But! The metal world is my grave! I am 
trapped in this world forever!"

"If I don't have the awakening wisdom, maybe I will be muddled, and just keep going, and be 
beheaded by a strong foreign race on a certain day, a certain month, and this is my destiny!"

"However, since I have awakened my wisdom, I absolutely will not allow me to live like this again! 
Therefore, I have to change my fate against the sky, I have to leave this world, at all costs, and by 
all means, I have to leave this world!"

Chapter 4892: : Tripartite Cooperation

In other words, the situation of the beast boy is really embarrassing.

The strength of the Beast Boy's cultivation base is in the metal world, even if it is not the strongest 
existence, it is still a minority at the top.



However, with such a powerful being, his cultivation level has no chance to continue to improve, 
and he will be trapped in the metal world forever.

If you are unwilling to make progress, you may be proud of being king in the metal world, but for 
the beast boy, this is suffering.

Li Tian can understand the beast boy, and even Li Tian has a feeling of pity for the same disease.

At the beginning, Li Tian was also the most powerful existence in the earth world, but Li Tian still 
entered the gate of the forbidden zone and came to the underworld.

There is the relationship with that mysterious woman, but Li Tian wants to become stronger!

Pity for the same disease does not mean that Li Tian will be slaughtered!

Obviously, the beast boy is willing to pay because he wants to use Li Tian as cannon fodder!

After all, according to the metal mural in the space ring, wearing twelve artifacts is really awesome, 
and the strength can indeed be improved.

However, the final result is that the body cannot withstand the powerful power of the twelve 
artifacts, and finally burst open and become cannon fodder!

The corner of Li Tian's mouth turned slightly, looking at the beast boy, sneered and said, "So, you 
want to use me? Let me be the fool who collects all twelve artifacts, and then tear the void into 
pieces so that you can leave the metal world. ?"

The Beast Boy did not deny or affirm.

"You now have the Red Wing Divine Costume. Even if you don't collect the other eleven artifacts, 
don't you think you can take care of yourself?"

"Although the Red Wing Divine Appearance will make a big change in human temperament, after 
all, only a few people know this. What other powerful people see is that the Red Wing Divine 
Appearance can improve the strength of cultivation! So, whether you like it or not, you are already 
Become a public enemy of the metal world, so why don't you let yourself be the strongest in the 
metal world?"

"In this way, even if your temperament changes drastically, and even if you still cannot escape the 
tragic ending in the end, at least you have met my friend, and my friend can help you settle many 
powerful enemies in the metal world, and can also help you find other ten. An artifact!"

"Besides, before the last moment, how can we be sure that the final outcome will be tragic? 
Everything is unknown. Maybe this red wing divine outfit and other artifacts fall into your hands 
and won't make you blew up. Dying?"

What Beast Boy said is not wrong.

Just like the "Sunflower Treasure" and "Evil Swordsmanship" in "The Swordsman" in the earth 
world, many people know that'you must first come from the palace if you want to practice this 
exercise', but there are still many strong people who follow suit, even at the cost of their lives To get 
this kind of exercise.

Red Wing God outfit, so is it!

The same is true for the other eleven artifacts!



Li Tian thought quickly in his mind!

His purpose in coming to the metal world is to improve his cultivation strength.

But now Li Tian's first thing to do is to rescue Tang Xiaolong, Youanrou and others, but in terms of 
Li Tian's current cultivation base and strength, this seems impossible at all.

Even if Li Tian already has the Red Wing Divine Equipment, before he can fully master the Red 
Wing Divine Equipment, Li Tian's cultivation level is still at the seventh level of the domain master, 
and his actual combat power is only the second level of the super domain master. .

Give the Beast Boy a bad check and you can use the power of the Beast Boy. There is no hesitation.

Even Li Tian has already figured out a way out.

As long as his cultivation base reaches the super domain master's fifth-level cultivation base realm, 
he will lead his people out of the metal world!

"Good! I am willing to cooperate with you!" Li Tian said with a smile.

Situ Ningbing glanced at Li Tian, but said nothing.

Because she knew that if Li Tian made this decision, he must have his own ideas.

"I... Our Spirit Clan is an ally of Master Li Tian. Since Beast Boy, you want to cooperate with 
Master Li Tian, that is to cooperate with our Spirit Clan! We are really a strong alliance. In this way, 
in the metal No one in the world will be our adversary anymore!" Seeing that Li Tian had promised 
to cooperate with Beast Boy, Niu Tou Jian immediately interjected.

At this time, the Artifacts still believe that their Artifacts are the most powerful masters of the metal 
world!

Eh, even if it is not a master, it is at least one of the most powerful races!

Beast Boy's initial goal has been achieved. As for one more spirit clan and one less spirit clan, it 
doesn't affect him much.

Moreover, the Artifacts are not useless. After all, as one of the most powerful races in the metal 
world, the Artifacts still have their background.

It's just that the spirit of the spirit clan has developed to the present, and the descendants of these 
unsatisfied spirits have not exerted the strength that the spirit of the spirit should have!

"Happy cooperation!"

"Happy cooperation!"

Bull Head Sword and Ponytail Gun said excitedly at the same time: "Happy cooperation!"

...

He promised to cooperate with Beast Boy, Beast Boy, Li Tian, Bull Head Sword, Ponytail Gun, and 
Situ Ningbing formally sat together to discuss cooperation.

The idea of Ponytail Spear and Bull Head Sword is to let the spirit clan rise first and enhance the 
overall strength.



The idea of Beast Boy is to start looking for the other eleven artifacts, as long as there are artifacts, 
the overall strength will naturally increase.

Li Tian’s idea is to improve his cultivation strength first. It is best to cultivate the power, and then 
rescue Tang Xiaolong, Youanrou and others. By the way, rescue the powerhouses of the Spirit Clan 
controlled by the Lingjin Clan. Killing two birds with one stone not only improved Li Tianfang's 
strength, but also improved the strength of the Spirit Clan.

The three cooperating parties represent three forces, and their demands are different, so naturally 
their demands are also different.

The result of the argument was to survive the differences. After some arguments, both the Bull Head 
Sword and the Horse Tail Gun supported Li Tian's ideas, and then the matter was settled.

Go to Wonderland first!

The Bull Head Sword and the Horsetail Gun returned to the Spirit Clan space battleship with 
satisfaction. They must first remove the Spirit Clan pattern on the outer layer of the space 
battleship, while Li Tian and Situ Ningbing stayed in the Beast Boy's space battleship.

"There are many ways to improve your cultivation strength, and you don't necessarily have to go to 
miracles. Since we cooperate, then I should also show my sincerity. Please come with me!" Beast 
boy faced Li Tianhe Situ Ningbing said.

Li Tian and Situ Ningbing looked at each other, and followed him, who had changed into a beast 
boy's circle, into the elevator!

Soon, Li Tian and Situ Ningbing came to the storage area of the Swishing Sky Warship!

The Beast Boy opened the door of one of the warehouses in the storage area, and flashed in front of 
him, and the black storage area was instantly bright.

"You can pick any of the things inside, of course, if you want, you can take them all!" said the beast 
boy.

Looking at the mountain of crystals piled up in the storage area, the pupils of Li Tian and Situ 
Ningbing couldn't help but enlarge!

"This... so many crystals? I... can I really take them all?"

Chapter 4893: : Arriving in Wonderland

"Of course! These crystals are of no use to our metal steel orcs! Only foreign races will treat these 
crystals as treasures! You can take as much as you want, this is just a few days of my gains That's 
it!" said the beast boy.

How many days?

Li Tian only felt a chill in the back of his spine!

How abnormal is the beast boy? There are thousands of crystals piled up like a hill!

This means that in the past few days, the beast boy has killed at least tens of thousands of foreign 
races.



Although most of these crystals are venerable, domain master-level crystals, this number is scary 
enough!

An idea flashed in Li Tian's mind. If he hadn't agreed to cooperate with the Beast Boy at that time, 
would the Beast Boy also kill him, and then train suitable cannon fodder?

Although this is only Li Tian's personal thoughts, it does not rule out this possibility!

Looking at the Beast Boy, Li Tian couldn't help but feel a little chill in his heart.

Of course, Li Tian is not afraid of the beast boy.

The Red Wing Divine Apparel is a powerful existence that can kill even the superdomain master's 
eighth-level strong bandit leader in a flash. Even facing a superdomain master's ninth-level 
strongman like Beast Boy, Li Tian is not without the power of a battle.

Of course, the premise is that the Red Wing Divine Equipment can be controlled by Li Tian.

Don't think about the irrelevant things, now the beast boy is very kind, and Li Tian is not polite.

"Get rich! Haha, this time is really rich! Ningbing, these crystals are enough for you and all the Sea-
Monster clan experts to cultivate to the eighth or nineth level of the domain master!" Li Tian held 
the crystals in both hands. , Regardless of whether there are blood stains or mucus on these crystals, 
Grandet said with an expression on his face.

Situ Ningbing was also shocked by Beast Boy's words.

In a few days, the beast boy was able to kill so many powerful men, this guy is really a murderous 
demon.

Situ Ningbing's heart could not help but began to worry about their safety.

Situ Ningbing's thoughts in Li Tian's heart could probably be guessed, but Situ Ningbing was 
worried that the beast boy might also be able to guess.

It's okay if the Beast Boy can be sent out of the metal world, if it can't, then the Beast Boy's crazy 
revenge is not a joke.

"These crystals are enough for us to cultivate. I will send these crystals to the space battleship of the 
Spirit Clan so that everyone can hurry up and cultivate!" Situ Ningbing said.

Li Tian nodded, "It's okay, you should stay in the space battleship of the Spirit Clan to practice, by 
the way, give pointers to Liu Jimeng and Ye Meijing! Tell all the Sea-Monster Clan that these 
crystals are open for supply, but they must increase their cultivation level as soon as possible. !"

"understand!"

Beast Boy is not stupid, he can guess what Li Tian and Situ Ningbing thought.

But he didn't have any objections, and even Li Tian staying on this space battleship was entirely Li 
Tian's voluntary behavior. He did not force it!

...

The space battleship of the Qi Ling tribe and the space battleship of the Beast Boy swiftly moved 
towards the direction of the fairyland.



There was a space battleship with a beast boy nearby, and there was no other short-sighted thing to 
bother Li Tian and the others.

A week later, the fairyland has appeared in front of you!

In the shady sky, various space battleships appeared.

Each of these space battleships had different patterns. Li Tian probably glanced at it and saw at least 
a few hundred different patterns.

There are so many foreign races in the metal world.

The fairyland in the distance is like an island in the sky.

Hundreds of independent floating islands surround a huge main island.

This main island can no longer be described as an island, it looks more like a piece of land.

The main island, hundreds of independent islands, are of different sizes, scattered in a pattern, and 
surrounded by white clouds, really like a fairyland.

From a distance, these islands are full of green shades and full of vitality. From time to time, there 
will be powerful practitioners or small space battleships coming in and out of the clouds. You can 
see that the fairyland is very lively!

What is even more commendable is that there is a huge burning sphere at an altitude of 10,000 
meters from the fairyland.

This burning sphere is like the sun in a fairyland, providing light energy and heat for the fairyland, 
and making the fairyland the only area with light and heat in the entire metal world.

The endless dark sky, space warships flying in the sky, and the wonderland of the sky island 
suspended in the sky, all these are so familiar.

Li Tian always felt that he had seen these pictures somewhere, but he couldn't remember it for a 
while.

"The fairyland will be here soon, but the large space battleship cannot get close to the fairyland, 
otherwise it will cause disaster! Therefore, we can only take the small space battleship or fly to the 
fairyland! By the way, there is one more thing that needs to be explained to you in advance. 
Wonderland is different from metal. World, you...Forget it, you will understand when you reach the 
fairyland!" said the beast boy.

"One more thing, we are just going to the fairyland to add some ingredients. It is not necessary for 
everyone to go to the fairyland. Therefore, you choose two people to follow me up, and the others 
will stay in the space battleship. Seize all the time to practice!"

"it is good!"

Li Tian chose to take Situ Ningbing and the horsetail gun, and let the Bull Head Sword and others 
stay in the space battleship.

The beast boy sent a message to the space battleship of the Spirit Clan through the space battleship. 
Soon the door of the space battleship of the Spirit Clan opened, and Situ Ningbing and the horsetail 
gun flew out of the hatch. Li Tian and Beast Boy also flew out of the sky battleship, and everyone 
flew towards the fairyland in the midway round.



"Ningbing, I always feel familiar with the sight in front of me, as if I have seen it from somewhere, 
but I won't remember it for a while!" Li Tian said to Situ Ningbing.

Situ Ningbing looked into the distance, thought a little, and said, "Death Battlefield, the 
underground palace of the Supreme Mansion!"

That's right!

I saw this picture in the underground palace!

The only difference is that in this picture, there is no strong man falling from the sky constantly.

...

With the beast boy, Li Tian and others fly fast.

When there was at least tens of thousands of meters away from the fairyland, Li Tian suddenly felt a 
suction from the fairyland.

Li Tian looked at Situ Ningbing. He saw that Situ Ningbing's expression also changed slightly.

"Don't worry, this is the gravity of Wonderland!" Ponytail Gun said.

Li Tian was suddenly surprised.

The gravity of this fairyland is too strong, it is much larger than the earth world and the gravity of 
the underworld!

Li Tian and Situ Ningbing are only domain master-level powerhouses, they both dare not neglect, 
and at the same time display their cultivation bases to resist this powerful gravitational force!

A few minutes later, Li Tian and others landed on the largest main island steadily!

Landing on the main island, the suction disappeared, but this powerful gravitation made Li Tian and 
Situ Ningbing feel uncomfortable.

"Relax, you will get used to it soon! Let's hurry up and shop now!" said the beast boy.

Gradually, Li Tian got accustomed to the gravity of the fairyland, and Li Tian and Situ Ningbing's 
attention shifted from the gravity to the fairyland.

Passing through a bustling street selling various items, Li Tian and others came to a relatively 
empty area. At this time, various creatures continued to speed up from Li Tian and others.

"Go and see! The Shining Bandit Gang just snatched a slave ship of the Spirit Gold Clan and is now 
auctioning off slaves in public! Hey, it's a good thing this time!"

Chapter 4894: : Increased conflict

"Are you going to have a look?"

"What are you looking at?"

"Of course it is an auction! Some people from the Lingjin tribe are now very strong, and the 
prisoners of war returned from the Lingjin tribe's captives are also quite good! Maybe there will be 
superdomain master-level slaves in it, do you want to buy a few slaves as cannon fodder?" Beast 
Boy said.



"Super domain master level powerhouse? Become a slave?"

Li Tian and Situ Ningbing felt completely incredible!

"In the metal world, everything is possible! This is the world of killing. All the strong come here for 
only one purpose, and that is to improve the cultivation base! The fastest way to increase the 
cultivation base is to fight. Stronger than the venerable and the domain master level, but there are 
people outside the mountain, unless you can become a god, even the super domain master level 8 
powerhouse may still be defeated, injured, and killed. , Of course, the most pitiful thing is not to die 
and become a prisoner, and then be sent here for auction!"

When Beast Boy said this, he couldn't help but glanced in the direction of the ponytail.

The expression on Ponytail Gun's face was quite embarrassing, and his eyes didn't dare to look 
directly at the beast boy, erratic!

Fairyland, this open-air auction site, will hold auctions from time to time, and the most popular 
slave lot in this auction is not other alien races, but artifacts!

That's right, it is the Spirit Clan!

The IQ of the Spiritual Clan is worrying, but the host of the Spiritual Clan is a weapon. If you can 
obtain the weapon of the Spiritual Clan, you can equip yourself and effectively improve your 
strength. Once the consciousness of the Spirit Clan is erased, it will be completely reduced to The 
weapon puppets in the hands of others, unless the spirit clan can re-awaken consciousness.

For example, the great axe in the hands of the bandit leader, it is also the superdomain master class 
spirit clan, but its consciousness is erased, and even if it is finally melted, it will not betray the 
bandit leader. It is for this reason that the Artifact Clan is also the most popular race for all bandits, 
and the Artifact Tribe has suffered a devastating attack.

Of course, in the metal world, various races converge here, and there will not only be tool spirit 
races on this auction floor.

Carrot and cabbage have their own loves. Some races can devour crystals for cultivation, some 
races can devour souls for cultivation, and some races can directly devour the body of cultivators 
for cultivation.

In addition, there are various perverted races!

These perverts like "cross-race love", and the beauties of this race like to attack the beauties of other 
races! And those women in this auction house who are not high in cultivation but outstanding in 
appearance are also in demand!

There are also some cultivators and even bandit groups, just like the beast boy said, they need 
cannon fodder, a large amount of cannon fodder, and they will also buy some cultivators who are 
not very strong at the auction floor. When necessary, let these Cannon fodder goes to death.

What's more, treat the slaves returned from the auction as food!

You read it right, it's food!

Various races in the metal world emerge in an endless stream. In the eyes of these guys, as long as 
they are not their race, as long as they are not native races in the metal world, other races can be 
eaten as food. Just like the earth world, some people are willing to eat monkey brain.



There is no right or wrong here, only different concepts, only different positions, and only different 
strengths.

Come out and mix, sooner or later it will be used!

Since you have ventured into the metal world and want to hunt others to become your source of 
cultivation, you can't blame others for being killed!

Li Tian didn't have such hobbies, smiled slightly, and refused: "Forget it! I don't have such 
hobbies!"

The beast boy smiled slightly, and did not force it.

Pass through this small open-air auction site, turn left and enter a street.

There are small stalls selling various vegetables and fruits on both sides of the street, just like 
walking into a farmer’s market.

The vegetables and fruits here are produced locally in the fairyland. Almost all the vegetables and 
the water ghost Li Tian have never seen. Coupled with the clouds and mist on this street, Li 
Tianzhen has the feeling of entering the fairyland.

In this metal world, there is no unified currency, but the most popular one is crystals!

It's like a corpse crystal in the end of the earth world.

These crystals are useful to most cultivators, and become the most accepted goods.

Li Tian doesn't know how long they need to stay in the metal world, and also don't know when they 
will come to Wonderland next time, so Li Tian wants to buy more at once!

Anyway, you can put vegetables and fruits in the space ring, and the vegetables and fruits in the 
vacuum space ring will not be damaged.

What Li Tian didn’t expect was that the high prices of vegetables and fruits here are scary. A 
Venerable-level crystal with a cultivation level of five or less can’t even buy a single vegetable. This 
Venerable-level crystal is like It is the same as the smallest coin.

Only domain owners, especially crystals with a high level of domain masters, have good purchasing 
power.

Li Tian used several skins of crystals in exchange for vegetables and fruits, barely able to eat Li 
Tian and the others and the Sea-Monster tribe in the Gear Spirit space battleship. Li Tian could only 
reluctantly cut his love, and replaced the few domain master ninth-level crystals he left with 
vegetables and fruits!

"Don't worry! There will always be other strong players in the metal world. Now you don't need to 
think too much. You can replace all your crystals with ingredients. After we leave the fairyland, we 
can unscrupulously plunder, as long as we meet It is not the powerhouse at the ninth level of the 
super domain master, all other foreign races can become our crystal currency!" said the beast boy.

Well, it can only be so now!

Li Tian and others are not willing to stay in the fairyland. After all, there are many powerful forces 
in the fairyland, and even some forces may not even be able to provoke the beast boy.



Come out of the market and go through the open auction house again!

At this time, more and more people flocked here.

All kinds of sounds are mixed noisily, and the smells released from each species are suffocating.

And when Situ Ningbing walked through these crowds, the male animals of these species would 
greedily give birth to their tongues, licking their teeth and lips, just like they saw a fat lamb, and 
even people from Followed far behind Li Tian and others.

The beast boy said with a gleeful look: "It seems that you are being watched! This is all right, after 
leaving the fairyland, there will be no more crystals!"

These gazes made Situ Ningbing feel uncomfortable, and he pulled Li Tian's arm and said, "Let's 
get out of here quickly!"

"Okay! As long as they dare to follow, let them come or not..." Li Tian didn't finish his words, 
suddenly Li Tian stopped and pointed to a huge metal cage carried by some creatures in the distant 
crowd. , Said: "Ningbing, look..."

Chapter 4895: : Increased conflict (2)

Following Li Tian's fingers, Situ Ningbing's pupils involuntarily dilated!

She saw that the people in the metal cage turned out to be the Sea-Monster Clan who followed them 
to the metal world!

At this time, the spirit of the Sea-Monster tribe in this cage was sluggish, and many Sea-Monster 
tribes huddled together, their expressions full of fear and despair!

"Could it...could there be Tang Xiaolong and Youanrou in this auction?"

Li Tian suddenly had a bad feeling in his heart, and even a little bit of self-blame in his heart!

If he had just gone to the auction house instead of going to the market to buy ingredients, he might 
be able to meet Tang Xiaolong and the others, so that Li Tian would buy Tang Xiaolong, Youanrou, 
and these Sea-Monster tribes anyway. If not, even With the Shining team torn apart, even if the Red 
Wing Divine Apparel was exposed, Li Tian must rescue Tang Xiaolong and others.

"Ponytail gun, did you see those creatures? It's the creatures carrying the huge metal cage. Follow 
them. You must find a way to protect the people in the metal cage. They all followed me into this 
world. Friend!" Li Tian said quickly to the ponytail.

The Ponytail Spear has already seen the changes in Li Tian and Situ Ningbing's faces, and he 
nodded slightly, "Don't worry, leave it to me! After we are separated, if you want to find me..."

"Leave it to me! I can find you!" Beast Boy said.

Ponytail believed in the beast boy, he turned around and quietly followed the creatures carrying the 
metal cage, and soon disappeared from the crowd.

It’s not that Li Tian doesn’t want to save these Sea-Monsters in the cage. It’s just that Li Tian is 
more concerned about the safety of Tang Xiaolong and Youanrou than the Sea-Monsters. Now the 
auction is still going on. If Tang Xiaolong and Youanrou are still on the auction floor , Then he will 
rescue them now.



Li Tian took Situ Ningbing and the beast boy through the crowd, and soon came to the auction 
house.

In the center of the auction floor is a huge cylindrical metal cage, which isolates the crowd of 
onlookers. In this metal cage, there are hundreds of small metal cages. Inside these small metal 
prisons, there are various kinds of metal cages. Kind of creature.

These are the slaves auctioned by the Shining race.

At this time, the small cage was hung on the large metal cage, and these slaves were displayed as if 
they were pets, and the powerful shining tribes each carried a weapon in their hands and kept 
beating the small metal cage. , Making the slaves in the small metal cage even more frightened.

The shining tribe used this to display their products, and the other powerful people onlookers bid 
according to their own preferences!

Situ Ningbing's gaze swept across these small cages quickly. She did not see Tang Xiaolong, nor 
Situ Ningbing. In order to confirm, Situ Ningbing looked back and forth three times, but still did 
not find Tang Xiaolong's figure. .

"No! There is no Tang Xiaolong, nor Situ Ningbing, have they already been bought?"

At this time, Li Tian suddenly saw a meat ball and firewood in a cage!

That is, when Li Tian first arrived at the Sea-Monster Clan, the two little Sea-Monster Clan who 
climbed on the wall to look at Li Tian.

For some reason, these two little guys were imprisoned alone in a small cage!

Li Tian decided to rescue the meat ball and the firewood first, and then asked the whereabouts of 
Tang Xiaolong and Youanrou.

At this time, Rouqiu seemed to feel someone staring at them and raised his head to look at Li Tian.

"Lee... Master Li Tian!"

When Rouqiu saw Li Tian and Situ Ningbing crowded outside the cage, Rouqiu was so excited that 
he cried for some reason.

The fleshy ball grows fleshy, and the cultivation base is weak, and the sound of crying is like a baby 
crying.

Cang!

Hearing the cries of the meat ball, the Shining bandit standing beside the meat ball and the firewood 
slammed the edge of the cage with the weapon in his hand. The meat ball was frightened and the 
cry stopped abruptly.

"Everyone, have you seen it? I said this kind of creature is definitely a top-quality food. The cry just 
now is like a child, and it can't deceive anyone! If you are optimistic, please bid as soon as possible. 
If you wait for the person in Qingfeng Tower If it appears, it will definitely not be your turn to buy 
this good ingredient!" The shining bandit said with a smile on his face.

The sea-monster clan meat ball and firewood have not been opened yet, and they look like children. 
Such'food materials' can definitely be sold at a good price in Wonderland, so the meat ball and 
firewood are kept, waiting for the final sale. price.



And the Qingfenglou that the shining bandit said just now is the largest restaurant in Wonderland!

A restaurant can be a restaurant if you have wine!

Qingfenglou is the only place selling fine wine in the entire wonderland.

For any cultivator who wants to drink fine wine, the first choice is of course Qingfenglou.

Qingfenglou gathers fine wines from different worlds!

The vast majority of these fine wines come from practitioners who have entered the metal world.

After the death of these cultivators, the fine wine in the space ring will also circulate to Qingfeng 
Tower through various channels.

(In the metal world, Li Tian has been unable to continue the Void Yasha so far, but the Space Ring is 
not affected in any way.)

Of course, the most powerful thing about Qingfeng Tower is that any food material can become 
spiritual food in their hands!

Including ordinary vegetables or fruits, and of course other race creatures!

Pastel newcomers like meat **** and firewood are definitely the best ingredients. Once 
Qingfenglou finds such an ingredient, it will surely get it at a big price!

Upon hearing the name of Qingfeng Tower, many onlookers began to offer quotations!

In just a short time, the price of meat **** and firewood has reached dozens of domain master 
eighth-level crystals.

Li Tian suddenly became a little anxious, and said firmly to the beast boy: "Give me crystals, the 
more the better! I want to buy two small things in that cage!"

"Are you sure you want to buy these two little things at all costs?" Beast Boy asked.

"Yes!" Li Tian nodded and said with certainty.

The beast boy smiled slightly and said, "If that's the case, then why bother to do so! Just grab these 
two little things back!"

I fuck!

No way, this is a fairyland!

You have been playing for so long before, saying that Wonderland is a complex of various powerful 
forces, so now you suddenly say you want to do it?

But, even if you do it, how sure are you Beast Boy?

You must know that this metal cage cannot be cut with an ordinary blade at all, unless it is an 
artifact similar to the red cut!

"Borrow your weapon for a use!"

The Beast Boy stretched out his hand and took Situ Ningbing’s Butcher Slaughter God in his hand. 
With a surge of spiritual power released from the Beast Boy, I saw a green light flashing on the 



bland Slaughter Slaughter God just now. Immediately afterwards, the beast boy raised the butcher 
knife and slaughtered the **** to the metal cage!

Click!

A green light flashed from the butcher knife and god, and the metal cage was cut off a dozen 
railings in an instant!

Crunch!

The metal railing of this metal cage shrank in an instant, and changed into a square metal block!

The small cages that had just been hung on the huge metal cage fell to the ground one after another. 
The shining tribe robbers in the cages carried their weapons and looked angrily in the direction of 
Li Tian and others!

"who is it?"

Chapter 4896: : Increased conflict (3)

Who is your sister!

The beast boy grabbed it casually, and a metal cage containing slaves flew towards Li Tian!

"Wrong, not this!" Li Tian quickly shouted.

At this time, the square was already in a mess, and five or six shining bandits rushed over with their 
swords in their hands.

"Wrong? Then go wrong and go wrong!"

The butcher knife in the hands of the beast boy flashed a green light, and directly cut open the metal 
cage that had flown over.

Imprisoned in this metal cage were two strong men who had reached the mid-level 9th level of the 
domain master. The moment the cage was cut open, the two strong men rushed to the Shining 
bandits. The power of these shining bandits is very powerful, but the anger in the hearts of these 
two domain masters ninth-level powerhouses made them not choose to shrink!

Just now those strong foreigners who were going to spend a lot of money to buy hard, saw the 
opportunity to get their favorite slaves without spending money, and started looting after the chaos. 
There were no strong ones who wanted to **** things. The bandits of the spirit race pounced on Li 
Tian one after another, and robbed them politely.

The small square fell into chaos instantly!

Very confused!

Wonderland hasn't been messed up in such a long time.

In the crowd, the spiritual energy flies chaotically, the sword energy flies chaotically, and from time 
to time there will be stumps and broken arms flying.

Beast boy, this guy is a ninth-level super domain master. Ordinary shining bandits are not his 
opponents at all, but any shining clan powerhouse who rushes towards the beast boy has not had 
time to attack the beast boy. The butcher knife in the hands of the boy, the butcher god, was 
dismembered instantly!



After this guy changed into a human form, he looked like an understatement. He had already 
rescued the meatball and firewood between his gestures and he didn't waste any effort at all!

However, other foreign races have suffered!

In less than a minute, at least a dozen strong men were dismembered by beast boys!

Beast Boy is definitely an art of killing people. He can unknowingly kill those strong men who are 
five or six meters away from him, and take out their crystals and throw them at Li Tian. , The 
bodies of those killed collapsed and shattered when they approached the beast boy.

Within a few minutes, the auction house that was still lively just now has turned into a blood 
stream, with **** corpses everywhere!

"Really...really strong!" Situ Ningbing couldn't help sighing.

Situ Ningbing felt that the Beast Boy was very strong, but she also sighed that the butcher knife in 
the hands of Beast Boy was very strong!

In the hands of Situ Ningbing, although the sword spirit of the butcher **** butcher was awakened, 
Situ Ningbing was unable to exert the strength of the butcher **** butcher. In many cases, the 
butcher **** butcher was used by Situ Ningbing as a sharp weapon. .

But now, the original insipid butcher knife to slaughter the **** in the beast boy is already a magic 
weapon!

Could it be that the butcher knife and the butcher **** would still choose the master?

This is indeed the case!

It's like the power of the spirit clan, once they have spirituality, they are fully qualified to choose to 
practice on their own or follow other powers!

boom!

boom!

Li Tian blasted two punches in a row, blasting the two shining bandits who rushed towards him into 
scum, with minced meat and blood splashing on him, but Li Tian's expression remained as usual 
without any panic.

One will become famous!

A cultivator like Li Tian doesn't have hundreds or thousands of lives in his hands?

When beheading the first opponent, Li Tian may have been panicked and panicked deep in his 
heart. However, for so many years, too many opponents have died in Li Tian’s hands. During the 
battle, Li Tian His heart has long been as solid as a rock.

"Ningbing, this is not the time for you to think about it, take a meat ball and firewood!" Li Tian 
once again blasted and killed a domain master level 5 powerhouse, turned his head to hide behind 
him, stretched out his hand, and used the "Blue Cloud Technique" The fighting Situ Ningbing 
roared: "Hurry up, I'll cover you!"



"Hey, do you still want to leave to do this kind of thing in Wonderland? It's too naive, do you really 
think that we are the shining people?" A tall and strong shining bandit carried a handle that was 
longer than The two-meter sword sneered towards Li Tian with a sneer!

Super domain master power! Super domain master weapon spirit clan weapon!

The big sword is still at least ten meters away from Li Tian, but the spirit power fluctuations 
released from this strong man and from the sword body of this big sword can be accurately judged 
by Li Tian, this guy and The weapons in his hand are already in the super domain master realm.

Moreover, the actual combat effectiveness of this guy is probably much stronger than Li Tian.

It's definitely not easy to mess with!

Li Tian quickly blasted a dozen punches and released a dozen black fire and purple dragons to 
attack this guy.

But... the black fire purple dragon released by Li Tian was instantly wiped out by this guy's giant 
sword!

"I rub! It's really strong!"

At this time, Li Tian could feel that the energy fluctuations of the superdomain master-level 
powerhouses were constantly released from the independent small islands, and then these 
superdomain master-level powerhouses flew to the main island at an extremely fast speed!

In this wonderland, there is absolutely no friend of Li Tian!

Therefore, Li Tian decided to flash first!

Li Tian blasted a dozen punches in a row this time, and ninety-nine black fire purple dragons 
blasted out of Li Tian's body at the same time... Li Tian turned and fled!

The beast boy had expected it!

While this guy beheaded the strong who attacked him, he did more to release the slaves who were 
controlled by the metal cage!

Not all slaves have the courage to fight against these shining tribes, but what is there? As long as 
one-tenth of the slaves is still a bit bloody, jumping out to fight against these shining bandits is 
enough, after all, they are just...cannon fodder!

Yes, they are cannon fodder!

The purpose of the beast boy releasing them is to make trouble, to increase the difficulty of the 
shining bandits, and at the same time to let the slaves who are brave to resist...go to death!

Beast boy is not a charity boy, no wonder Beast boy!

Whoosh!

Whoosh!

Li Tian and Situ Ningbing carried meat **** and firewood respectively, and rushed toward the exit 
of the main island.



Fighting broke out at the auction site. Pedestrians around the square and even on the street seemed 
to have disappeared quickly. No one came out to stop Li Tian and others!

boom!

boom!

The sound of explosions continued to be heard from the small square of the auction house!

With a wave of the butcher knife in the hand of the beast boy, he slashed a superdomain master's 
fourth-level peak shining tribe robber who was approaching him. With his wrist, he picked out the 
crystal of this guy from his body and grabbed it. In his hand, he pointed the butcher knife at the 
other shining bandits who were forcing him, and said with a sneer: "The shining bandit, hehe, if you 
want to play with my beast boy, then come out with me!"

"Beast boy! We Shining tribe bandits have no grievances and no grudges against you, why do you 
want to do this?" One of the Shining tribe bandits said with a gloomy face.

Beast boy suddenly laughed.

This idiot, everyone has no grievances or grudges. Is the metal world a peaceful and prosperous 
age?

"Because... I am willing!"

Chapter 4897: : Not afraid of big things

Money is hard to buy, I am willing!

Besides, the strength of the Beast Boy is very awesome!

This sentence I would like to make all the Shining Bandits present feel a faint pain!

You said that you have been beaten like this. Don't be angry, it's impossible, but if you want to say 
you are angry, you can't do it!

Do you really want to chase the beast boy and fly out of the fairyland, and then have a big fight 
outside?

Isn't that seeking a dead end?

That being the case, I can only hold back the anger for a while, and when the other strong men of 
the Shining Bandits gather together, look for the bad luck of the Beast Boy!

The beast boy has also felt that other superdomain master-level powerhouses are constantly rushing 
in this direction, and sneered a few times and said: "Do you want to fight or not? If you don't fight, 
then I will go first? If necessary, My beast boy is always here!"

After saying these pretending words, the beast boy turned and chased Li Tian and Situ Ningbing 
away!

Behind him, the shining spirit bandit at the eighth level of the Transcendent Master's mouth 
twitched slightly, "Beast boy, metal and steel beast! Humph, no matter how you change, you can't 
change your job as a beast, we flash Since the Spirit Clan even dares to move the Spirit Clan, are 
you still afraid of a beast like you! Soon you will pay a heavy price for your idiot behavior! Bring 



me a few people and keep up with me secretly, preferably secretly Give me the positioning star map 
and install it on the Beast Boy’s space battleship!"

In the fairyland, Li Tian, Situ Ningbing, and Beast Boy ran out of the fairyland unscathed with meat 
**** and firewood.

After all, the fairyland is not the territory of the beast boy. It is precisely because the beast boy 
knows that although the shining robbers are powerful, they are not the local strength of the 
fairyland, but rely on the fairyland to do some sneaky robbers. If it is really offended With other 
powerful forces in Wonderland, they probably won't get out so easily today.

On the way out of Wonderland, Rouqiu had already told Li Tian everything he knew.

It turned out that after the Sea-Monster tribe, Tang Xiaolong, Youanrou, etc. were captured by the 
Lingjin tribe, they were sent to some place by the Lingjin tribe in batches using transport warships. 
As a result, these transport warships were attacked by the Shining tribe. Except for a transport 
warship that was directly destroyed and exploded, and two transport warships fled, all other 
transport warships were hijacked by the Shining race.

Then the Sea-Monster tribe was transported to the fairyland as slaves. Tang Xiaolong and Youanrou 
were together, but they were not captured. Tang Xiaolong and Youanrou... their whereabouts are 
unknown.

Li Tian didn't know whether he should be happy that Tang Xiaolong, Youanrou and others were not 
sold by the slaves in the first place, or were worried because their whereabouts were unknown!

"Li, no news is good news. Tang Xiaolong is someone who has died once, and his luck is no worse 
than yours. You have to believe that they will definitely be lucky!" Situ Ningbing comforted.

Li Tian nodded, and now he can only pray more for Tang Xiaolong in his heart, hoping that he can 
turn the bad into the good.

Flying out of the fairyland, the people in the fairyland did not chase them out, and Li Tian and the 
others returned to the space battleship of the Spirit Clan.

Meatball and Firewood were immediately overjoyed when they saw that there were other powerful 
Sea-Monster clan inside this battleship.

For the rest of their lives, these Sea-Monster tribes began to tell their respective experiences.

No matter who it was, Li Tian was rescued, and he was full of confidence in Li Tian and the others.

Looking at Li Tian eagerly and asking: "Master Li Tian, before you save us, some of the same clan 
was auctioned off. Can the adults save them?"

"Don't worry, even if you don’t say I’m going to rescue them, but now they have been bought by 
other alien races, and we have just made a scene in Wonderland, it seems not easy to return to 
Wonderland now, but don’t worry, I have sent People have followed them. If there is danger, my 
people will definitely not sit idly by!" Li Tian didn’t know if the ponytail had the ability to rescue 
the Sea-Monster tribes. He just tried to comfort these Sea-Monster tribes now. That's it!

The beast boy had already returned the butcher knife to Situ Ningbing, and on the other hand 
instructed Situ Ningbing how to use the power of the butcher knife.



Hearing Li Tian's words, the corner of Beast Boy's mouth showed a slight smile, "If you really want 
to save them, I advise you to start early!"

When Li Tian heard the words of the Beast Boy, he really wanted to kick the **** Beast Boy to 
death!

The Sea-Monster Clan regards Li Tian as the savior, but Li Tian is not the real savior.

In order to save the Sea Monster Clan, putting him in a dangerous situation is not something Li Tian 
is willing to do.

However, how can a low-energy fellow Beast Boy know Li Tian's true thoughts?

If Tang Xiaolong and Youanrou were saved, then Li Tian must have another idea.

Don't talk about Li Tian's reality, this really cannot be described by reality.

After all, the relationship is not to that level.

"Why? Are my other people in danger now?" Rouqiu asked.

The beast boy smiled slightly and continued: "There should be no danger right now, but... who 
knows? After all, the guys who auctioned off your clan are also perverts who like to eat people!"

Hearing these words, Meat Ball, Firewood, and other Sea-Monster tribes shuddered, and then 
looked at Li Tian at the same time.

Li Tian glared at the beast boy viciously, and said, "Then what can you do?"

"Hahaha, what else can be done? The best way to love in this metal world is fists! The same is true 
in Wonderland. As long as your fists are hard enough, even the strong local forces in Wonderland 
will not take you. ! And... the certain artifact we want to get is in Wonderland at this time, why not 
get this artifact in chaos?" The Beast Boy said, fearing that the world would not be chaotic.

For the weapons used by the twelve powerful men, there must be a prerequisite for a change like the 
Red Wing Divine Suit, that is, the user must be able to provide at least a semi-god energy source 
before these artifacts can take place. Variety.

This feeling is like a flashlight designed by Da Vinci that can only illuminate under a light source in 
a movie "The Secret Agent Ling Lingqi" by the star of the end of China.

Entering the metal world, many strong people know that Red Wing God's outfit is powerful, but 
they don't know this prerequisite.

And since the artifact possessed by a certain force in the fairyland now has no such prerequisite, it 
is now only being used as an ordinary weapon.

Beast Boy fears that the world will not be chaotic, Li Tian feels that the partner he found this time is 
too crazy.

People don’t want to be mad at young people.

Anyway, even if it's going to die, there will still be a beast boy!

Moreover, Li Tian also had a certain feeling in his heart, and he also hoped to be able to master the 
Red Wing God outfit this time.



"Okay, then we will save the Sea Monster Race!" Li Tian said.

Chapter 4898: : Just do it

Just do it!

Everyone sat together and discussed again, and finally decided that they should save the Sea-
Monster Clan first and merge with the Ponytail Spear.

After the Sea-Monster Clan was rescued, the Ponytail Spear, Bull Head Sword, and Rat Head Knife 
escorted the Sea-Monster Clan back first, while Li Tian followed the Beast Boy to grab the artifact.

It's a bit big!

This time, he was going to face one of the most powerful forces in the Wonderland. The Beast Boy's 
cultivation level was already a ninth-level super domain master, but he couldn't say that he would 
succeed.

After all, among the most powerful forces in the fairyland, there are not no super-domain masters at 
the ninth level!

At the end of the discussion, Li Tian and Situ Ningbing came to one side, first took off the messy 
clothes on their bodies, and asked Situ Ningbing to touch the wounds on her body that had not fully 
recovered with the green tree in her space ring, and then changed them. Set of clean clothes.

"Li, you must come back safely! The Sea-Monster clan powerhouse, save it if you can. If there is 
danger, you will not blame you if you give up Haiqin! Also, the so-called divine weapon is just 
something outside of the body, we are following the beast boy , But you can't be led by the nose by 
the beast boy!" Situ Ningbing said in a low voice.

"Understand! Don't worry!" Li Tian stretched out his hand and patted the back of Situ Ningbing's 
hand.

When everyone was ready, Li Tian took the Bull Head Sword and Rat Head Sword, and followed 
the Beast Boy into the fairyland again.

As for the space battleships of the spirit clan, the space battleships of the Beast Boy, and the metal 
and steel beasts of the Beast Boy, ordinary enemies dare not do anything against them!

Entering the fairyland again, Li Tian's mentality is different again.

The fairyland at this time has returned to normal.

People come and go, and it is very lively.

It seems that what happened just now has no effect on these strong men!

"Go to Qingfeng Tower! Let's grab things first and create chaos!" said the beast boy!

...

One of the artifacts mentioned by the beast boy is in Qingfeng Tower!

Qingfeng Tower, the first building in Wonderland!



However, this building is not a brick, civil, or reinforced concrete building in the Underworld or the 
Earth World, but a pure metal building, as if it were... made of metal with the same structure as a 
space battleship. to make!

Qingfeng Tower has 17 floors in total, just like a 17-story tower.

But this tall tower is not the ordinary tower we usually see. It decreases layer by layer. Even to the 
top layer, the building area of this layer can reach more than two hundred square meters, and the 
total area of the bottom layer is already More than two thousand square meters.

The Qingfeng Tower has regulations, and the height of the Qingfeng Tower that a cultivator can 
reach is also different depending on the cultivation level!

Below the domain master, it is the lowest level existence in the metal world, and in the fairyland, it 
is also a non-flowing existence. These sages, even if you have the cultivation base of the emperor 
realm and enter Qingfeng Liu, you can only stay at the bottom. level one.

Starting from the realm of the domain master, for each level of cultivation level increased, the 
height that can be reached can be increased by one level!

The seventh-level cultivation base of a domain master like Li Tian, the highest level he can do is the 
eighth, but... Li Tian is walking with Beast Boy, a super domain master ninth-level strong, Li Tian 
and Niutoujian, You can go directly to the top floor with the mouse head knife!

At the top level, this is the place where only super domain masters above level 6 are qualified to 
come.

Beast boy chose the table close to the window, sitting here, you can see less than half of the main 
island of Wonderland.

To be honest, the scenery here is exceptionally good, with clouds and mists lingering, coupled with 
all kinds of strange-shaped buildings in the fairyland, it really feels like a fairyland.

However, because of the Shining bandits, Li Tian knew that Qingfeng Tower was a place to cook all 
kinds of foreign races, because Li Tian didn't have any good feelings about Qingfeng Tower, and 
even sitting here Li Tian always felt like a diaphragm in his heart. , Especially when I saw other 
tables with all kinds of food, those super domain masters who feasted without changing their faces, 
Li Tian was about to throw up nauseously!

Your sister, there are creatures of other races on the table!

Maybe you still hugged your elder brothers yesterday, and you **** got into your belly today, don't 
you feel any sickness?

"How many, do you want to have? Our Qingfeng Building has a variety of delicacies, only you can't 
think of it, nothing we can't do!" The guy on the top of the Qingfeng Building pushed a black metal 
eyeball to the beast boy In front of him, as the spiritual power in his hand fluctuated slightly, some 
pictures were immediately reflected on this metal ball!

This is the menu of Qingfenglou. Of these pictures, the first one shows how certain creatures looked 
when they were alive, and the second one has become a Chinese meal! Each picture will be 
accompanied by text, clearly writing the spiritual power of these creatures, what kind of benefits 
will eating these creatures have on the cultivation base or the body!



Moreover, Qingfeng Tower is clearly marked!

For example, if a superdomain master's first-level ingredients are cooked, the price of this dish will 
be several times higher than at least a few superdomain master's first-level crystals!

"Fuck! What a **** pervert!" Li Tian cursed in his heart, and he focused more of his attention on 
this guy.

This guy from Qingfenglou, in terms of appearance, has many similarities with Li Tian, except that 
his ears are pointed and long, with two fangs at the corners of his mouth, and there is a monkey-like 
one behind him. tail.

But don't underestimate this guy, his cultivation level has reached the sixth level of Super Domain 
Master!

Far more than Li Tian!

Perhaps because of the existence of Beast Boy, a super domain master ninth-level powerhouse, the 
guy was polite to Beast Boy, and he was full of respect for Li Tian.

It's just... Li Tian could see a trace of puzzlement in his eyes.

Probably this guy didn't understand why the beast boy of the mid-level 9th level of the super 
domain master would be with the garbage who only had the seventh level of the domain master!

The beast boys are metal and steel beasts, and the bull-head sword and the rat-head sword are both 
tool spirit races. Even if they transform into human forms, their racial attributes are particularly 
clear and obvious. Therefore, this guy introduced them to blood!

Yes, it is the blood of various creatures!

Crazy knife drinking blood, this is the delicious meal of these metal creatures in the metal world.

And what this guy recommended to Li Tian are other foreign races!

Li Tianqiang endured the nausea and waved his hand quickly!

"Hey, this friend of mine came to Qingfeng Tower for the first time, and he was still not used to this 
kind of environment, so he gave us some beautiful bars! Want the most common water and wine..." 
Beast Boy said in order to take care of Li Tian.

This guy would not look down on Li Tian and others because of this, and soon the water and wine 
were served.

Wine is still warm!

The man pushed it down, the beast boy took the wine and drank it all in one go!

"Li Tian, did you notice the roof of Qingfeng Tower when you flew to Qingfeng Tower?"

"The roof?"

Li Tian remembered that the whole Qingfeng Tower was made of black metal, and only on the top 
of the tower did it seem to have a lightning rod.

"Could it be that the needle at the top of the tower is a divine tool?"



"That's right! This Qingfeng Tower is also a waste. One of the twelve powerhouses in the legend of 
the metal world's Fire Meteor Bow and Yuanyang Extinguish God Arrow were used as decorations 
by them. I will look for excuses and The other super-domain master-level powerhouses on this top 
floor are going to war. When the time comes, the Bull Head Sword and the Rat Head Sword, and 
you cooperate with Li Tian to **** the Yuanyang Extinguish God Arrow on the top of the building! 
At that time, this Qingfeng Tower Those masters in the game will definitely not let it go. The idiot 
landlord will take his fire shooting star bow out, and then we will kill people and win treasure..."

"When will you save the Sea Monster Race?" Li Tian still remembered this in his heart.

"As long as the Lord Qingfeng dies, then the fairyland will be in chaos. Isn't it easy to save the Sea-
Monster Clan by then?"

Chapter 4899: : Just do it (2)

Just do it!

If you really want to find fault, creating conflicts can't be easier.

It's like a certain area of China in the earth world, saying ‘what are you looking at? ’And the phrase 
‘look at you what’s happening’ may be the fuse of a fight.

The same is true in this metal world.

The beast boy is really looking for something, and any other superdomain master on the 17th floor 
of Qingfeng Tower may become his target.

A look, a word will become the reason for the battle!

No, the beast boy started looking for the target after saying the sentence just now.

There are not many guests on the seventeenth floor. There are a total of eight metal tables the size of 
eight immortals in the area of more than two hundred square meters, and the distance between each 
table is relatively far apart, except for Li Tian. In addition to the table, there are three other tables 
near the window with guests!

Fortunately, the Qingfeng Tower, or the entire metal world, seems to have no customary design such 
as private rooms or private rooms, which allows the beast boy to find his target unscrupulously.

"Have you heard? This time the Shining Bandit seems to have provoke a great opponent!"

"Of course I heard it, I saw it with my own eyes! The Shining Bandit dared to do something against 
the Lingjin Clan, but in the end several little-known little men rioted at the auction venue!"

"Little guy? Impossible! The shining bandit cultivation bases in Wonderland are not weak, at least 
there are super domain masters of the eighth level who are in charge! If they are only small people, 
I am afraid that the shining bandit will already be strong Beheaded!"

"The words are so right, but I saw with my own eyes that the guy who shot at that time really had a 
lot of cultivation base, it seems... as if the cultivation base level is the domain master level! This is 
absolutely not wrong!"

The few who are talking are the tiger roars who have entered the metal world from other circles!

The appearance of the Tiger Roar is very similar to that of human beings. When all new members of 
this race are born, their body skin is no different from that of human beings in the earth world, but 



as they begin to practice, something like tigers will appear on their bodies. The higher the level of 
their cultivation, the denser the pattern.

In addition, when they speak, their voice is loud, like a tiger roar, so this race is called the tiger roar.

At this time, the guys sitting on the seventeenth floor of Qingfeng Tower are not weak in their 
cultivation level. The weakest cultivator has reached the initial stage of the third level of the super 
domain master, and the strongest cultivator has reached the initial stage. He actually already 
possessed the eighth-level mid-level super domain master.

Their cultivation base is strong, coupled with the racial characteristics, which makes these strong 
men of the Huhou clan a little unscrupulous and defiant.

On the seventeenth floor, although the powerhouses of the other two tables disdain the feeling of 
bluffing with these tiger roars, it is better to do more than less, and they are not willing to conflict 
with them.

These tiger roars were talking vigorously. Suddenly the strong man who possessed the Transcendent 
8th-level mid-level realm felt someone blowing behind his ears, "I seem to hear someone saying 
that I am a small person! Then I want to see it. See what kind of big people you are!"

The one who speaks is naturally the beast boy!

This product was like looking for trouble. The Huhou clan was talking about the beast boy at this 
time, and the beast boy just pushed the boat along the water, just in time to take the Huhou clan.

Blowing behind the ears of other powerhouses looks like a very ordinary action, but for these 
superdomain master-level powerhouses, this is definitely a provocation.

The eighth-level strongman of the Tiger Roar Clan Superdomain Master felt that he had been 
greatly insulted, and wanted to stand up and give a good lesson to the fellow behind him.

However, before he stood up, he felt an arm on his shoulder, pressing him firmly on the seat.

"Don't be so angry with the young! The angry hurts the body, let's talk about your insulting me 
now!" The transformed beast boy put an arm on the shoulder of the strong tiger roar, with a trace on 
his face With a contemptuous smile, he said with a sneer.

The Tiger Roar Clan, an eighth-level super domain master, did not stand up all of a sudden, and 
tried two more times, only to find that he couldn't escape the shackles of the beast boy anyway, and 
his expression could not help but change slightly.

However, the other super domain masters of the Huhou clan didn’t know the power of the beast 
boy. Seeing that the beast boy dared to be so rude to their little leader, he couldn’t help being 
furious. The four super masters at the same table At the same time, he stood up and yelled at the 
beast boy, "Damn mutant thing, roll aside, otherwise your Tiger Roar clan uncle can kill you here 
regardless of whether this is Qingfeng Tower or not!"

The one who was talking was for the super domain master's fifth-level peak powerhouse. This guy 
had not figured out the situation until now, and even dared to swear.

The Beast Boy is obviously not the kind of broad-minded person. He was originally looking for 
something. Since these guys of the Tiger Roar tribe are so prosperous, the Beast Boy has no 
scruples.



I saw a sneer on the face of the beast boy, and the arm resting on the shoulders of the eighth-level 
super domain master of the tiger roar clan, and then pressed on his head, slammed the ground, and 
directly touched the super domain master. The eighth-level powerhouse pressed it on the table, 
pressing his face on the greasy food!

Beast boy tells everyone with practical actions, try not to make noise if you can.

This time, the movement was extremely fast and clean.

Several other super-domain masters of the Tiger Roar clan were actually deterred by the surging 
spiritual power released from the Beast Boy, standing still at a loss, looking at the Beast Boy in 
panic!

"Ultra... Super domain master ninth-level powerhouse?"

Several tiger roar clan experts either subconsciously shouted out, or thought in a trembled heart.

But, no matter what, the beast boy has already begun to do it!

It is impossible for the Tiger Roar Clan Superdomain Master to be killed by the Beast Boy at once. 
Of course, the Beast Boy's purpose is not to kill this guy now.

While knocking this guy on the table with one move, the beast boy pressed his head with his right 
hand, his body was flying lightly, and his legs kicked at the two weakest tigers with thunder and 
lightning. The strong roar.

boom!

boom!

The cultivation bases of these two Tiger Roar clan superdomain master-level powerhouses are too 
far apart from the Beast Boy, and they were kicked sadly by the Beast Boy before they had time to 
retreat.

One is in the neck, and the other is in the chest!

The guy in the middle of his chest had great luck. He was kicked by the beast boy and broke several 
chest bones. He spouted a mouthful of blood and was kicked directly from the 17th floor of 
Qingfeng Building. Flew back in midair and landed on the seventeenth floor again.

The tiger roar in the middle of the neck was kicked off in an instant, and the guy's head flew 
directly to the adjacent table. The **** head was spinning around on this table. All kinds of things 
on this table. The ingredients have been knocked over!

"Damn Tiger Roar, do you want to die!"

Seeing that the beast boy is a hard point, the super domain master-level powerhouse at this table did 
not dare to spread his anger on the beast boy, so he could only curse at the tiger roar.

In an instant, the entire seventeenth floor was completely chaotic.

This is what the beast boy wants.

Li Tian and Niu Toujian glanced at each other, their figures flashed and jumped to the top of the 
tower!

"Do it!"



Chapter 4900: : Just do it (3)

When he fell to the top of the tower, Li Tian saw that the "lightning rod" was the legendary artifact 
Yuanyang Deshen Arrow!

However, at this time, the god-killing arrow as it was at this time looked exceptionally ordinary. 
The baby's arm-thick arrow body was rusty, and it didn't feel the slightest fluctuation of spiritual 
power, and it didn't look like an artifact at all.

"Is this Yuanyang Desperate Arrow?" Li Tian turned his head to look at Bull Head Sword in 
disbelief!

Bull Head Sword also looks dumbfounded!

He only saw the changes after the combination of Yuanyang Mishen Arrow and Jihuo Meteor Bow 
with the legendary strong man on the murals of Qiling Clan Treasures. On the metal wall murals, 
Yuanyang Mishen Arrows and The bow is not very specific, but rather like an abstract painting.

"Whether it is or not, since we have come here, we must not go home empty-handed!" said 
Niutoujian.

The rat head knife that just climbed up from below crawled all over the spire, and said tremblingly: 
"Can you hurry up, I feel that all the strong people in the entire fairyland have focused on the 
Qingfeng Tower. If we If you want to leave the fairyland alive, stop talking nonsense!"

Although Ratsou Dao was afraid of death, he was right.

Li Tian could already feel that at least the consciousness of hundreds of powerhouses had locked the 
Qingfeng Tower.

It’s just that the top floor of Qingfeng Tower is that only those who are above the fifth level of 
Super Domain Master are eligible to enter. So far, no one has rashly dared to break into the 17th 
floor of Qingfeng Tower, but... this day of wonderland happened twice in a row. In the large-scale 
battle, Li Tian and their every move will probably enter the sight of other powerhouses.

and so……

"Bull Head Sword! Become a giant sword!" Li Tian shouted at Bull Head Sword.

The Yuanyang Mighty God Arrow was on the top of the Qingfeng Tower, but it was not left to Li 
Tian to take it.

Li Tian saw that the metal on the top of the Qingfeng Tower was wrapped around the body of the 
Yuanyang Deshen Arrow. It was obviously unrealistic to pull the Yuanyang Deshen Arrow from the 
metal.

If this is the case, then you can only move it rough, cut off the metal with the bull's head sword, and 
then pull out the Yuanyang Deshen Arrow and take it away.

As soon as Li Tian’s words fell, the Bull Head Sword's figure flashed, and it had transformed into a 
nearly two-meter-long sword. The sword rotated a few times in the air and fell into Li Tian’s hands. 
Li Tian grasped the hilt with both hands. He jumped up, jumped up and slashed the giant sword 
towards the metal under Yuanyang Mie Shen's arrow.



At the same time Li Tian jumped up, the spiritual power released by Li Tian had already blasted 
towards the metal spire along the sword body.

boom!

With a loud noise, the metal spire was cut open in an instant with a half-foot deep trace. Looking at 
the cut, Li Tian had already seen the part of Yuanyang's arrow body destroyed.

Li Tian applauded in his heart. The Bull Head Sword is a super domain master class spirit clan. The 
power of the weapon after being transformed into a weapon is really phoebe. If it is replaced with a 
normal sword, it may leave a trace of an inch deep. Not bad.

but……

Li Tian saw that the blade of the bull's head sword in his hand had just left after a few seconds, and 
he began to heal quickly. It is like digging a pit with a shovel and quicksand on a sand dune. The 
newly dug pit will soon be covered by other quicksand!

"Fuck! Does the metal of Qingfeng Tower also have the ability to heal automatically?" Li Tian 
couldn't help but cursed.

But at this time, even if Li Tian scolded too much, it was useless. There was no turning back arrow 
when he opened the bow. Now that he has already started, he must pull out the Yuanyang 
Destroying Arrow from here, otherwise everything he did before will be abandoned. , And Li Tian 
and others will offend Qingfeng Tower and other powerful races in Wonderland.

At this time, the mouse head knife finally overcomes the fear in his heart, his figure flashes, his 
hands grasp the Yuanyang Desire Arrow, trembling and swaying desperately to pull out the body of 
the arrow, but the Yuanyang Deshen Arrow does not move.

Boom!

Boom!

Even standing at the spire of the Qingfeng Tower, Li Tian and others could hear the violent sound of 
the beast boy fighting with other strong men on the seventeenth floor. The violent energy 
fluctuations made Li Tian feel lingering!

"It must be speeded up!"

Li Tian flew up again, and the bull's head sword in his hand kept slashing on the metal at the spire 
of the tower.

boom!

boom!

boom!

Metal fragments on the spire of the tower flew horizontally, and even sparks continued to splash!

Fortunately, the metal's automatic recovery speed is far less than that of Li Tian's slashing. In a few 
minutes, Li Tianran has seen the body of Yuanyang's arrowless arrow completely exposed.

However, at this moment, the whole Qingfeng Tower shook violently!

"Not good... Qingfeng Tower is going to collapse!"



In Qingfeng Building, there are such shouting personnel on almost every floor.

Whoosh!

Whoosh!

Whoosh!

The powerhouses who were curious about the violent energy fluctuations from the building just 
now flew out of the Qingfeng Building without any explanation.

Those guys in Qingfeng Tower, although they really want to stop these guys who ‘eat the king’s 
meal’, but those strong guys fly out at the same time, these guys are also helpless!

A small island outside the main island of Wonderland, this is an island exclusively owned by 
Qingfeng Tower, a huge force. The area of the island is small, but the various vegetables grown on 
it are sufficient for daily use of Qingfeng Tower.

And in the center of this small island, there is a wooden building made of wood. This is the 
headquarters of the Qingfeng Building.

The host of Qingfeng Tower is practicing here!

The violent energy fluctuations from Qingfeng Tower had long been noticed by the owner of 
Qingfeng Tower, but he didn't care about it. He believed that with the strength of Qingfeng Tower, 
few people in the entire fairyland dared to stray wildly on the head of Qingfeng Tower.

Therefore, he just sent the left and right Dharma kings from Qingfeng Tower.

But... not long after the Lord of the Kings left or right, the host of Qingfeng Tower suddenly felt the 
Jihuo Meteor Bow in his hand tremble suddenly!

"Could it be... is someone moving that arrow?"

The original poster of Qingfeng suddenly felt a sense of anxiety in his heart!

The Fireball Bow was accidentally obtained by the Qingfeng original poster in his world. Any 
arrow feather on this Fireball Bow can be hundreds of times more powerful.

The only pity is that as long as his Qingfeng master casts his spiritual power on the arrow, and then 
uses the fire-collecting meteor bow, the arrow will soon fall apart after flying out, and it is likely to 
be before the enemy is injured. , This arrow will destroy itself.

For this reason, the original poster of Qingfeng has forged many kinds of arrows in his world, but 
without exception, any arrow can't bear the bow of the fire meteor.

The original poster of Qingfeng was very painful.

He can feel that the Fireball Bow in his hand is superb, but if there is no suitable arrow, the original 
poster of Qingfeng always feels that the Fireball Bow in this episode will not be able to exert its full 
strength.

The original poster of Qingfeng always thinks that the Fire Meteor Bow should have a special 
arrow, but he has not found this kind of arrow yet!

For this reason, the original poster of Qingfeng began to look for arrows in his world. Later, for 
various reasons, the original poster of Qingfeng entered the world of metal and began to test. 



However, the original poster of Qingfeng never gave up looking for arrows to match with the 
shooting star bow.

Huangtian pays off!

On a giant metal land in the metal world, the owner of Qingfeng inadvertently broke into a metal 
cave. In this cave, the owner of Qingfeng found a very unique arrow. Now, the owner of Qingfeng 
is set to be used as a lightning rod. This Yuanyang Extinguish God Arrow.

It is a pity that although the original poster of Qingfeng got this arrow, he still has no way to refine 
the arrow.

And after the arrow was taken away by him from the metal cave, it seemed to have spirituality, 
always thinking about getting out of his control.

As long as the Qingfeng poster releases his arm, the arrow will fly away by itself, flying into the 
metal cave!

In desperation, the owner of Qingfeng could only use a magnificent metal Qingfeng Tower to 
control the arrow, and then look for opportunities to slowly refine the arrow!

No one thought that the refining of Qingfeng Louzhu did not know how many years had passed.

Unknowingly, the cultivation base of the original master Qingfeng has been greatly improved, 
reaching the initial stage of the ninth level of the super domain master.

Later, the original poster Qingfeng had lost hope in refining Yuanyang Mie Shenjian. He wanted to 
leave the metal world, but at this time, the original poster Qingfeng sadly discovered that there was 
no way to leave here.

Helplessly, the original poster of Qingfeng can only continue to cultivate in the metal world, 
continue to refine this special arrow, hoping that he can break through to the half-god realm as soon 
as possible, so that he can have hope to leave the metal world!

Now, the Fire Meteor Bow in the hands of the original Qingfeng is trembling.

This situation only happened when the Yuanyang Destroying Arrow was about to fly away.

"Could it be that the arrow from Qingfeng Tower is about to fly away again?"

"Impossible! The arrow was fixed by me with the entire Qingfeng Tower! Unless..."

Suddenly, there was a strong anxiety in the heart of the original poster of Qingfeng!

"It seems that I have to go to Qingfeng Tower to have a look, and see who dared to run wild on my 
Qingfeng Tower!" The Qingfeng building owner has no way to continue practicing here!

The host of Qingfeng stood up, patted the clothes on his body calmly, tidied the clothes, and then 
walked to the wall, went down the quiver from the wall, carried the quiver on his back, and opened 
the wooden door with the shooting star bow. Flew towards the Qingfeng Tower.

There are a total of twelve arrows in the quiver. These twelve arrows are all forged from special 
metals in the metal world!

These twelve arrows are somewhat similar to Yuanyang Mie Shen Arrow in appearance, these are 
substitutes for Yuan Yang Mie Shen Arrow!



But... these arrows are also unable to withstand all the spiritual power of the Qingfeng Louzhu. 
When the Qingfeng Louzhu's spiritual power exceeds one-tenth of his maximum ability, the metal 
arrow shot is very likely to be instantly Burst open.

boom!

boom!

When the host of Qingfeng was still some distance away from the main island of Wonderland, he 
had already seen a few ants moving on the top of Qingfeng Building!

"Hey, there really is someone who wants to die. If so, then I will fulfill you!" The Qingfeng master 
drew a metal arrow from the quiver, and placed it on the bow of the set fire meteor, and shot an 
arrow at the top of the Qingfeng building. !
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