
A Killer 5321

Chapter 5321: Dantian changes

The night light penetrated the window and shone on the floor inside the room.

Li Tian’s room was quiet, and there was no extra sound except for a very steady breathing. He sat 
on the bed like an ancient Buddha, with his legs crossed, hands on his knees, palms facing the sky, 
doing In a state of cultivation, his energy absorption is very fast in this state, and it can also make 
his body recover little by little.

Since knowing the special place of his body, Li Tian began to practice very hard.

When I reach a place like God Realm, it’s like a sheep entering the mouth of a tiger, and I 
constantly encounter some more powerful opponents than myself. None of these people can be 
easily dealt with by Li Tian alone, but life forces him to only be with these people. Fighting, can 
only work hard to ensure that when he can compete with these people, he will survive. Only in this 
way can he grow up slowly.

Therefore, he seizes all the time to cultivate at all times.

As long as there is a little free time, I will work harder.

There was obviously not much passion in the initial trials, because the truly powerful characters 
have not yet stood up. Just like when Li Tian meets his opponent, he can easily kill his opponent 
with just one fist, not at all. Under any pressure, such a battle may seem cool, but it is completely 
incomparable.

For those who are watching the battle around, they hope to see the battle between the two 
powerhouses, and use all of their skills, so that they can learn something from it.

Just like the battle between Li Tian and Zhuge Yuntian, although the battle between these two men 
is not that gorgeous, it is indeed a very exciting battle. The situation is constantly reversed. In the 
end, everyone thinks that Li Tianzai is just When they were about to fail, they suddenly emerged 
and successfully defeated their opponents, and this alone made them admire.

Although the battle on the first day was easy, it was different on the second day.

There are about 500 people left from 1,000 people, and the selection of the top 200 will start 
tomorrow. The SLR has entered the top 200, and it can be said that it has a very good strength in 
Luoyang City. It can be regarded as a status symbol. After all, not everyone can do it so easily to 
have the strength to enter the top 200 in Luoyang City.

In the next battle, it might not be easy for Li Tian to want to be as easy as before.

After all, their opponents have been verified to a certain extent, and they can win from the first 
batch of guys, which naturally means that their combat effectiveness is far beyond what ordinary 
people can think of.

At this time, Li Tian was observing his body by an inward-looking way.

Many immortals who have cultivated to a certain level will master this ability. They can rely on this 
magic to observe their body, so that your body is transparent in front of you. You want to see 
everything inside. It's easy.



At this time, Li Tian could clearly see the inside of his body, including the meridians or blood 
vessels.

Even the frequency of the beating of the internal organs can be clearly seen.

At the position of his dantian, there was a scene that Li Tian had never thought of. The stone that 
the remnant soul of the ancient **** gave to him, at this time, I don’t know why it has entered Li 
Tian’s body. This is It happened without Li Tian's knowledge. Even he himself didn't know what 
happened. The stone was inexplicably integrated into Li Tian's body.

And it's still in the place where the celestial power is concentrated, and I don't know what the 
function of this stone is.

He was still grateful to the Old God of Remnant Soul for staying at this time to help him find so 
many good things to tide over the difficulties, but now he has a little urge to scold his mother, no 
matter who sees his body suddenly Adding such a stone would definitely feel unacceptable no 
matter what, and wanted to avenge the person who gave him the dead stone.

Li Tian was like this, he wanted to find the ancient gods to ask what was going on.

This is like giving you a super treasure, but not giving you the key, but letting you find and explore 
by yourself. The only thing Li Tian knows about this stone is that this is left to him by the remnant 
soul of the ancient god. The thing, since it is the remnant soul of the ancient gods, the value of this 
thing must be very ordinary. Before, in the ancient scrolls and trials, they have played some good 
abilities.

But it's just that. Li Tian has always been a monk in Zhang Er's mind about this stone. He doesn't 
know if this stone will make him safer if he stays by his side.

As a result, he hasn't done anything yet, and a stone like this appeared in his body. No matter who it 
is, it will find it difficult to accept it.

He wanted to control his immortal power to completely expel the stone in his dantian, but all failed. 
The stone remained motionless inside, and seemed to be perfectly integrated with Li Tian's body. 
Similarly, no matter how hard he tried, he never succeeded in changing this situation. Instead, the 
stone began to frantically absorb the power in the tower.

It can be seen that after Li Tian made a little movement, this stone suddenly began to become 
greedy, absorbing the energy in Li Tian's body frantically, as if to transform himself into a more 
powerful existence, and here Li Tian tried many ways before and all failed. He really couldn't do 
anything with this stone.

Except knowing the origin of this stone, nothing can be done now.

‘Damn it, it’s okay how something like this happened to me, it really makes the 
character very depressed. ’

Li Tian was helpless, but now he can only take a closer look at what kind of changes the stone has 
brought after entering his Dantian. Therefore, when the stone starts to devour his energy frantically, 
he can only choose Continuing to enter your own cultivation state, no matter what it is, it will 
always be saturated, let alone this kind of energy-absorbing stone.



Li Tian believes that it won't be long before this stone will be completely saturated, and then 
become a very useful weapon in his hand.

Chapter 5322: Xinghai

‘Boom Rumble’

Suddenly, there was a thunderous sound in Li Tian's mind, and then the whole world seemed to 
tremble at this moment. He did not open his eyes to see if his house had collapsed. It was because 
He can clearly feel that his body is undergoing earth-shaking changes, and such a figure is 
emanating from his body.

Until now, Li Tian couldn't even explain what happened to him.

After absorbing a lot of energy, the stone suddenly made a huge explosion, and then it exploded 
completely like a wisp of smoke slowly disappearing, and Li Tian People's emotions are beginning 
to get bad, and the remnant soul of the ancient gods told him to protect the stone when he first gave 
him this stone.

No matter who you meet, you can't easily show them this stone.

But what is the situation now? This stone actually did such a thing in his body, and it exploded in 
his dantian. The energy rushed out in an instant was like thousands of babies holding Li Tian’s 
belly. Let her start to convulsions, and persevere hard, the appearance of so many you in the body 
makes him a little unacceptable.

But when things got to this point, Li Tian didn't dare to mobilize all the power in his body casually.

The reason is that he doesn't even know what kind of changes his body is undergoing now. In order 
to prevent this change from becoming a mistake, he can only obey this change.

Since this stone was given to me by the remnant soul of the ancient gods and helped me in many 
battles, it is enough to show that there are many secrets hidden on this stone that I don’t know. The 
secret of the stone, don’t try to change anything. This is the thing that Li Tian can figure out most 
clearly now. No matter whether this change is good or bad, he is not doing anything now. There 
must be nothing. Incorrect.

With this thunderous sound constantly ringing, Li Tian's entire Dantian was in confusion.

If it is said that his current Dantian is a world, then what the world is currently experiencing is an 
event like the destruction of the world.

The explosion caused by the stone began to form vortices one after another in Li Tian's dantian. 
These vortices slowly condensed, like a vast universe, with the passage of time, slowly condensing 
a lot of starlight.

‘What’s going on here, how can such things appear in my body? 'Li Tian looked at the 
starlight in his body. This stone is slowly transforming Li Tian’s dantian. Before, he 
was not sure whether this matter was good or bad, but now he can be sure. To say 
that such a change is profitable and harmless.



The whole room was filled with very strong spiritual energy in this short moment. If someone 
cultivated here, he would definitely feel that the speed of cultivation was twice the result with half 
the effort.

This is because when Li Tian is in this state, the extra celestial power in his body is being madly 
repelled out, but it is not truly integrated into nature, but is waiting outside for the second 
absorption. After the secondary absorption comes in, these celestial powers will begin to become 
more solid, and then become one star after another in Li Tian's Dantian.

The time of change is very long, and there is a little bit of pain.

At the beginning, Li Tianbian felt some pain, but he was still able to hold on. When he was fighting 
in the lower realm, he experienced a lot of cruel battles. It can be said that he endured more pain 
than many people.

But as this change became more and more lasting, Li Tian finally began to find that his body could 
not support it.

These energies were madly absorbed by the stone, causing Li Tian’s body to become like a kettle 
filled with boiling water at this time. The swelling hot water was squeezing his body bit by bit, 
expanding his body. His body and his internal organs began to undergo earth-shaking changes.

Of course, this is just a description. The truth is that these energies are starting to make Li Tian's 
meridians stronger and broader.

In this way, he can run his immortal power faster when he is in battle, and in the same realm, Li 
Tian’s immortal power storage is stronger than others, but he consumes faster than others. More 
slowly.

In other words, although it did not directly increase Li Tian's combat effectiveness, it did allow Li 
Tian to occupy a natural advantage among opponents of the same level.

In this way, even if he wants to challenge his opponent by leapfrogging, it is not impossible.

Feeling that his body had undergone such a huge change, even if he needed to endure a great deal of 
pain, Li Tian had no complaints at this time. He knew that if he did not pass, there would be no 
more perfect future.

I don’t know how much time has passed. Li Tian’s clothes have been soaked in cold sweat, and the 
whole body feels as if he is out of control. This kind of paralysis began to appear after being 
expanded by the power of the immortal. , It stabbed Li Tian deeply, keeping him awake all the time, 
even if the brain wants to dizzy and therefore pass this painful period, there is no way to do it.

During this period of time, Li Tian could only persist through gritted teeth.

Finally, there was no more thunder in his body.

And his dantian, at this time, has also undergone a huge change completely.

Li Tian hadn't really seen his dantian before, but it was very ordinary, but now his dantian may be 
the whole world, unique in appearance, I believe there is very likely no second person in this world 
will have this The pubic area.



The entire pubic area has become a pitch-black universe, and in this universe, there are countless 
starlights. These starlights condense to form a vast universe in Li Tian's body, which looks 
extremely mysterious.

And that stone, floating quietly in the center of Li Tian's dantian, exudes a strange energy like the 
center of a world, connecting with other stars in the entire dantian.

Li Tian could feel that the energy on these stars was his own celestial power, as long as he needed to 
mobilize, he could easily mobilize these celestial powers for his own use.

Chapter 5323: Mystery man

He raised his head and glanced. This process seemed to him as long as a whole century had passed. 
During this process, Li Tian almost couldn't hold on. The pain was really very tormenting.

However, in the outside world, it is actually just a few minutes.

Li Tian felt the changes in his body. It was an unspeakable feeling. If he was just an adult before, 
then he is now an adult who regularly exercises.

They are all adults, but they are completely different in terms of combat effectiveness.

He can confidently say that if it is an opponent whose realm is exactly the same as himself, he can 
easily defeat the opponent with the strength of his own body, without the need for more gorgeous 
tricks.

This is the change this stone brought to him.

Some can't be said, but this change is very real in Li Tian's dantian, and it can be very real to him 
anytime and anywhere.

Gently squeezed his fist, his body instinctively burst out with a powerful force, making him feel full 
of power throughout his body: "Why did this stone suddenly change like this? The remnant soul of 
the ancient **** gave me What is the purpose of this stone, and how can I know what the changes 
in my body are."

After experiencing such benefits, Li Tian quickly woke up. There must be no pie in the sky in this 
world.

Such a change in his body must have to pay some price accordingly. What he doesn't know now is 
how much he needs to pay for this matter.

Regarding the matter of the ancient gods, he now wants to know more urgently.

This is about the change of his body, and only by understanding the real history of the ancient gods 
can Li Tian understand what kind of changes have taken place in his body, and whether there are 
other people’s Dantian and Dantians in this world. The way he is now is exactly the same.

Li Tian was curious, but he was only curious.

Obviously it will take some time before the Sky City wants to enter, and even the Sky City may not 
really be able to understand the history of the ancient gods. You must know that history has always 
been a means used by the victors to control the lower. They will use history to justify themselves 
and make themselves a glorious and righteous existence. But which warlord since ancient times will 
truly represent justice?



Everyone’s heart is more or less evil, no matter what he does, he will still be linked to his own **** 
after all.

No one dares to guarantee that he is truly desireless, like a saint.

"Who."

Li Tian's eyes suddenly became solemn. After such a change in his dantian, he tried to spread his 
spiritual thoughts out, and unexpectedly found that there was another person near this room. The 
breath is completely different from those guards, and it is still dormant on the other side of the 
window, seeming to be eavesdropping on something.

There was a cold drink right now, and at the same time, the spiritual mind quickly locked in the 
past.

"Don't speak loudly." At this moment, a figure appeared in front of Li Tian, showing a kind smile: "I 
really didn't expect that I would be able to meet you as a kid again. Maybe it's true in our lives. It’s 
very destined to let me meet you here."

Li Tian looked at the man in front of him carefully, then arched his hands: "Senior..."

"Hey, don't be so cautious, maybe you are not very clear about the purpose of my coming to you 
this time." The person who came is not someone else, it is the water ghost Guzi who has friendship 
with Li Tian, this guy ascended to the gods long ago. After that, Li Tian had very little news of 
Water Ghost Guzi. After he soared to the God Realm this time, he did not really want to find Water 
Guiguzi.

It was the first one who wanted to find out where Situ Ningbing was, but what he didn't expect was 
that Shui Gui Gu Zi came to the door himself.

"How did you get in?"

"The City Lord's Mansion is indeed tightly guarded, but it doesn't mean that it is truly leak-proof. 
The tightly guarded places are only those places where Lu Xiu and Lu Wenhui often appear. Your 
guest rooms are just a little defensive, but they are not so tightly guarded. Shui Gui Gu Zi squinted 
his eyes, looked at Li Tian, and asked: "What is going on with that Catherine, I have heard a lot of 
things between you."

"I am pierced in the eyes of many people in the God Realm itself. My identity has not yet been 
exposed, but when I stay in the God Realm longer and longer, and the road I travel further and 
further, there will definitely be more People know me and guess my identity. By then, my enemies 
in the gods will be countless. I don’t want those friends around me to be implicated a little bit 
because of my own affairs, since it happened because of me. I would rather solve the matter by 
myself." Li Tian looked at the water ghost millet, sighed, and said in a serious tone.

"You have a good idea, but people live in this world. In many cases, it is impossible to change 
anything by only relying on their own strength." Shuigui Guzi sat down on the table next to him, 
like looking at his child Looking at Li Tian in the same way, he sighed for a long time, poured a cup 
of tea, and said, "Although your idea is not wrong, there is a wrong approach."

"In the current situation, I can only use this method to get them to dispel any thoughts of any 
relationship with me, otherwise the next thing will involve them."



"It looks like you are preparing something." After hearing Li Tian's words, Shui Gui Guzi's face 
changed slightly, and then looked at Li Tian in front of him with a solemn expression, and said in a 
deep voice, "Should you not? You want to be right with Lu Xiu, you know that he is the city lord of 
Luoyang City. Your current strength is probably not at the same level as Lu Xiu. How can you..."

"Of course I know, but I have no choice." Li Tian looked at Shuigui Guzi, saying word by word, 
very heavy: "Senior probably also knows what happened in today's game, you know very well, I am 
now What is going on in his situation, right?"

Seeing Li Tian's expression, Shuigui Guzi sighed helplessly. He was doing other things before.

But after receiving Catherine's news, he immediately came to Luoyang City, and then learned a lot 
of Li Tian from Catherine's mouth.

Chapter 5324: Draw up a plan

"Know part."

"Then you should be very clear. Although I have reached an agreement with Lu Xiu, Lu Xiu has 
always been worried about whether I will implement the so-called agreement between us, and after 
I show such talent, I think what Lu Xiu wants to do most now is to get rid of me." Li Tian slowly 
stood up and closed all the doors and windows firmly: "The better my talent, the more impossible 
my future is. Presumably, he Lu Xiu, after all, can't really control me."

"It seems that you are very clear about your current situation, and you have already started to make 
your own plans." Shui Gui Guzi nodded, and then smiled to himself: "It seems that my worries are 
completely unnecessary. I thought you didn’t know what Lu Xiu secretly planned. This time I 
wanted to let you know the situation and see what you plan to do.”

"If my guess is not wrong, Lu Xiu is probably ready to kill me now, but not now, as long as this trial 
is over, he will do everything possible to kill me. I am just a god. The immortal of the realm of 
cultivation is nothing more than that. He wants to kill me without any effort." Li Tian held his fist, 
this feeling of being slaughtered is really not very good.

But he has no other choice.

The room fell into silence for a while, and neither of them said anything.

I don’t know how long it has passed before Shuigui Guzi sighed: "Luoyang City is in such a remote 
place. Although it is not a powerful main city, Lu Xiu’s cultivation is better than the average city 
owner. A little bit higher, reaching the strength of the immortal realm, and no one knows his specific 
strength of the immortal level. In addition, he rarely shoots at ordinary times. We know very little 
about Lu Xiu."

"It is indeed like this. Lu Xiu's strength is far more complicated than I thought. Therefore, after I 
finish that thing, I will choose to leave Luoyang City as soon as possible." Li Tian looked at the 
water ghost millet in front of him, Speaking in an imploring tone: "Senior, you want to help me in 
this matter. Now I can't find a better trusted companion in the God Realm, so I can only ask Senior 
to help me."

"What do you need me to do for you." Shuigui Guzi didn't mean to refuse at all.



"I hope that seniors can help me arrange some safe roads, or create some chaos on the day of the 
trial finals, so that I can also successfully leave Luoyang City with the help of this chaos." Li Tian's 
eyes went straight. Staring at the water ghost millet, I can see that the water ghost millet has some 
hairy all over, but I feel that this kid is just thinking about something bad.

"What the **** do you want to do, how do I feel that you kid seems to be doing a very dangerous 
thing." He couldn't help asking, really curious what Li Tian's plan was in his heart.

"I want to kill Lu Wenhui."

The tea in'Puff' Shuiguiguzi's mouth was sprayed out, and he almost fell to the ground, staring at 
him and said: "Your kid is crazy, Lu Wenhui is Lu Xiu's only son. You want to leave Luoyang after 
killing him. City? Even if you leave Luoyang City, you will become the enemy of the entire God 
Realm. There will be many people chasing you and killing you. Do you think you can survive from 
these people?"

"After I ascended to the realm of the gods, I didn't have much thoughts of living. It was an old man 
who saved me and encouraged me to keep working hard. Only then did I have the idea of survival 
again." Li Tian's eyes were full of expressions. The sadness of some memories, although the time in 
the town is very short, but there is a sense of vividness. It seems that everything that happened 
before was the same as yesterday: "But Lu Xiu wanted to catch me, so that my identity was not It is 
known to the outside world that I have killed the people in the entire town. Although I can't avenge 
this grudge, I still have to make Lu Xiu sad."

"You are very righteous." Shui Gui Guzi said irritably. This kid is indeed very righteous, and few 
people can do this step.

But while being righteous, there was a little bit of idiot.

Killing Lu Wenhui, this is not a hornet's nest.

"I have no choice. Lu Xiu must choose to kill me anyway. In that case, I might as well kill Lu 
Wenhui directly. This guy has always looked down on me before and didn't treat me as a real 
person. I don't need to give him a little bit of face." Li Tian gritted his teeth, and everything Lu Xiu 
did was clearly remembered in Li Tian's mind.

It is absolutely impossible for him to forget. As a strongest in the lower realm, he has his own pride, 
and he will never allow a character like Lu Xiu to insult his pride.

"Have you really decided?"

"It's decided." Li Tian nodded firmly, staring at the water ghost millet in front of him intently, and 
repeated: "You, would you like to help me."

"Since you are like this, then what choice do I have. If I watch you die in the realm of the gods, if I 
see your father then, I'm afraid I won't have a face to confess." Shuigui Guzi chatted. He smiled, 
and then he burst into a swear word: "Isn't he just a city lord who has been in Luoyang City, **** 
him, but you have to follow my arrangements in the process."

"Do you have a plan?"

"I will come to you the night before the final. If I can't come here by that time, I will send someone 
a message to you." Shui Gui Gu Zi stood up and patted Li Tian on the shoulder: "When the time 



comes, you only need to follow my plan above. I believe I will let you leave Luoyang City safely. 
When the time comes, when the two of us are strong enough, we must come back and kill Lu Xiu."

Li Tian nodded and said nothing.

He holds three cyan spells in his hands, but he doesn't know if these three spells can turn the tide of 
the battle.

All they know so far is that Lu Xiu’s strength is already in the realm of immortals, and they don’t 
know anything else. This person is usually very careful and never really reveals his strength in front 
of people, so far, Except for some people who are really close to Lu Xiu, they basically don't know 
the strength of this guy, so Li Tian doesn't know whether three charms can defeat Lu Xiu.

But to be on the safe side, he was still unwilling to pin his hopes on the three spells.

"Okay, then I will leave now. When I'm ready, I will naturally tell you other news." Shui Gui Guzi 
and Li Tian looked at each other, smiled, and then turned into a stream of light, disappearing...

Chapter 5325: Catherine's strength

After Shuigui Guzi left, Li Tian had been sitting silently in his room.

Although thinking in his heart that he did not want to involve anyone in, he did not expect that he 
would need to rely on the strength of others in the end. He wanted to rely on his own ability to 
complete the action plan this time, but this was simply unrealistic. For Lu Xiu whose cultivation 
level has reached the realm of immortals, even if all his plans are seamless, he will eventually be 
defeated by finding flaws.

Fortunately, the water ghost millet appeared at this critical time. At present, there are very few 
people Li Tian can trust in the God Realm.

But Shuiguiguzi is definitely one of them.

He believed that Water Ghost Guzi would definitely help him leave Luoyang City. If he died in the 
God Realm, he would be very guilty for the rest of his life, and it would have a great impact on his 
mood. Therefore, Li Tian believed that Water Ghost Guzi was here. There will never be any slack in 
this matter, and it will definitely find the most suitable and safest way to leave Luoyang City.

There is no doubt at this point.

The next thing you need to do is to try hard to play to your true level in the trials tomorrow, until the 
finals.

But speaking of it, there are not many powerful masters in such trials that Li Tian can deal with.

After all, there are only ten people in Luoyang City that can make Li Tian worry about. Although 
other main cities are not few, there must be a small number of people who come here all the way, 
except for the remote main cities like Luoyang City. , Other main cities are more or less related to 
some sects, and those young people who show extraordinary strength in the main city will soon be 
selected by those sects.

And Zhuge Yuntian, I’m afraid it’s an exception. No one knows why he would come here so far to 
participate in a trials of Tianluo Zong. You must know that the strength of their Zhuge family is 
better than that of Tianluo Zong, but at all. Not bad, and there is no problem at all to cultivate a 
super strong.



Even Ji Youling can be given to him a magic weapon, let alone a person like him.

Li Tian doesn't understand, of course there are more people who don't understand.

Among them is Nanfeng bamboo.

Before the finals, Li Tian had been carefully investigating the other elders of Tianluo Zong. 
Although they did not know their strength, entering Broken Cloud Mountain to deal with the little 
Lolita and the one-eyed orc might not seem to them at all. It's that simple.

One thing that Li Tian knows very well is that Little Loli has noticed that they have survived on that 
battlefield, but did not choose to kill them. Instead, they left their lives, perhaps to let them know 
the real situation inside. Tell these people outside so that some powerful people can come in and 
make trouble for her. No one knows what this is for.

But what Li Tian can be sure of is that Little Lolita is very confident of her own strength, maybe in 
her opinion, even if the **** emperor arrives, she may not be able to defeat it.

On the next day, there were no more or less surprises in Li Tian’s battle. As I said before, there were 
not many people who could really make him feel dignified. Those opponents who didn’t put Li Tian 
in his eyes before. When facing him, it can be easily solved with just a fist.

He finished his game early and then came to another ring.

On the ring today, Catherine and another man are fighting.

Li Tian rarely sees Catherine shot, but from this woman's usual performance, it can be seen that she 
is a very sturdy woman. I believe that this kind of trial is more or less difficult for Catherine, and it 
can even be said, It is simply a pediatrics. Only when the quarter-finals are around, the gold content 
of these battles will start to increase a little bit.

The purpose of his coming here is to see how strong Catherine is and whether he can finally become 
a member of Tianluo Sect.

"I didn't expect my opponent to be the famous Miss Catherine in Luoyang City. It really surprised 
me. It's actually a bit embarrassing for me to fight against a beautiful woman like you. If I beat you, 
others will call me bullying. Woman, but if I fail, others will say that I am inferior to a woman. This 
is how I should be." The man who spoke seemed to be only in his twenties, as if he was still very 
young. It should be a person born in the gods, with a cold smile on the corner of his mouth, looking 
at Catherine in front of him.

These words sounded helpless, but they were actually mocking Catherine.

After all, women are inherently disadvantaged. Only a few women can break through their shackles 
and become the existence that many men are afraid of.

"You seem to be willing to talk such nonsense, believe it or not, I will use my fist now to let you 
know why the flower is so red?" Catherine squinted her eyes, looked at the somewhat mad man in 
front of him, and snorted coldly: "I rarely do If a man talks to me like this, you are the first one, so 
today I will not be merciful. You'd better prepare mentally. This battle is very difficult for you."

The man shook his head and sighed, "It seems that you can just talk big."



At the moment before his voice fell, I saw Catherine suddenly snorted, and then a burst of light red 
fairy power was ejected from her body, like a layer of illusory armor covering her , The faint red 
fairy power was also condensed into a ball in her hand, and then blasted down with a heavy punch.

Sure enough, she is a hot girl, even the way of fighting is so simple and rude.

Although it looks a bit savage, it is really effective.

But don't underestimate the power of this fist, if you eat this fist without any defense, then the next 
end is to become a corpse directly.

As for the man, although he spoke lightly, he was more or less careful when facing Catherine.

Especially when Catherine came to this fist suddenly, it made him stunned for a while, and then all 
the hairs on his body were erected, and cold sweat followed.

The corner of Li Tian's mouth rose slightly, looking at Catherine on the ring, and nodding slightly.

The battle has not yet been determined, but Li Tian still sees some eyebrows, at least now Catherine 
has an advantage in the aura.

Chapter 5326: Peace of mind

As if feeling the same, Catherine's eyes suddenly glanced down the ring.

Soon after, I saw Li Tian standing below.

Her mouth opened slightly, looking at the man below, she seemed a little at a loss, and even the 
movements in her hands subconsciously slowed down a lot.

And the man seized this opportunity and showed a sly smile: "Haha, let me catch the flaw, at this 
time you still want to look down and see how I make you pay a heavy price." While talking, he took 
out a huge sword from his storage, holding the hilt in both hands, and slamming it upward, easily 
breaking Catherine's move.

Originally, Catherine had already completely taken advantage of her aura before. If that situation 
were to continue, it would not take much time to defeat the man in front of her.

But the appearance of Li Tian made Catherine a little bit shaken.

It was just such a slight shake that the man in front of him caught the flaw, and then launched a fatal 
attack instantly.

When Catherine recovered, the huge sword had already been chopped down. He could only 
reluctantly raise his hands, attempting to use this method to block the attack of this sword, followed 
by a crisp'click'. Sound, the Xianli on her body was also damaged.

'boom'

Catherine flew upside down all of a sudden, slammed into the barrier behind her, and a touch of 
blood leaked from the corner of her mouth.

"Huh, even the famous Catherine is nothing more than that. When fighting with me, he will be 
distracted. Do you look down on me or think that your strength is enough to deal with me easily?" 
The man squinted and looked in front of him. Some embarrassed Catherine said disdainfully: "I 
have met many people, but I have never thought of you like this."



Catherine didn't answer. Although she had dealt with it in haste, she only suffered a slight injury, 
which did not affect her next battle.

Her eyes began to search for Li Tian's figure below, trying to see if the man was still below, but in 
the vast crowd, besides seeing many people with suspicion, he could not find Li Tian at all. It seems 
that Li Tian hadn't appeared here long ago.

‘Am I wrong? A bitter smile appeared on the corner of her mouth. When she saw Li 
Tian appear before, she thought things had turned for the better, but now she didn’t 
see Li Tian again, which made her wonder if she was wrong.

At this time, Li Tian had already left the ring.

He naturally discovered that Catherine had discovered himself, so he left in a hurry and ignored 
what happened afterwards, but I believe that Catherine will have no problems in the subsequent 
games. Just a glance before can confirm Catherine’s strength. About four stars in the realm of **** 
cultivation, it can be regarded as one of the best in Luoyang City.

With such strength, facing that man, even if he is injured, he can easily deal with it.

Therefore, Li Tiansi will not worry. Catherine will definitely be able to successfully become a 
member of the Tianluo Sect. The only thing he hopes now is that he should not meet Catherine and 
the others in the subsequent games, otherwise the next thing may happen. It will make Li Tian a 
little bit embarrassed, facing them, is he doing it or not?

If Li Tian went all out and let them lose this opportunity, then even Li Tian would have some 
imbalance in his heart.

Looking up at the blue sky, he could only sigh helplessly: "I hope we won't meet in the next game. I 
don't want to play against you. After all, I have been with you before. For a while."

There was still no pressure on Li Tian on this day.

He easily defeated his opponent, and then swaggered to the charm shop of Jubao Pavilion.

After seeing Li Tian, the fat man felt his teeth tickling with hatred: "It turns out that the old man 
was you guys, but we were still stunned by you. The cyan spells were all sold to you so cheaply. 
Guy, I'm so angry."

Seeing the excited expression on Fatty's face, Li Tian didn't doubt at all, if allowed, he would be 
here to attack himself.

"Didn’t you also say that there is a problem with your capital chain, and no one would want to buy 
these things with you. Since no one cares, and I helped you solve the problem, you should thank 
me. Why? Now it seems to be very angry." Li Tian squinted his eyes, looked at the fat man in front 
of him, and said with a smile: "I am here now to continue buying some spells from you."

"No, no, I knew you were such a cunning guy. We would never sell you any spell." The fat man 
snorted coldly, squinted at Li Tian in front of him, and was about to drive Li away. day.

"You can think about it, I am now ten rookies in Luoyang City, and the future is definitely limitless. 
If you can have a good relationship with me, the future will definitely benefit a lot, but you make 
me hate it. I want to know that I will definitely not make you comfortable. You have to know that I 



am now a guest at the Lord's Mansion. I have done things before and he will definitely help me." Li 
Tian narrowed his eyes and said threateningly.

The fat man looked at Li Tian, and at this time he began to feel a little worried.

In desperation, he snorted: "Okay, okay, I just managed to do your business today, but don't think 
that I just compromised like this. I will always be worried about the previous things."

Li Tian smiled indifferently, and looked at the child next to him: "Come on, buy some more 
according to the charms I bought before, I want to spare some."

After the previous battle, it can be regarded as let Li Tian know the benefits of the charm, especially 
when his current moves are extremely consuming immortal power, if he has to use other spells to 
assist his battle, the immortal power must be Not enough, even after the dantian has been changed, 
after the Xianli reserves are more, it still can't withstand such a high consumption.

But with spells, his celestial power can be fully used on his very expensive tricks, and at the same 
time, he can use the spells in his hands to assist him in the battle, which is indeed a very good 
method.

Li Tian squinted and looked at the child in front of him.

"Got it." The child nodded, turned around and started looking.

Chapter 5327: Battle of the top sixteen

In the next few days, the entire Luoyang City was filled with a fighting atmosphere.

The trial held by Tianluo Zong made many people excited. After all, it was the first time they saw 
such a fierce battle in so many years. Although these young people are not strong, they all fight in 
different ways. They are strange, and it can be seen that their strength is not like ordinary people.

And Li Tian played very ordinary in these battles.

If you want to see what kind of strength this young man is from the way he fights, it is obviously 
impossible. He has been using his spare time from fighting to restore his physical state.

Lu Xiu also seemed to know that the next battle was the highlight of this trial, so he took care of Li 
Tian and basically did not let him face any difficult opponents.

By the time of the top sixteen, Li Tian had completely recovered to his peak state.

In the previous game, only a few people came to watch it, but it was obviously not that simple when 
it reached the top sixteen. Among the ten shows in Luoyang City, Li Tian knew only Lu Wenhui and 
Catherine.

The few remaining people are all scattered immortals from other main cities.

They didn't understand Li Tian's strength at all, and Li Tian didn't understand their strength at all.

There were more spectators in the whole trial than a few days ago. Many people know that this is 
when the real game begins. At this time, more people are willing to come over and watch their 
battle. After all, it has reached this level. , The battle will become more exciting.

Li Tian sat on a chair in the waiting lounge and looked at the passionate crowds around him.



For unknown reasons, Catherine was sitting beside Li Tian, and there was no other person around 
the two.

This arrangement also made Li Tian very embarrassed, sitting here like sitting on pins and needles, 
very uncomfortable.

"I can see that you are not in a good mood right now, are you very nervous? The next round of 16 
battle may also be a challenge for you that cannot be underestimated." She squinted her eyes and 
turned her head. It was a cute little girl who looked at Li Tian and asked with a smile.

"Fighting in the round of 16? It's just because I don't know the opponent's strength, so I am a little at 
a loss now, but if I don't have confidence in this game, then you still think more." Li Tianban With 
his face, he just looked calmly at the ring in front of him, his eyes didn't stop at all on Catherine's 
body. Although the two people were sitting together, they looked like strangers.

Catherine looked at Li Tian who was so indifferent, and felt a little sad in her heart, but she was 
very strong and said nothing.

She knew that Li Tian might have his own difficulties.

"I know you have your own difficulties. I believe that you are not the kind of person we see now, 
but I hope that no matter what difficulties you have, you can tell us. After all, we have lived and 
died together, as long as it is yours. We are all willing to work hard to help you." She looked at Li 
Tian affectionately, and said slowly in a low tone.

"Don't think about it, the next round of 16 battles will not be so easy to deal with. Mengsk and Xing 
Jun have been eliminated. I advise you to be more cautious, but don't be eliminated before then." Li 
Tian said faintly. He said something, sounding like a mockery, and then closed his eyes, began to 
close his eyes and calm his mind, adjusting his current state.

Catherine sighed helplessly, and could only look at the top of the ring, waiting for the next 
arrangement.

"The battle in the top 16 is much more intense than before. How long do you think he can hold Li 
Tian under such a wheel fight?" Nan Fengzhu looked at Lu Xiu beside him. This guy wanted to 
make Li Tian can better be defeated and die, so when he arranged for Li Tian, he deliberately 
arranged some more difficult opponents. Although he would still win in the end, the price to be paid 
was still very huge.

"I don't know, I hope he can successfully advance to the final. If he fails like this, then I have 
nothing to say." Lu Xiu shrugged and looked at the distance sitting in the lounge chair. Li Tian 
above snorted softly: "Speaking of this, what happened inside the Broken Cloud Mountain Range? 
Since they passed, there has been no news."

Speaking of those who had been investigating the Broken Cloud Mountain Range in the past by 
Tianluo Zong, Nanfengzhu also began to become serious.

Compared with the trials, this matter is obviously more important. Otherwise, Tianluo Zong would 
not send so many people over, but after these people have come over, it has been almost a week or 
so. In this week, there was no news at all, it was like the world had evaporated, and no one knew 
what happened to them.



"I don't know what's going on, but the two elders brought the disciples of the Tianluo Sect, and even 
our two direct disciples. Their strength is also not to be underestimated, presumably even if they 
are. If there is a problem, it will not be a difficult problem to deal with." Nan Fengzhu still looked at 
Li Tian, but the expression on his face became more or less serious: "I hope they will go. Don't go 
wrong."

"We still need to be concerned about this situation. What we have learned about the internal affairs 
of Broken Cloud Mountain is only the little news that Li Tian and the others brought back. Now 
they personally go to investigate, if the strength of those monsters lies far behind them. Above, then 
these people might really stay there and not come back." Lu Xiu squinted his eyes and began to 
vaguely worry.

They are like an arrogant king, thinking that they are a superior being, and belittle their enemies 
time and time again.

When the truth of the matter was in front of them, they began to become a little at a loss. As it is 
now, they understand to some extent that their opponents may not be so easy to deal with, even if 
Tianluozong did this time. The above has been very cautious, but it still seems to have no effect. 
The opponent may be really terrible.

Otherwise, what kind of explanation should be used, such a huge team, a whole week has passed, 
but there is no news and intelligence to convey back?

It can only be said that they may have been left in that forest forever.

Chapter 5328: The main show begins

"My mission here is only this trial. As for the lives and deaths of those people, even I am helpless 
now. Almost all the elites dispatched by our Tianluo Sect this time participated in this action. Their 
overall combat effectiveness is hard to imagine. Even the three monsters with the strength of the 
gods can not deal with them." Nan Fengzhu thought for a while, still had some confidence in his 
companions.

These people are all elite disciples trained by Tianluo Zong, and there are two elders who personally 
lead the team.

It can be said that Tianluo Zong has rarely dispatched such a large team for so many years, but in 
order to show that he attaches great importance to this action, the two elders directly led the team, 
and then arranged so many elite disciples. If you think about it, there will be no serious problems.

"What we think is not necessarily correct. Now we can only do these things well. I hope they can 
tell us the information inside, so that we can also arrange the next things." He sighed helplessly, 
then looked at the ring, nodded to a referee in the distance, indicating that the game can start.

The battle of the top 16 was naturally brilliant, but in this battle, the battle was still carried out by 
drawing lots.

Li Tian was fortunate not to meet Lu Wenhui and Catherine.

His opponent was a guy who looked a little mature, as if he had practiced some magic to rejuvenate 
his youth. His appearance was very young, but his eyes were very deep, as strange as the vast starry 
sky.



When Li Tian was standing on the same ring with him, he felt a burst of pressure.

"The previous battle was very exciting. The battle between you and Zhuge Yuntian may be called a 
part of the extremely exciting battle among the geniuses of the **** cultivation realm." He looked 
at Li Tian with a white mouth. The teeth seemed to be very kind: "My name is Chi Chenzi, and I am 
also here in Xianyang City. I think I have some friendship with Zhuge Yuntian."

"You have friendship with Zhuge Yuntian?"

"It's not wrong. Originally, the two of us were still discussing who can be the final winner of this 
trial and who can be the direct disciple of the Tianluo Sect. As a result, I didn't expect this guy to be 
so unlucky. With you, naturally, there will be no competition with me anymore." He smiled and 
looked at Li Tian in front of him, as if he was telling something that had nothing to do with him.

Li Tian frowned: "In this way, your strength may be stronger than Zhuge Yuntian, or similar to 
Zhuge Yuntian's strength."

"This is difficult to guarantee. The two of us have never played against each other, but even if we 
fight, I think it will be difficult for the two of us to really distinguish who is the final winner. It can 
only be that the strength of both sides is equal. "Chi Chenzi frowned, as if he was really thinking 
about it, then said to Li Tian very calmly.

"Hehe, it seems I have to deal with you seriously."

"This is the best way. I am different from Zhuge Yuntian. I was completely born in a poor family. I 
have received a lot of discrimination and unfair treatment since I was a child. For this dirty world, I 
want to treat myself more My destiny is in my own hands, so I won’t give you any chance in this 
trial, but if I catch a little flaw, I will win the final victory by killing you." Squinting at Li Tian, he 
showed no mercy, clenched his fists, and raised the corners of his mouth slightly, revealing a 
strange smile.

Li Tian raised his brows. Just standing in front of you will make you feel a little uncomfortable. 
Although he doesn't know the source of this discomfort, he still knows the feeling very clearly. .

Looking at Chi Chenzi in front of him, there was something wrong with him.

It's like something is controlling your thoughts.

"This guy also looks like a kind of fairy who is good at mental spells. The feeling it brings to us is a 
little bit similar to that of Zhuge Yuntian. Such guys will make you feel like they are not dangerous 
at first. Yeah, but when you relax your body, you will directly enter their trap." The voice of the 
great blue dragon resounded in Li Tian's mind. With the experience of Zhuge Yuntian before, they 
What is certain now is that passive beating must be a loss: "I advise you to take the initiative, not to 
give your initiative to this guy."

"But I don't know anything about Chi Chenzi. Taking the initiative is very likely to give all of his 
initiative to the opponent."

"Do you have any other choices now? Imagine the battle between you and Zhuge Yuntian before. If 
it weren't for a spell, maybe you have become a corpse now. Do you still think that the same miracle 
can appear on your body twice? Is it the second time?" Hong Huang Qinglong sensed Li Tian's 
hesitation, and now began to use real cases to advise Li Tian that in the face of such a Sanxian who 
is good at spiritual spells, he must not give them the initiative to fight.



Once they control your spirit, then you will become something that exists like a puppet, completely 
unable to judge any situation in the battle, and the final result can only be defeat. ,

Although Li Tian didn't want to take the initiative to take the initiative, finding the opponent's 
weakness and then attacking is obviously the best choice.

However, what Honghuang Qinglong said is not unreasonable. There is almost no time left for him. 
Moreover, these Sanxians who are good at spiritual spells, once they start to cast their spiritual 
spells, they want to find their flaws. It's difficult, and the process is also very dangerous. Maybe he 
hasn't found a break before he has become a corpse.

He didn't want to see such things happen to him, so he could only choose to take the initiative to 
attack.

I directly squeezed an imperial wind technique in my hand and quickly read the formula, and then 
the whole body began to become light and fluttering. If you observe carefully, you can find that 
there are some pale green fairy powers lingering around Li Tian Supporting Li Tian's body like 
countless hands, he became lighter, of course, this situation lasted only a few minutes.

After these few minutes passed, Li Tian needed more charms to maintain this state all the way.

Chapter 5329: Sorcery

Seeing Li Tian cast the spell, Chi Chenzi still didn't make any special movement, but calmly said: 
"Yufengshu, although it is only a very low-level spell among the spells, is often used by many 
people because of this spell. Even in high-level battles, some strength can be exerted, but it depends 
on the combat power of both sides to determine how much power this spell can exert in battle."

"It's really like this, but it's obviously enough to use such spells to fight with you." Li Tian squinted 
his eyes, looked at the weird guy in front of him, and then squeezed his fist: "Be careful, take it. I 
won’t be merciful in the next battle. Like you, I don’t want to miss such a good opportunity. 
Therefore, I will go all out in this battle."

"come on."

After Li Tian used the imperial wind technique, he directly summoned Hong Zhan, and then began 
to run around quickly. His speed was not slow, and coupled with the imperial wind technique, he 
became even faster. It really blows around you like a gust of wind, making Chi Chenzi in front of 
him become a little serious. Under such high-speed movement, his figure is also difficult to capture.

‘This kid has changed his previous tactics. It seems that these words I said still have 
an effect, making him mistakenly believe that Zhuge Yuntian and I are fighting in the 
same way. Seeing that Li Tian had chosen to take the initiative to attack, instead of 
choosing to wait and see and carefully test like the last Zhuge Yuntian battle, Chi 
Chenzi immediately guessed what Li Tian's thoughts were.

He is afraid that he is a Sanxian who is good at mental spells, so once he enters his own rhythm, he 
will get rid of it.

Under such circumstances, even Li Tian could not find any solution.

Therefore, Li Tian chose to take the initiative to attack.



But in fact, Chi Chenzi is not a so-called spiritual dispersal. The reason why he said that before was 
only to give Li Tian a feeling that he is similar to Zhuge Yuntian, so that once he truly shows 
himself With his ability, Li Tian can instantly feel overwhelmed, as long as he feels like this, he can 
instantly change the situation.

Li Tian obviously didn't know this, he was using Imperial Wind Technique to distract Chi Chenzi's 
attention, looking for his flaws.

As for Chi Chenzi, there was no slight movement, just standing on top of the original position like a 
log, his eyes narrowed slightly at this time, as if he was thinking about something.

There was no flaw in his body, but when Li Tian was observing, his body moved and a flaw 
appeared.

Li Tian did not hesitate, pinched out a few fireballs in his left hand, held Hong Zhan in his right 
hand, and attacked directly. Since he decided to take the initiative, there must be no mercy at this 
moment. This is among thousands of people. Of the sixteen powerhouses selected, everyone 
naturally has their magic weapon to win, and everyone can never be underestimated.

It's just a pity that Li Tian hadn't observed Chi Chenzi's battle before, otherwise, today's battle 
might have become easier.

But now he has all summoned several fireball arts, and immediately caused the air inside the 
enchantment to boil, and the ground also began to turn crimson. The two of them were like standing 
in a volcanic crater. The erupting flame was annihilated.

The Hong Zhan in Li Tian's hands even absorbed a lot of immortal power.

With the help of Dantian Xinghai, his current battle can condense his immortal power more quickly, 
and he can fully prepare on his side without any preparation from the enemy, and then attack in one 
fell swoop.

"Very grand attack, but do you think such an attack can really have any effect on me?" Chi Chenzi 
turned around to look at Li Tian after losing one hand. He didn't even look up at the top of his head. 
These fireballs just showed a weird smile. He looked at Li Tian and said, "From the very beginning, 
everything about you has been invisiblely controlled by me, even I didn’t even think of what I said. 
Everything is just to confuse you."

'boom'

A fireball fell from the sky and hit Chi Chenzi's head.

But at the moment of the electric flint, Chi Chenzi didn't even do anything. When the fireball fell, 
there was a smile on his face, as if he had completely ignored his life and death.

Faced with such a weird scene, Li Tian also quickly felt the unusual point of this matter.

But now it is too late even if he wants to change anything.

With the sound of an explosion, the dense fireballs all fell, like a covered missile attack, all 
slammed into Chi Chenzi's body, the explosion sounded endlessly, and the ground splashed. 
Countless dust covered the sight of many people. At the same time, the hot air wave hit the 
surrounding barrier like a scourge.



Fortunately, there were lessons from the previous battle between Li Tian and Zhuge Yuntian. 
Today's barrier can be said to be very strong. No matter how hard they work, it is difficult to destroy 
this barrier.

There is no way for the heat wave to dissipate, and it turns into free energy floating on the ring.

Li Tian looked at the veiled ring in front of him, and could only rely on his own spirit to find where 
Chichenzi was. At this point, something went wrong. He didn't even feel that there was Chichenzi 
around him. breath.

This person seemed to have completely disappeared from the ring.

"How is this possible? How could the guy who was standing on this ring just now completely 
disappeared in a blink of an eye? Could it be that I was completely killed by my fireball technique?"

"Do you understand?" Lu Xiu looked at Nan Fengzhu and said.

"It should be something from those cults. The people around Zhuge Yuntian are really weird. Even 
people who are good at this kind of cult will know them." Nan Fengzhu frowned. They claim to be 
righteous, but they are not true. They should be incompatible with cults. They are called cults only 
because the way they practice is weird and vicious, but that's all.

There is no particularly big conflict between the right way and the cult.

In a big dyeing vat like the God Realm, a small amount of friction will bring unimaginable 
consequences.

"This competition looks interesting. I don't know what kind of methods this little guy who is good 
at sorcery can have."

Chapter 5330: Tricky guy

Li Tian is now using his spiritual thoughts to cover the entire arena as much as possible. He knows 
that Chi Chenzi must not disappear from his sight like this. There is only one possibility to be sure. 
The opponent is not good at it. An immortal with spiritual spells, but one who practices another type 
of spell.

At this moment, the top of the ring is filled with smoke, and it is difficult to see the opponent's 
appearance.

"We are still not able to determine where your opponent is. Maybe this guy is still on this ring at 
this time, but he just hides himself in a special way." Honghuang Qinglong said in a low voice, they 
are the only one now. What is certain is that the opponent is still on the ring, hiding in the dark 
watching their movements.

Maybe it only takes Li Tian to reveal a flaw, and the opponent can attack quickly.

Li Tian also knows that, so he has always been careful to watch out for Chi Chenzi.

Suddenly, a thick black fog rushed towards Li Tian.

This black mist looks darker than ink, and it exudes a very strange smell, like the smell of a corpse. 
The pungent smell hits his face, and Li Tian quickly noticed it. A thick black fog.

The Hong Zhan in his hand slammed a sword light, and disappeared the moment it hit the black 
mist.



In the sound of "chichichichi", Li Tian's attack was immediately disintegrated, leaving no trace.

His expression was a little dignified, step by step he stepped back and squinted his eyes: "It seems 
that the opponent this time is very difficult. Although this spell is not known yet, it must be 
extremely evil, and There is also a corrosive nature on this black fog. If it encounters it, it might 
corrode me."

Li Tian stepped back step by step, but Hei Mist advanced like an army, constantly approaching him.

Seeing that the distance between Heiwu and Li Tian is getting closer and closer, he now has no 
choice if he wants to continue to retreat. His skill is not a sunshine avenue, but an enchantment. 
Wanting to retreat again represents failure.

He tried to use the fireball technique to wipe out the black mist, but it had no effect.

"You don’t need to work hard here. This black mist has a terrifying swallowing nature. It can 
swallow all the energy and objects in this world. Even I need to be careful to deal with it, not to 
mention you. Those who don't understand, I'm afraid there is no other way." Chi Chenzi's voice 
rang in Li Tian's ear, as if he was laughing.

Feeling the stench and pressure from the black mist, Li Tian could only fight to the death.

He took out the two imperial wind techniques, and then quickly chanted the spell. The speed of the 
whole person was increased several times, his feet slammed on the ground, and he jumped quickly.

At the same time, it was another wind protection technique, which turned into a hurricane and fell 
on the ring.

Since Chi Chenzi’s voice can still reach Li Tian’s ears, it can only mean that this opponent is still on 
the ring. There must be something that Li Tian hasn’t checked yet. Use the hurricane to remove the 
dust on the ring. After a part of the dense fog dissipated, the devastated arena was exposed to Li 
Tian's sight, and Chi Chenzi's figure followed.

This guy just stood there on purpose and detonated the fireball technique, and then used a means to 
hide his breath, instantly giving people the feeling that he was dead or disappeared from the ring.

But in fact, Chi Chenzi had never moved on this ring.

"Yes, it's like knowing this so quickly. It's worthy of a man who can defeat Zhuge Yuntian, but my 
opponent is more difficult than Zhuge Yuntian. Don't think this is over." He sneered. , Clenched his 
hands into fists, and condensed a cloud of thick black fog, and then began to gather slowly, as if to 
merge some different colors together.

The attributes of these black mists seem to be extremely special, and under his compulsory means, 
they actually began to resist.

This integration process is very slow.

However, Chi Chenzi would not be particularly worried, because Li Tian is still closely following a 
cloud of black mist. If it weren't for his fast speed, coupled with the assistance of the imperial wind 
technique, he might have been affected by that now. A cloud of black mist was swallowed directly.

Above the ring, the black mist would swallow the holy stones under their feet from time to time.



I don’t know how these black mists came from. After swallowing these sacred stones, the sacred 
stones under their feet did not recover from the internal energy for a while, still maintaining the 
appearance after being corroded and swallowed. It made people sigh and surprised that the power of 
this black mist was so terrifying that it could not even be opposed to the strongest sacred stone 
barrier in the world?

"There is no point in escaping. Even if you just made a small mistake in this battle, the final result 
was defeated by me, but I don't need to make a mistake by myself. I can just stand here. Controlling 
everything, no matter where you are, there is no way to escape my attack." Seeing Li Tian fleeing 
frantically, Chi Chenzi gave a cold snort, the corners of his mouth raised slightly, and said with a 
hint of disdain.

Li Tian ignored him, he still had a lot of imperial wind skills.

But the prices of all these things are not low. They are only available through his hard work these 
days, not only for this trial, but also for many things in the future. These imperial wind spells, so 
she wants to reduce her consumption as much as possible. If this is the case, she may need to defeat 
Chi Chenzi faster.

Their fighting method at this time was like a war of attrition. Li Tian didn't know what Chi Chenzi 
consumed, but what he consumed was these imperial wind spells.

Seeing the spells being used one by one by himself, Li Tian is really very painful now. For many 
people, the spells of Yufengshu are extremely precious, but they are now being used by Li Tian. It is 
used as a toy at will, and there is no desire to reduce the amount that he currently consumes. People 
have to wonder what the purpose of this kid is.

Chi Chenzi also knew that Li Tian was not consuming his immortal power, but he didn't stop it.

Even if a charm is a kind of auxiliary prop, it is not endless. Li Tian will soon consume all the 
charms on his body, and then he will release it.
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