
 I Have a Shop of Infinite Resources 

44 300 Million Wealth Points 

The villa had been occupied for a long time. All kinds of hustle and 
bustle had disrupted the luxurious European-style villa the developer had 
built. Piles of junk littered the place, and it was so messy that people had 
no place to walk on. 

However, Tang Susu had her eyes set on all kinds of dazzling 
gemstones in this place. 

Just as she was about to pick them up, 008 reminded her and said, 
[These are common gems. They are worth very little.] 

“Have I grown your appetite so much to where you no longer want 
ordinary gemstones?” However, Tang Susu was determined not to put 
any of them to waste as she pocketed one. 

“Do you know how expensive the things you sell are? Even the most 
ordinary goods start at a million. Any of the better ones start at a 
hundred million. Is everything in your world that expensive? ” 

[Sob. I am the shop that is connected to millions of worlds. I can supply 
you with whatever you want from any world.] 

“What about Hogwarts?” Tang Susu asked with some curiosity. 

[… Yes, But I have to be upgraded to level 15. At level 18, you can even 
trade for fantastical beasts from the fantasy worlds.] 008 said as he cast 
his bait. 

However, Tang Susu remained unmotivated. She didn’t want to become 
a slave, working only on missions. 

However, her body was acting honestly by collecting all kinds of 
valuables. 
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If the owner of the villa with the classical Chinese architecture was an 
antique collector … 

The owner of this villa was most likely a jewelry designer. 

All kinds of cutting and carving tools and leftover materials lay inside the 
villa while most of the finished jewelry was placed in another room. 

The room was over 20 square meters large and all kinds of racks filled 
the room. It was like a boutique, displaying all kinds of finished work. 

Tang Susu was overwhelmed. No woman could resist a room full of 
jewelry. She pulled Mrs. Tang over and enjoyed the dazzling spectacle 
together. 

“Good heavens!” Mrs. Tang couldn’t contain her excitement and ran in. 
“There’s so many! My goodness, am I dreaming? All of this is fake, 
right? But the texture… I want this! Let me try it on!” 

Mr. Tang, who was behind her, put on a dolphin necklace studded with 
diamonds on her, making no complaints. 

“I have to try this too!” 

“I also want this!” 

“That one is very pretty, too.” 

“Haha! Since they’re having their eyes on us, we don’t have to give them 
any consideration!” 

Seeing that her mother liked the jewelry so much, Tang Susu didn’t 
scramble to take them all. Instead, she let her mother pick as many 
pieces of jewelry as she wanted. She would then exchange the rest for 
Wealth Points. 

After a while, she found another safe in the bedroom. When she opened 
it, there was a full stack of pink-colored notes and two boxes. 



[A top-grade pigeon-blood ruby and a pink diamond!] 008 immediately 
cried out. 

It was a pleasant surprise. These two items were priceless. 

[They are worth 50 million each!] 

Even Tang Susu could not stop her heart from throbbing with elation. 

However, a light of pure scarlet seemed to flow out when she opened 
the box containing the pigeon-blood ruby. It was like fresh blood, 
radiating a strange and cold sense of mystery. 

She didn’t know why, but she didn’t want to exchange it for wealth 
anymore. 

“I’ll keep this, for now. Exchange the rest.” After her mother picked out 
the jewelry she liked, Tang Susu waved her hand and all of them 
disappeared. 

[Congratulations! You have obtained 300 million wealth points! ] 

Satisfied, Tang Susu stopped collecting the valuables and turned around 
to look for the supplies from the convenience stores that might be hidden 
here together with her parents. 

[You can spend 20 million to buy a machine that can search for 
materials. Otherwise, it will take too much time to find them on your 
own.] 

If it was in the past, the poverty-stricken Tang Susu would say no to 
buying such a useless piece of equipment. But now that she had 
accumulated some Wealth Points, she had become much more 
generous. 

“I’ll buy one.” 

[The machine is now in place. Searching…] 

Tang Susu waited and she received 008’s report soon enough. 



[Sorry, there are no supplies at your current location.] 

It was at this moment that someone turned the villa’s doorknob. “Are we 
still continuing tonight?” 

  

 


