
 
 
 

I Have A Sword  

 

Chapter 16: Dual Cultivation? 

Slap! 

Fei Banqing smacked Ye Guan’s head. “What nonsense is in that head of yours?” 

Ye Guan was flustered. “W-weren’t you trying to dual cultivate with me?” 

Fei Banqing glared at Ye Guan before tearing his shirt apart. 

There was a red fist mark on Ye Guan’s chest, and the skin around the fist mark was 
torn. 

Fei Banqing took out a white jade bottle. She opened it before gently tilting it toward the 
wound. Moments later, a dark green liquid poured out of the jade bottle and onto Ye 
Guan’s chest. 

The liquid felt cool and comfortable. 

Ye Guan was slightly embarrassed. 

Indeed… could dual cultivation even heal injuries? 

Fei Banqing glared at Ye Guan and said, “You better thank your lucky stars that he still 
hasn’t mastered his Profound Fire Fist. Otherwise, his fist would have punctured a hole 
in you and scorched your organs.” 

“Why did you even take such a risky move?” asked Fei Banqing. 

Ye Guan thought about it for a while before answering, “There are two reasons. Firstly, 
it was the simplest and most direct method. Secondly, he had been looking down on 
me. He’s arrogant, so there is an extremely high chance of success. I would have 
gotten injured in exchange for his life.” 

Fei Banqing went silent. 

Ye Guan revealed a look of disappointment. “I had intended to kill him; what a pity!” 

Fei Banqing said, “You still have a chance.” 

Ye Guan asked, “The academy doesn’t restrict fighting between students?” 



 
 
 

Fei Banqing shook her head and replied, “Doing that would be tantamount to giving up 
on martial arts. Of course, there is a limit to the fighting. If it goes overboard, we will 
naturally intervene. However, he used Sun Xiong against you, but he did it so cleanly 
that there‘s nothing we can use against him. It is all Sun Xiong’s fault for being too 
stupid.” 

Ye Guan nodded. “I understand.” 

“You better cultivate once you’re done taking care of your injury,” said Fei Banqing 
before standing up. She was about to turn around and leave, but she suddenly kicked 
Ye Guan’s waist upon recalling his words earlier. “I’m your tutor, so don’t even think 
about nonsensical ideas, do you understand?” 

Ye Guan was slightly embarrassed. He had truly misunderstood! 

Anyway, Fei Banqing departed, and Ye Guan decided to set the matter aside and 
looked down at his stomach. It seemed that Fei Banqing’s medicine was extraordinary 
because the injury had more or less healed. 

Ye Guan took a deep breath before taking out a Sky-rank cultivation manual. As soon 
as he opened it, the Sky-rank cultivation manual turned into a white light that sunk into 
his glabella. 

Moments later, Ye Guan started cultivating and the spiritual energy in the air rushed 
toward him. 

Ye Guan smiled upon sensing the rush of spiritual energy. What an awesome Sky-rank 
cultivation method! 

At this rate, it would take him less than a month to reach the Divine Path Realm. 

Ye Guan seemed to have thought of something, and he decided to ask, “Master 
Pagoda, what do you think of my talent?” 

Little Pagoda sounded calm as it said, “It’s not great.” 

Ye Guan stiffened. He had no idea what to say. 

Little Pagoda exclaimed, “I have heard some rumor about how someone of your age 
has already become an Imperial Realm cultivator. For your information, An Imperial 
Realm cultivator is as strong as a hundred Imperial-rank demonic beasts.” 

Ye Guan’s expression changed. He seemed moved as he said, “It seems that I am still 
a frog in a well. I have to work even harder!” 

With that, he stopped talking and focused on cultivating. 



 
 
 

Meanwhile, the mysterious voice in the pagoda asked, “He’s very talented, so why did 
you say that?” 

Little Pagoda calmly replied, “Have you already forgotten how his father fell back then? 
He fell because he got too arrogant. Do you want that lad to become arrogant as well?” 

The mysterious voice went silent. 

Little Pagoda continued, “In this world, you should not always rely on external 
assistance. ” 

The mysterious voice replied, “I agree…” 

… 

Meanwhile, an old man and a young man stood face to face on a mountain peak. 

Tutor Xiao gazed at Nan Xuan without saying anything, while Nan Xuan was silent as 
well. 

Moments later, Tutor Xiao finally spoke, “There was only one reason why he dared to 
challenge you despite his injuries. He was probably confident in his chances of killing 
you.” 

Nan Xuan remained calm as he replied, “I’m also confident.” 

Tutor Xiao replied, “Can you do what he did to Sun Xiong? Can you defeat Sun Xiong in 
a short amount of time?” 

Nan Xuan went silent. 

Tutor Xiao shook his head slightly and said, “I’ve heard about what happened in 
Nanshan Mountain Range. It’s not strange that you want to seek revenge. However, 
you’re too impatient. In addition to blowing your cover, you also made an enemy out of 
Sun Xiong. Sigh…” 

Nan Xuan clenched his right fist without saying anything. 

Tutor Xiao flipped over his palm, and a scroll appeared in front of Nan Xuan. 

Nan Xuan was startled. “What is it?” 

Tutor Xiao calmly said, “Open it.” 

Nan Xuan’s expression changed upon opening the scroll. 



 
 
 

“A Sky-rank Mysterious Art!” he gasped. 

Tutor Xiao nodded. 

Nan Xuan immediately bowed. “Thank you, Tutor.” 

Tutor Xiao replied, “Let me bring you to a place where you can cultivate in peace.” 

With that, they disappeared from the mountain peak. 

… 

Meanwhile, Ye Guan was still cultivating in the hall of his palace. 

“Ye Guan!” 

However, a shout from the outside startled him awake. 

Ye Guan looked out and saw a young woman smiling at him. The young woman was 
wearing a black dress, and she was standing outside with her hands on her back. 
Overall, she looked charming and elegant. 

Ye Guan immediately got up and ran toward her. 

He threw his arms around her and laughed boisterously. “Sister Nan!” 

The young woman was none other than Ye Nan—Ye Xiao’s daughter. 

Ye Nan glared at Ye Guan and said, “I’ve heard that you arrived here several days ago, 
so why did you not look for me?” 

Ye Guan chuckled hollowly. “I’m sorry, it’s my fault.” 

Ye Nan didn’t seem to mind as she stood on her toes and compared her height with Ye 
Guan’s height. 

She smiled at the result and said, “You’re taller than me now.” 

Ye Guan smiled and asked, “Sister Nan, how have you been?” 

“I’m doing good, but I’m a bit homesick. After all, I can only go back home during the 
annual vacation,” replied Ye Nan. Afterward, she stared deeply at Ye Guan and said 
with a smile, “I’m really happy to see you here.” 

Ye Guan examined Ye Nan and asked for confirmation, “Truth Realm?” 



 
 
 

Ye Nan nodded and confirmed. “Yes!” 

Ye Guan looked around before taking out a storage ring and handing it over to Ye Nan. 

Ye Nan gasped upon seeing what was inside. “Gold spiritual crystals?” 

“There are about two thousand of them here. They’re yours,” said Ye Guan. 

However, Ye Nan shook her head and refused. “This is too much…” 

Ye Guan smiled at her and explained, “I’m sure it’ll only be a matter of time until you 
reach the All-Truth Realm with the gold spiritual crystals in there.” 

The idea sounded great, but Ye Nan was still hesitating. 

At that, Ye Guan became slightly unhappy. 

“Sister Nan, since when were we so distant?” he asked, seemingly aggrieved. 

Ye Nan rolled her eyes at him and said, “Fine!” 

She finally accepted the storage ring. 

Ye Nan looked around. She was happy as she said, “I really didn’t expect that you’ll 
become Tutor Fei’s disciple. You even have a palace for yourself. I’m so jealous of 
you…” 

Ye Guan smiled at her and suggested. “If you’d like, you can stay here.” 

Ye Nan shook her head and said, “No, that would be against the rules.” 

However, it seemed that Ye Guan wasn’t the only one who had a surprise for the other 
because Ye Nan also took out a basket and handed it over to Ye Guan. 

Ye Guan froze before asking, “What is this?” 

“Open it and see!” Ye Nan urged with a smile. 

Ye Guan opened it and found a fragrant roasted chicken in the box. 

Ye Guan was thrilled. 

Ye Nan smiled and exclaimed, “Surprise! It’s your favorite!” 

Ye Guan didn’t stand on ceremony. He sat down and started devouring the dish. 



 
 
 

Cultivators could fast for an extended period of time, but it was only truly applicable to 
powerful cultivators. A cultivator at Ye Guan’s realm still had to eat. 

Fasting is nonsense! I have to eat, and I want to eat good food. If given the chance, I’ll 
even eat dragon meat! 

Meanwhile, Ye Guan asked Little Pagoda, “Master Pagoda, have you seen a dragon 
before?” 

Little Pagoda replied, “Yes.” 

Ye Guan sounded envious as he said, “Master Pagoda, I really admire you. It seems 
like you’ve already seen everything that the world has to offer. You’re really incredible!” 

Little Pagoda didn’t know what to say. 

Ye Nan arranged her skirt and sat next to Ye Guan before proceeding to stare at the 
latter while he was eating. 

Ye Guan was an adopted son, so most members of the Ye Clan weren’t really fond of 
him when he was still a child. However, Ye Nan had spent most of her time playing with 
Ye Guan when they were still children, so they grew extremely close. 

Ye Nan could still remember how Ye Guan often covered for her whenever she got into 
trouble because of her mischievousness as a child. She would then repay Ye Guan by 
cooking for him while he was in the middle of serving punishment on her behalf. 

All of a sudden, Ye Guan turned to look at Ye Nan and asked, “Sister Nan, are you not 
going to eat?” 

Ye Nan shook her head and replied, “I got it for you.” 

Ye Guan grinned and devoured a chicken leg. 

Ye Nan chuckled at the sight. “Do you know how impressive you were on the Life or 
Death Stage? Many of my female friends are infatuated with you right now.” 

Ye Guan shook his head and smiled. I was risking my life for a goal, and my goal wasn’t 
to look cool. 

Ye Nan smiled at him and asked, “How are things going between you and Nalan Jia? 
Are you living under the same roof?” 

Ye Guan was appalled, and he quickly retorted. “Excuse me, our relationship is 
wholesome, just so you know!” 



 
 
 

Ye Nan rolled her eyes at him and said, “What, pure? You have to be bolder. Let me tell 
you. Every woman out there wants their men to be a bit cheeky toward them. Do you 
understand what I’m saying?” 

Ye Guan was rendered speechless. 

Ye Nan shook her head and laughed at Ye Guan’s dumbfounded look. 

“You’re so dense,” she said. 

With that, she lifted her basket and said, “I’ll bring you food when I’m free. I’m off.” 

Ye Guan stared at Ye Nan’s departing figure, and his expression grew increasingly 
solemn. 

Eventually, he stood up to look for Fei Banqing. 

I really have to be cautious! There’s a chance that my enemy will go after those who are 
close to me and use them against me. 

It was bullshit that had to be avoided at all costs. 

It didn’t take Ye Guan long to find Fei Banqing and he explained his concerns. 

Fei Banqing was rather calm as she said, “Don’t worry. No one is daring enough to 
commit murder in the academy.” 

Ye Guan went silent. He was unconvinced. But I had done it before… 

Fei Banqing seemed to have seen through Ye Guan’s thoughts. She shook her head 
and said, “I’ll ask the other tutors in the academy to look after your sister. I’ll also give 
her a sound transmission talisman. If anything happens to her, I’ll personally head over.” 

Ye Guan bowed deeply and said, “Thank you, Tutor.” 

However, it seemed that Fei Banqing wasn’t done just yet as she said, “I heard that Nan 
Xuan and his tutor went to one of the training towers.” 

Ye Guan frowned. “Training towers?” 

Fei Banqing nodded. “There are nine training towers in the academy. The towers are 
great places to cultivate because they have nine levels of difficulty. There’s apparently a 
mysterious reward upon reaching the ninth level of the towers.” 

Ye Guan’s curiosity was piqued as he asked, “What kind of reward?” 



 
 
 

Fei Banqing shook her head at Ye Guan. “I don’t know.” 

Ye Guan was confused. 

Fortunately, Fei Banqing quickly explained, “Only those under the age of twenty-four 
can enter those towers. Those towers were built by powerful cultivators from the Main 
Academy many years ago, so we don’t know what the mysterious reward is…” 

Ye Guan’s curiosity intensified as he exclaimed, “I’ll go and try my luck!” 

“Entering a tower requires high-grade purple spiritual crystals,” advised Fei Banqing. 

“It’s fine,” said Ye Guan with a nod. However, his expression soon turned complicated 
as he said hesitantly, “Tutor, why did you sound like you’re short of money? Am I right? 
I still have—” 

“Short your head!” Fei Banqing shooed him impatiently. “I have a lot of money! Hurry up 
and get to a training tower!” 

Ye Guan was dumbfounded by Fei Banqing’s excessive reaction. 

Chapter 17: She Is a Great Sword Immortal! 

“Wait!” Fei Banqing stopped Ye Guan. 

Ye Guan turned around. 

Fei Banqing stared deeply at him for a moment before saying, “You only have a month 
until your death match with Nan Xuan. If you’re going to kill him, I advise that you wait 
until the death match. Otherwise, you will be breaking the rules, and you’ll be in deep 
trouble.” 

Ye Guan remained silent, mildly surprised. He didn’t expect that Fei Banqing would see 
through his thoughts. 

He was actually planning on assassinating Nan Xuan, and it was all because he had 
always preferred to settle his grudges as soon as possible. 

Fei Banqing sighed and said, “It’s great that you’re stubborn. I think powerful men 
should be stubborn, but you have to keep in mind that you’re already a student of the 
Guanxuan Academy, and you’re not invincible as well. You have to stick to the rules, or 
you’ll be suppressed by those who are more powerful than you.” 

Ye Guan nodded. “I understand…” 

Fei Banqing smiled at the sight and said, “Go ahead.” 



 
 
 

Ye Guan bowed before turning around to leave. 

Fei Banqing shook her head. This disciple of mine is great, but he’s too ruthless and 
decisive. He should think about the ramifications before doing something! 

Fei Banqing seemed to be criticizing Ye Guan, but Ye Guan’s principle of giving no 
quarter to his enemies and his decisiveness were precisely the reasons she quickly 
grew fond of the latter. 

Fei Banqing grinned upon recalling Ye Guan’s decisiveness, but she soon shook her 
head. She could finally understand her tutor’s feelings back then. A hot-headed disciple 
is indeed troublesome! 

… 

The Trial Peak was located on the southern side of the Guanxuan Academy. The Trial 
Peak was actually a mountain range with nine ridges between the mountains, and there 
was a trial tower on each of the ridges. 

The students of the Guanxuan Academy could naturally train in the trial towers. 

Ye Guan skipped traveling through a ridge and arrived directly near one of the trial 
towers using a teleportation portal. He smiled slightly upon seeing one of the trial 
towers, and the intent to fight burned in his heart. 

He knew that he could only test his limits through fighting. 

His battle with Sun Xiong made him realize that Sun Xiong lacked combat experience, 
especially in life-or-death battles. Of course, it wasn’t really strange that Sun Xiong was 
a greenhorn in that kind of battle. 

It was a common issue among disciples of grand clans. Their great family background 
gave them access to lots of resources, so this meant that they had never really 
experienced fighting for their lives in exchange for resources. 

Therefore, the disciples of grand clans would often struggle against vicious individuals 
who were more than willing to bet their lives in exchange for cultivation resources. 

It was only natural that the privileged disciples of those great clans were greenhorns 
when it came to life-or-death battles. After all, why would they risk their lives against 
barbarians? 

However, Ye Guan’s many years of living in Ancient Desolate City made him realize 
one thing—a cultivator had to be vicious! 

He would die if he wasn’t vicious enough. 



 
 
 

Soon, Ye Guan arrived at one of the trial towers. An old man was standing by the 
entrance of the trial tower. The old man glanced at Ye Guan before saying, “A hundred 
purple spiritual crystals for every two hours.” 

Ye Guan nodded and paid two hundred spiritual crystals. 

The old man stored the purple spiritual crystals in his storage ring. 

“You have four hours,” he said. 

Ye Guan bowed slightly and asked, “Senior, am I allowed to go to any floor?” 

The old man stared at Ye Guan and replied, “Yes, but it depends on your strength.” 

Ye Guan smiled and nodded. “I understand.” 

With that, Ye Guan walked into the tower and was immediately transported to an illusory 
realm. 

A sword-wielding phantom was standing In front of him. 

Ye Guan was slightly surprised at the sight. A swordsman? 

Without warning, the phantom dashed forward and thrust its sword at Ye Guan. The 
phantom was swift. Ye Guan sidestepped and avoided the thrust, but the sword still 
brushed past Ye Guan’s head. 

Ye Guan’s eyes narrowed, and he stomped with his left foot. 

Boom! 

The phantom staggered backward. Ye Guan rushed ahead and struck the chin of the 
phantom with his elbow. 

There was another loud noise as the phantom disintegrated from the impact. 

Ye Guan tidied his clothes and headed up to the second floor. As expected, another 
phantom was waiting for him there. 

This time, Ye Guan took the initiative and charged at the phantom. Ye Guan’s fist struck 
the phantom before it could even react, and it was disintegrated by the flow. 

With that, Ye Guan headed up to the next floor. 

And just like that, Ye Guan reached the seventh floor… 



 
 
 

The sword-wielding phantom on the seventh floor stared silently at Ye Guan, and it was 
emitting an ominous aura. Ye Guan was about to attack the phantom, but it abruptly 
vanished and reappeared right in front of him. 

Ye Guan’s pupils constricted in shock, and he sidestepped to avoid the incoming sword 
thrust. Unfortunately, the phantom was too fast, and its sword ended up piercing his left 
shoulder. 

Ye Guan’s heart leaped into his throat, and he hurriedly jumped away to retreat. The 
blood gushing out of his wound dyed his robe red. 

Ye Guan managed to retreat to a corner. His expression turned both grim and somber 
as he glared at the phantom. What was that sword move? It was so fast! There weren’t 
any wasted movements, and it was a decisive attack! 

Meanwhile, the phantom charged at Ye Guan and transformed into numerous specters 
that pounced on Ye Guan, interrupting the latter’s train of thought. 

Ye Guan’s eyes narrowed as he swept his gaze across the specters, but rather than 
slicing them apart, he decided to run away from them. 

However, it seemed that the phantom wasn’t willing to let Ye Guan go, and it 
relentlessly chased after Ye Guan using its specters. Ye Guan couldn’t do anything else 
other than run, and his accumulated fatigue was starting to rear its ugly head. 

At first, the phantom was still capable of leaving wounds on Ye Guan, but as time went 
on, Ye Guan eventually adapted to the phantom’s attacks, speed, and techniques, 
allowing him to become even better at running away! 

By the third day, Ye Guan had completely acclimated to the phantom’s speed, and he 
could finally see through the phantom’s attacks and techniques. At this point, the 
phantom could no longer injure Ye Guan. 

The phantom thrust its sword at Ye Guan. Ye Guan would have sidestepped to avoid 
the sword thrust, but he had already gotten used to the phantom’s attacks. Ye Guan 
ducked and charged at the phantom with his head lowered. 

Moments later, he arrived in front of the phantom and punched its chest. 

Boom! 

The phantom was torn apart. 

“Haaa…” Ye Guan sighed deeply and sat down. 



 
 
 

He immediately meditated to heal himself. He was covered in blood, and it wasn’t really 
strange when he had been fighting a phantom that was faster than Divine Path Realm 
cultivators for three days straight. 

The phantom’s sword moves were decisive and direct as well. Ye Guan reckoned that 
an average cultivator wouldn’t be able to dodge its attacks. 

However, the biggest issue Ye Guan faced while fighting the phantom was the fact that 
the phantom focused only on one characteristic—speed! Ye Guan looked a bit scared 
upon recalling the phantom’s fastest speed. 

Two hours later, Ye Guan stopped cultivating. He could feel that he had almost 
recovered, so he decided to just let his body take care of his remaining wounds. 

He changed into a clean set of clothes and stared at the teleportation portal. 

He just had to walk into that teleportation portal, and he would arrive on the eighth floor. 

Scared? Not at all. Ye Guan was excited! 

Ye Guan walked into the teleportation portal, and he was transported to another illusory 
realm in the proverbial blink of an eye. He was surrounded by nothingness, and there 
wasn’t anyone else here aside from a phantom in the distance. 

It was another sword-wielding phantom. 

Ye Guan raised his guard and tightened his right fist. However, the phantom didn’t 
charge toward Ye Guan. It lifted its sword and slashed out, sending a brilliant light flying 
toward Ye Guan. 

Ye Guan’s expression fell. Sword energy! Goodness, he can use sword energy! 

Ye Guan was a swordsman, but he could only wield the sword. He still couldn’t wield 
sword energy. However, the phantom in front of him could do so. The sword energy was 
incredibly fast, and it reached Ye Guan in the blink of an eye. 

It seemed that the phantom on the eighth floor was at least a few times faster than the 
phantom on the seventh floor. 

Goodness! Ye Guan didn’t dare to face the sword energy head-on. He sidestepped to 
avoid the attack. Fortunately, my sidesteps had gotten quicker thanks to the phantom 
on the seventh floor. 

He barely managed to avoid the sword energy, but before he could even compose 
himself, another sword energy flew toward him. The thick scent of death assaulted Ye 
Guan’s nose, and his eyes narrowed. 



 
 
 

It was clear that he couldn’t hide his strength anymore, so Ye Guan decisively took out 
the Path Sword. 

Slash! 

The Path Sword collided against the sword energy, disintegrating it. 

Ye Guan was stunned at the sight. It’s that easy? 

Ye Guan’s gaze turned toward the phantom, and he saw that the phantom’s sword had 
departed the phantom’s hand and was now floating in front of Ye Guan. 

The sword was trembling ever so slightly. 

Is it afraid? Is it submitting to me? 

Ye Guan was astonished, and the phantom seemed surprised as well. The two of them 
stared at the quivering sword in a daze. 

Moments later, Ye Guan discovered that the sword wasn’t afraid of him. It was actually 
afraid of the Path Sword in his hand. 

“Ahem.” Ye Guan cleared his throat and asked, “Master Pagoda, is my assumption 
correct? Is it really afraid of the Path Sword?” 

Little Pagoda sounded uncertain as it replied, “I think so?” 

Ye Guan was even more confused. “Why?” he asked. 

Little Pagoda went silent, prompting Ye Guan to ask once more, “Why?” 

Little Pagoda finally answered, “I think it’s tired, and it wants to rest?” 

Ye Guan was annoyed by the uncertain response, and he snapped. “Please be honest 
with me, Master Pagoda.” 

With that, Little Pagoda added, “Your sword is special, and as far as I can remember, 
there are only two swords that are not afraid of your sword. Apart from those two, the 
rest will submit to your sword. They won’t even dare to showcase their abilities in front 
of your sword.” 

Ye Guan blinked. “Master Pagoda, are you saying that I will be invincible among 
swordsmen?” 

Master Pagoda replied, “I’m not sure about the swordsmen themselves, but your sword 
will definitely beat your enemy’s sword!” 



 
 
 

Ye Guan was delighted, and he exclaimed, “That’s incredible! Master Pagoda, I’m 
convinced that the plain-skirt sister I saw at the time is a sword immortal. Am I right? 
I’ve heard that there are no sword immortals, even in the Upper Realm!” 

Little Pagoda was silent for a few moments, but it eventually replied, “Indeed. She’s a 
great sword immortal!” 

“My master is actually a great sword immortal? I really didn’t expect that. Wow! It feels 
great to have such a strong master, hahaha!” Ye Guan boisterously laughed at the 
positive response. However, an idea suddenly popped up in his mind, and he hurriedly 
asked, “Master Pagoda, can she split a mountain into two with a sword strike? I’m 
talking about a really high mountain!” 

Little Pagoda thought about it for a while before answering, “I believe she’s capable of 
doing that if she puts in the effort.” 

Woah! Ye Guan jumped in excitement, but he quickly composed himself by muttering, 
“Calm down, I have to calm down... She’s the amazing one, not me. I have to work 
harder so that I’ll become a sword immortal one day!” 

Little Pagoda smiled and exclaimed, “That’s right!” 

With that, Ye Guan took in a deep breath of air as a new goal formed in his heart. 

A sword immortal! I must become a sword immortal. Once I become one, I’ll go back to 
Ancient Desolate City and split a mountain into two with a sword strike in front of 
everyone. Honestly, I don’t really like that mountain behind Ancient Desolate City. 

Meanwhile, the mysterious voice in the pagoda asked, “A-aren’t we going too far?” 

Little Pagoda sighed and said, “Just think about his father…” 

The mysterious voice grew silent. 

Indeed, they had to raise an independent man this time. 

Meanwhile, Ye Guan grabbed the sword floating in front of him. He walked toward the 
phantom and handed the sword over to it. 

“Take this. We have to fight again!” he said. 

The phantom was silent. Ye Guan carefully placed the sword in the phantom’s hand. 

Afterward, he walked back to where he was earlier and lifted the Path Sword. 

Ye Guan covered the Path Sword with his profound energy. 



 
 
 

The phantom made a move just then, sending a sword energy toward Ye Guan. 

Ye Guan didn’t back down. He sprinted toward the phantom with his eyes narrowed and 
thrust his sword toward the incoming sword energy. Ye Guan decided to face the sword 
energy head-on. 

Boom! 

The sword energy was forcibly dispersed, and Ye Guan used the backward momentum 
from the sword energy to retreat in a hurry. 

However, it seemed that the phantom had a different idea. It vanished and reappeared 
in front of Ye Guan, glaring coldly at him. 

Ye Guan’s eyes flashed, but he started running away rather than confronting the 
phantom. He used the same tactic he used against the phantom on the seventh floor 
because Ye Guan knew that he couldn’t possibly beat a sword-wielding opponent 
capable of wielding sword energy. 

To make matters worse, the phantom was faster than him. Ye Guan couldn’t even find 
any opportunities to attack. He was helpless and could only dodge. 

However, Ye Guan was planning on getting used to the phantom’s speed and 
movement, so he didn’t really mind dodging. Unfortunately, he quickly found himself in a 
sad—no, tragic plight. 

Ye Guan couldn’t dodge all of the phantom’s attacks, so it didn’t take long for him to be 
riddled with wounds. 

“Wait!” Ye Guan exclaimed and raised the Path Sword high up. 

The phantom came to a halt. It had no choice but to stop moving because its sword 
surrendered once again. 

Ye Guan was covered in his own blood, and his voice was trembling as he said, “Let me 
recover. We’ll fight again once I’ve recovered.” 

Ye Guan then confiscated the phantom’s sword. 

The phantom stood rooted and speechless. 

 

 


