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Chapter 1621: Come To Ask For Debt

Seamo Domain.

Moyin Mall.

“…Brother Ming, that’s what happened!” He Qian, the person in charge of the Moyin Mall, 
described the situation at that time and released the water curtain image.

“Yeah!” Xu Ming nodded slightly, with a gloomy expression on his face. It took a while before he 
said, “Don’t worry! I’ll get back the Divine Destruction Soldier that was snatched away, and the 
kick you took, tenfold, hundredfold!”

Xu Ming stayed in Ximo Region for more than a year.

During this period, he lived in seclusion and few people knew that Xu Ming was here.

He Qian saw Xu Ming’s leisurely appearance every day. Although he didn’t say anything, he 
couldn’t help but think that he promised to “return it ten times and a hundred times”. Why is there 
no movement at all?

“He Qian!” One day, Xu Ming suddenly asked, “When Pei San and Pei Si said, how long will it 
take to pay?”

He Qian replied, “Three months as soon as possible, but a year or two as slow!”

“One or two years…” Xu Ming actually counted the time, “Then it’s almost two years now, and it’s 
time to ask for debts!”

“Brother Ming?” He Qian was startled, “Are you going to Pei’s to ask for a debt?”



“That’s right!” Xu Ming said lightly.

“Which almighty is coming to Westmore Region?” He Qian asked again.

Going to ask for debts is undoubtedly a high-risk job; so He Qian’s first reaction was that Xu Ming 
invited a superpower to support him.

To He Qian’s surprise, Xu Ming shook his head lightly: “No!”

no! ?

He Qian was startled again: “Then…”

“Isn’t it just a debt? I can go alone!” Xu Ming said lightly.

“Brother Ming!” He Qian was in a hurry, “Forgive me…”

Xu Ming waved his hand: “No need to say more, I have my own measure!”

Own measure?

He Qian couldn’t help laughing and laughing. If you were really measured, you wouldn’t think 
about going for debts alone!

After all, from He Qian’s point of view, Xu Mingcai’s cultivation was only in the prehistoric realm. 
As for the Pei family, there are a lot of powerhouses in the Destruction Realm, and the two sides are 
not at the same level of strength at all!

Xu Ming came to ask for a debt, but what was it that he didn’t humiliate himself?

Even…”self-humiliation” is a better result! If the result is worse, it is hard to say whether it will be 
able to come back alive!



“Brother Ming, you can’t!” He Qian began to persuade.

But obviously, his persuasion was meaningless.

Three days later, He Qian could only watch Xu Ming go to the Pei family alone; and he was 
forcibly left behind by Xu Ming, obviously going to fight, and of course he couldn’t bring He Qian 
as a burden.

Not long after seeing Xu Ming off, He Qian received a message.

“What!?” He Qian was shocked when he saw the message, “The Pei family is about to hold a ‘Pei 
family event’!?”

Pei’s grand event is a grand event where Pei’s invites all parties to enhance his prestige! Xu Ming 
ran over to ask for debts during the Pei clan’s grand meeting. Doesn’t this make it clear that he was 
a spoiler?

“Brother Ming…” He Qian hurriedly called again and told Xu Ming about the situation.

After hearing this, Xu Ming smiled and replied, “That’s right! I’m just here to smash the field!”

“This…” He Qian was speechless for a while. He couldn’t imagine that Xu Ming was just a 
cultivation base in the Great Desolate Realm. Where did he get the confidence?

…

The Pei clan is an old-fashioned force in the Westmore Region and has a prominent reputation.

In the West Mo region, although it is not the top, it is also the top five power! Looking at the entire 
Ximo Region, the Domain Lord’s Mansion, as well as the sixth-rank forces in the Nirvana Realm, 
can overwhelm them.

Of course, in the eyes of ordinary forces in the West Mo region, the Pei family is already an 
extremely terrifying behemoth. There are hundreds of thousands of forces attached to the Pei 
family.



Every Pei’s grand meeting is also a time for all affiliated forces to make contributions! The more 
treasures donated by the power, the more treasures will be taken care of by Pei in the years to come; 
and if the powers donated less treasures, they will naturally be neglected.

At the same time, the Pei Clan’s grand event is also an opportunity for those forces that have not yet 
attached to the Pei Clan to join the Pei Clan’s camp!

Pei’s old nest is majestic.

“The Pei clan’s event? It’s really lively!” Xu Ming couldn’t help sneering as he watched the forces 
pouring into the Pei clan.

Like a pair of young men and women walking not far behind Xu Ming, they came from different 
forces.

“Sister Yuyan! You, the Yu clan, are attached to the Pei clan for the first time; the treasures that your 
clan asked you to bring will be presented later when you enter the door!” the young man reminded.

“Yes!”

At the front gate, Pei’s masters chanted and read treasures, one after another.

“Huang Tianzong, donate five supreme weapons of all things!”

“Ms. Ji, present three top-quality weapons of all things!”

“Hundred Refinement Medicine Pavilion, donate eight bottles of myriad-level medicinal herbs!”

“The Feather God Sect, donate a low-grade divine weapon of all things…”

The forces attached to the Pei family are big and small. The value of the treasures donated is 
naturally not the same.



Like Huang Tianzong and Ji clan, they are all top-level fourth-grade forces; it is relatively normal to 
donate a few top-grade weapons of all things.

Like Bailian Medicine Pavilion, it is good at alchemy and medicine, so it donates all things grade 
medicine.

And like the Feather God Religion, although the treasures donated are far less precious than those 
of the previous forces; but you must know that the Feather God Religion is only an ordinary third-
rank force, and its heritage is far less than the previous four-rank forces! It is already very sincere to 
be able to present a low-grade weapon of all things!

“Ms. Zhong, donate three pieces…”

Pei’s masters continued to sing and read the treasure; finally, they read Xu Ming’s treasure: “Xu 
Ming, a loose cultivator, offer… a low-grade chaotic source stone!”

“What!?” Pei’s master, after reading the gift list handed over by Xu Ming, suddenly reacted to the 
low-grade Chaos Origin Stone?

Low-grade Chaos Originium, what is that? That is garbage for the cultivation base of Chaos Realm! 
Pei’s event has never seen such garbage; not to mention…

Pei’s master raised his head to look at Xu Ming, and found that he was actually a master of the 
prehistoric realm!

“What do you mean?” The master of the Pei family who was in charge of receiving the gift 
suddenly sank, “Provocation of our Pei family?”

“Don’t get me wrong! It’s not a provocation!” Xu Ming still had the second half of the sentence in 
his heart.

Xu Ming continued: “To participate in the Pei clan’s event, you need to be polite. I understand that! 
But it seems, you didn’t say that you can’t give away the low-grade Chaos Originium, right?”

“You…” Pei’s master stared at Xu Ming and did not say that he couldn’t send the low-grade Chaos 
Originium, but, does it need to be said?



The Pei clan master was about to explode when suddenly he received a voice transmission in his 
mind: “Don’t spoil the atmosphere of the event, let him in first, and then… carefully check who he 
really is, he doesn’t know what to do!”

“Go in!” Pei’s master said coldly, but looking at Xu Ming, his eyes were extremely indifferent, as if 
he was looking at a dead person.

Chapter 1622: Nirvana Realm Combat Power

Xu Ming strolled into Pei’s hall.

About what he did at the gate, it had already been spread among the Pei family and the guests.

“Dare to provoke Pei with a low-grade Chaos Origin Stone? He is dead!”

“That’s right! Today is a grand gathering of the Pei family, and all the sages have arrived; the Pei 
family will never allow it, who will provoke its authority today! – I will definitely find an excuse to 
kill this person to strengthen its power!”

“Maybe… what’s his background?” Another guest whispered.

“Big backs? Oh! What big backs can there be in such a mere prehistoric realm? No matter how big 
the backing is, Mr. Pei will definitely punish him! Anyone who dares to approach this person will 
definitely be hated by Mr. Pei!”

“Not bad! We’d better stay away from him, don’t go too close, so as not to be misunderstood by 
Pei.”

…

One after another, the guests looked at Xu Ming’s eyes, mocking with terror.

When Xu Ming walked into the Pei’s hall, the guests from all sides also subconsciously distanced 
themselves; it seemed that they were afraid that they would be too close and would be infected with 
bad luck by Xu Ming.



“Oh!” Xu Ming smiled disdainfully.

This time he came to Pei’s, not to make friends, but to smash the scene! Now that everyone is far 
away from him, he is still happy to be quiet!

Xu Ming leisurely found a place to sit down, there was no one around.

Xu Ming didn’t care either, and calmly ate the rare fruits on the table.

Any precious fruit is more valuable than a middle-grade Chaos Origin Stone!

Xu Ming looked at the precious fruit in his hand, and thought to himself, if you eat any precious 
fruit, it is more valuable than a divine realm! This kind of thing, thousands of years ago, when Xu 
Ming was still struggling in God’s Domain, was simply impossible to imagine!

Chaos is vast!

When he just stepped out of the realm of the gods and walked toward the endless chaos, Xu Ming 
even felt panic about this vastness! Today, Xu Ming has long been able to look at the sacred realm 
of destiny and the endless chaos with a very indifferent attitude – no matter how vast the chaos, Xu 
Ming has the confidence to conquer it one day!

Eating and eating, Xu Ming couldn’t help laughing in his heart: “I paid the entrance fee for a low-
grade Chaos Originium, but I ate a lot, and I made a lot of money!”

As for the frightened and mocking eyes of the guests and the hateful eyes of Pei’s masters, Xu Ming 
completely ignored them.

“Clan Pei? The peak power of the fifth grade?” Xu Ming pondered secretly, “Compared to our Xu 
clan, the power should be in the middle!”

The Pei family, like the Xu family, has a lot of powerhouses in the Destruction Realm, but they are 
the pinnacle forces of the fifth grade!



If it was before entering Yun’s treasure, Xu Ming would indeed be quite afraid of Pei’s; after all, Xu 
Ming’s strength is not enough to force the peak of Destruction Realm, let alone many Destruction 
Realm powerhouses.

However, after returning from Yun’s treasure, Xu Ming no longer took Pei in his eyes. After all… 
Xu Ming earned a lot of 19th and 20th level points from the great masters by relying on the blood 
cloud magic array in Yun’s treasure; and these points are enough for Xu Ming to summon the soul 
of “the peak of Nirvana realm”, Come and open the “Eternal Power” hanging!

Eternal Power: Souls of any level can be summoned, and the power that is summoned will exist 
forever and will not disappear until it is replaced by a stronger Eternal Power! Moreover, the power 
of eternity can be superimposed with the strength of the host itself! However, the soul summoned 
by “Eternal Power” is only one-tenth of the combat power of the original soul!

One-tenth of the combat power of the peak of Nirvana! That is at least the low level of Nirvana 
Realm! —In the Destiny Sacred World, although it is not the top powerhouse, it is more than 
enough to crush the peak power of the fifth-rank!

The strong Nirvana realm is definitely not something that the Destruction Realm can compete with!

It is precisely because of this that Xu Ming is so fearless! After all… even if the entire Pei clan’s 
powerhouses are all added together, it is not enough for him to fight!

Thinking of this, Xu Ming couldn’t help but think of his “hometown” Huang Yu.

“It is said that…thousands of Destruction Realm and Nirvana Realm powerhouses from all sides of 
the Destiny Sacred Realm are still in the original position of the Blood Cloud Demon Formation, 
squatting and guarding the Phoenix Feather…”

Xu Ming couldn’t help but sigh, Huang Yu and the thousands of strong people were really patient! 
On one side, they just don’t come out; on the other side, they just squat down and don’t go! -
Obviously, the next step is to see which side has better patience!

However… Xu Ming is not very optimistic about Huang Yu!

After all, among the thousands of squatting powerhouses, there will definitely be more patience 
than Huang Yu! And… not a lot!



Xu Ming was thinking about things in a boring way while eating the delicacies of precious fruits. At 
this time, he found that a figure that was out of the dust and elegant was walking towards him.

Xu Ming had a bit of an impression of this person. It was the “Yuyan girl” among the young men 
and women who walked behind him before.

In the eyes of Yuyan sister, there was ignorance in the cold, and there was a hint of curiosity; she 
actually walked up to Xu Ming and saluted: “I’m under Yuyan, what do you call your Excellency!”

Xu Ming smiled: “People in the hall don’t dare to approach me, are you not afraid of me?”

There was a cute slyness in Yuyan’s eyes, and she said, “Since your Excellency dares to appear 
here, you must be relying on it! I am standing here, which is not only a danger, but also a kind of 
chance!”

“Haha!” Xu Ming smiled and reported his name, “It’s interesting! I made you a friend—Xu Ming!”

“Then have a drink!” Yuyan took the initiative to make friends.

“Haha! Good!” Xu Ming also picked up the wine glass, and one cup drank the value of thousands of 
“God’s Domain”.

“Yuyan!” At this moment, the young man who had come with Yuyan hurriedly ran over, “Why are 
you here? Hurry up, hurry up!”

After speaking, he could not help but quietly exert his divine power and drag Yu Yan away.

Yuyan said, “I’m just making friends!”

After entering the Pei’s hall, Yuyan has made many friends.

“That can’t be handed over here!” the young man whispered, “It’s so naive!”



The young man’s sentence seems to be reprimanding Yuyan, but in fact, he is telling the other 
strong men in the hall to clear his relationship with Xu Ming.

Xu Ming looked at it with an indifferent smile, and said in his heart, “It’s a little clever, but it’s a 
pity… I’m still not deep in the world!”

Yuyan thought about it, making friends with Xu Ming is probably a chance, so she stepped forward 
to make friends. It’s just that she didn’t think about it carefully – what she can think of, can’t other 
guests think of it?

The other guests didn’t dare to come, so she came alone, isn’t she afraid of being hit by a gun?

“Many geniuses in the Sacred World of Destiny have a very high starting point; they have very 
strong strength without training!” Xu Ming thought to himself; obviously, Yuyan is such a person, 
“But… Fortunately, she met her. Me! Now that I have made this friend, I will definitely not put her 
in danger!”

If Yuyan did not meet Xu Ming, but someone else; in this case, it is very likely that she would 
simply ignore whether Yuyan would be in danger.

Chapter 1623: You Are Lucky

Pei’s palace.

“Have you checked the origin?”

It was Pei’s patriarch “Pei Yan” who spoke.

At the Pei’s grand event, someone dared to provoke the Pei’s; at this time, if the Pei’s performance 
is not good, he will be despised by other forces.

Of course, Mr. Pei will not make a rash move, but should investigate the origin in advance.

“He is Xu Ming!” Pei San said, “Xu Ming from Moyin Mall!”



“Oh?” Pei Yan was a little surprised, “How dare Xu Ming come here in person?”

Pei’s deliberately provoking Moyin Mall before, naturally, it was because of the meaning of the 
Taoist Man under Pan Tianyu’s command. Pei Yan was still waiting, what method Moyin Mall 
would use to deal with it; but he did not expect that Xu Ming would actually come to the door in 
person.

“Patriarch, what should we do now?” Pei San’s eyes flashed with ruthlessness.

Of course he knew that the person standing behind Xu Ming was the Master Pan Tianyu. However, 
in his opinion, Xu Ming got into the relationship with Pantianyu Lord through the son of Pantianyu; 
and this is Ximoyu, so the influence of Pantianyu is limited after all.

Therefore, Pei San is not very afraid of Xu Ming.

Pei Yan was expressionless, and said lightly: “Since Xu Ming dares to come, he has to pay a price! 
We only need to save his life, and Pan Tianyu has nothing to say!”

“Not bad!” Pei Si also said, “If you want to blame, you can only blame Xu Ming for not knowing 
whether to live or die! And…”

The Pei clan’s all-powerful people suddenly looked at each other, tacitly knowing. What they 
thought in their hearts was—moreover, the Pantian Territory Lord may have fallen!

Of course, they didn’t dare to say such “rebellious” words directly, at most they only dared to hint. 
Otherwise, if the Pantian Territory Lord did not fall, and he heard their rebellious conversation, it 
would definitely be a disaster.

…

Pei’s Hall.

The area where Xu Ming was sitting was still deserted.

Xu Ming didn’t care – he was waiting for the Lord to appear!



When the top management of the Pei family appears, it will be time for his debt collection to begin! 
As for whether this will ruin the Pei clan’s event… Xu Ming is here to smash the scene! Destroyed 
the best!

“Huh?” Suddenly, Xu Ming frowned slightly and looked in a certain direction.

This direction is exactly where Yuyan is.

At this moment, Yuyan was so frightened that her delicate body trembled slightly. In front of her, a 
strong man in a robe with a white complexion was pressing Xiang Yuyan with the suffocating aura 
he forced.

“Humph! What the hell!?” The robed strong man shouted coldly, “It’s your blessing that I can see 
you in Bai Changtian! How dare you push three or four obstacles? – Don’t you know that you are a 
female-like generation, and you are just Xuanhuangjing cultivation base, what does it mean to be 
able to appear here?”

“What identity?” Yuyan was a little puzzled, trembling slightly.

“Yuyan, don’t hurry to apologize to Senior White!” The young man who came with Yuyan 
continued.

Yuyan looked at the young man and seemed to have guessed something, her eyes were filled with 
fear: “Did the clan arrange for me to come here…?”

The young man nodded silently.

“Humph!” Bai Changtian snorted coldly, “Now you’re sensible? As long as you follow me, I’ll also 
help you to intercede with Mrs. Pei about your relationship with ‘that person’ just now, and keep 
you safe, otherwise…”

That person was naturally Xu Ming.



The old **** Xu Ming was watching from the ground, and he almost understood what was going 
on—a clan woman like Yuyan, who was sent to participate in the Pei clan event, was actually gifted 
by the clan to someone who participated in the event. Mighty!

This kind of thing should be an unspoken rule; it’s just that Yuyan doesn’t know what’s going on, 
and she naively thinks that she is really here to help the clan “make friends” – what she thinks of 
“make friends”, and “make friends” with the clan. make friends”, is not the same.

“Ha! Yuyan’s clan is ruthless enough! I didn’t tell her the real situation beforehand, I’m afraid she 
just wanted to use Yuyan’s ‘ignorance’ to attract the attention of the strong! As for Yuyan’s fate, I’m 
afraid she The clan behind them will not care!” Xu Ming thought to himself.

However, Xu Ming did not make a move.

Now, Yuyan already knows the real situation, what kind of choice she should make next is up to 
her! If Yuyan chose to surrender herself, Xu Ming just met by chance and was too lazy to meddle in 
her own business; and if Yuyan “would rather be a broken jade than a complete tile”, then Xu Ming 
might be able to take a shot – after all, Xu Ming is If you come to smash the field, you don’t mind 
slapping one more face.

“Yuyan!” The young man who came with Yuyan also persuaded him through voice transmission, 
“Senior Bai, but the realm of all things is strong! You can follow him in this life, it is a blessing that 
you can’t ask for! It’s not too fast! Thank you Senior White for your appreciation!”

This young man obviously knew Yuyan’s mission for a long time. And he didn’t tell Yuyan before.

Yuyan looked at her companion in disbelief, her eyes were full of despair, and she could not see a 
trace of vitality. At this moment, she felt the whole world collapse.

Bai Changtian was appreciating Yuyan’s expression with a playful look, as if he was appreciating a 
beautiful painting – Yuyan’s current expression made him more eager to conquer.

“I…” Yuyan was so saddened that she suddenly burst out with determination, “I don’t!!”

Yuyan obviously wanted to detonate her divine body.



“Begging to die?” Bai Changtian sneered disdainfully, “In front of me, are you qualified to die?”

boom!

In a small area around Bai Changtian, the space was instantly frozen, making Yuyan unable to even 
explode, and naturally it did not cause much movement.

In other places around, although some strong people have noticed the situation on Yuyan’s side, but 
this kind of thing can occasionally be seen in Pei’s grand gatherings, and it is not that rare. 
Therefore, the other great powers just glanced at it as a fun, no one cared, and no one came out for 
Yuyan.

Even Da Neng sneered: “I have come to participate in the Pei’s event, but I still haven’t figured out 
that my identity is a plaything!”

“Sure enough, I can’t even die…” Yuyan was completely disheartened. Although she is still alive, 
she feels that life is better than death.

“Jie Jie…” The expression on Bai Changtian’s face became more and more perverted.

At this time, Xu Ming silently stood up.

“Let’s make a move!—Although it was a chance encounter, after all, she is the only one in the 
entire hall who treats me as a friend!” Anyway, for Xu Ming, making a move was just a gesture of 
effort!

With a little effort, Xu Ming is naturally willing to do it to save a friend who met by chance.

boom!

Xu Ming released a little momentum and suppressed Bai Changtian.

At the same time, Xu Ming’s voice sounded in Yuyan’s ear: “You are so lucky!”



yes! Good luck!

If it hadn’t happened to make friends with Xu Ming, Yuyan, as a “plaything” at the grand event, her 
fate can be imagined.

“Huh?” Yuyan’s eyes suddenly burst into hope.

Bai Changtian’s face turned gloomy in an instant.

Chapter 1624: I’M Here For Debt!

Bai Changtian’s face turned gloomy in an instant.

“Who!?”

Bai Changtian instantly looked in the direction of the momentum: “It’s you!?”

Seeing that it was Xu Ming, Bai Changtian was not surprised but delighted. He was thinking about 
how to please Mr. Pei and go straight up to teach Xu Ming a lesson, right? I was worried that Pei 
Shi would blame him for being nosy! But now, Xu Ming took the initiative to join up; if Bai 
Changtian had cleaned up Xu Ming beautifully, Mr. Pei naturally couldn’t blame him!

This is a great opportunity to please Mrs Pei!

However, what surprised Bai Changtian was that Xu Ming’s aura was not weaker than him!

“Obviously it is the cultivation base of the prehistoric realm!” Bai Changtian stared at Xu Ming, 
and secretly said in his heart, “The momentum is not weaker than me, and it has reached the realm 
of all things? Hmph! The momentum is only part of the strength! , can’t be my opponent!”

As a strong man in the realm of all things, Bai Changtian naturally has his own pride.

It’s just… Before Bai Changtian could take action, the young man who came with Yuyan hurriedly 
shouted: “I’m dying, how dare you meddle in your own business!?”



Yuyan once again looked at this young man in disbelief. She had always regarded him as a friend, 
but she did not expect that the other party would be so despicable!

“Go away!” Xu Ming slapped the void and slapped the young man away. Xu Ming naturally 
despised this kind of man; killing him would be a dirty hand.

boom!

The young man slammed into the formation of the main hall heavily, and his divine body was 
almost completely destroyed. If Xu Ming hadn’t disdain to kill him, he would have already died.

Bai Changtian looked at Xu Ming coldly: “I don’t know whether to live or die! How dare you be so 
arrogant in the Pei family! I will capture you first for the Pei family!”

boom! !

Bai Changtian directly captured Xu Ming.

In the Pei’s hall, the powerhouses from all sides watched indifferently. In their opinion, Bai 
Changtian in the realm of all things, dealing with Xu Ming in the prehistoric realm, is naturally easy 
to crush.

“Ha!” A sneer sneered at the corner of Xu Ming’s mouth. Since he had already made his move, he 
didn’t plan to keep a low profile!

Now that Xu Ming has the combat power of Nirvana Realm, he should be a little more high-profile!

“Get out too!” Xu Ming also slapped his palm towards Bai Changtian, Void.

“what?”

“Ha ha…”



Seeing Xu Ming’s actions, the other great powers in the hall couldn’t help but laugh at Xu Ming 
using such a trick to deal with Bai Changtian? Did he think that Bai Changtian was in the 
Xuanhuang realm?

“It’s ridiculous!” Bai Changtian captured Xu Ming with more and more contempt.

but…

When Bai Changtian’s palm condensed with divine power touched Xu Ming’s slap, his expression 
changed instantly.

“This is impossible!” Bai Changtian clearly felt the unmatched power from the slap that Xu Ming 
slapped at random! Although he is not the top existence in the realm of all things, how could he be 
crushed by a prehistoric realm?

boom! !

Without waiting for Bai Changtian to think, Xu Ming slapped him with a slap, and even the divine 
body was damaged more than half!

“what!?”

The great powers in the hall exclaimed again. But this time, the voice was no longer sarcasm, but 
frightening that Xu Ming would slap Bai Changtian into serious injuries with a slap in the face. 
Does that mean that Xu Ming’s strength has probably reached the peak of the realm of all things, or 
even Destruction?

The great powers of all parties couldn’t help but secretly feared that it was fortunate that they did 
not take action against Xu Ming, otherwise, the end would not be better than Bai Changtian!

“You!” Bai Changtian stood up, startled, scared and angry.

Xu Ming didn’t even look at him, he just said lightly, “Get out, or die!”

roll!



Or die!

If it was before, a person who seemed to be only in the prehistoric realm dared to say such a thing to 
himself, Bai Changtian would definitely laugh his teeth out. But now, Bai Changtian didn’t dare to 
laugh at all, nor did he laugh.

go away?

Of course, Bai Changtian knew that if he really left with his tail between his legs, he would 
definitely become a laughing stock in the heart of Ximoyu. But… if you don’t get out, you might 
really die!

Just when Bai Changtian was hesitating whether to get out or not…

“Bold!”

“presumptuous!”

“How dare you make trouble at my Pei’s event!”

Dozens of Pei’s great masters suddenly rushed into the hall; each of them, with the momentum of 
the peak of the realm of all things, was thinking about what reason to attack Xu Ming when they 
saw Xu Ming in the There was trouble in the hall; all of a sudden, a group of Pei’s great experts 
rushed in “joyfully”.

Obviously, the top management of the Pei family had instructed them to teach and humiliate Xu 
Ming.

Bai Changtian’s eyes lit up: “No need to get out!”

The powerhouses in the hall all secretly said: “Pei’s shot! This kid, if he dares to make trouble at the 
Pei’s grand event, he will peel off his skin if he doesn’t die!”



Of course, the powerhouses from all sides were also a little puzzled as to why these great powers of 
the Pei family rushed in so quickly; and there were still so many great powers, as if they had agreed, 
swarming up.

“A group of ants!” Xu Ming sneered in disdain. Facing dozens of peak existences in the realm of all 
things, Xu Ming still just slapped him lightly.

Snapped! Snapped! Snapped! Snapped! Snapped! …

boom! boom! boom! boom! boom! …

With Xu Ming’s “Lower Nirvana Realm” real combat power, to clean up a group of peaks in the 
realm of all things is really not much different from stepping on a nest of ants.

However, Xu Ming didn’t want to kill for the time being, so he didn’t trample the group of ants to 
death, but “stepped to a half-death”.

In just a moment, dozens of Pei’s great experts who rushed in happily, all lay on the ground like 
dead dogs.

“what!?”

This time, the great powers of all parties have been completely numb with shock!

When the Pei clan experts rushed in, everyone thought that Xu Ming was dead; but unexpectedly, 
Xu Ming suppressed all the Pei clan experts with a single slap!

“This person’s strength, even in the Destruction Realm, is probably quite powerful…”

As for Bai Changtian, he was so frightened that he ran away and never ran again. If he made this 
grandfather unhappythen he would be doomed!

“Huh?” Xu Ming’s eyes swept coldly towards Bai Changtian.



Bai Changtian’s body trembled, as if death was imminent. Did he run late and annoy this master?

Xu Ming didn’t take action, but said lightly, “I told you to get out, not to get out!”

get out?

Although Bai Changtian felt extremely humiliated, he was frightened by Xu Ming several times, 
and his dignity had long since been frightened away! Get out, get out, it’s better to die than live!

“Xu Ming!” At this moment, Pei San’s angry voice sounded outside the main hall, “You are from 
Pantianyu, how dare you come to our West Moyu to be wild!”

As soon as Pei San spoke out, he directly pulled out the banner of “Ximoyu”. If Xu Ming admitted 
that he was here to act wildly, he might be considered by some narrow-minded powers to provoke 
the entire Ximo Region.

“Saye?” Xu Ming naturally saw through the tricks in Pei San’s words, “No! I’m here to ask for 
debts!”

Chapter 1625: Hit To Admit

“No! I’m here to ask for a debt!”

As soon as Xu Ming said these words, the hall was shocked and silent.

Debt?

Could it be that Pei owes a debt to this person? But even so, today is a grand meeting of the Pei 
family; at this time to ask for debts, isn’t it clear that he will hit the Pei family in the face?

Although the great powers in the hall did not dare to say anything, they were discussing in private:



“Clan Pei is a top five-rank force! Even if this person’s strength is at the peak of Destruction Realm, 
if he dares to hit Pei Clan in the face, I’m afraid he won’t be able to eat and walk away today! 
Unless, he has the strength of Nirvana Realm…”

“Nirvana? How is it possible! There are only so many strong Nirvanas in the entire Destiny Holy 
Realm, but I have never seen this person!”

“It can’t be Nirvana! After all… If it’s really Nirvana, the Pei family wouldn’t dare to be so tough!”

…

boom! boom! boom! …

More than a dozen senior members of the Pei clan rushed into the hall aggressively. Every one of 
them is a shattering realm cultivation base!

“Xu Ming!” Pei San even shouted directly, “I want a debt? I am a dignified Pei family, do I owe you 
a debt? This is a Pei family event, how dare you deliberately spread rumors!”

The other senior Pei clan members also glared at him, as if Xu Ming was so heinous.

“Xu Ming!” Pei Yan, the patriarch of the Pei clan, was indifferent and condescending, “You dare to 
smear my Pei clan on purpose, but are you ready to pay the price?”

Ouch I’m going!

Xu Ming secretly scolded this group of senior members of the Pei family, how shameless! Do you 
have any debts, don’t you have any pressure in your heart? And the face is so arrogant?

However, Xu Ming was not angry either.

Shameless, it takes strength! If you have no strength but are “shameless” there, you will only be 
slapped in the face!



“You don’t admit your debts?” Xu Ming said indifferently.

“Ridiculous!” Pei San sneered, “If you don’t owe a debt, why should you admit it?”

“Ha! Haha…” Xu Ming couldn’t help laughing, “Okay! Very good! Don’t admit it, right? It’s 
okay… Then I’ll call you until you admit it!”

If you don’t admit it, hit it to admit it!

Everyone was shocked!

At this time, the attention of all the guests was no longer whether Pei was in debt, but that Xu Ming 
was too arrogant!

Everyone understands that this man named Xu Ming is here to smash the scene today!

Before they knew it, everyone silently retreated a little; they clearly realized that there was a good 
show to watch!

“Good! Good! Good!” Pei Yan said repeatedly, “Xu Ming, today, you are the one who provokes my 
Pei family first! My Pei family is patient everywhere, but you are aggressive! In this case… we will 
teach you a lesson, and let’s face it. The Lord of Heaven has nothing to say!”

Pei’s is still very afraid of Pan Tianyu; although they think that Pan Tianyu should have fallen.

“You all give in? I’m aggressive?” Hearing this, Xu Ming was also stunned by Pei’s, it was so 
shameless!

Not much to say!

Slap directly in the face!

boom! !



In an instant, Xu Ming had a spear in his hand!

At this time, the top of the Pei family showed a shameless face again: “Xu Ming, this is your first 
move! No wonder we!”

boom! boom! boom! …

Pei Yan did not move at all, while the other top executives of the Pei clan took action one after 
another!

More than a dozen powerful people in the Destruction Realm surrounded and killed Xu Ming at the 
same time. The imposing manner was so vast that all the guests in the hall were terrified.

“Ha!” Xu Ming just smiled disdainfully.

These more than ten high-level Pei clan teaming up, I am afraid they can threaten the first-order 
Nirvana! But… although Xu Ming is currently a low-level Nirvana Realm combat power, but the 
low-level is also divided into “tier one to three”; Xu Ming’s combat power is completely 
comparable to the third-tier Nirvana Realm!

The second-order Nirvana Realm is already absolutely crushed in the face of the Destruction 
Realm!

The third-order Nirvana Realm is an existence that the entire Pei clan cannot compete with!

And now, the Pei family is provoking the existence they can’t compete with again and again!

“roll!”

Xu Ming’s one-shot, one-shot, contains thousands of spear intents. With a single shot, it is a mighty 
crush, and it is so fast that it surpasses time and space, and even the defense is impeccable!

This is already an absolutely perfect shot!



“What!?” Pei Yan originally had the demeanor of an expert who was calm and disdainful, but when 
he saw the power of Xu Ming’s shot, he didn’t dare to stand there foolishly and pretend to be an 
expert!

“The powerhouse of Nirvana!” Pei Yan never thought that Xu Ming would have the strength of 
Nirvana! After all, the information he got said that Xu Ming had just awakened to his fate not long 
ago!

This growth rate is too appalling!

Under the sudden power of Xu Ming, none of the more than ten strong Pei clan dared to be careless. 
As soon as he made a shot, they all took out the unique skill of pressing the bottom of the box and 
tried their best to block Xu Ming’s shot!

only…

How can the combat power of the third-order Nirvana Realm be blocked by a group of ordinary 
Destruction Realm?

Even Pei Yan, whose strength has reached the peak of the Destruction Realm, only slightly blocked 
the shot!

“Finish the battle formation!” Pei Yan shouted, and he was already in the center of the battle 
formation.

The other Pei clan masters also joined the battle formation, which had been practiced hundreds of 
millions of times.

boom!

The power of more than a dozen powerful people in the Destruction Realm instantly gathered in Pei 
Yan alone; let Pei Yan’s combat power break through the shackles of Nirvana Realm in an instant!

“Stop it for me!” Pei Yan greeted Xu Ming, struggling to resist.



However…

boom! !

When Xu Ming was crushed by this shot, Pei Yan was still crushed and flew away.

The battle hadn’t dispersed yet, but Pei Yan knew that even if he played all his cards, he probably 
wouldn’t be able to help Xu Ming!

Pei Yanlian said in a private voice: “Xu Ming, the debt we owe will be repaid now! Please stop, we 
will discuss it in the apse!”

I have to say that Pei’s family is full of shame! Even Pei Yan, the patriarch, was originally 
indifferent and arrogant; but when he saw Xu Ming’s tyrannical strength, he immediately lowered 
his face and asked for peace.

Make peace?

is it possible?

“Negotiate!” Xu Ming shouted without hesitation.

“Xu Ming!” Pei Yan said coldly, “Could it be that… you have to fight to the death!?”

“The fish died and the net broke?” Xu Ming shook his head disdainfullyIt’s just your Pei family? 
Enough? ”

While speaking, Xu Ming’s attack hit Pei Yan again!

“A thousand guns!”

boom!



Pei Yan was blasted away again and slammed into the formation of the main hall.

“It’s too strong…” The guests from all sides were shocked to see Xu Ming facing the entire Pei 
Clan’s top management, and they were absolutely crushed! Obviously, Xu Ming’s strength, even in 
Nirvana Realm, is not weak!

Just as Pei Yan was about to struggle to resist, Xu Ming’s attack came again!

boom! boom! boom! boom! …

Pei Yan, as well as a high level of Pei’s family, were bombarded to the wall of the formation again 
and again; even the formation of Pei’s formation began to crack!

“Dare to be shameless? Do you dare to admit the debt?” Xu Ming’s spear kept firing, “Then it will 
hit you until you admit it!”

Chapter 1626: Loot

“This…”

In the main hall of Pei’s family, all parties were dumbfounded at the scene in front of them – they 
came to participate in the Pei’s grand event, but before the event started, they saw that the great 
masters of Pei’s were hanged and beaten collectively.

Can this event go on?

boom! boom! boom! boom! …

Under the strong pressure of Xu Ming, the gods of the Pei Clan’s great powers began to suffer 
varying degrees of damage. If it continues like this, it is bound to lose several or even more 
Destruction Realm powerhouses!

“I admit it! I admit it!” Pei Yan’s mouth finally couldn’t be tougher.



“Humph!” Xu Ming retracted his spear and looked at Pei’s Great Expert, who had been slapped like 
a dead dog. “Admit it earlier, wouldn’t that be the case?”

The Pei clan’s masters are bitter in their hearts – if we knew that you are so powerful, how dare we 
not admit it… Even, we may not dare to go to Moyin Mall to provoke!

The powers of all parties couldn’t help but look at Mrs. Pei with pity—they didn’t quite understand 
whether Mrs. Pei really owed the debt, or was beaten by Xu Ming and forced to admit the debt.

In the eyes of countless pity, Pei Yan took out a world ring in humiliation and handed it to Xu Ming: 
“There are 200,000 middle-grade Chaos Origin Crystals…”

“What!?” Before Pei Yan could finish speaking, he was interrupted by Xu Ming’s sharp voice, 
“200,000 middle-grade Chaos Origin Crystals? Are you kidding me!? – Bought two top-quality 
nirvanas from our Moyin Mall. Divine Armament, will you use 200,000 middle-grade Chaos Origin 
Crystals to send me off?”

The best Nirvana magic weapon! ?

The Pei clan’s great powers were suddenly stunned!

Pei Yan even said: “Isn’t it two superb weapons of destruction?”

The onlookers seemed to understand a little – it should be that Pei’s family bought two top-quality 
Destruction Weapons from Moyin Mall, and then failed to pay the debt, so that Xu Ming came to 
collect the debt! And Xu Ming is also ruthless enough to directly “change” the Destruction Soldier 
into a Nirvana Soldier.

“Pei Shi was deliberately provoking Moyin Mall, but he kicked the iron plate…”

All the great powers stood in silence for Mr. Pei, and at the same time couldn’t help but gloat over 
the misfortune.

“I don’t know how Pei’s will respond?”



“Two top-quality Nirvana weapons? Even if Pei’s family goes bankrupt, they can’t make up such 
high-quality Chaos Origin Crystals, right?”

…

“Hmph!” Xu Ming snorted coldly, “It’s obviously a **** of Nirvana, but you actually said it’s a 
**** of destruction? Then why don’t you just say it’s a **** of all things, a **** of prehistoric 
times, or even a **** of black and yellow?”

“I…” Pei Yan didn’t expect Xu Ming to be so ruthless in debt, so he had to say, “Our entire Pei clan 
doesn’t even have a top-quality Nirvana weapon! If you don’t believe me, just search it!”

“What!?” Xu Ming shouted angrily, “You must have hidden my Nirvana weapon!”

“I…” Pei Yan wanted to say something more.

But he also knew that Xu Ming did not come here to ask for debts, but to seek revenge! At this time, 
reasoning is meaningless – for example, if the weaker party is Xu Ming, Mrs. Pei will not reason 
with Xu Ming at all!

Strength is truth!

“Xu Ming!” Pei Yan said through a voice transmission, “This matter is what my Pei clan did wrong. 
As the patriarch of the Pei clan, I apologize to you, and I would like to offer an apology! I hope to 
be able to reveal it!”

Xu Ming smiled, and the sound transmission replied: “I know that my strength is not as good as 
others, so I want to apologize? How can there be such an easy thing in the world?”

“Then what do you want?” Pei Yan frowned and said.

“It’s very simple…” Xu Ming smiled grimly, finished the sound transmission, and said aloud, “Clan 
Pei! I won’t go into the matter of you guys robbing me of two top-quality Nirvana weapons in 
Moyin Mall! Now, I’ll give you three paths. Choice: The first way, to return the two supreme 
Nirvana weapons!”



return?

The corners of Pei’s master’s mouth twitched for a while – we have never won the best Nirvana 
weapon, how can we pay it back?

“The second way is to offer 200,000 high-grade Chaos Origin Crystals, just buy them!” Xu Ming 
said again.

purchase?

The corners of Pei’s masters’ mouths twitched again – Pei’s is only a fifth-rank power, how can he 
afford the best Nirvana magic weapon?

“The third way…” Xu Ming’s eyes suddenly flashed a stern look, “Pei Shi, destroy!”

Pei, destroy it!

Three paths, any one of them, is not something Pei can afford!

“Choose!” Xu Ming said indifferently – he would have no mercy.

select?

How to choose?

The first way and the second way, Pei’s can’t do it; and the third way is a dead end! – Did Mr. Pei 
choose a dead end?

“Since you are unwilling to choose, then let me help you choose!” Xu Ming shouted.

boom! !



Xu Ming’s spear fired again.

The Pei clan members hurriedly formed a battle to resist!

However, Mr. Pei had a lot of great powers and was injured under Xu Ming’s crushing! Even if they 
form a new battle formation now, how long can they resist?

boom! boom! boom! boom! …

Every time Xu Ming fired, the damage to the powerful divine bodies of the Pei Clan became more 
and more serious.

And Xu Ming, even more murderous, looked like he vowed to destroy the Pei family.

“Xu Ming!” Pei Yanlian said in a voice transmission, “How do you want to give up!?”

“Heh!” Xu Ming sneered, “Well, it’s not difficult for me to help you – take all the treasures from 
your dozen or so Destruction Realm bodies and hand them over to me, this is the end of the matter!”

All the treasures of the Pei Clan’s Destruction Realm Great Master are not worth 200,000 high-
grade Chaos Origin Crystals.

“You…” Pei Yan was angry and helpless.

“You can choose to die!” Anyway, after killing these people, their treasures are still Xu Ming’s, 
“Also… don’t think about delaying time! You know, before the other great powers come, it’s 
enough for me to kill them. You Pei family!”

“I…” The corners of Pei Yan’s mouth were extremely bitter, seeing the other gods in the 
Destruction Realm getting weaker and weaker, he had to bow his head and say, “Okay! We Pei’s 
Destruction Realm, hand over all the treasures!”

“That’s right!” Xu Ming was here to settle the account, so he was quite satisfied.



Xu Ming stopped attacking.

The great experts of the Pei Clan’s Destruction Realm humiliated and unloaded their equipment.

The great powers who were watching from various forces were stunned – what is this?

“All treasures! All treasures!” Xu Ming pointed and said, “Whoever, take off the armor for me too!”

After confiscating the treasures of the great powers of the Pei clan, Xu Ming estimated that it should 
still be worth a hundred thousand high-grade Chaos Origin Crystals.

This is equivalent to selling two Divine Destruction Weapons for over a hundred thousand top-
grade Chaos Origin Crystals.

“Hehe!” Xu Ming walked away contentedly, leaving behind the naked powerhouses who had been 
looted, with their faces full of sadness!

“hateful!”

“Damn Xu Ming!”

“If I had known, .com would not help the Taoists to test…”

But now, it’s too late to regret.

“Patriarch! Is the Pei clan still going to be held?” A master of the Pei clan asked uncertainly.

“What to do? What should I do?” Pei Yan really wanted to slap the blind master to death, “Let me 
go!”

At this moment, a terrified scream suddenly sounded outside Pei’s main hall: “Xu Ming is back 
again!”



Xu Ming is back?

Pei Yan almost wanted to vomit blood – why is this **** of plague coming back?

boom!

Xu Ming aggressively rushed into the Pei’s Hall: “There is still an account, I almost forgot to 
calculate it – who injured my Moyin Mall?”

Chapter 1627: Make A Rumour

“Who injured my Moyin Mall?”

In fact, Xu Ming knew for a long time that it was Pei Si who did something to He Qian.

However, to his surprise, Pei San took the initiative to stand up and say, “It’s me!”

“You?” Xu Ming glanced at Pei San in surprise – he couldn’t tell that this Pei San was still a person 
who values friendship.

“No! It’s me!” Pei Si also quickly stood up, “One person does things for one person! It has nothing 
to do with others!”

“Really?” Xu Ming looked at Pei Si again, “Okay, come with me! Those who dare to touch me, you 
must be ready to bear the consequences, right?”

Pei Si took a deep breath: “Yes!”

Injuring Xu Ming’s subordinates, this kind of thing can be big or small! At a young age, an apology 
would be the end of the matter; but at an older age, Xu Ming is now a strong party, even if Pei Si 
was to pay his life to pay off the crime, Mrs. Pei could only admit it!

After all…strength is truth!



Pei glanced at the clan reluctantly, took a deep breath, and left with Xu Ming as soon as he gritted 
his teeth—obviously, in order not to implicate the clan, he was prepared to bear the consequences 
alone.

“Pei Si!” Pei San shouted.

“Brother Xu Ming!” The other senior executives of the Pei clan also followed Xu Ming’s pace.

In fact… Clan Pei is one of the most important clans among the major clans. Now, seeing that Pei 
Si was going to die, the great powers of the Pei clan naturally chased after him and pleaded for 
mercy.

Xu Ming ignored them, but walked to Moyin Mall in Ximoyu on his own.

“Brother Ming!?”

In Moyin Mall, He Qian was completely dumbfounded.

He didn’t expect that Brother Ming had just been there for a while, but he brought back all the 
senior management of the Pei family. Moreover, it seems that these senior members of the Pei 
family are very afraid of Brother Ming.

“Could it be… Brother Ming really ruined the entire Pei family?”

He Qian really never thought that Xu Ming’s strength would be so terrifying.

…

“Brother Xu Ming!” Patriarch Pei Yan followed Xu Ming and said repeatedly, “Our Pei clan, 
willing to pay other prices, please bypass Pei Si!”

“Other prices?” Xu Ming sneered, “I already have all of your Pei’s valuable treasures—what else 
can you pay?”



“This…” Mr. Pei was stunned for a moment.

Indeed, all of Pei’s treasures of the Destruction Realm were all stripped away by Xu Ming. The rest 
are just treasures at the level of all things, and it is impossible for Xu Ming to take a fancy to him, 
and it is even more impossible to exchange the life of Pei Si.

He Qian was stunned again when he heard it: “Brother Ming grabbed all of Pei’s valuable 
treasures?”

He Qian couldn’t help remembering what Xu Ming said before he went to Pei’s – he would get back 
the shattering soldiers that were taken away tenfold, a hundredfold!

And the value of the entire Pei family’s valuable treasures is more than ten times, a hundred times 
more than two pieces of Destruction God Weapon!

“No! How can I mutter that Brother Ming is ‘robbing’?” He Qian thought to himself – he found that 
he used the word incorrectly.

…

“Let’s do it!” Xu Ming said suddenly, “For the sake of your friendship, I’ll give you a chance!”

“Brother Xu Ming, please speak!” Pei Yan said solemnly.

Xu Ming said indifferently: “Tell me, who is behind the scenes to instruct you Pei’s to do this!”

Xu Ming actually had a guess in his heart, but it still needs to be confirmed.

“This is your only chance!” Xu Ming said again.

All of the Pei clansmen looked at each other—it’s a bit unkind to betray their allies; but in order to 
save Pei Si, they don’t care so much for the time being!

Besides…



If it weren’t for the erroneous information of the Taoists and the others, Pei’s would not be so 
miserable now!

Thinking of this, Pei Yan made a decision. He secretly transmitted a voice to Xu Ming and said 
three names: “Man Daoist, Wuye, Huanxin!”

“Sure enough!” Xu Ming raised a disdainful sarcasm at the corner of his mouth, and said, “I also 
keep my promise – you Pei family, please apologize to He Qian; this matter is over!”

“Thank you, Brother Xu Ming!” Pei Yan continued – Xu Ming’s handling of this was already very 
magnanimous.

…

Back to Pantianyu.

Xu Ming pondered in his heart: “The three of them, Daoist Man, are already very strong in the 
Nirvana Realm! If I don’t use ‘attribute modification’ to temporarily modify my combat power, I 
am definitely not an opponent of any of the three; Even if I turn on the ‘temporary modification of 
combat power’, but I don’t have a lot of hanging points, I’m afraid it will be difficult for one to 
fight three!”

Xu Ming naturally vaguely guessed the intentions of the three Daoist Man—they wanted to test 
whether the Master of Pan Tianyu had fallen by testing Moyin Mall.

“Since it’s not an opponent for the time being, then…” Xu Ming thought of a plan – use a knife to 
kill!

However, before borrowing a knife to kill, Xu Ming had to hide himself.

“Now, Moyin Mall is of little use to me!” Moyin Mall can only earn points below level 18. Xu 
Ming has earned enough; “Then first evacuate the Moyin Mall in the entire Destiny Sacred World, 
and then use a knife to kill!”



It is not easy to spread Moyin Mall in the entire Destiny Sacred Realm; however, it is not difficult to 
evacuate!

In just a few months, the once-prosperous Moyin Mall disappeared in the Holy Land of Destiny.

“Brother Ming!”

“Brother Ming!”

The Lone Gunner and Yun Tian were standing beside Xu Ming.

Xu Ming was ready to take the two out of Pan Tianyu.

“Brother Ming!” The Lone Gunner said, “Man Taoist is the best at karma. He should always use 
‘karma’ to implicate me! It’s good that I don’t open my father’s treasure. Once it is opened, I’m 
afraid he will perceive it!”

“No hurry!” Xu Ming said. He actually suspects that the Master Pan Tianyu should have also used 
most of the treasures to refine the same secret room as the ancestor of the blood cloud, so that the 
lone gunner can avoid the destruction and collapse of this chaotic era; The treasures that you have 
ordered are not necessarily how many are left.

Therefore, Xu Ming is really in no hurry to open the treasure of Pan Tianyu.

“As long as you don’t open the treasure, it shouldn’t be easy for Daoists to perceive your location, 
right?” Xu Ming asked.

The Lone Gunner said: “I’m not weak now, and it won’t be easy for a man to use cause and effect to 
implicate me! The cause and effect he left on me should only be able to sense that I have unlocked 
the treasure, and it is impossible to sense mine. Location!”

“Yeah! That’s good!” Xu Ming nodded, “But… before you leave, you have to help me spread some 
rumors!”



“Spreading rumors?” The Lone Gunner wonderedThat’s right! “Xu Ming smiled mysteriously and 
took out the Immortal Sword, “We made a water curtain image, put the image of the Mandaoists 
and the immortal sword, and then spread rumors that the Immortal Sword is in the hands of the 
Mandaoists!” ”

Lone Gunner’s eyes lit up, and he guessed Xu Ming’s intention.

“It’s just Brother Ming… Will other great experts believe this rumor after hearing it?” The Lone 
Gunner couldn’t help asking.

Xu Ming smiled slyly: “Whether they believe it or not, those great masters will definitely go to the 
Mandaoist for verification! Because…they can’t find any trace of us, so they can only go to the 
Mandaoist!”

As for the fate of the three Daoist people, that’s not what Xu Ming needs to care about! – Brother 
Ming is just making up a rumour for fun!

Chapter 1628: Do Not Escape This Catastrophe

The location of the blood cloud magic formation.

None of the thousands of people in the Destruction Realm and Nirvana Realm left.

A strong man, or sitting cross-legged, or standing proudly in the void, or closing his eyes and 
resting.

“Huang Yu still hasn’t come out yet!”

A violent Destruction Realm powerhouse shouted.

“Don’t worry! The later Huang Yu comes out, the more likely it is that he will get the Immortal 
Sword. We are here to wait! Whoever can grab the Immortal Sword will depend on their ability! If 
you can’t wait any longer, go first. Come on! It’s better if there is one less person to fight for!”



“Can’t wait any longer? Joke!” The irritable Destruction Realm powerhouse snorted coldly, “Even 
if it is ten epochs or a hundred epochs, I will still wait!”

Which of the powerhouses in the Destruction Realm and Nirvana Realm here is not an existence 
that has cultivated for hundreds of millions of eras? Just waiting for dozens of epochs or hundreds 
of epochs is like taking a nap.

If Huang Yu knew the thoughts of these powerful outsiders, she would definitely cry.

“You’re still too young!” At this time, a strong man with all white eyebrows said calmly, “Dozens 
of epochs? Hundreds of epochs? Hehe! If Huang Yu doesn’t come out, even if it is hundreds of 
millions of epochs, the old man will Wait here!”

Like these powerhouses who have reached the bottleneck, no matter how much they cultivate, it is 
difficult to make an inch, and they are very boring. If they really want them to wait hundreds of 
millions of epochs, they will wait.

“Haha… Not bad! Where are you waiting? It’s not waiting! Hundreds of millions of epochs are just, 
and it’s over with a flick of a finger!”

The strong men were chatting and laughing, and then soon fell back into silence.

“Um?”

Suddenly, the expressions of all the powerhouses changed in unison, and they all received a water 
curtain image almost at the same time.

“This is…”

Thousands of powerhouses looked at the water curtain images they received suspiciously.

“What!? This is… Immortal Sword!?”

“The Immortal Sword is in the hands of the Daoists in Pantianyu!?”



“Could it be that someone deliberately framed the Taoists and the others?”

“The nine immortal swords are all different! This immortal sword is indeed different from the other 
eight! It seems… No matter whether the immortal sword is really in the hands of the Daoists, it is 
basically certain… The ninth The sword has been born!”

“The ninth sword is born? Since Huang Yu didn’t get the immortal sword, why can’t he hide?”

“Who knows, maybe Huang Yu has already died in the treasure! The treasure he entered may be a 
dangerous place!”

“Makes sense!”

“No matter what, let’s go to Pan Tianyu first!”

“That’s right! Even if someone deliberately framed the Daoists and the others, at least it means that 
they have something to do with the Daoists!”

“Damn it! Could it be that the people who relied on the Blood Cloud Demon Array to play with me 
before were the Daoists and the others?”

Immediately, thousands of strong men stood up, ready to go to Pantianyu to see what happened.

…

At this time, Huang Yu, who had been hiding in the fake treasure for a while, also stood up. He 
estimated that it should be safe outside.

“Since the treasure that I entered is a fake treasure, then… the treasures that other great powers have 
entered must be real treasures!” Huang Yu muttered, “It’s been so long, they should have already 
competed for the immortal sword. The results are here! There should be no one who will continue 
to guard me outside!”

It’s just… What Huang Yu didn’t know was that thousands of other great powers also entered a fake 
treasure!



Thousands of great powers have always thought that what Huang Yu entered is the real treasure! So, 
so far, none of the great powers have left!

“It’s time to go out!” As Huang Yu opened the passage to go out, he secretly said that he was 
unlucky!

is not that right?

In order to find the trace of this ninth immortal sword, how much effort did he spend! In the end, he 
ran into a fake treasure, picked up a pile of garbage, and was too scared to go out.

“Damn it! If you let me know who’s cheating on me, I’ll have to kill him!”

While thinking fiercely, Huang Yu walked out of the treasure, preparing to “embracing freedom”.

But…

When Huang Yu walked out of the treasure, he was suddenly stunned to see that none of the 
thousands of Destruction Realm and Nirvana Realm experts seemed to have left… Thousands of 
sharp eyes shot at him in unison!

“What’s the situation!?” Huang Yu’s face was full of confusion. He just wanted to say that you 
greats are all idle and have nothing to do? I entered a fake treasure, and you are still squatting here 
and not walking…

…

Thousands of experts in the Destruction Realm and Nirvana Realm, many of them were about to get 
up and leave, but saw Huang Yu suddenly appear.

Suddenly, all the powerhouses were not in a hurry to leave, but looked at Huang Yu in unison. After 
all, the water curtain images they just received were not necessarily true! As for Huang Yu, they 
have been squatting for so long; now that they have seen Huang Yu, they naturally have to figure 
out what Huang Yu has in the treasure.



“Every…everyone?” Huang Yu felt the malicious intent in these eyes, and couldn’t help but 
tremble, “You are…?”

boom! boom! boom! …

Before Huang Yu could react, there were countless powerful powers, pressing him so hard that he 
couldn’t breathe.

“Huang Yu! You entered a different treasure alone, what did you get!?” the strong men asked.

“Wh… nothing!” Huang Yu even said aggrieved.

There really is nothing! Just a bunch of treasures below the level of the Great Desolate Realm! As 
for those above the realm of all things… I just found and beat a “hair” that fell from the realm of all 
things in the treasure.

So, to be precise, after Huang Yu entered this fake treasure, he almost only harvested a hair!

“Nothing!?” The powerhouses, regardless of whether they believed it or not, directly attacked 
Huang Yu aggressively!

Does it matter whether you believe it or not?

unimportant!

He directly stripped Huang Yu to see if he had obtained any treasures?

“You…you…” Huang Yu screamed.

But it didn’t work!

In front of thousands of strong men like wolves and tigers, Huang Yu was completely powerless to 
struggle!



Like a little sheep, surrounded by thousands of wolves!

All the space treasures on Huang Yu’s body were forcibly stripped off, and the spiritual imprint was 
erased; all the items in the space treasures were also “pulled out”.

Even the battle armor and weapons on Huang Yu’s body were stripped away; Huang Yu didn’t even 
have clothes to cover his body, so he could only use his divine power to cover his shame.

Divine power is hazy, like a beauty taking a bath. This made some powerhouses with special 
orientations couldn’t help but see their eyes light up.

Soon, every treasure on Huang Yu’s body was clearly detected.

“Damn it! There really is no immortal sword!”

“Don’t talk about the immortal sword, there is not even a valuable treasure!”

Snapped!

An anxious flame slap slapped Huang Yu’s face directly, sending it flying: “Damn it! I didn’t get the 
Immortal Sword, why did you hide in it for so long!?”

“I…” Huang Yu is a grievance, isn’t he afraid that he will be mistaken for some treasure when he 
comes out? In the end, I didn’t expect that after hiding for so long, I still couldn’t escape this 
disaster!

Snapped!

Another Nirvana Realm powerhouse slapped the phoenix feathers with one palm: “I wasted so 
much time!”

Under the low eaves, people had to bow their heads. Although Huang Yu was extremely ashamed 
and angry, he didn’t dare to say a word at all under the eyes of thousands of strong men.



After being bullied for a while, the strong men gave up.

At this time Huang Yu’s divine body was already extremely weakened.

“What’s the matter…” Huang Yu wanted to cry without tears. He still hasn’t figured out what 
happened to him?

Just as Huang Yu was packing up the “remaining body” and was about to leave… The few 
powerhouses with bright eyes before, who had a special orientation, surrounded Huang Yu with 
malicious intent.

“What do you want!?” Huang Yu shuddered violently.

“What do you want? Jie Jie Jie Jie…”

“Humph! It took us so long to just walk away like this!? Of course, I’ll take you back and ‘teach’ a 
lesson!”

These “special powerhouses” deliberately gritted their voices on the word “lessons”; their 
expressions were also extremely mysterious.

“No” Huang Yu seemed to be aware of the coming storm and even wanted to run away.

It’s just that Huang Yu’s divine body at this time is already extremely weak, how can he escape the 
suppression of many peak destruction realm powerhouses?

Chapter 1629: Calamity From Heaven

Pantianyu, Yuxincheng.

Mandaoren, Wuye, Huanxin, these three Nirvana realm powerhouses, sit in a triangle.



“The Lone Gunner actually disappeared!” Huan Xin’s figure was like a dream, “With him, there are 
Xu Ming and Yun Tian from Moyin Mall!”

“Man Daoist, do we want to find a way to track down their whereabouts?” Wu Ye also said.

These three people are obviously respected by the Taoist people.

“Investigate?” Man Taoist shook his head and smiled, “These three people must be prepared to 
leave! Even if you want to track down, can you find a way to track down their whereabouts?”

“That…?”

“Let them run away!” The Taoist man said with a sneer, “If they don’t open the treasure left by the 
Pantian domain master, they will be fine; once they open it… The causal involvement I left on the 
Lone Gunner will definitely allow me to perceive them. The location! Wait!”

Mandao people are very patient.

In fact, how many of those who have cultivated to Nirvana are impatient?

“Yes!” Wu Ye smiled and said, “Let’s wait with peace of mind!”

at this time…

boom! boom! boom! boom! boom! …

The three Daoist people suddenly felt that countless tyrannical breaths rushed into Yuxin City.

“What’s going on?” Man Taoist couldn’t help but wonder – because there are too many strong men 
rushing into Yuxincheng! There are thousands of Daoists who can roughly feel it!

“Why do so many powerhouses suddenly come?” Wuye is also puzzled, “We Pantianyuyu 
Xincheng, it seems that there is nothing worthy of so many powerhouses coming together?”



Huan Xin is a female cultivator, so her perception is more acute: “Man Daoren, Wuye, these 
thousands of strong people seem to be… coming in our direction!”

“Um?”

“Um?”

Daoist Man and Wu Ye were slightly taken aback—it seems that this is indeed the case!

“Don’t panic!” The Taoist Man said softly, “Maybe it’s not for us, but for the other powerhouses in 
the Domain Lord’s Mansion!”

In the Domain Lord’s Mansion, apart from the Taoist Man and the three of them, there are naturally 
other experts in Nirvana and Destruction.

“Not bad!” Wu Ye also said, “The three of us live in seclusion, and don’t cause trouble! There are so 
many strong people, it makes no sense to come to us!”

Just as the three of them were talking, thousands of experts in the Destruction Realm and Nirvana 
Realm had already surrounded the Domain Lord’s Mansion in all directions.

Immediately after…

“Man Daoist! Wuye! Huanxin!”

“You three, come out quickly!”

“Come out quickly! Otherwise, don’t blame us for rushing into the Domain Lord’s Mansion to 
arrest people!”

One after another shouts, like endless thunder, rolling through the entire Yuxin City.

“What!?” The three of the Taoists were immediately stunned, “Why are they coming for us?!”



For hundreds of millions of epochs, the three Mandaoists have never offended anyone! They really 
couldn’t imagine why there were so many strong people who wanted to find the three of them by 
name.

“Everyone!” The voice of the Taoist man also resounded throughout the entire Yuxincheng, “I don’t 
know what to do with the three of us? Is there any misunderstanding?”

If the Domain Lord Pantian is there, the Taoist Man can naturally hide in the Domain Lord’s 
Mansion and ignore the three of them. But now, the Domain Lord Pantian is not there, and the 
formation of the Domain Lord’s Mansion is uncontrolled, obviously unable to stop these thousands 
of powerhouses!

At the same time, Daoist Man couldn’t help but think: “It seems… all parties in the holy world of 
destiny think that the domain master of Pantian has fallen! Otherwise… these powerhouses would 
not dare to collide with the domain master’s mansion!”

Domain Master and Nirvana Realm are two completely different levels!

Even if thousands of Destruction Realm and Nirvana Realm join forces, if they dare to provoke the 
domain master head-on, it will be courting death!

“Misunderstanding?” Thousands of powerhouses were imposing, “Whether there is a 
misunderstanding or not, come out and speak!”

“This…” Man Daoist hesitated for a while, but in the end the situation was stronger than others, and 
he didn’t dare to carry it hard, so he had to fly out of the Domain Lord’s Mansion with Wuye and 
Huanxin.

As for the Domain Lord’s Mansion, although there are other Destruction Realms and Nirvana 
Realms living in it, they don’t know what happened, so none of them dare to come forward.

Of course…they’re useless even if they start! – The number of powerhouses in the Domain Lord’s 
Mansion is far less than the thousands of powerhouses! Even if he gets ahead, he will be beaten 
back.

“Everyone…” The Daoist Man looked at the strong man in the sky, no longer calm as usual, “I 
don’t know what’s going on?”



“Man Daoist!” A loud shout sounded, “Hand over the immortal sword!”

“What?” Man Daoist looked bewildered.

Hand over the immortal sword?

The immortal sword, of course, the Taoist people know that it is a token of entering the tower of 
immortality! But the problem is…

“Where did I get the Immortal Sword!?” The Taoist Man was stunned for a while, but he couldn’t 
react.

“How dare you quibble!?” The momentum of thousands of strong men oppressed the three Daoist 
Man. At the same time, a water curtain image was displayed in front of the Taoist Man and Wu Ye.

In the image of the water curtain, there are three figures of Daoist Man and an immortal sword.

“This…” The Taoist Man said speechlessly, “Just based on this water curtain image, it doesn’t seem 
to be able to explain anything, right? Obviously, someone is deliberately framing it for us!”

“Is it planted… Check it out and see if you don’t know!?”

boom! boom! boom! …

Immediately, without warning, thousands of powerhouses made their move in an incomparable tacit 
understanding.

“you…”

Mandaoren, Wuye, and Huanxin, although they are all Nirvana realm powerhouses, their strength is 
much more tyrannical than Huang Yu; however, in the face of the joint siege of dozens of Nirvana 
realm and thousands of Destruction realm, they only struggled a little. Immediately, it was 
suppressed.



However, the three Mandaoists are all in the Nirvana realm after all; so when the thousands of 
powerhouses attacked, they were all measured, but they did not strip off the weapons and armor of 
the three.

When they checked the treasures of the three and determined that the immortal sword was not on 
the three of them, everyone stopped.

Afterwards, thousands of powerhouses showed their causal means, carefully “scanning” the three 
subdued Daoists; after confirming that there was no causal connection with the Immortal Sword on 
the three of them, they stopped.

“Who got the Immortal Sword!?”

Thousands of strong men left Pantianyuyu Xincheng with their doubts in their hearts.

Mandaoren, Wuye, and Huanxin just felt like crying without tears!

What’s the matter!

It’s really “When people sit at home, disasters come from heaven”!

Inexplicably, thousands of strong men rushed to the door and searched the body…

“Damn! Damn!”

The Taoist man gnashed his teeth and flew back to the Domain Lord’s Mansion. But he always felt 
that the eyes of other powerhouses in the Domain Lord’s Mansion looking at the three of them were 
full of ridicule.

“Don’t let me find out, who is framing me!” The Taoist Man has never suffered such humiliation in 
his entire life!

However, no matter how angry the three of them are, there is nowhere to shed their anger! After all, 
they have no clue as to who the murderer is behind the scenes.



Chapter 1630: Walking Through The City Of Death

“Ahead is the city of death!”

Xu Ming looked at the black city of God beyond the billions in front of him.

This black city of God is full of blood and evil spirits; in the center of the city, there is a black stone 
tablet that pierces the top of the dome.

“This stele is the ‘Monument of the True Self’!” Beside Xu Ming, the lone gunman looked at the 
black stele in awe, “It is rumored… this stele of the true self was erected by the great Supreme 
Phoenix himself! ”

Phoenix Supreme!

The most supreme existence in the holy world of destiny! Overlooking the many domain lords and 
world lords in the Destiny Holy Realm!

“The monument of the true self? The Supreme Phoenix?” Xu Ming’s eyes were distant, and he 
didn’t know what he was thinking.

Xu Ming actually really wanted to meet Huang Zhizun, but after coming to this chaotic era, he 
didn’t hear any news about Huang Zhizun at all, let alone looking for his trace.

Xu Ming guessed that when he entered the Immortal Tower, he might be able to meet Huang 
Zhizun.

“Brother Ming!” The Lone Gunner said again, “This ‘Monument of True Self’ is said to be hiding 
the secrets from Nirvana to the Domain Lord!”

“Oh?” Xu Ming was a little surprised.



The Lone Gunner continued: “The strong people above the domain master realm cannot enter the 
city of death! Once they enter, they will be suppressed by the monument of the true self; if they 
resist, it is very likely that they will die! The Nirvana realm powerhouses in the city are crazy!”

“crazy?”

“Yes!” The Lone Gunner said, “For the so-called ‘real self state’, they even… have no fear of life 
and death! Many Nirvana realm powerhouses will never come out for life after stepping into the 
city of death; unless , when did you realize the ‘real realm’!”

In the realm of self, Xu Ming knows a little bit!

From the realm of chaos to the realm of nirvana, these six realms are all perceptions of “chaos to the 
Tao” at different levels! When you reach the pinnacle of Nirvana, your understanding of Chaos 
Supreme Dao has reached the pinnacle!

If you want to break through from the Nirvana realm to the domain master realm, you must 
comprehend the “real self realm”!

And those who can comprehend the “real self”… Among the hundred peak Nirvana realms, there 
may not be one person!

The real me, why?

Too ethereal! No one can say it unless they feel it.

“Let’s go! Enter the city!” Xu Ming said.

The reason why Xu Ming came to the City of Death is because… it can be said that it is almost 
absolutely safe in the City of Death!

It is strictly forbidden to do anything in the city. Anyone who dares to violate it will be suppressed 
by the “Monument of the True Self”!



And Xu Ming, there is a transaction that needs to be done! Walking Dead City is undoubtedly the 
place that best meets Xu Ming’s requirements!

“Brother Ming.” The Lone Gunner hesitated and said, “Do you really want to go to the City of 
Death and sell your entry to the ‘Tower of Immortality’?”

To enter the Immortal Tower, you need the token “Immortal Sword”.

There are nine immortal swords in total, and they are in the hands of different powerhouses. And 
each immortal sword can allow twelve strong men to enter the tower of immortality.

Xu Ming was in the Holy Land of Destiny, and he didn’t have any powerful friends; like Lone 
Gunner and Yun Tian, their strength was too weak, and it was impossible for Xu Ming to bring them 
into the Tower of Immortality. So… in Xu Ming’s hands, eleven places were vacated to enter the 
Tower of Immortality.

And now Xu Ming is going to sell these eleven places.

“If I go to other places to sell the quota, it will definitely attract strong people from all over the 
world, and even the auction house may take action against me! But in the city of death…” Xu Ming 
smiled, “It is absolutely safe in the city of death!”

“But Brother Ming…” The Lone Gunner said embarrassedly, “How did you leave the City of Death 
after you finished the auction?”

The Tower of Immortality, in the Taikoo Temple.

And in the city of death, there is no teleportation formation leading to the outside world.

In other words… Xu Ming is absolutely safe in the City of Death! But as soon as you leave the City 
of Death, you will definitely be surrounded by Nirvana realm powerhouses from all sides! At that 
time, the places to enter the Immortal Tower can be sold, but the Immortal Sword will probably also 
be taken away!

“You don’t need to worry about that!” Xu Ming smiled, “I’m sure of myself!”



For others, it may be difficult to leave the City of Death; but for Xu Ming, it is not difficult at all! 
Just open the “coordinate transmission” link, and you’re done!

And… when Xu Ming auctions off the quota, he will definitely have enough level 20 points! At that 
time, if those nirvana realm powerhouses really don’t have eyes, Xu Ming will directly open the 
“attribute modification” link, and he will be able to hang Bafang easily!

Xu Ming is in urgent need of high-level hanging points!

With hanging points, nothing is a problem!

“Okay!” Seeing that Xu Ming was very confident, the Lone Gunner didn’t persuade him any 
further.

The Lone Gunner thought that Xu Ming’s confidence came from the mysterious master behind him
—Senior Palm God!

In the eyes of the Lone Gunner, Senior Palm God is a suspected existence of the “World Lord 
Realm”! With such an existence backing it, it is natural to have the confidence to do anything.

It’s just… How could the Lone Gunner think that the senior Palm God he always thought was 
actually Xu Ming.

…

Enter the city of death.

The city is very desolate.

After all, most of the people who will come to the city of death are in the Nirvana realm; the 
weakest are generally in the destruction realm!

And how many Nirvana and Destruction states can there be in the entire Destiny Holy Realm? The 
huge city of jumping to death naturally looks desolate.



Oh no!

To be precise, there are still several places in the City of Death, which are quite lively! For example, 
the no-regret battle stage, such as “True Self Auction”!

“On this no-regret battle stage, all the powerhouses in the Destruction Realm and Nirvana Realm 
are fighting for life and death…”

You must know that the entire Destiny Sacred Realm is only in the Destruction Realm and Nirvana 
Realm? On the stage of no regrets, it is often seen that such strong men are fighting for life and 
death, just to understand the “true self”.

When Xu Ming passed by the Battle of No Regrets, he did not fight.

Not long after, Xu Ming arrived at the “True Self Auction”.

“What!? Auctioning the places to enter the Tower of Immortality?” The great master in charge of 
the real auction house was also startled – he had never auctioned this!

After all, The eight immortal swords that were born before are all in the hands of various forces; no 
one will auction off the places to enter the immortal tower.

“Not bad!” Xu Ming said, “Can it be auctioned?”

“Auction, of course, it can be auctioned!” The person in charge of the real auction house, after 
confirming that Xu Ming does possess an immortal sword, said, “But…it may not be able to sell!”

“Why?” Xu Ming couldn’t help asking.

“Because…” The person in charge glanced at Xu Ming, “Your strength! – If you want others to buy 
a place, first of all, you must have the strength to keep the Immortal Sword!”

The person in charge said this, obviously questioning Xu Ming’s strength. Just like when he was 
outside the city before, the Lone Gunner questioned Xu Ming.



“Don’t worry! You are the real auction house, you only need to be in charge of the auction!” Xu 
Ming said lightly.

“Then… Okay!” The person in charge stopped persuading him. After all, he also really wanted to 
rely on this auction to make a name for the auction house.
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