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Chapter 761: Mental Strength Level 2

“Xu Ming!”

“Xu Ming!”

The top human beings were all shocked when they saw Xu Ming’s actions – Xu Ming wanted to 
stop the gods for them! ?

The power of the gods, how could the demigods be able to stop them?

In particular, the great powers of the Jiuyu era, such as Chu Ji, are even more aware of the horrors 
of the gods!

Under the gods, to block the real gods is completely like a man’s arm!

Many people from the human race suddenly slowed down in their escape steps—they wanted to 
turn around to help Xu Ming, but they knew that they couldn’t help anything at all.

It’s not going to go back, and it’s not going to go back!

“You go first!”

God of War Jin and God of Fire roared, then turned around to help Xu Ming.

rumbling…

In the blink of an eye, Erke had already killed Xu Ming.

“Dare to stop me? It’s really courting death!”



On Erke’s fist, a black flame was burning; the ferocious and terrifying breath seemed to be able to 
burn and destroy everything in the world.

With one punch, Xu Ming deeply felt the power of the gods—this was a terrifying power that was 
not at the same level as him.

Facing this punch, it felt like an ant looking up at the sky.

But Xu Ming didn’t teleport to escape; if he dodged, Narke would rush directly over!

“bring it on!”

Xu Ming also had his back.

He was hanging on the “energy shield”, and he didn’t believe that he would be killed by a punch!

Even if the other party is a god!

Moreover, even if you are killed by a punch, you will only lose a human clone! The big deal is to 
regroup immediately.

No matter what, Xu Ming is invincible and cannot be killed!

boom!

Erke’s speed is too fast!

Xu Ming could barely see a black fist shadow, and his fist had already hit him.

Unsurprisingly, Xu Ming was blasted away without any resistance.



“It’s really not escaping?” Erke was shocked and surprised, “Did he die? – My punch is enough to 
completely destroy his body and soul!”

“Xu Ming!”

“Xu Ming!”

The Golden God of War, the God of Fire, and the top beings of the human race are all extremely 
worried.

But immediately, everyone found that Xu Ming’s breath did not weaken at all.

“Xu Ming is fine!” The top human beings breathed a sigh of relief, and at the same time they 
couldn’t help but become more and more curious – what treasure is on Xu Ming’s body, and even 
the attack of the gods can’t hurt him!

You must know that even if you are wearing a divine weapon armor, you will still be easily killed 
by the gods!

“So strong…” Xu Ming was horrified.

Although he was not injured, he still felt the horror of this punch! Because… with one punch, he 
was directly deducted 10 million level 8 hanging points!

Ten million level 8 hanging points!

You know, thousands of alien demigods’ spiritual attack volleys only made Xu Ming deduct 
300,000 level 8 hanging points! In other words, the power of Erke’s random punch is dozens of 
times more terrifying than the joint attack of thousands of demigods!

“The power of the gods is really unstoppable!” Xu Ming secretly said.

If there is no “energy shield” hanging, Xu Ming will probably be killed with one punch!



However, if there is no “if”, Brother Ming is hanging, so he is safe and sound!

boom! boom!

Just as Xu Ming was blasted away, the Golden God of War in golden armor and the fiery red God of 
War had already met Erke from left to right.

“Two puppets!” Erke’s face was disdainful; his two arms that exuded black aura suddenly stretched 
and blasted out.

The Golden God of War and the God of Fire were also blown away directly.

“I… I’m injured!” The Golden God of War was a little terrified.

Although it is only a slight injury, you must know that the Golden God of War has never suffered a 
single injury for hundreds of millions of years!

On the other hand, the God of War, because the composition of the body is relatively special, it 
seems real and virtual, but he is not injured.

“Just because of you, you want to stop me from killing!?” Erke continued to kill.

call out-

At this moment, the Sky-Questing Mirror at the top of the Asking Palace suddenly shot out a 
dazzling ray of light, covering all the power of Erke, the domain artifact, the Sky-Questing Mirror, 
all concentrated to restrict Erke’s movements.

Wherever Erke flew, this dazzling light followed.

It’s just… Erke’s actions were hardly affected!

This is the strength of the gods, unmatched and unreasonable!



“How can it be so strong…” Xu Ming felt a hint of despair – he couldn’t find any way to defeat 
Erke!

“Under the gods, is it really impossible to match the gods?”

Seeing Erke kill like lightning, Xu Ming teleported again and appeared in front of Erke; moreover, 
his entire body quickly slammed into Erke.

“Teleport” hangs, in addition to being able to instantly move to other positions, it can also change 
direction – just like now, Xu Ming was originally blasted away by Erke; after a teleport, he instead 
directly hit Erke .

The “teleportation” hanging contains secrets related to space, which Xu Ming can’t understand at 
all.

“Huh!?” Erke was startled, “You ant, you are really difficult to deal with! However, if you want to 
stop my killing, you are not qualified! – All the powers of your human race are going to die!”

boom!

Saying that, Erke sent Xu Ming flying with another punch.

Then, in the next instant, Erke had already killed a ninth-order demigod of the human race—this 
ninth-order demigod was an ancestor of the previous era, and Xu Ming did not recognize it.

“die!”

The terrifying giant fist exuding black **** slammed out – this ancestor who came out of the 
eternal silence cave, but there is no “energy shield” hanging, and there is no terrible defense like the 
golden **** of war and the **** of fire! With one punch, he was directly smashed to death, leaving 
no fly ash.

Just a random punch, a ninth-order demigod, die!



As for Xu Ming, he could only helplessly watch all this happen – Xu Ming’s teleportation also 
required reaction time; and Erke’s speed was already too fast for Xu Ming to react!

What a speed this is!

As for the Golden God of War and the God of Fire… In front of True God Erke, it is even more 
useless! After they were blasted away, they couldn’t catch up with Erke’s figure at all.

Swish!

Xu Ming teleported again, appeared in front of Erke, and was blown away by a punch!

Can’t stop it!

God is unstoppable!

Immediately afterwards, Erke had already killed behind the sword master—a sword master with 
only “eighth-order” strength, in front of Erke, he couldn’t even be regarded as an ant, at most… 
“ant egg”!

“No—” The sword master was terrified, but he was completely powerless to resist.

“Sword Master!” Xu Ming was anxious!

However, in the face of the absolute strength gap, it is useless to rush!

“How can he be so strong! How can he be so strong!?” Xu Ming was furious, “How on earth can 
we defeat him!”

In a trance, Xu Ming felt a hint of despair in his heart: “I can’t defeat him…”

“no way…”



“There is no way…”

“God is too strong…”

The fire of Xu Ming’s fighting spirit began to dim.

Sudden-

“Do not!!”

Xu Ming’s pessimistic eyes suddenly became extremely sharp and determined!

“There can’t be anyone who can’t be defeated!”

“There must be a way to defeat him!”

“What’s wrong with the gods? Even the gods are from the mortal world, after going through the 
spiritual realm, the Tao realm… and only cultivated step by step!”

“Although he is stronger than me, can’t I defeat him?”

“Do not!!”

“Gods are also human, and there must be a way to defeat them!”

In an instant shorter than lightning, Xu Ming’s mood was changing rapidly.

wow—

Suddenly, Xu Ming felt that his spiritual power, which had already reached the “first level of mental 
power consummation”, actually began to break through the “second level”!



Chapter 762: Smash The Palace

The power of the mind is ethereal and illusory, but it is real.

It is different from comprehending the way of heaven—with the help of the power of heaven, this is 
an external force; while the mental force is an “internal force”.

From the heart, destroy the sky and destroy the earth.

When you first enter the “first level of mental power”, you can have the strength of a first-step 
Taoist!

Reaching the “third level of mental strength”, you will be able to compete with gods head-on with 
the body of a mortal!

The power of the mind cannot be underestimated! If it is cultivated to the extreme, it can even be no 
less than the power of heaven!

…

Xu Ming’s mental strength has been honed at the “first level of consummation” for a long time; at 
this time, Xu Ming felt that he suddenly broke a layer of shackles and stepped into a completely 
different new world!

Xu Ming could feel that his mental strength was expanding like a balloon; his mind seemed to be 
wider and vaster than the heaven and the earth…

“The second level of mental strength!”

Xu Ming knew very well that he had just completed a spiritual transformation.

“Good… what a powerful force!”



Xu Ming felt the power that erupted from the depths of his heart—the first level of mental power 
was comparable to that of a sixth-order demigod!

All of a sudden, Xu Ming’s mental power was even stronger than the power of heaven – after all, 
Xu Ming’s strongest perception of the heaven of fire has not yet reached the third-order demigod!

boom!

Equivalent to the mental strength of a sixth-order demigod, with the blessing of combat plug-ins 
such as “three-hanging package”, “super perfect battle”, “leapfrog battle bonus”, “protagonist halo”, 
it is directly comparable to “16th-order”!

Before Xu Ming’s mental power breakthrough, he had the “fifteenth-order” combat power; but now, 
there are more mental powers comparable to the “sixteenth-order” – “mind power” and “heavenly 
power”. Ming’s strength has directly entered the terrifying “Seventeenth Order”!

Seventeenth-order demigods, even in the realm of the gods, are probably rare!

However, the combat power of the seventeenth rank is far from enough compared to the gods!

but…

The breakthrough of mental strength brought Xu Ming, in addition to the improvement in strength, 
the more important thing is the transformation in fighting spirit!

Even in the face of the gods who were completely unable to compete, Xu Ming was never 
discouraged.

“kill!”

Xu Ming appeared in front of Erke again.

rumbling…



The ice gun erupted into a “reincarnation black hole”, and the power of this gun was several times 
stronger than before!

Even Erke was moved: “This kid’s strength…has improved again?”

Erke couldn’t believe why Xu Ming’s strength could increase so terribly in such a short period of 
time! After all, Erke knows nothing about the power of the mind, and naturally he cannot 
understand how powerful the power of the mind is!

“The speed of this kid’s transformation is too terrifying, he must not be kept!” Erke was full of 
murderous intent.

“roll!”

The iron fist lingering with black **** slammed towards Xu Ming again.

“Erke’s speed seems to have slowed down?” Xu Ming secretly asked.

In fact, it’s not that Erke’s speed has slowed down, but Xu Ming’s reaction and speed have become 
faster! – Of course, compared to Erke, Xu Ming’s speed is still very slow!

The gods are absolutely superior to the demigods – this is the iron law between heaven and earth!

“Pick me up!” Xu Ming, who had rekindled his fighting spirit, blasted directly at Erke’s black iron 
fist.

“Unbelievable!”

boom!

Under the terrifying impact, Xu Ming was directly blasted back.

But in an instant, Xu Ming teleported to Erke again, raised his hand and shot again!



“Let’s go!” Xu Ming’s voice transmission resounded in the minds of every top human being.

More than 900 top human races exist, and they have used their milk-feeding strength to flee towards 
the palace.

The sword master who escaped from death took a deep look at Xu Ming, with gratitude and remorse 
deep in his eyes; he gritted his teeth and turned to flee.

boom! boom! boom! boom! …

Xu Ming was bombarded continuously, but every time he was bombed, he teleported to Erke 
immediately, blocking Erke’s progress.

Under the obstruction of Xu Ming, Erke’s speed was greatly affected.

Of course, Erke felt more…annoying!

He was so annoyed that he wanted to pinch Xu Ming to death, but there was nothing he could do 
about Xu Ming!

Xu Ming’s hanging point is constantly being consumed, but in order to save the powerful people of 
the human race, Xu Ming can’t care about his distressed hanging point!

“die!”

“die!”

“die!”

Erke became more and more annoyed – although Xu Ming couldn’t hurt him, he was completely an 
unbeatable Xiaoqiang!

swoosh swish…



With Xu Ming’s efforts to stop them, the top human beings fled into the Asking Palace one by one.

When the Golden God of War and the God of Fire also fled in, the human race remained outside the 
Palace of Asking Questions, and only Xu Ming was left!

“Xu Ming, come back quickly!” Jin Shengli shouted.

“Close the door!” Xu Ming shouted directly.

rumbling…

The door of the Asking Palace closed with a rumble.

Boom!

When the gate was completely closed and the entire Asking Palace was completely sealed off; Xu 
Ming appeared in the Asking Palace with a teleportation.

“Phew… it’s safe for now!” Xu Ming let out a long sigh of relief.

However, the hanging points consumed by resisting Erke just now really hurt Xu Ming’s heart! – A 
full five billion 8-level hanging points!

The top powerhouses of the human race gathered around one after another.

“Xu Ming, thanks to you!”

“Yeah! Otherwise, there are so many of us, I’m afraid it will be more fortunate!”

“Brother Xu Ming, I owe you a life!” It was the sword master who spoke.

…



Everyone can talk.

However, Xu Ming’s attention was mostly on Erke who was outside the palace.

He stood at the window and looked at the situation outside the Palace: “Everyone, is the Palace… 
strong enough?”

The Chuji demigod from the Jiuyu era said: “Sturdy! – I remember Jiuyu True God once said that 
even if he is, without the help of divine tools, he can’t open the Asking Palace!”

“That’s good!” Xu Ming was relieved now – Erke had no divine weapon in his hands!

However, Chu Ji demigod then said: “But Jiuyu True God also said… If it is a **** who is good at 
attacking, even with his bare hands, he can break through the Asking Palace…”

A **** who is good at attacking?

Just when Xu Ming was thinking deeply,  Erke’s attack smashed **** the outer wall of the Asking 
Palace.

Afterwards, Xu Ming saw that the Asking Palace had been smashed out with slight cracks.

These cracks, with Erke’s attack point as the core, spread slightly towards the four directions.

Although the crack is not big, it shows that… Erke can break through the Asking Palace with his 
bare hands!

“This…”

“This…”

Erke’s smash also made the human race powers in the palace completely stunned – how can this be 
good?



Xu Ming said directly: “Everyone should hide in my world ring first! Quick!”

Under Erke’s terrible attack, the Terran had to abandon the palace! – After all, the Asking Palace is 
a pseudo-artifact of the palace type, it is difficult to move, and it can only be destroyed by Erke!

And what Xu Ming can do is to put all the human race powers into his world ring before the Asking 
Palace is blasted open.

Chapter 763: Retreat To The Kingdom Of God

boom! boom! boom! boom! …

Erke’s fist with black airflow slammed into the same place, punch after punch.

The cracks on the wall of the Asking Palace are getting bigger and denser!

Smashing fake artifacts with bare hands, I am afraid that only gods can achieve this level!

“Break it for me!”

Erke was furious.

He thought that after he became a god, it would be no problem to swept the endless continent; but 
he did not expect that this was the first shot, and it was eaten by Xu Ming.

On the surface, it seems that Erke killed the entire human race and fled in embarrassment; but if you 
think about it carefully, he was dragged by Xu Ming for a long time with the power of the gods, so 
that the great people of the race had time to escape into the Taoist Palace – such a record, It is 
simply a shame among the gods!

What a shame!

“I must be a fake god!” Erke couldn’t help thinking.



“Break! Break it for me!”

However, as long as the Asking Palace is broken open, then it will still be Erke’s slaughter feast.

…

Ask the first floor of the palace.

The top human beings who have just escaped into the Asking Palace are all gathered here.

Xu Ming opened the world ring, and everyone at the top of the human race followed the space 
passage and entered the world ring.

“Xu Ming, be careful!”

“Brother Xu Ming, I’m holding you back!” The sword master felt extremely ashamed.

“Ahem, brother Xu Ming, I was really blind in the past, I didn’t recognize you as a dragon among 
men!” Until now, the Palace Master Soul Tian still commented on his previous evaluation of Xu 
Ming at the banquet. And brooding.

Soon, Xu Ming put all the powerful people on the first floor of the Asking Palace into the world 
ring.

Then, Xu Ming teleported and came to the second floor of the Taoist Palace again – collecting 
people and treasures in the Taoist Palace, he was just trying to grab time with Erke! In order to save 
time, Xu Ming even used teleportation to hurry.

Swish!

Soon, all the monks on the second floor of the Asking Palace were taken away by Xu Ming. Xu 
Ming teleported again and came to the third floor.

Fourth floor…



Fifth floor…

The sixth floor…

Sweep away layer by layer.

boom! boom! boom! boom! boom! …

Asked outside the palace, Erke’s fist rain became more and more dense. The cracks on the Palace of 
Questions also became as dense as cobwebs.

“Break it!”

boom!

In the last huge bang, one of the walls of the Asking Palace was blasted directly out of a big hole.

Asking Palace… was blasted open…

Erke dodged and immediately rushed into the palace.

“Xu Ming!” Erke’s mental power instantly locked onto Xu Ming.

At this time, only Xu Ming was left in the entire Asking Palace; as for the others, they had all been 
put into the World Ring by Xu Ming.

And Xu Ming is still doing the last thing – moving the mirror of the sky!

The Sky-Questioning Mirror is the only domain-type artifact and exploration-type artifact of the 
human race, and of course it cannot fall into Erke’s hands.

boom!



Erke passed through the stairs of the Asking Palace and killed Xu Ming in an instant—although he 
couldn’t kill Xu Ming, he could **** the Sky-Questioning Mirror!

It’s just that Xu Ming’s unicorn arm is so fast! After a while, he took the Wentian Mingjing down 
and put it into the world ring.

“Walk!”

Xu Ming teleported and left the Asking Palace.

“Damn it!” Erke was depressed—he climbed up one staircase after another; now that Xu Ming 
teleported out, he had to take the stairs again to “come down”, and then go out through the blasted 
hole.

“Xu Ming, come to me!” As soon as Xu Ming teleported away from the Asking Palace, he received 
a message from the Palace Master Jitian.

Obviously, the Jitian Palace Master already knew what happened here.

“Retreat to the kingdom of God!” said the master of Jitian Palace.

Jiuyu Divine Kingdom, but the last retreat of the human race.

“What if Erke came with you?” Xu Ming couldn’t help worrying.

“Then let him come!” Jitian Palace Master said directly.

The kingdom of God, how can it be so easy to break into?

“it is good!”

Xu Ming took one last look at the broken Asking Palace, and then teleported directly in the 
direction of Jiuyu Divine Kingdom.



Since then, the human race has not asked the palace for this place!

boom!

At this time, Erke also rushed out of the Asking Palace and rushed towards Xu Ming.

However, no matter how fast Erke’s speed is, of course it can’t be faster than teleportation.

In just a moment, Xu Ming arrived at the Kingdom of God.

He teleported into the interior of the kingdom of God, but saw that the Lord of the Supreme Heaven 
was standing in the sky, and hundreds of millions of bright threads of the Law of Heaven were 
intertwined in the sky behind the Lord of the Supreme Heaven.

“Palace Master Jitian!” Xu Ming continued, “Erke is chasing after him!”

“Yeah!” Jitian Palace Lord nodded slightly, his face expressionless, “Next, leave it to me!”

“Oh?” Xu Ming couldn’t help but be a little surprised – could it be that the existence of the 
Supreme Heaven Palace Master, who controls the kingdom of God, has a way to fight against Erke?

Regardless of whether there is a way, Xu Ming can only watch it quietly.

After all, he has now come to the last base of the human race, and there is no way to retreat!

rumbling—

After a while, the sky intertwined by the threads condensed by the Law of Heaven was torn apart by 
a huge space crack.

Erke, dressed in black but extremely dazzling, strolled into the kingdom of God directly from the 
crack in the space.



“This is Jiuyu Divine Kingdom?” Erke’s eyes swept domineeringly in all directions of the Divine 
Kingdom, as if to see the mystery of this Divine Kingdom, “I have wanted to come to this place for 
a long time, and today, I finally realized this. Be careful!”

“Erke!” The voice of the master of the Jitian Palace was mighty, “I can’t believe that you have 
become a god! – It’s really hidden!”

“Is it surprising that I can become a god?” Erke said with a wanton smile, “My Yehenala clan is the 
most pure demon clan on the endless continent! And my Erke is Yehenara. Among the Henara clan, 
the bloodline is the most pure!—Isn’t it just right to be able to become a god?”

“Haha…” Jitian Palace Master couldn’t help laughing, “Erke, don’t put gold on your face! You 
were seriously injured in the Eternal Demon Pit, and it would be good to save your life, let alone 
become a god! -I’m curious, where did you get the fruit of enlightenment!”

“Hmph! These You don’t need to care!” Erke sneered, “Today, I will first destroy the kingdom of 
God and kill you top human races! Then, I will go to exterminate the endless continent. All the 
human races, hahahaha…”

The geniuses below who are cultivating in the kingdom of God, listened to the conversation in the 
sky, they were all shocked-they didn’t know what a severe test the human race was going through!

“Who is that black figure in the sky? How dare you be so arrogant?”

In the kingdom of God, one after another figure looked up at the scene in the sky.

“Want to destroy our human race? Do you want to destroy our human race?” Ji Tiangong sneered at 
first, then his expression became grim, “Then you can stay here forever!”

rumbling…

Hundreds of millions of dazzling silk threads are instilled in the body of the Supreme Heaven 
Palace Master; the source energy of the entire Divine Kingdom is converging towards the Supreme 
Heaven Palace Master.



The most mysterious of the human race, who has never made a move, or even left Jiuyu Divine 
Kingdom, is finally going to make a move!

Chapter 764: Enough To Fail

rumbling…

The aura of the Palace Master Jitian continued to rise, as if the world was as vast and majestic.

The power of the entire Divine Kingdom is called and controlled by the Supreme Heaven Palace 
Master!

At this moment, the power of the Supreme Heaven Palace Master is not even inferior to that of the 
gods!

“What a strong aura!” Even Erke was moved by it, “But… a strong aura doesn’t mean your strength 
is strong! – Let me see how powerful the human race’s last reliance is, the ‘Ji Tian Palace Master’. 
Bar!”

boom!

Erke burst out.

Erke, who has just become a god, actually doesn’t have much fighting skills, just two points – fast! 
Great power!

However, with these two points alone, Erke can crush all demigods; even Xu Ming, facing Erke, 
can only use “teleportation” and “energy shield” to save his life.

“Humph!” Jitian Palace Master has a look of disdain on his face – in the kingdom of God, he is 
almost invincible!

rumbling…



As soon as the Jitian Palace Master raised his hand, the vast source energy of the Divine Kingdom 
gathered in the palm of his hand; then, he directly faced Erke’s black iron fist and slammed into it.

boom!

Erke’s punch is the real power of the gods!

And the fist of the Supreme Heaven Palace Master contains the power of the entire Divine 
Kingdom.

Two punches slammed together, and then…

Erke was directly blasted away! But the Palace Master of Extreme Heaven is safe and sound!

“This…” Erke was instantly stunned, “Isn’t this too strong!?”

Xu Ming was also stunned: “The Supreme Heaven Palace Master is so powerful!?”

In fact, it is not that the power of the Supreme Heaven Palace Master is strong, but the source 
energy of the kingdom of God is too vast…

You must know that the source energy of the kingdom of God is usually much stronger than the 
“divine power” of the pioneers of the kingdom of God!

Although Erke is a god, but trespassing into the kingdom of the human race is completely an act of 
seeking abuse!

“Erke, do you really think that if you become a god, you will be invincible in the world?—Humph! 
Die!”

In the sky of Jiuyu Divine Kingdom, hundreds of millions of densely packed heavenly source 
powers are intertwined into a dense prison net, directly shrouding Erke.



“Not good!” Erke’s face changed suddenly, and he quickly manipulated his divine power and 
slammed into the shrouded prison net.

boom! boom! boom! boom! …

Erke’s attack that could easily kill the ninth-order half-god, slammed into the energy prison net, but 
couldn’t shake it in the slightest.

“The kingdom of God, it really isn’t for trespassing!” Erke even felt a little regretful that he should 
not have broken into the kingdom of God.

At the same time, Erke was also pondering – when he is free, he must also open up a kingdom of 
God!

escape!

Erke flew directly towards the apex of the sky—there is also the membrane wall of the kingdom of 
God.

Only by breaking the top of the sky can you leave the kingdom of God.

However, the prison net constructed by the power of the source of heaven is just above Erke’s head 
– at this time, Erke is still flying upwards, isn’t he throwing himself into the net?

call out-

Sure enough, soon, the energy prison net covered Erke.

“Caught Erke?” Xu Ming looked at him in surprise.

But then, a scene that made Xu Ming stunned happened! I saw Erke’s body turned into a stream of 
water, “flowing” out from the gap in the prison net.

It really flows out!



After flowing out, Erke instantly condensed into a human form, and punched the wall of the 
kingdom of God with one punch, and escaped directly.

“Let him escape…” Jitian Palace Master sighed.

In fact, this situation was as early as expected by the Supreme Heaven Palace Master—with the 
help of the power of the source of the kingdom of God, although the gods can be suppressed, but it 
is almost impossible to kill them!

The life level of the gods is completely different from the demigods! The real gods are not so easy 
to kill!

Just like just now, Erke’s body suddenly turned into a stream of water – this is actually a change of 
the divine body.

Of course, if True God Jiuyu is allowed to control the kingdom of God in person, the power that can 
be exerted will be completely different! Killing a “new god” who has just been preached is as easy 
as the palm of your hand.

“I’m going to see the outside world!” Xu Ming said.

“No need!” As soon as the Supreme Heaven Palace Lord thought, a crack opened in the sky of the 
Kingdom of God – in the Kingdom of God, the Supreme Heaven Palace Lord is an omnipotent 
existence!

Through the crack in the space, Xu Ming saw that Erke was standing proudly in the turbulent space.

“Erke, why are you leaving in such a hurry?” Jitian Palace Master smiled, “Aren’t you coming back 
for a cup of tea?”

“Ji Tian, you really have the means!” Erke sneered, “But your means are only external forces, not 
your own strength! – If you dare to come out, I will crush you, just like crushing someone to death. 
As easy as an ant!”



Jitian Palace Master was not provoked at all: “I will never leave the kingdom of God!”

The controller of the kingdom of God shoulders the last retreat of the entire human race! No matter 
what happens outside the Kingdom of God, even if the human race in the 3,600 territory is 
slaughtered, the controller of the Kingdom of God will not leave the Kingdom of God!

As long as the kingdom of God is protected, the human race will be inexhaustible!

“Don’t come out?” Erke looked grim, “Then you hide in the tortoise shell! – Now, I will kill all the 
people of your human race; destroy your human race and occupy your territory!”

“Humph!” With that said, Erke was about to turn around and leave.

“Stop!” Suddenly, Xu Ming teleported and appeared outside the kingdom of God.

“Xu Ming…” Erke looked indifferently and did not do anything; because he knew that he could not 
kill Xu Ming.

“Erke!” Xu Ming shouted directly, “If you dare to slaughter my human race, I will slaughter your 
demon race!”

“Huh!?” Erke’s pupils shrank suddenly, murderous intent flashed, “Xu Ming, are you threatening 
me?!”

“Yes! I’m threatening you!” Xu Ming said directly, “Erke, although my strength is not as good as 
you for the time being, you can’t kill me at all! – If you destroy my human race, I will destroy your 
demon race!”

Erke’s face was cloudy for a while, and after changing a few times, he said: “How dare you threaten 
me with ‘mutual slaughter’! Then you can go and destroy my demon clan! Anyway, those idiots 
don’t have much left. Function; if it is destroyed, I am still happy to be pure! – In short, no matter 
what your human race, I am destroyed!”

It’s gone!



“Hmph, I want to destroy your human race, who can stop it!?”

Indeed, on the Endless Continent, no one can stop Erke’s killing!

“The demons are indeed cold-blooded and ruthless!” Xu Ming sneered, “After proving the Tao and 
becoming a god, he even abandoned his own clan when he said it was abandoned! But…”

Xu Ming paused and continued: “Even if you can kill the human race, you can’t kill me! – After I 
become a god, I will definitely kill you to pay homage to my human race’s billions of compatriots!”

Erke’s face changed again – Xu Ming’s words completely hit his vital point!

As Xu Ming said, he couldn’t kill Xu Ming, but after Xu Ming became a god, he could almost 
certainly kill him!

“This…”

Erke suddenly discovered that what he was a **** was really a failure! Actually, he was threatened 
by a demigod!

Chapter 765: Killing Intent Boils

Erke suddenly discovered that what he was a **** was really a failure! Actually, he was threatened 
by a demigod!

But Erke can’t do anything about it – now, he really can’t kill Xu Ming; and with Xu Ming’s 
progress, it is almost a certainty that he will become a **** in the future!

Moreover, the gods who have achieved the fruit of refining and refining the Tao are undoubtedly the 
weakest among the gods! When Xu Ming becomes a god, his strength is definitely much stronger 
than Birke!

The most tragic thing is that Erke also promised that mysterious God’s Domain Power that he 
would stay in the Endless Continent forever and never go to God’s Domain! In other words, there is 



nowhere for him to escape; when Xu Ming becomes a god, killing him will be nothing but catching 
a turtle in a urn!

“It’s really embarrassing for this **** to be!”

Of course, Erke is not stupid.

He sneered and looked at Xu Ming: “Humph! Even if I don’t destroy your human race now, won’t 
you come after me after you become a god?”

Xu Ming heard that Erke was a little soft.

If the opponent is soft, Xu Ming is hard!

“You can leave the Endless Continent and go to the Divine Realm!” Xu Ming said directly.

To expel a real **** from the Endless Continent, Xu Ming is really… overbearing enough!

At the end, Xu Ming said “kindly”: “You can rest assured, as long as you are willing to leave the 
Endless Continent; then, I will definitely leave a place for your demons to live in the underground 
world of the Endless Continent!—How?”

how?

“Of course it’s impossible!” Erke snorted coldly, “Xu Ming, you are too arrogant! You have to 
figure out that it is me, not you, who has the advantage now! – You actually want to drive me away 
from the Endless Continent?”

“Hmph, and, even if I want to leave the Endless Continent, I can’t leave!” Accidentally, Erke 
seemed to have leaked something.

Can’t leave?

Xu Ming keenly captured these four words: “What do you mean?”



“It doesn’t make any sense!” Erke hurriedly denied.

However, Xu Ming believes that there must be something strange in this.

“Erke, where did you get your Taoism Fruit?” Xu Ming grasped the key point at once, “On the 
Endless Continent, it is impossible to have a Taoist Fruition!”

Just now, the Fire God of War confirmed Xu Ming’s voice transmission, telling him that there is no 
fruit of proving the Dao in Huangquan Realm!

So, where did Erke’s fruit of enlightenment come from?

Moreover, Xu Ming also heard the words “can’t leave” from Erke’s mouth.

All kinds of signs were linked together, and Xu Ming immediately thought of a possibility – 
someone gave Erke the fruit of enlightenment, and he was not allowed to leave the Endless 
Continent!

Then, who can come up with the fruit of proving the Way and bestow it on Erke?

There is no doubt that it is definitely the super beings who descended from the God Realm to the 
Endless Continent to have the fruit of enlightenment!

Thinking of this, Xu Ming’s mind suddenly flashed the figure of a young general in white armor: 
“Is it him? Li Xiujie?”

Li Xiujie, the super existence of God’s Domain, is also one of Yin Ran’s suitors.

Li Xiujie’s coveted heart for Yin Ran can be seen even by a blind person; however, Yin Ran is 
extremely disgusted with Li Xiujie!

“Erke!” Xu Ming asked directly, “Is it a young general in white armor who gave you the fruit of 
enlightenment?”



Erke was stunned for a moment, and subconsciously said: “You… how did you know?”

“Sure enough… Li Xiujie!”

All of a sudden, Xu Ming understood Li Xiujie’s sinister intentions – Li Xiujie gave Erke the fruit 
of enlightenment, but he did not allow Erke to leave the Endless Continent; obviously, he wanted to 
use Erke’s hand to kill himself!

“Fortunately…” Xu Ming secretly rejoiced, “Fortunately, I have the ‘Teleport’ hanging and the 
‘Energy Shield’ hanging, otherwise, with my current strength, my clone will definitely die in Erke’s 
hands ; Our entire human race will suffer because of this! – Such a ruthless Li Xiujie, such a 
poisonous move! Almost… Almost our entire human race was killed by him!”

Fortunately, Xu Ming had enough cards to temporarily shock Erke and make him fearful.

“Li Xiujie!”

Xu Ming’s murderous intent towards Li Xiujie was unprecedentedly strong!

“Li Xiujie is the superpower of God’s Domain? And he has great power? – So what? I will kill 
him!”

Xu Ming now knew that Li Xiujie had planned to deal with him so ruthlessly, how could he not 
avenge this revenge?

“Humph! Li Xiujie…wait for me to kill you in the God’s Domain!” Xu Ming’s heart was filled with 
killing intent.

Li Xiujie, who was far away in the realm of the gods, of course did not know that at this time, Xu 
Ming had already thought of killing himself. Of course, even if he knew, he probably wouldn’t care 
too much; after all, in his eyes, Xu Ming was not even an ant!

At the same time, Xu Ming couldn’t help but worry about Yin Ran. Yin Ran was in the realm of the 
gods. It must be very difficult to deal with such a vicious suitor, right?



Thinking of this, Xu Ming couldn’t help but feel a little distressed: “Yin Ran, wait for me!”

Xu Ming’s eyes are firm – he must become a **** as soon as possible, and then go to God’s 
Domain to find Yin Ran!

Of course, now the enemy is now, forcing Xu Ming to become a **** as soon as possible to solve 
the immediate crisis.

“Erke!” Xu Ming said directly, “That young general in white armor, named Li Xiujie, is one of my 
enemies in God’s Domain! He wants to use your hand to kill me!”

Erke fell into deep thought.

In fact, Erke believed most of Xu Ming’s words; after all, he thought it was a bit strange that the pie 
fell from the sky.

“But… even if what you said is true, so what?” Erke looked at Xu Ming, “One mountain can’t 
tolerate two tigers! Don’t you understand this truth? – Now, although I can’t kill you, my strength is 
strong. I am stronger than you, and I still have a certain amount of initiative; when you become a 
**** in the future, then I really have no initiative at all! So…”

Erke gradually showed a ruthless expression: “I might as well take advantage of now first slaughter 
your human race; then, open up the kingdom of God-from now on, I will hide in the kingdom of 
God and can’t come out! In that case, you What can you do with me!?”

“Huh?” Xu Ming’s expression changed slightly.

You must know that the pioneers of the kingdom of God, if they hide in their own kingdom of gods, 
they can fight at many levels! – Even if Xu Ming has the strength to obtain the “Ten Star Medal” in 
the God’s Domain, I am afraid that he will not be able to kill Erke who is hiding in the God’s 
Kingdom!

The kingdom of God is just a turtle shell!



Therefore, if Erke really does nothing, he will kill the human race first, and then open up the 
kingdom of God to hide in; then, Xu Ming really has nothing to do with Erke!

“Haha…” Seeing that he was finally in full control of the initiative, Erke couldn’t help laughing 
proudly, “Xu Ming, I’ll go and slaughter your human race now, and see what you can do with me! 
Hahaha…if you want too After slaughtering our demons, please go ahead, I don’t care about the life 
and death of that group of trash!”

Demons have always been cold and ruthless; Erke, as the patriarch of the Yehenala clan, has taken 
this to the extreme.

Chapter 766: 10 Years

ruthless!

Shameless!

Facing such an enemy, Xu Ming was really angry and helpless!

“Hahahaha…” Erke became more and more complacent, “Xu Ming, I admit that you are very evil, 
and your fate is also against the sky! – I can’t kill you! However, I want to slaughter your human 
race, you can’t stop it; in the future I will Hiding in the kingdom of God, you can’t help me…”

The more Erke said, the more proud he became: “Are you very angry? But you can’t do anything 
about me? Haha, it’s really cool to see your expression! – Okay, no more to say! Now, I’ll go to the 
slaughter You humans have gone; one territory after another has been slaughtered, Jie Jie Jie Jie…”

Xu Ming clenched his fists tightly.

However, with his strength, it is impossible to stop Erke’s slaughter!

“Hahaha, I’m leaving!” Erke laughed, turned and was about to leave, “Xu Ming, do you want to 
come and see how I slaughtered your human race? – Don’t worry, I’ll let them die. I can’t feel the 
pain! With one move, the lives of hundreds of millions of miles away will be wiped out…”



For the gods, with a random blow, the attack can easily cover a range of tens of thousands of miles 
or even more. Those ordinary warriors and cultivators, I am afraid they will die before they can 
react – it is really painless to die!

But…

To die without pain, is it not death?

As the saying goes, when the sky falls, there are tall people on it.

And now, the sky of the human race is about to collapse, Xu Ming is the tallest tall man, can he 
stand up?

Of course top!

After all, Xu Ming was able to grow to the current state so quickly, although it mainly depended on 
plug-ins, but it had nothing to do with the cultivation of the ethnic group!

Now, the human race is in trouble, of course Xu Ming will do his best to turn things around!

“Erke!” Xu Ming shouted.

“What’s the matter?” Erke grinned and turned to look at Xu Ming.

“Do you want to know… the secret of teleportation?” Xu Ming’s voice contained a hint of 
bewitchment.

The secret to teleportation?

Of course Erke wanted to know! – A teleport that even the gods can’t use! If he could learn 
teleportation, he would be awesome!

But Erke was sober: “You can’t give me the secret of teleportation!”



Xu Ming stared at Erke: “As long as you don’t slaughter the human race, thirty years from now, I 
can give you the secret of teleportation!”

“Ha!” Erke smiled disdainfully, “Do you think I would believe you?”

But it can be seen that Erke is actually quite moved!

“You may as well believe it!” Xu Ming said directly, “Anyway, even if I really lied to you, you will 
have nothing to lose! On the contrary, if I didn’t lie to you, then you will make a lot of money!”

Of course Xu Ming was lying to Erke.

After all, “teleport” is a function in the plug-in, so how can there be any secrets that can be taught to 
Erke? Even if Xu Ming himself, without the plug-in, still can’t use teleportation.

To put it bluntly, Xu Ming is trying to find a way to buy time!

If you can really get 30 years, let Erke not slaughter the human race for 30 years; then, after 30 
years, Xu Ming may be able to prove the Tao and become a god!

If Xu Ming became a god, wouldn’t slaughtering Erke be as easy as slaughtering chickens and 
dogs?

Just…will Erke really take the bait?

“Humph!” Erke hummed disdainfully, “But… I won’t give you a chance to lie to me!”

Although Erke said this, he was actually quite eager in his heart – after all, the secret of 
“teleportation”! Who doesn’t want to get it?

Moreover, you must know that Erke has only refined the fruit of proving the Tao before becoming a 
god; in the future, his strength may not be able to gain an inch! – However, if he masters 
teleportation, his strength will undoubtedly increase a lot!



Even if the possibility of getting the “teleport” secret is very low; but it is impossible for Erke not to 
yearn for it!

Of course, the desire is the desire, and on the surface, Erke still has to act very cold.

“No, you can give me a chance to lie to you!” Xu Ming smiled lightly and said, “It’s only 30 years. 
Could it be that I can become a **** and threaten you within 30 years? – This is impossible. , isn’t 
it?”

Erke didn’t speak, but he actually agreed with Xu Ming’s statement – after all, Erke knew the 
difficulty of becoming a god! In his opinion, in just thirty years, it is impossible to become a **** 
at all!

Xu Ming continued: “Thirty years later, if you find out that I lied to you, then you can come again 
to slaughter my human race! – For you, it is only 30 years later to slaughter my human race; Can 
hopefully get the ‘teleport’ secret!”

“Erke, do you really want to gamble?” Xu Ming followed suit.

Long silence.

Erke suddenly laughed: “Xu Ming, I know, you probably want to delay for 30 years! But I also have 
to admit, your conditions really make me very moved!”

Xu Ming’s eyes lit up, and his heart was secretly happy – there is a drama!

But then, Erke said again: “But…”

Xu Ming’s heart suddenly tightened.

Erke sneered: “Thirty years is too long! Even if I clearly believe that it is absolutely impossible for 
you to become a **** within thirty years; however, I don’t want to give you such a long time! Ten 
years, at most ten years! Ten years from now, I’m going to see the ‘teleport’ secret!”

ten years?



Xu Ming fell into contemplation—if he was given thirty years, he would have a good chance of 
becoming a god; but if it was only ten years, he would be less than 10% sure!

“Xu Ming, if you agree, I will spend ten years playing with you! Within ten years, my demons, and 
your human race, the well water will not make river water!” Erke said, “If you don’t agree, then 
what? The secret of ‘teleport’, I don’t ask for it anymore! Now, I will slaughter your human race! – 
You decide!”

Xu Ming looked at Erke: “Twenty years!”

“No!” Erke resolutely said, “It’s only ten years! One more day, I will immediately slaughter your 
human race!”

Xu Ming narrowed his eyes slightly, and finally sighed, saying: “Okay! Ten years is ten years! – But 
after ten years, I will give you the secret of ‘teleport’, you must not slaughter my human race; 
otherwise, I will absolutely slaughter my human race. Do your best, and will do everything possible 
to kill you too!”

Of course Xu Ming couldn’t reveal the secret of “teleportation” – let alone ten years later Even in a 
hundred years, he still couldn’t reveal it!

Xu Ming said this just to confuse Erke, give him hope, and make him believe that he really has the 
secret of “teleportation”!

“Hey, don’t worry!” Erke said, “As long as you give me the secret of ‘teleportation’, then from now 
on, the surface world of the Endless Continent will be ruled by your human race, while the 
underground world will be ruled by our demon race! guilty!”

“Okay! It’s a deal!” Xu Ming said seriously.

However, Xu Ming has already searched his heart to figure out **** Erke within ten years!

“On my own, the possibility of becoming a **** within ten years is very small!” Xu Ming thought 
to himself, “I can only hope for the ‘king-level trial’…”



The general-level trial has already benefited Xu Ming a lot; the king-level trial, as long as it is 
completed well, will definitely be able to reap even greater opportunities!

“In any case, ten years later, I will definitely kill Erke!”

Chapter 767: Borrow Artifact

In this way, Xu Ming and Erke reached an agreement: the human race and the demon race would 
not slaughter each other; but ten years later, Xu Ming would give Erke the secret of “teleportation”.

ten years!

Xu Ming’s time is only ten years!

…

Endless Continent.

Originally asked about the location of the palace.

All the great powers of the alien races gathered here, looking at the ruined Asking Palace, sighing 
endlessly.

“The power of the gods is really unstoppable!”

“The ‘Question Palace’, the power center of the human race for hundreds of millions of years, has 
been bombed!”

“Wangwen Palace is a palace-like pseudo-artifact, but it was destroyed by Erke’s bare hands… If 
Erke has an artifact in his hand, wouldn’t it be even more unmatched?”

“I don’t know, Erke killed the human kingdom of God, what was the situation of the battle… Could 
it be that the human kingdom of God has been destroyed?”



The alien demigods did not dare to watch the battle with the past.

After all, battles that take place within the kingdom of God cannot be seen outside of the kingdom 
of God. And the alien demigods didn’t dare to break into the human race, so even if they followed, 
they couldn’t see anything.

Moreover, once the kingdom of God is destroyed, the power will absolutely destroy the sky and the 
earth. If it is too close to the kingdom of God, I am afraid that it will be too late to escape.

Follow the past, there is no good show to watch, and there may be life-threatening – the alien 
demigods, naturally, will not follow along to join in the fun, they will honestly stay beside the 
dilapidated Asking Palace, waiting for the result of the battle.

…

Amid the many shocked discussions, Erke flew out from the depths of the space crack and returned 
to the Endless Continent.

“Patriarch!”

“Patriarch!”

The demigods of Yehenara’s clan were extremely excited and excited. They could never have 
imagined that their patriarch Erke, after being silent for many years, actually became a **** in one 
fell swoop!

There is no doubt that the glorious era of Yehenara has arrived!

“True God Erke!” Bamboo Sage looked at Erke, handing over from a distance, his eyes were 
extremely complicated.

Prove the Tao and become a god… How can the Bamboo Sage not desire it?



However, because the Bamboo Sage once devoured a piece of heaven and earth treasure, although 
he has obtained an endless long life and an incomparably huge body, at the same time, he has paid 
the price of not being able to become a **** again!

Unless, he can obtain a Taoist fruit and forcibly prove the Tao.

Now, seeing Erke’s successful preaching, the Bamboo Sage is jealous, helpless, and… fearful!

Between the demon clan and the demon clan, although there is an alliance relationship when 
dealing with the human clan. However, the “alliance relationship” is undoubtedly a very fragile 
relationship.

Now, Erke has become a **** and came to the battlefield as a king on the endless continent. Can 
the alliance between the demon clan and the demon clan continue to exist?

Or, in other words, will the demons give the major groups room to survive?

The Bamboo Sage believes that if he has the strength to be invincible in the Endless Continent, he 
will never give other ethnic groups any living space!

Absolutely kill them all!

“It’s the Bamboo Saint!” Erke glanced at him, his expression arrogant.

For the gods, there are ants under the gods – facing the ants, Erke naturally doesn’t need to give any 
face.

It was Xu Ming’s ant, which was too miraculous and special; even True God Erke couldn’t kill him!

“What’s the matter?” Erke said indifferently; but the aura that he naturally exudes made the alien 
demigods so oppressive that they didn’t even dare to make a sound.

“Congratulations to True God Erke, who has become a god! From now on, he will transcend the 
mundane world and be immortal!” Bamboo Sage cupped his hands and said, “From now on, our 
demon clan, may True God Erke follow suit!”



As the saying goes, those who know the times are the best.

The Bamboo Sage is obviously very aware of current affairs; as soon as he sees Erke becoming a 
god, he immediately surrenders to Erke.

“I’m the only one who will follow?” Bamboo Saint’s mouth twitched into a wicked smile.

He really enjoyed the feeling of being invincible in the world. Especially seeing that the Bamboo 
Sage, who used to intimidate the Endless Continent for hundreds of millions of years, also 
respectfully surrendered in front of him.

“Is this true?” Erke asked deliberately, staring at the Bamboo Saint.

Bamboo Saint was startled for a moment, and an extremely unpleasant feeling rose in his heart, but 
he still had to bite the bullet and say: “Really!”

“Just take it seriously!” Erke smiled meaningfully. “Since it’s true, then, my first order to you is… 
lend me your artifact!”

Borrow an artifact?

The Bamboo Saint was stunned.

How could he not understand that when he said it was “borrowing”, it was actually “robbing”!

“Bamboo Saint!” Erke sneered, “Just borrowing your divine weapon, shouldn’t you be so stingy?”

“I…” Bamboo Saint couldn’t help hesitating – after all, Erke’s words meant that he directly offered 
the divine weapon! In such a situation, how could the Bamboo Sage not hesitate?

However, it was such a hesitation that gave Erke an excuse!



“Bamboo Saint! This is what you mean by ‘the head of the horse’!?” Erke snorted coldly, “I just 
borrowed an artifact from you, you are so hesitant! I seriously doubt your sincerity, should you? Is 
it coming… to fool me?”

“I…” Bamboo Sage even wanted to explain something.

However, Erke obviously did not give him a chance to explain: “I Erke, what I hate most is the 
person who deceived me! So…die!”

rumbling…

In Erke’s hand, a black flame burns, burning and corroding everything.

In the depths of the black flame, extremely mysterious causal fluctuations are still beating—of 
course, only gods can see such causal fluctuations; demigods cannot see them.

“die!”

The black flame shot directly at one of Bamboo Saint’s clones.

“escape!”

The one hundred and twenty-three clones of the Bamboo Saint fled in one hundred and twenty-three 
different directions without hesitation.

Facing True God Erke, the avatar of the Bamboo Saint was completely unable to resist. The only 
doubt is that he can escape a few clones under True God Erke.

“My clone, divided into different directions to escape, should be able to escape most of it?” 
Bamboo Saint secretly said.

boom!



At this moment, the black flame full of corrosive aura fell on one of the avatars of the Bamboo 
Saint, like a maggot attached to a bone.

“Ah—” The avatar of the Bamboo Saint, only had time to scream in pain, and then directly turned 
into nothingness.

However, this is far from over!

After this avatar was annihilated, the other 122 avatars of the Bamboo Saint also burned a black 
flame full of corrosive aura—the avatars of the Bamboo Saint were all linked by cause and effect; 
and , each clone is so close, the causal relationship is naturally very strong!

The mysterious causal fluctuations contained in the black flame of the Bamboo Sage directly spread 
this black flame to every clone of the Bamboo Sage.

Although these spreading black flames are not as strong as the first black flames, they are still 
enough to burn the Bamboo Saint!

The only one who can struggle is the Bamboo Saint clone wearing the divine weapon “Destruction 
Demon Armor”.

However, this clone didn’t struggle for long, because… Erke personally shot  to kill this slightly 
tenacious clone.

In the blink of an eye, the one hundred and twenty-three clones of the Bamboo Saint were 
destroyed!

The two divine weapons of the Bamboo Sage, the Demon Armor and the Reincarnation Bell, also 
fell into Erke’s hands.

“This…”

“This…”



The demigods of the major alien races were all horrified – Erke actually shot and killed the Bamboo 
Saint.

“Quack…” Erke’s face was hideous, and he didn’t think there was anything wrong with it.

His realm of gods unfolded again, covering every alien demigod: “Actually, it’s really useless to 
keep you all! So… let’s all die!”

“Do not!!”

The alien demigods all screamed in horror.

However, no one can escape the realm of the gods!

Chapter 768: Kill Erke?

The alien demigods who came to attack the human race were all dead…

Not one left!

After the human race got this news, the entire family was shocked. Even Xu Ming could not calm 
down for a long time.

“I only have ten years!” Xu Ming felt a lot of pressure.

The gods are too strong!

Until now, Xu Ming still didn’t know how big the gap between him and Erke was! -Anyway, Xu 
Ming’s attack, which fell on Erke, would not cause any damage; and Erke’s random blow would 
cause Xu Ming to consume a lot of hanging points.

If it weren’t for the great powers who had robbed all the different races before, Xu Ming probably 
wouldn’t have had a hang-up to resist Erke’s attack.



Roundtable…

The atmosphere was extremely dull.

The top people of the human race were sullen, unable to think of any way.

Jin War God said solemnly: “Don’t think about it, demigods, it is impossible to defeat the gods! – 
Even in the vast God Realm, I have never heard of any demigods who can defeat the gods!”

God’s Domain, how vast is it?

In God’s Domain, there are so many powerful demigods! Even someone like Xu Ming who has 
reached the fifteenth, sixteenth, and seventeenth tiers in strength, is a feather in the air!

The most top demigods have cultivated all the nine heavenly ways to the level of “Thirty-sixth floor 
of the Tongtian Tower”, known as the “nine demigods”! The combat power of the nine demigods is 
probably above the “twentieth order”.

There are even some demigods with special cultivation paths, whose strength is even more 
terrifying than the nine demigods!

but!

In the vast God Realm, no demigod has ever been able to defeat the gods!

The gods, and the gods, are two completely different levels of life. Just like humans and bacteria – 
no matter how strong a bacteria is, it cannot defeat a person! Hundreds of millions of bacteria 
united, it may cause some trouble!

The levels of life are different and completely incomparable!

Xu Ming also looked ugly: “So, unless I can become a **** within ten years; otherwise, I still can’t 
deal with Erke?”



“That’s right!” Jin War God said with great certainty, “If the demigods can hope to defeat the gods, 
then in the vast God Realm, someone has already done it! However, I have never heard of such a 
thing!”

“Xu Ming.” Ji Tiangong said, “In ten years, are you sure you will become a god?”

Palace Master Ji Tian felt that he asked a very stupid question! – Become a **** within ten years? 
how is this possible!

Xu Ming shook his head and sighed: “The grasp is very small…”

“Ugh…”

“Ugh…”

One after another, the great people of the human race couldn’t help sighing. The round table 
meeting fell into dead silence and dullness again.

After a long time, Jitian Palace Master sighed heavily: “Let’s prepare to arrange the inheritance of 
the human race… All monks above Daojun and above, as well as those qualified geniuses, are all 
concentrated in the kingdom of God…”

It’s just that the kingdom of God has such a small range, how many people can it hold?

In the 3,600 territories of the human race, the vast majority, more than 99% of the tribe, can only be 
abandoned! – If ten years later, Xu Ming cannot defeat Erke; then, only death and extinction will 
welcome those clansmen!

At this time, Xu Ming said, “I still have a secret space that can accommodate a lot of clansmen! 
When that time comes, arrange for more clansmen to escape to me!”

As Xu Ming said, it is naturally an independent space.

However, the territory of 3,600 is too vast; Xu Ming’s independent space can accommodate only a 
very small number of clansmen after all.



…

After the roundtable meeting, Xu Ming returned directly to the independent space.

He first gave some giant warships to the top leaders of the Alliance of Gods, and gave them the 
authority to bring people into the independent space; then, Xu Ming’s main body and two clones 
entered a state of retreat.

This retreat lasted for five years!

Xu Ming is still focusing on studying the Dao of Fire—after all, he has the highest attainments in 
the Dao of Fire; if he wants to become a **** within ten years, he must devote all his energy to the 
Dao of Fire in order to have a glimmer of hope. .

Perhaps it was because of reaching the “Second Level of Mind Power”, and his comprehension 
greatly improved; or perhaps it was because he desperately longed to become a **** within ten 
years. In the past five years of retreat, Xu Ming’s understanding of the fire of heaven has improved 
by leaps and bounds!

It’s like riding a rocket, soaring all the way!

The 33rd floor level of the Babel Tower…

The Thirty-Fourth Floor of the Babel Tower…

When the five-year retreat ended, Xu Ming’s understanding of the Heavenly Dao of Fire actually 
reached the level of the thirty-sixth floor of the Tongtian Tower! That is… the limit of a demigod!

Xu Ming’s “Flower of Tao” has blossomed to the extreme. As long as the enlightenment of the 
Heavenly Dao of Fire goes one step further and condenses the “fruit of the Dao”, one can directly 
prove the Dao and become a god!

but…



Having reached this level of cultivation, Xu Ming was at a loss: “The next step, what should I do?”

no idea.

I don’t even know how to take this last step.

…

in a separate space.

Xu Ming wandered here at will, looking for a hint of inspiration to become a god.

Proving Taoism and becoming a **** is not just about immersing yourself in hard work, but also 
requires inspiration, opportunity, fate…all conditions are met, and it is possible to have an epiphany, 
transcend the mundane, condense the “fruit of the Tao”, and become a god.

“Um?”

Walking in the independent space, Xu Ming was suddenly startled: “That kid Zhang Hao…”

Zhang Hao was a young man who was rescued by Xu Ming in the wild city slave market a long 
time ago.

However, Zhang Hao is a little different – in this world where “Martial Dao is respected”, Zhang 
Hao doesn’t like Martial Dao, but he likes useless reading!

And Xu Ming helped him realize his ideal of studying and sent him to the super famous “Lanxiang 
Academy” in the Wilderness Sect area for further study.

Zhang Hao studied hard at Lanxiang University for four years. Not only did he finish all the courses 
in the academy, but he was also instilled by Xu Ming with many unheard and unimaginable strange 
knowledge such as “advanced mathematics”.

Xu Ming saw that he had a talent for learning, and even taught him the “quality-energy equation”!



E=MC2 (square)

That is: energy = mass × speed of light squared!

Atomic bombs and hydrogen bombs are made according to this formula!

I have to say, Zhang Hao is really talented! He has been working **** this series of formulas for 
decades, but… he really made him come up with an atomic bomb! -Technology products can 
already be made quickly.

At this time, Zhang Hao was testing the atomic bomb!

“Let’s go!” Xu Ming was stunned, “This kid has no brains!—Just his cultivation, standing at the 
center of the atomic bomb explosion, isn’t he courting death?”

boom! !

The atomic bomb exploded.

Only then did Zhang Hao realize the danger and wanted to escape, but it was too late!

At this moment, a large hand of energy condensed and formed out of thin air, directly snuffing out 
the atomic bomb that had just exploded. It’s as easy as pinching a cigarette butt.

“Huh…huh…” Zhang Hao was so frightened that he collapsed to the ground, “I almost lost my 
life…”

Xu Ming descended from the sky: “Nima! Are you trying to blow up my territory?”

The atomic bomb that Zhang Hao is testing now does not have much power. But what if he tests a 
super-large hydrogen bomb in the future? —Isn’t that  the entire independent space will be blown 
up by him! ?



“Cough cough…” Zhang Hao was both embarrassed and ashamed, “Brother Ming, I don’t know, 
this thing is so powerful…”

“Damn it, you don’t know?” Xu Ming was speechless, “The formula says, you won’t count it? 
Fortunately, I happened to see it this time! Otherwise, at this moment, your little life is probably 
gone!”

“Cough cough…” Zhang Hao became more and more embarrassed, “Actually, I originally wanted 
to test the hydrogen bomb directly… But after calculating the power of the formula, I didn’t dare to 
try it!”

“Damn it! Did you build the hydrogen bomb?”

The power of the hydrogen bomb is undoubtedly greater than that of the atomic bomb!

“Huh?” Suddenly, Xu Ming had an idea, “It is said that as long as the material is sufficient, the 
power of a hydrogen bomb theoretically has no upper limit! Then… Can I use the hydrogen bomb 
to kill Erke?”

In theory, it is possible!

Xu Ming’s heart suddenly became hot: “Zhang Hao, I need you to build a hydrogen bomb! A very 
big hydrogen bomb!”

Chapter 769: King Trial

A big, big hydrogen bomb?

Zhang Hao was startled: “How old is it?”

Xu Ming narrowed his eyes slightly: “The bigger the better!”

He planned to use a hydrogen bomb to blow up the gods, of course not if he was too small!

“It’s easy to make it big!” Zhang Hao said, “But… the materials for making hydrogen bombs are 
hard to find…”



It took Zhang Hao decades of materials to get a small hydrogen bomb together.

“Material is not a problem!” Xu Ming said directly.

The materials for making hydrogen bombs are not high-grade materials; Xu Ming can buy a lot of 
them from the artifact store with just a few hanging points.

“However, you can’t make it too big!” Xu Ming said worriedly, “If you make it too big, the Endless 
Continent may be blown up if you’re not careful! Therefore, you must carefully calculate the power 
of the explosion. Yes, it can only cover a hundred territories at most!”

In theory, the power of a hydrogen bomb has no upper limit!

If Zhang Hao was really let go, Xu Ming was worried that this kid could really blow up the Endless 
Continent!

…

Soon, it was time to start the “king-level trial”.

Xu Ming directly hung it with “coordinate positioning” and sent it to Huangquan’s tomb.

“King-level trial!” Xu Ming stood outside Huangquan’s tomb, clenching his fists secretly, “I hope…
don’t let me down!”

Five years have passed since the “ten-year appointment” with Erke!

In the past five years, although Xu Ming has greatly improved in the way of fire, he is still far from 
defeating Erke!

To be honest, I want to increase my strength to the level where I can defeat Erke in the remaining 
five years… Xu Ming really has no confidence!



Therefore, Xu Ming can only hope that the “king-level trial” can greatly improve himself.

Boom!

The door to the side of the tomb of Huangquan slammed open.

“Come in!” The Golden Realm Lord’s voice sounded.

Xu Ming walked along the passage into the depths of the tomb.

“Golden World Lord.” Xu Ming couldn’t help but ask curiously, “I am the only one to participate in 
this king-level trial. What if I fail the trial?”

Xu Ming was actually quite puzzled – if he failed the trial, wouldn’t it mean that no one would be 
able to get the rewards in the king-level trial?

Jinjiezhu calmly said: “You are not alone!”

“I’m not alone?” Xu Ming became more and more puzzled.

“You’ll understand later!”

Walking all the way to the depths of Huangquan’s tomb, Xu Ming thought for a while, and then 
asked: “Golden World Lord, can I ask you to take action and help me deal with someone…even if I 
owe you a big favor! Later, wait. I have become a god, and even become a great power among gods, 
and I will definitely return your favor!”

Of course, what Xu Ming has to deal with is Erke!

But now, Xu Ming knew that there was nothing in himself that could make Jinjiezhu move; 
therefore, he could only talk about “potential”.

“Your potential is really good, and there is hope for you to become a great master of God’s Domain 
in the future! But…” Jinjiezhu said, “I can’t help you!”



Can’t help?

Xu Ming couldn’t believe it: “Golden World Lord, your strength is so strong! Even True God 
Brahma has been imprisoned by you…”

Jinjiezhu said: “I have my responsibilities, and I can’t do anything beyond my responsibilities! In 
addition, Brahma was not imprisoned by me, but by the organs in Huangquan Realm!”

Xu Ming immediately understood that if he wanted Erke to be killed or imprisoned by Huangquan 
Realm, he could only lead Erke to a dangerous place in Huangquan Realm.

But could Erke be so stupid?

I am afraid it is difficult!

“This method doesn’t seem to work…” Xu Ming sighed secretly.

With a sigh, Xu Ming followed the guiding passage in Huangquan’s tomb and came to an 
incomparably huge array.

This array is a hundred miles in size. At the top of the formation, there is a ray of light shining 
directly into the sky, leading to nowhere.

Countless array runes are circulating in the formation. The large formation is as big as a few tens of 
feet, comparable to a palace; the small formation is smaller than a mosquito.

These formation runes are actually the text of the formation! Xu Ming recognized most of the single 
runes; after all, there were only so many commonly used formation characters.

However, Xu Ming could not understand the rehearsal order and circulation rules of the talismans.

“Too complicated!”



After watching for a while, Xu Ming could not see the slightest clue.

“What kind of formation is this?” Xu Ming couldn’t help but ask curiously.

“Intentional formation!” said Jinjiezhu, “This formation can transmit your consciousness to other 
worlds that are very far away! And let you maintain a connection with that consciousness at all 
times!”

“What!?” Xu Ming was surprised, “There is such a large formation?”

“This is normal!” said Jinjiezhu, “After all, it is much easier to transmit a touch of consciousness 
than to transmit the whole person!”

Intention comes to the great formation, that is, “consciousness comes to the great formation”. Rare 
in Endless Continent, but very common in God’s Domain.

After all, the realm of the gods is too vast; even if it is a god, it is very difficult to rush to the realm 
of the gods. And with the Intentional Formation, it is much more convenient.

“Where will this great formation send my consciousness to?” Xu Ming asked again.

“You will know when you go in!” said Jinjiezhu.

“Okay…” Yi Gaoren is bold, and what’s coming today is just two avatars of Xu Ming, not Xu 
Ming’s deity, so there’s no need to worry at all.

call out-

As soon as Xu Ming took a step, he entered the great formation of Yilin.

boom!



The divine stone that was placed in the interior of the Great Array, burst out with incomparably vast 
and majestic power. All the formation symbols in the entire formation suddenly lit up; a huge and 
terrifying pressure was exerted on Xu Ming like a mountain.

“What a terrifying power!”

Such coercion, I am afraid that Dao Zun’s great power can be directly crushed and killed.

boom!

Immediately afterwards, the light that shot towards the sky suddenly became dazzling.

At this time, Xu Ming felt that his consciousness was a little blurred.

In the next moment, a wisp of his consciousness seemed to be directly separated from the sea of 
consciousness; along the dazzling light leading to the sky, it shot towards the endless sky.

Xu Ming could see that the space was constantly changing around him. In just a few short breaths, 
Xu Ming realized that his consciousness  had left the boundless continent.

Xu Ming could see that the Endless Continent was right behind him—the appearance of the Endless 
Continent was a huge sphere, almost occupying the entire field of vision; but now, Xu Ming found 
that “self” was moving away from this big sphere.

“So fast!”

Xu Ming could feel that every moment, he might have passed hundreds of millions of miles, or 
even more! After a while, the huge spherical shape in the field of vision turned into a tiny star.

At the same time, Xu Ming’s consciousness also saw countless equally small stars in the dark void 
around him.

“These should be other dust worlds!” Xu Ming secretly said, “I just don’t know, where is the realm 
of the gods? – Could it be one of these tiny stars?”



The answer is: no!

The existence of God’s Domain is amazing.

The space around God’s Domain has even been completely distorted, and it is not at all what Xu 
Ming can see now.

Chapter 770: Naihe City

In the endless dark starry sky, I don’t know how long I have traveled.

Suddenly, Xu Ming felt the surrounding space distorted; immediately, a “miniature continent” 
appeared in front of him.

The continent is flat in shape, like a leaf.

It is said to be a “miniature continent”, but it also has a radius of 10,000 miles; however, compared 
with the “tens of billions of miles” level behemoths like the Endless Continent, it is indeed very 
exquisite and pocket-sized.

Xu Ming saw that on this “Leaves Continent”, there was a magnificent dark red city.

The city stretches for thousands of miles, occupying the entire continent.

But in Xu Ming’s opinion, this city was built quite petty; after all, a leaf of the Bamboo Saint deity 
can be as big as ten thousand li! Xu Ming’s willow avatar is also hundreds of miles in size!

However, Xu Ming didn’t dare to underestimate this continent and this city because of its small size 
– in the world of the gods, size doesn’t mean much! Only strength is meaningful!

swoosh—

This strand of Xu Ming’s consciousness, at a speed faster than lightning, pierced through the dark 
void and descended to the gate of the city, condensing into a “consciousness” that looked exactly 
like Xu Ming.



“Naihe City…”

Xu Ming raised his head and looked up at the top of the city gate. The three characters “Naihe City” 
engraved on it were full of dead silence, desolation and despair, as if telling a vicissitudes of history.

Even Xu Ming couldn’t help but feel a pessimism and despair in his heart when he saw these three 
words…

“What a strong pessimism!” Xu Ming was secretly shocked, “What on earth did the great master 
who built this city go through to leave such a strong mood of pessimism and despair in the city?”

Xu Ming is hard to figure out.

At this time, the voice of Jinjiezhu sounded in Xu Ming’s mind: “This city of Naihe is a secret 
stronghold of Huangquan Temple!”

“Oh?” Xu Ming knew that the Hall of Yellow Springs was probably a superpower in the Divine 
Realm.

Jinjiezhu continued: “Naihe City was built after the fall of Huangquan Temple! This secret 
stronghold is mainly used to cultivate and select super geniuses! – Super geniuses who can revive 
Huangquan Temple!”

Xu Ming thought for a while: “So, the king-level trial I’m going to participate in is also one of the 
‘genius selections’?”

“Not bad!” Jinjiezhu said, “But to be honest, the possibility of you standing out from the king-level 
trial… is very small!”

“Very small?” Xu Ming was of course unconvinced, “Why?”

“Once you go in, you will naturally know!” Jinjiezhu is reluctant to say more, “Okay, I will only 
take you to the gate of the city; inside, you can go in by yourself!”



“Okay…” Xu Ming didn’t care.

As for what Jinjiezhu said, the possibility of him standing out is very small – Xu Ming scoffed at 
this.

Compete with other geniuses?

Xu Ming is not afraid of it!

Stepping into Naihe City, soon, a puppet similar to the Golden God of War came up to meet him; he 
said “please come with me” to Xu Ming, and then he took care of himself and led the way in front 
of him, and said another word. Do not send.

“This puppet of Naihe City is quite aloof!” Xu Ming secretly said.

However, Xu Ming didn’t mind.

Soon, under the leadership of the puppet, Xu Ming came to a dark red grand palace—this grandeur 
was not a visual grandeur, but a temperament grandeur.

The palace is actually not big, but Xu Ming stood at the gate of the palace, but he had a sense of 
insignificance looking up at the endless starry sky.

“God’s Realm’s handwriting is really extraordinary!” Although Xu Ming’s current strength has 
reached the terrifying “eighteenth order”, he is still somewhat ashamed before this “magnificent 
temperament”.

The gap between Xu Ming and God’s Domain Great Expert is still too big to measure!

Walking into the magnificent palace, Xu Ming saw more than a hundred demigod monks, already 
waiting in the hall.

These hundreds of demigods are all unfamiliar faces of Xu Ming. Obviously, they are not demigods 
on the Endless Continent, but most likely demigods from other dust worlds.



However, every demigod has a mighty aura, far exceeding the aura of a ninth-order demigod.

With just a slight glance, Xu Ming was sure: “These hundreds of demigods are very difficult!”

As for the actual strength, it is difficult to determine just by looking at the momentum, and it will 
only be known after the shot. For example, Xu Ming’s momentum is very weak; but, is his strength 
weak?

“Someone is here again!”

As soon as Xu Ming walked into the hall, he attracted many eyes.

“Looking at his momentum, he seems to be very weak! It seems that even ordinary ninth-order 
demigods are inferior!”

“With such a weak aura, can you pass the screening of the ‘General Trial’ to participate in the ‘King 
Trial’?”

“You can’t say that. If the momentum is weaker, is the strength weaker?” Someone immediately 
retorted.

“Also… but, his aura is too weak, right? Any one of us is much stronger than him!”

“Don’t worry about this, maybe they have some special means!”

…

Soon, a short, white-clothed demigod stepped forward and cupped his hands, “Which world of dust 
is my brother from?”

What dusty world…

Xu Ming said, “Endless Continent!”



“Endless Continent?” The white-clothed demigod frowned and thought for a while, “I haven’t heard 
of this dusty world—if I guess right, the dusty world you live in is relatively remote, and it is 
different from other dusty worlds. , there is no contact, right?”

“There really is no connection!” Xu Ming said.

Anyway, in the Endless Continent, there have always been major ethnic groups fighting with each 
other; I have never heard of fighting with the “different planes” powerhouses.

Therefore, the white-robed demigod was right—the Endless Continent was indeed a very remote 
dust-like world.

“I was born in a remote dusty world that is isolated from the world, but I can come to participate in 
the king-level trial… It’s not easy for you, brother! Admire it!” Baiyi’s demigod’s character is very 
familiar, “Xu Bin, brother, you How do you call it?”

“Xu Bin?” Xu Ming was startled, then smiled, “What a coincidence, my surname is Xu-Xu Ming 
too!”

“Haha What a coincidence!” Xu Bin laughed, “Brother Xu Ming probably doesn’t know much 
about this king-level trial, right? Let me give you a little introduction! ”

Xu Ming’s eyes lit up: “Then there is work!”

When Xu Ming first arrived, he was really confused; now that there are enthusiastic people 
introducing it, of course it couldn’t be better!

Xu Bin said: “Most of the geniuses who came to participate in the king-level trial this time were 
selected from more than 10,000 dust worlds!”

“More than 10,000 dust worlds!?” Xu Ming was shocked – isn’t that more than 10,000 worlds like 
the Endless Continent?

“However… there are also some geniuses who are from God’s Domain!” Xu Bin said again, “For 
example, those ten guys!”



Xu Bin glanced at him—in the very center of the hall, there were indeed ten geniuses with 
rebellious expressions, forming a circle of their own; they were incompatible with other geniuses.

Each of these ten geniuses of the God Realm exudes a sense of superiority from their bones.
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