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The doctor pretended to be busy by flipping through documents. He did not 
even look up at Wu Mei as he tried to chase her away. 

Wu Mei's brows knitted together and she stared at him with a sneer on her 
face. 

Li Nanchen sensed something was amiss and said coldly, "I'm the President 
of the Li Family Corporation, Li Nanchen. I have some ties with your hospital 
director. Can you make an exception for me and let us take a look at the 
medical records?" 
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These few sentences seemed polite, but in actuality, it was using power to 
oppress him. 

The doctor stopped what he was doing. He adjusted his glasses and looked at 
Li Nanchen. With a smile, he said, "Even if you get the director here, without 
approval and instructions, we don't have the authority to show the medical 
records to anyone. Please leave!" 

"Heh." Wu Mei chuckled and shook her head. 

He knew how to take advantage of loopholes and use the official rules and 
regulations, making it seem like he was fair and justified. 

Li Nanchen's brows furrowed and wanted to continue to speak. However, Wu 
Mei tugged on his shirt and shook her head. 

"Let's go." 

Outside the hospital, Wu Mei looked back at the building and stared at it 
intently. 



Li Nanchen thought that she was indignant and said in a low voice, "I'll get 
someone to find a way to get it for you…" 

"No need, I can handle it." Wu Mei smiled confidently and relaxedly got into 
the car. 

In the villa, Wu Mei went straight to her bedroom after dinner. 

She turned on the computer and closed her eyes as she tried to recall the 
domain name of the intranet that she had seen the doctor use back in the 
office. She typed a few lines of code and instantly, she successfully hacked 
into the hospital's network system. She searched for the department that the 
doctor was in and easily found all the information and medical records during 
the period of Mother Wu's hospitalization. 
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After she downloaded them, she exposed the doctor's abnormal bank account 
transactions and taught him a lesson! 

Wu Mei sat cross-legged in the computer chair and stared at the screen. She 
pondered for a while before typing on the keyboard again. She found the Civil 
Affairs Bureau's system library and searched for information on the divorce 
between Mother Wu and Wu Pang, as well as Wu Yi's birth certificate. She 
organised and summarized everything… 

Under the dim light of the screen, Wu Mei's lips curled up into a smile and she 
wrote a long essay. 
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She pressed the "send" button and paid for the server push. She was 
extremely satisfied when she saw the heated discussion on the largest social 
media platform in the country. 
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"Wu Pang, the President of the Wu Corporation, started his career by living off 
a woman. However, he cheated on his wife and had a second daughter while 
he was still married!" 



"So his wife wasn't born with a mental illness. We all misunderstood her when 
we saw the medical records… The grudges of rich families can't be explained. 
Do you think the lawful wife developed a mental illness because of Wu Pang 
and his mistress?" 

"How vicious! Wu Pang proposed a divorce while his wife was undergoing 
treatment, and he married the third party!" 

"For the sake of his illegitimate daughter, he even chased his own daughter 
out of the house. The first wife and daughter are simply too pitiful!" 
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This exposé listed almost all of Wu Pang's crimes, leaving him unable to 
defend himself. 

Within a short period of time, the Economic Weekly had been reposted one 
after another. The stock price of the Wu Corporation suddenly plummeted, 
reaching the price limit once every day! 

The netizens' comments were pretty much one-sided. Those who had been 
cursing Wu Mei initially all turned their attention to look up Yang Shan and Wu 
Pang. 

"I heard that the company and all their current assets are the dowry of the first 
wife! Even the villa they live in! How shameless!" 

The netizens' comments put a lot of pressure on Wu Pang and the Wu 
Corporation. Their reputation was just about irreparable. 

Li Nanchen looked at the article and raised his head to look at the bedroom on 
the second floor. He recalled what Wu Mei had said. 

Is this her solution? 

He suddenly smiled. She is indeed his wife. 
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Ring… 

The doorbell rang. 



Wu Pang could not bear it any longer and came to the villa to find Wu Mei. 

"Where's the money? You promised your mother that you would help the Wu 
Corporation survive this crisis. You can't let it go bankrupt or close down! 
Quickly give me the money!" 

"If you don't give it now, it will be too late…" 

Wu Pang's eyes were bloodshot. He looked like he was on the verge of a 
breakdown and was going to tear Wu Mei's clothes apart and rob her of her 
money. 
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"Of course I will give the money. I will also fulfill my promise. I will definitely 
not let the Wu Corporation go bankrupt." 

Leaning against the door, Wu Mei looked at Wu Pang with a smile. She saw a 
glimmer of hope flash across his eyes. She opened her thin lips and added, 
"However, I'm not going to give you my money for nothing. I want to use the 
money to exchange for the Wu Corporation's shares. How much money I'll 
offer depends on President Wu's sincerity and how many shares you want to 
give me in exchange." 

Wu Pang hadn't expected her to use such a reason. "How much are you 
offering for each share?" 

Even till now, he is still in the mood to bargain? 

Wu Mei burst into laughter. "Are you kidding? Of course shares have to be 
bought at market price." 
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"Wu Mei! That's impossible… You're ripping me off!" 
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Wu Pang pointed at Wu Mei and scolded her agitatedly, "Now that the price 
has dropped so much, I must be crazy to sell my shares to you. You have to 
buy them at the price it was worth a few days ago!" 

"Oh, forget it then." 

Wu Mei shrugged. "You're the one begging me, not the other way around," 
she reminded him. 

She pressed her back against the door frame and looked into Wu Pang's 
gradually conceding eyes. "Can you think of any other solution besides 
begging me?" she said slowly. 

"You…!" 

Wu Pang gritted his teeth in hatred, but there was nothing he could do. 

Due to the impact of the exposé, the Wu Corporation was pretty much a 
rotting corporation that everyone despised. All their business partners had 
terminated their contracts. Who would be willing to help? 

"Alright! We'll follow the market price. When are you going to give me the 
money?" Wu Pang compromised and asked. 

Wu Mei looked up and chuckled. "The weather tomorrow is good. It's very 
suitable for signing the contract in the company…" 

The next day, in the Wu Corporation… 

The legal department had finished drafting up the contract for the acquisition 
of shares. Many shareholders were in the meeting room, waiting for Wu Mei to 
appear. 

"Tsk, everyone is here?" 



Wu Mei wore a pure black off-shoulder skirt suit and linked arms with Li 
Nanchen as they walked in. She looked around and flashed a flamboyant 
smile. 
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When the higher-ups saw that she even brought Li Nanchen with her, their 
gazes turned disdainful. They even began to whisper to each other. 

"Ho, you have to bring your husband along just to sign a contract?" 

"Are you afraid that you can't understand the acquisition contract? You only 
know how to use the Li family to oppress the Wu family. She's President Wu's 
biological daughter indeed!" 

"If I had such a daughter, I would definitely beat her until she can't go out, so 
that she can't go out and make me lose face!" 

A few higher-ups had been influenced by Wu Pang. They thought that Wu Mei 
was bullying them using Li Nanchen's family background and did not care 
about the life and death of the Wu Corporation. 

Their words were filled with provocation and disdain… 

Wu Mei did not get angry. On the other hand, Li Nanchen helped her pull the 
chair out and said, "Everyone, don't worry. The acquisition has nothing to do 
with me. I'm only here as a shareholder." 

"If any of you have any objections, please come to the Li Corporation in a few 
days for a cup of tea. We can have an in-depth discussion then." 

"I hope we don't delay the acquisition process…" 

Li Nanchen raised his eyes to look at the few familiar higher-ups and said, "I 
remember that you guys wanted to discuss a collaboration with the Li 
Corporation? If we delay any further, I'm afraid we'll have to delay our 
discussion." 

Such threatening words instantly silenced the meeting room. 

Wu Mei looked at Li Nanchen gratefully. She lifted her eyes lightly and stared 
at the men who were making things difficult for her. She smiled insincerely 



and said, "It's not up to you to decide whether or not I can understand the 
contract, is it?" 

"On the other hand, if you guys can have a daughter like me, it'll be your 
blessing." 
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"I heard that your son took drugs and gambled recently, resulting in someone 
making him lose an arm? How tragic. How's it? Do you want me to introduce a 
doctor to you?" 

After Wu Mei said that, the men's expressions turned awful. 

"Just because I didn't say anything doesn't mean that I don't know what you've 
done behind my back. Don't provoke me and sit down quietly, or else…" 
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Wu Mei stared hard at them. She turned back to face Wu Pang and spread 
her hands open. "Where's the contract?" she asked. 

"Here…" 

Seeing that he had failed, Wu Pang reluctantly handed over the contract. 

Wu Mei checked each clause to make sure it was correct before she signed 
her name on it. When she looked up again, her lips curled up into a smile. 

"From now on, I am the largest shareholder of the Wu Corporation. I have the 
right to make decisions…" 

Wu Mei glanced at Wu Pang and said, "So, since everyone is here, why don't 
we talk about the Wu Family members' embezzlement of funds?" Wu Mei said 
as she glanced at Wu Pang. 

She tossed out the evidence that she had already prepared, tossing it right in 
front of the shareholders and higher-ups. In a pretty good mood, she 
explained to them while all of them flipped through the evidence. 

"Wu Pang used his position as President to embezzle tens of millions of 
dollars twice, and let his family spend it freely. Now… please make up for it." 
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"Otherwise, I will inform the police to participate in dealing with it." 

Wu Mei did not show any mercy as she watched Wu Pang, Yang Shan and 
the others break out in cold sweat. "What is it? Do you need a few minutes to 
consider?" 

She fiddled with her nails as she listened to the chatter in the conference 
room. 

Yang Shan and Wu Pang looked at the detailed investigation 
report. Impossible! 

They had done it very cleanly. How did Wu Mei find out? How did she obtain 
the evidence? 

"If you don't have the money, I can offer you a solution." 

Wu Mei saw that they were getting more and more flustered. She said, "You 
can use the villa you're living in now as collateral. Although it's slightly less 
than the amount you've embezzled…" 

"I can make up for the rest. How about it?" 

Wu Mei laughed so hard that Wu Pang and Yang Shan panicked. "That's 
impossible! Don't even think about it!" 
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"Little b*tch! You never thought of saving the Wu Corporation. You just wanted 
to kill us and take away our villa!" 

"You're just like your mother! You're both mentally ill. Both of you should be 
locked up in a sanatorium! Both of you shouldn't be alive!" 
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Furious, Yang Shan sprang up and pointed at Wu Mei's face as she cursed at 
her. 

When Wu Pang saw the shareholders and secretaries secretly holding up 
their cell phones to record the scene, he tried to hold Yang Shan back but to 
no avail. 

Wu Mei did not care. She stared at Wu Pang indifferently and asked, "What 
are you planning to do? Join your mistress in scolding me? Go to jail with her 
and do prison time? Or are you going to give me the villa? Choose quickly. I 
don't have time to waste!" 
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That villa belonged to her mother. They had taken it for nothing for so many 
years. It was time to return it. 

"…" 

Wu Pang knew her character. She would do whatever she said. 

Besides, the evidence was enough to convict them and they wouldn't even be 
able to shirk responsibility. 

After a long time, Wu Pang nodded dejectedly and said, "As you wish, the 
villa… is yours!" 

"Hubby! If you give her the villa, where are we going to stay?" Yang Shan 
shouted, no longer caring about her image. 
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Wu Mei was a little annoyed. She raised her hand to call the bodyguard over 
and said, "Drag her out… Get her further away from me. My ears hurt." 
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The entire meeting room fell silent as Yang Shan's screams got further away 
from them. 



The higher-ups saw that Wu Mei wasn't as weak as they thought she was. 
She was not orderly in her management of the company. Instead, her 
methods were swift and fierce, and her every move was firm and practical. 
Fear and panic instantly arose in their hearts, and they didn't dare to open 
their mouths to refute her anymore. All of them exchanged glances with each 
other. 

"Don't worry. As a major shareholder, I will naturally hand out rewards and 
penalties according to abilities." 

"As long as you complete the tasks assigned by the company on time and 
achieve the KPI review by the end of the year, I will give you a bonus 
according to your ranking." 

"And it won't be less than your three-month salary." 

"If there's a need for overtime work, the overtime pay will be calculated 
according to the country's regulations…" Wu Mei said in a clear voice. Seeing 
that everyone's eyes lit up instantly, she continued to add on, "If you have any 
suggestions or ideas, you can also tell me. As long as it is beneficial to the 
development of the Wu Corporation, I will accept it." 

Benefits were always the easiest thing to strike a chord in people's hearts. 

As expected, the attitude of the higher-ups, who wanted to scold her just now, 
immediately turned into one of flattery and fawning. 

"Young President Wu is indeed capable and has the abilities!" 

"To be able to reach this position at such a young age, she really did it 
herself!" 

"Yeah, there are some rumors on the Internet. Maybe it was the Wu Family 
who deliberately slandered her. We couldn't stand it as well!" 

The few employees who had expressed their opinions did not care that Wu 
Pang was still in the meeting room, and were talking loudly. 

Wu Pang was so angry that he was spasming. He pointed at them and 
shouted, "You bunch of dogs! You really go where the money is!" 

"Don't forget, I can still control you…" 



Wu Pang still held a small portion of the company's shares. He gave the order 
to punish the employees, "Deduct one month's performance bonus for those 
who make wild conjectures about their superiors!" 

This behavior immediately caused the Wu Corporation staff's hatred towards 
Wu Pang to increase by several folds. 

"What? What are you looking at? If you continue looking, I'll transfer you to the 
logistics department!" 

Wu Pang vented all his anger on his employees, not realizing that he had lost 
the support of the people in the corporation. 

The number of people who supported Wu Mei rose rapidly. 

Wu Mei looked at his foolish behaviour and shook her head with a smile. "I 
really have to thank him for helping me with his brainlessness!" 

Li Nanchen's eyes were filled with tenderness as he silently observed her 
expression. 

After that night, Wu Mei seemed to have become more and more confident. 
She also seemed to have become increasingly more radiant, making one 
unable to look away. 
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… 

In the villa, Wu Mei was soaking in a milk bath, exhausted. She fiddled with 
her computer and scrolled through the information on the special agent forum. 
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She had registered an alternate account. Even if the Ministry of Defense 
wanted to investigate, they wouldn't know who she was. 

"Have you heard? A leader of a small country, who is caught in a political 
storm, is about to visit our country!" 

"I heard that our country is going to hold a banquet and even assign a few 
special agents to guard the place!" 



A message on the forum quickly caught Wu Mei's attention. She kept scrolling 
through with her mouse, searching for information on the high-ranking leader. 

"I heard that someone is offering money to buy his life on the dark web. The 
price offered is quite high." 

"It seems like this mission requires the Ministry of Defense to send their key 
special-agent team. In the past, it was always M who went on such missions. 
What a pity…" 

Wu Mei's mood didn't change much upon seeing these words. 

She simply stared at the face that appeared on the screen and the venue 
information of the banquet as she pondered… 

Perhaps attending this banquet is a chance to get close to the world of special 
agents again! 
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In the dead of night, Wu Mei got her hands on the topographic map of the 
banquet venue. She analyzed the environment and made marks on it. 

Based on her intuition as a top special agent, Wu Mei knew that someone 
would definitely assassinate this high-ranking official from the neighboring 
country during the banquet. That was why special agents were sent to protect 
him. 

After gathering information about this operation from the forum, she organised 
them and a plan formed in her mind. 

As long as she could sneak into the banquet and keep the special agent, who 
was protecting the high-ranking official, under control temporarily, she would 
then come to the rescue when the situation was critical! 



As long as she succeeded, she would be able to leave an impression on the 
senior officials of the Ministry of Defense! 

They would never let go of any good successors. It was highly likely that they 
might even offer her a chance to join the secret service. 
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This was the only key to her return to the world of special agents. 
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Wu Mei made up her mind. However, she realized that the selection of 
participants for the banquet was very strict due to safety reasons. Those who 
could obtain an invitation were all people of status. 

"Li Nanchen?" 

Her eyes narrowed as she thought of a familiar name. "How did I forget about 
him?" she murmured. 

Li Nanchen would donate a large sum of money every year. He was definitely 
an invited guest! 

She smiled and knocked on the door next door. Without hearing any 
response, she pushed the door open. 

"President Li, I want to talk to you…" 

"Yeah?" 

Li Nanchen had just finished his night jog. His loose sports jacket made him 
look more youthful and attractive. 

His eyes subtly lit up with some sparks as he stared at the woman who was 
visiting him in the middle of the night. 

Her semi-transparent white shirt loosely covered her graceful figure, revealing 
her long legs. Her curly hair fell on her chest, making it difficult for one to look 
away. However, she did not sense that anything was wrong and simply slowly 
approached Li Nanchen. "Why aren't you saying anything?" 

"…" 



Li Nanchen felt his throat turn slightly hoarse. He threw the towel over her 
body to cover the revealing parts. 

Wu Mei lowered her head in confusion. Realising that her pajamas were too 
sexy, she smiled and said, "Can you bring me along for the Ministry of 
Defense's dinner banquet that will be held in a few days?" 

"I remember that you didn't like attending banquets in the past." 

Li Nanchen furrowed his brows and scrutinized Wu Mei. Her expression was 
natural and her gaze was honest. 

"People change. Besides, I have another motive for attending the banquet." 

Li Nanchen raised his brows slightly, indicating for her to continue. 

Naturally, Wu Mei sat down beside Li Nanchen. She crossed her legs and 
looked at him seductively. 

"I never told you that I actually liked Agent M… I think there's something fishy 
about her death." 
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"How could such a powerful agent die in a plane crash?" 

Wu Mei did not hide her entire motive. Only when the truth was mixed in with 
the lie, could she confuse the other party and render Li Nanchen unable to 
differentiate them. 

"How about I make a deal with you, President Li!" 

"As long as you can bring me into the banquet hall and find a way to help me 
get the attention of the high-ranking officials of the Ministry of Defense and 
help me to become a special agent, I will help you investigate the truth behind 
M's death and give her justice!" 

Wu Mei tilted her head and looked into Li Nanchen's wavering eyes. "You 
don't want her to be wronged, do you?" 

Li Nanchen was indeed secretly asking his friend about Agent M, but that did 
not mean that he would agree to Wu Mei's involvement. 



"Do you know how dangerous it is to become a special agent? It's not that 
easy!" 

Li Nanchen was worried about Wu Mei's safety. Although he knew that she 
might have some skills, compared to a group of experts… He did not want to 
take the risk! 
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"Oh? You don't believe in my abilities? How about we give it a try?" 

Wu Mei pretended to ruffle her hair, but she instantly launched an attack. She 
removed her hair clip and stabbed it at Li Nanchen. Her movements were fast 
and swift, stirring up a gust of wind in the air! 

The two of them fought in the room and the furniture made banging sounds. 
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A few minutes later, Li Nanchen seized the opportunity and suddenly 
restrained her shoulders, pressing her onto the bed! 

Both of them were panting heavily. 

Wu Mei raised her brows. She lifted her leg and wrapped it around Li 
Nanchen's waist, using the momentum to push him down. "Impressive, 
President Li!" 

"Thank you for letting me win." Looking at that pair of sly eyes, Li Nanchen 
was a little dazed as he replied. 

Wu Mei could feel both their strengths being locked in a stalemate. If she were 
to have a head-on clash with him, she could only fight to a draw. She had to 
rely on her wits! 
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She looked up at the man's handsome face that was extremely close to her. 

The next moment, she moved closer to Li Nanchen's neck and bit his 
sensitive earlobe. 



Instinctively, Li Nanchen tensed up. 

This woman! 

Wu Mei instantly caught the chink in his armour and broke away from him. 
She pressed the sharp tip of the hair clip against his artery and smiled. 

"You've lost!" 

Li Nanchen sat up expressionlessly and said, "You tricked me." 

Wu Mei coolly used the hair clip to tie up her hair again and looked back into 
his eyes. "I will use any means necessary to achieve my goal." 
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At that moment, she was too dazzling. Li Nanchen could not utter a single 
word. He could only hear his heart beating wildly. 

After a long time, he relented, "Alright, I'll take you there." 

Wu Mei smiled smugly. Before she left, she heard Li Nanchen say softly, 
"Promise me you'll keep yourself safe." 

"Don't worry." Wu Mei turned around and smiled mischievously as she said, 
"Those people won't be able to hurt me." 
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The next morning. 

Li Nanchen unexpectedly received a message from Bi Fang. 



He briefly explained that he was out on a confidential mission and would not 
be able to return anytime soon. He was unable to help with Old Master Li's 
matter and apologized for that. 
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This reply was within Li Nanchen's expectations. His mood was not affected 
much. 

"Auntie Zhang, is there any milk? Help me warm up a cup of milk!" 

Hearing the seductive voice coming from the first floor, Li Nanchen narrowed 
his eyes. He picked two photos of her and pressed the send button. 

"Is this person your disciple?" Li Nanchen probed. He nervously waited for a 
reply. 
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However, the signal in the warzone was cut off and he lost contact with Bi 
Fang. There was no reply for a long time… 

… 

In the afternoon, at the Wu Family villa. 

Holding Li Nanchen's arm, Wu Mei rang the doorbell. 

Since the ownership of the Wu Family villa was already under her name, it 
was time to take it back completely. 

Wu Pang stared at the clock on the wall. He had already arranged a time to 
return the villa to Wu Mei. She came right on the dot! 

Enraged, his blood pressure soared as he pushed open the door, pointed at 
Wu Mei, and yelled, "Wu Mei! Are you still human?! No matter what, I am still 
your biological father! You really want to drive me out and make me live on 
the streets?" 
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"Let the neighbors see the ugly side of the woman who married Li Nanchen! 
An ingrate!" 

Wu Pang dragged the Li family in. Wu Mei shook her head, lamenting on his 
stupidity. 

"Keep your voice down. You're not afraid of losing face, but I'm afraid of losing 
face!" 

"Now, all the neighbors know how you had an affair during your marriage and 
abandoned my mother to live here with your mistress. They must hate you so 
much that they can't wait to move away!" 

Wu Mei sized him up and frowned in distaste. 

"Besides, you don't have a place to stay? Didn't you use my mother's money 
to secretly buy a few apartments? Don't force me to take them back as well!" 

Wu Pang was speechless. He turned to Li Nanchen and said, "President Li, 
she's so unfilial. Aren't you going to control her?" 

Li Nanchen gently placed his hand on her shoulder and smiled languidly. 

"If you insist on causing trouble, I can get the court and the relevant 
departments to step in. However, President Wu will probably lose all his face 
at that time." 

This couple is really ruthless! 

Just then, Yang Shan's voice suddenly came from inside the house. 

"Aiya, Wu Mei? You're here… Come in quickly! President Li…" 

"I know you guys are here to take back the house, but just a few more hours 
won't matter, right?" 

"Wu Mei, I got someone to bring your mother back from the sanatorium. Let's 
have dinner together at the villa before we leave, okay?" 

Yang Shan smiled and appeared humble as she pleaded. 

Wu Mei brows knitted together warily. 



This woman… What is she up to? 
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Li Nanchen also looked at her in confusion. In his impression, Yang Shan was 
not such an easygoing woman! 

"I don't have any other intentions. I just hope that our feud will end here. We'll 
give you back the villa. In the future, you and President Li can stop finding 
trouble with us. Both our families… Can we pretend that we don't know each 
other from now on?" 

Yang Shan's eyes were slightly red as if she hadn't slept well. 

Wu Mei hesitated. A wave of sadness washed over her and her heart skipped 
two beats uncontrollably. 

She understood that it was the Host's wish to have a reunion dinner. 
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Wu Mei nodded reluctantly and agreed, "Fine." 
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"Come in…" 

Instantly, Yang Shan was delighted. However, her gaze was fixed on Li 
Nanchen, making him feel a little bewildered. 

However, Li Nanchen had always gone along with Wu Mei's decision. 

Holding Wu Mei's hand, he went with her to the living room and sat down. 

Wu Pang's eyes seemed to be able to shoot daggers at them. However, Yang 
Shan tugged on him and he did not scold them any further. With a dark 
expression on his face, he sat down unwillingly beside the retarded Mother 
Wu. 
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In the kitchen, Yang Shan personally prepared the food and took out a packet 
of powder. She shook her wrist and secretly mixed the medicine into the wine 
glass. 

"Mom! What are you doing?!" 

Wu Yi came in reluctantly, wanting to grumble. However, when she saw Yang 
Shan's actions, she could not help but exclaim softly. 

Yang Shan covered Wu Yi's mouth and whispered as she listened out for the 
noise in the living room. 

"It's an aphrodisiac." 

1 

"After Li Nanchen drinks it later, you need to find the right timing. Mom will 
help you keep Wu Mei busy while you take the chance to bring Li Nanchen to 
the room!" 
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"Think of a way to sleep with Li Nanchen. Even if he doesn't divorce Wu Mei, 
you can be his lover!" 
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"If you're lucky enough to give birth to a child for the Li family, would we still 
need to be afraid of Wu Mei?" 

"At that time, the entire Li family will be yours!" 

A deranged expression flashed across Yang Shan's eyes as she imagined the 
future. Wu Yi also stared at the wine glass and clenched her fists. 

"That's right! Brother-in-law can only be mine…" 
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Wu Mei couldn't help but feel annoyed as she looked at the sneaky mother 
and daughter in the kitchen. However, she gritted her teeth and forced herself 
to hold it in, on Mother Wu's account. 



 


