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Therefore, the older generation had long anticipated Diego's decision. However, prior to this, the Turner family, except
for Lydia who was only focused on research, had no one to rely on. Hence, they did not guard against Diego too much.

No one had expected that the Turner family would suddenly produce a Selena, a young lady who inherited both the
talents of her mother, Lady Nevaeh, and the unparalleled skills of her father, Callum.

Single-handedly, Selena saved the Turner family from the crisis and created a bright path for them amid the wolves'
siege. With one last step, the Turner family could formally return to the research institute and drive out all the invaders
from years ago.

After Diego finished speaking, a high-level member of the Shaw family faction immediately objected, "Although what you
said is true, Miss Turner is too young. If we make an exception for her today, where would that leave the many research
personnel who have labored for the institute for decades?"

Facing the unfriendly gazes of the opposition, Selena said with a smile, "The reason you all oppose me being the head of
the institute is simply because my qualifications are not enough, is that right?"

The atmosphere at the scene suddenly quieted down.

To be qualified as the head of the research institute, one must possess strength, reputation, means, and experience, and
none of these could be lacking. But Selena was too full of the first three.

As a super genius from Lab 717, Selena possessed an invincible strength that could overlook everyone else. The
reputation accumulated by the Turner family for many years gave Selena the confidence to stand above the many high-
ranking members of the institute. As for means-

The Turner family's young lady, did not the people of the whole capital already know about her means? It was not that
they did not want to object on other grounds, but apart from qualifications, they could not find any point of attack.

Therefore, when faced with Selena's question, no one dared to answer.

Looking at the silent crowd, Selena chuckled, "The so-called qualifications are nothing more than the accumulated
experience in dealing with situations."

"Although I am not as old as everyone here, I do not think that my experience and means in handling problems are
inferior to anyone here."

"I believe that everyone here has already realized this after all that has happened."

"If there is anyone who still thinks that I am not qualified to be the head of this institute, please stand up. I can let them
witness it right here and now."

Selena's words made the top executives of the Shaw family and the Poole family twitch their faces collectively.

And in the conference room, almost everyone's gaze subconsciously looked towards where the Shaw family and the
Poole family were located. After all, for these neutral people, it didn't matter who became the dean would affect them.

Even deep down in many people's hearts, they hoped Selena could successfully take over. After all, in terms of reputation,
the Shaw family and the Poole family were no match for the loyal and righteous Turner family.

However, the Turner family was weak, and it was impossible for the two major families to really let Miss Turner succeed.
Now it depends on how the Shaw family and the Poole family will take action to stop it.

In the dead silent conference room, a phone on the table suddenly rang.

"Honey" The sweet and lively voice of a young girl shocked everyone present who was looking up at the man in the main
seat in awe, and they all looked up in confusion.

Was that voice just their imagination? How could their lord use such a ring tone?

But then they saw the man in the seat of honor raise a slender and fair hand, pick up the phone next to him, and look at
it carefully for a moment.

Then, the man's blood-red lips curled up into a curve that made people tremble with excitement. His gaze also became
gentle in an instant.

Facing the stunned crowd, the man stood up, picked up the coat on the table, put it on, and walked out. His slender
figure disappeared in an instant, leaving only silence in the room.

It took a while for someone to come back to their senses and ask the person next to them in a dazed expression, "Did I
just have a hallucination? How could I hear..."

"It's probably not a hallucination," the person being asked was also shocked. "Because I heard it too."

That clear and pleasant sentence belonged to the girl - "Honey"

If it wasn't witnessed with their own eyes, who could have thought that this man would use such a phone ring tone that
made people's facial expressions collapse. There was no need to ask, everyone knew whose voice it was.

Osvaldo has had a wife for the past six months, and he dotes on her.

It was originally thought to be an exaggeration, but now it seems to be true.

If it weren't for his extreme affection towards her, given his personality, why would he use her voice as his mobile phone
ringtone? And just because he received a text message from her, he can go from a killer to a gentle lamb...

What kind of magic does this legendary wife possess that can transform such a man into a different person?

Osvaldo walked out of the conference room and called Luke, "Luke."

Luke sounded surprised, "What's wrong?"

Normally, Osvaldo wouldn't be calling him at this time, unless there was an unexpected situation. "You stay there and
keep an eye on those people," Osvaldo said.

Luke seemed to guess what was going on, "Aren't you going to watch Cassius yourself...?"

Osvaldo got in the car and sounded more joyful than usual, "She said she missed me."

He hung up the phone, stepped on the accelerator, and drove his black sports car towards the research institute.

On the other end, Luke looked at the disconnected phone with a puzzled expression.

This man actually changed his mind halfway through the plan they had agreed upon. Compared to Freddie and Christ,
Cassius was obviously a greater threat.

No matter what, Freddie and Christ would not dare to harm Selena's life. But Cassius might. For this reason, they had
agreed that Luke would go to the research institute and Osvaldo would watch Cassius.

But the man suddenly changed his mind... just because of a text message from Selena.

Luke remembered Osvaldo's transformation over the past six months and smiled. Before Selena appeared, no one would
have thought that a young girl could make their previously cold and unfeeling young master suddenly become more
human.

"Forget it..." Luke put down his phone, smiled, and resigned himself to walking forward.

If Osvaldo was going to see Selena in person, he would have to keep an eye on things here.

In order to prevent Cassius from sabotaging Selena's position as the new director of the research institute, Osvaldo had
put a lot of effort into this.

Lately, Cassius had been as timid as a tortoise and hadn't shown his face at all.

But he was still Osvaldo's uncle, and if he gave up so easily...
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