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Chapter 22 

Dominic’s mind was buzzing, holding the cigarette, he bursted with vigorous 
anger. 

He doesn’t like Selena, but that woman is still cuckolding him after her 
reputation ruined as her ‘promiscuity”! 

Bitch! 

Dominic was so angry that he almost lost his mind, he was so furious that he 
took a big step over and grabbed Leah’s arm, staring at her, his voice deep 
with anger, “Leah, did you just say that Selena was keeping a man outside?” 

Leah seemed to be taken aback, but raised her head and explained, 
“Dominic, it’s not like that, that day, after my sister left home, mum saw her 
get into a man’s car, that man helped her carry her luggage, he should have 
picked her up to go somewhere, maybe mum was mistaken.” The corners of 
Dominic’s forehead popped with veins and his face twisted. 

There was no doubt that if Selena were in front of him at this moment, he 
would have strangled her fiercely! 

Claiming to love him, while she used shares as bait and offered harsh 
conditions to alienate him from approaching Leah, while keeping men outside 
and cuckolding him. 

The anger of being deceived and played with made what little complex 
feelings he had left for Selena disappear into thin air. 

Leah seemed shocked by his expression and shivered as she explained for 
Selena, her face full of guilt and remorse, “Dominic, calm down, Selena must 
have hardships, it’s all my fault, she was kicked out of the house, she doesn’t 
even have a place to live. In order to survive, she can only… If only I didn’t 
show up in your wedding banquet.” 

Dominic took a deep breath, suppressing his heart full of anger and shame, 
and raised his hand to gently caress Leah’s face. 



“Leah, you know how you feel, you’ve always rejected me before so as not to 
hurt Selena, but now that she’s degraded herself to this point, you’re still going 
to choose to sacrifice our lifelong happiness for such a lowly woman?” 

Leah’s face turned white, tears in her eyes, seemingly panicked to the 
extreme, frantically shaking her head, “No, Dominic, I can’t do something 
harmful to Selena. My mum has already been sorry to Selena’s mother, I can’t 
do that.” 

“How long are you going to let her get away with this?!” 

Dominic yelled furiously, but when he saw Leah’s face turned white with fear, 
he suppressed his anger and took her into his arms, coaxing her softly. 

“Leah, I’ve had enough, the whole of Creephia knows that I’ve been 
cuckolded by Selena, they’re all looking at me as a joke, my mother is pushing 
me. I don’t want to marry Selena, Leah, help me, OK?” 

“Dominic.” Leah shook her head in fear, “I, I can’t. Selena may have a reason, 
she has always loved you deeply, she will change.” 

“I don’t care!” Dominic hugged her tightly, agitated to the core, “I want to break 
off my engagement with Selena! The person I like is you! The one I want to 
marry is you!” 

Leah’s tears poured down and she cried until she broke down, “But in that 
case, it doesn’t matter if I carry the name of a mistress, how can you be called 
a scum? Everyone will accuse you of being unfaithful, and the Walson family’s 
reputation will be implicated-” 

“I will let Selena take the initiative to break off the engagement herself!” 
Dominic narrowed his eyes slightly, his voice full of hostility, “Hasn’t she put 
us in harm’s way enough? I will make her get the hell out of here, Leah, don’t 
worry, I will not let any accusations fall on you.” 

After Dominic finished, he kissed Leah and turned to stride out. 

Behind him, Leah looked at his angry and vigorous back, raised her hand and 
dried her tears, her face was as soft and sad as it could be, the corners of her 
lips hooked up, and her eyes were ruthless. 

Selena – 



If you fight me, you will only die miserably! 

In the garden. 

Selena was in a good mood and smiled at Osvaldo, “Just wait for me.” 

Osvaldo stroke her hair. The wind had picked up and the weather was chilly, 
so he took his jacket off and draped it over Selena’s slender 

shoulders. 

Selena was slim and lean, and wearing his clothes was similar to a child 
wearing an adult’s clothes. 

She waved at him with a warm smile before stepping on her heels and turning 
towards the banquet hall. 

Osvaldo stared at her back. After a moment, he spoke out, his tone carrying a 
touch of bone-chilling coldness, “Luke.” 

Luke stepped down from inside the black sports car behind him, his slender 
fingers loosened the tie around his neck, his pretty face with a cynical smile, 
“Got it, I’ll make sure your woman won’t suffer any slightest bit!” 

Having said that, he headed in the direction Selena had left. 

Selena had just walked into the main hall of the banquet, and she bumped 
into Dominic. 

Dominic’s tall body blocked her outside the gate, his harsh gaze fixed on 
Selena’s face with anger and condescension, barking out orders like, 

“Selena, I love Leah, go and cancel the engagement yourself and leave 
Creephia!” 

Selena hooked her lips in a smile that was extremely cold, “Oh?” 

Dominic’s eyes revealed a dense disgust, looking at her as if he was looking 
at something dirty. “What qualifications do you have to compare with Leah? 
Even if you use all your tricks, I won’t like you!” 

Selena tilted her head slightly, her eyes revealed a touch of something that 
made people’s hearts chill as she said with a smile, “I don’t care.” Dominic 



was in the midst of his anger, and when he saw Selena’s reaction, his face 
twisted and his words became more and more unpleasant. “You’re not only 
shameless, you’re slutty, using your body to please those men in order to 
achieve your goal, Selena, how can you be so shameless?” 

He stared dead in the face of Selena, even if such an unlovable and notorious 
woman was good looking, he would not want her! Even if she held twenty 
percent of the Riddle family’s shares, he would not allow her to enter his 
Walson family’s door, she as too dirty! He has Leah, he will never marry 
Selena! 

Seeing Selena hanging her head and not saying anything, he thought that she 
still refused to give up, and became more and more irritated, “Selena, look at 
yourself! Are you good enough for me? Even if you stalk me, I won’t give you 
a second glance 

“Ah 

His words had just reached the point where they turned into a scream 

There was a loud bang and a potted plant hit Dominic’s head hard! 

An instant silence fell over the room as everyone stared in disbelief 

Dominic was smashed dumbfounded and looked at Selena with wide eyes, he 
couldn’t believe that he would be hit by Selenat 

The Selena who used to love him to the point of madness, who was always 
around him, who was humble and pitiful, who was obsessed with him and 
crazy about him, who would do anything for him! 

She actually hit him!!! 

No!!! 

Dominic couldn’t believe his eyes! 

However, Selena looked at him with a cold smile that sent chills down his 
spine. 

 


