
Read The Almighty Dragon General Chapter 4656 

The Almighty Dragon General Chapter 4656-Initially, Wynona did not think 
much of James before the match started. However, she changed her mind 
after their brief exchange. 

As James walked toward her at an unhurried pace, Wynona generated and 
unleashed more of her aura. She lifted her arm and teleported toward James. 
There were gasps of surprise and amazement among the audience because 
they were shocked by how quickly Winona moved. 

Despite her amazing speed and skill, Wynona still left behind spatial 
disruptions as she teleported. Moreover, cultivators of their level could easily 
detect those changes in the space around them. 

As she reemerged before James and thrust her palm at him, James raised his 
hand and countered with his own palm just in time. 

Boom! 

There was a loud sound as both hands slammed into each other. James was 
instantly thrown backward in the air due to the immense force coming from 
Wynona. 

After he eventually steadied himself and got to his feet, James felt something 
hot gush from the back of his throat. He coughed up a mouthful of blood the 
next instant. James could also feel a throbbing pain in the arm he had used to 
parry Wynona’s attack. 

James had only used his sheer physical strength instead of his Path Powers 
to withstand Wynona’s strength. 

“That guy is a pushover! He couldn’t even defend himself against a simple 
attack from Wynona! Yet, he had the audacity to challenge her?!” Some 
lower-ranked powerhouses commented amongst themselves. They thought 
James was clearly on the losing side. Only a small number of cultivators had 
noticed that James had only used his physical strength to defend himself. 

James wiped off the blood on his lips with the back of his hand. He smiled and 
looked at Wynona. “You’re pretty good.” 



Wynona sensed the hint of sarcasm in James’ tone. She let out a snort. Then, 
she prepared to unleash her next attack. 

James did not even see how she moved when Wynona had teleported right 
before him at that moment. She raised her palm and thrust it at James again. 
In a flash, James noticed that many illusory palms had materialized and 
formed a secure barrier around him. 

At the same time, James detected the immense power of a spatial seal 
pressing down on him simultaneously. As the powers of the seal seemed to 
gradually increase, James felt as if he might crumble under the weight and 
suffocate at any time. His feet were shaking a little as he tried his best to 
resist the overwhelming power of the spatial seal. 

James was honestly amazed by the powers and skills Wynona had 
demonstrated so far. He could tell that the various stories surrounding the lady 
were not just baseless rumors. 

Suddenly, tremors and loud sounds filled the arena as several explosions 
went off within the space that James was trapped in. Wynona’s powerful 
attacks had destroyed much of the arena. Fortunately, the arena was repaired 
instantly as the formation cast around that space took effect. 

As things seemed to settle down for a moment, people could eventually spot 
James, who was lying motionless on the ground in a pool of blood. On the 
other hand, Wynona was staring at the man whilst she levitated in mid-air. 

Just then, she noticed James slowly getting up from the ground. In a matter of 
seconds, the wounds on his body healed at a miraculous speed. The man 
appeared nonchalant as he straightened his clothes. 

Then, James activated the Omniscience Path. A white halo seemed to 
surround him as his body glowed faintly. His spiritual powers skyrocketed and 
he seemed like a matchless war god at that moment. 
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The Almighty Dragon General Chapter 4657-‘The Omniscience Path.1 “He’s 
at the late stage of the Ninth Rank.” 

“I’m starting to wonder about the young man’s capabilities “ 



“He’s mastered the Blithe Omniscience and reached this level in the 
Omniscience Path. It might be rather tricky for Wynona to defeat him.” 

The heads of each of the houses discussed amongst themselves as they 
watched the battle. 

On the other hand, Lothar remained unfazed by James’ performance so far. 

‘Wynona has the ability to counter the Blithe Omniscience anyway.’ Lothar 
thought. The man had faith in his disciple’s abilities. 

“Are you finally going to fight seriously?” 

Wynona kept her gaze trained on James. She snickered,” The Omniscience 
Path… The cultivation system created by Yardos Xagorari from the Welkin 
District. Quite a number of humans chose to utilize this path. However, only a 
handful of people have managed to become superior cultivators under it since 
it’s extremely difficult. Also, cultivators would hardly be able to climb to higher 
ranks after reaching the late stage of the Ninth Rank.” 

Across the Endlos Nine Districts, the Omniscience Path was one of the least 
preferred systems for cultivation since most found it too challenging. Not only 
was it hard to begin cultivating the Omniscience Path, but it was equally and 
sometimes more difficult to boost one’s ranks through it. 

With the Omniscience Path, a cultivator could somewhat boost their spiritual 
powers and physical powers. However, that was it. These same effects were 
also achievable through the use of certain secret arts. 

Still, James was not bothered by Wynona’s taunts. 

“If you’re ready to fight properly, I won’t hold back anymore as well.” Wynona’s 
expression hardened. She lifted her 

hands and conjured numerous sigils. The audience watched the sigils float 
toward the formation cast around the arena. Then, the sigils seemed to fuse 
with the formation instantly. 

Wynona learned that James could wield the Blithe Omniscience as soon as 
he was set to be her opponent. As such, she had made preparations to 
counter any attacks related to the Blithe Omniscience. With the sigils set in 



place, Wynona was certain that James would not be able to make any 
surprise attacks. 

James could tell what Wynona was trying to do. However, he was not worried 
about the sigils at all. 

‘The Blithe Omniscience is just one of the many techniques I’ve learned. It’s 
not the most deadly and potent technique I’ve mastered,’ he pondered. 

After she was done casting the sigils around them, Wynona remained 
hovering in the air. 

James flashed her a smile. “If you’re done, I guess I’ll make my move now.” 

James vanished from his spot at that very moment. He teleported and 
reappeared before Wynona. Then, he balled his fist and swung his arm 
forcefully at her. 

As soon as James moved, Wynona gripped her fist tightly and took James’ 
blow head-on. 

Boom! 

A loud crash resounded as their fists came together. The impact was so 
strong that James was thrown backward yet again. 

Wynona’s powers seemed to have increased substantially this time. James 
knitted his brows as he looked down at the cracks running down his arm. If he 
had not been careful enough, James might have lost his arm when they 
traded blows. 

‘She’s truly a strong opponent. I can tell from this hit that her mastery of the 
Boundless in the Permanence Acme Rank is much better than mine.’ James 
mused. 

Wynona did not allow James to rest as she began attacking him swiftly and 
viciously. The audience watched as they were embroiled in a fierce battle. 

Gradually, Wynona managed to slow James down as he sustained more and 
more injuries. 

Unfortunately, when James tried to avoid an attack by using the Blithe 
Omniscience, he failed and took a direct hit. 



Wynona’s attack tore a bloody hole through the center of James’ body. 

“It’s over for him!” 

Wynona’s supporters as they watched the battle’s progression. 
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James gasped for air. Still, he felt a sense of joy and exhilaration in him. 

Ever since he had arrived at the Endlos, he was oftentimes forced to face 
opponents or cultivators who were way stronger than him. He was always 
trying to look for ways to avoid battling them as he had no wish to foolishly 
challenge 

them. 

James never had a chance to engage in a proper fight all this time. Finally, he 
got to face Wynona, who was an equal match to him in many aspects. 

Til use this opportunity to assess the results of my training and cultivation.’ 
James thought. 

While most of the people assumed that James had clearly been defeated at 
that point, they began to notice the wounds on his body were curiously healing 
again, including the huge, bloody hole on his abdomen. 

“You’re truly a worthy opponent. I should also get serious 

then, ” he muttered. 

As the new muscles on James’ abdomen had finished forming, James 
straightened himself and directed his gaze at Wynona. Then, he activated the 
Thousand Paths Holy Body. 

The audience instantly felt a drastic change in the air. Almost everyone could 
sense how the Path Energies existing around them were all flowing toward 
James rapidly. At that moment, James’ body appeared to be in full sync with 
his surroundings as he began absorbing an immense amount of energy. 

“W… What?!” Quite a number of cultivators got up whilst staring at James. 



‘The Thousand Paths Holy Body?!” 

“He possesses and has even awakened the Thousand Paths Holy Body?! 
With that ability, he could increase almost any Path Power multiplefold!” 

Most of the audience was shocked to see the battle’s current development. 

After he had stopped suppressing the powers of the Thousand Paths Holy 
Body, James began to absorb the Path Powers into his body. As it instantly 
rejuvenated him, the aura emanating from his body grew substantially as well. 

A deep frown creased Wynona’s forehead. She had never come across any 
cultivators at the Permanence Acme Rank with such an overwhelming amount 
of aura. 

After a moment’s consideration, Wynona lifted her hand. Just then, a beam of 
golden light shot down from the sky and shone on Wynona’s hand. 

As the light slowly faded away, the audience could see the object that in her 
hand was a sword. 

“It’s the Caelandor!” 

“It’s the sword previously owned by our headmaster.” “It’s hailed as the most 
powerful weapon in the Verde District.” 

“Some say the sword might have first belonged to the founder of the Verde 
Academy. It’s a superb weapon that transcends the Acme Rank.” 

There was a stir in the crowd as Wynona summoned the Caelandor Sword. 

She pointed the Caelandor in James’ direction. Then, she said in a low voice, 
“I admit you’re pretty good. You’re the first to make me use the Caelandor 
Sword in a battle. Even if you lose this battle, everyone in the Verde District 
will know your name from this point onward.” 

Wynona was extremely confident that with the power of her sword, she would 
not lose to James. 

On the other hand, James could sense an overpowering sword intent coming 
from the Caelandor. It was a superior energy that was powerful enough to 
affect its wielder’s opponents. 



James could feel his pulse race and the strength of the Thousand Paths Holy 
Body drop due to the Caelandor* s ability. 

He let out a small chuckle. ‘The Caelandor is indeed a superb weapon. 
However, what matters more is the skill of its wielder. Since you’ve decided to 
use the Caelandor, I’ll use my own sword to defeat you and show everyone 
who’s the better fighter.” 

James conjured the Death-Celestial Sword at that instant. Then, he shot up 
into the air. As he rocketed upward, a wave of sword energy and countless 
inscriptions were produced from his sword simultaneously. 
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Sword Energy rushed toward Wynona and circled around her. In a matter of 
seconds, a Sword World formed around Wynona, trapping her inside it. 

“Welcome to my Sword World,” James muttered as he levitated in mid-air. 

The man seemed cool and composed as he stared down at Wynona. 

‘I’ve learned the Universal Sword Art and have better comprehended the 
Primal Mantra. Normal cultivators won’t be able to withstand the onslaught in 
my Sword World.’ James thought. 

At the same time, Wynona used all her might to resist the immense Sword 
Path Energy generated by the Sword World that surrounded her. Although her 
clothes remained intact, numerous wounds started forming on different parts 
of her body. The audience could see patches of red on her dress as blood 
seeped through the fabric. 

‘That’s an amazing amount of Sword Path Energy…” 

“It’s the Universal Sword Art, a signature skill created by the leader of the 
Saber Sect.” 

“It’s a signature skill designed specifically for those who possess the 
Thousand Paths Holy Body.” 



“James Caden used the Greater Paths to reinforce his Sword Energy. He’s 
also mastered the Universal Sword Art. Even though Wynona has the 
Caelandor, it seems she’s struggling to break free from James’ Sword World.” 

Most cultivators could see that Wynona was in a huge bind at that moment. 

Despite the seemingly endless barrage of Sword Energies, Wynona remained 
standing within the Sword World as she tried to decide her next move. 

Finally, she tightened her grip around the handle of the Caelandor and raised 
the sword high. As a tremendous and threatening wave of Sword Energy 
radiated from the Caelandor, Wynona slowly levitated in the air. 

Simultaneously, cracks began forming on the Sword World’s barrier. 

“She truly deserves the title of a genius cultivator…” 

James was equally shocked and amazed when he detected the cracks in his 
Sword World. He immediately channeled more Sword Energy into the Sword 
World to repair and reinforce it. 

Unfortunately, the powers of the Caelandor Sword were far stronger. As 
Wynona slowly floated upward in the air, the Caelandor Sword seemed to 
gradually glow brighter. 

Although James had used the Universal Sword Art to create the Sword World, 
the structure could not seem to withstand the Caelandor’s might much longer. 

In an instant, James focused and gathered all of his powers 

to prepare for an attack. The audience could vaguely see James’ powers 
manifesting as the faint image of a gigantic sword in the air. 

Then, the man rushed toward Wynona, who had also generated a great 
number of Sword Energy with the Caelandor. 

Boom! 

As two forms of Sword Energies collided, the impact was so destructive that 
the arena was completely obliterated. Even the formations cast around the 
battle arena shook a little due to the immense forces. 



After a while, the arena was eventually restored again. As the dust settled, the 
audience could see James and Wynona levitating in mid-air on opposite sides 
of the arena again. 

James had one hand against his back while the other hand was holding the 
Death-Celestial Sword. He appeared unscathed and composed. 

On the contrary, Wynona was in a disheveled and bloodied state. Numerous 
wounds marred the visible parts of her skin. Furthermore, she also suffered 
severe internal injuries. 

Even though she had tried her best to channel the powers of the Caelandor 
Sword, Wynona failed to overcome James’ attack. 

At that moment, almost everyone could tell the tides had turned on her. 

James stared at the lady silently. 

‘To be fair, I’ve actually gone easy on her. I chose not to unleash the Nine 
Voices of Chaos during our battle. If I were to incorporate that attack into the 
Sword World, she would have lost quite early on,’ James concluded inwardly. 

 


