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The Almighty Dragon General Chapter 5235-“Haha. You aren’t as strong as I 
expected.” 

When Ladon saw that James was constantly getting injured, he relaxed. 

To Ladon, James had already lost. 

Ladon believed he had won the challenge. 

Not only could he obtain the signature skill of Dieux Academy, the Feimsurge 
Art, but he could also obtain Thaddeus’ signature skill, the Tressencia 
Completare Art. 

On the battlefield, James was covered in wounds. 

His past form appeared on Ladon’s left, while his future form appeared on his 
right. 

James wiped away the blood that seeped out of his mouth. He activated the 
Life Path, and the wounds on his body healed at a speed visible to the naked 
eye. 

Currently, he was waiting for a chance to kill Ladon in one move. 

His only chance was to use the Tressencia Completare Art. He needed to 
combine the past, present, and future before giving Ladon a fatal blow. 

James created the Supremusse Sword. 

He knew the might of the Supremusse Sword. 

He believed the Tressencia Completare Art could break the Genesis 
Protective Barrier formed by the Supremusse Sword. 

Now, James needed to numb Ladon. 

Once Ladon took his attention off the battle, James would strike and win the 
battle. 

James looked at Ladon standing in the distant void and said, “I admit defeat. 



You’ve won the battle. According to our previous agreement, I will teach you 
the supreme signature skill of Dieux Academy, the Feimsurge Art. I will also 
guide you in cultivating the Tressencia Completare Art that was created by 
Thaddeus.” 

James chose to admit defeat. 

Upon hearing James admit defeat, Ladon laughed. 

At the same time, he grew excited. 

James admitting defeat meant Ladon could obtain the signature skill of Dieux 
Academy, the Feimsurge Art, and the mysterious Tressencia Completare Art. 

James withdrew his past and future forms. His body gradually descended 
from the sky. Then, he stood on the ground steadily. 

Meanwhile, Ladon also dispersed the Genesis Protective Barrier. 

Once he dispersed the Genesis Protective Barrier, James disappeared. At the 
next second, James appeared before Ladon. 

The moment James materialized, his past and future forms combined. 

Once they combined, double images appeared on the left and right sides of 
his body. As the double images merged, an extremely strong power emerged 
from his body. 

Out of nowhere, James attacked Ladon. 

Ladon did not expect James to attack him after admitting defeat. Without the 
Genesis Protective Barrier, Ladon could not resist the power of James’ 
Tressencia Completare Art. 

Under the destruction of James’ terrifying power, Ladon’s physical body was 
annihilated instantly. 

James immediately snatched the Supremusse Sword once Ladon’s physical 
body was annihilated. 

The Supremusse Sword was a peerless Ancestral God Weapon. The moment 
James grabbed the Supremusse Sword, it trembled. The sword was resisting 
him. 



If James wanted, he could tame the Supremusse Sword easily. 

However, many big shots were watching this scene in the outside world. 

He flew backward due to the Supremusse Sword’s power. 

“You…” 

After Ladon’s physical body was destroyed, his spirit was sent out of the 
Arena World. Then, a furious roar sounded. Ladon wanted to say something, 
but before he could finish speaking, he was sent out of the Arena World. 

“Nothing is too deceitful in war.” 

James smiled. 

Looking at the Supremusse Sword floating in the void, he rubbed his temple 
and mumbled to himself, “The Supremusse Sword originated from 
Supremusseum. It has resistance toward me. It’s quite hard to obtain the 
Supremusse Sword. I can only obtain it by removing the aura in the 
Supremusse Sword. However, the sword is controlled by Quirijn Yushar, the 
master of Supremusseum. With my cultivation rank, I can’t remove the aura in 
the Supremusse Sword left behind by Quirijin.” 

James had a troubled expression. 

Nonetheless, it was all an act. He was putting on a show for the powerhouses 
in the outside world. 

He mumbled again, “It seems that I can only ask the powerhouses of Dieux 
Academy to remove the aura in the Supremusse Sword after I complete the 
assessment. That way, I’ll be able to control the sword.” 
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about the Supremusse Sword for the time being. 

Nevertheless, he did not care about that. He let the Supremusse Sword float 
in mid-air. 

He walked toward the spiritual mountain ahead and sat cross-legged on its 
peak. 

He had suffered from injuries during the battle. 



Sitting in a lotus position, he began healing his wounds. 

At present, there were nine spiritual mountains left in the Arena World. The 
nine spiritual mountains were each guarded by a powerhouse of the Petit 
Celestial Rank. These powerhouses were powerful and had treasures. 

Even though the treasures could not be compared to the Supremusse Sword, 
they were still powerful. 

At this time, many powerhouses of the Petit Celestial Rank fell into deep 
thought. They were all thinking about what to do if James attacked them next. 

They wondered if they could use this opportunity to kill and eliminate James 
since James was injured. 

Although they had such thoughts, no one took action. They waited in their 
respective cities. 

They believed they were not Ladon’s match since Ladon had the Supremusse 
Sword. 

Nonetheless, they wanted to fight against James. James’ signature skills were 
powerful, and they wanted to have a taste of it. 

Even though James had defeated Ladon, he did so by being deceitful. He 
tricked Ladon into dispersing the Genesis Protective Barrier and took that 
chance to kill him. If Ladon had not dispersed the Genesis Protective Barrier, 
James would not have won. 

Thus, the powerhouses of the Petit Celestial Rank believed they had a chance 
of winning against James. 

Days flew by. 

James’ injuries healed. He also obtained the inscriptions of this city and a part 
of the Feimsurge Inscriptions. 

However, the fifth and sixth stages of the Feimsurge Art were tough. Even 
though James had obtained the inscriptions, he could not comprehend them 
in a short time. 

James gradually stood up. He scanned the surrounding city. 



“Forty-nine, I’m here.” 

A voice sounded. 

Looking in the direction of the voice, James realized Aurelius was the one 
calling him. 

Aurelius waved at James from the sky above the city and called out, “Come 
here.” 

James’ body flashed and disappeared. At the next moment, he showed up in 
the city where Aurelius was. 

With a smile, Aurelius said, “Let’s dismiss the battle between us. I believe I’m 
not your match. You occupied spiritual mountains and cities because you 
wanted to obtain the Feimsurge Inscriptions, right? You can observe and 
comprehend this city I occupy as much as you want.” 

James glanced at Aurelius. Without saying anything, he found a spot and sat 
on the ground. He began to focus on comprehending. 

His Zen integrated into the city. 

Under the senses of his Zen, he realized that this city was formed by 
inscriptions. The sceneries, things, and even the streets were inscriptions. 

These inscriptions were profound and complex. 

Even James could not comprehend the inscriptions in a short time. 

Nevertheless, James did not need to comprehend the inscriptions now. He 
only needed to sense the existence of the inscriptions and remember them. 

Soon, he sensed the inscriptions of this city and memorized them. 

He stood up once again and headed to another city. 

Aurelius was the first to allow this. 

Although the powerhouses of the Petit Celestial Rank who occupied other 
cities wanted to fight against James, they did not know if they could win. Thus, 
they chose not to fight. Instead, they allowed James to sense the Feimsurge 
Inscriptions in their cities. 



In the outside world, in the apex main hall of Dieux Academy, many 
powerhouses were having a discussion. 

“There are no more battles.” 

“It has been pretty good. Forty-nine has surprised us.” 

On the other hand, the headmaster of Dieux Academy, Xhemal, left the main 
hall of Dieux Academy. 

He headed toward the so-called Endlos Plane. He wanted to inquire about 
James’ details. 
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area where the Endlos Plane was, Xhemal realized that the area had nothing. 

No matter how he sensed the area, he could not sense the aura of the Endlos 
Plane. 

This realization made him frown. 

Since he could not sense the existence of the Endlos Plane, he could not 
enter the Endlos Plane and inquire about James’ details. Thus, he could only 
return to Dieux Academy. 

“Sir Xhemal, how was it? Did you find anything?” Jorah questioned once 
Xhemal returned. 

Xhemal shook his head and answered, “I went to where the Endlos Plane was 
according to the location Ziyad provided, but I did not find the Endlos Plane. I 
did not sense the existence of the Endlos Plane. A powerhouse must have 
hidden the Endlos Plane. He does not want other living beings to enter the 
Endlos Plane.” 

Xhemal did not ponder too much about all this. 

In his opinion, the legendary Thaddeus might have hidden Endlos. 

Meanwhile, Thaddeus was hiding in the Endlos Plane. 

In the Arena World, after defeating Ladon by deceit, James stopped fighting. 



The powerhouses of the Petit Celestial Ranks in the rest of the cities also 
chose not to fight against James. They allowed him to observe and sense the 
Feimsurge Inscriptions. 

James obtained the complete Feimsurge Art as he desired. 

Nonetheless, it was difficult for him to reach the fifth and sixth stages of the 
Feimsurge Art. 

In the main apex hall of Dieux Academy, Xhemal stood up and said, “I’m 
announcing the end of this round’s assessment.” 

An elder asked, “Forty-nine killed and eliminated so many living beings. There 
are only a few powerhouses of the Petit Celestial Rank left. How should we 
calculate the result of the assessment?” 

Xhemal smiled and said, “Elders, you can recruit anyone who has impressed 
you as your disciple. As for the powerhouses from the great sects and huge 
planes, let them choose.” 

With that, Dieux Academy’s disciple-recruiting assessment came to an end. 

The spiritual mountains and cities in the Arena World disappeared. 

On the other hand, the living beings in the secret realm were sent out of the 
arena. 

The prodigy powerhouses who completed the nine tests and entered the 
Arena World showed up in the vast area outside the apex main hall of Dieux 
Academy. 

James, Gaius, Gurgen, Zavis, and Taran stood at the front. The rest were 
powerhouses of the Petit Celestial Rank. 

At the entrance of the main hall, many powerhouses of Dieux Academy 
gathered. 

The powerhouses stared at James. His performance during this assessment 
had shocked them all. They wanted to recruit James as their disciple. 

Nevertheless, there was still an unsolved matter-the Supremusse Sword. 



With a thought, Xhemal summoned the Supremusse Sword from the secret 
realm. The sword floated in the main hall. 

Looking at the Supremusse Sword, Xhemal rubbed his temples with a heavy 
expression. 

According to the challenge, the sword belonged to James. However, the 
master of the sword came from a strong background. Dieux Academy could 
not offend him. 

Upon seeing the Supremusse Sword, James stood forward and said, “Sir 
Xhemal, this sword belongs to me now. Please remove the aura of the 
Supremusse Sword’s master.” 

Xhemal sighed. He felt helpless as he said, “Do you know who this sword 
belongs to? It belongs to Quirijn of Supremusseum.” 

“So what?” 

James did not care who the sword belonged to. He said,” 

Supremusseum’s disciple lost the challenge. I killed and eliminated him, 
making the sword mine. Besides, is Supremusseum really that great? They’re 
only still around because my teacher doesn’t travel to the outside world. If he 
did, he could destroy Supremusseum with just a thought.” 

James brought up Thaddeus again. 

No one in the outside world knew if James was truly Thaddeus’ disciple. The 
living beings in the outside world also did not know who Thaddeus was. Thus, 
they could not verify this fact. 
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Ladon stood forward, his face pale. He clenched his fists, wanting to tear 
James into pieces. 

James glanced at Ladon and said, “So what if I did We agreed in the 
beginning that one would only win if one killed and kicked the other person out 
of the arena. You were careless. You can’t blame me for this.” 

‘You…” 



Ladon breathed heavily. 

“Alright.” 

Xhemal stood forward and glanced at Ladon. He said, ‘You lost.” 

Since the headmaster of Dieux Academy said so, Ladon could not say 
anything else. He only glared at James. 

“Quirijn, why don’t you show yourself?” Xhemal looked into the distant void. 

Following Xhemal’s words, many living beings turned around. 

In the distant void, a middle-aged man appeared. The man wore a golden 
robe. 

His aura was extraordinary. Strange clouds were floating behind him. 

The man was the current master of Supremusseum, Quirijn. He was also the 
current master of the Supremusse Sword. 

Quirijn stepped on the void and walked over. In an instant, he appeared in the 
sky above the apex main hall of Dieux Academy. His body gradually 
descended, and he stood steadily before Xhemal. 

“Greetings, Lord Supreme,” said many powerhouses of Dieux Academy. 

Xhemal looked at the clouds and smiled. He said, ‘Your son challenged 
Forty�nine and lost the Supremusse Sword. You must have seen it in the 
dark. Do you think this challenge counts?” 

“Haha. Of course, it counts.” 

Before Quirijn spoke up, laughter sounded from the void. 

Following the sound of laughter, another middle-aged man appeared. 

He wore plain clothes, but his aura was powerful. 

He was the clan leader of the Ancient Clan, the lord of a ninth-level plane. He 
was Fabrizio, the lord of the Immortal Mountain. 

Holding the Supremusse Sword, Quirijn was feared by everyone. 



Even Fabrizio of the Ancient Clan’s Immortal Mountain feared Quirijn. 

Although they were allies in the dark, they were enemies at the same time. 

The Ten Great Forces and a few powerful planes were at odds. None of them 
wanted other living beings to be stronger than them. 

Now that there was a chance to weaken Quirijn’s ability, Fabrizio did not want 
to let it slip out of his hands. 

Many powerhouses watched Dieux’s Academy disciple recruitment 
assessment in the dark. None of them showed themselves. Only Fabrizio of 
the Ancient Clan’s Immortal Mountain showed up. 

Fabrizio glanced at Quirijn and said with a smile, “Quirijn, countless living 
beings of thousands of planes are watching. Do you think this challenge 
counts?” 

Quirijn glanced at Ladon. 

Reluctantly, Ladon said, “Father, I want to get the Feimsurge Art and 
Tressencia Completare Art.” 

Quirijn did not reprimand Ladon. 

Looking at Xhemal, Quirijn smiled and said, “Since Ladon lost the challenge, 
we, Supremusseum, will admit defeat. However…” 

Then, he glanced at James. 

“Forty-nine, right? Do you know that this Supremusse Sword is a treasure of 
Supremusseum? I may be giving it to you now, but I will think of a way to get it 
back in the future.” 

Under Quirijn’s gaze, James was unafraid. He said, “If you use a legitimate 
way to get it back, I have nothing to say, but if you forcefully snatch it back by 
relying on your powerful abilities, your reputation will be tarnished.” 

‘You’re brave.” 

A murderous intent flashed in Quirijn’s eyes. 



“Take the Supremusse Sword for now. In the future, I will personally get it 
back.” 
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wonder how you’re going to get it back.” 

“Since we lost it because of the challenge, I will win it back. Do you dare to 
take on my challenge?” Quirijn looked at James. 

“What’s the challenge?” James looked at Quirijn. 

“I don’t want to take advantage of you when your cultivation base is still weak. 
I’ll give you time to grow and cultivate. One entrapoch later, I will come and 
get the Supremusse Sword myself. I won’t have mercy on you. The day I 
obtain the Supremusse Sword will be the day you die. So, do you dare to take 
on this challenge?” 

“Alright. I’ll take on the challenge.” James did not hesitate. 

An entrapoch was a long time. 

With his potential, one entrapoch was enough for him to restore his cultivation 
base to the state of his previous life. He could reach the Holy Celestial Rank. 

“Hmph.” 

Quirijn scoffed before disappearing. 

After he left, Fabrizio of the Ancient Clan’s Immortal Mountain also left the 
area. 

After all, he did not want to stay in Dieux Academy for a long time. 

“Forty-nine, you’re too rash.” 

Xhemal frowned and said, “Even though you have great potential and strong 
comprehension, one entrapoch is too short. Do you think you can reach 
Quirijn’s level in one entrapoch?” 

James smiled and said, “That depends on how much resources Dieux 
Academy is willing to give me. According to the previous agreement, Dieux 
Academy will give me an eighth-level plane and one entrapoch of resources. If 



Dieux Academy follows through with the agreement, I believe I can reach 
Quirijn’s level and maybe even surpass him in one entrapoch.” 

‘You’re ambitious.” Xhemal gave James a thumbs up. Then, he erased the 
aura in the Supremusse Sword, making the Supremusse Sword ownerless. 

Although the aura Quirijn left behind in the Supremusse Sword was powerful, 
Xhemal was the one removing the aura. Xhemal was in the same cultivation 
rank as Quirijn. Moreover, Quirijn did not stop Xhemal from removing the 
aura. 

Thus, Xhemal could remove the aura in the Supremusse Sword easily. 

He waved his hand, and the Supremusse Sword flew toward James. 

James took the Supremusse Sword and sensed its aura. He felt confident. 

“Forty-nine, you performed well during the disciple recruitment assessment. I 
promised to give you an eighthlevel plane and one entrapoch of cultivation 
resources. 

Now, it’s time for you to make a decision. Among the many powerhouses in 
the academy, who would you like to be your teacher?” 

All the living beings looked at James. 

They wanted to know who James would choose to be his teacher. 

However, James said, “I don’t want anyone to be my teacher.” 

“Oh?” 

Xhemal was taken aback. 

James said, “I hope Dieux Academy can open up another spiritual mountain 
for me and give me an elder position. I want to become an elder of Dieux 
Academy.” When James said that, everyone was shocked. 

The powerhouses of Dieux Academy were stunned. 

Open up another mountain and make him an elder? 

How could this be said by a living being of the Sovereign Third Rank? 



How could a human of the Sovereign Third Rank say such things? 

“Haha!” 

Xhemal touched his white beard and laughed. “Forty-nine, you have great 
ambitions. First, you want an eighth-level plane and one entrapoch of 
cultivation resources. Now, you want the academy to open up a mountain and 
make you an elder. How are you so confident?” 

“Because I’ve cultivated the Feimsurge Art until the fourth stage. Give me 
some time, and I will master the complete Feimsurge Art,” said James 
confidently. 

“Alright. As you wish.” 

Seeing that James was so confident, Xhemal said, “I will make an exception 
for you today. I will open up a mountain and make you an elder.” 
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elders of Dieux Academy. 

“Sir Xhemal, please reconsider this.” 

“Sir Xhemal, I admit that Forty-nine is a prodigy and has strong 
comprehension. 

However, he has just entered Dieux Academy. If you open up a mountain and 
make him an elder, the world will laugh at Dieux Academy once this spreads.” 

‘That’s right. Even though he’s talented, he should follow the rules. He can’t 
become an elder right upon entering the academy.” 

Several powerhouses of Dieux Academy advised Xhemal. 

The potential James showed was indeed terrifying. It definitely surpassed that 
of all the amazing powerhouses in the history of Dieux Academy. 

Nonetheless, James had just entered Dieux Academy. 

Opening up a mountain for him and making him an elder was ridiculous. 

Even Jorah, a great elder, frowned. He glanced at James and thought for a 
moment. Then, he said, “I think it will work. After all, James could cultivate the 



Feimsurge Art and reach the fourth stage in such a short time. That is enough 
to prove his potential. One day, he will become the pillar of Dieux Academy.” 

Xhemal touched his beard and said, “It’s settled then.” 

Then, he looked at James and asked, “Do you have other requests? Tell me 
all at once.” 

‘There’s nothing else.” 

James shook his head. 

He knew Dieux Academy well. Opening up a mountain for a newly recruited 
disciple was a first in its history. Dieux Academy had already made an 
exception for him. 

Xhemal looked at James and said, ‘The academy will open up a mountain for 
Forty-nine today.” 

Following Xhemal’s words, a spiritual mountain was added to the land of 
Dieux Academy. 

‘This mountain is named Mount Caden. You will be the Lord of Mount Caden 
and one of the elders of Dieux Academy. I hope you do your best to serve 
Dieux Academy after you become the Lord of Mount Caden and work hard in 
developing Mount Caden to make it the main mountain peak of Dieux 
Academy.” 

Resolutely, James said, “I won’t disappoint you.” 

Many living beings gathered in the area. 

The living beings envied James. 

Dieux Academy made an exception for a newly recruited disciple and opened 
up a mountain for him. It was a huge honor. 

If this news spread, James would be famous in the Central Plane and become 
a legendary character in the thousands of planes. 

“Forty-nine, congrats.” Aurelius walked over. With a smile, he asked, “I 
wonder if I can enter Mount Caden and become a disciple.” 



Aurelius took the initiative to ask if he could join Mount Caden. 

James glanced at him. 

Aurelius came from a ninth-level plane. His father was the lord of the ninth-
level plane. It was wise to make friends with him. Besides, James held no 
grudges against Aurelius’ plane and his father. 

“Of course,” said James with a smile. 

“It’s settled then. I’m the first person to enter Mount Caden. As the Lord of 
Mount Caden, you should give me the position of an elder,” said Aurelius with 
a smile. 

James was an elder of Dieux Academy, and Dieux Academy had many 
elders. 

These elders occupied a spiritual mountain each. They were the lords of the 
spiritual mountains. There were several elders in each spiritual mountain. 

However, they were only elders in the spiritual mountains they were in. They 
were not elders of Dieux Academy. 

“Sure.” 

James smiled and agreed to Aurelius’ request. 

A powerhouse of the Petit Celestial Rank was eligible to become an elder of 
Mount Caden. 

Upon seeing this scene, Zavis glanced at Sevara in the distance. He hinted at 
James. 

Instantly, James understood what Zavis meant. 

James walked over to Sevara and asked with a smile, “Miss Lhayme, I 
wonder if you’re willing to join Mount Caden and become a member.” 

 


