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the Calidum Spiritual Tree but was pulled back by James. “Forty-nine…” 

“Be patient,” James advised him, then raised his head. 

“You’ve been following US for so long. Now that we’ve arrived at the Calidum 
Spiritual Tree, it’s about time you confess.” 

James’ group was stunned by his words. 

Truett looked at him in confusion and asked, “What are you talking about?” 

James quickly flashed in front of Truett, Xitlaly and the other members of his 
group. He shielded them behind him and cast a glance at Whitaker, who was 
strangely silent. 

“There’s an extremely cunning and dangerous person in our team right now.” 

Everyone followed James’ gaze and fixed their eyes on Whitaker. 

Whitaker raised his head and stared at James with bloodshot eyes. “What do 
you mean, Forty-nine?” 

James glared at him and questioned coldly, “Who are you? Did Xachary and 
Lyla send you, or are you from a different sect of the Three Thousand Great 
Genesis Worlds?” 

Truett and the others were dumbfounded by James’ words. 

Whitaker’s face darkened, and he replied, “You’ve gone too far, Forty-nine. 

You’ve already cursed me and can control my every move. What else do you 
want?” 

James said solemnly, “It’s precisely because of my Curse Magic that I can 
expose you. I didn’t curse you, but you put on an act just now.” 

“N-Nonsense,” Whitaker refuted, slowly distancing himself from James. 



James sneered, “I can read the thoughts of the living beings I’ve cursed. 

However, I can’t get anything from you. There are only two possibilities. Either 
the curse didn’t work on you, or dispelled my curse.” 

James slowly stepped forward and continued, saying, “Living beings at the 
same cultivation rank as me aren’t capable of resisting my curse. Nobody 
below the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank’s Third Tribulation should be able to.” 

Truett asked surprisedly, “Are you saying Whitaker hid his strength? Is he a 
powerhouse above the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank’s Third Tribulation?” 

James said coldly, “That’s impossible. He went through the Yorean Wind with 
us. Even if he had consumed an elixir to seal his core, it’s impossible for him 
to have recovered so soon.” 

Truett asked, ‘Then why isn’t he cursed?” 

James glared at Whitaker, who was slowly retreating. Then, he replied, “It’s 
because he’s also from the Dark Genesis World and is proficient in our 
inscriptions and Curse Magic.” 

Truett and the others gasped at the revelation. 

James looked at Whitaker and said, “Long time no see, old friend. Should I 
call you Xayvion or Whitaker?” 

Whitaker distanced himself more, then suddenly sneered, “I’ve already 
completely reformed myself. I wasn’t expecting you to be able to recognize 
me so easily, James.” 

James smiled faintly and said, “We’ve been enemies for so long. I’ve been 
hunting you down for so long, but you also did whatever it took to escape. 
After you’ve consumed Xayal’s powers, you must’ve improved a lot, right? Will 
you still try to run from me?” 

Whitaker raised his head and laughed, “You’re so smart, James. You knew 
from the very beginning, huh? To expose me, you deliberately chased away 
your wife. Do you really think you can prevent her from getting caught up in 
this matter?” 
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smile, not saying anything in response. 

Whitaker smiled and said arrogantly, “Unfortunately, you’re wrong. Your wide 
is the Timaeus Sect’s Saintess. Her identity is too crucial. Whether it’s about 
the personal feud between you and me or the conflict of interest between the 
Timaeus Sect and our new alliance, she’ll play a big part.” 

Suddenly, Whitaker looked at James sinisterly and said, “Do you know how 
many of the powerhouses at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank from our alliance 
have consumed elixirs to seal their cores? 

“I can answer that for you. There are eighty powerhouses, and at least fifty 
have recovered their strength by now. 

“Think about it carefully, James. Can your wife, the Timaeus Sect’s Saintess, 
escape the besiegement of fifty powerhouses at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank?” 

James squinted but remained silent. 

Truett suddenly stepped forward and said, “Bastard, aren’t you also from the 
Timaeus Sect? When did you start colluding with the new alliance?” 

Whitaker chuckled and said, “Even better, Skynet’s Young Master, Truett, is 
here. Everything seems to be working in our favor. Eventually, Skynet will also 
be under our control.” 

“Who do you think you are?” Truett waved his hand and summoned a giant 
sword. 

Xitlaly also wielded her weapon, saying, “Don’t try to bluff us! Those elixirs are 
extremely rare. I doubt more than 500 exist. Most are possessed by the 
Ancient Genesis World’s top ten forces. How could you have acquired eighty 
of them?” 

Whitaker said, “The lustus Sect’s Saintess sure is knowledgeable and 
talented. I really admire you. But what if I say I can create these elixirs?” 

His words took Xitlaly aback. 

Truett said with hostility, “So these improved sealing elixirs are from you? That 
makes things so much easier.” 



“Do you still think you’re at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank’s Fifth Tribulation, 
Truett? You’re just an ant right now,” Whitaker sneered, then pointed to 
everyone else and said, “You all are just ants. 

“If you surrender, I’ll not kill anyone else except James. I’ll also give everyone 
the most generous treatment to help you quickly enter the Yuraeceon Daelm 
Rank.” 

Everyone glared at him furiously. 

James sneered, “The situation isn’t looking too good for you. Then, let’s see if 
you have the strength.” 

Whitaker roared, “Arrogant! Take them down! Kill them all!” 

After giving an order, dozens of figures appeared around them. From their 
Genesis Qrohm, James could sense they were at the Yuraeceon Xaelm 
Rank’s Rank’s Third Tribulation. 

Seeing so many powerhouses, Truett and the others were startled. 

James looked at Truett and said, “Protect your wife.” 

After speaking, he leaped into the air and stretched out his hands. His Golden 
Body was activated, and Quasar Lightning surrounded him. 

At the same time, Quasar Tribulation Clouds appeared above the group of 
enemies. 
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“This is bad! He’s trying to use Quasar Lightning! 

Activate your Genesis Divine Light!” 

Just as he finished speaking, a terrifying gray light suddenly erupted from 
James’ body. He had entered the Third Marciais Combat Form. 

James raised his hand, and a bell rang from his black gloves. However, the 
group of powerhouses had already activated their Genesis Divine Lights and 
were unaffected. 



Meanwhile, Truett, Xitlaly and the others immediately entered a dreamlike 
state. 

James was startled the group of powerhouses were immune to the Yuraeceon 
Genesis Bell’s chimes. 

Xayvion burst out laughing. “Haha! Do you think you’re invincible with the 
Yuraceon Genesis Bell, James? I’ve already devised a way to neutralize your 
bell’s chimes.” 

“Then, can you neutralize this?” James sneered, then raised his hand. His 
Genesis shot toward the Quasar Tribulation Clouds. 

Countless steaks of Quasar Lightning fell from the sky, attacking the group of 
powerhouses. 

At that moment, James slashed out his Judgment Scythe. A 10,000-meter-
long Sword Energy emerged and slashed at them. 

Swoosh! 

The rapid movement of the Sword Energy cut through the air and attacked the 
group of powerhouses. At the same time, the wave of Quasar Lightning kept 
striking, and the agonizing screams resounded continuously. 

The group had faced a lot of casualties. 

Xayvion murmured in shock, “How is this possible? His one attack killed a few 
of the powerhouses at the Yuraeceon Xaelm Rank’s peak instantly?” 

While he was distracted, James charged into the dense lightning. 

Since the Yuraceon Genesis Bell was ineffective in the battle, James had no 
choice but to face his opponents head-on. 

James was at the Yuraeceon Xaelm Rank’s Seventh Tribulation’s peak. With 
the enhancements of the Yuraceon Genesis Bell’s defenses and his Third 
Marciais Combat Form, he was invincible against opponents below the 
Yuraeceon Daelm Rank. 

Every time James slashed out the Judgement Scythe, he would take down 
one of his opponents and destroy their souls. 



The Judgement Scythe shattered a few powerhouses’ Divine Lights, leaving 
them vulnerable to the Quasar Lightning. Their bodies trembled after being 
struck by the lightning. 

The group leaders at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank finally returned to their 
senses and launched united attacks against James. 

“Let me help you!” Truett shouted, then activated his Genesis Divine Light. He 
wielded his giant sword and charged into the dense lightning to kill their 
opponents. 

The two fought against 80 powerhouses ranging from the Yuraeceon Xaelm 
Rank’s Ninth Tribulation to the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank’s Third Tribulation. 

Amidst the Quasar Lightning, the afterimages of swords could be seen. 

The intense battle was in full swing. 

Xitlaly cast a glance at her comrades, then turned around. She quickly 
activated her Genesis Divine Light and rushed to help. 

Meanwhile, Xayvion leisurely sat on a stone and took out a wine gourd. 

“Go on, fight. Both sides should be injured. When I recover to the Yuraeceon 
Daelm Rank’s Fifth Tribulation, it’ll be the end of you all.” 

Just as he finished speaking, two headless bodies flew out of the dense 
lightning and struck him. 

Xayvion pushed off the bodies and grumbled, “Fuck off. What a bunch of 
useless trash.” 

James, Truett and Xitlaly stood back to back, surrounded by five powerhouses 
at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank. 
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injured, but they persevered. On the other hand, James managed to stay 
unharmed with the help of the Yuraeceon Genesis Bell and his Golden Body. 
Even so, he still was disheveled from the intense battle. 



The powerhouses besieging them were not in better states than them. All of 
them were quite injured and had messy hair. Three of them were wounded 
quite severely. 

Xayvion’s group of powerhouses lost all members at the Yuraeceon Xaelm 
Rank’s Ninth Tribulation peak. The other women from the lustus Sect also 
perished in the fight. 

On the battlefield, it was a three versus five. 

James squinted at their opponents and said, “Leave with your wife, Truett. I’d 
be able to fight without any worries that way.” 

Truett snorted, “We agreed to fight and die along with each other. I’d feel 
worse to leave you than to die here.” 

James said, “Alright. You two deal with that powerhouse at the Yuraeceon 
Daelm Rank’s Third Tribulation. Leave the other four at the Yuraeceon Daelm 
Rank’s Fourth Tribulation to me.” 

After speaking, James raised his hand, and four lightning struck the four 
powerhouses at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank’s Fourth Tribulation. 

At the same time, his Judgment Scythe quickly merged with his Golden Body. 

He gripped tightly on his sword and charged forward. 

At the same time, Truett and Xitlaly exchanged glances and immediately 
rushed toward the opponents with the lowest cultivation rank. 

Fierce battles broke out again. 

James fought against four opponents, relying on his exceptional overall 
strength. 

Meanwhile, Truett and Xitlaly relied on their extraordinary talents to face the 
powerhouse at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank’s Third Tribulation. However, they 
barely held him back. 

With Lesia’s guidance, James turned into a lightsaber and fought his four 
opponents. 



Although the Yuraceon Genesis Bell had lost its dreamlike effect, James could 
still merge with it into a sword. Combined with the Quasar Lightning, James 
managed to deal much damage to his opponents. 

Xayvion that both sides were evenly matched and sighed, “James, James…l 
didn’t expect you to have the strength to fight four powerhouses at the 
Yuraeceon Daelm Rank. It seems I shouldn’t continue trying to recover for 
now.” 

As soon as Xayvion stood up, a sudden shout came from behind him. 

“Stop it!” 

Xayvion turned around and saw the hundreds of living beings with powerful 
auras approaching him. 

The leader of the group was a young man in a black robe. 

Xayvion looked at him and said, “Nando? What brings you here?” 

Nando shouted angrily, “Stop them! Otherwise, I won’t hold back.” 

Xayvion hurriedly explained, “That’s James from the Timaeus Sect… 

“Are you listening to me?” Nando suddenly raised his hand and hit Xayvion 
with his Genesis. 

Xayvion was sent flying tens of thousands of meters into the distance, and he 
spat out a mouthful of blood. 

Nando ordered again, “I’m the son of the new alliance’s leader, Nando. 

Everyone stop right now, or else I’ll kill everyone.” 

The living beings fighting fiercely in the void immediately held back. 

James, who was surrounded in the middle, also stopped attacking. The next 
moment, he separated from the sword. 

Nando pointed at James and said, “Everyone come down! How dare you 
touch my friend?! Do you guys want to die?” 
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against James looked at each other in disbelief before finally descending to 
the ground. 

The powerhouse at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank’s Third Tribulation, which 
Truett and Xitlaly besieged, also hurriedly stopped. 

James looked at Nando, who was shouting anxiously. At that moment, he 
found Nando slightly adorable for rushing over so quickly. 

Nando shouted, “Come down here first, Forty-nine! There must be a 
misunderstanding. I’ll give you a satisfactory explanation.” 

‘Misunderstanding?’ James thought to himself, curious to see what kind of 
tricks Nando wanted to pull. 

James landed in front of Nando in a flash. 

Nando hurriedly bowed and clasped his hands, saying tentatively, “There 
must be a misunderstanding, Forty-nine. I’ll teach them a lesson!” 

Xayvion, who was knocked away, had his jaw wide open. He was surprised by 
Nando’s attitude toward James. He thought to himself, ‘How is this possible? 

Why is the dignified young master of the Yaquis Sect so close to James? 
Also, why is he acting so respectful.’ James looked at Nando and asked 
calmly, “What kind of misunderstanding is there?” 

Nando immediately turned around and waved to Xayvion. “Get your ass over 
here!” 

Startled, Xayvion made his way over warily. 

“Dumbass!” Nando punched Xayvion in the face, knocking him to the ground. 

“How dare you disrespect my friend? Who the hell are you? Even though we 
recognize your talent for making elixirs, you’re still a slave. Without us, you’re 
nothing.” 

Faced with Nando’s furious scolding, Xayvion raised his head from the 
ground, covered his cheek, and said, “He’s from the Timaeus Sect…” 

“Shut up!” Nando punched and kicked Xayvion repeatedly. 



“He’s my friend! We’d die for each other! Disrespecting him is disrespecting 
me and the Yaquis Sect! Do you still want to stay with US?” 

James almost burst out laughing while watching Nando beat Xayvion up. It 
was hard to find a good slave like Nando. After being cursed, he was 
obedient, yet because of his status, he was still as arrogant in front of others. 

Finding someone like him who was sensible enough to behave accordingly in 
different situations was hard. 

After beating Xayvion for a while, Nando turned around and looked at James. 

“I’ll leave this piece of shit to you, Forty-nine. It’s up to you whether to kill or 
spare him.” 

“Alright.” James squinted at Xayvion. 

Xayvion’s expression was hostile as he met James’ gaze. He never expected 
James to have so many relationships. 

He thrived in the Timaeus Sect and even defeated Mount Elixir’s Master, a 
powerhouse at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank’s Ninth Tribulation. Now, he even 
knew the Yaquis Sect’s Young Master. 

Nando even beat him up publicly, not leaving him any pride. 

Xayvion was furious after comparing himself to James. Even in the Dark 
World, he could not beat James. It was still the same now that they were in 
the Three Thousand Great Genesis Worlds. Suddenly, he leaped to his feet 
and punched Nando. 

Everyone was stunned by the sight. 
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neck and poured his Genesis into his body, sealing away his cultivation base. 

“Don’t come near me, or else I’ll kill him!” Xayvion roared and retreated with 
Nando as his hostage. 

Nando shouted, “How dare you attack me? You must have a death wish.” 



Xayvion roared, “It’s not my intention to disrespect you! However, you’ve been 
deceived by James. He’s the biggest demon from the Dark Genesis World! 

“The purpose of the new alliance is to wipe out the Dark World, but now you’re 
on good terms with him? How will you explain this to our alliance leader?” 

Everyone in the area immediately stared at James with suspicious 
expressions. 

James looked at Xayvion and said smilingly, “You’re playing the good guy 
now? 

Do you dare to tell them where you’re from, Xayvion?” 

Xayvion’s face immediately darkened. 

Nando, who was being held hostage, exclaimed, “Xayvion? Aren’t you 
Whitaker? Why do you have another name?” 

Xayvion shouted, “His name Forty-nine is fake! His real name is James 
Caden, the biggest demon from the Dark World!” 

James said calmly, “Demon? If I’m a demon, then what are you? You’ve 
consumed a lot of Dark Power, right?” 

“You…” Xayvion trembled from anger. “That’s nonsense!” 

James looked around and said, “Guys, this man’s name isn’t Whitaker. His 
real name is Xayvion. He’s from the Yefteros of the Dark World. Moreover, 
he’s their prince! 

“If we’re talking about a demon, he fits the description perfectly. Go ahead and 
use your Zen to scan him. See for yourself whether there is any malevolent 
energy or Dark Power in him.” 

The surrounding living beings immediately released their Zen simultaneously. 

However, they sensed Dark Power coming from both Xayvion and James. 

At that moment, a powerhouse from the Yaquis Sect stepped forward and 
said, “Could it be both of you are from the Dark World, Mr. Caden?” 



James shook his head, waved the Judgement Scythe, and said, “No. My 
sword carried Dark Power.” 

After answering to him, James put away the Judgement Scythe. Then, he 
looked at the others and said calmly, “Now try it again. Do you still feel Dark 
Power in me?” 

The living beings scanned James again, but James had already asked Lesia 
to hide his Dark Power this time. 

A beautiful woman stepped forward and said, “I don’t sense any Dark Power 
in him now. That must mean Xayvion is really a demon from the Dark World!” 

As soon as the woman spoke, the Yaquis Sect’s powerhouses immediately 
surrounded Xayvion. 

Xayvion became anxious after the tides turned against him. 

“You guys have been deceived! He really is the biggest demon of the Dark 
World. He even killed the Illuminated World’s Lord.” 

Nando, who was being held hostage, shouted, “Bastard, you’re still trying to 
lie? 

Why don’t you just run for your life?” 

With Nando’s sudden reminder, Xayvion quickly reacted. He looked at the 
hundreds of powerhouses from the Yaquis Sect and took a few steps 
backward. 

“Don’t come near me, or I’ll kill him.” 

Immediately afterward, he disappeared with Nando. 

The Yaquis Sect’s powerhouses were anxious after Nando was taken 
hostage. 

Just when they were about to chase after Xayvion, James stopped them. 

James explained, “He won’t be able to leave the Forladtt Land. I have an 
inscription that can contact Nando. I’ll go after them. You guys take care of my 
friend.” 



After speaking, James disappeared in a flash. 
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Power. I’m immortal! I’ll become a never-ending nightmare to you for 
generations to come.” 

After shouting the last sentence, Xayvion cackled wildly. Then, a ball of black 
flames started from his feet, engulfing his body. 

He wore a pained expression as his face kept changing. His skin turned white, 
then colorful, then black. One moment, he had a phoenix head and a human 
body, but the next, he transformed again into a creature with an eagle head 
and a human body. Eventually, his head settled in the form of a cuckoo. 

“We’ll meet again, James…” 

Before Xayvion could finish speaking, James suddenly blew a breath and 
extinguished the flames on Xayvion’s body. 

Xayvion shouted, “How is this possible?” 

James said calmly, “It’s useless to struggle. You know I’ve learned Curse 
Magic from the Dark World, but you are probably unaware I’ve already 
obtained Franciscus’ inheritance. I’ve mastered all kinds of Curse Magic. 

“I’ve already planted eighteen thousand curses on your soul, body and bones. 

Regardless of how strong you are and what kinds of Supernatural Powers you 
have, you won’t be able to escape or reincarnate.” 

“You’re despicable and shameless, James.” 

Livid, Xayvion flew into the sky. 
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Genesis Bell suddenly descended and hovered above him. Immediately 
afterward, it burst out with a gray Historial Light. 



James flashed over, stepped above the Yuraeceon Genesis Bell, and pressed 
down on it. 

Boom! 

With a loud bang, the Yuraeceon Genesis Bell trapped Xayvion and plunged 
into the ground, leaving a huge pit. 

Ding! Ding! Ding! 

The bell rang a few times. 

James sat above the Yuraeceon Genesis Bell in a lotus position and felt a 
potent Genesis flowing into his body. At that moment, his Golden Bod began 
to repair. He sneered, “I thought you really found a way to neutralize the 
Yuraeceon Gensis Bell’s powers. Turns out you simply used a Supernatural 
Power to block your hearing.” 

After speaking, James waved the Judgement Scythe and continued to ring the 
bell. 

Xayvion shouted and cursed in pain but could not escape. 

The bell rang continuously, and the Genesis being absorbed into James’ body 
grew stronger. At that moment, James had enough to make a breakthrough in 
cultivation rank. 

Boom! 

Thick Tribulation Clouds swept over, and lightning about the size of an arm 
immediately shrouded around James. 

James was about to go through the Yuraeceon Xaelm Rank’s Eighth 
Tribulation. 

The Heavenly Tribulation was nothing to James. After all, he had already 
mastered Quasar Lightning. 

Meanwhile, Xayvion was in a miserable state under the Yuraeceon Genesis 
Bell. 

As the bells continued to resound, his Genesis was drained rapidly. He was 
initially at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank’s Fifth Tribulation but gradually kept 



dropping until he was at the Yuraeceon Xaelm Rank. However, it was not over 
yet. 

The bell chimes lasted for a long time. James finally stopped ringing the bell 
and slowly opened his eyes after he felt the Genesis he had been absorbing 
had weakened significantly. 

Immediately afterward, a frightening red light flashed in his eyes, and a 
Genesis Divine Light emitted from his body. 

James raised his hand and said excitedly, “I’m at the peak of the Yuraeceon 
Xaelm Rank’s Ninth Tribulation. I didn’t expect to have improved by two ranks 
just by absorbing the Genesis of someone at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank’s 
Fifth Tribulation.” 

James used his Zen to scan his body and found that he had fully recovered. 

Even better, his physical body was much stronger than before. In addition, his 
Genesis was even more pure and lethal. 

He slowly raised his head and said, “Now I’ll be able to reach the Yuraeceon 
Daelm Rank. I really have to thank you, Xayvion.” 

Xayvion, who was trapped under the Yuraeceon Genesis Bell, was 
unresponsive. 

James jumped to the ground and retracted the Yuraeceon Genesis Bell. He 
saw a terrifying creature with a human body and a cuckoo head curled up 
miserable in the deep pit. 

Judging from Xayvion’s aura, he was no longer at the Yuraeceon Daelm 
Rank. 

James activated his Curse Magic and woke Xayvion up. 

Xayvion screamed and got up from the ground. He glared at James 
ferociously and said, “Y-You’re a monster!” 

James did not bother wasting time talking to him. He immediately used his 
Genesis to force out Xayvion’s soul and signed a slave contract. 

Immediately afterward, he struck Xayvion with his Genesis, instantly turning 
him into a little cuckoo bird. 



James stared at it and said, “Do you want me to make a cage to lock you up 
and let you live in the darkness forever, or would you like to obediently stay on 
my shoulder and cultivate to provide me with Genesis.” 

Xayvion, who had transformed into a cuckoo, did not respond. He fluttered his 
little wings and landed on James’ shoulder. 

James smiled and said, “You’re wise to have made the right decision. I never 
expected to fight with a bird for so long. We’ll live in peace from now on, 
right?” 

‘Live in peace? What a joke. I’m immortal. You made me a bird for now 
because you can’t kill me,’ Xayvion thought to himself, then cast James a 
strange glance. 

At that moment, James used his Zen to locate Nando’s location. He found that 
Nando had already escaped back to the Calidum Spiritual Tree. 

Nando thought Xayvion and James had already perished together and were 
about to take advantage of Xitlaly. 

After finding out about the situation, James immediately activated his Curse 
Magic. Nando immediately dropped to the ground. He shouted and rolled on 
the ground in pain. 

Then, James quickly returned to the Calidum Spiritual Tree with Xayvion on 
his shoulder 
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What’s wrong with you?” 

In the Calidum Spiritual Tree, a woman powerhouse from the Yaquis Sect 
hugged Nando with a worried expression. 

Nando covered his head and screamed, “Quick! Make them stop! stop them 
from clearing out the Four Gurdian Trees! 

The woman asked confusedly, “What do you mean…” 

“Just do it!” Nando rorared. 



The powerhouse from the Yaquis Sect was confused but quickly relayed the 
order. 

At that moment, Xitlaly, who was almost taken advantage of, quickly got up 
and rushed over to Truett, who was wounded and bleeding. 

“Are you okay, Mr. Truett?” 

Truettwas unresponsive. 

Xitlaly shouted anxiously, “You can’t just die, Truett. We just married and 
signed a soul contract with James as a witness. You can’t just leave me 
behind.” 

“Truett, wake up! Truett!” 

While Xitlaly cried anxiously, Truett coughed and finally woke up. 

When he saw Xitlaly’s face full of tears, he hurriedly embraced her and said, 
‘It’s okay. Everything will be alright. I’ll kill them all!” 

Xitlaly also hugged him tightly and said gently, “I’m okay. He didn’t do 
anything to me. I think he had a sudden headache, and I managed to escape.” 

With Xitlaly’s support, Truett slowly got up and said, “Okay, good. Let’s leave 
quickly. I wonder if Forty- nine is alright. We should go search for him.” 

Just when Truett was about to get up, he noticed a few powerhouses at the 
Yuraeceon Xaelm Rank glaring at them. 

Truett squinted his eyes and said, “We’ll have to fight.” 

Xitlaly responded, “Sure.” 

Just after their brief conversation, a Sword Light full of Dark Power slashed at 
the powerhouses from behind, slicing them in half before they could react. 
Their separated bodies fell to the ground. 

Truett immediately shielded in front of Xitlaly but was surprised when he saw 
a handsome man in a black robe approaching them with a long sword. He 
immediately exclaimed, “You’re finally back!” 

Xitlaly was also surprised after seeing James. 



James slowly walked over to them with the Judgement Scythe in his hand. 

Without any explanation, he stuffed two bronze pills into their mouths. 

After swallowing the pill, Truett and Xitlaly felt a majestic energy flowing 
through their bodies. 

The effects seemed much more effective on Truett. His sealed acupoints and 
bones were gradually opened as the potent force flowed through his body. 

The pills that James had fed them were from Xayvion’s storage, called 
Essence Genesis Elixirs. 

Xayvion was a genius who could refine all sorts of elixirs. He even created 
Essence Genesis Elixirs, which could be used to break seals. 

He and a group of powerhouses at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank had 
deliberately sealed their cultivations. After they entered the Forladtt Land, they 
consumed the Essence Genesis Elixirs to recover their strength quickly. 

James looked at the couple and said apologetically, “You two suffered 
because I was reckless.” 
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“We’ll talk about the apology later. I need to kill him first.” After James finished 
speaking, he appeared before Nando. 

Nando struggled to get up, feeling like he had a bad headache. However, 
James’ sudden appearance frightened him. He let out a scream and fell to the 
ground again. 

He crawled over to James like a dog and kowtowed, saying, “I won’t ever dare 
to do it again. Please forgive me. I promise to never…” 

Before he could finish speaking, James had pressed the Judgement Scythe 
on his neck. 

At that moment, a hundred waves of potent Genesis emerged behind Nando, 
forming a protective barrier around him. 



James was immediately knocked away. 

“Forty-nine!!!” Truett quickly rushed over and caught James. 

Xitlaly also quickly took action, allowing James the chance to stabilize himself. 

James raised his head and saw over a hundred powerhouses ranging from 
the Yuraeceon Xaelm Rank and Yuraeceon Daelm Rank standing behind 
Nando. 

He squinted his eyes and slowly took a step forward. Then, a terrifying gray 
light erupted from his body. 

James had activated the Third Marcials Combat Form. 

A middle-aged man standing behind Nando said coldly, “We’ve been waiting 
for you, Mr. Caden. It’s time we eliminate the demon from the Dark World.” 

James sneered, “How confident. I’ve even killed Xayvion, a powerhouse at the 
Yuraeceon Daelm Rank’s Fifth Tribulation. You guys are nothing to me.” 

The powerhouses behind Nando immediately had bewildered expressions. 

Xayvion, who was in the form of a cuckoo on James’ shoulder, glared at him. 
It was clear his gaze was full of disdain. 

Nando immediately got up and shouted, “You can’t do this! You mustn’t fight 
him. If you kill him, I’ll die as well. How will you explain this to my father?” 

The powerhouses from the Yaquis Sect frowned. Their young master was an 
idiot. They would not bother with him if not because of his identity. 

However, their hands were tied. While they hesitated, James leaped into the 
air with the Judgement Scythe. Then, a 10-000 meter-long Sword Energy 
slashed from the sky. 

The Sword Energy swept through the air and immediately killed the 
powerhouses at the Yuraeceon Xaelm Rank. 

The few survivors were at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank. They quickly rose into 
the sky and activated their Genesis Divine Light. 



“His cultivation rank has progressed so fast. He’s already at the peak of the 
Yuraeceon Xaelm Rank’s Ninth Tribulation.” 

“He’s terrifying, almost invincible. I don’t think we can kill him today.” 

“Let’s not think too much about it first. Let’s eradicate him first.” 

James snorted coldly, “Come at me.” 

Immediately afterward, he fused with his Judgement Scythe to form a massive 
sword. Then, he darted at the remaining powerhouses. 

The powerhouses found him crazy to be initiating an attack. All of them had 
shocked expressions. 

Before they could react, the massive Sword Light had already arrived and 
pierced through the body of a powerhouse at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank’s 
Fourth Tribulation. 

The Sword Light’s momentum did not diminish, and it quickly penetrated the 
two more powerhouses at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank’s Third Tribulation. 

A deaefening rumble resounded in the area. 

James eliminated three powerhouses at the Yuraeceon Daelm Rank with just 
one attack. The rest who had survived wore horrified expressions. 

 


