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"No need to pretend to care about me. You are so fake! Besides, Mom prepared this 
bottle of water especially for Kevin. If she gets to know that I drink all of it, she would be 
so angry with me." There was a trace of jealousy in Claire's words. Anyone could tell 
that she was bothered by Leena, because she was the only one being asked and cared 
about by Kevin. 

"Claire, don't forget what you promised me when I let you go to S City with us." Kevin's 
tone was cold. If it had not been for Leena, who had pleaded on Claire's behalf, he 
would not have let Claire come to S City with them and interrupt their perfect married 
life. Now that he had promised to let Claire stay, she should also keep her word and be 
nice to Leena. 

"Fine! I'll just have to keep my mouth shut. Are you satisfied now?" Claire glared at 
Leena with annoyance, as if it was her fault. Well, her brother couldn't be beside her all 
day long to take Leena's side! Claire could wait. She could think of lots of ways to make 
Leena's life miserable while she was in S City. Leena didn't understand what she had 
done to make Claire so furious with her. She thought that Claire was thirsty, so she 
gave her some water to drink, that was all. Why would she think Leena was being fake 
in pretending to care about her? It seemed to Leena that she should be the one keeping 
her mouth shut on this journey back to S City. She would just have to talk less, 
otherwise she would cause more trouble. 

Sitting on the other end of the backseat, Louisa was happy to see this exchange. The 
corner of Louisa's lips lifted as she glanced at Leena, her eyes dripping with mockery 
and disdain. She pretended to comfort Claire. 

"Claire, come on. No need to get upset over such a small thing, right?" Louisa patted 
Claire's shoulder and said in a sickly sweet voice, pretending to be considerate and 
understanding in front of Kevin. 

It didn't go as she hoped for. Kevin's eyebrows furrowed. He was unhappy about what 
Louisa said, but he kept his mouth shut and didn't say another word. He stared at Leena 
intensely through the rearview mirror. He was worried about her. Although they had left 
capital city early this morning, it was already afternoon by the time they arrived in S City. 
There was a traffic jam on the way. Fortunately it was not rush hour, so it wasn't so bad, 
or they could have been trapped there for hours. 



Kevin, is this the apartment you live in? I thought you still lived at the army base." Claire 
raised her head to look at the tall building in front of her. She could tell from the nice 
decorations outside the apartment that it was very pricey. She wondered if her brother 
had spent all the money he had saved buying this apartment. 

"Yeah, I lived at the army base before. But I moved here after marriage. Living in the 
army base is inconvenient for a married man after all. All right, come on. Pick your 
luggage and let's go inside," Kevin replied to his sister's question simply. He didn't ask 
Lee for help, who had to drive Louisa back to her own house. 

"Hey! Kevin, won't you help me carry my luggage?" Claire looked helplessly at the two 
big, heavy suitcases in front of her. She turned to Kevin, her eyes pleading. 

Why did you bring two big suitcases? Do you really have that many things to bring with 
you? Leena and I only have one big suitcase, and it's enough for us." Kevin shook his 
head at his sister, picking up the leather suitcase in front of Claire. He wondered if she 
was planning to stay for a long time. Otherwise, why would she bring so many things 
with her? He really hoped that he was wrong. 

"There are not many things in them. They are just the clothes and shoes that I will be 
wearing. If I hadn't brought them here, would you buy new ones for me?" Claire 
frowned, then picked up the other suitcase and followed them to the elevator. She was 
unhappy that Leena just had the small travel bag with her. Truthfully, it was Claire's own 
fault that she had packed up so many things. She just couldn't help but blame Leena for 
it unreasonably. 

"Well, I understand that you need to take some clothes with you, but you don't need to 
bring your entire closet here!" Once they were in the elevator, Kevin immediately took 
the travel bag from Leena's hand. It looked as if he was afraid that carrying such a small 
bag would exhaust Leena. Upon seeing his action, Claire's mood soured even more. 

"Well, you know, I'm a girl after all. That is what makes us girls, right? I need to change 
my clothes everyday. Besides, I'm going to look for a job here. That way, Louisa will not 
be so lonely here, because I can keep her company." As she talked, Claire's mood 
shifted. She was quite excited about her future life in S City. She was confident that she 
would be happy and successful here. 

"What did you say? You want to look for a job here? Are you kidding? Are you sure that 
you can find a suitable job without Mom and Dad's help?" Kevin didn't expect to hear 
this. Claire wanted to find a job so she could stay here for a long time! He was a bit 
shocked at her words. Would she stay at his place for much longer? He didn't want that 
to happen, because Claire didn't get along with Leena at all, and he wanted to spend 
some time alone with his wife. If Claire lived in his apartment with them for too long, she 
would surely become a nuisance. There went his plan of spending some good time 
alone with Leena. 



"Well, I have you, my dear brother. Won't you help out your loving sister?" Claire tilted 
her head and looked at Kevin with her eyebrows raised. She was sure that he would 
help her. 

"Are you sure the jobs I find will be suitable for you?" Kevin looked her up and down, 
and helplessly shook his head. He didn't think he could help his sister find an 
appropriate job here. 

"As long as it's a respectable job with a high salary, and there is enough freedom to 
work anytime, I would be satisfied." Claire wasn't even joking. She was serious about 
her conditions. She thought it would be easy to find such a job. 

"You really must be dreaming. There is no such job like you just described. No company 
will ever hire you if you demand all that." Kevin let out a deep sigh. If he were an 
employer, he would never hire an employee with demands like those, unless she was 
extremely talented. But unfortunately, his sister was everything but talented. 

"Kevin, don't lower my confidence like that! I haven't even started looking, for God's 
sake, and here you are, already pouring cold water on me." Claire was unhappy about 
her brother's words. She didn't think that her conditions for a job were so impossible to 
meet. According to her, a job with a high salary and the liberty to work any time was just 
standard. 
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"I am advising you to desist from this insane idea before you start looking. In case you 
become the butt of someone's joke." Kevin didn't mean to look down upon his own 
sister. He thought Claire aimed too high, and it would get hard for her to find her footing 
in such a highly competitive society. 

"I'm not that bad. It doesn't matter. I have talent in management and I studied that 
abroad," Claire said, pouting. She displayed strong objection to her brother's remarks. 

Come on. You? Talent? I bet you got your diploma after wasting away years at college," 
Kevin made this conclusion based on his sister's playful personality. 

"How would that be possible? I entered college because of my efforts. Sure, it was not a 
well-known college, but, generally speaking, I spent my years there just like any other 
regular student," Claire replied, frowning. That entrance exam was one eternal scar for 
her! Especially since the major she had chosen was a high-end one. 



"Like you said, you just spent your years there. I doubt if you learnt anything useful," 
Kevin said. He never considered his sister to be great in studies, since her scores at 
school never went beyond 80. It was obvious that she was lazy at studying. Leena didn't 
make any comment on their bickering and just smiled breezily. She was aware of 
Claire's dissatisfaction with her. Leena wasn't so stupid that she'd intervene in this 
argument. It was wise to protect herself from something that unfavorable. 

Wow! Brother, this is a fabulous house! What a great design! It's really classy. You must 
have spent a lot of money and energy on it!" Claire praised. She was stunned by the 
interiors of Kevin's house as she walked in. When they had left for S City, Claire had 
assumed that she would live at the army base upon arriving here. But to her surprise, 
she was to live in this glorious apartment. She didn't want to leave here ever from this 
moment onward. 

"Is it so fabulous? I don't think so!" Kevin said, looking around. He then realized that 
Claire was speaking the truth. He admitted that Leena had made some changes in this 
house. She had bought some fancy furniture for him. 

"You bet. All the furniture here is costly, you can tell it's luxurious." Claire jumped onto 
the soft couch with glee, her hands gliding across the cloth. She made a satisfied 
murmur of admiration. Although their house in Capital City was beautiful, it was still 
different from here. Maybe it was because of the new furniture. This house was splendid 
but not flashy. 

"Claire, you can sleep in the guest room on this floor. I'll go and clean it. Then you can 
move in there, okay?" Leena asked for Claire's opinion, fearing that she would be 
dissatisfied with the arrangement. 

What about upstairs? No guest room there?" Claire glanced at the stairs, wondering 
about the rooms on that floor. 

"No. There's only a guest room here," Leena replied decisively. She didn't want Claire to 
live upstairs with them, even if they had a guest room there. Leena would feel 
uncomfortable living with her. 

"Well, okay! I have no choice then," Claire said in frustration. In her opinion, living 
upstairs was far more preferable to living down here. 

Leena pursed her lips and turned around, walking toward the guest room. She needed 
to see if anything needed to be arranged. Although Claire was never happy with her, for 
Kevin's sake, Leena would still look after her. An old saying said, "Love me, love my 
dog." When it came to Kevin, no matter what difficulties Leena had to face, she would 
confront them all while smiling. 

"Claire, put your luggage in your room. We'll go out for dinner then," Kevin announced 
before taking his and Leena's luggage upstairs. He didn't wait for Claire's response. 



"Okay, I'll do that right away." Claire was excited to hear that they were going to have 
dinner outside. When they were in Capital City, they got almost no opportunities to go 
out for dinner, because they ate at home every day. 

Leena didn't need to do much cleaning or make arrangements. She only needed to 
spread the sheets for Claire. Every room in this house was kept neat and tidy, so there 
should be no problem living here. 

This room?" Claire asked, frowning. She looked around, finding it to be neat and 
comfortable, although it wasn't as big as her room at the house in Capital City. She 
could manage to live here. 

"Yep! Your clothes can be put in this wardrobe. If you need anything else, please let me 
know. I'll set it up for you." Leena looked at the big bed with its new covers in 
satisfaction. They were all her favorite colors. She hoped Claire would like it, since they 
were of similar age and probably had the same aesthetic sense. 

"Got it. You talk too much. You can go now! I'm gonna get changed," Claire said 
impatiently, waving Leena away. 

"All right. Suit yourself," Leena said, before walking out and closing the door behind her. 
She didn't expect Claire to appreciate what she had done for her, but she still felt a bit 
hurt when she was treated by Claire so lousily. 

As she walked into the living room, Leena instantly felt better, even though she didn't 
see Kevin around. She knew he was probably putting their luggage upstairs. Leena 
walked straight into the kitchen to see what ingredients in the refrigerator she could use 
to cook. Otherwise she might need to do some shopping. 

As she stared at the empty refrigerator, Leena put a hand on her forehead. She couldn't 
help but laugh at herself. She had such a bad memory! She had emptied the refrigerator 
before they had left for Capital City, in case the items went stale when they came back. 
She had totally forgotten about that. She must have forgotten to bring back her brain 
with her from Capital City too. 

Leena looked at her watch. 'It is still early for dinner, so I'd better use this time to drive 
out and buy some groceries.' With this thought, she trotted upstairs. Her bags had all 
been carried up there by Kevin. Besides, she needed to fetch her car keys too. Lee took 
her Audi Pikes Peak Quattro to drive Louisa home. Leena guessed her car wouldn't be 
back for a while. 

Nana, is everything arranged for Claire?" Kevin asked when he saw Leena come in. He 
was busy unpacking their luggage. Leena halted in her footsteps when she heard the 
nickname on Kevin's lips. Why was he suddenly calling her that? He used to call her by 
her name before, like everyone else. 



"Um! Yes. There is no food in the refrigerator, so I'm going out to buy some groceries," 
Leena said. She had no intention of asking him to go with her. After all, she wasn't some 
fragile little princess in this house. She had gotten used to this kind of life. Kevin wasn't 
home often, so she had learnt to do a lot of things on her own. 

"Don't bother. We'll go out for dinner later. All of us are very tired after the day-long trip, 
so don't exert yourself." Kevin stopped her with his hand on her arm. Although he was 
only responsible for eating, he didn't want his wife to exhaust herself by cooking for 
them. 

We're going out for dinner? That's not a bad idea. Fine. It's on me tonight." Leena 
accepted Kevin's suggestion with pleasure. She was really tired, and she didn't really 
feel like cooking for dinner. 
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"Well! Okay, then I'll eat like a pig," Kevin teased as he gazed at Leena's pleasant 
smile. His eyes brimmed with affection for her. He could tell that she was more relaxed 
now, since she wasn't behaving as formally as she was back at Capital City. 

"As long as you're not worried about becoming a real pig, I'll offer as much as I can," 
Leena said, her eyes lingering on the busy Kevin. She threw herself on the soft bed and 
took a deep breath. She could smell the light scent of mint on the bed sheets. Leena 
relaxed, feeling right at home. 

"Kiddo, it's impossible to get me fat," Kevin said. He let her unwind and stared at her 
with a smile. He thought she knew about his job. He did training every day. 'How would I 
get fat? It's absurd,' he thought. 

"Kevin, can I ask you a personal question?" Leena asked seriously, propping herself up 
all of a sudden. 

"Ask away. What question? I'll tell you everything but the state secrets," Kevin said, 
turning around and putting his last shirt inside the wardrobe. 

I'm not interested in the state secrets and I'm not a politician, so why would I ask about 
that? I'm not so bored. I'm just curious... why did you address me by that nickname?" 
Leena asked, rolling her eyes. She was a simple girl. Political talks were complicated, 
and she wasn't the right person to ask about it. 

"You really want to know the reason?" Kevin asked. He licked his lips, wondering how 
he should answer her question. He called her by the nickname out of some natural 



instinct of him. The reason why he suddenly addressed her as that was because it 
sounded so intimate. He didn't want to go back to calling her by her first name. To him, 
Nana sounded great. 

Yes. Can you tell me?" Leena asked, her big eyes blinking in expectation. She was 
flustered. She imagined that it was a way for Kevin to show how much he loved her. 

"The reason! The reason is that there's no reason. I just don't want to call you the same 
way as everyone else does," He blurted out. It wasn't the real reason. For a moment, he 
didn't understand his feelings, so he gave her a random answer. 

"Is that so?" Leena was a little disappointed about his answer. She thought he'd say it 
was because the nickname sounded more intimate. Why did he give her such a strange 
answer? 

"What else did you expect? Get up! Freshen up and we'll go out for dinner," Kevin said, 
pulling her out of bed. He didn't feel good seeing the disappointment on Leena's face. 

"Nothing. I didn't expect anything. I should have known about that." Leena laughed at 
herself. 'Am I too greedy? Happiness always seems to pass me by.' 

"Leena, the real reason why I call you Nana is because I care about you very much. It's 
not because I don't want to call you the same as other people. Does this answer make 
you happy?" Kevin sighed and explained to Leena. He didn't want to see her unhappy. 

"Is that really true? Are you sure you're not saying it because you feel sorry for me?" 
Leena raised her head to look up at him. She waited for his answer nervously. 

"Do you think I'm that dull? Hey, be confident in yourself. I will always belong to you." 
Kevin said, pulling her into his arms and kissing her hair tenderly. He wondered what he 
had done to deserve such an admirable girl. She was capable of worrying about him as 
much as she was of being happy for him. 

"This is not about my confidence. It's about the choice you make in your heart. To 
change your choice, I have to make double effort. Both of us know who the girl in your 
heart is, and how dazzling she is," Leena whispered sadly. She had brought it up the 
other day, but it didn't result in anything. Truthfully, she was still a little disappointed. 
She, of all people, deserved a more honest answer from him. 

"Leena, now that you have mentioned this again, I'd like to clear the air. I admit that I 
had feelings for Daisy before, but it was just a passing affection. After Edward showed 
up, I kept telling myself that she was now a girl who had a family of her own. It wasn't 
proper for me to continue having feelings for her, so I decided to move on. I can't say 
that I have no affection for her anymore, but I can assure you that she belongs to my 
past now. That past will never come between us and our life together," 



Kevin promised, his hands holding onto Leena's tightly. He didn't know how much he 
loved Leena, but he knew she was very precious to him. She was like a jewel, and he 
didn't want to lose her. 

"Kevin, am I too evil? I know she is like a scar to you, but I still mention her again and 
again. Is it too cruel?" Leena asked, her body clinging to his. She could hear his strong 
heartbeat. She felt so safe and secure in that moment. It was fine even if he didn't love 
her. If she was allowed to be in his arms, she wouldn't ask for anything else. 

"Kiddo, it was a scar for me earlier. But now, I can't feel it at all. I won't call it cruel, 
because her name doesn't hurt me anymore." As he confessed this to Leena, Kevin felt 
a great sense of relief. It felt like that scar was made centuries ago. 

Are you sure? Will you be so calm when you face Daisy too?" Leena looked at Kevin in 
amazement. She knew he wasn't in love with her, but as long as Daisy didn't have his 
heart anymore, Leena was confident of winning it. She didn't just want his body, she 
wanted his love too. 

"What do you think? Don't forget, Daisy and I are both in the army. If I still had feelings 
for her, I would be exhausted." Kevin felt awkward at the beginning when Daisy had 
found out he liked her. However, he saw that she didn't act distant from him because of 
it. She was so calm and mature about it, and Kevin realized he had to be the same. 

"What about Daisy? Does she know you like her?" Leena asked cautiously, a little 
nervous. She didn't know if her question would irk him. 

"Um. Not only her, even Edward knows about it. She told me that my feelings for her 
were just out of sympathy, not real love. What she said has made me think about it a lot, 
but it seems possible," Kevin said, with a bitter smile on his face. Daisy might be right. 
How could he get over her so easily otherwise? If it had been love, he should have kept 
pursuing her until the end of time. 

"What? Edward knows it, too? Now I know why he always has a problem with you." 
Leena hadn't expected this. She thought that Daisy and Edward didn't know about 
Kevin's unrequited love. No wonder Edward always gave him the cold shoulder. He 
knew Kevin loved his wife previously but married his beloved sister. Edward probably 
didn't think Kevin was a responsible man. Leena pictured him being nice to Kevin. That 
would certainly be strange. 

"Yeah, that's why I always endure their standoffish behavior towards me. After all, I'm 
the guy who made the mistake, right?" Kevin uttered, feeling helpless. If he were 
Edward, he would have behaved the same way! Judging from what he had done, he 
himself wouldn't think he was a reliable man. 



"What about my brother and the others? Do they know about this?" Leena asked 
curiously. A far as she knew, Duke wouldn't be this calm about it if he knew Kevin had 
feelings for Daisy. 
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"I don't think so. It looks like Edward hasn't mentioned that to Duke." Kevin knew very 
well how important Leena was to those powerful men. If they ever got to know that 
Leena was in pain or suffering, Kevin could be in serious trouble. 

"Never let him know that. Otherwise things will get complicated." Leena had a clear 
understanding of her brother's personality and what he was capable of. He wouldn't 
tolerate any wrongdoings towards his sister. 

"The inevitable happens one way or another and there's no escaping from it. We better 
let nature take its course. Fire can't be wrapped up in paper. Why bother yourself in a 
fruitless attempt to hide it from them?" Kevin was quite open-minded about this. He had 
no secrets to hide from others. As long as he was honest and big-hearted, he would be 
fine. 

"But I'm worried about you. You know that Duke gets ill-tempered sometimes, especially 
when I am involved. You should know the consequences better than others." Leena was 
a bit worried. Duke harbored grudges against Kevin already. If he was informed of what 
happened to her, it would mean trouble. 

"Don't worry. I can endure the pain," Kevin answered. He smiled at his wife soothingly. 
As he did so, he released her hands and looked over her, his gaze intense. 

"Why are you staring at me?" Leena asked nervously. It made her feel embarrassed to 
be stared at so passionately. She subconsciously touched her face, fearing that it was 
smeared by mud or something. 

"It just occurred to me how bright and beautiful my wife is." Leena's innocent face was 
charming and her luscious figure was tantalizing. Kevin reached out and chucked her 
under the chin. He was grateful to her. When he had felt let down and been extremely 
disappointed, Leena decided to marry him. As a result of that, he stopped pitying 
himself and managed to pull himself together. 

"So? Don't you know that you found a treasure when you married me?" Hearing his 
explanation, Leena felt close to Kevin for the very first time. This man finally belonged to 
her. Although it was a long road before Kevin truly fell in love with her, that day would 



certainly come, wouldn't it? Leena was willing to give up everything if it meant that day 
would arrive. She had to win over his love. 

"The more you get, the more you want. Now scoot and get dressed. We can't keep 
Claire waiting. She's likely to get impatient and come upstairs, demanding us to hurry 
up." Kevin pinched her adorable cheeks. Deep down in his heart he realized what 
Leena meant, but he couldn't admit it in front of her. Otherwise, she would get arrogant 
and tease him. 

"Do I really need to change my clothes if we are just going out for dinner?" Leena 
looked at herself in the mirror, finding her clothes to be fine. They had traveled quite a 
distance today, but she didn't see the need to change into something else. 

"Are you sure you want to wear these warm clothes around the city? Don't forget the 
temperature here is a lot higher than it is in Capital City." Kevin gazed at Leena in 
amusement, wondering how she forgot about the weather she had been so accustomed 
to all these years. 

"Yes, you're right. It's damn hot out there. I feel even hotter because I haven't taken off 
these warm clothes." In hindsight, she realized how stupidly dependent on Kevin she 
had become. She had gotten so used to being looked after by her husband. 

"Darling, I am beginning to wonder how you managed your life when I was away," Kevin 
said. He found it funny to imagine the life Leena must have lived alone, in the past. 

"I just got confused. Wait a minute for me, I'll get ready quickly," Leena said in haste. 
She loved the pleasant climate in S City. The temperature difference wasn't large in all 
the four seasons. 

"Well, Don't rush. Take your time. I'll wait downstairs." Kevin usually wore a shirt and tie. 
All he needed was a light coat to ward off the cold in the early winter of S City. 

"Fine. Please don't forget to take the car keys." Leena looked for suitable clothes in her 
closet. Now that she was back in her own house, she didn't feel forced to wear so-called 
appropriate clothes to see her in-laws. She could choose the clothes she liked, such as 
the popular, expensive and avant-garde ones that were normally the first choice of 
designers. She looked more like a model than a renowned designer in them. 

"Are you sure you want to wear these warm clothes around the city? Don't forget the 
temperature here is a lot higher than it is in Capital City." Kevin gazed at Leena in 
amusement, wondering how she forgot about the weather she had been so accustomed 
to all these years. 

"Yes, you're right. It's damn hot out there. I feel even hotter because I haven't taken off 
these warm clothes." In hindsight, she realized how stupidly dependent on Kevin she 
had become. She had gotten so used to being looked after by her husband. 



Darling, I am beginning to wonder how you managed your life when I was away," Kevin 
said. He found it funny to imagine the life Leena must have lived alone, in the past. 

I just got confused. Wait a minute for me, I'll get ready quickly," Leena said in haste. 
She loved the pleasant climate in S City. The temperature difference wasn't large in all 
the four seasons. "Well, Don't rush. Take your time. I'll wait downstairs." Kevin usually 
wore a shirt and tie. All he needed was a light coat to ward off the cold in the early 
winter of S City. 

Fine. Please don't forget to take the car keys." Leena looked for suitable clothes in her 
closet. Now that she was back in her own house, she didn't feel forced to wear so-called 
appropriate clothes to see her in-laws. She could choose the clothes she liked, such as 
the popular, expensive and avant-garde ones that were normally the first choice of 
designers. She looked more like a model than a renowned designer in them. 

"I won't. Rest assured. I'm not as absent-minded as you are." Kevin was about to take 
the keys of Leena's Ferrari sports car, but stopped on second thought. He chose his 
own Bugatti, since Leena's sports car only had two seats. 

Claire was already dressed up for dinner. Impatiently, she waited downstairs for a long 
time, but Leena and Kevin didn't show up. She was about to yell at them when she saw 
Kevin come downstairs. "Kevin, what took you so long?" Claire asked in irritation. "Didn't 
you know I was waiting for you here?" 

No need to get mad. I'm here now, don't you see? What's the rush? It's still early," Kevin 
answered. He deliberately kept from Claire the reason he was late. He was talking to 
Leena about something important, so Claire had to wait. 

"Why are you alone? Where is Leena? Don't tell me she is still dressing up? No matter 
how long she takes, she would still look old-fashioned and ordinary," Claire derided as a 
lopsided grin lingered around the corners of her mouth. Although she hated Leena, she 
didn't really dare to go too far in front of her brother. Reluctantly, Claire had to watch her 
mouth and not disrespect Leena, and even pretend to be nice. 
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"Claire, I am warning you once again. I hope you can enjoy a good time with Leena in 
the city. Otherwise, be sure that I will send you back home. Besides, Leena's family is a 
lot more well-known than you think. She just doesn't want to be thought of as one of 
those rich girls from powerful families. She chose to keep a low profile and endure your 
insults again and again. I am supposed to respect her wishes and so I didn't intervene. 
But now that you have decided to stay here, you'll discover many more secrets about 



her. By then, I'm sure you'll regret everything you have done to Leena," Kevin said 
sternly. 

Kevin had kept the knowledge of Leena's wealthy family from Claire since Leena wished 
to keep the secret to herself and he had to respect her wish. Rich as she was, Leena 
was also independent and open-minded, and she knew what was right for herself. So 
Kevin had decided not to make any decisions on her behalf. 

"What secrets? Are you talking about me?" Leena asked loudly, suddenly arriving at the 
scene. She walked downstairs. She had heard part of Kevin's conversation with Claire, 
and couldn't help but be curious about what they were discussing. 

"It's your guess," Kevin answered, smiling. He looked over Leena up and down. 
Apparently, his wife had finally decided to be herself again, instead of pretending to be 
someone else in front of his family. She must have been tired of being discreet and 
mature. Today, she looked like the lovely princess she actually was. 

"What? Are you actually Leena? Or just some fucking imposter?" Claire shouted in 
disbelief. She was shocked to see Leena in the fashionable clothes. How could this 
woman, as beautiful as a supermodel, be the same girl she had come to know in Capital 
City, whom Claire considered to be ordinary, old-fashioned, and even ugly? 

"What are you talking about? Did I miss something? Kevin, is there something wrong 
with me?" Leena asked, ill at ease. She was wearing a pair of most fashionable dark 
blue pencil pants, and a low-cut lacy shirt covered by an expensive fur coat. The outfit 
made her look cute and alluring at the same time. 

"No, you're all right. Claire's just being silly. Ha!" Kevin burst into laughter. He couldn't 
blame Claire for sounding so shocked and rude when she saw Leena come down the 
stairs. This was Leena's true side. She had behaved differently in a thousand ways at 
Capital City. Leena chose to hide her charm and beauty to please Kevin's parents, 
pretending to be old-fashioned and mature instead. Kevin had persuaded her to be 
herself, regardless of his parents' likes and dislikes. But Leena had her own way in the 
end, claiming that she couldn't be her childish self in front of her husband's family. 

"Oh! I see." Leena winked at Claire mischievously. She realized the reason for the 
shocked expression on Claire's face. She must be upset by the enormous differences 
between the old and new Leena. 

"Fuck off. Don't be so arrogant. You are only wearing different clothes, which doesn't 
change anything about you," Claire said reluctantly, her awkwardness obvious. Her 
mouth curled. Obviously, Leena was much better than her when it came to fashion. 
What was worse was that Leena's snow-white skin scored her many points. Claire was 
incomparable. 



"Let's hit the road. And stay away from Claire. She has a big mouth. Don't quarrel with 
her, otherwise you'll only frustrate yourself," Kevin said. He knew only something drastic 
could change Claire's biased opinions about Leena. Her relationship with Leena could 
not transform overnight. On the other hand, it was fortunate that Leena usually turned a 
deaf ear to Claire's criticism and taunts. It would be awful if they got into a quarrel one 
day. 

"Okay. I see." Leena deliberately played the mature woman and agreed with what Kevin 
said. She wanted nothing but to see Claire getting pissed off, stomping her foot and 
shouting at her. Back in Capital City, Claire was always making trouble for Leena and 
attempting to pick a fight with her. For the sake of Kevin's parents, Leena had to 
swallow her anger and behave herself. But now since they were in S City, Leena found 
it necessary to teach Claire a lesson and clue her in some ground rules. Claire should 
know better than to think that Leena was a weak woman whom she could provoke 
easily. 

"Quit being naughty!" Kevin said. He shrugged, already knowing what Leena planned to 
do next. He decided to step aside and become an observer. In his opinion, she was a 
smart and thoughtful girl who knew what she was doing. 

"Stop running away! And don't you look down on me," Claire yelled, trying to catch up 
with them as they left the house. Noticing that her existence was being ignored while 
Leena and Kevin flirted with each other right in front of her, Claire couldn't refrain herself 
any longer and grew angry. She knew she was the subject of their conversation. 

"Why should we care about your feelings? You're too old to be looked after by others. 
You're a grown-up, you should learn how to do things on your own," Leena said. She 
was highly amused at the expression on Claire's face. She finally had the opportunity to 
get her revenge and reprimand Claire. Claire had been so arrogant in Capital City. 
Leena had to swallow her anger and do what she was ordered. It was different now. 
This was her city and Leena would be the one giving Claire orders. Nobody dared to 
use Leena as a punching bag. Not her parents, not her brothers. However, Claire had 
an exaggerated opinion of her abilities and had forced her to kneel and surrender. It 
was time to strike back. 

Kevin, why are you standing there and doing nothing? Didn't you hear what she just 
said to me?" Claire yelled hysterically. She finally caught up to them as they reached 
the elevator. Claire didn't want to be left behind or be considered a pathetic clown. As 
Kevin's only sister, she had the natural right to be loved and looked after by her brother, 
didn't she? 
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"Claire, I am warning you once again. I hope you can enjoy a good time with Leena in 
the city. Otherwise, be sure that I will send you back home. Besides, Leena's family is a 
lot more well-known than you think. She just doesn't want to be thought of as one of 
those rich girls from powerful families. She chose to keep a low profile and endure your 
insults again and again. I am supposed to respect her wishes and so I didn't intervene. 
But now that you have decided to stay here, you'll discover many more secrets about 
her. By then, I'm sure you'll regret everything you have done to Leena," Kevin said 
sternly. 

Kevin had kept the knowledge of Leena's wealthy family from Claire since Leena wished 
to keep the secret to herself and he had to respect her wish. Rich as she was, Leena 
was also independent and open-minded, and she knew what was right for herself. So 
Kevin had decided not to make any decisions on her behalf. 

"What secrets? Are you talking about me?" Leena asked loudly, suddenly arriving at the 
scene. She walked downstairs. She had heard part of Kevin's conversation with Claire, 
and couldn't help but be curious about what they were discussing. 

"It's your guess," Kevin answered, smiling. He looked over Leena up and down. 
Apparently, his wife had finally decided to be herself again, instead of pretending to be 
someone else in front of his family. She must have been tired of being discreet and 
mature. Today, she looked like the lovely princess she actually was. 

"What? Are you actually Leena? Or just some fucking imposter?" Claire shouted in 
disbelief. She was shocked to see Leena in the fashionable clothes. How could this 
woman, as beautiful as a supermodel, be the same girl she had come to know in Capital 
City, whom Claire considered to be ordinary, old-fashioned, and even ugly? 

"What are you talking about? Did I miss something? Kevin, is there something wrong 
with me?" Leena asked, ill at ease. She was wearing a pair of most fashionable dark 
blue pencil pants, and a low-cut lacy shirt covered by an expensive fur coat. The outfit 
made her look cute and alluring at the same time. 

"No, you're all right. Claire's just being silly. Ha!" Kevin burst into laughter. He couldn't 
blame Claire for sounding so shocked and rude when she saw Leena come down the 
stairs. This was Leena's true side. She had behaved differently in a thousand ways at 
Capital City. Leena chose to hide her charm and beauty to please Kevin's parents, 
pretending to be old-fashioned and mature instead. Kevin had persuaded her to be 
herself, regardless of his parents' likes and dislikes. But Leena had her own way in the 
end, claiming that she couldn't be her childish self in front of her husband's family. 

"Oh! I see." Leena winked at Claire mischievously. She realized the reason for the 
shocked expression on Claire's face. She must be upset by the enormous differences 
between the old and new Leena. 



"Fuck off. Don't be so arrogant. You are only wearing different clothes, which doesn't 
change anything about you," Claire said reluctantly, her awkwardness obvious. Her 
mouth curled. Obviously, Leena was much better than her when it came to fashion. 
What was worse was that Leena's snow-white skin scored her many points. Claire was 
incomparable. 

"Let's hit the road. And stay away from Claire. She has a big mouth. Don't quarrel with 
her, otherwise you'll only frustrate yourself," Kevin said. He knew only something drastic 
could change Claire's biased opinions about Leena. Her relationship with Leena could 
not transform overnight. On the other hand, it was fortunate that Leena usually turned a 
deaf ear to Claire's criticism and taunts. It would be awful if they got into a quarrel one 
day. 

"Okay. I see." Leena deliberately played the mature woman and agreed with what Kevin 
said. She wanted nothing but to see Claire getting pissed off, stomping her foot and 
shouting at her. Back in Capital City, Claire was always making trouble for Leena and 
attempting to pick a fight with her. For the sake of Kevin's parents, Leena had to 
swallow her anger and behave herself. But now since they were in S City, Leena found 
it necessary to teach Claire a lesson and clue her in some ground rules. Claire should 
know better than to think that Leena was a weak woman whom she could provoke 
easily. 

"Quit being naughty!" Kevin said. He shrugged, already knowing what Leena planned to 
do next. He decided to step aside and become an observer. In his opinion, she was a 
smart and thoughtful girl who knew what she was doing. 

"Stop running away! And don't you look down on me," Claire yelled, trying to catch up 
with them as they left the house. Noticing that her existence was being ignored while 
Leena and Kevin flirted with each other right in front of her, Claire couldn't refrain herself 
any longer and grew angry. She knew she was the subject of their conversation. 

"Why should we care about your feelings? You're too old to be looked after by others. 
You're a grown-up, you should learn how to do things on your own," Leena said. She 
was highly amused at the expression on Claire's face. She finally had the opportunity to 
get her revenge and reprimand Claire. Claire had been so arrogant in Capital City. 
Leena had to swallow her anger and do what she was ordered. It was different now. 
This was her city and Leena would be the one giving Claire orders. Nobody dared to 
use Leena as a punching bag. Not her parents, not her brothers. However, Claire had 
an exaggerated opinion of her abilities and had forced her to kneel and surrender. It 
was time to strike back. 

Kevin, why are you standing there and doing nothing? Didn't you hear what she just 
said to me?" Claire yelled hysterically. She finally caught up to them as they reached 
the elevator. Claire didn't want to be left behind or be considered a pathetic clown. As 
Kevin's only sister, she had the natural right to be loved and looked after by her brother, 
didn't she? 
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"Why should I defend you? As far as I'm concerned, Leena is right," Kevin answered 
coolly. He pressed the pause button on the elevator's control panel and allowed Claire 
to come inside. 

"I see. You were pretending to be well-behaved and nice to fool Dad and Mom. As soon 
as you came back to your own house, you just couldn't wait to show your true self," 
Claire huffed in irritation. She glared at Leena accusingly and in disbelief, not quite 
registering the fact that the weak and soft Leena had the nerve to stand up to her. She 
seemed so different. 

"I'm sorry, Claire. But you are right. If you are offended, just let it be and don't say 
another word," Leena retorted sharply. Her response shocked Claire once again and 
was a huge blow to her ego. Leena smiled sweetly. As Kevin's wife, she was 
determined to convince Claire, one way or another, to get rid of her bad habits of being 
wild, self-willed and ungrateful. She had been spoiled by her family since she was born. 
If Claire didn't change, she was doomed and wouldn't find herself a suitable husband. 
No matter how kind and tolerant men were these days, they wouldn't accept such an 
uncontrollable wife. 

Kevin zipped up his mouth and decided to let Claire have a taste of her own medicine. 
Truthfully, he would feel delighted to see it happen. 

"I know women can be erratic, but I never thought you were the worst of the lot. I really 
underestimated you," Claire voiced out in a mocking voice. Her mouth twisted in a 
contemptuous sneer. She realized suddenly that she had been fooled by Leena. She 
had tried desperately to uncover Leena's true side, but had failed to do so. There is an 
old saying that goes, 'People shouldn't be judged by their looks.' Claire finally knew 
what that meant, now that she had seen Leena for who she was. 

"Claire, let me give you a piece of advice. Despite their superficial resemblances, things 
can be very different in their essence. Just take human beings as an example. People 
can be really evil, although sometimes they seem to be amiable and kind." Leena 
wanted her to realize that Louisa wasn't as much of a friend to her as she pretended to 
be. 

What do you mean? Are you accusing me of something?" Claire had intended to 
squeeze in between Leena and Kevin. It was in vain, since Kevin chose to stand close 
to Leena, forcing Claire to step aside. 



"If you think so, sure. I have got nothing else to say," Leena answered. She decided to 
adopt a neutral position. As far as she was concerned, Claire wasn't a bad woman. To 
tell the truth, she was just a spoiled rich girl. If Claire was guided properly, she would be 
lovely and charming, rather than mean and repulsive. 

"Kevin, what's wrong with her? Shouldn't you discipline your wife?" Claire wasn't brave 
enough to be arrogant when her parents weren't with her. So she asked her brother for 
help. 

Listen to Leena. Although she is younger than you, she is smarter and more thoughtful. 
I know you have always been a spoiled girl, but you really get carried away sometimes. 
It's time that Leena taught you a lesson and showed you how to be a decent lady." 
Kevin was impressed with Leena. Claire was his beloved sister and he hoped she could 
live a better life. If Leena could transform Claire, it would be a real blessing to Kevin's 
family. 

"Why should I listen to her?" Claire pressed her lips together. A look of pure hatred 
flashed in her eyes. However, she couldn't confront Leena directly since Kevin had 
decided to side with his wife. 

"Leena is my wife and your sister-in-law. Isn't that good enough for you to show her 
some respect?" As they reached the parking lot, Kevin pressed a button on his car keys. 
They walked in the direction of the car. 

"I have never considered her my sister-in-law," Claire said haughtily. Although she had 
spoken in a small voice, Kevin heard her anyway. His trainings as a soldier had made 
him extremely sensitive to faint noises. However, Kevin chose to remain silent. He didn't 
intend to embarrass Claire in front of Leena. 

"Wow! Bro, it's Bugatti. Since when have you become so rich? This is very strange. 
Wait a minute, tell me the truth. Are you taking bribes?" Claire should have cheered up 
seeing her brother's luxury car. However, as she stopped to think about it, she 
wondered how her brother got his hands on that kind of money. A luxurious house and 
luxurious cars. It was more likely that Kevin was taking bribes, because as far as she 
knew, he had never asked their parents for money. He was old enough to be earning 
quite enough on his own. 

"Sis, what are you thinking about? I won't do anything that violates the law and order. 
Dad would surely skin me alive," Kevin said, struck at her words. He hit Claire's head 
softly, annoyed that his sister would consider him to be a dirty soldier. Kevin was a man 
of strict moral principles. He would never allow himself to smear his reputation and ruin 
his own career. 

"In that case, how did you get so much money? Did you get it from Mom?" Claire 
massaged her head. Although Kevin hadn't hit her too hard, she didn't like him doing it. 



"I'm a grown man and won't ask Mom for money. Please set your mind at rest. I'm 
earning money legally. There's no way that I will be court martialled." Kevin opened the 
car door, ushering Leena into the passenger seat. He wouldn't be out of money even if 
he was denied his income from the bar. After all, he rendered outstanding services 
every year, and was awarded with a great deal of money and rewards. Of course, all 
this was restrictive. He wasn't as rich as Leena's brothers. 
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"Really?" Claire was doubtful when she stepped into the car. She couldn't believe what 
Kevin said. Her brother's salary as a military officer was never enough for him to afford 
a luxurious life. It was still the government that was paying them regardless of how high 
their positions were. Thus, there was no soldier who had ever become a millionaire due 
to their limited salaries. So how was it possible for Kevin to purchase such a fancy 
house and cars? He couldn't afford them! Moreover, he bought those branded clothes 
and shoes like he just paid them with wasted papers and not money. That was just 
unbelievable! 

"What do you mean, Claire? Do I need to steal and rob just to polish myself?" Kevin 
glanced at his sister disapprovingly as he fastened his seatbelt. He was silent when he 
started the engine and slowly drove off. 

"Steal and rob? That is just ridiculous! I just felt puzzled, okay?" Claire was excited for 
her first trip to S City. It was just within a minute when her attention got caught by the 
scenery that was passing by. It was easy to say that S City was quickly progressing into 
a very lively area. She could see a lot of buildings and streets that had been 
constructed. Everything was screaming development and economic advancement in S 
City. It was like a breath of fresh air to Claire as she had gotten so used to the ancient 
cultural atmosphere of the city she was from. 

On the other hand, Leena stayed quiet the whole time as she didn't want to interfere 
with the siblings' conversation. The two might have a lot to talk about. She chose not to 
feed Claire's curiosity about her brother's income even if she knew about it. It was 
forbidden for military officers to run a business. Kevin had been very clear with that 
when he told her about it. Leena wouldn't want to leak his secret to anyone, even to his 
younger sister. 

"Leena, do you have any restaurant in mind?" Kevin turned and asked. He needed to 
know Leena's opinion as she was the one to pay the bill. 



"Claire, what's your opinion? Western food or Chinese food?" As thoughtful as Leena 
always was, she turned to Claire. It had been a habit for her to inquire about others 
before making decisions. 

"Of course, Western food! My life is already full of Chinese food. I honestly miss 
everything Western nowadays," said Claire with a grin. She had been outside the 
country for a while and had her filled with Western cuisines. However, it wasn't just the 
taste that she missed about Western foods. It was actually the luxury and elegance one 
felt when eating such. So high-class and fab! It felt like she had been eating too many 
Chinese foods since she came back to China. 

"Okay! I know where we should go. To Westin, Kevin!" Leena made the decision as 
soon as Claire finished speaking. Confidence was in her voice as she knew that she 
could satisfy everything her sister-in-law would ask for as long as it was in S City. 

"Got it. Westin it is," replied Kevin in an obedient tone. He slightly turned the steering 
wheel and drove toward another direction. 

Westin was already a sea of noise and commotion when they arrived. The dining hall 
was crammed with guests. Everyone's voices and clanking utensils were filling the place 
with noises from wall to wall. There was no way to deny that Westin was one of the 
city's most popular restaurants. 

"Wow! What a crowd!" Claire was beyond amazed as she looked around. As far as she 
recalled, most of the Western restaurants were not welcomed in China. She didn't really 
expect such a number of people in this place. 

That's not strange as Westin is the number one Western restaurant in S City. It ranks 
first both for its food and interior design." Kevin spoke to Claire in a calm manner. He 
wasn't really a regular in Westin. He just came here a couple of times on invitations. 

"I think the price must be among the top as well!" The lady pursed her lips as she talked 
to her brother. It was easy to see that everyone in there was dressed up beautifully. 
There was no doubt that Westin was only for rich people. 

"You are right. Don't worry about the price though. The dinner will be on your sister-in-
law's treat. I'm sure that she will not lend you here as collateral in case she doesn't 
pay." Kevin said with a slight laugh. He was having his time joking with his sister. 

"Huh! Actually, I worry because she is the one to pay. On the other hand, it is still your 
money that she will use even if she said that it is on her treat. It is like being famous 
without paying anything. What a nice business!" The lady smirked and shot Leena with 
a contemptuous glare. She even remained with her disdainful expression as she 
followed Leena and Kevin across the place. 



"All tables are occupied," concluded Kevin after surveying the place. There seemed to 
be no seat available for them as it was the peak hour. 

That's all right. We can dine in the compartment!" Leena said. Worry was out of her 
mind as she knew that there was a compartment in that restaurant for special guests. 
She didn't think that the lack of seat should be considered a problem at all. 

"Is there a compartment?" The man gave the place another look. He'd been in the place 
for a few times but never had he thought that the restaurant actually had such a section. 

"Yes! There is a compartment but it is not open to the guests. No worries, I can use it. 
Just follow me," was Leena's calm reply. She didn't really use the compartment often. 
Compared to dining alone in a lonely compartment, it was better to dine in the hall 
where the atmosphere was livelier and warmer. It was just that she had to use the 
compartment this time as there was no available table outside. 

"You sounded like you know the boss of this restaurant, do you?" asked Kevin with a 
frown. Now he could not help but guess who among Leena's close brothers owned 
Westin. 

"I know him of course! Westin is a property of FX International Group. Do you think I 
should not know the boss of Westin?" Leena flashed a smile at Kevin and Claire. Little 
did her sister-in-law know that her specific request just saved her a sum of money. She 
never paid for anything while dining in Westin. 

"Oh! I got it. I never expected that Edward owns this place." Realization finally hit Kevin. 
Although FX International Group had many assets and branches across the whole 
country, never had he imagined for it to engage in so many industries as to cover 
Western food restaurant. 
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"Mrs. Gu." They were already at the compartment's entrance when a manager came 
and addressed Leena respectfully. Everybody in the place knew her as she often visited 
here with Edward. 

"Aha, Manager Liu. Is the compartment reserved? Will Edward come here tonight?" 
Leena asked in a graceful manner with a smiling face. 



"The compartment is available. Mr. Mu hasn't been here for a long time. Even his close 
friends who usually come here with Mr. Mu haven't been around for a while." Manager 
Liu smiled politely. He would never dare to neglect any of Leena's questions as he knew 
her relationship with his boss. 

"They must have been very busy! I want to use the compartment since it's available." A 
playful smile cracked Leena's lips as she looked at the manager. Of course, she knew 
what Edward and his friends were busy about! Edward could not even keep his hands 
off Daisy for a single moment. Rain was sent to Thailand. Tom took no interest in 
anything except for his experiments. How could it be possible for them to come here 
and eat? 

"Yes, Mrs. Gu. Please come in." The manager pushed the door open for them as a 
gesture for them to come in. 

"Thank you, Manager Liu!" said Leena pleasantly. She believed in treating everyone 
nicely. It was impossible for her to put on airs against anybody. It was the reason why 
she was famous to many people. 

"You're welcome, Mrs. Gu. We are promoting some new dishes recently. Would you 
want to have a try?" Manager Liu guided them to the compartment and made the 
promotion as soon as they reached their seats. 

"Oh! Really? What are the guests' opinions about the new dishes?" Other people's 
opinion meant a lot to Leena. She had practiced taking ideas from others before trying 
out new things. 

"The new dishes are welcomed by our guests as they are both aristocratic and tasty. 
Many guests revisited Westin just because of them. Would you want to have a try of 
those new products, Mrs. Gu?" The manager sounded tentative. He knew how to please 
his guest as a professional. As far as he observed, Leena was one of those women who 
were sensitive to every kind of new things and liked to welcome fresh challenges. That 
was the reason why he offered her their new dishes rather than the usual things she 
ordered. The great popularity of those new dishes among the guests was just a second 
reason for him. 

"Since you recommend them so earnestly, I'd like to have a try. I'm really curious how 
tasty they are. How about you, Kevin? Would you want to order the same as mine or 
something else?" There was excitement in Leena's eyes as she talked. Like many girls, 
Leena was caught between her desire for delicious foods and her thirst to keep herself 
slender. Nonetheless, she would not even give a second thought about cheating her 
diet when she heard of new foods. 

"Everything is okay for me. How about you, Claire?" Kevin was not particular about 
food. Every kind of food would mean the same to him as long as it didn't fall into the 
category that he extremely disliked. 



"I will not take the same food as she ordered! I want to have lobster and beefsteak. 
That's all. Nothing else." The manager's flattering attitude had already aroused 
suspicion within Claire. She might be reluctant to ask but she could sense it that the 
manager had always been hospitable to Leena. She just disliked Leena regardless of 
what she would do! The male manager's sincere behavior towards her sister-in-law had 
no doubt intensified her hatred for Leena. 

"Well, Manager Liu. Please serve Kevin and me the same food. It's lobster and 
beefsteak for the lady. Thank you!" Leena said while casting a look at Kevin. It felt nice 
to see Kevin agree and support her decisions regardless of how trivial or small the 
matter was. 

"Okay. I will let them serve the dishes as soon as possible. Please wait for a moment." 
Manager Liu nodded before leaving the compartment. 

"The service in this restaurant is quite good. That guy behaved like a waiter instead of a 
manager. He is quite different from those arrogant managers I have met. It seems a big 
restaurant is really better than those small ones." Claire was born into a military family. 
Due to her parents, almost all the people around her had high positions in the army and 
government. It was rare for her to get in contact with some senior executive people in 
the business circle. Thus, she had assumed that every high ranking executive in a 
company would be exactly like those poker-faced militaries or governmental seniors she 
knew. 

"Manager Liu doesn't treat everybody that way. It depends on who the guest is," said 
Kevin with a smile. If Edward, Rain, and Tom hadn't treated Leena as their little 
princess, Manager Liu would have never treated Leena as a queen. 

"Kevin, are you implying that that manager has known who you are?" For her prejudice 
against Leena, Claire didn't believe that Manager Liu was flattering her sister-in-law. 
She didn't think that she was that important. However, it was a fact that Leena was the 
only one who Manager Liu had kept talking with since they walked in. It was just that 
Claire was ignorant to even notice it. 

"Of course not. The only reason why he is treating us politely is because of your sister-
in-law." Kevin was unwilling to claim the credit belonging to Leena. His life had always 
been limited to the military circle. How could it be possible for him to know some 
commercial elites? Besides, it would cause him some trouble if he was considered to be 
too close with some businessmen. 

"Really? How is it possible?" Claire measured Leena in suspicion. To her surprise, she 
did spot some changes in Leena's behavior and air. She was a different woman when 
she was in the capital city. Leena used to be calm and composed. But she looked more 
lively and bubbly now. 



"We come here for dinner, not for interrogation, Claire!" The handsome officer could not 
help but furrow his eyebrows. Claire's questions were outright silly and her disrespect 
for his wife had certainly upset him. 

I'm just curious! Is it illegal to ask?" Claire twisted her lips sarcastically as some ideas 
came to her head. 'Is it possible that Leena isn't as simple as she seems to be?' she 
secretly asked herself. 

"Claire, I can answer all your questions. What are your questions?" Leena butted into 
the conversation. She had sensed that Kevin already lost his temper with how his sister 
had been asking offending questions. 

All right. I'm not interested in your affairs. They're none of my business!" was Claire's 
arrogant reply as she raised her chin. She held no gratitude for Leena. She didn't even 
care if Leena had saved her from her brother's anger by diverting his attention. 
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"Okay! But as I said, you can ask me anything if you have any questions." A kind smile 
broke across Leena's face. Her good upbringing had forged her a forgiving nature. As 
Kevin's wife, she had more patience for his sister. Life was too long anyway. She 
wouldn't mind spending some time winning Claire's approval. 

"Maybe In the future. I'm not sure that you can give me the answer that I want to know 
though!" Claire showed her disapproval by curling her lips on Leena. She said each of 
her words between clenched teeth. She just could not help despising Leena from the 
bottom of her heart. 

"Leena, just leave her alone. Do you want to drink some water?" Kevin had noticed one 
of Leena's bad habits since they started to live together. She seldom drank water. That 
was why he kept reminding Leena to drink whenever necessary. 

"Okay, thank you, Kevin." Leena covered her uneasiness with a sweet smile. She was 
honestly worried about how the future would be. Claire's wantonness was beyond her 
expectation. It wouldn't be easy to get along with her, although she had already 
prepared herself for it. 

For Leena's VIP status, all dishes were served to them very soon. To distinguish 
Leena's importance, it was even the manager who served the dishes for them in person. 



"Mrs. Gu, please have a try of the dishes. Just let me know if they fail you. I'll arrange 
other dishes for you." Manager Liu stared at Leena with sheer expectation. He was 
afraid for his recommendation to disappoint his guest. 

"All right, I'll take some of them to see if they are as fantastic as you said." Leena cut a 
slice of meat and put it into her mouth. The juiciness of the dish spread through her 
tongue immediately. It was so good that it had conquered all her senses. 

How is it?" The manager looked at Leena nervously. He could not tear his gaze from 
her face as the slightest change in her expression would mean a difference in his career 
life. 

"Wow! This is wonderful. The meat is both fresh and tender. It doesn't taste raw and the 
vegetables match perfectly with the meat. This dish is fabulous!" Leena studied the 
meat and vegetables in her plate carefully. This was the first time for her to see a 
Western food displayed in such a beautiful plating. 

"It is very good that you like it, Mrs. Gu! Please enjoy the food. I must check outside as 
there are more and more guests in the hall." Alas! Manager Liu finally managed to flash 
his brilliant smile. No one wanted to leave their most distinguished guest with a bad 
impression after all. 

"Okay, you can leave, Manager. Liu! We can take care of ourselves," said Leena in a 
mild attitude. It would be uncomfortable to eat while someone was watching anyway. 

Mrs. Gu, let me know if you need anything, okay?" Manager Liu only said that to Leena. 
He had already noticed Kevin the moment they came in. It was just that Leena didn't 
show any intention of introducing the man thus he didn't dare to greet him recklessly. As 
a military officer, it was natural for Kevin to carry an air of sternness, thus saving him 
from unwanted greetings from others. 

"I know. You are too courteous, Manager Liu. We have known each other for a long 
time. You don't need to pay too much attention to us." Almost everyone in Westin was 
familiar with Leena as she had been visiting the place often. It would be impossible for 
her to blame any staff for just some trivial issues. 

Leena turned to Kevin right after the manager left. It was only then that she realized why 
Manager Liu kept peeping at the man from time to time while speaking to her. Kevin's 
stern expression was charismatic enough to attract anybody's attention. It was definitely 
this aura that cut him above everybody else. It was no wonder why the manager kept 
watching Kevin's reaction from the beginning. 

"Why are you staring at me? Is there anything wrong with my face?" asked Kevin with a 
frown. He felt uneasy and perplexed upon noticing how his wife was looking at him. 



"Nothing at all. I just suddenly realized that you look terrible when you stay silent." 
Leena rubbed her nose while talking in a teasing tone. There was a playful smile 
plastered on her face. 

"Really? Nobody told me that before. I don't feel like that either." Kevin said as he took 
Leena's plate. He started slicing the meat for her into smaller pieces. It was easy to tell 
that Kevin was used to eating in Western restaurants. 

"How could you know it yourself? Can you see your own expression?" Leena said in a 
happy tone as her husband sliced the meat for her. She found the action very 
thoughtful. 

That is unfair, Kevin. You should do that for me too!" On the other hand, Kevin's action 
made Claire feel jealous and discontented. She couldn't stand the fact that Leena had 
outweighed her inside Kevin's heart. 

"What do you mean, Claire?" Kevin raised his head and shot his sister a confused glare. 
He wondered about what was wrong with her. Why was she shouting all of a sudden? 
No one said anything to provoke her, after all. 

You cannot just cut the meat for Leena alone. You should help me with it too!" Claire 
said like a spoiled princess. She pursed her lips to show how unhappy she was. 

"Just that? What a calculating girl! All right, let me help you with your food. Give it to me! 
I'll cut all of it for you. But I think you have ordered too much. Are you sure you can eat 
all of this? Aren't you afraid of gaining weight?" said Kevin as he helplessly shook his 
head. It was extremely nice that Leena and his mother were getting along really well. 
That had saved him a lot of trouble. But it was different with Claire's case. The war 
between the two sisters-in-law seemed to be inevitable. As a brother, he had to forgive 
his sister's waywardness and assume the peacemaker role between the two ladies. He 
smiled bitterly before pushing Leena's plate back to her and then took Claire's. 

"A skinny girl is not beautiful. That is what you told to me, Kevin. I still remember it. You 
see, I have no reason to lose weight. Besides, I only ordered lobster and beefsteak. It 
will be impossible for me to put on weight just because of them." To be frank, the two 
dishes were too much for Claire. The only reason why she ordered those was to 
embarrass Leena. She was dying to see how her sister-in-law would react once she 
saw the expensive bill. Those were her plans but never would she admit her real 
purpose to them. She wouldn't want to waste this opportunity of teaching her sister-in-
law a lesson or two. She was sure that the bill would be beyond Leena's ability to pay. 
She would certainly ask for help from her brother. That would be extremely interesting 
and she just could not help but feel excited about it. She would bet her bottom dollar 
that Leena would die of shame today. 
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"That's true. I don't know why you girls are obsessed with getting thinner. I'm sure that 
you'll look ugly if you are as thin as a lath," Kevin replied as he cut the steak. He didn't 
know what other men thought but he had never liked skinny women. 

Look at your wife. She is also skinny," Claire answered back as she glanced sideways 
at Leena. The latter looked plump and awkward in her loose clothing during their stay in 
the capital city. It was only until now that Claire realized Leena's waist was much more 
slender than hers. This quite depressed her. 

Yeah, you're right. You're too thin, Leena. I have to feed you up a bit." The man glanced 
at Leena while he spoke. Despite his words, he thought his wife was curvy and perky. 
The dress exaggerated her wasp waist and enlarged her bosom. 

"Huh? I think I'm good." Leena looked down at her body. She might not be what people 
called "hot" but she had "hour-glass" figure written all over her body. She wasn't as thin 
as Kevin said. 

You'll look more beautiful if you get fatter," was Kevin's indifferent reply. Leena didn't 
know whether he meant what he said as it sounded more like a half-meant joke. He 
even looked serious while staring at her. 

"No! It'll be scary." She shuddered just by the thought of herself being fat. She used to 
suffer from obesity, so she knew how painful it was. She didn't want to fall into the same 
old trap again. 

"See? I'm not alone in this. No woman wants to be obese." For the first time, Claire took 
Leena's side as they shared the same idea. 

"Good to see that you hang together. Hope you can get along with each other 
afterward." Kevin smiled widely and pushed the plate back to Claire. His eyes glittered 
with joy. 'What a delightful scene it is,' he thought. 

The meal wasn't enjoyable but the three got on very well with one another. They asked 
for the bill after they dined and wined to satiety. Claire chuckled to herself because she 
thought the price on the bill would embarrass Leena. However, things didn't go that way. 
Leena calmly took a card out of her purse and gave it to the cashier. More surprisingly, 
she didn't even need to enter the password. The cashier just swiped the card and 
respectfully returned it to her. 



"Leena, what card did you use just now? You didn't even need to enter the password! 
It's amazing!" Claire asked curiously when they walked out of the restaurant. What she 
saw at the checkout counter really surprised her. 

"Well, it's a Dragblac Card. What's wrong? You seem curious." Claire's question 
confused Leena. The card required no passwords and she had been accustomed to it. 
Why did it surprise Claire? 

"How did you get it? Which bank is it from? It looks different from general bank cards," 
Claire continued to inquire. She also wanted to have this card. Then she could show it 
off to her friends. 

"Yeah. It's not a bank card. It can only be used in all branches under FX International 
Group." Leena patted her forehead as she was suddenly enlightened. She finally knew 
why Claire was curious. She used this card in front of them for the first time, so Claire 
had no idea of it. 

"FX International Group? What is it?" Now Claire's curiosity was just unstoppable. She 
wanted to get the answer to her question despite her dislike towards her sister-in-law. 

"Err… It's a little difficult to explain. Well, you can search Google for the answer after 
you go home. I believe you'll know the ins and outs on the internet." Leena made a 
mystery of the card. She didn't expect Claire to be so interested in her card. 

"Come on. Don't leave me hanging. Kevin, you have stayed in S City for long. You must 
know the story of the card, right? Tell me about it." Since Leena was unwilling to 
answer, Claire turned to ask Kevin, who remained silent all the time. 

"You heard what Leena said. Search Google if you want to know the answer. I believe 
that it'll provide more detailed information." Kevin was also very curious about the card 
but he knew it was nothing more than a privilege Edward gave Leena. It was when 
Leena said that she could only use the card in FX International Group's branches that 
gave it away. 

"Come on! Can't you tell me now? You're being so mysterious." Claire pouted angrily. 
However, she was even more curious about FX International Group. 

No, we aren't. There are too many things to explain when it comes to FX International 
so you have to figure it out yourself. That way, we'll not need to answer your questions 
one by one." Leena frowned. She really didn't want to explain more on this. 

"Fine. I'll find the answer myself. I won't bother to ask you!" Claire replied in a huff. She 
dismissively turned to look at the heavy traffic on the street. The moment turned 
awkward. 



Kevin looked at Leena and smiled helplessly. He could do nothing to his sister. Leena 
stuck out her tongue at him, telling him that she seemed to provoke Claire again. 

"It's still early. We can go have fun somewhere." Leena suggested after a while as 
Claire pulled a long face. 

"Good idea! How about going to the bar? I'll invite Louisa to join us." Claire immediately 
got excited. But then she thought sadly, 'Alas. I was bored as hell in the capital city as 
my parents didn't allow me to go out. It sucks.' 

"Maybe another time. I'm tired. I have to report for duty at the army base early tomorrow 
morning." Kevin agreed with Leena at the beginning but changed his mind after hearing 
Louisa's name. It was needless to say that he didn't like that annoying woman. 

"In this case, let's go back now. We can go some other day when we're free." Leena 
didn't like Louisa either, so she chimed in with her words. 

"Come on! You brought up the idea. How come you don't want to go now? You are 
liars." Claire pouted as she glared at the two with burning, reproachful eyes. 

"Kevin just had a cold. If he says he is tired, he means it. Do you really want to go to the 
bar? Let's see if we can make it tomorrow night." To disappoint Claire wasn't really 
Leena's idea right now. Nonetheless, she didn't want to be with Louisa. It would be the 
worst night of her life if she had to. 

"Since you don't want to go, I'll invite Louisa to go with me. I'll call her now." Claire took 
her phone out and called Louisa. 

Leena was relieved. She shrugged helplessly to Kevin to silently tell him that he had to 
deal with his sister himself. 

"Hello, Claire. Did you eat dinner? What's up?" Louisa was leaning against the sofa and 
painting her fingers with nail polish. She was looking cozy and lazy at the same time. 

 


