
Ancient 2921

Chapter 2921 It’s impossible to resist

Boom!

At this time, the countless monsters released by the Lord of Ten Thousand Demons were all 
charging towards Ye Feng crazily in the void.

In such a terrifying and chaotic environment, even a strong person in the same realm as the Lord of 
Ten Thousand Demons may not be able to sustain it.

Because there are too many monsters in the void!

It’s like a group of demons dancing wildly!

But at this moment, Ye Feng's eyes did not show any panic, but were filled with an ultimate 
calmness.

Faced with this kind of group attack, Ye Feng has rich experience.

So at this time, Ye Feng did not panic at all, but instantly activated all the power in his entire body.

"kill!"

Ye Feng roared and waved the Six-Path Reincarnation Fist, striking out fiercely.

Boom!

However, Ye Feng's fists struck the bodies of countless demons, but were unable to cause any harm 
to these demons.

This made Ye Feng's eyes suddenly show surprise.



Because he could feel that these demons were not very powerful individually.

But why can't it be destroyed?

And at this moment, as if he saw the surprise in Ye Feng's eyes, the Lord of Ten Thousand Demons 
immediately burst out laughing: "Human boy, you don't understand this, even though I released The 
individual power of these demons is not very strong, but you have to know that what I release is the 
power of the entire field. The power of each demon is superimposed by other demons, so if you 
want to crush these demons, It's like fighting against the combined power of thousands of demons. 
You will never be able to break through this level of power because your cultivation is too weak!"

At this time, Ye Feng did not speak aloud, but instantly inspired his Dzogchen future body.

Boom boom boom...

Almost at this moment, Ye Feng's cultivation aura suddenly rose steadily, directly from the first 
level of the Creation Realm to the tenth level of the Creation Realm.

Then Ye Feng continued to punch hard

Got out.

Boom! !

Accompanied by a huge roar, Ye Feng's punch suddenly shook the Ten Thousand Demon Realm of 
the demon chaos released by the Lord of Ten Thousand Demons.

But the Ten Thousand Demons Realm has still not been destroyed!

The Lord of Ten Thousand Demons continued to speak mockingly: "Young man from the human 
race, even if you have this secret technique to improve your cultivation, you still can't break the Ten 
Thousand Demons Domain that I released. Just be honest." Just stay where you are and wait to die."



At this time, Ye Feng still did not speak, but took a deep breath and directly displayed a very 
powerful inheritance.

It is the inheritance of the Great Desolate God Lord that Ye Feng just received, the Great Desolate 
Prisoner of Heaven Technique!

Boom!

Almost at this moment, the power of the earth within a hundred meters of Ye Feng was absorbed by 
Ye Feng in an instant.

Everyone was immediately surprised to find that all life on the ground within a hundred meters of 
where Ye Feng was standing had disappeared.

Plants withered and died, and some animals and microorganisms also lost their vitality and turned 
into shriveled bodies.

All of this life force was absorbed by Ye Feng.

Then in an instant, Ye Feng's combat power aura was raised to a whole new level.

"Try my punch again!"

At this moment, Ye Feng gathered all his strength and then bombarded forward.

Boom! !

At this moment, Ye Feng's fist suddenly burst out with a terrifying and vast divine light.

You know, Ye Feng's fist at this moment is Ye Feng's most peak fist now.

Not only does he possess the power of Ye Feng's perfect future body, but he also possesses the 
power of a hundred meters in radius absorbed by the Great Wilderness Prisoning Heaven Art.



All the life force of the earth.

So at this moment, Ye Feng's fist suddenly burst out with a huge divine light, which instantly 
shattered the seemingly indestructible Ten Thousand Demons Domain in front of him.

"This is impossible!"

Along with an earth-shattering roar, the entire body of the Lord of Ten Thousand Demons was 
shrouded in the vast divine light of Ye Feng's punch.

Visible to the naked eye, the body of the Lord of Demons was being shattered inch by inch in the 
light of Ye Feng's fist. ??

"ah!!"

The Lord of Ten Thousand Demons immediately let out a painful scream.

But all to no avail.

Because Ye Feng's punch was really terrifying.

Blessed by the power of the Great Wilderness Heaven Prison Technique.

It's simply impossible to resist!

"Click, click..."

In the midst of a violent shattering sound, the entire body of the Lord of Ten Thousand Demons 
immediately disintegrated, and was completely shattered by Ye Feng's peak punch.

"hiss!"



Seeing this shocking scene on the field, all the experts present couldn't help but have deep horror in 
their eyes.

There was a gasp of air immediately on the field.

Because Ye Feng's cultivation level is much lower than that of the Lord of Ten Thousand Demons.

But he still managed to kill the Lord of Ten Thousand Demons, a super powerful person at the 
Eternal Realm level.

This kind of strength is so terrifying that everyone can't help but tremble.

"Run!"

The surrounding group of masters who had sealed off the world all quickly fled towards the 
surroundings at this moment.

Because in their eyes at this moment, they only think that Ye Feng is a super devil wearing a black 
robe!

"Wasn't it very powerful when they blocked my road just now? Why are everyone thinking about 
escaping now?"

At this time, Ye Feng's mouth flashed a cold smile.

Smiling, and then quickly grabbing around.

boom! boom! boom……

Along with Ye Feng's grabbing, big hands of vitality suddenly appeared in the sky, crushing all the 
masters who escaped.

To Ye Feng, these masters are simply extremely weak.



Even if he was at the same level of cultivation as Ye Feng, he still couldn't stop Ye Feng's move.

It has to be said that Ye Feng's current combat power is really terrifying to the extreme.

It's simply ridiculously strong!

"Devouring the Realm!"

The next moment, Ye Feng immediately released his Devouring Domain, and began to devour all 
the blood and skills of the Lord of Ten Thousand Demons and a group of surrounding masters.

The power in Ye Feng's body suddenly began to surge.

boom!

The second level of creation realm!

boom!

The third level of creation realm!

boom!

The fourth level of creation realm!

boom!

The fifth level of creation realm!

Finally, at this moment, Ye Feng's cultivation aura stopped.

It has to be said that the other group of ordinary masters may not bring much energy to Ye Feng.



But the Lord of Ten Thousand Demons, this powerful Eternal Realm expert, brought extremely 
abundant energy to Ye Feng.

Let Ye Feng break through several realms at this moment!

Directly breaking through from the first level of the Creation Realm to the fifth level of the Creation 
Realm!

Ye Feng's strength had increased immensely at this moment.

Uh-huh!

At this time, Ye Feng suddenly turned his head and looked in a certain direction not far away.

In that place, the spiritual body of the ancient god king still stayed there.

Ye Feng said slowly: "Great Wild God Lord, do you want to fight with me?"

Chapter 2922 Great Wilderness Tower

The divine mind of the Great Wild God was suspended in mid-air at this time, staring at Ye Feng 
who was speaking not far away, with a deep and inexplicable look in his eyes.

He was silent for a while, and then said slowly: "You are a peerless genius. In just a short moment, 
you have successfully comprehended the Great Wilderness Prisoning Heaven Technique that I left 
behind, and can use it in actual combat." , this kind of talent is really unheard of.”

When Ye Feng heard the Divine Lord of the Wilderness say this, his eyes suddenly showed a hint of 
surprise, and then he said, "Then, what are you going to do to me?"

The Divine Lord of the Great Wilderness seemed to have seen the hostility in Ye Feng's words, and 
he immediately smiled softly and said: "When I fought with the Lord of Ten Thousand Demons just 
now, the power of this spiritual body was almost All of them have been used up, so you don’t need 
to be afraid of me. Even if I want to do something to you now, I don’t have the strength to do it.”

"Well, farewell."



Hearing this, Ye Feng clasped his fists slightly, then turned around and prepared to leave.

"Wait a moment."

But suddenly at this moment, Lord Dahuang spoke from behind.

Ye Feng turned around, his eyes a little confused, and asked aloud: "Is there anything else?"

At this time, God Lord Dahuang showed a mysterious smile on his face, and said aloud: "You have 
obtained my inheritance. This is only one of the two great fortunes I left behind. There is another 
wealth that you have not obtained yet. If It would be a huge loss for you to leave now.”

Hearing what Lord Dahuang said, Ye Feng immediately understood something.

Then Ye Feng spoke slowly and said: "Senior, can you give me the remaining wealth? If you have 
any request, I will definitely agree if I can do it."

At this moment, when Ye Feng heard that Lord Dahuang suddenly brought up this matter, he 
immediately guessed that Lord Dahuang must be seeking something for himself.

r\u003e

Sure enough, after hearing what Ye Feng said, Lord Dahuang suddenly showed a smile in his eyes, 
and said loudly: "Okay, you, this young junior, are indeed quick to talk, so I won't be pretentious, I 
do have something." You need to complete something, and as long as you agree to complete it, I 
will give you the remaining wealth."

Ye Feng immediately nodded and said, "If I can do it, I will definitely agree."

Lord Dahuang nodded slightly, and then suddenly stretched out a finger, and a ray of light suddenly 
shot out from his finger.

Then this divine light gradually turned into a very girlish image in front of Ye Feng.



Lord Dahuang looked at the girl made of light, with a kind of warmth and kindness in his eyes.

He spoke slowly: "This is the daughter I left behind in the world. I will also give you my second 
wealth, but you must promise that if you can meet my daughter, you must protect her."

Ye Feng stared at the girl made of light, nodded immediately, and said loudly: "I have remembered 
your daughter's appearance. If I can meet your daughter, I will definitely treat her as my biological 
sister. Treat them the same.”

"good."

Lord Dahuang immediately nodded, and then said aloud: "I don't believe your casual promise. You 
need to take a martial arts oath."

Ye Feng didn't hesitate at all, he just raised his hand on the spot and took a martial arts oath.

Seeing this scene, Lord Dahuang nodded with satisfaction and said aloud: "It seems that you are 
sincere, then I will feel relieved."

Buzz!

The next moment, the Great Wild God directly stretched out his hand and grabbed a certain ruins in 
the distance.

Boom!

The ruins immediately exploded.

An ancient tower with nine floors flew out.

The entire body of this ancient pagoda is made of a special loess-like material, and it looks full of 
endless antiquity and vicissitudes of life.



The Great Desolate God stared at the ancient tower and said slowly: "This tower is called the Great 
Desolate Tower. It was my natal weapon back then. When combined with the Great Desolate 
Heaven Prisoning Technique that you are practicing now, it can explode with very powerful power, 
and The material used to cast the Great Desolate Tower is very special. It is the soil condensed from 
the legendary mother energy of all things, also known as the 'soil of origin'. The material used to 
cast the Great Desolate Tower even exceeds the value of the magic weapon itself. , young man, 
remember your promise.”

Buzz!

After the Lord of Desolation finished speaking, the entire spiritual body seemed to have exhausted 
its power, and finally completely spread out between heaven and earth and disappeared completely.

Uh-huh!

Ye Feng's eyes showed excitement at this time.

At this time, Ye Feng directly took the Great Wilderness Tower into his hands.

Buzz!

The moment Ye Feng's palm touched the Great Wilderness Tower, he immediately felt that this 
ancient tower was filled with unparalleled power of the Wilderness. It was very terrifying. It was 
definitely a powerful and boundless forbidden magic weapon that would definitely be able to 
explode. Very terrifying power.

And at this moment, Ye Feng is holding the Great Desolation Tower in his hand, and he can feel that 
the ancient power of the Great Desolation in the Great Desolation Tower and the Great Desolation 
Heaven Prison Technique he has practiced have formed an inner cycle invisibly, constantly 
nourishing his own energy. Great wild power.

r\u003e

"Uh-huh!"



At this time, Ye Feng swallowed the Great Wilderness Tower into his body space, and began to use 
his own skills to refine it, striving to completely control it as soon as possible.

This time Ye Feng got the inheritance and natal magic weapon from the Great Wild God, and it can 
be said that he made a lot of money.

At this time, Emperor Chu suddenly said aloud in his mind: "The life breath of the Tongtian Sacred 
Tree is disappearing quickly! It seems that someone has started to cut down the Tongtian Sacred 
Tree. Ye Feng, go and take a look!"

Obviously, for Emperor Chu, what he had always been thinking about was the sacred tree reaching 
the sky.

"The sacred tree that reaches the sky is being cut down?"

When Ye Feng heard what Emperor Chu said, there was a look of astonishment in his eyes.

Then Ye Feng wasted no time and quickly flew out of the area where the ancient god king lived.

Ye Feng still remembers the Tongtian Sacred Tree and has not forgotten it.

After all, Emperor Chu said that from ancient sacred trees such as the Tongtian Divine Tree, one can 
understand the Great Life Technique, which ranks fifth among the three thousand avenues of the 
heavens!

Ye Feng would not let go of any of the three thousand great arts.

Because Ye Feng has always had a goal in his heart, which is to integrate all the three thousand 
avenues of the heavens into one furnace and control them all by himself.

Swish, swish, swish!

Ye Feng soon arrived at the exit of the ancient divine king's residence and came down from the sky.



When he came down, he immediately saw that there were more than a dozen figures cutting down 
the towering sacred tree.

What surprised Ye Feng was that these dozen figures turned out to be Ye Feng's old acquaintances, 
all masters of the Dragon King Holy Land, and among them was the chief instructor of the Dragon 
King Holy Land who had fought with Ye Feng before.

Chapter 2923 An ant-like existence

For Ye Feng, the former head coach of the Dragon King Holy Land, he was no match and needed 
the help of Senior Sister Zi Han to fight against him.

But now, Ye Feng's cultivation level has been upgraded to the extremely powerful fifth level of 
Creation Realm.

In the eyes of Ye Feng, people like the chief coach of the Dragon King Holy Land can only be 
called ants.

Uh-huh!

At this time, Ye Feng had a cold smile on his face and flew directly towards the sky-reaching sacred 
tree.

"The sacred tree that reaches the sky is mine."

Suddenly Ye Feng spoke up.

The sound instantly attracted the attention of everyone present.

"It's you boy!"

The head coach of Dragon King Holy Land recognized Ye Feng immediately.

"Who is this person?"

Around the head coach of the Dragon King Holy Land, a group of experts could not help but ask.



The head coach just smiled slightly at this moment, seemingly very relaxed, and said loudly: "He is 
just a boy from the Holy Land of Heaven."

When the other masters heard what the head coach said, they immediately breathed a sigh of relief. 
They thought it was some kind of super master, but they didn't expect it was just a young man from 
the Holy Land of Heaven.

At this time, the head coach glanced at Ye Feng, who was not far away, and said slowly: "Last time, 
if the true female disciple of Tiandao Holy Land hadn't saved you, you would have died in my 
hands long ago. Today We meet again, this time you have no one to help you, you are dead."

When Ye Feng heard this, he just shook his head and smiled. He didn't bother to respond at all and 
walked directly in the direction of the Tongtian Sacred Tree.

"Boy, you actually ignored me? Damn it! How presumptuous!"

The head coach immediately said angrily: "Then I will let you see a powerful inheritance that I have 
just cultivated now, Tiger Roaring in the Sky!"

boom!

Almost at this moment, a powerful and boundless energy burst out from the head coach's body.

potential.

A huge phantom of a divine tiger rose up from the head coach's body in an instant. It was several 
thousand meters tall. Although it was just a phantom of a divine tiger, it was full of endless majesty.

The divine tiger roared and the earth trembled!

Buzz!

But suddenly at this moment, Ye Feng just stretched out a hand slightly and grabbed it in front of 
him.



"Click, click..."

The next moment, the phantom of the divine tiger on the head coach's body was suddenly shattered 
inch by inch by an invisible force.

"What……"

The smile on the head coach's face suddenly solidified, and then became stiff.

Because at this time, the head coach also felt a very terrifying force that was constantly crushing his 
body.

At this moment, a faint smile appeared in Ye Feng's eyes. He stared at the head coach of the Dragon 
King Holy Land and said loudly: "Actually, in my eyes, you are already like an ant. ”

An ant-like existence!

Almost as soon as Ye Feng finished speaking, the head coach of the Dragon King Holy Land turned 
red in the face.

Because he felt deep shame and a deep sense of powerlessness.

Because now his whole body was pinched by an invisible force and he couldn't move at all. He 
could only watch Ye Feng walking over.

Moreover, the head coach also discovered that Ye Feng did not use any full strength to deal with 
him.

Just by casually stretching out a hand, he was able to restrain the head coach's entire body. It was 
really unbelievable.

With this kind of strength, he is simply the head teacher



The head is now unimaginably powerful.

"What? Why is this boy so powerful?"

"Who is he? How could a young disciple of the Holy Land of Heaven possess such terrifying 
power!"

Almost at this moment, the group of experts who were with the head coach of the Dragon King 
Holy Land all had incredible looks in their eyes.

Because their cultivation strength is similar to that of the chief instructor.

But now Ye Feng was able to deal with the head coach, even using only one hand, and was able to 
beat the head coach until he had no resistance. It was really terrifying. .??.

Everyone simply didn't understand how terrifying Ye Feng's true strength was.

Swish, swish, swish!

Swish, swish, swish!

So at this moment, this group of experts didn't care about the life or death of the head coach at all. 
They all flew quickly towards the surroundings, trying to escape from here.

Because Ye Feng gave them such a terrifying feeling.

But at this moment, Ye Feng just smiled faintly, and then snorted coldly.

Buzz!

Suddenly, a powerful force appeared in the whole world, and a group of more than a dozen masters 
who escaped around were all imprisoned in place.



There's no way they can escape from here!

Ye Feng smiled slightly and said loudly: "You can't escape."

At this moment, Ye Feng just said one sentence, which was to imprison all the dozen masters 
present in place.

Everyone's eyes showed deep shock and fear.

Because these masters are considered prominent figures in the center of the God Realm.

But here, Ye Feng is as weak as an ant, which is really unbelievable.

At this time, he was imprisoned in the void

The head coach in the middle stared at Ye Feng unwillingly.

There was a very complicated meaning in his tone, with fear and reluctance, and he said aloud: 
"How could a boy like you have increased your strength to this level in such a short period of time? 
This is impossible!"

Ye Feng just smiled slightly and said aloud: "There is nothing impossible in this world. Maybe it is 
impossible for other people. But, for me, everything is possible."

boom!

After Ye Feng finished speaking, he clasped his hands slightly, and suddenly an even more 
terrifying power descended between heaven and earth.

The bodies of the dozen or so experts present, including the head coach, all exploded instantly.

Wow!



Then Ye Feng opened his mouth and swallowed all the blood and energy.

Ye Feng's skill immediately improved a lot.

But there was no direct breakthrough in cultivation.

After all, the cultivation levels of these dozen masters are all average.

For Ye Feng now, it is nothing at all.

Ye Feng's eyes looked a little sad at this time.

Just a few months ago, it was very difficult for me to fight against the head coach of the Dragon 
King Holy Land.

But now, with just a slight movement of his hands, he was able to instantly kill all the masters at the 
head coach level.

Even Ye Feng felt that his cultivation progress was a bit too outrageous.

Ye Feng himself had to admire his talent.

Of course, good luck is also very important.

At this time, Ye Feng collected the storage rings of more than a dozen experts present, and then 
began to look at the majestic and boundless sacred tree.

Ye Feng asked aloud in his mind: "Emperor Chu, how should I conquer this sacred tree that reaches 
the sky? Should I just cut it down?"

Chapter 2924 Zhou Tiangang

After Ye Feng finished speaking at this time, Emperor Chu immediately said in his mind: "Of 
course you can't directly cut down this sacred tree. If you do, the life attribute in the sacred tree will 
disappear, so it will be useless." ”



Ye Feng looked at the sacred tree in front of him and couldn't help but ask: "Then what should I do 
now?"

Emperor Chu said aloud: "Now you use your own power to communicate with the tree spirit in this 
ancient sacred tree. If you can get this tree spirit to agree to become a part of your body, then you 
can control this sacred tree that reaches the sky." ”

"Communicating with tree spirits?"

When Ye Feng heard what Emperor Chu said, he immediately nodded, then stretched out his hand 
to touch the trunk of the sky-reaching sacred tree in front of him.

Buzz!

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately flew his soul body into the inner space of this sky-reaching 
sacred tree.

The next moment, Ye Feng suddenly felt that the inner space of this sacred tree was a place full of 
infinite vitality.

Even Ye Feng's soul felt a kind of restorative nourishing power at this moment.

There is a warm feeling.

"Tree spirit, where are you? Come out and see me."

At this time, Ye Feng's soul body spoke to the entire inner space of the Tongtian Sacred Tree.

"Buzz!"

And at the next moment, a soul body like a sapling appeared in the inner space of this sky-reaching 
sacred tree.



At this time, Emperor Chu suddenly spoke in Ye Feng's mind: "It turns out that the old tree spirit of 
the Tongtian Sacred Tree has died, and now what is born is the soul body of a new sapling. No 
wonder the dozen or so people before Ordinary experts were cutting down this sacred tree, but the 
tree did not resist. It turned out to be because the soul body of the new sapling was too weak. "

At this moment, the soul body of the newly born sapling from the Tongtian Divine Tree came to Ye 
Feng and couldn't help but say: "I am willing to surrender to you."

Ye Feng's eyes were a little surprised. He didn't expect this tree spirit to agree directly without even 
telling him his purpose.

However, Emperor Chu smiled in his mind and said: "Because this little sapling knows

It can't resist a powerful being like you at all, so it might as well just surrender and save yourself 
from suffering. "

When Ye Feng heard what Emperor Chu said at this time, he nodded, then stretched out his hand 
and directly introduced the saplings bred by the Heaven-reaching Sacred Tree in front of him into 
his body.

Uh-huh!

The next moment, Ye Feng's soul body returned to his own body.

At this moment, the huge tree in front of Ye Feng suddenly shook.

Buzz!

Then the Tongtian Divine Tree quickly shrank and turned into a small tree, emitting emerald green 
light and entering Ye Feng's dantian.

Ye Feng immediately felt that the divine tree in his Dantian had taken root in his body and could 
provide his body with a steady stream of life force.

In addition, Ye Feng can also feel that his vitality is more vigorous.



At this time, Emperor Chu said aloud in his mind: "Ye Feng, remember to understand the Great Life 
Technique from this sacred tree. If you can successfully comprehend the Great Life Technique, it 
will be really difficult for you to die." ”

Hearing Emperor Chu's reminder, Ye Feng immediately nodded and said, "Okay, I'll remember it."

At this time, Ye Feng left the scene directly after collecting the Tongtian Sacred Tree.

Because he knows that there will definitely be many other masters coming here next. He has 
obtained the most precious thing and can leave directly.

But at this moment, Ye Feng was just about to leave, but a group of young men wearing silver 
armor suddenly surrounded Ye Feng.

There was a look of surprise in Ye Feng's eyes.

Because the cultivation auras of these dozen young people wearing silver armor are extremely 
powerful, only a small level lower than themselves.

So many powerful silver armored guards suddenly appeared. Ye Feng suddenly understood. It 
seemed that the people around him

Someone big has arrived.

However, Ye Feng looked around and saw that no big shot appeared.

"Boy, stop looking around."

These dozen silver armored guards were gathering towards Ye Feng at this moment.

A young man in the lead stared at Ye Feng, slowly stretched out his hand and said: "Take out that 
sacred tree that reaches the sky. This kind of ancient sacred tree is not something that a young boy 
like you can control. "



It has to be said that the young man in charge obviously cannot see the aura of cultivation in Ye 
Feng.

He just felt that Ye Feng looked very young and easy to bully. He felt that Ye Feng was just an 
ordinary boy who got the ancient sacred tree like the Heaven-reaching Sacred Tree because of his 
good luck.

These dozen guards obviously did not see the scene where Ye Feng killed a group of masters from 
the Dragon King Holy Land. Otherwise, they would not dare to be so presumptuous in front of Ye 
Feng.

Ye Feng's eyes were a little surprised at this time, because anyone who could recognize the Tongtian 
Shenmu must have a very extraordinary identity.

But even though he knew that the identities of the dozen or so guards opposite him might be 
extraordinary, Ye Feng still had no fear at this moment.

After all, Ye Feng's strength has now risen to a very high level, and he is basically not afraid of so-
called people with backers.

At this time, Ye Feng stared at the group of guards in silver armor in front of him, and just said one 
word indifferently: "Get out."

"you……!"

Seeing Ye Feng's appearance, the dozen or so silver-armored guards suddenly showed deep anger 
on their faces.

"Since this kid is so ungrateful, let's just grab it. The young master needs the ancient sacred tree for 
his cultivation. If we can offer one, our absolute status will rise."

At this moment, these dozen silver armored guards burst out with their powerful cultivation aura 
and rushed towards Ye Feng.



"I told you to get out of here, you'd better get out of here!"

Boom! !

But at this time, Ye Feng snorted coldly, and a wave of energy rushed out from his body.

An even more terrifying momentum.

Bang!

Bang!

In an instant, more than a dozen silver-armored guards were blown away, and they all fell to the 
ground vomiting blood.

They have no ability to resist at all!

"What?!"

"Powerful cultivation of the Creation Realm!"

"How could this kid... be a super master in the Creation Realm!"

A group of silver-armored guards who fell to the ground screamed in embarrassment at this 
moment.

And at this moment, two very noble figures suddenly flew over from not far away.

One male and one female.

The man is as tall as jade, handsome and tall. He is dressed in a purple robe and looks majestic and 
extraordinary.



The woman is wearing a light blue dress and looks very cool and beautiful.

"Senior Sister Jialan?"

Ye Feng's eyes were stunned at this moment, because among the two people who flew over from 
not far away, the woman turned out to be Senior Sister Jialan, whom he had been separated from 
before.

At this moment, Jialan saw Ye Feng and a group of silver-armored guards lying on the ground, and 
he immediately understood something.

Jialan couldn't help but smile and said: "It turned out to be a misunderstanding. Junior brother Ye 
Feng, let me introduce to you. The person next to me is the senior brother among the core disciples 
of our Tiandao Holy Land, senior brother Zhou Tiangang. This group of silver-armored guards are 
all members of Senior Brother Zhou Tiangang’s entourage. They are elite young people from the 
Zhou family who have also entered this time of experience in the ancient world.”

But at this time, the majestic Zhou Tiangang's eyes were very gloomy. He stared at Ye Feng and 
said loudly: "It turns out that you are the peerless evildoer that Senior Sister Jialan has always told 
me. Ye Feng, who can instantly Defeating all my guards, it seems that you are indeed very skilled. 
Yes, I forgive your rude behavior this time. Perhaps, I can consider letting you join our Zhou family 
and become my bodyguard."

At this moment, what Zhou Tiangang said seemed very generous, but in fact, he looked down on Ye 
Feng at all and actually asked Ye Feng to become his subordinate!

Chapter 2925 The place where ancient giants lived

Hearing what Zhou Tiangang said, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly showed a hint of coldness.

Because Ye Feng clearly heard that Zhou Tiangang was very concerned about the fact that he had 
knocked away his subordinates. He was not as generous as he said.

So at this moment, Ye Feng stared at the embarrassed group of silver-armored guards around him, 
and then said calmly: "They wanted to rob me of the treasures, so I took action."

Seeing Ye Feng's indifferent look, Zhou Tiangang's eyes suddenly showed a hint of gloom.



Because he never expected that Ye Feng, an unknown person from the Holy Land of Heaven, would 
dare to speak to him like this.

However, at this time, Zhou Tiangang seemed to feel that it was difficult to get angry directly at Ye 
Feng with Jia Lan around.

He just smiled faintly and said nothing more. Instead, he looked at Jialan beside him and said 
loudly: "Junior Sister Jialan, what happened at this time is just a small episode. Don't delay our 
business, it's not worth it. We are wasting time, let’s continue to find the ancient giant’s lair.”

"The lair of the ancient giant?"

Ye Feng heard what Zhou Tiangang said and immediately understood. It seemed that they were here 
to find opportunities.

At this time, Ye Feng was ready to leave.

Although he was also very interested in the ancient giants, Zhou Tiangang did not invite him, and 
Ye Feng was too lazy to join him.

"Junior Brother Ye Feng, don't leave yet."

At this time, Jialan suddenly said: "Junior brother Ye Feng, come with us to find the ancient giant's 
lair."

There was a look of surprise in Ye Feng's eyes, as if he didn't expect that Jialan would take the 
initiative to invite him.

But at this time, since Jia Lan invited him, Ye Feng would naturally not refuse.

After all, looking for the lair of the ancient giants might also yield very rich rewards.

and ancient chance.



At this time, Ye Feng walked to Jia Lan's side.

Zhou Tiangang, who was standing aside, just glanced at Ye Feng indifferently, snorted coldly, and 
said nothing more.

Although Zhou Tiangang felt that Ye Feng had no identity.

But he also had to admit that Ye Feng was very powerful.

So at this time, Zhou Tiangang just snorted and did not stop Ye Feng from joining.

After all, going to the lair of the ancient giant is very dangerous.

So it would be nice to have one more boost.

And besides that, Zhou Tiangang also had a very sinister idea in his heart.

That is, if there is any terrible danger encountered in the ancient giant's lair, then Zhou Tiangang 
feels that Ye Feng can be made the scapegoat.

Thinking of this, Zhou Tiangang suddenly smiled coldly in his heart, and there was a deep 
gloominess in his eyes.

At this time, with his powerful perception, Ye Feng immediately sensed a cold and calculating 
murderous intention from Zhou Tiangang's body.

In response, Ye Feng just smiled secretly. He didn't take Zhou Tiangang into his eyes at all.

Although this Zhou Tiangang is the senior brother among the core disciples, he possesses the 
terrifying cultivation level of the ninth level of the Creation Realm.

However, the Ninth Level of Creation Realm may be a very scary superpower to others.



But for the current Ye Feng, Zhou Tiangang's cultivation level is not considered a master at all.

Because Ye Feng's cultivation base is very strong and he is not afraid of himself at all.

Rivals and enemies of the same realm.

At this time, the group of people seemed to be plotting against each other, leaving the scene and 
walking towards the central area of this ancient world.

The group's cultivation is very strong, and their speed is naturally very fast.

In less than half a day, the group of people had arrived at the center of the ancient world.

Here, everyone saw many majestic and boundless buildings, but they were all dilapidated and 
looked dilapidated.

At this time, a golden compass appeared in Zhou Tiangang's hand.

At this moment, he was carefully looking at the golden compass in his hand.

Suddenly at this time, Zhou Tiangang looked fiercely in a certain direction and said loudly: "Over 
there!"

Uh-huh!

After saying that, Zhou Tiangang rushed quickly in that direction instantly.

A group of more than a dozen silver-armored guards followed suit.

Ye Feng and Jia Lan looked at each other and flew behind everyone.

At this time, Jia Lan couldn't help but said to Ye Feng: "Be careful with Zhou Tiangang. You injured 
his guard before and disobeyed his orders. He may be harmful to you."



When Ye Feng heard this, he just smiled slightly and said, "If he dares to do something bad to me, 
believe me, he will be the one who regrets it."

Seeing Ye Feng's confident smile, Jia Lan just smiled helplessly and said: "Zhou Tiangang is very 
powerful, and he is the eldest son of the Zhou family, the super family behind Tiandao Holy Land. 
He has many tricks up his sleeve. Don't do it. I underestimated him."

Ye Feng nodded and said with a smile: "Don't worry."

Ye Feng secretly sneered in his heart, even if Zhou Tiangang was the inheritor of some super big 
family, there was absolutely no way he could be his opponent.

On trump cards.

Among peers, who can compare to Ye Feng?

At this moment, the group of people had arrived in front of a huge dilapidated palace not far away.

Everyone stopped.

At this time, Zhou Tiangang was looking at the dilapidated palace.

This palace is extremely huge, and there is a huge circular arch outside the palace.

However, half of the arch was broken, leaving only the broken half.

Uh-huh!

At this moment, Jialan suddenly walked forward and said, "I know this arch. The patterns carved on 
the surface of the arch are the totem gates of the ancient giant clan. This is the place we are looking 
for."



When Zhou Tiangang heard this, his eyes suddenly showed a trace of greed, and he immediately 
said: "Let's go in directly."

"Um."

Everyone nodded.

Buzz!

Just when everyone entered the area behind this huge arch, suddenly the whole world suddenly 
fluctuated rapidly.

Everyone was immediately horrified to see it.

The moment they stepped into the arch, the dilapidated buildings around them were all restored to 
their original state, and there were also many ancient giants living among them.

Ye Feng's eyes suddenly flashed, and he couldn't help but say: "That round arch seems to be a secret 
portal. We are now transported to the place where the real ancient giant family lives."

At this moment, Jialan was also looking at the ancient giants living in the magnificent buildings in 
the distance, with awe in his eyes, and said aloud: "I didn't expect there were ancient giants 
surviving in these ruins."

Chapter 2926 The practice world where the weak eats the strong

At this moment, looking at the ancient giants living in tall buildings not far away, Zhou Tiangang 
showed excitement in his eyes and said loudly: "I finally found the survival nest of the lost ancient 
giant clan. I must Obtain the most powerful treasure of the ancient giant clan! "

At this moment, Zhou Tiangang immediately looked at the group of silver armored guards around 
him and said loudly: "Everyone works together to kill these ancient giants first, and then look for 
the treasure."

"Yes, young master!"



A group of powerful silver-armored guards were clasping their fists and making noises at this 
moment. Then they took out their weapons and magic weapons and rushed towards the building in 
the distance.

"Damn human bugs, you dare to enter the territory of our giant clan, you will all die!"

At this time, the ancient giants living in a group of buildings not far away naturally discovered Zhou 
Tiangang and his party.

They roared angrily and rushed directly towards Zhou Tiangang and his party.

"Rumble..." ??

It has to be said that the power of these ancient giants is still very terrifying.

They were running on the ground, and the whole ground was shaking violently.

At this time, the ancient giants ran in front of them. Dozens of ancient giants actually hit many of 
the silver-armored guards around Zhou Tiangang, causing them to break into pieces and kill them 
instantly.

"What?"

"These ancient giants are so powerful!"

"Our magic weapon can't even break through their bodies."

At this moment, a group of silver armored guards present couldn't help but exclaimed in surprise.

"As expected of a clan of ancient giants, their bodies are solid."

At this time, Zhou Tiangang smiled instead of angry. Instead, he was looking forward to the ancient 
giant more and more.



As for the deaths of many silver-armored guards around him, Zhou Tiangang didn't care at all.

"Big split

Heavenly Sword! "

At this moment, Zhou Tiangang took action.

A large sword with a serrated blade instantly appeared in his hand, and he slashed directly forward.

It has to be said that Zhou Tiangang has an extremely powerful cultivation base, and his strength is 
still very terrifying.

"boom!"

At this moment, the serrated sword in Zhou Tiangang's hand suddenly burst out with a terrifying 
sword light, possessing the terrifying power of splitting the heaven and the earth.

"Pfft!"

"Pfft!"

In an instant, two terrifying ancient giants were chopped in half by the serrated sword in Zhou 
Tiangang's hand.

It has to be said that Zhou Tiangang's strength is still very terrifying.

He is worthy of being the senior brother among the core disciples.

His strength may be even more powerful than that of Senior Sister Zi Han, who is one of the top ten 
true disciples that Ye Feng encountered before.



At this time, Ye Feng couldn't help but look at Jialan beside him, and said aloud: "Senior Sister 
Jialan, the true disciple group, or the core disciple group, which one is the most powerful? Among 
the sects I joined before , True disciples are generally better than core disciples.”

When Jia Lan heard what Ye Feng said, he just smiled slightly and said: "In our Holy Land of 
Heavenly Dao, the true disciples are not a fixed group of disciples, but they are under the command 
of the upper-level forces of the sect. They can be called True disciples, and core disciples, are a 
fixed group of disciples. Regardless of whether you have joined the subordinates of a certain sect 
big shot, as long as you are strong enough, you can become a core disciple of Tiandao Holy Land, 
which represents our Tiandao Holy Land. core members.”

"I see."

When Ye Feng heard this, he immediately understood.

At this moment, Jialan suddenly appeared

He said in a loud voice: "Junior brother Ye Feng, let us take action as soon as possible to kill this 
group of angry ancient giants and find the resources and wealth of the ancient giant clan as soon as 
possible."

Ye Feng nodded slightly and said, "Okay."

"boom!"

"boom!"

At this moment, Ye Feng and Jia Lan both took action.

A huge emerald-colored ring appeared in Jialan's hand, just like the legendary Diamond Ring. 
Every time it was popped out, it could instantly crush the head of an ancient giant.

Ye Feng, on the other hand, is much simpler and does not need to use any so-called weapons or 
inheritance at all.



He simply waved his fists and charged forward.

Boom!

With every punch, Ye Feng's chaotic body can burst out with terrifying power, directly shattering 
the entire body of an ancient giant.

It has to be said that Ye Feng's chaotic body has now reached a very terrifying level.

Even though the bodies of these ancient giants were extremely strong, they could not withstand the 
impact and destructive power brought by Ye Feng's fists.

Boom!

At this time, the entire field suddenly fell into huge chaos.

With the addition of Ye Feng and Jia Lan, this battle seems to be a bit one-sided.

After all, these ancient giants are the old, weak, sick and disabled who have survived.

All the elites of the real ancient giant clan died in the war in the ancient times.

Therefore, they simply could not withstand the attack of the three extremely powerful top geniuses 
of the Holy Land of Heavenly Dao, and were almost slaughtered.

Although this may be a bit cruel, in the spiritual world, the law of the jungle is the law of the jungle.

Because only through continuous plunder can one become stronger.

Therefore, those who feel compassion will definitely be eliminated immediately in the spiritual 
world.

There is no way, if you don’t rob others to become stronger, disaster may befall you one day.



At this time, after a group of people killed all the ancient giants, they began to explore the 
surroundings.

At this time, Jialan also separated from Zhou Tiangang.

Because everyone has their own direction of exploration.

Zhou Tiangang also ignored Jialan and Ye Feng's departure.

After all, whoever finds the opportunity first will get it.

At this moment, Jialan said to Ye Feng: "I am going to look in another direction. The ancient giant 
family must have many opportunities and great wealth. Don't waste time."

Uh-huh!

After Jialan finished speaking, he also left Ye Feng.

Ye Feng nodded slightly at this time, and then did not leave the scene.

Instead, he released the Devouring Domain, covering all the ancient giants he had killed before in 
his Devouring Domain.

For Ye Feng, the blood energy left behind by the deaths of dozens of ancient giants is also a huge 
wealth.

It may even be more useful to Ye Feng than the magic weapon left by the ancient giant.

After all, Ye Feng is not short of magic weapons now. He just got the Great Desolate Tower from 
the Great Desolate God.

boom!



At this time, the Devouring Domain released by Ye Feng immediately absorbed the blood energy of 
those ancient giants, as well as the skills of the ancient giants, and injected them into his body.

Buzz!

At this moment, Ye Feng suddenly felt that his skill was being greatly improved.

The next moment, Ye Feng's cultivation aura began to rise steadily.

Chapter 2927 Black Broken Sword

Boom boom boom...

At this time, the skills and life energy of dozens of ancient giants surged through Ye Feng's body.

You know, although these dozens of ancient giants are not very powerful in cultivation, they are a 
family of ancient giants, and their life origins are extremely terrifying.

So at this time, the energy provided to Ye Feng was naturally very huge and majestic.

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately felt that his skill was rapidly improving.

boom!

The sixth level of creation realm!

Ye Feng's cultivation level suddenly made a breakthrough at this time, directly breaking through to 
the first level.

This made Ye Feng's eyes reveal a happy smile.

Because the cultivation base of dozens of ancient giants is not very strong, but they still made 
breakthroughs in their own cultivation base, which is already very good.



Uh-huh!

At this time, Ye Feng flew quickly towards the surroundings and began to look for the wealth left 
by the ancient giant clan.

For Ye Feng, the most important thing now is to find various resources that can improve his skills.

The inheritance of magic weapons and the like are not that important.

Because now the magic weapon and inheritance in Ye Feng are enough for Ye Feng to use for the 
time being.

Buzz!

With powerful soul power search, Ye Feng's search process was very smooth.

At this time, Ye Feng came to a dilapidated hall and immediately saw the body of an immortal 
ancient giant standing in the hall.

But the ancient giant's chest was pierced, and a black broken sword was inserted into the ancient 
giant's body, nailing it to the ground.

"The body of this ancient giant has not decayed until now, and its vitality has not lost its vitality for 
so many years. It seems that the ancient giant must have been a very powerful existence back then."

At this time, Ye Feng stared at the body of the immortal ancient giant, with a deep brilliance in his 
eyes.

Because the body of this immortal ancient giant has not decayed after such a long time, it must still 
contain a very large amount of life energy, as well as the skills of ancient powerful men.

So at this time, Ye Feng felt that this immortal ancient giant would be of great help to him.

Uh-huh!



At this moment, Ye Feng walked forward without any hesitation, ready to devour it.

But just when Ye Feng walked in front of this immortal ancient giant.

boom!

The broken black sword that was originally inserted into the body of this ancient giant suddenly 
released a unique and ferocious aura of terror.

In an instant, he rushed towards Ye Feng!

This ferocious aura gave Ye Feng the feeling that it was like an ancient evil demon contained in this 
broken sword, which made people's souls completely shattered.

"Soul Defense!"

At this moment, Ye Feng almost subconsciously released his huge soul power, and condensed a 
thick soul barrier around his head, trying to resist the black broken sword rushing out. The fierce 
atmosphere.

Click, click...

But at this moment, what shocked Ye Feng was that his full 600,000-level soul power, so

The soul barrier formed was unable to withstand this extremely ferocious aura.

Cracks appeared in those who were directly attacked, and it seemed that they would be completely 
shattered in the next moment!

crisis!

A huge crisis!



At this moment, Ye Feng felt a sense of crisis that was about to break his soul.

Ye Feng has never seen such a terrifying weapon.

Ye Feng originally felt that this black broken sword had been broken and had passed through a long 
and endless years.

It has definitely lost its spirituality and has completely become a broken weapon without any threat.

But I didn't expect that this seemingly ordinary, even somewhat broken black broken sword could 
release such a terrifying and ferocious energy in an instant.

It was like there was an extremely terrifying ancient evil demon contained in this broken sword, 
possessing extremely terrifying destructive power.

Buzz!

"Golden little tower!"

At this extremely critical moment, Emperor Chu released in his mind the small golden tower he had 
obtained before.

The small golden tower floated right in front of Ye Feng's eyebrows at this moment, and then 
released a huge golden light shield, finally blocking the ferocious aura released from the black 
broken sword.

But it just resisted.

This vicious aura cannot be completely eradicated.

At this moment, Ye Feng could still feel that the ferocious aura was still rapidly eroding his soul.



So at this moment, Ye Feng couldn't help but ask: "Emperor Chu, what kind of weapon is this? It 
has been broken for endless years, why is it still full of such terrifying power?"

Emperor Chu was silent for a moment, and then said aloud in his mind: "I don't really know what 
kind of weapon this black broken sword was back then, but what I am sure of is that this black 
broken sword, It should have been the natal weapon of an ancient peerless evil demon, otherwise it 
would be impossible to have such a terrifying and ferocious aura. Even if the sword is broken, only 
the hilt and a section of the sword body are left, it is still so terrifying and ferocious. "

When Ye Feng heard this, he couldn't help but nodded and said loudly: "The value of this black 
broken sword may be extremely huge. If I can control it, this black broken sword can give me 
infinite destructive power." ”

Emperor Chu said aloud: "It should be difficult to completely control. Now even the two of us 
working together can only resist this vicious aura. I think it's better for you, Ye Feng, to withdraw 
now and think of a way later." , Collect this black broken sword. After all, I can't use the soul gem 
now. If the soul gem is not sealed, I might still give it a try. "

Ye Feng shook his head at this time and said aloud: "Whether it's the ancient giant's body or this 
black broken sword, I don't want to give up so easily. I'm going to give it a try and see how the 
Purple Demon The emperor’s inheritance, can the Purple Devil Soul be integrated into this black 
broken sword, and thus take the initiative?”

"Yes, Ye Feng, you have cultivated the inheritance of an ancient demon god."

Emperor Chu also reacted instantly at this time, and couldn't help but said aloud in his mind: "This 
black broken sword is filled with ferocious energy, it should also be a kind of demonic power, 
maybe Ye Feng, you have cultivated it." The Purple Demon Soul can really take control of this 
black broken sword, so hurry up and give it a try! This black broken sword is definitely a magic 
weapon, even if it is broken! A piece of it can definitely kill all kinds of so-called magic weapons! 
"Boom boom boom..."

At this time, the skills and life energy of dozens of ancient giants surged through Ye Feng's body.

You know, although these dozens of ancient giants are not very powerful in cultivation, they are a 
family of ancient giants, and their life origins are extremely terrifying.

So at this time, the energy provided to Ye Feng was naturally very huge and majestic.



At this moment, Ye Feng immediately felt that his skill was rapidly improving.

boom!

The sixth level of creation realm!

Ye Feng's cultivation level suddenly made a breakthrough at this time, directly breaking through to 
the first level.

This made Ye Feng's eyes reveal a hint of joyful smile.

Because the cultivation base of dozens of ancient giants is not very strong, but they still made 
breakthroughs in their own cultivation base, which is already very good.

Uh-huh!

At this time, Ye Feng flew quickly towards the surroundings and began to look for the wealth left 
by the ancient giant clan.

For Ye Feng, the most important thing now is to find various resources that can improve his skills.

The inheritance of magic weapons and the like are not that important.

Because now the magic weapon and inheritance in Ye Feng are enough for Ye Feng to use for the 
time being.

Buzz!

With powerful soul power search, Ye Feng's search process was very smooth.

At this time, Ye Feng came to a dilapidated hall and immediately saw the body of an immortal 
ancient giant standing in the hall.



But the ancient giant's chest was pierced, and a black broken sword was inserted into the ancient 
giant's body, nailing it to the ground.

"The body of this ancient giant has not decayed until now, and its vitality has not lost its vitality for 
so many years. It seems that the ancient giant must have been a very tyrannical existence back 
then."

At this time, Ye Feng stared at the body of the immortal ancient giant, with a deep brilliance in his 
eyes.

Because the body of this immortal ancient giant has not decayed after such a long time, it must still 
contain a huge amount of life energy, as well as the skills of ancient powerful men.

So at this time, Ye Feng felt that this immortal ancient giant would be of great help to him.

Uh-huh!

At this moment, Ye Feng walked forward without any hesitation, ready to devour it.

But just when Ye Feng walked in front of this immortal ancient giant.

boom!

The broken black sword that was originally inserted into the body of this ancient giant suddenly 
released a unique and ferocious aura of terror.

In an instant, he rushed towards Ye Feng!

This ferocious aura gave Ye Feng the feeling that it was like an ancient evil demon contained in this 
broken sword, which made people's souls completely shattered.

"Soul Defense!"



At this moment, Ye Feng almost subconsciously released his huge soul power, and condensed a 
thick soul barrier around his head, trying to resist the black broken sword rushing out. The fierce 
atmosphere.

Click, click...

But at this moment, what shocked Ye Feng was that his full 600,000-level soul power, so

The soul barrier formed was unable to withstand this extremely ferocious aura.

Cracks appeared in those who were directly attacked, and it seemed that they would be completely 
shattered in the next moment!

crisis!

A huge crisis!

At this moment, Ye Feng felt a sense of crisis that was about to break his soul.

Ye Feng has never seen such a terrifying weapon.

Originally, Ye Feng felt that this black broken sword had been broken and had passed through a 
long and endless years.

It has definitely lost its spirituality and has completely become a broken weapon without any threat.

But I didn't expect that this seemingly ordinary, even somewhat broken black broken sword could 
release such a terrifying and ferocious energy in an instant.

It was like there was an extremely terrifying ancient evil demon contained in this broken sword, 
possessing extremely terrifying destructive power.

Buzz!



"Golden little tower!"

At this extremely critical moment, Emperor Chu released the small golden tower he had obtained 
before in his mind.

The small golden tower floated right in front of Ye Feng's eyebrows at this moment, and then 
released a huge golden light shield, finally blocking the ferocious aura released from the black 
broken sword.

But it just resisted.

This vicious aura cannot be completely eradicated.

At this moment, Ye Feng could still feel that the ferocious aura was still rapidly eroding his soul.

So at this moment, Ye Feng couldn't help but ask: "Emperor Chu, what kind of weapon is this? It 
has been broken for endless years, why is it still full of such terrifying power?"

Emperor Chu was silent for a moment, and then said aloud in his mind: "I don't really know what 
kind of weapon this black broken sword was back then, but what I am sure of is that this black 
broken sword, It should have been the natal weapon of an ancient peerless evil demon, otherwise it 
would be impossible to have such a terrifying and ferocious aura. Even if the sword is broken, only 
the hilt and a section of the sword body are left, it is still so terrifying and ferocious. "

When Ye Feng heard this, he couldn't help but nodded and said loudly: "The value of this black 
broken sword may be extremely huge. If I can control it, this black broken sword can give me 
infinite destructive power." ”

Emperor Chu said aloud: "It should be difficult to completely control. Now even the two of us 
working together can only resist this vicious aura. I think it's better for you, Ye Feng, to withdraw 
now and think of a way later." , Collect this black broken sword. After all, I can't use the soul gem 
now. If the soul gem is not sealed, I might still give it a try. "

Ye Feng shook his head at this time and said aloud: "Whether it's the ancient giant's body or this 
black broken sword, I don't want to give up so easily. I'm going to give it a try and see how the 
Purple Demon The emperor’s inheritance, can the purple demon soul be integrated into this black 
broken sword, and thus take the initiative?”



"Yes, Ye Feng, you have cultivated the inheritance of an ancient demon god."

Emperor Chu also reacted instantly at this time, and couldn't help but said aloud in his mind: "This 
black broken sword is filled with ferocious energy, it should also be a kind of demonic power, 
maybe Ye Feng, you have cultivated it." The Purple Demon Soul can really take control of this 
black broken sword, so hurry up and give it a try! This black broken sword is definitely a magic 
weapon, even if it is broken! A piece of it can definitely kill all kinds of so-called magic weapons!"

Chapter 2928 I’ll send you to the West first

Ye Feng didn't waste time at this time, because that ferocious aura could break through the defense 
of the golden tower at any time.

"Purple Demonic Soul!"

boom!

At this moment, Ye Feng directly released the inheritance of the Purple Demon Emperor, the Purple 
Demon Soul.

Buzz!

Almost at the next moment, in the void behind Ye Feng, the space suddenly changed.

A demonic soul glowing with purple light instantly appeared and floated in the void behind Ye 
Feng, full of endless majesty.

After this Purple Demon Soul has been cultivated to the end, it will become the shadow of the will 
of the Purple Demon Emperor's true self.

However, Ye Feng has not yet reached the final state of cultivation, but he still possesses a hint of 
the majesty and power of the Purple Demon Emperor. .??.

At this moment, Ye Feng controlled the purple demon soul he had cultivated and charged directly 
towards the black broken sword.



Uh-huh!

The purple demon soul instantly entered the inner space of the black broken sword.

Next, Ye Feng began to wait nervously.

Because he didn't know whether the Ziji Demon Soul could truly control the Black Broken Sword.

But now I can only pray, hoping that the purple demon soul can master this black broken sword.

About half an hour passed.

"I can't hold on anymore!"

Just when Emperor Chu was about to retreat, Ye Feng was about to escape.

Buzz!

Suddenly, the ferocious aura that was attacking Ye Feng disappeared.

Then all the ferocious aura around the black broken sword disappeared.

The black broken sword returned to its normal state again.

"It seems it was successful!"

When Ye Feng saw this scene, his eyes suddenly showed a trace of excitement.

He walked directly to the body of the immortal ancient giant, then stretched out his hand and 
grasped the hilt of the broken black sword.

Buzz!



At this moment, Ye Feng could immediately feel through the hilt of the sword that he was holding a 
very terrifying evil spirit in the inner space of the black broken sword.

But now this evil soul has been controlled and suppressed by the purple demon soul released by Ye 
Feng.

So at this time, the black broken sword no longer released its ferocious energy and was already 
controlled by Ye Feng.

Of course this is only preliminary control.

Ye Feng cannot yet rashly arouse the ferocious energy in this black broken sword.

Otherwise, it is very likely to come back to bite you.

But now that Ye Feng has obtained this black broken sword, Ye Feng has confidence.

In the next time, I will definitely be able to figure out a way to completely control this black broken 
sword.

Click!

At this moment, Ye Feng pulled out this black broken sword from the body of the immortal ancient 
giant.

Wow…

But at the next moment, the body of the immortal ancient giant suddenly turned into ashes.

Ye Feng was dumbfounded when he saw this scene.

He is also preparing to devour the blood and energy in the body of this immortal ancient giant.



At this time, Emperor Chu said aloud in Ye Feng's mind: "It seems that the body of this ancient 
giant is not immortal, but it is because of the energy in this black broken sword that it can maintain 
its original state. Now Ye Feng If you pull out this black broken sword, the entire ancient giant's 
body will naturally turn into ashes."

When Ye Feng heard what Emperor Chu said, he immediately nodded and couldn't help but said 
with some pity: "I thought it could swallow a lot of life energy, but being able to get this black 
broken sword of a peerless demon is also It’s a huge gain.”

At this time, after Ye Feng finished speaking, he directly put the black broken sword into the storage 
ring and could take it out at any time.

use.

Ye Feng knew very well that once the ferocious energy in the black broken sword could be released, 
even if it was just a broken broken sword, it could erupt with extraordinary terrifying and 
destructive power.

Emperor Chu said: "The Great Wilderness Tower has very powerful defensive capabilities, but its 
attack power is definitely not as powerful as this black broken sword. Once the ferocious energy in 
this black broken sword is released, it can literally damage the enemy's body and body." The soul 
does double damage."

When Ye Feng heard what Emperor Chu said, he immediately nodded in agreement.

After all, Ye Feng had just been attacked by the ferocious energy in this black broken sword. .??.

He just felt that his soul was about to be broken.

And you must know that the ferocious aura just now was just the power released casually by the 
black broken sword.

And when Ye Feng truly activates all the ferocious energy in the black broken sword, it will cause 
extremely terrifying destructive power.



At this time, Ye Feng thought for a moment, took out the black broken sword from the storage ring, 
and carried it behind his back.

In this case, he can use the power in his body to circulate the power with the black broken sword 
behind him at any time, and can form an inseparable connection with the black broken sword as 
soon as possible.

After doing all this, Ye Feng left the dilapidated hall, walked out, and continued to search for 
various places in the ancient giant alien living area.

But just when Ye Feng was about to find the next opportunity.

boom!

Suddenly, a huge roar came from a certain direction not far away.

Ye Feng sensed this fluctuation, and immediately couldn't help but move his eyes, and quickly 
rushed in that direction.

When Ye Feng arrived at his destination, he immediately saw a shocking scene.

I saw a dark abyss in the deepest part of this ancient giant.

At this moment, a golden giant covered with golden scales

Man, stood up from the dark abyss, standing tall and tall, full of endless majesty.

At this time, Zhou Tiangang and a group of masters were besieging the golden giant.

This golden giant is not an actual flesh and blood body, but is composed of a golden light, almost 
like a substantial giant.

"This is made up of the power of heaven and earth!"



Ye Feng sensed it in an instant. The golden giant standing up from the dark abyss not far away was 
definitely composed of the power of heaven and earth.

And if you want the power of heaven and earth to form such a powerful golden giant, it means that 
there must be an ancient formation in the dark abyss, so that the power of heaven and earth can be 
mobilized to condense the golden giant for protection.

At this time, Zhou Tiangang, who was fighting in mid-air not far away, saw Ye Feng in an instant.

He immediately spoke out: "Ye Feng, come quickly and fight this golden giant. I want to go to find 
treasures under this abyss."

Zhou Tiangang's tone at this moment was commanding. Apparently he felt that Ye Feng did not dare 
to disobey his order.

After all, Zhou Tiangang is the senior brother among the core disciples of Tiandao Holy Land.

But at this time, Ye Feng just said indifferently: "Why should I listen to you? I will fight the golden 
giant, and you will search for treasures under the abyss. How can there be such a good thing in the 
world?"

Uh-huh!

After saying that, Ye Feng jumped directly into the abyss, preparing to find the treasure.

When Zhou Tiangang saw this scene, he couldn't help but roared angrily: "Ye Feng, humble outer 
disciple, how dare you disobey my senior brother's orders. When you return to the Holy Land of 
Heaven, I will make you suffer terribly." Torture, death is ugly!”

"Um?"

Hearing what Zhou Tiangang said, Ye Feng suddenly stopped going to the dark abyss, but turned 
around and rushed towards Zhou Tiangang, with a cold smile on his face: "If this is the case, then I 
I’ll send you to the West now!”

Chapter 2929 Giant’s Heart



boom!

Almost at the moment Ye Feng finished speaking, he exploded with all his strength and charged 
directly towards Zhou Tiangang.

The killing intent in Ye Feng at this moment was extremely surging, like a vast ocean, trying to 
submerge the entire space.

When Zhou Tiangang saw Ye Feng, he actually went straight towards him and his eyes widened. He 
seemed not to have thought that Ye Feng, a humble outer disciple, would be so courageous.

But the fact is the fact. At this moment, Ye Feng's attack is about to arrive in front of Zhou 
Tiangang.

Swish, swish, swish!

Swish, swish, swish!

At this moment, a group of silver-armored guards around Zhou Tiangang reacted immediately.

All the guards shouted directly: "Boy, you are so impudent that you dare to attack our young master. 
You must die here today!"

Boom boom boom...

At this moment, all the silver armored guards took action with all their strength and turned to attack 
Ye Feng.

These guards are all elites, so the power of attacking together is still very terrifying.

But at this moment, Ye Feng was not afraid at all. He just smiled coldly and said: "A group of 
weaklings."

boom!



The next moment, Ye Feng waved his fist and struck out.

A brilliant light suddenly burst out from Ye Feng's fist.

The vast divine light directly enveloped all the silver armored guards in the light.

Then at this moment, the entire bodies of these silver armored guards, including the armor they 
were wearing, were all destroyed, turned into pieces, and died instantly.

"hateful!"

Seeing that Ye Feng killed all his guards in an instant, Zhou Tiangang, the senior brother among the 
core disciples, immediately shouted angrily: "Damn boy, Ye Feng, you are simply guilty. , even if 
you are Jialan

Junior sister’s friend, I will definitely let you die without a burial place today! "

In fact, Zhou Tiangang has long had a deep murderous intention towards Ye Feng.

This time, I took advantage of the great opportunity to kill Ye Feng in a legitimate manner.

"The fire dragon roars!"

Zhou Tiangang roared loudly at this time and directly displayed a powerful fire attribute 
inheritance.

boom! boom! boom……

Almost at the next moment, nine huge fire dragons rushed out of Zhou Tiangang's body, filled with 
unparalleled burning power.

It directly surrounded Ye Feng, as if it could melt the entire sky.



Zhou Tiangang laughed loudly: "Damn boy, your background is simply not comparable to mine. 
My nine fire dragons are all fire dragon souls condensed by the three flavors of true fire. They can 
destroy the eternal souls above the creation realm." The powerful ones are all trapped and melted, 
boy, just slowly enjoy the burning pain of this endless sea of fire!"

At this time, Zhou Tiangang smiled very wildly, obviously thinking that he had defeated Ye Feng.

"The Great Wilderness Prisoning Heaven Technique!"

Almost at this moment, Ye Feng immediately released the inheritance of the Great Wild God Lord 
that he had just cultivated.

Boom!

All the life force of the earth within a radius of several hundred meters was absorbed into Ye Feng 
instantly.

boom! !

The aura on Ye Feng's body suddenly climbed to a peak.

Then the Great Wilderness Tower appeared in Ye Feng's hand, and he smashed it directly in front of 
him.

Rumble...

The Great Wilderness Tower and the nine fire dragons collided directly.

An extremely terrifying force exploded out, smashing all nine fire dragons into pieces.

"What?!"

Seeing this scene, Zhou Tiangang, who was not far away, immediately widened his eyes.



He was obviously in disbelief that Ye Feng actually possessed such a powerful treasure.

"Boom!" .??.

And at the next moment, Ye Feng didn't give Zhou Tiangang a chance to react.

At this moment, Ye Feng had the huge life energy absorbed from the Great Wilderness Prisoner's 
Heaven Art, and directly took out the black broken sword he had obtained before.

Buzz!

After Ye Feng held the black broken sword, he directly inspired the terrifying and ferocious aura in 
the black broken sword.

Boom!

In an instant, a black sword light, filled with endless ferocity and destructive power, struck directly 
forward.

It was like a peerless evil demon from ancient times rushed out from the black broken sword and 
directly struck Zhou Tiangang with a fierce blow.

Poof!

Zhou Tiangang's entire body was immediately split into two halves.

"ah!!"

A shrill scream instantly came from Zhou Tiangang's broken body.

Then Zhou Tiangang's entire body and soul were split in half by the sword light of the black broken 
sword, killing him instantly.



Uh-huh!

At this time, Ye Feng came to Zhou Tiangang's broken body in an instant, then stretched out his 
hand to grab it, and a black swallowing vortex appeared in the palm of his hand.

The swallowing vortex absorbed all Zhou Tiangang's entire skill.

It has to be said that Zhou Tiangang's cultivation skills are quite rich.

After Ye Feng devoured it, his cultivation level directly broke through again.

Directly from the sixth level of creation realm, breakthrough to

He reached the seventh level of the Creation Realm, which made Ye Feng quite satisfied.

And at this time, Ye Feng seized Zhou Tiangang's storage ring and discovered the training method 
of Fire Dragon Roar from it.

You know, Ye Feng's natal flame is also extremely powerful.

If the fire dragon's roar is displayed, it should be much more powerful than the fire dragon's roar 
displayed by Zhou Tiangang.

At this time, Ye Feng turned around and looked at the golden giant not far away.

At this moment, the golden giant never made a move, but looked at Ye Feng quietly.

Then at this time, the golden giant slowly spoke out: "Young man of the human race, you are very 
powerful, and the black broken sword you hold in your hand has a very mysterious origin. I hope 
you use it with caution."

After the golden giant finished speaking, his entire body suddenly dissipated.



Ye Feng immediately understood that this golden giant had probably consumed all his energy in the 
battle with Zhou Tiangang just now.

At this time, Ye Feng was ready to go directly into the black abyss below to find treasures.

Before, Zhou Tiangang led a group of guards to fight this golden giant, probably to plot something 
under the abyss.

Uh-huh!

Ye Feng did not hesitate at this moment and jumped directly into the abyss.

When Ye Feng arrived under the abyss, he immediately saw a shocking scene.

I saw a skeleton measuring tens of thousands of feet lying on the ground.

Obviously this was the body of an ancient giant. The flesh and blood had decayed, leaving behind 
such a shockingly large skeleton.

Emperor Chu suddenly spoke up: "This is the skeleton of the ancient giant king. I know what Zhou 
Tiangang is planning when he comes here."

Ye Feng's eyes moved and asked: "What is it?"

Emperor Chu slowly spoke: "The heart of a giant."

Chapter 2930 You are in big trouble

"Heart of a Giant?"

When Ye Feng heard what Emperor Chu said, there was a hint of doubt in his eyes, and he asked 
aloud: "Is the heart of the giant you are talking about the heart of this ancient giant emperor?"

"That's right."



Emperor Chu nodded and continued to speak in his mind: "Ye Feng, find the Giant's Heart and 
refine it into yourself. You will be able to obtain the power of the ancient Giant Emperor in the 
Giant's Heart. For you The improvement of combat power has huge benefits.”

"The power of the ancient giant emperor?"

When Ye Feng heard what Emperor Chu said, his eyes immediately showed surprise.

Ye Feng knew very well that the power of those ordinary ancient giants were very arrogant and 
extremely powerful.

Not to mention the emperor among the ancient giants!

If you can get the power of the ancient giant emperor, then the power of your chaotic body will be 
even higher.

Uh-huh!

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately rushed forward quickly.

Hard work pays off.

Half an hour later, Ye Feng finally found the heart of the ancient giant emperor in a sealed amethyst 
jar at the deepest point of the abyss.

At this moment, the giant's heart was still radiating red light, surging with infinite blood energy, and 
beating constantly, giving Ye Feng a feeling of majesty and majesty.

Every time the giant's heart beats, the whole world faintly echoes with this heart, which makes Ye 
Feng feel quite shocked.

"Refining!"



At this moment, Ye Feng did not hesitate and directly released his chaotic power, wrapping the heart 
of the giant in front of him, and then pulled it and merged it into his body.

Fortunately, Ye Feng's body is like a big melting pot, able to accommodate all things in the world, 
so he can truly integrate this giant into his own body.

in the body, and the process was very smooth.

Ye Feng felt that Zhou Tiangang also came here to find the heart of this giant.

However, Zhou Tiangang was unlucky and provoked Ye Feng, and his end was naturally extremely 
miserable.

After all, today's Ye Feng is no longer the weak human boy before, but has grown into a super 
strong man in the human race in the center of the God Realm.

It has to be said that Ye Feng's chaos power is extremely domineering and terrifying.

Even the Giant's Heart, after resisting for half an hour, could no longer resist it. It was directly 
pulled into Ye Feng's body and fused.

Buzz!

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately clenched his fists and felt that his body was filled with the 
power of an ancient giant.

"Is this the power of the ancient giant emperor?"

Ye Feng couldn't help but murmur to himself at this moment, with a divine light flashing in his 
eyes, and he looked extremely powerful.

Uh-huh!



At this time, Ye Feng suddenly turned around and looked at the huge skeleton left by the ancient 
giant king lying under the abyss.

For others, perhaps this skeleton has no purpose.

But for Ye Feng, it has a huge effect.

Because the skeleton left by the ancient giant king is extremely strong.

Ye Feng can use the God Clan gloves to extract the bone attribute power of the Ancient Giant 
Emperor, which may be used to increase the strength of his Chaos Body.

Uh-huh!

At this moment, Ye Feng stretched out his hand directly and released

The Protoss Glove came and touched the skeleton left by the ancient giant king.

"Buzz..."

Almost at this moment, Ye Feng immediately felt that a very strong attribute power was directly 
absorbed into his body, and was rapidly growing every inch of his body.

Ye Feng sensed this power and immediately showed deep joy in his eyes.

really!

The skeleton left by this ancient giant emperor contains very rich solid attribute power, which can 
increase the strength of his body and provide huge nutrients.

"boom!"



At this moment, the strength of Ye Feng's chaotic body once again began to undergo a huge 
transformation.

Previously, Ye Feng's chaotic body had broken through to the ninth level of the late sixth 
heaven. .??.

Now the strength of Ye Feng's chaotic body continues to grow and become stronger.

In the end, when the entire tens of thousands of meters long huge skeleton was completely absorbed 
and turned into ashes.

All the bone strength in the skeleton is integrated into Ye Feng's body.

This allowed Ye Feng's Chaos Body strength to rapidly transform from the ninth level of the late 
Sixth Heaven to the tenth level of the Chaos Body's Sixth Great Perfection!

This is a huge improvement and transformation!

As long as Ye Feng gets some kind of magical object next, he can improve his body's physical 
strength.

Ye Feng can completely break through the bottleneck of the tenth level of the Great Perfection of 
the Sixth Heaven, and can step into a new level, directly impacting into the seventh heaven of the 
Chaos Body.

At that time, Ye Feng will once again awaken a very special and powerful blood talent.

Because of the technique awakened by Ye Feng, the Chaos Heavenly Emperor Technique, Ye Feng

Every time the strength of the Wind Chaos Body increases by a large level, a blood talent can be 
awakened.

Ye Feng is looking forward to it. What kind of powerful new bloodline talent will he awaken in the 
seventh heaven of the Chaos Body that he is about to enter?



Ye Feng thought in his heart, and then left this dark abyss.

Because there is nothing left to find down there.

But Ye Feng has already received huge benefits this time.

Not only did he get a powerful inheritance from Zhou Tiangang, the Roar of the Fire Dragon, but he 
also got the Heart of the Giant, and the strength of his Chaos Body was also increased so much.

Even though Ye Feng's cultivation level has not improved much during this period, Ye Feng's 
comprehensive combat power at this moment is many times stronger than before.

Uh-huh!

When Ye Feng flew out of the dark abyss, he suddenly saw a beautiful figure of a woman in blue 
flying over from a short distance away.

It was Senior Sister Jialan.

"Senior Sister Jialan, it seems that we have found something good." Ye Feng immediately greeted 
him with a smile.

"It's okay, I did find some good stuff."

Jia Lan smiled at this time, and then seemed to have discovered something. Suddenly his face 
changed and he couldn't help but said, "Is Zhou Tiangang dead?"

After finishing speaking, Jialan squatted down and found a fragment of Zhou Tiangang's natal soul 
card from the ruins on the ground.

Ye Feng said nonchalantly at this time: "He provoked me, I will kill him."

"Did you kill Zhou Tiangang?"



A trace of worry appeared on Jialan's beautiful face, and she said loudly: "Zhou Tiangang is the 
controlling family behind our Tiandao Holy Land. The young master of the Zhou family, his status 
is extremely noble. Ye Feng, this time you It's a big disaster."
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