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Chapter 331 Banquet

Ye Feng looked at Chu Huanxue in his arms, couldn't help stroking her black hair, and said with a 
smile: "It's not a separation of life and death. Even if I leave in the future, there will still be a chance 
to meet again."

Although Ye Feng said so, Chu Huanxue knew very well that the geniuses who could participate in 
the Hundred Dynasties War would either die or join the overlords who stood high at the top of the 
pyramid and become immortal figures.

At this time, Chu Huanxue actually had a great desire to annex the world in her little heart, not to 
fight for hegemony, but just to accompany Ye Feng.

"Let's go, the time is almost up. Let's go directly to the Sixth Prince's Mansion. This Sixth Prince 
should know the reasons for the decline of the Seventh Prince's Mansion."

Ye Feng chatted with Chu Huanxue for a while, and then pulled Chu Huanxue towards the Sixth 
Prince's Mansion.

Now that he has entered the half-step magical realm, Ye Feng finds that he is more and more 
confident.

At this time, he didn't even think about how powerful the mastermind behind the Seventh Prince's 
Mansion was, because in Suzaku City, as long as no superpowerful overlord interfered, Ye Feng 
was not afraid of anyone.

Two people were walking on the bustling streets of Suzaku City. .??.

In fact, it was at this time that Ye Feng truly began to appreciate the imperial city, one of the top ten 
super dynasties.

It has to be said that Zhuque City is many times more prosperous than the imperial capital of the 
Dayan Dynasty.



This can be seen from the fact that the width of the streets is several times wider than that of the 
Great Yan Dynasty.

Both sides of the street are lined with splendid buildings, such as taverns, pavilions, weapon shops, 
medicine houses, romantic places, etc., all of which represent the ultimate prosperity in the world.

This kind of scene cannot be seen in the sect. The various aspects of life and the hustle and bustle of 
the world are all revealed in front of your eyes.

At this time, Ye Feng suddenly understood why some old monsters with extremely powerful 
cultivation would choose to practice in the world. Looking at the various aspects of life, it indeed 
played a huge role in condensing his martial arts heart.

At this time, even Ye Feng couldn't help but slow down.

A long memory came to mind in his mind.

\u003eThree thousand years ago, his father also took him to visit these ancient cities.

However, in order to prevent accidents at that time, his father always took him on tours at high 
altitudes, because in his previous life, he was cursed by God and could not bear any harm and was 
very fragile.

Now Ye Feng finally relies on his own power to cross the sea of people and see all the prosperity of 
the world.

"Master, we are here."

Chu Huanxue suddenly spoke in his ear.

Unknowingly, the two of them had arrived at the gate of a very luxurious mansion.

"Congratulations to Mr. Ye Feng and Little Princess Huanxue!"



At the entrance of the Sixth Prince's Mansion, the Sixth Prince had obviously arranged for people to 
greet them, and they all knew the looks of Ye Feng and Chu Huanxue.

"Let's go."

Ye Feng and Chu Huanxue walked into the Sixth Prince's Mansion. What surprised them was that in 
the Sixth Prince's Mansion, there were noble people walking on the road wearing brocade clothes 
and satin.

Moreover, outside the door of the mansion, distinguished guests kept coming in one after another, in 
an endless stream.

"The Sixth Prince originally invited all the celebrities in Suzaku City tonight, and wanted to 
congratulate the old man on his birthday."

The guard of the Sixth Prince's Palace who led Ye Feng and Chu Huanxue in the direction actually 
whispered in their ears.

Ye Feng suddenly realized.

He thought that the banquet hosted by the Sixth Prince tonight was a private banquet with not many 
people, but he did not expect that it was to celebrate the birthday of the old man of the Sixth 
Prince's Mansion, and that all the dignitaries and big families in Suzaku City were here.

However, Ye Feng didn't care. The reason why he agreed to the Sixth Prince's invitation was 
because he wanted to find out what kind of force had attacked the Seventh Prince's Palace and 
deprived Chu Huanxue of his title.

"Then let's take a rest and have a meal. I'll ask the Sixth Prince after the meal."

Ye Feng smiled and said to Chu Huanxue beside him.

"Uh-huh."

Chu Huanxue nodded her head vigorously.



Since the decline of her family, the little princess of the Seventh Prince's Palace has not attended 
such an upper-class gathering for a long time. Ye Feng looked at Chu Huanxue in his arms, couldn't 
help stroking her black hair, and said with a smile: "It's not a separation of life and death. Even if I 
leave in the future, there will still be a chance to meet again."

Although Ye Feng said so, Chu Huanxue knew very well that the geniuses who could participate in 
the Hundred Dynasties War would either die or join the overlords who stood high at the top of the 
pyramid and become immortal figures.

At this time, Chu Huanxue actually had a great desire to annex the world in her little heart, not to 
fight for hegemony, but just to accompany Ye Feng.

"Let's go, the time is almost up. Let's go directly to the Sixth Prince's Mansion. This Sixth Prince 
should know the reasons for the decline of the Seventh Prince's Mansion."

Ye Feng chatted with Chu Huanxue for a while, and then pulled Chu Huanxue towards the Sixth 
Prince's Mansion.

Now that he has entered the half-step magical realm, Ye Feng finds that he is getting more and more 
confident.

At this time, he didn't even think about how powerful the mastermind behind the Seventh Prince's 
Mansion was, because in Suzaku City, as long as no superpowerful overlord interfered, Ye Feng 
was not afraid of anyone.

Two people were walking on the bustling streets of Suzaku City. ??

In fact, it was at this time that Ye Feng truly began to appreciate the imperial city, one of the top ten 
super dynasties.

It has to be said that Zhuque City is many times more prosperous than the imperial capital of the 
Dayan Dynasty.

This can be seen from the fact that the width of the streets is several times wider than that of the 
Great Yan Dynasty.



Both sides of the street are lined with splendid buildings, such as taverns, pavilions, weapon shops, 
medicine houses, romantic places, etc., all of which represent the ultimate prosperity in the world.

This kind of scene can't be seen in the sect. The various aspects of life and the hustle and bustle of 
the world are all revealed in front of your eyes.

At this time, Ye Feng suddenly understood why some old monsters with extremely powerful 
cultivation would choose to enter the world and practice. Looking at the various aspects of life, it 
indeed had a huge effect on condensing his martial arts heart.

At this time, even Ye Feng couldn't help but slow down.

A long memory came to mind in his mind.

\u003eThree thousand years ago, his father also took him to visit these ancient cities.

However, in order to prevent accidents at that time, his father always took him on high-altitude 
tours, because in his previous life, he was cursed by God and could not bear any harm and was very 
fragile.

Now Ye Feng finally relies on his own power to cross the sea of people and see all the prosperity of 
the world.

"Master, we are here."

Chu Huanxue suddenly spoke in his ear.

Unknowingly, the two of them had arrived at the gate of a very luxurious mansion.

"Congratulations to Mr. Ye Feng and Little Princess Huanxue!"

At the entrance of the Sixth Prince's Mansion, the Sixth Prince had obviously arranged for people to 
greet them, and they all knew the looks of Ye Feng and Chu Huanxue.



"Let's go."

Ye Feng and Chu Huanxue walked into the Sixth Prince's Mansion. What surprised them was that in 
the Sixth Prince's Mansion, there were noble people walking on the road wearing brocade clothes 
and satin.

Moreover, outside the door of the mansion, distinguished guests kept coming in one after another, in 
an endless stream.

"The Sixth Prince originally invited all the celebrities in Suzaku City tonight, and wanted to 
congratulate the old man on his birthday."

The guard of the Sixth Prince's Palace who led Ye Feng and Chu Huanxue in the direction actually 
whispered in their ears.

Ye Feng suddenly realized.

He thought that the banquet hosted by the Sixth Prince tonight was a private banquet with not many 
people, but he did not expect that it was to celebrate the birthday of the old man of the Sixth 
Prince's Mansion, and that all the dignitaries and big families in Suzaku City were here.

However, Ye Feng didn't care. The reason why he agreed to the Sixth Prince's invitation was 
because he wanted to find out what force had attacked the Seventh Prince's Palace and deprived 
Chu Huanxue of his title.

"Then let's rest and have a meal. I'll ask the Sixth Prince after the meal."

Ye Feng smiled and said to Chu Huanxue beside him.

"Uh-huh."

Chu Huanxue nodded her head vigorously.



Since the decline of her family, the little princess of the Seventh Prince's Palace has not attended 
such an upper-class gathering for a long time.

Chapter 332 The mastermind behind the scenes

When Ye Feng and Chu Huanxue walked to the central hall of the Sixth Prince's Mansion, they 
found that many people were already sitting in it.

"Master Ye Feng, you are finally here, brother, I have been waiting for you for a long time!"

Suddenly at this moment, the Sixth Prince's loud laughter sounded in the hall.

He now attaches great importance to Ye Feng.

I saw the Sixth Prince taking two steps at a time, walking quickly in front of Ye Feng, and said with 
a smile: "Master Ye Feng, I have reserved your seat for you. Come and sit here quickly."

With that said, the Sixth Prince pulled Ye Feng over and Chu Huanxue quickly followed.

This scene made many guests present look surprised. .??.

They were able to come to the Sixth Prince's Mansion to attend the old man's birthday, so naturally 
they were all respectable people in Suzaku City.

But now suddenly a strange young boy appeared. No one had seen him before, but the Sixth Prince 
paid so much attention to him and treated him so much.

This made many people stare at the young man in black with surprise.

"Who is this boy? Is he the disciple of some old monster? No, even those disciples of the old 
monster, although they have noble status, are not worthy of being treated like this by a big man like 
the Sixth Prince. It feels like groveling. "

"Look at the girl in blue next to the boy in black. Isn't she an orphan from the Seventh Prince's 
Palace? Her name seems to be Chu Huanxue. She is following the boy in black. Could it be that this 
boy in black is from the Seventh Prince's Palace?"



"In the turmoil a few years ago, all the masters in the Seventh Prince's Palace were wiped out, and 
almost everyone died. If the Emperor hadn't thought of his old friendship and preserved Chu 
Huanxue, the Seventh Prince's only bloodline, I'm afraid the entire Seventh Prince's Palace would 
have been destroyed. It’s truly unprecedented.”

At this time, many people around were talking in low voices.

Everyone's eyes showed complex expressions such as surprise, confusion, horror, etc.

Because Ye Feng looks too young, only eighteen or nineteen years old. What is the origin of such a 
young man?

However, no one dared to challenge Ye Feng or anything, because no one was a fool.

The young man in black asked the Sixth Prince to treat him so seriously, regardless of whether he 
was

No matter whether he is powerful or has a noble status, no one can afford to offend him.

Therefore, the dignitaries present and the heads of the big families kept their expressions 
unchanged, continued to talk politely to each other, and continued to drink and eat.

Ye Feng did not pay attention to the surprised looks from the people around him, because perhaps 
these people were high-ranking figures in the eyes of others, but in Ye Feng's eyes, they were no 
different from normal people.

Ye Feng and Chu Huanxue sat on the side closest to the throne above.

The Sixth Prince then smiled at everyone present and said, "The banquet has officially begun!"

The moment he finished speaking, graceful dancers walked out from both sides of the hall and 
began to sing and dance.

The entire hall suddenly fell into excitement and excitement.



"Master Ye Feng, let's toast you."

The Sixth Prince, a luxurious middle-aged woman, and Chu Yuxiao, the dandy young prince, 
walked up to Ye Feng.

"Sixth Prince, I want to go to a place with you alone and ask you some questions."

Ye Feng suddenly spoke up.

"good."

The Sixth Prince did not refuse, turned around and led Ye Feng towards the outside of the hall.

"Huanxue, stay here and wait for me to come back."

Ye Feng said to Chu Huanxue.

Today's Chu Huanxue is no longer the weak little girl before.

Under Ye Feng's guidance, her strength skyrocketed and she was already considered a second-rate 
master in Suzaku City.

"Master, I will wait here for you to come back."

Chu Huanxue nodded immediately, very well-behaved.

…

Under the dark night, Ye Feng and the Sixth Prince came alone to a rockery and flowing water 
outside the main hall.

The Sixth Prince was silent for a while and said: "Young Master Ye Feng probably wants to know 
the man behind the decline of the Seventh Prince's Palace."



Ye Feng nodded and said: "Yes, just tell me directly. There is no need to taboo anything. You also 
know that I am not afraid of any so-called taboo forces and people in Suzaku City." When Ye Feng 
and Chu Huanxue When they walked to the central hall of the Sixth Prince's Mansion, they found 
that many people were already sitting in it.

"Master Ye Feng, you are finally here, brother, I have been waiting for you for a long time!"

Suddenly at this moment, the Sixth Prince's loud laughter sounded in the hall.

He now attaches great importance to Ye Feng.

I saw the Sixth Prince taking two steps at a time, walking quickly in front of Ye Feng, and said with 
a smile: "Master Ye Feng, I have reserved your seat for you. Come and sit here quickly."

With that said, the Sixth Prince pulled Ye Feng over and Chu Huanxue quickly followed.

This scene made many guests present look with surprise in their eyes.

They were able to come to the Sixth Prince's Mansion to attend the old man's birthday, so naturally 
they were all respectable people in Suzaku City.

But now suddenly a strange young boy appeared. No one had seen him before, but the Sixth Prince 
paid so much attention to him and treated him so much.

This made many people stare at the young man in black with surprise.

"Who is this person? Is he a disciple of an old monster? No, even those disciples of the old monster, 
although they have noble status, are not worthy of being treated like this by a big man like the Sixth 
Prince. It feels like groveling. "

"Look at the girl in blue next to the boy in black. Isn't she an orphan from the Seventh Prince's 
Palace? Her name seems to be Chu Huanxue. She is following the boy in black. Could it be that this 
boy in black is from the Seventh Prince's Palace?"



"In the turmoil a few years ago, all the masters in the Seventh Prince's Palace were wiped out, and 
almost everyone died. If the Emperor hadn't thought of his old friendship and preserved Chu 
Huanxue, the Seventh Prince's only bloodline, I'm afraid the entire Seventh Prince's Palace would 
have been destroyed. It’s truly unprecedented.”

At this time, many people around were talking in low voices.

Everyone's eyes showed complex expressions such as surprise, confusion, horror, etc.

Because Ye Feng looks too young, only eighteen or nineteen years old. What is the origin of such a 
young man?

However, no one dared to challenge Ye Feng or anything, because no one was a fool.

The young man in black asked the Sixth Prince to treat him so seriously, regardless of whether he 
was

No matter whether he is powerful or has a noble status, no one can afford to offend him.

Therefore, the dignitaries present and the heads of the big families kept their expressions 
unchanged, continued to talk politely to each other, and continued to drink and eat.

Ye Feng did not pay attention to the surprised looks from the people around him, because perhaps 
these people were high-ranking figures in the eyes of others, but in Ye Feng's eyes, they were no 
different from normal people.

Ye Feng and Chu Huanxue sat on the side closest to the throne above.

The Sixth Prince then smiled at everyone present and said, "The banquet has officially begun!"

The moment he finished speaking, graceful dancers walked out from both sides of the hall and 
began to sing and dance.

The entire hall suddenly fell into excitement and excitement.



"Master Ye Feng, let's toast you."

The Sixth Prince, a luxurious middle-aged woman, and Chu Yuxiao, the dandy young prince, 
walked up to Ye Feng.

"Sixth Prince, I want to go to a place with you alone and ask you some questions."

Ye Feng suddenly spoke up.

"good."

The Sixth Prince did not refuse, turned around and led Ye Feng towards the outside of the hall.

"Huanxue, stay here and wait for me to come back."

Ye Feng said to Chu Huanxue.

Today's Chu Huanxue is no longer the weak little girl before.

Under Ye Feng's guidance, her strength skyrocketed and she was already considered a second-rate 
master in Suzaku City.

"Master, I will wait here for you to come back."

Chu Huanxue nodded immediately, very well-behaved.

…

Under the dark night, Ye Feng and the Sixth Prince came alone to a rockery and flowing water 
outside the main hall.

The Sixth Prince was silent for a while and said: "Young Master Ye Feng probably wants to know 
the man behind the decline of the Seventh Prince's Palace."



Ye Feng nodded and said: "Yes, just tell me directly. There is no need to taboo anything. You also 
know that I am not afraid of any so-called taboo forces and people in Suzaku City."

Chapter 333 High Priest

Ye Feng's tone of voice at this time was filled with a deep and powerful confidence.

Perhaps to other people's ears, Ye Feng's words sounded very arrogant.

But at this time, Ye Feng didn't have any pride in his heart at all. He really said this very calmly, just 
stating a fact.

The Sixth Prince stared at the young man in black in front of him, secretly surprised in his heart.

But soon the Sixth Prince calmed down and said: "Actually, no one expected the sudden decline of 
the Seventh Prince's Palace back then. However, I did send spies to inquire about some information. 
It seems that the destruction of the Seventh Prince's Palace and the Seventh Prince's Palace The 
prince has angered Murong Qianjue, the high priest of our Suzaku Dynasty."

"High Priest, Murong Qianjue?"

Ye Feng's eyes moved. He had also lived in Suzaku City for a while and knew a lot of things.

For example, the high priest of the Suzaku Dynasty, Murong Qianjue, was said to be an alluring 
woman with mysterious and unpredictable abilities.

Although she is a woman, Murong Qianjue is the high priest personally consecrated by the late 
Emperor of the Suzaku Dynasty, and it is said that her methods are very mysterious and 
unpredictable. She was once able to trigger the thunder from the sky with a wave of her hand and 
destroy a barbarian tribe in the wilderness. .

Therefore, the prestige of the high priest Murong Qianjue among the people of the Zhuque Dynasty 
is even higher than that of the current emperor of the Zhuque Dynasty.

So at this time, the Sixth Prince said that the decline of the Seventh Prince's Palace was related to 
the high priest Murong Qianjue, and Ye Feng suddenly began to ponder slightly.



The only thing he couldn't understand about the Suzaku Dynasty was probably the high priest 
Murong Qianjue.

Because during this period, the news that Ye Feng heard the most from the people around him was 
about Murong Qianjue.

Even in the heart of the little Chu Huanxue, Murong Qianjue, the high priest and the legendary 
woman who was unparalleled in beauty, was still Chu Huanxue's idol.

Ye Feng was silent for a while and said: "Sixth Prince, the title of prince and marquis that this girl 
Huanxue was supposed to inherit is also a great sacrifice."

Deprived by the company? "

"That's not true."

The Sixth Prince shook his head and said: "The princely title that Chu Huanxue wanted to inherit 
was taken back by the Emperor because this girl Chu Huanxue is a woman and her cultivation is too 
weak."

Ye Feng nodded and said: "I know this, but now that Huanxue is no longer weak, how can she 
regain her previous title of prince?"

The Sixth Prince said: "As long as you can win the top ten in the royal competition held every six 
months, you will be rewarded by the emperor and regain the title of prince. However, the royal 
competition not only includes the heirs of various nobles, but also many other Suzaku disciples. The 
young talents from all regions of the dynasty are all masters.”

Hearing this, Ye Feng nodded and said, "One last question for you, when is the next royal 
competition?"

The Sixth Prince said: "It is almost the end of the year, and the royal competition is expected to be 
held during the winter hunting next month, allowing many participating young geniuses to enter a 
deep mountain forest to hunt each other. This is how our Suzaku Dynasty selects talents. 
mechanism."



"I see."

Ye Feng finally nodded, turned around and walked towards the distance.

He walked to the banquet hall, came to Chu Huanxue, and said, "Let's go back with me."

After saying that, Ye Feng walked directly outside.

Chu Huanxue was very obedient in front of Ye Feng, and followed Ye Feng directly towards the 
outside of the hall without asking why.

"Hurry up and catch this thief who took advantage of our old man's 80th birthday to steal things! He 
stole all the things he stole from our Sixth Prince's Mansion. He really took advantage of the heart 
of a bear and the courage of a leopard!"

Suddenly at this moment, there was a burst of noise outside the hall, which immediately attracted 
the attention of many people.

Even Ye Feng was looking slightly not far away, but at this glance, he saw a figure that he had not 
seen for a long time but was extremely familiar. Ye Feng's originally indifferent eyes suddenly 
became... Startled. Ye Feng's tone of voice at this time was filled with a deep and powerful 
confidence.

Perhaps to other people's ears, Ye Feng's words sounded very arrogant.

But at this time, Ye Feng didn't have any pride in his heart at all. He really said this very calmly, just 
stating a fact.

The Sixth Prince stared at the young man in black in front of him, secretly surprised in his heart.

But soon the Sixth Prince calmed down and said: "Actually, no one expected the sudden decline of 
the Seventh Prince's Palace back then. However, I did send spies to inquire about some information. 
It seems that the destruction of the Seventh Prince's Palace and the Seventh Prince's Palace The 
prince has angered Murong Qianjue, the high priest of our Suzaku Dynasty."



"High Priest, Murong Qianjue?"

Ye Feng's eyes moved. He had also lived in Suzaku City for a while and knew a lot of things.

For example, the high priest of the Suzaku Dynasty, Murong Qianjue, was said to be an alluring 
woman with mysterious and unpredictable abilities.

Although she is a woman, Murong Qianjue is the high priest personally consecrated by the late 
Emperor of the Suzaku Dynasty, and it is said that her methods are very mysterious and 
unpredictable. She was able to trigger the thunder from the sky with a wave of her hand and destroy 
a barbarian tribe in the wilderness. .

Therefore, the prestige of the high priest Murong Qianjue among the people of the Zhuque Dynasty 
is even higher than that of the current emperor of the Zhuque Dynasty. ??

So at this time, the Sixth Prince said that the decline of the Seventh Prince's Palace was related to 
the high priest Murong Qianjue, and Ye Feng suddenly began to ponder slightly.

The only thing he couldn't understand about the Suzaku Dynasty was probably the high priest 
Murong Qianjue.

Because during this period, the news that Ye Feng heard the most from the people around him was 
about Murong Qianjue.

Even in the heart of the little Chu Huanxue, Murong Qianjue, the high priest and the legendary 
woman who was unparalleled in beauty, was still Chu Huanxue's idol.

Ye Feng was silent for a while and said: "Sixth Prince, the title of prince and marquis that this girl 
Huanxue was supposed to inherit is also a great sacrifice."

Deprived by the company? "

"That's not true."



The Sixth Prince shook his head and said: "The princely title that Chu Huanxue wanted to inherit 
was taken back by the Emperor because this girl Chu Huanxue is a woman and her cultivation is too 
weak."

Ye Feng nodded and said: "I know this, but now that Huanxue is no longer weak, how can she 
regain her previous title of prince?"

The Sixth Prince said: "As long as you can win the top ten in the royal competition held every six 
months, you will be rewarded by the emperor and regain the title of prince. However, the royal 
competition not only includes the heirs of various nobles, but also many other Suzaku disciples. The 
young talents from all regions of the dynasty are all masters.”

Hearing this, Ye Feng nodded and said, "One last question for you, when is the next royal 
competition?"

The Sixth Prince said: "It is almost the end of the year, and the royal competition is expected to be 
held during the winter hunting next month, allowing many participating young geniuses to enter a 
deep mountain forest to hunt each other. This is how our Suzaku Dynasty selects talents. 
mechanism."

"I see."

Ye Feng nodded finally, turned around and walked towards the distance.

He walked to the banquet hall, came to Chu Huanxue, and said, "Let's go back with me."

After saying that, Ye Feng walked directly outside.

Chu Huanxue was very obedient in front of Ye Feng, and followed Ye Feng directly towards the 
outside of the hall without asking why.

"Hurry up and catch this thief who took advantage of our old man's 80th birthday to steal things! He 
stole all the things he stole from our Sixth Prince's Mansion. He really took advantage of the heart 
of a bear and the courage of a leopard!"



Suddenly at this moment, there was a burst of noise outside the hall, which immediately attracted 
the attention of many people.

Even Ye Feng was looking slightly not far away, but at this glance, he saw a figure that he had not 
seen for a long time but was extremely familiar. Ye Feng's originally indifferent eyes suddenly 
became... Startled.

Chapter 334 Old Friend

At this time, the figure that appeared in Ye Feng's field of vision was cursing: "Who is the thief? 
You guys, please understand that I am not a thief. I just came to pay your birthday to your old man. 
It's just your Sixth Prince's Mansion." Too big, I got lost and accidentally walked into your palace 
treasure house and just touched a weapon. Fortunately, you are still a noble of the super dynasty, 
why are you so stingy? "

Almost at the moment when the figure finished speaking, everyone on the scene, including Ye Feng, 
could not help but twitch the corners of their mouths.

I got lost while praying for my birthday, and ended up in the treasure house of the Sixth Prince's 
Mansion.

Who would believe such nonsense?

The speaker was a middle-aged man with a scar on his face. He was very tall, but there was a hint 
of a smile on his rough face.

Because in his hand, he was holding a dagger made of black gold. It looked very precious. It was 
obviously a treasure stolen from the treasure house of the Sixth Prince's Mansion.

Holding the treasures of the Sixth Prince's Palace in his hand, he said that he got lost and entered 
the treasure house by mistake. The words of this middle-aged man with a scar made people feel that 
he was in need of treatment.

Even Ye Feng felt that what he said really deserved a beating.

But Ye Feng had a smile on his face at this time and shouted from a distance: "Uncle Scar, long time 
no see."



That’s right!

The figure that shocked Ye Feng at this moment was an old friend he had not seen for a long time, 
Uncle Scar!

Ye Feng still remembers that when he was in the Great Yan Dynasty, he and Uncle Scar once 
planned to plot the Demon Lord's treasure house in the Demon City.

As a result, he got the Demon Lord's armor, and Uncle Scar got the Demon Lord's inherited skills 
and the body of a true demon.

However, Ye Feng never expected that he would meet Uncle Scar in the imperial city of the Suzaku 
Dynasty, which was an unknown distance away from the Great Yan Dynasty.

But what leaves Ye Feng speechless is that Uncle Scar still hasn't gotten rid of his habit of sneaking 
around.

Uncle Scar heard Ye Feng's voice, and he was a little surprised who was calling him.

But when he turned around and saw Ye Feng, Uncle Scar immediately opened his mouth and 
couldn't help but said: "Damn...boy Ye Feng! Why are you here!"

Uncle Scar never expected that in this strange place

In a foreign country, I unexpectedly ran into an old friend from back then.

"Who is this uncle?"

Chu Huanxue's small face was full of deep curiosity.

She and Ye Feng had been together day and night for so long, and this was the first time she saw her 
always majestic master showing an expression of astonishment.



This made Chu Huanxue couldn't help but smile. For a moment, the girl looked at Ye Feng, and the 
deepest feeling in her heart was less dependence on the master, and more feeling that Chu Huanxue 
herself was An indescribable sense of happiness.

"Boy Ye Feng, are you attending a banquet here? It seems that you are a distinguished guest of the 
Sixth Prince's Palace. Come and tell me, I am not a thief, but a gentleman!"

As Uncle Scar spoke, he shamelessly put the black gold dagger in his hand into his storage ring.

When Ye Feng saw this scene, he walked over with a dark face and whispered: "Uncle Scar, why 
are you here? You haven't gotten rid of your sneaky habit yet."

Ye Feng was still a little happy when he met his old friend.

At this time, people around saw that this middle-aged man with a scar was chatting with Ye Feng, 
and it seemed that the two were very familiar with each other.

Several guards from the Sixth Prince's Mansion retreated one after another.

After all, Ye Feng was treated so politely by the Sixth Prince before, which made everyone look in 
awe of Ye Feng, the young man in black.

Chu Huanxue walked over at this time, staring at Uncle Scar curiously with a pair of big and smart 
eyes, and asked: "Master, is this uncle your friend?"

"Boy Ye Feng, you can do it!"

Uncle Scar stretched out a thick arm, hugged Ye Feng to one side, and whispered: "I haven't seen 
you for many years, you are so cool now, you actually accepted such a beautiful little girl as your 
apprentice, I'm so envious. "

Chu Huanxue's cultivation was much stronger now. She also heard Uncle Scar's words, and a trace 
of rosy color suddenly appeared on the girl's fair face.

"Stop talking nonsense."



Ye Feng rolled his eyes at Uncle Scar, then grabbed his collar and said: "Uncle Scar, don't think that 
I don't know. You came all the way to Suzaku City, and you must have gotten some good secret 
information, treasure. ? Or the inheritance of the peerless power? Come on! Don’t think about it 
alone!” The figure that appeared in Ye Feng’s field of vision was cursing: “You guys need to figure 
it out. I'm not a thief, I just came to pay my respects to your old man's birthday. It's just that your 
Sixth Prince's Palace is too big. I got lost. I accidentally walked into your palace's treasure house 
and touched a weapon. Fortunately, you are still a noble of the super dynasty. Why? So stingy!”

Almost at the moment when the figure finished speaking, everyone on the scene, including Ye Feng, 
could not help but twitch the corners of their mouths.

I got lost while praying for my birthday, and ended up in the treasure house of the Sixth Prince's 
Mansion.

Who would believe such nonsense?

The speaker was a middle-aged man with a scar on his face. He was very tall, but there was a hint 
of a smile on his rough face.

Because in his hand, he was holding a dagger made of black gold. It looked very precious. It was 
obviously a treasure stolen from the treasure house of the Sixth Prince's Mansion.

Holding the treasure of the Sixth Prince's Palace in his hand, he said that he got lost and entered the 
treasure house by mistake. The words of this middle-aged man with a scar made people feel that he 
was in need of treatment.

Even Ye Feng felt that what he said really deserved a beating.

But Ye Feng had a smile on his face at this time and shouted from a distance: "Uncle Scar, long time 
no see."

That's right!

The figure that shocked Ye Feng at this moment was an old friend he had not seen for a long time, 
Uncle Scar!



Ye Feng still remembers that when he was in the Great Yan Dynasty, he and Uncle Scar once 
planned to plot the Demon Lord's treasure house in the Demon City.

As a result, he got the Demon Lord's armor, and Uncle Scar got the Demon Lord's inherited skills 
and the body of a true demon.

However, Ye Feng never expected that he would meet Uncle Scar in the imperial city of the Suzaku 
Dynasty, which was an unknown distance away from the Great Yan Dynasty.

But what leaves Ye Feng a little speechless is that Uncle Scar still hasn't gotten rid of his habit of 
sneaking around.

Uncle Scar heard Ye Feng's voice, and he was a little surprised who was calling him.

But the moment he turned around and saw Ye Feng, Uncle Scar immediately opened his mouth and 
couldn't help but said: "Damn...boy Ye Feng! Why are you here!"

Uncle Scar never expected that in this strange place

In a foreign country, I unexpectedly ran into an old friend from back then.

"Who is this uncle?"

Chu Huanxue's small face was full of deep curiosity.

She had been with Ye Feng day and night for so long, and this was the first time she saw her always 
majestic master showing an expression of astonishment.

This made Chu Huanxue couldn't help but smile. For a moment, the girl looked at Ye Feng, and the 
deepest feeling in her heart was less dependence on the master, and more feeling that Chu Huanxue 
herself was An indescribable sense of happiness.

"Boy Ye Feng, are you attending a banquet here? It seems that you are a distinguished guest of the 
Sixth Prince's Palace. Come and tell me, I am not a thief, but a gentleman!"



As Uncle Scar spoke, he shamelessly put the black gold dagger in his hand into his storage ring.

When Ye Feng saw this scene, he walked over with a dark face and whispered: "Uncle Scar, why 
are you here? You haven't gotten rid of your sneaky habit yet."

Ye Feng was still a little happy when he met his old friend.

At this time, people around saw that this middle-aged man with a scar was chatting with Ye Feng, 
and it seemed that the two were very familiar with each other.

Several guards from the Sixth Prince's Mansion retreated one after another.

After all, Ye Feng was treated so politely by the Sixth Prince before, which made everyone look in 
awe of Ye Feng, the young man in black.

Chu Huanxue walked over at this time, staring at Uncle Scar curiously with a pair of big and smart 
eyes, and asked: "Master, is this uncle your friend?"

"Boy Ye Feng, you can do it!"

Uncle Scar stretched out a thick arm, hugged Ye Feng to one side, and whispered: "I haven't seen 
you for many years. You are so cool now. You have accepted such a beautiful little girl as your 
apprentice. I'm so envious. "

Chu Huanxue's cultivation was much stronger now. She also heard Uncle Scar's words, and a trace 
of rosy color suddenly appeared on the girl's fair face.

"Stop talking nonsense."

Ye Feng rolled his eyes at Uncle Scar, then grabbed his collar and said: "Uncle Scar, don't think that 
I don't know. You came all the way to Suzaku City, and you must have gotten some good secret 
information, treasure." ? Or a peerless powerful inheritance? Come on! Don’t think about it alone!”

Chapter 335 Complex



Uncle Scar looked at Ye Feng, who had fiery eyes, and his mouth widened. He couldn't help but 
said: "Boy Ye Feng, you still said that I was sneaking around, you are more shameless than me!"

Hearing what Uncle Scar said, Ye Feng was not angry at all, but his eyes suddenly lit up.

Uncle Scar didn't refute, which meant that he guessed correctly.

"What are you looking for in the Imperial City of the Suzaku Dynasty?" Ye Feng asked 
immediately.

"Okay, okay, let's talk to your kid."

Uncle Scar approached Ye Feng's ear and said very carefully: "I recently learned a shocking news 
from a mysterious man in the black market. The high priest of the Suzaku Dynasty seems to be in 
collusion with the legendary evil tribe from outside the territory. , according to internal information, 
the evil tribe from outside the territory gave the high priest a treasure. It was a treasure map left 
behind after the legendary dark turmoil war. It was called the 'Nine Heavens Demonic Saint Map'. It 
was a top-quality magic weapon that could release infinite demonic flames and The Holy Thunder 
of the Nine Heavens is extremely powerful. The true demonic body I am cultivating has 
encountered a bottleneck, and I need the power of the demonic flames in the Holy Demon Saint 
Picture of the Nine Heavens."

"What? The high priest is colluding with the evil tribes outside the territory?"

Ye Feng's eyes were suddenly startled.

The evil alien tribes were the evil creatures that almost destroyed the entire Longyuan Continent.

"The high priest Murong Qianjue, a mythical figure in the hearts of the people of the Suzaku 
Dynasty, turned out to be in collusion with evil tribes from outside the territory..."

At this moment, Ye Feng suddenly thought of the inexplicable decline of the Seventh Prince's 
Palace, and what the Sixth Prince's Palace said before about the death of Chu Huanxue's father, the 
Seventh Prince, which seemed to be related to the high priest.



Thinking of this, Ye Feng suddenly felt that the Seventh Prince was suppressed and fell because he 
discovered the secret of the high priest, and the Seventh Prince's Palace fell into decline?

"matter

It's getting more and more complicated. "

Ye Feng frowned slightly and began to think about the next arrangements.

At this time, Uncle Scar turned around, smiled and said to Chu Huanxue who was waiting not far 
away: "Little girl, your master and I were good brothers who went up to the mountain of swords and 
down to the sea of fire together. You call me master." Uncle, listen."

"Hello, uncle."

Chu Huanxue said immediately, acting very well-behaved.

"Oh, this feels pretty good."

Uncle Scar laughed, and the storage ring in his hand flashed, and a small black gold dagger 
appeared. He handed it to Chu Huanxue and said: "You are the apprentice of my good brother Ye 
Feng, please call me uncle. Uncle Master can’t help but give it a welcome gift. This dagger is made 
of meteorite iron. It’s indestructible and harder than ordinary top-grade magic weapons. It suits you 
very well, so I’ll give it to you.”

"Thank you, uncle!"

Chu Huanxue immediately took it and looked at it happily.

Uncle Scar looked at Ye Feng beside him and said with a smile: "Look, it's interesting."

The corner of Ye Feng's mouth twitched slightly, and he turned around and took the dagger he just 
took out from the Sixth Prince's Palace as a gift. He really had no shame at all.



But Ye Feng is used to Uncle Scar's behavior. Now he only cares about the mysterious high priest of 
the Suzaku Dynasty.

Ye Feng whispered: "Uncle Scar, in a few days we will sneak into the Suzaku Palace together to 
find out the true identity of the mysterious high priest."

Uncle Scar's eyes lit up and he said: "That's exactly what I meant. Originally, I was quite scared to 
be alone. After all, colluding with evil tribes outside the territory is quite scary, but with you as my 
companion, I feel a lot safer. , the two of us are together, we are definitely brothers, and we are as 
powerful as gold!" Uncle Scar looked at Ye Feng with fiery eyes, and he couldn't help but said: "Ye 
Feng, you still said that I was sneaking around? , you are more shameless than me!"

Hearing what Uncle Scar said, Ye Feng was not angry at all, but his eyes suddenly lit up.

Uncle Scar didn't refute, which meant that he guessed correctly.

"What are you looking for in the Imperial City of the Suzaku Dynasty?" Ye Feng asked 
immediately.

"Okay, okay, let's talk to your kid."

Uncle Scar approached Ye Feng's ear and said very carefully: "I recently learned a shocking news 
from a mysterious man in the black market. The high priest of the Suzaku Dynasty seems to have 
colluded with the legendary evil tribe from outside the territory. , according to internal information, 
the evil tribe from outside the territory gave the high priest a treasure. It was a treasure map left 
behind after the legendary dark turmoil war. It was called the 'Nine Heavens Demonic Saint Map'. It 
was a top-quality magic weapon that could release infinite magic flames and The Holy Thunder of 
the Nine Heavens is extremely powerful. The true demonic body I am cultivating has encountered a 
bottleneck, and I need the power of the demonic flames in the Holy Demon Saint Picture of the 
Nine Heavens."

"What? The high priest is colluding with the evil tribes outside the territory?"

Ye Feng's eyes were suddenly startled.

The evil alien tribes were the evil creatures that almost destroyed the entire Longyuan Continent.



"The high priest Murong Qianjue, a mythical figure in the hearts of the people of the Suzaku 
Dynasty, turned out to be in collusion with evil tribes from outside the territory..."

At this moment, Ye Feng suddenly thought of the inexplicable decline of the Seventh Prince's 
Palace, and what the Sixth Prince's Palace said before about the death of Chu Huanxue's father, the 
Seventh Prince, which seemed to be related to the high priest.

Thinking of this, Ye Feng suddenly felt that the Seventh Prince was suppressed and fell because he 
discovered the secret of the high priest, and the Seventh Prince's Palace fell into decline?

"matter

It's getting more and more complicated. "

Ye Feng frowned slightly and began to think about the next arrangements.

At this time, Uncle Scar turned around, smiled and said to Chu Huanxue who was waiting not far 
away: "Little girl, your master and I were good brothers who went up to the mountain of swords and 
down to the sea of fire together. You call me master." Uncle, listen."

"Hello, uncle."

Chu Huanxue said immediately, acting very well-behaved.

"Oh, this feels pretty good."

Uncle Scar laughed, and the storage ring in his hand flashed, and a small black gold dagger 
appeared. He handed it to Chu Huanxue and said: "You are the apprentice of my good brother Ye 
Feng, please call me uncle. Uncle Master can’t help but give it a welcome gift. This dagger is made 
of meteorite iron. It’s indestructible and harder than ordinary top-grade magic weapons. It suits you 
very well, so I’ll give it to you.”

"Thank you, uncle!"



Chu Huanxue immediately took it and looked at it happily.

Uncle Scar looked at Ye Feng beside him and said with a smile: "Look, it's interesting."

The corner of Ye Feng's mouth twitched slightly, and he turned around and took the dagger he just 
took out from the Sixth Prince's Palace as a gift. He really had no shame at all.

But Ye Feng is used to Uncle Scar's behavior. Now he only cares about the mysterious high priest of 
the Suzaku Dynasty.

Ye Feng whispered: "Uncle Scar, in a few days we will sneak into the Suzaku Palace together to 
find out the true identity of the mysterious high priest."

Uncle Scar's eyes lit up and he said: "That's exactly what I meant. Originally, I was quite scared to 
be alone. After all, colluding with evil tribes outside the territory is quite scary, but with you as my 
companion, I feel a lot safer. , the two of us work together, we are definitely brothers, and we are as 
powerful as gold!"

Chapter 336 Action

That night, after Ye Feng and Uncle Scar returned to the Seventh Prince's Mansion, they bought two 
jars of good wine from the streets of Zhuque City, and asked Chu Huanxue to cook some good 
dishes in the palace's kitchen, and they drank and ate. stand up.

I have to say that although Chu Huanxue was once the little princess of the Seventh Prince's Palace, 
her cooking skills were still good.

Ye Feng and Uncle Scar hadn't seen each other for a long time, so they naturally talked about their 
respective encounters and experiences.

Uncle Scar was very amazed at Ye Feng's current achievements. In just one year, Ye Feng had 
already reached the peak of the titled martial arts realm, and even had one foot in the magical power 
realm. ??

However, Ye Feng was also extremely surprised, because even though he had now entered the half-
step magical realm, he still didn't quite see through Uncle Scar's true strength.



What made Ye Feng feel very strange was that at one moment he felt that Uncle Scar was very 
weak, like an ordinary person, and at the next moment he felt an unfathomable aura from him.

Chu Huanxue sat aside and listened to the conversation between the two. She felt very interesting. 
She never thought that her master, who looked extremely young, had already had so many 
experiences and encounters.

Moreover, Chu Huanxue silently remembered from the words of the two people that Ye Feng's 
hometown was a place called the Great Yan Dynasty.

…

In the following days, Ye Feng told Chu Huanxue that if he wanted to regain the title of prince, he 
must stand out in the Suzaku Royal Hunting Competition next month.

Chu Huanxue's beautiful eyes showed a determined expression, and she practiced harder and harder.

In addition to avenging the Seventh Prince's Palace, Chu Huanxue also has another motivation, that 
is, she must not let her master down.

One night three days later, Chu Huanxue practiced Kung Fu all day and went to bed early.

At this time, Ye Feng and Uncle Scar met together in a house in the Seventh Prince's Mansion.

The night sky tonight is pitch black, with only a few stars shining faintly above the night sky.

Uncle Scar and Ye Feng were both dressed in black night clothes, with their faces covered.

"The moon is dark and the wind is high, it's a good time to take action."

Uncle Scar said: "Ye Feng, the last time the two of us acted like this was in the small Demon City, 
but this time, it is the palace of the Suzaku Dynasty, one of the top ten super dynasties. It is really 
exciting."



Ye Feng glanced at Uncle Scar and said: "Since the high priest may have some connections with the 
evil tribes outside the territory, then we really have to be cautious and careful. We must not make a 
mistake tonight and investigate the news first, and then make plans later. That Nine Heavens 
Demon Saint Picture.”

"I know."

Uncle Scar nodded and said: "I don't expect to be able to get the Nine Heavens Demon Holy Map 
tonight. I have been in Suzaku City for almost three months, and I have never had a chance to do it. 
The Nine Heavens Demon Holy Map, there is no It should be stored in some treasure house or 
secret room, but should be carried by the high priest of the Suzaku Dynasty."

Having said this, Uncle Scar looked at Ye Feng and suddenly smiled and said: "If our action fails 
and the hard one is not enough, we can only use the soft one. Young Ye Feng, then it will be up to 
you to use the beauty trick to win over the big man." The priest seduced her and then found an 
opportunity to seize her storage ring. "

Ye Feng: "..."

"Stop talking nonsense and let's go."

Ye Feng jumped up and quickly disappeared into the darkness outside the Seventh Prince's 
Mansion. That night, after Ye Feng and Uncle Scar returned to the Seventh Prince's Mansion, they 
bought two jars of good wine from the streets of Zhuque City, and asked Chu Huanxue to cook 
some good dishes in the palace's kitchen, and they drank and ate. stand up.

I have to say that although Chu Huanxue was once the little princess of the Seventh Prince's Palace, 
her cooking skills were still good.

Ye Feng and Uncle Scar hadn't seen each other for a long time, so they naturally talked about their 
respective encounters and experiences.

Uncle Scar was very amazed at Ye Feng's current achievements. In just one year, Ye Feng had 
already reached the peak of the titled martial arts realm, and even had one foot in the magical power 
realm.



However, Ye Feng was also extremely surprised, because even though he had now entered the half-
step magical realm, he still didn't quite see through Uncle Scar's true strength.

What made Ye Feng feel very strange was that at one moment he felt that Uncle Scar was very 
weak, like an ordinary person, and at the next moment he felt an unfathomable aura from him.

Chu Huanxue sat aside and listened to the conversation between the two. She felt very interesting. 
She never thought that her master, who looked extremely young, had already had so many 
experiences and encounters.

Moreover, Chu Huanxue silently remembered from the words of the two people that Ye Feng's 
hometown was a place called the Great Yan Dynasty. ??

…

In the following days, Ye Feng told Chu Huanxue that if he wanted to regain the title of prince, he 
must stand out in the Suzaku Royal Hunting Competition next month.

Chu Huanxue's beautiful eyes showed a determined expression, and she practiced harder and harder.

In addition to avenging the Seventh Prince's Palace, Chu Huanxue also has another motivation, that 
is, she must not let her master down.

One night three days later, Chu Huanxue practiced Kung Fu all day and went to bed early.

At this time, Ye Feng and Uncle Scar met together in a house in the Seventh Prince's Mansion.

The night sky tonight is pitch black, with only a few stars shining faintly above the night sky.

Uncle Scar and Ye Feng were both dressed in black night clothes, with their faces covered.

"The moon is dark and the wind is high, it's a good time to take action."



Uncle Scar said: "Ye Feng, the last time the two of us acted like this was in that small Demon City, 
but this time, it is the palace of the Suzaku Dynasty, one of the top ten super dynasties. It is really 
exciting."

Ye Feng glanced at Uncle Scar and said: "Since the high priest may have some connections with the 
evil tribes outside the territory, then we really have to be cautious and careful. We must not make a 
mistake tonight and investigate the news first, and then make plans later. That Nine Heavens 
Demon Saint Picture.”

"I know."

Uncle Scar nodded and said: "I don't expect to be able to get the Nine Heavens Demon Holy Map 
tonight. I have been in Suzaku City for almost three months, and I have never had a chance to do it. 
The Nine Heavens Demon Holy Map, there is no It should be stored in some treasure house or 
secret room, but should be carried by the high priest of the Suzaku Dynasty."

Having said this, Uncle Scar looked at Ye Feng and suddenly smiled and said: "If our action fails 
and we are too hard, we can only use soft methods. Boy Ye Feng, then it will be up to you to use the 
beauty trick to win over the big man." The priest succeeded in seducing her, and then found an 
opportunity to seize her storage ring. "

Ye Feng: "..."

"Stop talking nonsense and let's go."

Ye Feng jumped up and quickly disappeared into the darkness outside the Seventh Prince's 
Mansion.

Chapter 337: Lurking in

"It's just a joke, don't worry about it, Ye Feng, just wait for me."

Uncle Scar also followed immediately.

The figures of the two people shuttled throughout Suzaku City, approaching the palace.

Soon, the two of them arrived at the most central area of Suzaku City.



Here, towering inner city walls stand, surrounding a large area of luxurious royal gardens, 
buildings, halls, etc. ??

This is the royal palace of the Suzaku Dynasty.

At this time, Ye Feng and Uncle Scar lurked, and they immediately saw that every road was heavily 
guarded.

Moreover, from time to time, teams of royal guards wearing heavy armor and holding huge swords 
were patrolling back and forth.

This important palace of the Suzaku Dynasty was indeed heavily guarded and difficult to enter.

Uncle Scar whispered to Ye Feng: "Follow me, I have found the safest way to sneak into the palace 
in the past three months."

Ye Feng smiled and followed Uncle Scar in a certain direction. He knew that Uncle Scar would not 
be idle in the past three months.

Soon, Uncle Scar took Ye Feng to the end of the city wall inside a palace.

The land here is dilapidated, overgrown with weeds, and dilapidated buildings stand on the ground.

There wasn't even a guard here. Ye Feng and Uncle Scar walked directly into the deserted buildings.

Looking at the dilapidated buildings and overgrown weeds around, Uncle Scar smiled and said: 
"This abandoned building complex is the weakest security area in the outer area of the Suzaku 
Dynasty's palace, because it is said that something happened inside this building complex. It’s 
extremely strange and ominous, so no one dares to come here to patrol, and it gradually becomes 
deserted. We can go directly through this deserted building and enter the palace of the Suzaku 
Dynasty... Damn it! Ye Feng, what’s wrong with you?”

As Uncle Scar spoke, he looked around and his face suddenly changed. He saw black hairs like 
venomous snakes growing crazily and rapidly on Ye Feng's body.



Under the cold moonlight, this scene was obviously extremely strange and terrifying.

Uncle Scar's eyes suddenly changed and he said, "Boy Ye Feng, have you ever been contaminated 
by something unknown?"

He said, suddenly taking out a small bottle from the storage spirit ring.

The vial contained an inexplicable green liquid, and Uncle Scar poured it directly into Ye Feng's 
mouth.

boom!

Immediately, an inexplicable cooling power exploded in Ye Feng's body, and the rapidly growing 
black hair on Ye Feng's body was completely removed.

Ye Feng came back to his senses, his eyes were a little downcast and he said: "The unknown 
happened again."

Uncle Scar's eyes were a little solemn, and he said: "Boy Ye Feng, where have you been for more 
than a year and how did you become contaminated with such strange things? The thing I gave you 
to drink just now should be able to help you suppress your body." It has been unknown for a while, 
but it cannot be eradicated. After you participate in the Hundred Dynasties War and enter those 
overlord forces, you must find a way to get rid of the unknown, otherwise the consequences will be 
serious. "

"I see."

Ye Feng nodded. The last time he visited Uncle Nan in the Ye Clan, he forgot to ask Uncle Nan how 
to deal with the ominous power.

But for a while, he didn’t have time to return to the Ye Clan. He could only wait to enter the 
overlord force and see if he could find any solution. If he couldn’t find a solution after entering 
Poseidon Academy, then Ye Feng decided to return to the Ye Clan again. Ask Uncle Nan what to do.



"The high priest's residence should be in this direction, follow me."

Uncle Scar spoke out at this time and quickly galloped towards a certain direction in the palace.

Ye Feng also followed immediately. "It's just a joke, don't worry about it, Ye Feng, just wait for 
me."

Uncle Scar also followed immediately.

The figures of the two people shuttled throughout Suzaku City, approaching the palace.

Soon, the two of them arrived at the most central area of Suzaku City.

Here, towering inner city walls stand, surrounding a large area of luxurious royal gardens, 
buildings, halls, etc.

This is the royal palace of the Suzaku Dynasty.

At this time, Ye Feng and Uncle Scar lurked, and they immediately saw that every road was heavily 
guarded.

Moreover, from time to time, teams of royal guards wearing heavy armor and holding huge swords 
were patrolling back and forth.

This important palace of the Suzaku Dynasty was indeed heavily guarded and difficult to enter.

Uncle Scar whispered to Ye Feng: "Follow me, I have found the safest way to sneak into the palace 
in the past three months."

Ye Feng smiled and followed Uncle Scar in a certain direction. He knew that Uncle Scar would not 
be idle in the past three months.

Soon, Uncle Scar took Ye Feng to the end of the city wall inside a palace.



The land here is dilapidated, overgrown with weeds, and dilapidated buildings stand on the ground.

There wasn't even a guard here. Ye Feng and Uncle Scar walked directly into the deserted buildings.

Looking at the dilapidated buildings and overgrown weeds around him, Uncle Scar smiled and said: 
"This abandoned building complex is the weakest security area in the outer area of the Suzaku 
Dynasty's palace, because it is said that something happened inside this building complex. It’s so 
weird and ominous that no one dares to come here to patrol, and it gradually becomes deserted. We 
can go directly through this deserted building and enter the palace of the Suzaku Dynasty... Damn 
it! Ye Feng, what’s wrong with you?”

As Uncle Scar spoke, he looked around him, and his face suddenly changed. He saw black hairs on 
Ye Feng's body that were growing crazily and rapidly, like venomous snakes.

Under the cold moonlight, this scene was obviously extremely strange and terrifying.

Uncle Scar's eyes suddenly changed and he said, "Boy Ye Feng, have you ever been contaminated 
by something unknown?"

He said, suddenly taking out a small bottle from the storage spirit ring.

The vial contained an inexplicable green liquid, and Uncle Scar poured it directly into Ye Feng's 
mouth.

boom!

Immediately, an inexplicable cooling power exploded in Ye Feng's body, and the rapidly growing 
black hair on Ye Feng's body was completely removed.

Ye Feng came back to his senses, his eyes were a little downcast and he said: "The unknown 
happened again."

Uncle Scar's eyes were a little solemn, and he said: "Boy Ye Feng, where have you been for more 
than a year and how did you become contaminated with such strange things? The thing I gave you 
to drink just now should be able to help you suppress your body." It has been unknown for a while, 
but it cannot be eradicated. After you participate in the Hundred Dynasties War and enter those 



overlord forces, you must find a way to get rid of the unknown, otherwise the consequences will be 
serious. "

"I see."

Ye Feng nodded. The last time he visited Uncle Nan in the Ye Clan, he forgot to ask Uncle Nan how 
to deal with the ominous power.

But for a while, he didn't have time to return to the Ye Clan. He could only wait until he entered the 
overlord force to see if he could find any solution. If he couldn't find a solution after entering 
Poseidon Academy, then Ye Feng decided to return to the Ye Clan again. Ask Uncle Nan what to do.

"The high priest's residence should be in this direction, follow me."

Uncle Scar spoke out at this time and quickly galloped towards a certain direction in the palace.

Ye Feng also followed immediately.

Chapter 338 Nine-story Pavilion

Swish, swish, swish!

Ye Feng and Uncle Scar were like ghosts in the dark night, traveling quickly through the palace of 
the Suzaku Dynasty.

What they were most afraid of this time was the mysterious high priest Murong Qianjue.

Otherwise, with the strength of the two people, there is no need to lurk at all, and they can just walk 
into the palace openly and openly, without fear of anything.

At this time, the two sneaked up to an extremely gorgeous nine-story pavilion.

This huge pavilion has a total of nine floors. It is built extremely luxuriously with carved beams and 
painted beams. The huge pavilion reaches into the sky. At the end of the eaves of each floor, there is 
a bright lamp hanging, which looks like an ethereal and strange beauty.



Uncle Scar whispered: "According to my three months of investigation, this is where the high priest 
lives."

Ye Feng nodded and said: "This nine-story pavilion is very noble. You can tell at a glance that it is 
where some important person lives."

With that said, the two lurked into the nine-story pavilion.

After entering the pavilion, what surprised the two of them was that there was no one in the entire 
pavilion and it was completely empty.

"what's the situation?"

Uncle Scar put the mythical beast sculpture carved out of a piece of beautiful jade into the storage 
ring and said with some confusion.

"Go up and have a look."

Ye Feng jumped up to the second floor. He found that there was no one on the entire second floor.

"Strange."

When the two of them explored the entire nine-story pavilion, they found that the entire nine-story 
pavilion was completely empty.

"No, Ye Feng! Is this a trap specifically targeting us?"

Uncle Scar thought of some possibility and immediately pulled Ye Feng and ran out.

"Don't leave in a hurry."

Ye Feng did not move and analyzed: "If there is really any trap,



, we have been here for so long, we have been arrested long ago. "

When Uncle Scar heard what Ye Feng said, he was slightly startled and said, "That's right."

"Um?"

Suddenly, at this moment, Ye Feng's powerful perception suddenly caught a familiar aura, which 
was coming out from the underground of the nine-story pavilion.

"It's the breath of the evil tribe from outside the territory!"

Ye Feng's eyes changed slightly. He had dealt with evil tribes outside the territory many times, so he 
was naturally very sensitive to this kind of aura.

So even Uncle Scar didn't notice anything. Ye Feng had already caught a hint of the special aura of 
the evil tribe outside the territory.

"Ye Feng, what's wrong?"

Uncle Scar saw something wrong with Ye Feng's expression and immediately asked.

"I sensed the aura of the evil tribe outside the territory."

Ye Feng spoke slowly and said: "It seems that the information you got is very accurate. This high 
priest of the Suzaku Dynasty really has collusion with evil tribes outside the territory."

Uncle Scar was also frightened when he heard what Ye Feng said.

After all, everyone talks about the alien creatures that almost destroyed the Longyuan Continent, 
but their expressions change.

How many human races, demon races, and other races on Longyuan Continent were almost wiped 
out in that dark turmoil.



Although the evil tribes outside the territory are now suppressed by the ancient powers and saints, 
and sealed in the dark space.

However, the evil tribes outside the territory cannot be killed at all. Now that endless years have 
passed, they are starting to make moves, which is worrying.

"The aura of the evil tribe outside the territory seems to be coming from the underground of this 
nine-story pavilion. Let's go and have a look."

Ye Feng said aloud, and he immediately jumped to the first floor.

"good."

Uncle Scar also nodded.

Although he seems to be very afraid of the evil tribes outside the territory, he will fight for the 
ultimate magic weapon, the Nine Heavens Demonic Saint Picture! Swish, swish, swish!

Ye Feng and Uncle Scar were like ghosts in the dark night, traveling quickly through the palace of 
the Suzaku Dynasty.

What they were most afraid of this time was the mysterious high priest Murong Qianjue.

Otherwise, with the strength of the two people, there is no need to lurk at all, and they can just walk 
into the palace openly and openly, without fear of anything.

At this time, the two sneaked up to an extremely gorgeous nine-story pavilion.

This huge pavilion has a total of nine floors. It is built extremely luxuriously with carved beams and 
painted beams. The huge pavilion reaches into the sky. At the end of the eaves of each floor, there is 
a bright lamp hanging, which looks like an ethereal and strange beauty.

Uncle Scar whispered: "According to my three months of investigation, this is where the high priest 
lives."



Ye Feng nodded and said: "This nine-story pavilion is very noble. You can tell at a glance that it is 
where some big shot lives." .??.

With that said, the two lurked into the nine-story pavilion.

After entering the pavilion, what surprised the two of them was that there was no one in the entire 
pavilion and it was completely empty.

"what's the situation?"

Uncle Scar put the mythical beast sculpture carved out of a piece of beautiful jade into the storage 
ring and said with some confusion.

"Go up and have a look."

Ye Feng jumped up to the second floor. He found that there was no one on the entire second floor.

"Strange."

When the two of them explored the entire nine-story pavilion, they found that the entire nine-story 
pavilion was completely empty.

"No, Ye Feng! Is this a trap specifically targeting us?"

Uncle Scar thought of some possibility and immediately pulled Ye Feng and ran out.

"Don't leave in a hurry."

Ye Feng did not move and analyzed: "If there is really any trap,

, we have been here for so long, we have been arrested long ago. "

When Uncle Scar heard what Ye Feng said, he was slightly startled and said, "That's right."



"Um?"

Suddenly, at this moment, Ye Feng's powerful perception suddenly caught a familiar aura, which 
was coming out from the underground of this nine-story pavilion.

"It's the breath of the evil tribe from outside the territory!"

Ye Feng's eyes changed slightly. He had dealt with evil tribes outside the territory many times, so he 
was naturally very sensitive to this kind of aura.

So even Uncle Scar didn't notice anything. Ye Feng had already caught a hint of the special aura of 
the evil tribe outside the territory.

"Ye Feng, what's wrong?"

Uncle Scar saw something wrong with Ye Feng's face and immediately asked.

"I sensed the aura of the evil tribe outside the territory."

Ye Feng spoke slowly and said: "It seems that the information you got is very accurate. This high 
priest of the Suzaku Dynasty really has collusion with evil tribes outside the territory."

Uncle Scar was also frightened when he heard what Ye Feng said.

After all, everyone talks about the alien creatures that almost destroyed the Longyuan Continent.

How many human races, demon races, and other races on Longyuan Continent were almost wiped 
out in that dark turmoil.

Although the evil tribes outside the territory are now suppressed by the ancient powers and saints, 
and sealed in the dark space.



However, the evil tribes outside the territory cannot be killed at all. Now that endless years have 
passed, they are starting to make moves, which is worrying.

"The aura of the evil tribe outside the territory seems to be coming from the underground of this 
nine-story pavilion. Let's go and have a look."

Ye Feng said aloud, and he immediately jumped to the first floor.

"good."

Uncle Scar also nodded.

Although he seems to be very afraid of the evil tribes outside the territory, he will fight for the 
ultimate magic weapon, the Nine Heavens Demonic Saint Picture!

Chapter 339 Crystal Scepter

It has to be said that Ye Feng's perception is becoming more and more terrifying as his soul grows.

Soon he discovered that there was really a tiny entrance in a corner of the first floor.

A strong evil aura from the evil tribe outside the territory was quickly emanating from the small 
entrance.

"This is it!" .??.

Ye Feng's eyes suddenly moved and he immediately walked into it.

"Ye Feng, you are too brave, just walk in like that?"

Uncle Scar's eyelids twitched slightly, he gritted his teeth and followed Ye Feng in.

Afterwards, the two of them traveled through a very long intestinal trail.



When they came to the end of the passage, they suddenly fell down and lurked in the darkness in 
the corner.

Because at this time, an extremely shocking scene appeared in the field of vision of both of them.

In this underground, a huge underground square was actually built.

At this time, there were densely packed people standing in the square. A rough calculation estimated 
that there were thousands of people.

Moreover, these people were all wearing noble brocades and silks, and it was obvious that many of 
them were high-ranking people in both the court and the public in the Suzaku Dynasty.

It might be a powerful family, or it might be various ministers.

But now all of these people are like possessed, their eyes are exuding a strong black evil spirit, and 
they are all worshiping the peerless and beautiful woman standing on a high platform in the center 
of the square.

This charming woman has a purple veil covering her perfect face, perfect posture, wearing a 
precious blue robe, and holding an ancient scepter in her hand.

At this time, a huge picture was hung at the top of the square.

That picture is inlaid with top-quality diamonds that are as densely packed as the stars in the sky, 
exuding charming brilliance.

r\u003e

Countless top-quality diamonds were inlaid together, and finally a demon and a saint appeared on 
this picture, which looked full of grandeur and distance.

"Nine Heavens Demonic Saint Picture!"



In the darkness at the entrance of the small intestine trail, Uncle Scar's eyes suddenly lit up.

At this moment, thousands of ministers, generals, etc. of the Suzaku Dynasty were all worshiping 
the high priest.

Streams of black and golden light emanated from these thousands of people, and then converged on 
the crystal scepter in the hand of the high priest.

"It seems to be a kind of power of faith. I didn't expect that such a being would appear in this small 
mortal dynasty. The crystal scepter in her hand can actually collect the power of faith. It is definitely 
a treasure, and it is very likely that it is A treasure brought from a certain overlord force."

The old demon dragon Shang suddenly spoke up in Ye Feng's mind.

"The power of faith? The scepter of faith?"

Ye Feng's eyes moved slightly.

He knows very well how terrifying the power of faith is, because three thousand years ago, his 
father created a small world among his own soldiers, and then used his great supernatural powers to 
absorb many creatures into the small world of the soldiers. , providing him with the power of faith 
at all times, allowing him to maintain his peak condition for countless years.

So Ye Feng knows that the power of faith cannot be said to be the most terrifying power in the 
world, but it is definitely the most mysterious and unpredictable attribute power, which involves the 
legendary destiny.

Uncle Scar didn't know that it was the power of faith. He was now very passionate about the Nine 
Heavens Demon Saint Picture hanging at the top of the square, which seemed to be just a 
background picture.

Originally, Ye Feng was also very interested in the Nine Heavens Demon Saint Picture, but now that 
he knew about the crystal scepter in the hands of the high priest, since he could gather the power of 
faith, his eyes suddenly became extremely hot.



If you can get the crystal scepter, it will definitely be of great help to your future practice! It has to 
be said that Ye Feng's perception is becoming more and more terrifying as his soul grows.

Soon he discovered that there was really a tiny entrance in a corner of the first floor.

A strong evil aura from the evil tribes outside the territory was quickly emanating from the small 
entrance.

"This is it!"

Ye Feng's eyes suddenly moved and he immediately walked into it.

"Ye Feng, you are too brave, just walk in like that?"

Uncle Scar's eyelids twitched slightly, he gritted his teeth and followed Ye Feng in.

Afterwards, the two of them traveled through a very long intestinal trail.

When they came to the end of the passage, they suddenly fell down and lurked in the darkness in 
the corner.

Because at this time, an extremely shocking scene appeared in the field of vision of both of them.

In this underground, a huge underground square was built.

At this time, there were densely packed people standing in the square. A rough calculation estimated 
that there were thousands of people.

Moreover, these people were all wearing noble brocades and silks, and it was obvious that many of 
them were high-ranking people in both the court and the public in the Suzaku Dynasty.

It might be a powerful family, or it might be various ministers.



But now all these people are like possessed, their eyes are exuding strong black evil energy, and 
they are all worshiping the peerless and beautiful woman standing on a high platform in the center 
of the square.

This charming woman has a purple veil covering her perfect face, perfect posture, wearing a 
precious blue robe, and holding an ancient scepter in her hand.

At this time, a huge picture was hung at the top of the square.

That picture is inlaid with top-quality diamonds that are as densely packed as the stars in the sky, 
exuding charming brilliance.

r\u003e

Countless top-quality diamonds were inlaid together, and finally a demon and a saint appeared on 
this picture, which looked full of grandeur and distance.

"Nine Heavens Demonic Saint Picture!"

In the darkness at the entrance of the small intestine trail, Uncle Scar's eyes suddenly lit up.

At this moment, thousands of ministers, generals, etc. of the Suzaku Dynasty were all worshiping 
the high priest.

Streams of black and golden light emanated from these thousands of people, and then converged on 
the crystal scepter in the hand of the high priest.

"It seems to be a kind of power of faith. I didn't expect that such a being would appear in this small 
mortal dynasty. The crystal scepter in her hand can actually collect the power of faith. It is definitely 
a treasure, and it is very likely that it is A treasure brought from a certain overlord force."

The old demon dragon Shang suddenly spoke up in Ye Feng's mind.

"The power of faith? The scepter of faith?"



Ye Feng's eyes moved slightly.

He knew very well how terrifying the power of faith was, because three thousand years ago, his 
father created a small world among his own soldiers, and then used his great supernatural powers to 
absorb many creatures into the small world of the soldiers. , providing him with the power of faith 
at all times, allowing him to maintain his peak condition for countless years.

So Ye Feng knows that the power of faith cannot be said to be the most terrifying power in the 
world, but it is definitely the most mysterious and unpredictable attribute power, which involves the 
legendary destiny.

Uncle Scar didn't know that it was the power of faith. He was now very passionate about the Nine 
Heavens Demon Saint Picture hanging at the top of the square, which seemed to be just a 
background picture.

Originally, Ye Feng was also very interested in the Nine Heavens Demon Saint Picture, but now that 
he knew about the crystal scepter in the hands of the high priest, since he could gather the power of 
faith, his eyes suddenly became extremely hot.

If you can get the crystal scepter, it will definitely be of great help to your future practice!

Chapter 340 Holy Stone

At this moment, Ye Feng and Uncle Scar didn't want to leave.

Although they came here tonight to inquire about the news, they did encounter such a shocking 
picture.

Ye Feng whispered: "Could it be that the entire Suzaku Dynasty, including the ruling and opposition 
parties, and the many big shots, were almost all subdued by this high priest and became her 
followers?"

Ye Feng's eyes revealed a hint of surprise, and I have to say that this discovery was quite 
astonishing.

Even Uncle Scar couldn't help but clicked his tongue: "What a great gesture. I guess the emperor of 
the Suzaku Dynasty doesn't even know it. He has long been emptied of power by this high priest."



Ye Feng nodded slightly, this high priest was really unfathomable.

"That's it for tonight, everyone go back."

Suddenly at this moment, the high priest standing on the high platform in the distance spoke.

Her voice was extremely light, sounding like the Guanghan Fairy above the nine heavens.

But no one could have imagined that such a charming woman who looked like a fairy would 
actually be an out-and-out devil!

"Ye Feng, I will teach you a formula that can temporarily seal off all the fluctuations in your life 
and reduce your vitality to zero."

Suddenly at this moment, Uncle Scar spoke up.

Obviously he is not willing to leave now at all, and wants to disguise himself as a lifeless existence, 
hide here, and wait for everyone to leave.

"good."

Ye Feng has long been accustomed to Uncle Scar's magical methods.

Soon, Ye Feng learned the formula and quickly reduced his vitality to zero.

Uncle Scar was a little surprised and said: "Your kid's comprehension ability is still as evil as 
before."

Uncle Scar remembered clearly that when he was in Demon City, he taught Ye Feng a flying martial 
arts book, and Ye Feng learned it in a few minutes.

This allows



Uncle Scar felt envious in his heart.

In the dark underground space, Ye Feng and Uncle Scar were hidden in a dark corner. Their life 
fluctuations were reduced to zero, like two dead logs.

At this time, they watched quietly as the dignitaries of the Suzaku Dynasty walked out of the 
underground space one after another.

To the two men's relief, the mysterious high priest of the Suzaku Dynasty did not notice them and 
walked out directly with everyone.

But to Ye Feng's slight disappointment, the high priest also took away the crystal scepter in her 
hand.

But Uncle Scar was extremely happy at this time, because the huge Nine Heavens Demon Saint 
Picture was still hanging at the top of the square.

At this time, the huge underground square had become empty.

"Tonight is not in vain!"

Uncle Scar rushed to the square all of a sudden, looking at the Nine Heavens Demon Saint Picture 
hanging on the top, his face full of excitement.

"Ye Feng, this Nine Heavens Demon Saint Diagram is half magic stone and half holy stone. I only 
want the magic stone. I will give you the thousands of holy stones."

Uncle Scar said, jumped up, rushed to the dome in an instant, and grabbed the Nine Heavens 
Demonic Saint Picture with one hand.

The holy stone is a higher-level strange stone that surpasses the spiritual stone and spiritual crystal. 
It contains not the spiritual energy of heaven and earth, but the holy energy of heaven and earth, and 
has a huge source of energy.



The Nine Heavens Demon Saint Picture is very large, dozens of meters long. There are thousands of 
holy stones inlaid in the picture to form a "holy", which is equivalent to the value of hundreds of 
thousands of top-quality spiritual crystals.

This is a huge fortune!

Ye Feng smiled happily and put the thousands of holy stones into the storage ring.

"Who is it? Dare to break into my sleeping place? And dare to touch the Nine Heavens Demon 
Saint Picture. How brave!"

Suddenly at this moment, an ancient vicissitudes of sound suddenly sounded in this huge 
underground space square, and its tone had an eternal chill. At this moment, Ye Feng and Uncle 
Scar didn't want to leave.

Although they came here tonight to inquire about the news, they did encounter such a shocking 
picture.

Ye Feng whispered: "Could it be that the entire Suzaku Dynasty, including the ruling and opposition 
parties, and the many big shots, were almost all subdued by this high priest and became her 
followers?"

Ye Feng's eyes revealed a hint of surprise, and I have to say that this discovery was quite 
astonishing.

Even Uncle Scar couldn't help but clicked his tongue: "What a great gesture. I guess the emperor of 
the Suzaku Dynasty doesn't even know it. He has long been emptied of power by this high priest."

Ye Feng nodded slightly, this high priest was really unfathomable.

"That's it for tonight, everyone go back."

Suddenly at this moment, the high priest standing on the high platform in the distance spoke.

Her voice was extremely light, sounding like the Guanghan Fairy above the nine heavens.



But no one could have imagined that such a charming woman who looked like a fairy would 
actually be an out-and-out devil!

"Ye Feng, I will teach you a formula that can temporarily seal off all the fluctuations in your life 
and reduce your vitality to zero."

Suddenly at this moment, Uncle Scar spoke up.

Obviously he is not willing to leave now at all, and wants to disguise himself as a lifeless existence, 
hide here, and wait for everyone to leave.

"good."

Ye Feng has long been accustomed to Uncle Scar's magical methods.

Soon, Ye Feng learned the formula and quickly reduced his vitality to zero.

Uncle Scar was a little surprised and said: "Your kid's comprehension ability is still as evil as 
before."

Uncle Scar remembered clearly that when he was in Demon City, he taught Ye Feng a flying martial 
arts book, and Ye Feng learned it in a few minutes.

This allows

Uncle Scar felt envious in his heart.

In the dark underground space, Ye Feng and Uncle Scar were hidden in a dark corner. Their life 
fluctuations were reduced to zero, like two dead logs.

At this time, they watched quietly as the dignitaries of the Suzaku Dynasty walked out of the 
underground space one after another.



To the two men's relief, the mysterious high priest of the Suzaku Dynasty did not notice them and 
walked out directly with everyone.

But what made Ye Feng slightly disappointed was that the high priest also took away the crystal 
scepter in her hand.

But Uncle Scar was extremely happy at this time, because the huge Nine Heavens Demon Saint 
Picture was still hanging at the top of the square.

At this time, the huge underground square had become empty.

"Tonight is not in vain!"

Uncle Scar rushed to the square all of a sudden, looking at the Nine Heavens Demon Saint Picture 
hanging on the top, his face full of excitement.

"Ye Feng, this Nine Heavens Demon Saint Diagram is half magic stone and half holy stone. I only 
want the magic stone. I will give you the thousands of holy stones."

Uncle Scar said, jumped up, rushed to the dome in an instant, and grabbed the Nine Heavens 
Demonic Saint Picture with one hand.

The holy stone is a higher-level strange stone that surpasses the spiritual stone and spiritual crystal. 
It contains not the spiritual energy of heaven and earth, but the holy energy of heaven and earth, and 
has a huge source of energy.

The Nine Heavens Demon Saint Picture is very large, dozens of meters long. There are thousands of 
holy stones embedded in the picture to form "holy", equivalent to the value of hundreds of 
thousands of top-quality spiritual crystals.

This is a huge fortune!

Ye Feng smiled happily and put the thousands of holy stones into the storage ring.



"Who is it? Dare to break into my sleeping place? And dare to touch the Nine Heavens Demon 
Saint Picture. How brave!"

Suddenly at this moment, an ancient vicissitudes of sound suddenly sounded in this huge 
underground space square, and its tone had an eternal chill.
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