
Ancient 4811

Chapter 4811 Formation Seal

Since the old man of all beasts has said this now, Ye Feng naturally nodded and said: "Then I will 
go to the Flower Fairy Valley to have a look."

Ye Feng was also quite interested in what the flower fairy said. After all, the flower fairy was 
originally just a very weak spirit in this wild forest, but after cultivating to such a powerful level as 
an ancient monster, she was naturally It means that in the Flower Fairy Valley where the Flower 
Fairy is located, there may really be a peerless strong man who has fallen.

At this time, Ye Feng and Old Man Beasts asked Hua Fairy to lead the way.

Old Man Beasts said: "If you dare to lie to me, I will cut you into pieces in an instant."

When Hua Fairy heard what Old Man Beasts said, her beautiful face immediately showed a look of 
fear, and she quickly said: "Of course the little demon doesn't dare to lie to these two adults."

After finishing speaking, Hua Fairy quickly led the way.

Soon, Hua Xianzi brought Ye Feng and Old Man Beasts to a huge valley.

When they entered it, they immediately saw a huge lake in this valley.

There are many other flower fairies living on the edge of the lake, and each of them is very cute and 
beautiful.

However, each of these flower fairies are very weak, and they just live here.

Only the flower fairy that Ye Feng and Old Man Beast met was blessed by chance and turned into a 
powerful ancient monster.

At this time, the Flower Fairy immediately said: "You two adults, don't worry about the other flower 
fairies in our valley. They pose no threat to the two adults at all. Please don't hurt them."



Ye Feng nodded, smiled and said: "As long as you lead us to the place where the peerless strong 
man you mentioned fell, and we get benefits, we will naturally let you go."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, Hua Fairy couldn't help but nodded happily.

At this moment, Old Man Beast glanced at Ye Feng and said nothing more.

At this time, Hua Xianzi brought Ye Feng and Old Man Beasts to the end of the lake.

At the end of this lake, there is an air of chaos.

Seeing this scene, the old man of all beasts suddenly showed a look of surprise in his eyes, and 
couldn't help but said: "Hey, it seems that what this flower fairy said is true. Generally, after the 
death of a peerless strong man, this kind of chaos will occur." This special energy of chaos will be 
generated after the body of the peerless strong man gradually dissipates, and it will spread around. "

At this time, the old man of all beasts said that he quickly flew towards the depths of the lake.

But just when they had just flown to the end of the lake, and were about to come into contact with 
the chaotic energy, suddenly a huge formation suddenly lit up in the void in front of them, and a 
blood-red energy mask appeared. It directly sent the Old Man of Ten Thousand Beasts flying 
backwards.

"What??"

The old man of all beasts suffered a loss, and immediately a look of surprise appeared in his eyes, 
and he couldn't help but said: "This seems to be a very ancient blood demon clan's formation. I 
didn't expect it to appear here. Could it be that Hua The peerless strong man that the fairy 
mentioned fell here, was he a strong man from the Blood Demon Clan? "

At this moment, Ye Feng said aloud: "Senior, how should we break the seal of this formation?"

At this time, Hua Xianzi hurriedly said: "Two adults, please let the little demon go and bring two 
adults here.



Other little demons couldn't do it. The little demon couldn't break this sealing formation. He just 
accidentally picked up a round bead from the edge of the formation, so he cultivated to the current 
state. "

Old Man Beast didn't seem to care. He waved his hand and said loudly: "Get out of here."

Hua Fairy thanked her quickly, and then left here in horror.

At this moment, the old man of Ten Thousand Beasts could not help but stare at the formation seal 
in front of him that was emitting blood-red light, and said aloud: "Let my body of Ten Thousand 
Beasts try the power of this formation. ”

After finishing speaking, the old man of Wan Beasts directly continued to release the method of 
Wan Beasts, and the whole person turned into a monster giant composed of the body parts of 
countless monsters.

At this moment, the old man of all beasts turned into this monster giant. He stretched out a huge 
palm and blasted forward.

Boom! !

The moment the huge monster's palm hit the blood-red formation seal, a huge vibration occurred 
throughout the valley, and a huge roar resounded throughout the sky.

But Ye Feng saw that this blood-red seal formation showed no signs of being broken. Instead, Old 
Man Beasts felt a huge resistance and couldn't help but take several steps back.

"Um?"

This made Ye Feng's eyes suddenly show surprise.

After all, Ye Feng had seen before that Old Man of Beasts turned into this monster giant and took 
action. How terrifyingly powerful it was, but he still couldn't break this sealing formation.



At this time, the old man of Ten Thousand Beasts could not help but show a look of surprise in his 
eyes. He seemed not to have thought that he had used the Ten Thousand Beasts Technique to 
become his own Immortal Body of Ten Thousand Beasts, and there was no way to destroy this 
formation.

At this moment, Old Man Beast couldn't help but said: "Ye Feng, do you understand the formation 
method?"

Ye Feng nodded and said aloud: "I understand a little bit."

The old man of all beasts immediately brightened his eyes and said loudly: "Well, as long as you 
can interfere with this formation and prevent it from exerting its full power, I can destroy this 
formation."

Ye Feng nodded. He didn't want to waste time at this time. He just started running the Eye of 
Heaven and Earth to find the weak points of this formation.

Soon, Ye Feng discovered several flaws in this formation.

Uh-huh!

At this moment, Ye Feng held the black broken sword in his hand and immediately attacked those 
weak points.

In the black broken sword, the light group of the power of gods and demons immediately spun out, 
and then merged into a huge sword light, attacking the weak points of the formation discovered by 
Ye Feng.

The next moment, visible to the naked eye, the entire blood-red formation suddenly dimmed, but it 
still emitted red light, but it was much dimmer than in its heyday.

Seeing this scene, the old man of Wanshou not far away immediately laughed out loud and said: "Ye 
Feng, you are really a genius!"

After saying that, the Old Man of Beasts turned into this monster giant, gathered all his power, and 
attacked crazily.



Click! Click!

At this moment, the entire formation was finally completely shattered, revealing the scene inside the 
formation.

The next moment, Ye Feng and Old Man Beasts both looked at each other, because they discovered 
that the scene behind the formation seemed a bit strange. Since the old man of all beasts has said 
this now, Ye Feng naturally nodded and said: "Then I will go to the Flower Fairy Valley to have a 
look."

Ye Feng was also quite interested in what the flower fairy said. After all, the flower fairy was 
originally just a very weak spirit in this wild forest, but after cultivating to such a powerful level as 
an ancient monster, she was naturally It means that in the Flower Fairy Valley where the Flower 
Fairy is located, there may really be a peerless strong man who has fallen.

At this time, Ye Feng and Old Man Beasts asked Hua Fairy to lead the way.

Old Man Beasts said: "If you dare to lie to me, I will cut you into pieces in an instant."

When Hua Fairy heard what Old Man Beasts said, her beautiful face immediately showed a look of 
fear, and she quickly said: "Of course the little demon doesn't dare to lie to these two adults."

After finishing speaking, Hua Fairy quickly led the way.

Soon, Hua Xianzi brought Ye Feng and Old Man Beasts to a huge valley.

When they entered it, they immediately saw a huge lake in this valley.

There are many other flower fairies living on the edge of the lake, and each of them is very cute and 
beautiful.

However, each of these flower fairies are very weak, and they just live here.



Only the flower fairy that Ye Feng and Old Man Beast met was blessed by chance and turned into a 
powerful ancient monster.

At this time, the Flower Fairy immediately said: "You two adults, don't worry about the other flower 
fairies in our valley. They pose no threat to the two adults at all. Please don't hurt them."

Ye Feng nodded, smiled and said: "As long as you lead us to the place where the peerless strong 
man you mentioned fell, and we get benefits, we will naturally let you go."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, Hua Fairy couldn't help but nodded happily.

At this moment, Old Man Beast glanced at Ye Feng and said nothing more.

At this time, Hua Xianzi brought Ye Feng and Old Man Beasts to the end of the lake.

At the end of this lake, there was an air of chaos.

Seeing this scene, the old man of all beasts suddenly showed a look of surprise in his eyes, and 
couldn't help but said: "Hey, it seems that what this flower fairy said is true. Generally, after the 
death of a peerless strong man, this kind of chaos will occur. This special energy of chaos will be 
generated after the body of the peerless strong man gradually dissipates, and it will spread around. "

At this time, the old man of all beasts said that he quickly flew towards the depths of the lake.

But just when they had just flown to the end of the lake, and were about to come into contact with 
the chaotic energy, suddenly a huge formation suddenly lit up in the void in front of them, and a 
blood-red energy mask appeared. It directly sent the old man of all beasts flying backwards.

"What??"

The old man of beasts suffered a loss, and immediately a look of surprise appeared in his eyes, and 
he couldn't help but said: "This seems to be a very ancient formation of the blood demon clan. I 
didn't expect it to appear here. Could it be that Hua The peerless strong man that the fairy 
mentioned died here, was he a strong man from the Blood Demon Clan?"



At this moment, Ye Feng said aloud: "Senior, how to break the seal of this formation?"

At this time, Hua Xianzi hurriedly said: "Two adults, please let the little demon go and bring two 
adults here.

Other little demons couldn't do it. The little demon couldn't break this sealing formation. He just 
accidentally picked up a round bead from the edge of the formation, so he cultivated to the current 
state. "

Old Man Beast didn't seem to care. He waved his hand and said loudly: "Get out of here."

Hua Fairy thanked her quickly, and then left here in horror.

At this moment, the old man of Ten Thousand Beasts could not help but stare at the formation seal 
in front of him that was emitting blood-red light, and said aloud: "Let my body of Ten Thousand 
Beasts try the power of this formation. ”

After finishing speaking, the old man of Wan Beasts directly continued to release the method of 
Wan Beasts, and the whole person turned into a monster giant composed of the body parts of 
countless monsters.

At this moment, Old Man Beast turned into this monster giant, stretched out a huge palm, and 
blasted forward.

Boom! !

The moment the huge monster's palm hit the blood-red formation seal, a huge vibration occurred 
throughout the valley, and a huge roar resounded throughout the sky.

But Ye Feng saw that this blood-red seal formation showed no signs of being broken. Instead, Old 
Man Beasts felt a huge resistance and couldn't help but take several steps back.

"Um?"

This made Ye Feng's eyes suddenly show surprise.



After all, Ye Feng had seen before that Old Man of Beasts turned into this monster giant and took 
action. How terrifyingly powerful it was, but he still couldn't break this sealing formation.

At this time, the old man of Ten Thousand Beasts couldn't help but have a look of surprise in his 
eyes. It seemed that he had not thought that he had used the Ten Thousand Beasts Technique to 
become his own Immortal Body of Ten Thousand Beasts, and there was no way to destroy this 
formation.

At this moment, the old man of Wanshou couldn't help but said: "Ye Feng, do you know the way of 
formation?"

Ye Feng nodded and said aloud: "I understand a little bit."

The old man of all beasts immediately brightened his eyes and said loudly: "Well, as long as you 
can interfere with this formation and prevent it from exerting its full power, I can destroy this 
formation."

Ye Feng nodded. He didn't want to waste time at this time. He just started running the Eye of 
Heaven and Earth to find the weak points of this formation.

Soon, Ye Feng discovered several flaws in this formation.

Uh-huh!

At this moment, Ye Feng held the black broken sword in his hand and immediately attacked those 
weak points.

In the black broken sword, the light group of the power of gods and demons immediately spun out, 
and then merged into a huge sword light, attacking the weak points of the formation discovered by 
Ye Feng.

The next moment, visible to the naked eye, the entire blood-red formation suddenly dimmed, but it 
still emitted red light, but it was much dimmer than in its heyday.



Seeing this scene, the old man of Wanshou not far away immediately laughed out loud and said: "Ye 
Feng, you are really a genius!"

After saying that, the Old Man of Beasts turned into this monster giant, gathered all his power, and 
attacked crazily.

Click! Click!

At this moment, the entire formation was finally completely shattered, revealing the scene inside the 
formation.

The next moment, Ye Feng and Old Man Beasts both looked at each other, because they discovered 
that the scene behind the formation seemed a bit strange.

Chapter 4812 Xuanyuan

I saw that after the sealing formation was cracked, a huge deep pool of water suddenly appeared 
inside.

In this deep pool of water, a huge flower actually grew.

Inside the stamen of the flower, there is a red wooden coffin, which feels very beautiful and strange.

At this moment, when Old Man Beast saw this scene, he couldn't help but his eyes changed and he 
said: "Is this flower the legendary corpse flower? This is a legendary flower that is said to bury 
oneself." In this kind of flower, one can one day use the essence energy of heaven and earth in the 
whole flower to revive again. "

Hearing what the Old Man of Ten Thousand Beasts said, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly showed a look of 
surprise, and then a faint smile appeared on his face, and he said loudly: "It seems that our arrival 
has disturbed this peerless strong man. The rebirth plan." .??.

The old man of Wanshou also smiled and said loudly: "Then go over and take a look at the wealth 
left by this peerless strong man."

Uh-huh!



After saying that, the old man of all beasts had absolutely no inhibitions. The old monster 
immediately flew in front of the huge flower, looked at the mahogany coffin lying in the flower's 
stamens, and stretched out a hand.

Buzz!

One of his hands immediately turned into a big demonic hand, grabbing directly towards the 
mahogany coffin lying in the stamens of the flower in front of him.

Boom!

But suddenly at this moment, countless crimson vines appeared on the surrounding ground, 
attacking the huge monster beast of the Old Man of Beasts, and even bombarded the Ninja's 
monster palm. Couldn't help but retreat.

The old man of all beasts immediately said coldly: "It is ridiculous to set up some so-called 
formations just to protect the place of burial and rebirth!"

After saying that, Old Man Beasts immediately shouted loudly: "Wild Beasts Crazy Sword!"

This was the first time Ye Feng saw Old Man of Beasts using his weapons.

I saw a golden dragon-headed machete immediately appearing in the hands of Old Man Beasts.

The old man of all beasts stretched out a huge monster palm, grasped the dragon-headed machete, 
and headed towards the crazy pickup trucks around him.

Click click click!

Each red vine was directly chopped into pieces by the dragon-headed sword in the hand of Old Man 
of Beasts.

At this moment, Old Man Beasts immediately stepped in front of the flower core, stretched out his 
hand, and shattered the mahogany coffin inch by inch, revealing a black corpse inside.



This black corpse has obviously been transformed. The skin all over the body is covered with black 
hair, which gives people a very strange feeling. The fangs in the mouth have grown out, and the 
fingernails on both hands have grown out. They all turned into a three-foot-long black and green 
color, and they definitely looked like they had intense corpse poison.

At this moment, before Old Man of Beasts could say anything, the corpse of this peerless powerful 
man suddenly opened his eyes, emitting a bright red light, smiled ferociously, and looked at Old 
Man of Beasts crazily. Grab the past.

The old man of all beasts immediately shouted: "Frozen Eyes!"

Boom!

Boom!

At this moment, only two long rivers of ice were seen, immediately bursting out from the two eyes 
of the old man of all beasts, bombarding towards the front, and instantly freezing the body of the 
peerless strong man who rushed over. In place.

At this moment, a sneer appeared on Old Man Beast's face, and he said loudly: "For a small 
transformed zombie to dare to confront me, he is really overestimating his own capabilities.

"

After finishing speaking, a terrifying flame suddenly appeared in the left hand of Old Man Beasts, 
burning directly into the body of the zombie that was frozen in ice.

At this moment, the black hair on the entire zombie's body was directly burned to ashes, and then 
turned into a charred corpse, which fell to the ground from a high altitude.

When Ye Feng saw this scene, a look of surprise suddenly appeared in his eyes.

It seems that after the Old Man of Ten Thousand Beasts fused the ice dragon's horn and inner elixir, 
his strength has indeed recovered a lot. His attacks are fierce and he no longer needs to take the 
lead. He is so powerful that he doesn't even need to take action at all.



An old monster like the Old Man of Beasts is enough to cope with everything. His crushing power 
is truly amazing.

At this time, Ye Feng quickly ran over, searched carefully, and immediately got a storage ring from 
the zombie's finger.

At this moment, Ye Feng was naturally ready to share this storage ring with Old Man Beasts.

Wow!

The moment Ye Feng opened the storage ring, countless treasures poured out from the storage ring.

At this moment, the Old Man of Ten Thousand Beasts also arrived here.

After the two divided the wealth, Old Man Beast said: "Continue to check if there are any other 
good things around."

Ye Feng nodded, and the two of them walked to the left and right, ready to take a good look at the 
place behind the seal. Apart from the peerless strong man who had turned into a corpse in the 
mahogany coffin, to see if there were any other good things.

At this time, Ye Feng saw that the Old Man of All Beasts was carefully observing a flower growing 
out of the deep cold pool, and seemed to be very interested in this flower.

And Ye Feng began to devour the charred Jue body.

The body of the world's strongest man.

Although this peerless strong man had turned into a zombie, he still stored a lot of energy, and Ye 
Feng naturally began to devour it.

Along with the devouring, Ye Feng's skill naturally improved rapidly.



boom!

The fifth level of Taoist realm!

boom!

Daofu Realm Sixth Heaven!

At this moment, Ye Feng's cultivation directly broke through two heavens in a row, reaching the 
sixth heaven of the Taoist Realm.

At this moment, as Ye Feng devoured him, the body of the peerless powerful man in front of him 
was completely reduced to ashes.

But just when Ye Feng was about to turn around and leave, his eyes suddenly moved, and he 
discovered that a piece of golden paper suddenly fell from the body of this peerless strong man that 
had turned to ashes.

"this!"

Seeing this golden paper, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly changed, and he immediately put it into the 
storage ring like lightning.

Then Ye Feng turned his head slightly and found that the old man of all beasts was observing the 
special flower that could resurrect people in the distance, but obviously did not find the golden 
paper.

When Ye Feng saw this scene, he immediately breathed a sigh of relief, but then there was a hint of 
excitement in Ye Feng's eyes.

Although Ye Feng didn't see clearly what was written on the golden paper just now.

But Ye Feng still saw the two words on the paper just now.



Just two words made Ye Feng very excited.

Because those two characters are "Xuanyuan".

These two words represent extraordinary significance in the history of the human race. Ye Feng 
knows very well that the earliest human emperor in the human race is called Emperor Xuanyuan, 
which represents the origin of the glorious history of the human race.

Chapter 4813 Mysterious Mental Formula

Ye Feng's eyes were full of surprise at this time. He didn't expect that he would accidentally 
encounter such an extraordinary golden paper.

Although it only had the word "Xuanyuan" written on it, Ye Feng felt that this piece of golden paper 
was definitely extraordinary.

Moreover, this golden paper is still hidden in the inner area of this ancient strong man's body.

If he hadn't devoured this peerless powerful man and turned his body into ashes, maybe he wouldn't 
have gotten this piece of golden paper.

So at this time, Ye Feng didn't want to share this secret with Old Man Beasts.

Although Ye Feng and Old Man Beast are now considered partners, they are only temporary 
partners.

Moreover, Ye Feng was forced by the Old Man of Beasts to cooperate together.

So Ye Feng naturally has some selfish motives of his own.

Moreover, Ye Feng also saw just now that the old man of all beasts was observing the huge flower 
and had no intention of giving this flower to him.

So both of them have their own selfish motives.



Ye Feng didn't ask any questions at this time, watching Old Man Beast put the huge flower into his 
storage ring.

Ye Feng walked over and said, "Senior, we have searched everything around and there is nothing 
else."

Old Man Beast nodded, with a hint of joy in his eyes.

Obviously, that huge flower made Old Man Beasts very happy, as if he had obtained a precious 
treasure.

Ye Feng secretly wondered whether this old monster also wanted to use this flower. In case he was 
suddenly killed by the enemy in the future, he could use his own soul to carry his broken body and 
bury it into this flower. The stamens in the flower are reborn again.

However, Ye Feng did not express his thoughts. After all, it would be better not to create a gap with 
Old Man of Beasts for the time being.

At this moment, Ye Feng is following Wanshou Lao

People simply left the area within this seal.

At this time, when the two people came out of the seal, they found that it was almost dark.

Old Man Beasts said: "Let's rest tonight in the Flower Fairy Valley. When it gets bright tomorrow, 
we will go find the ancient tomb of the Lord of the Wilderness, the Nine-Eyed Black Flame Kirin."

Hearing what the Old Man of Ten Thousand Beasts said, Ye Feng immediately nodded.

At night, Old Man Beast practiced silently on the other side of the valley.

Ye Feng, on the other hand, stayed away from the Old Man of Beasts and came to the lake.



At this moment, Ye Feng glanced at Old Man of Beasts and confirmed that Old Man of Beasts was 
currently addicted to his own cultivation.

Ye Feng immediately took out the golden paper from the body of the strong man that he had 
secretly collected from his storage ring.

At this time, Ye Feng sensed that the material of the golden paper was a kind of material that looked 
like gold but not gold. It felt very tough, but also soft, but very sharp.

Ye Feng cut a little and actually cut all his flesh.

This made Ye Feng's eyes suddenly show surprise.

You must know that Ye Feng's current immortal body of the gods has entered a very powerful level, 
and his flesh and blood skin is already as strong as if it was made of divine iron.

Ordinary magic weapons can no longer scratch Ye Feng's skin.

But this piece of golden paper was as sharp as a magic weapon. It instantly cut through Ye Feng's 
skin and even caused blood to drip out.

This made Ye Feng naturally feel that this piece of golden paper itself was very extraordinary, let 
alone its other

something recorded in.

At this moment, Ye Feng glanced at Old Man of Beasts not far away and found that he was still 
deep in cultivation.

Therefore, Ye Feng naturally did not hesitate at this time and immediately began to carefully 
observe the contents recorded on this golden paper.

The first thing Ye Feng saw was the two ancient fonts "Xuanyuan".



Then Ye Feng saw clearly that what was written on the entire golden paper turned out to be a very 
ancient human font.

"This seems to be an ancient inheritance, but it doesn't seem to be a specific inheritance, but a very 
obscure mental formula. I don't know what the specific use of practicing this mental formula is..."

Ye Feng was thinking secretly in his heart at this time, and then began to silently run the mental 
formula recorded on the golden paper.

In any case, this mental formula must be related to the legendary first generation leader of the 
human race, Emperor Xuanyuan.

Emperor Xuanyuan was the first generation leader who had commanded the entire human race in 
ancient times. He was naturally an earth-shattering figure.

So Ye Feng was naturally very happy at this time. He was able to get a piece of secrets about 
Emperor Xuanyuan.

Although he didn't know what kind of inheritance this mental formula was and what the use would 
be if he practiced it, Ye Feng felt that he must practice it.

At this time, Ye Feng didn't hesitate at all and started practicing and operating this mental formula 
directly.

Slowly, Ye Feng sensed a very special power that he had cultivated.

This is a yellowish gas force.

Ye Feng doesn't know what the power of this gas does for the time being, but after practicing it, Ye 
Feng only feels that his mind is very relaxed, and he has a feeling of having clear thoughts.

\u003c

br\u003e Ye Feng secretly thought, "Could this mental formula be a wonderful method that can 
cleanse one's own spiritual soul?"



Otherwise, Ye Feng would not be able to make his thoughts so clear when he used the mental 
formula.

At this moment, no matter what, Ye Feng was very happy to have obtained this mysterious mental 
formula.

After all, this is related to the legendary Emperor Xuanyuan, the first generation leader of the 
ancient human race.

At this moment, Ye Feng did not hesitate and simply put the golden paper into his body, so that he 
could slowly find the secrets in it later.

At this time, Ye Feng practiced for a whole night. Apart from making his spirit and soul feel 
refreshed, it seemed to have no other effect. It neither strengthened his physical strength nor 
strengthened his spiritual energy. , seems to be really just a very simple ancient human formula that 
can purify the spirit and mind.

But since it is related to Emperor Xuanyuan, Ye Feng feels that this mental formula must be very 
extraordinary, and maybe he will slowly find out the true secret of inheritance in the future.

At this moment, Ye Feng saw that the sky was getting bright, so he stopped running the mental 
formula and looked not far away.

Ye Feng discovered that Old Man Beasts was looking in a certain direction at this moment, and his 
face was full of solemnity.

Seeing this scene, Ye Feng was about to ask something, but suddenly at this moment, a huge golden 
arch bridge appeared high in the sky.

An extremely beautiful woman in a golden dress slowly walked over from the other end of the 
golden arch bridge.

"not good!"



Seeing this familiar scene, Ye Feng couldn't help but his face suddenly changed, and he said loudly: 
"Oh no! The extremely powerful Sun Goddess of the Sun God Clan is chasing me!"

Chapter 4814 Harvest

Looking at the golden arch bridge that connects heaven and earth, Ye Feng immediately understood 
that it was the Sun Goddess who was coming.

At this moment, the Sun Goddess was wearing a golden dress with an extraordinary temperament. 
There was a ball of sun burning in the void behind her head, which made her feel very sacred, 
terrifying and overwhelming.

Even the old man Wanshou looked slightly solemn at this time.

But the old man of all beasts did not run away, but showed a cold smile on his face, and said loudly: 
"This little demon girl is indeed very powerful. She is better than her, and she is better than her, but 
I have killed so many people now." The ancient monsters have merged with the bodies of many 
ancient monsters and merged into my body. My strength has recovered a lot. I want to see how this 
little demon can kill me."

After saying that, the old man of all beasts laughed out loud: "Little demon girl, I have recovered a 
lot of strength now. It is impossible for you to suppress me like before."

When Old Man Beasts had just escaped from the Wilderness Prison, he had fought with the Sun 
Goddess once, but was seriously injured and escaped.

After all, when Old Man Beast escaped from the Wilderness Prison, he was very weak.

But now, with the efforts of Ye Feng and Old Man of All Beasts, they have killed many ancient 
monsters, allowing Old Man of All Beasts to use the Great Method of All Beasts to restore a lot of 
his body of all beasts. .

So at this time, even when facing the Sun Goddess, Old Man Beasts did not have any fear, fully 
displaying the domineering power of this old devil.

At this time, Old Man Beasts turned into a monster giant composed of countless monster beast 
bodies without any hesitation.



The majestic monster giant, which is tens of thousands of feet tall, possesses extremely terrifying 
power. It is like the arrival of the ancient giant in the ancient times, and it directly attacks in the 
direction of the Sun Goddess.

Immediately around the Sun Goddess, strong men from the Sun God Clan appeared in golden 
armor. They held golden spears in their hands, and their bodies were filled with bright sun light. 
They were facing the monster giant that the Old Man of Beasts had turned into. He rushed away, 
wanting to test what level Old Man of Beasts' current strength had returned to.

At this time, the old man of Wanshou didn't hesitate at all, and immediately laughed out loud: "A 
bunch of trash, dare to be so rampant in front of me? Get out of my way, all of you!"

boom!

After saying that, Old Man Beasts immediately waved his huge fist and blasted forward.

His fists and fingers are all composed of fingers of different monster beasts, so they have the power 
of countless monster beasts.

The punch of the Old Man of Beasts directly hit a dozen golden-armored warriors from the Sun 
God Clan, and immediately sent these golden-armored warriors flying thousands of meters away, 
and fell hard to the ground. , dying.

The power of one punch is so terrifying!

It has to be said that the body of all beasts condensed by the old man of all beasts is indeed very 
powerful. It is indeed an evil and domineering inheritance.

When the Sun Goddess saw this scene, she was not surprised but overjoyed. She couldn't help but 
say: "As long as I suppress you, the old man of all beasts, and force out the inheritance and the law 
of all beasts from you, then this goddess will become the strongest in the wilderness." By then, no 
matter other races, or the Sun God Clan where I am, even my father will only listen to me!"

After finishing speaking, the sun goddess's beautiful eyes shone with a light of ultimate ambition, 
and she immediately turned towards the Old Man of All Beasts.



Impact away.

The Sun Goddess shouted loudly: "Sun God Flame! Thousands of Rivers!"

Boom! !

Almost at this moment, the sun suspended behind the head of the Sun Goddess immediately burst 
into brilliant light, and long rivers of flames directly impacted and erupted from the sun in the void 
behind her head. , attacking towards the Old Man of Beasts, possessing terrifying burning power.

When Old Man Beast saw this scene, he instantly activated the innate ability of the ice dragon that 
he had integrated into his body.

I saw a set of ice armor immediately condensed on the monster giant that the Old Man of Beasts 
turned into.

Then, in his hand, there was a huge ice ax condensed by countless cold air, and it slashed hard at the 
Sun Goddess in front, and the long river of flames rushed out by the sun in the void behind the Sun 
Goddess' head, All were chopped into pieces.

Boom! !

The terrifying battle disintegrated countless surrounding lands and trees.

In the wilderness, such terrible battles occurred here, causing some of the so-called monsters and 
ancient beasts living around to flee here in panic.

Seeing the terrifying battle between the two, Ye Feng knew that he would not be able to intervene 
for a while.

But at this time, Ye Feng's eyes lit up and he flew quickly in a direction several thousand meters 
away.

Because Ye Feng saw just now, the Old Man of Beasts knocked away a dozen golden-armored 
warriors from the Sun God Clan with one punch.



Although these powerful men wearing golden armor are not as good as the super masters of the Old 
Man of Beasts and the Sun Goddess, they are still very powerful beings, much more powerful than 
themselves now.

The dozen or so golden armored men were now on the verge of death from a punch from the Old 
Man of Beasts. It was just in time for him to go over and harvest them.

At this moment, Ye Feng quickly flew several thousand meters away.

Now the Sun Goddess and the Old Man of All Beasts are engaged in a fierce battle, so naturally no 
one cares about Ye Feng.

Ye Feng immediately flew not far away from a strong man in golden armor.

This golden armored man from the Sun God Clan was sitting cross-legged on the ground at this 
moment, with his eyes closed, as if he was recovering from his injuries and recuperating his body.

Poof!

But the next moment, before he had time to react, Ye Feng had already used the space wormhole to 
instantly arrive in front of the golden armored man. With a wave of the black broken sword in his 
hand, he directly sealed his throat with a sword, killing him instantly.

This strong man in golden armor is worthy of being an elite guard among the Sun God Clan, and a 
special strong man who follows the Sun Goddess. Therefore, his cultivation aura is even stronger by 
a whole realm than Ye Feng's current sixth level of Taoist Realm. , is a super master at the Tianyang 
level above the Daofu level!

So at this moment, Ye Feng's eyes were naturally filled with joy, and he immediately started to 
devour it.

After all, there is no need for him to fight hard and harvest the lives of these golden-armored strong 
men. He just does it conveniently, which can be said to be a free bargain.



This made Ye Feng couldn't help but sigh, following the old man of beasts, sometimes he could 
really pick up the slack.

At this moment, Ye Feng directly began to devour the golden armored man of the Sun God Clan 
who was secretly attacked and killed by him.

Ye Feng has long been at odds with the Sun God Clan, and now that he can harvest the lives of 
these powerful people from the Sun God Clan, Ye Feng naturally does it without hesitation.

Chapter 4815 So powerful

Boom! !

At this time, as Ye Feng devoured this strong man from the Sun God Clan who was wearing golden 
armor, his whole body suddenly shriveled up, and all its power and energy were absorbed into the 
Dantian by Ye Feng.

Buzz!

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately felt that his skill had once again been greatly improved.

Boom!

Ye Feng's body suddenly burst out with a powerful cultivation aura, and Ye Feng's cultivation realm 
broke through at this moment.

Directly from the sixth level of Daofu Realm, he broke through to the seventh level of Daofu 
Realm!

For Ye Feng, although he only broke through to the first level of heaven, being able to absorb a 
golden armored guard was directly like breaking through to the first level of heaven, which made Ye 
Feng very satisfied.

After all, the cultivation level of these powerful golden armored guards is only one level higher than 
mine.



At this time, Ye Feng looked elsewhere and found that the remaining dozen or so golden-armored 
warriors discovered that they were harvesting their partners. They suddenly united together and 
gathered towards Ye Feng.

The leader is a strong man who is above the Taoist Realm and reaches the tenth level of Tianyang 
Realm.

This golden armored guard also has the powerful bloodline power of the Sun God Clan. He exudes 
the blazing sun light all over his body. He looks at Ye Feng and holds the golden giant sword in his 
hand. Just like an ancient golden warrior, he immediately heads towards the Ye Feng rushed away 
and said: "What a thief! You secretly attacked here. We must punish you, the thief, on the spot! Kill 
him completely!"

Almost as soon as the golden armored man finished speaking, the golden giant sword in his hand 
immediately headed towards Ye Feng to kill him.

boom!

On the golden sword body, an earth-shattering golden sword light burst out, which seemed to be 
able to smash everything.

When Ye Feng saw this scene, without any hesitation, he directly stepped forward to fight.

Ye Feng did not escape, because these golden armors

Although the strong man is a whole level higher than himself, Ye Feng feels that his current combat 
power is enough to fight these dozen masters.

At this moment, Ye Feng did not hesitate and directly released the Nether Armor.

Buzz!

A set of dark black armor immediately concentrated on Ye Feng's body, and actually blocked the 
golden sword light that was coming.



"What??"

Seeing this scene, the dozen golden armored men immediately widened their eyes slightly.

Because the golden armored guard who is the most powerful among them has a golden giant sword 
in his hand, but the weapon made by the Sun God Clan with Sun Black Gold is very sharp. 
Although it is not as good as the magic weapon, it is definitely an extremely advanced magic 
weapon. .

Unexpectedly, even the armor condensed by Ye Feng could not be broken.

Ye Feng smiled coldly and said, "It seems that I have overestimated you. My current strength may 
be much stronger than I imagined."

Ye Feng directly displayed the Hand of the Emperor at this moment.

Buzz!

Above Ye Feng's head, there was an immediate change in the sky, and a huge black hand appeared, 
bombarding the dozen golden armored guards in front of him.

The first person to bear the brunt was the strong man in golden armor who appeared to Ye Feng. He 
was caught by the hand of the emperor. He screamed in horror and was blasted to pieces. His golden 
armor was torn to pieces, bleeding from all his orifices, and he fell to the ground instantly. .

"What??"

"So powerful??"

At this moment, the remaining group of golden-armored strong men suddenly widened their eyes, 
with deep panic on their faces, and quickly fled towards the surroundings, trying to

Avoid Ye Feng's attacks.



Because they knew that Ye Feng, a young boy who seemed very ordinary, actually had such 
terrifying strength, they were really shocked.

At this time, Ye Feng looked at the dozen or so golden armored men who were escaping, with a 
cheerful smile in his eyes, and said loudly: "You strong men of the Sun God Clan, I can finally fight 
against you. Don’t even think about escaping.”

After saying that, Ye Feng burst out into the Netherworld.

Buzz!

At this moment, a breath of underworld rose up from under Ye Feng's feet, covering an entire area 
of several hundred meters.

The dozen or so golden armored men who were about to escape were immediately enveloped by the 
Nether Realm and entered it before they could escape from Ye Feng's surroundings.

There are ghost warriors composed of yin energy, skeleton soldiers wearing armor, and majestic 
ghost bone dragons that are hundreds of meters tall, as well as many other undead, headless snakes, 
and snake-headed monsters. Wait, they all appeared, all composed of Yin Qi, and attacked the dozen 
or so golden-armored warriors from the Sun God Clan around them. .??.

These golden-armored strong men usually live in a privileged position among the Sun God Clan, 
and can be said to be superior to others in the wilderness. They have never seen such a terrifying 
scene.

They immediately screamed in horror: "Boy! Who are you? You are not a human! You are an 
undead from the underworld! The evil spirits invade and the world is going to end!"

At this time, accompanied by horrifying screams, these golden-armored strong men from the Sun 
God Clan were directly torn to pieces by the undead monsters condensed in the Nether Realm.

Seeing this scene, Ye Feng's eyes showed deep surprise. The three sets of inheritance he received 
from the tombs of Emperor Netherworld and Emperor Netherworld's wife can be said to be an 
extremely powerful combination.



Netherworld

The armor can provide Ye Feng with very powerful defense, the Hand of the Emperor provides 
crushing power, and the Nether Realm provides group attacks. It can be said that it provides huge 
benefits for the overall improvement of Ye Feng's combat effectiveness.

At this moment, Ye Feng did not hesitate at all. He rushed forward and devoured all the dozen or so 
golden-armored warriors from the Sun God Clan who were killed by him.

"Rumble..."

At this moment, a very majestic skill and energy was immediately injected into Ye Feng's body, and 
Ye Feng's cultivation skills immediately began to continue to rise.

boom!

The eighth level of Taoist realm!

boom!

The ninth level of Taoist realm!

boom!

The tenth level of Taoist Realm is complete! !

At this moment, Ye Feng's cultivation level directly broke through the third level of heaven, and 
continued to break through to the tenth level of Daofu realm.

Ye Feng originally thought that his cultivation level could directly break through the bottleneck of 
the Taoist realm and step into the Tianyang realm above the Taoist realm.

But after all, the big bottleneck is really difficult to break through.



When Ye Feng broke through to the Great Perfection of the Tenth Level of the Taoist Realm, even if 
there was a very huge energy in the follow-up, it ultimately failed to break through Ye Feng's big 
bottleneck.

The fluctuations in Ye Feng's cultivation aura immediately subsided.

But no matter what, Ye Feng devoured these dozen golden armored elites from the Sun God Clan, 
and his cultivation level has improved so much, Ye Feng is already very satisfied.

At this time, Ye Feng immediately looked not far away, trying to find where the old man of beasts 
and the sun goddess were fighting.

The battle between the two was too terrifying and intense. After all, it was a battle between top 
masters, so Ye Feng was delayed for a while and didn't know where the two of them had gone.

Chapter 4816 Hard-hearted

Ye Feng immediately exuded his soul power at this time, trying to find where the Old Man of 
Beasts and the Sun Goddess had fought.

However, Ye Feng did not notice any energy fluctuations, which made Ye Feng feel a little strange.

After all, if such powerful beings as the Old Man of Beasts and the Sun Goddess were really 
fighting around, then I would definitely be able to detect the movements of their fighting.

But Ye Feng didn't notice it.

This made Ye Feng couldn't help but wonder, is the battle between the two over?

But at this time, in order to confirm his idea, Ye Feng could only keep searching. ??

At this moment, Ye Feng flew quickly in a certain direction in the distance according to the chaotic 
traces of the battle on the ground.

Soon, Ye Feng passed through numerous jungles and finally came to a huge mountain.



This mountain is extremely majestic. Among the entire wilderness, it is probably one of the few 
huge mountains that reach straight into the sky.

Under this mountain that looked like an ancient sacred mountain, Ye Feng saw the fighting coming 
to an abrupt end.

This made Ye Feng's eyes suddenly show a hint of surprise.

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately looked around and couldn't help shouting: "Senior Ten 
Thousand Beasts, are you nearby?"

But the moment Ye Feng just shouted, Ye Feng suddenly heard something strange, coming from a 
certain direction under the mountain.

Uh-huh!

Ye Feng's eyes moved and he immediately flew quickly in that direction.

When Ye Feng parted a dense jungle, he immediately saw a shocking scene.

I saw a beautiful woman wearing a golden dress with a pale face, sitting cross-legged on the ground 
not far away, seemingly recovering from her injuries.

Seeing this scene, Ye Feng had almost no hesitation. Almost instinctively, he rushed in front of the 
sun goddess. The black broken sword in his hand immediately slashed towards the head of this 
beautiful sun goddess.

Go, want to cut off the other party's head, cut it off, and take his life.

Because Ye Feng knew very well how terrifying this sun goddess was.

Being able to fight on par with, or even surpass, an ancient strong man like Old Man of Beasts, Ye 
Feng knew that this sun goddess must not allow her to recover her cultivation, otherwise he would 
die.



Ye Feng knew very well that it was probably the Sun Goddess and the Old Man of Beasts who 
fought to the end, and both sides suffered heavy losses.

The old man of all beasts has disappeared.

The Sun Goddess meditates here to regain her strength.

Ye Feng naturally would not let the Sun Goddess return to her original strength.

So at this moment, Ye Feng didn't hesitate at all, and took action instinctively, wanting to cut off the 
other party's beautiful head.

But the moment Ye Feng's black broken sword struck the snow-white neck of the Sun Goddess, the 
Sun Goddess suddenly opened her eyes.

The dark eyes glanced at Ye Feng, seemingly showing a hint of contempt.

Then she stretched out a jade-like finger and struck the black broken sword that was about to pierce 
her neck like lightning.

Boom! !

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately felt a terrifying and huge power, which was transmitted from 
the black broken sword in his hand to his palm.

Boom!

At this moment, Ye Feng was immediately blown away by the huge force. Even the broken black 
sword in his hand fell off and fell to the ground with a "clang".

"What?"

Ye Feng's face immediately became very gloomy. He didn't expect that this sun goddess could react 
so quickly and be so powerful even in a seriously injured state. It seemed that



Today I am dead.

But at this moment, Ye Feng suddenly raised his head and saw a trace of blood spilling from the 
corner of the Sun Goddess' mouth.

When Ye Feng saw this scene, he couldn't help but stood up immediately, laughed loudly and said: 
"Sun Goddess, you are such a witch, it seems that you have suffered serious injuries, even if you put 
out a finger, you will be hurt." There is blood flowing from the corner of your mouth, I guess you 
can't move at all now."

Ye Feng said at this time, picked up the broken black sword that fell on the ground, and then 
attacked the Sun Goddess in front of him fiercely again.

Seeing Ye Feng's hard-hearted attack, the Sun Goddess couldn't help but twitch her eyebrows and 
said, "Do you really want to kill me?" ??

At this moment, the beautiful face of the Sun Goddess showed a trace of pity, and on that noble and 
elegant face, there was a trace of sadness that could be said to be overwhelming. It was pitiful and 
difficult to deal with.

But at this time, Ye Feng's eyes were still full of boiling murderous intent, and he said loudly: "You 
are such a terrifying witch, if I don't take advantage of others' danger to kill you, then the person 
who will die will be me."

At this time, Ye Feng was not infected by the Sun Goddess's pitiful expression at all. Instead, he had 
no woman in his heart and drew his sword to the God of Nature.

Ye Feng directly used the most powerful posture to attack the Sun Goddess for the second time, 
wanting to kill the Sun Goddess on the spot.

Because Ye Feng knew very well that the threat of the Sun Goddess was too great.

So the moment Ye Feng saw the Sun Goddess, he waved the long sword in his hand to kill her and 
didn't want to talk nonsense with her.



At this moment, Ye Feng wielded his long sword to kill for the second time. The Sun Goddess 
showed an angry look in her eyes, but she was also quite helpless, because she was indeed very 
seriously injured now, even for someone as tall as Ye Feng. Even ant-like characters whose realm is 
much lower than hers can hurt her.

At this time, the sun goddess

Suddenly, a bright golden light lit up on his body. The golden light had terrifying burning power. It 
was obviously the sun flame power of the Sun God Clan.

This kind of solar flame power directly condensed a flame mask around the Sun Goddess.

The moment Ye Feng's black broken sword struck it, he immediately felt a huge resistance, making 
it impossible for the long sword in Ye Feng's hand to move forward.

At this moment, Ye Feng shouted loudly: "Hand of the Emperor!"

Ye Feng is obviously using all his methods now.

A towering and boundless palm immediately appeared high in the sky, majestic and fiercely 
attacking the sun goddess in front of Ye Feng.

Boom!

At this moment, Ye Feng's Emperor's Hand struck the sunlight surrounding the Sun Goddess, and 
immediately made a huge roar.

However, the power of Ye Feng's Emperor's Hand and the black broken sword in his hand failed to 
blast away the flame mask condensed around the Sun God Clan.

It has to be said that the sun goddess suffered such huge losses in the battle with the Old Man of 
Beasts, but there was still no way to hurt her life, which made Ye Feng feel very nervous at this 
time.



But the next moment, Ye Feng stopped when he saw the opportunity. Knowing that he could not kill 
the sun goddess, he immediately retreated quickly and got away from here immediately, just like an 
assassin assassinating, missing a single hit and running thousands of miles away.

But just when Ye Feng turned around, a burst of fragrance suddenly hit him.

Ye Feng felt it immediately. A soft and fragrant figure appeared directly behind him.

Then Ye Feng immediately felt that a white hand that seemed weak and boneless, but cold and cold, 
had grabbed his throat.

Immediately, the slightly cold voice of the Sun Goddess sounded in Ye Feng's ears: "Trash, be 
honest, otherwise, I will send you to see the King of Hell immediately."

Chapter 4817 You are crazy

"It's over!"

Ye Feng felt a chill in his heart when he heard the voice of the Sun Goddess in his ear.

Although the fragrance is fragrant and charming, the stunning beauty is behind him, and the two are 
very close at this time, Ye Feng cannot feel any ambiguity at this moment. Instead, he feels that his 
heart is suddenly cast with a cold shadow of death. Feel.

However, Ye Feng calmed down immediately and couldn't help but said: "Sun Goddess, what do 
you want? If you want to kill or behead, just do it. Why threaten me like this."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the Sun Goddess snorted coldly, and then a beautiful and elegant figure 
appeared in front of Ye Feng.

But that little white hand was still holding Ye Feng's throat tightly, as if he was going to kill Ye Feng 
if he disagreed.

The Sun Goddess stared at Ye Feng, with a slight chuckle on her beautiful face, and said loudly: "If 
it weren't for the fact that I kept you for some use, I would have killed you long ago. You are cruel 
and ruthless. When you saw me for the first time, you didn’t say much nonsense and just wanted to 
kill me. If I didn’t still have some skills left, I’m afraid you would have succeeded. I am a great sun 
goddess, if I die like you In the hands of an ant-like boy, it really tarnished my reputation."



Hearing what the Sun Goddess said, Ye Feng immediately showed a look of surprise in his eyes. It 
turned out that the Sun Goddess would not kill him, but kept him alive, and had other uses. It 
seemed that he wanted to help him recover from his injuries. .

At this time, the Sun Goddess suddenly moved her fingers, and a fiery red light directly penetrated 
into Ye Feng's Dantian.

Ye Feng's face immediately changed slightly, and he felt that there seemed to be a flame burning in 
his dantian, making Ye Feng's dantian almost melt.

Ye Feng immediately couldn't help but said in a low voice: "Sun Goddess, what did you do to me?"

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the Sun Goddess immediately stretched out her white hands, patted Ye 
Feng's face, and said loudly: "Just call me by my name."

, you are not worthy of this ant. Next, you have to call me Goddess. Otherwise, I will kill you 
directly. "

Ye Feng suddenly said coldly at this time: "Sun Goddess, what exactly did you do to me?"

Hearing that Ye Feng still called herself the Sun Goddess, which was very disrespectful, the Sun 
Goddess immediately showed an angry look in her eyes and said loudly: "How can you be so 
stubborn as a young man! If I didn't keep you for some use, I would It really crushed your throat at 
once!"

After saying that, the Sun Goddess immediately smiled coldly and continued: "Boy, don't be proud. 
I just left a trace of my flame spirit in your Dantian. Once you dare to do anything detrimental to 
me, , I will instantly detonate the flame spirit in your Dantian, and then your Dantian will 
completely explode and you will become a useless person from now on."

"you……"

Hearing what the Sun Goddess said, Ye Feng's face suddenly became a little uncertain. He didn't 
expect that he would kill the Sun Goddess with such iron-blooded attacks. However, the other party 
was too strong, and he was killed. The way of this sun goddess.



At this time, seeing that Ye Feng was silent, the Sun Goddess immediately smiled faintly, with a 
cunning look on her beautiful and noble face, and then released her palm from holding Ye Feng's 
throat.

Ye Feng did not act rashly at this time, because he was really afraid that the Sun Goddess would 
detonate the flame spirit in his Dantian, and his years of hard work would be in vain.

Ye Feng is not yet so confident that his immortal body can withstand the burning power of such a 
terrifying and advanced flame soul as the Sun Goddess.

At this moment, Ye Feng's face was quite gloomy, staring at the sun goddess in front of him, and 
said coldly: "What the hell are you doing?"

What do you want me to help you with? And if I help you, will you help me finally remove the 
flame soul from my Dantian? "

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the Sun Goddess immediately showed a hint of cunning in her eyes, 
and said loudly: "Of course I will not help you unlock the flame soul in your Dantian. I will enslave 
you for the rest of my life and make you become My slave will stay with this goddess for all 
eternity and become my exclusive slave."

Hearing what the Sun Goddess said, Ye Feng's face suddenly showed a look of astonishment, and 
then his eyes suddenly showed a kind of madness and ferocity. All of a sudden, he rushed in front of 
the Sun Goddess crazily and hugged the Sun Goddess. He yelled and said: "If you dare to do this to 
me, then I will blow myself up and we will die together!"

At this time, Ye Feng directly activated the original power of the immortal body of the God, and his 
whole body immediately erupted with an explosive power that could destroy the world.

This explosive power made the Sun Goddess feel a kind of death crisis, and she immediately 
screamed in Ye Feng's arms: "Ye Feng, you are crazy!!"

Ye Feng's face looked a little ferocious at this time, and he said aloud: "Instead of being your slave 
for the rest of his life, it would be better to die a happy death! If I can drag you, the most amazing 
and beautiful Sun Goddess of the Sun God Clan, into the water before I die, I will be considered as 
one." It’s a well-deserved death, a death with no regrets.”



Hearing what Ye Feng said, the Sun Goddess couldn't break away from Ye Feng's powerful and 
solid immortal body of the god cast like divine iron. She immediately shouted and said: "My 
Goddess just made a joke, Ye Feng, hurry up." Stop blowing yourself up!”

Hearing what the Sun Goddess said, Ye Feng let go of his hand.

Uh-huh!

At this time, the Sun Goddess took several steps back, with a look of deep astonishment in her eyes. 
She stared at Ye Feng in front of her. She didn't seem to expect that this handsome young man in 
front of her would suddenly change his behavior. So unusual,

They just want to self-destruct ferociously and die together.

At this time, the Sun Goddess couldn't help but waved her hands and said loudly: "Ye Feng, a weak 
young man like you is just an insignificant person in my eyes. I am seriously injured now and need 
your help." , As long as you help me recover some of my strength, I will let you go. I will definitely 
help you unlock the flame spirit in your Dantian, so you can rest assured."

Hearing what the Flame Goddess said, Ye Feng immediately said: "You must swear a martial arts 
oath, otherwise, not only will I not help you, but I will continue to self-destruct and drag you to 
death. I don't believe you." Witch."

Hearing Ye Feng say "witch", three black lines immediately appeared on the white forehead of the 
Flame Goddess. She seemed to be very angry, because the Sun Goddess was an extremely noble 
goddess figure anywhere in the wilderness, but now Ye Feng was Such a slut and a witch screamed 
like a witch, which made her very embarrassed.

But then, the Sun Goddess couldn't say much at this time. After all, Ye Feng almost blew himself up 
just now.

At this time, the Sun Goddess saw Ye Feng's firm and somewhat ferocious gaze, and immediately 
nodded helplessly and said: "Okay, I swear a martial arts oath, as long as Ye Feng you help me 
regain my strength. , I will let you go, Ye Feng, and I will unlock the flame spirit in your Dantian 
for you."



Hearing the Sun Goddess's vow of martial arts, Ye Feng finally felt relieved. He immediately smiled 
and said, "Then it will be a pleasure to cooperate."

This time, Ye Feng felt very lucky to have survived in the hands of the Sun Goddess.

At this time, he and the Sun Goddess had agreed to cooperate. Ye Feng was naturally very happy, 
and there was no danger for the time being.

At this moment, seeing Ye Feng's originally ferocious face turn into a smile, the Sun Goddess 
immediately couldn't help but said: "I have never seen anyone as moody as you."

Chapter 4818 The Rebellious Boy

For the Sun Goddess, she originally thought that she could play with and control a young ant-like 
figure like Ye Feng at will.

But she didn't expect that she underestimated Ye Feng's determination and actually wanted to blow 
himself up and die with her.

So at this time, the Sun Goddess could only make a martial arts oath and promise to do things for 
Ye Feng.

At this time, Ye Feng also had an inexplicable look on his face.

Ye Feng actually doesn't want to cooperate with a strong person from the Sun God Clan like the Sun 
Goddess, because Ye Feng and the Sun God Clan are completely at odds with each other. What Ye 
Feng wants to do most is to kill the leader of the Sun God Clan, the Flame Goddess. Today's father.

But now Ye Feng can only temporarily cooperate with the Sun Goddess in order to survive, 
otherwise he is probably dead. .??.

In this regard, Ye Feng could only make this decision helplessly.

Because if you want to survive now, you can only help the Sun Goddess regain her strength first.

As for the future, let’s wait until the future.



The only thing Ye Feng wants now is to save his life first.

After all, the green hills are still there, so you don’t have to worry about running out of firewood.

If you are too impulsive, sometimes don't know how to be tactful, and just break up with this sun 
goddess, there won't be much benefit.

After all, the person who has the greatest hatred against Ye Feng is the patriarch of the entire Sun 
God Clan, not this Sun Goddess.

There is indeed no big grudge between Ye Feng and the Sun Goddess.

At this time, Ye Feng did not hesitate and asked directly: "Sun Goddess, how do you want me to 
help you regain your strength? It should be no problem for you to regain your strength alone."

The Sun Goddess slowly spoke out: "You are friends with that Old Man of All Beasts. Next I will 
probably meet Old Man of All Beasts. Although Old Man of All Beasts also suffered heavy injuries, 
he is not dead. If he If you show up and want to kill me, you have to protect me.”

Hearing what the Sun Goddess said, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly showed a look of astonishment, and 
then suddenly shook his head and smiled, and said loudly: "I think you misunderstood. Old Man of 
Beasts and I are not friends. I was also raped by Old Man of Beasts before. Coercion, help him 
regain his strength, otherwise you will kill me, so your wishful thinking is wrong. If the old man of 
beasts appears and wants to kill you, even if I say something for you, it will be of no use. , he will 
still be determined to kill you, and even kill me together."

Regarding the moody old monster, Old Man of Beasts, Ye Feng knew very well that if this old 
monster wanted to do something and he tried to stop it, he would definitely kill him without 
hesitation.

Therefore, Ye Feng knew very well before that his cooperation with the Old Man of Beasts was 
simply a temporary cooperation, and it was impossible for the two to become friends.

Hearing Ye Feng say this, the Sun Goddess suddenly showed a look of surprise in his eyes, but then 
he chuckled, shook his head, and said: "It's okay, you just need to help me resist the Old Man of 
Beasts. A partial attack is enough. After all, although you are a very weak being in my eyes, your 
combat effectiveness is indeed pretty good."



When she said this, the Sun Goddess suddenly took out a map from her storage ring.

"Um?"

Ye Feng took a look, and his eyes suddenly showed a look of astonishment.

\u003e I saw that on this map, most of the locations where peerless elixirs grew in the wilderness 
were marked.

Ye Feng immediately couldn't help but said: "Sun Goddess, is this picture you brought from the Sun 
God Clan to specifically search for elixirs? But if someone discovers the place where these peerless 
elixirs grow in advance, Why don’t you pick these peerless elixirs and draw them on this map 
instead?”

The Sun Goddess smiled faintly and said aloud: "You don't understand this, right? This is the 
foundation of our overlord race. Every year, our Sun God Clan sends various powerful men to 
patrol and search for various peerless souls in the wilderness. Medicine or some precious treasures, 
but they will not be taken away directly. Instead, the locations containing peerless elixirs and 
treasures will be marked on the map, and then we, the elite disciples of the Sun God Clan, will get 
this. Draw a map. When we are practicing outside, we can look for these peerless elixirs or 
treasures. And if we encounter serious injuries, we can go to the places where these peerless elixirs 
grow and pick them. Use these peerless elixirs that have been explored in advance. Medicine is used 
to restore strength, these are life-saving things.”

Hearing what the Sun Goddess said, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly showed a hint of amazement, and he 
said loudly: "Indeed, the overlord race in the wilderness has a profound heritage, and it can actually 
come up with such a clever plan, which can save many people who have experienced outside. 
Young disciples, but if this map falls into the hands of others, I think your hard work will be in vain. 
"

The Sun Goddess gave Ye Feng a cold look and said loudly: "Do you think anyone in our Sun God 
Clan can get this map in their hands? Only the best among the best, the genius among geniuses, can 
To get this kind of special map, even the ninth prince of our Sun God Clan that you killed before 
could not have this kind of map, it is just a waste. "

Ye Feng's eyes suddenly showed a look of surprise, and he said loudly: "The ninth prince I killed 
should be your brother. Don't you have any hatred for me?"



The Sun Goddess immediately smiled coldly and said aloud: "Do you think they are all born to the 
same parents? As the leader of the Sun God Clan, my father is responsible for passing on the 
excellent bloodline to the entire Sun God Clan. My father is There are thirty concubines. The ninth 
prince you killed was just the son of a certain concubine. He has nothing to do with me at all. I 
don’t even know him very well. He is just like the blood of the Northern Territory where you are. 
It’s the same as the Demon Dynasty. Although the children of the royal family have the same father, 
their mothers are different. Therefore, there is no so-called blood connection or family relationship. 
If there is any relationship, it is only a competitive relationship. You Killing the Ninth Prince just 
cleared a possible obstacle for me in the future."

Ye Feng was stunned when he heard what the Sun Goddess said. It seemed that this Sun Goddess 
was a very ruthless person and a very ambitious person.

After all, Ye Feng had heard it a long time ago. The reason why this sun goddess dealt with the Old 
Man of All Beasts was to gain the power of the Old Man of All Beasts to practice the Great Law of 
All Beasts, so that she could forge the magic of the immortal body of all beasts, and thus dominate 
the wilderness. Taking his father's place.

From this, Ye Feng could see that this sun goddess, although she looked extremely beautiful and 
charming, like a noble and elegant goddess, was actually an out-and-out ambitious and rebellious 
person.

Ye Feng thought of this, but his eyes suddenly flashed slightly. Maybe he could find a way to use 
this Sun Goddess to give himself a chance to kill the current leader of the Sun God Clan in advance.

Chapter 4819 Seize every opportunity

However, Ye Feng knew that his idea of using this sun goddess might not be realized yet.

Because the gap in cultivation strength between him and the Sun Goddess is really too big.

When Ye Feng was seriously injured by the Sun Goddess, he was unable to do anything to the other 
party, although the other party was also somewhat unable to do anything to him.

But if the Sun Goddess regains her peak cultivation strength in her heyday, she will not be able to 
fight against her opponent with her current cultivation level.



Therefore, Ye Feng felt that the cultivation level of this Sun Goddess must be much higher than his 
own. It was definitely not just the Tianyang realm above the Taoist realm, or the Shenyang realm 
above the Tianyang realm.

The cultivation level of this Sun Goddess may be many levels stronger than that of Shenyang 
Realm. Otherwise, he would not be able to fight against the seriously injured Sun Goddess even at 
his peak.

At this moment, while Ye Feng was thinking secretly in his heart, the Sun Goddess and Ye Feng had 
arrived at the place closest to them on the map in her hand, where a peerless elixir was hidden.

That's a grand canyon.

However, the Sun Goddess looked at Ye Feng beside her and said, "Ye Feng, go over and take a 
look at the situation first."

Hearing what the Sun Goddess said, Ye Feng immediately showed a look of astonishment in his 
eyes, daring the Sun Goddess to treat him as cannon fodder and let him take the lead.

Ye Feng had no way to resist at this time and could only enter the valley alone.

Before leaving, the Sun Goddess said lightly: "Ye Feng, the peerless elixir growing in this valley is 
called the Flame Nine-petal Flower. This flower contains the innate flame essence, which can 
improve my cultivation strength." After a huge recovery, you first go into the valley alone to see if 
there are any demons or beasts lurking in it. But let me remind you, don’t try to swallow this nine-
petal flame flower privately. Otherwise, when I enter the valley, I will find out. If you swallowed 
the Nine-petal Flame Flower, I will kill you instantly. If you work for me honestly, then I will 
definitely keep my promise and let you go."

Hearing what the Sun Goddess said, Ye Feng had no expression on his face, just nodded, and then 
walked towards the valley alone.

The Sun Goddess was waiting for Ye Feng outside the valley, sending

A sign of safety.



At this moment, the moment Ye Feng entered the valley, he immediately discovered that there 
seemed to be no dangerous monsters and monsters lurking in the entire valley.

And Ye Feng really saw that in the middle area of the valley, a crimson flower that was as tall as a 
person and as big as a person grew on the ground.

This flower has nine petals, and each petal is engraved with an ancient pattern, emitting a red light.

This should be the nine-petaled flame flower that the Sun Goddess mentioned just now.

But just when Ye Feng was about to turn around and tell the Sun Goddess that there was no danger, 
Ye Feng suddenly discovered that in the stamens of the flame nine-petal flower, a small red fruit 
actually grew. None can be found.

The energy fluctuations emitted by this crimson fruit are much stronger than the nine-petal flame 
flower itself.

When Ye Feng saw this scene, his eyes suddenly flashed.

Could it be that this nine-petaled flame flower has finally borne fruit after so many years of growth?

The nine-petal flame flower itself is a very precious and unique elixir. There is also a fruit growing 
out of the stamens of the nine-petal flame flower. This is enough to show that this fruit is definitely 
more precious than the nine-petal flame flower itself.

Ye Feng's eyes were filled with joy, and he immediately rushed forward and picked the fruit into his 
storage ring.

Anyway, this sun goddess has never been here before, but it is recorded on the map that there is a 
flame nine-petal flower here.

So Ye Feng picked the fruit from the flame nine-petal flower, and the sun goddess would definitely 
not know.

At this time, Ye Feng swallowed the fruit grown from the flame nine-petal flower just in case.



Ye Feng's cultivation aura of the tenth level of the Taoist Realm suddenly broke through at this 
moment.

With the help of this fruit

The essence of the flames in it has directly broken through to the Tianyang realm, which is half a 
step above the Taoist realm!

It has to be said that one fruit allowed Ye Feng to break through the entire bottleneck and reach the 
half-step Tianyang realm above the tenth level of the Taoist realm.

It can be seen from this that how precious this fruit is, Ye Feng has simply received a huge 
opportunity.

However, Ye Feng did not show his cultivation aura at this time. He still maintained the cultivation 
aura of the tenth level of the Taoist realm, and truly broke through to the half-step Tianyang realm, 
for fear that the sun goddess would produce Suspect.

Moreover, Ye Feng felt that this Sun Goddess was such an ambitious woman, a rebellious boy who 
was even ruthless to his own father, including his brothers and sisters.

Therefore, Ye Feng felt that the Sun Goddess, a cruel and ruthless woman, might not be able to let 
him go so easily in the end.

Therefore, Ye Feng silently seizes various opportunities at this time to improve his cultivation 
strength, in case the last sun goddess turns against her, and he has the power to fight against her.

Ye Feng's previous cultivation was at the tenth level of Taoist Realm, Great Perfection.

But Ye Feng can grow up silently.

His current true cultivation realm is half-step to Tianyang realm.

But this is not enough.



Ye Feng decided to seize every opportunity as much as possible in the next journey to continue to 
improve and accumulate his own cultivation strength.

However, Ye Feng needs to hide his cultivation in the previous tenth level of Taoist Realm. In this 
case, the Sun Goddess will definitely look down on him, but his true strength is actually secretly 
improving, maybe by then When the time comes, you can counter-kill this sun goddess.

When he thought of this, Ye Feng's face suddenly showed a cold smile, and then Ye Feng flashed 
back to the outside of the valley, looked at the sun goddess in front of him, and said 
expressionlessly: "There is no such thing in the valley. any danger."

Seeing Ye Feng coming back so quickly, the Sun Goddess didn't have any doubts. She immediately 
nodded and said, "Okay, I hope you didn't swallow the nine-petal flame flower."

Hearing what the Sun Goddess said, Ye Feng had no expression on his face, but he smiled coldly in 
his heart.

He had already devoured and absorbed the most precious fruits among the nine-petaled flame 
flowers, allowing himself to break through the entire bottleneck.

As for the flame nine-petal flower itself, Ye Feng no longer cares about it.

At this moment, Ye Feng led the Sun Goddess directly into the valley. The next moment, the Sun 
Goddess' eyes suddenly revealed a look of surprise.

Because the nine-petal flame flower marked on this map does exist here and has not been picked by 
other monsters and beasts.

At this moment, the Sun Goddess rushed forward and came to the nine-petaled flame flower.

However, the Sun Goddess did not directly pick the nine-petal flame flower. Instead, she sat in front 
of the nine-petal flame flower, stretched out her two small white hands, and began to perform a 
special technique.



With the gentle waving of the two palms of the Sun Goddess, Ye Feng immediately saw a very 
magical scene.

The crimson flame essence in the nine-petal flame flower immediately turned into rays of energy 
and entered the hands of the Sun Goddess.

Ye Feng could see with his naked eyes that the Sun Goddess was also emitting a crimson light, 
which seemed to echo the nine-petaled sun flower and was constantly recovering from the Sun 
Goddess's injuries.

When Ye Feng saw this scene, a look of surprise suddenly appeared in his eyes.

This Sun Goddess is worthy of being an orthodox bloodline descendant of the Sun God Clan. She 
has a natural connection with this elixir of heaven and earth’s fire attribute. She does not need to 
refine this peerless elixir into elixirs to restore her own strength. You can directly respond to the 
elixir and use the medicinal power in the elixir to treat yourself.

After all, no one can directly devour it to recover injuries or improve skills like Ye Feng.

It is not easy for the Sun Goddess to be able to do this, directly echo the nine-petal flame flower, 
and heal her own body injuries.

At this time, Ye Feng also breathed a sigh of relief. It seemed that the sun goddess did not know that 
a precious fruit could grow from the nine-petal flame flower.

Chapter 4820 Six-Eyed Flame Kirin

Although the Sun Goddess was using the Nine-petal Flame Flower to recover from her injuries at 
this time, Ye Feng, who was observing from the side, had deep joy in his eyes.

After all, the most precious fruit has been stolen by himself, which has improved his cultivation 
skills, but the sun goddess is still kept in the dark and does not know all this.

And just when Ye Feng was secretly making a choice, he saw that as the Sun Goddess continued to 
absorb the power of the medicine, the nine-petaled flame flower that was originally emitting bright 
red light immediately changed from bright to bright. It was dim and withered in the end.

Obviously, all the medicinal power and vitality contained in it were absorbed by the Sun Goddess.



This made Ye Feng's eyes suddenly show surprise.

However, Ye Feng also knew that only the peerless elixir with flame attributes that had the same 
origin as the Sun God Clan could be used by the Sun Goddess in this way.

Otherwise, wouldn't the Sun God Clan, like Ye Feng, be able to absorb the energy of peerless elixirs 
from the outside world and directly use them for themselves? Obviously this is impossible.

In fact, most practitioners still need to pick various elixirs, supplement various materials, and refine 
elixirs through ancient elixir recipes in order to improve their skills.

With Ye Feng's ability to devour everything, it can be said that Ye Feng is probably the only one in 
the world.

And just as Ye Feng was thinking secretly in his heart, the Sun Goddess had already opened her 
eyes.

At this time, there was a faint light of fire shining in her beautiful eyes. It was obvious that the Sun 
Goddess had received huge benefits.

But at this time, the Sun Goddess stood up, and couldn't help but murmured, and said: "Why do I 
feel that the medicinal power and flame attribute energy of this nine-petal flame flower are not as 
effective as I imagined? I just I recovered a little bit of my injuries. According to the records in 
some ancient books of our Sun God Clan, the flame attribute energy in this nine-petal flame flower 
is very rich and can recover more than half of my injuries. However, the result is that I only 
recovered. Little by little, it seems that the author of this book exaggerated the effect of the Nine-
petal Flame Flower."

Hearing the murmur of the Sun Goddess not far away, Ye Feng's mouth curved slightly.

Because Ye Feng knows very well that the reason why the medicinal power and effect of the Flame 
Nine-petal Flower has become weaker is not because the author of the book exaggerated, but 
because the most precious fruit bred by the Flame Nine-petal Flower has been stolen by him. .

Therefore, the effect of the Flame Nine-petal Flower itself has naturally decreased a lot.



However, Ye Feng would naturally not tell the truth at this time, otherwise, he would definitely be 
severely punished by the Sun Goddess, or even killed.

Ye Feng just pretended to be dumbfounded at this time, standing in the distance without saying a 
word.

Of course, the Sun Goddess would not have thought that it was related to Ye Feng. After all, 
although the Sun Goddess was very cunning, no matter how smart she was, she would never have 
expected that the moment Ye Feng entered the valley, he had already boldly put the nine-petal flame 
flower into his hands. The fruit of the pregnancy was stolen directly.

At this time, the Sun Goddess shook her head slightly. She didn’t care so much. After all, this nine-
petal flame flower brought her a lot of benefits. The Sun Goddess

Still very satisfied.

At this time, the Sun Goddess looked at Ye Feng and said loudly: "Ye Feng, you did a good job this 
time. You listened to me very much. I asked you to go in to explore the danger, so you went in, and 
you didn't steal anything. As long as you find it again, A few high-level peerless elixirs can restore 
most of my strength, and then I will unlock the flame spirit in your Dantian and let you go."

When Ye Feng heard what the Sun Goddess said, he didn't comment. He just nodded and said, 
"Thank you very much."

Seeing Ye Feng's expressionless look, the Sun Goddess couldn't help but suddenly asked: "If I let 
you go in the end, will we still be enemies next time we meet?"

Ye Feng's eyes flashed slightly, and then he said loudly: "Then it depends on your attitude, Goddess 
of the Sun. I just have a personal grudge with the leader of your Sun God Clan. As long as the other 
members of your Sun God Clan don't provoke me, I will also I won’t kill innocent people 
indiscriminately, but if anyone among the Sun God Clan listens to your clan leader and wants to kill 
me, don’t blame me for being rude.”

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the sun goddess' seemingly beautiful eyes lit up slightly.



Then she didn't say anything more, she just said loudly: "Then let's go."

After saying that, the two of them were about to leave the valley.

But just at the moment when the two were about to walk out of the valley.

Boom!

A terrifying vibration sounded.

The next moment, a majestic flame unicorn with a length of several kilometers appeared at the 
entrance of the valley.

This flame unicorn actually has six eyes. It looks very magical. It is covered with red scales, and 
hair grows out of the gaps between the scales. Each hair is burning with red flames. , giving people 
a very extraordinary momentum, like the arrival of an ancient flame-attributed mythical beast.

At this moment, he sensed the terrifying aura of the six-eyed flame unicorn. Not to mention Ye 
Feng, even the Sun Goddess could not help but change her beautiful face slightly, and said fiercely: 
"Oh no!" The guardian spirit beast of the Nine-petal Flame Flower should be this six-eyed flame 
unicorn. Unexpectedly, it went out and let us steal the Nine-petal Flame Flower. I thought, how 
could there be no danger in this valley? The guardian spirit beast went out just now, let’s get out of 
here quickly.”

After saying that, the Sun Goddess directly pulled Ye Feng and flew towards the back of the valley 
quickly.

And the moment the two of them turned around, the majestic six-eyed flame unicorn behind them, 
which was thousands of meters tall, saw the withered nine-petal flame flower in the valley, and 
immediately revealed a terrifying look in its eyes. With murderous intent, he yelled angrily and 
said: "Where did the two little thieves come from? They actually stole the nine-petal flame flower 
that I have worked hard to cultivate and protect for hundreds of years to bear fruit. That one Fruit is 
the key thing for me to overcome the thunder tribulation! Ahhh! You are dead, I must completely 
kill you two thieves!"

At this moment, the six-eyed flame unicorn roared angrily, its majestic body thousands of meters 
away, burning with raging flames. This furious beast, carrying the terrifying power of flames that 



burned the sky, suddenly headed not far away. Ye Feng and the Sun Goddess, who were escaping 
everywhere, chased after him crazily, filled with endless fire of anger! Although the Sun Goddess 
was using the Nine-petal Flame Flower to recover from her injuries at this time, Ye Feng, who was 
observing from the side, had deep joy in his eyes.

After all, the most precious fruit has been stolen by him, which has improved his cultivation skills, 
but the sun goddess is still kept in the dark and does not know all this.

And just when Ye Feng was secretly making a choice, he saw that as the Sun Goddess continued to 
absorb the power of the medicine, the nine-petaled flame flower that was originally emitting bright 
red light immediately changed from bright to bright. It was dim and withered in the end.

Obviously, all the medicinal power and vitality contained in it were absorbed by the Sun Goddess.

This made Ye Feng's eyes suddenly show surprise.

However, Ye Feng also knew that only the peerless elixir with flame attributes that had the same 
origin as the Sun God Clan could be used by the Sun Goddess in this way.

Otherwise, wouldn't the Sun God Clan, like Ye Feng, be able to absorb the energy of peerless elixirs 
from the outside world and directly use them for themselves? Obviously this is impossible.

In fact, most practitioners still need to pick various elixirs, supplement various materials, and refine 
elixirs through ancient elixir recipes in order to improve their skills.

With Ye Feng's ability to devour everything, it can be said that Ye Feng is probably the only one in 
the world.

And just when Ye Feng was thinking secretly in his heart, the Sun Goddess had already opened her 
eyes.

At this time, there was a faint light of fire shining in her beautiful eyes. It was obvious that the Sun 
Goddess had received huge benefits.

But at this time, the Sun Goddess stood up, and couldn't help but murmured, and said: "Why do I 
feel that the medicinal power and flame attribute energy of this nine-petal flame flower are not as 



effective as I imagined? I just I recovered a little bit of my injuries. According to the records in 
some ancient books of our Sun God Clan, the flame attribute energy in this nine-petal flame flower 
is very rich and can recover more than half of my injuries. However, the result is that I only 
recovered. Little by little, it seems that the author of this book exaggerated the effect of the Nine-
petal Flame Flower."

Hearing the murmur of the Sun Goddess not far away, Ye Feng's mouth curved slightly.

Because Ye Feng knows very well that the reason why the medicinal power and effect of the Flame 
Nine-petal Flower has become weaker is not because the author of the book exaggerated, but 
because the most precious fruit bred by the Flame Nine-petal Flower has been stolen by him. .

Therefore, the effect of the Flame Nine-petal Flower itself has naturally decreased a lot.

However, Ye Feng would naturally not tell the truth at this time, otherwise, he would definitely be 
severely punished by the Sun Goddess, or even killed.

Ye Feng just pretended to be dumbfounded at this time, standing in the distance without saying a 
word.

Of course, the Sun Goddess would not have thought that it was related to Ye Feng. After all, 
although the Sun Goddess was very cunning, no matter how smart she was, she would never have 
expected that the moment Ye Feng entered the valley, he had already boldly put the nine-petal flame 
flower into his hands. The fruit of the pregnancy was stolen directly.

At this time, the Sun Goddess shook her head slightly. She didn’t care so much. After all, this nine-
petal flame flower brought her a lot of benefits. The Sun Goddess

Still very satisfied.

At this time, the Sun Goddess looked at Ye Feng and said loudly: "Ye Feng, you did a good job this 
time. You listened to me very much. I asked you to go in to explore the danger, so you went in, and 
you didn't steal anything. As long as you find it again, A few high-level peerless elixirs can restore 
most of my strength, and then I will unlock the flame spirit in your Dantian and let you go."

When Ye Feng heard what the Sun Goddess said, he didn't comment. He just nodded and said, 
"Thank you very much."



Seeing Ye Feng's expressionless look, the Sun Goddess couldn't help but suddenly asked: "If I let 
you go in the end, will we still be enemies next time we meet?"

Ye Feng's eyes flashed slightly, and then he said loudly: "Then it depends on your attitude, Goddess 
of the Sun. I just have a personal grudge with the leader of your Sun God Clan. As long as the other 
members of your Sun God Clan don't provoke me, I will also I won’t kill innocent people 
indiscriminately, but if anyone in the Sun God Clan listens to your clan leader and wants to kill me, 
don’t blame me for being rude.”

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the sun goddess' seemingly beautiful eyes lit up slightly.

Then she didn't say anything more, she just said loudly: "Then let's go."

After saying that, the two of them were about to leave the valley.

But just at the moment when the two were about to walk out of the valley.

Boom!

A terrifying vibration sounded.

The next moment, a majestic flame unicorn with a length of several thousand meters appeared at the 
entrance of the valley.

This flame unicorn actually has six eyes. It looks very magical. It is covered with red scales, and 
hair grows out of the gaps between the scales. Each hair is burning with red flames. , giving people 
a very extraordinary momentum, like the arrival of an ancient flame-attributed mythical beast.

At this moment, he sensed the terrifying momentum of this six-eyed flame unicorn. Not to mention 
Ye Feng, even the Sun Goddess couldn't help but change her beautiful face slightly, and said 
fiercely: "Oh no!" The guardian spirit beast of the Nine-petal Flame Flower should be this six-eyed 
flame unicorn. Unexpectedly, it went out and let us steal the Nine-petal Flame Flower. I thought, 
how could there be no danger in this valley? The guardian spirit beast went out just now, let’s get 
out of here quickly.”



After saying that, the Sun Goddess directly pulled Ye Feng and flew towards the back of the valley 
quickly.

And the moment the two of them turned around, the majestic six-eyed flame unicorn behind them, 
which was thousands of meters tall, saw the withered nine-petal flame flower in the valley, and 
immediately revealed a terrifying look in its eyes. With murderous intent, he yelled angrily and 
said: "Where did the two little thieves come from? They stole the nine-petal flame flower that I 
have worked hard to cultivate and protect for hundreds of years. That one Fruit is the key thing for 
me to overcome the thunder tribulation! Ahhh! You are dead, I must completely kill you two 
thieves!"

At this moment, the six-eyed flame unicorn roared angrily, its majestic body thousands of meters 
away, burning with raging flames. This furious beast, carrying the terrifying power of flames that 
burned the sky, suddenly headed not far away. Ye Feng and the Sun Goddess, who were escaping 
everywhere, chased madly, filled with endless fire of anger!


	Ancient 4811

