
Ancient 4911

Chapter 4911 How to decide

At this moment, Ye Feng didn't hesitate at all. He just looked at the undead bone dragon in front of 
him and said loudly: "Recover your injuries first, and then immediately take me to find the 94th 
floor of the dead body." Let’s go to the place where the undead monarch rested in the spiritual 
space, and see if we can find the core location of the wealth and inheritance left by that undead 
monarch.”

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the Undead Bone Dragon immediately said in a very respectful voice: 
"Don't worry, sir, my inherited memory contains the location traces left by my ancestors. I can 
definitely find the location left by the undead monarch back then." Where the wealth and 
inheritance come from, no one else will be able to discover it.”

Hearing what the Undead Bone Dragon said, Ye Feng's eyes revealed a look of surprise. He couldn't 
help but smile meaningfully and asked: "Since you know so much in detail, why haven't you been 
looking for that place yourself?" The inheritance and wealth left by an undead monarch? If you find 
it, your strength will undergo earth-shaking changes, and you will not be able to practice silently in 
this abyss."

Hearing what Ye Feng said at this moment, the Undead Bone Dragon knew that Ye Feng was 
probably doubting whether he really wanted to take Ye Feng to find the wealth of the Undead Lord.

The Undead Bone Dragon immediately explained anxiously: "Sir, please don't get me wrong. The 
reason why I have never gone to the final resting place of the Undead Lord is because that place is 
very dangerous. My level is too low. Even if I enter, The core place where the undead monarch 
finally rests, and I have no way to obtain the wealth and inheritance left by the undead monarch. 
The reason why I dare to take you to that place is because you have the legendary Gate of Heaven 
in your body, which has very terrifying powers. The power of light is specially designed to restrain 
our undead clan, so even if there are many powerful undead living in the place where the undead 
monarch lives, you will not be afraid. "

Hearing what the undead bone dragon said, Ye Feng nodded thoughtfully. It seemed that this undead 
bone dragon did not lie to him.
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He nodded and said aloud: "Okay, since you are so sincere in taking me there, if you can really get 
some wealth and inheritance left by the undead monarch, then I will definitely reward you with 
something you need. When the time comes, Your strength will also change."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the Undead Bone Dragon immediately looked overjoyed and kowtowed 
quickly and said, "Thank you, sir, for the reward."

At this time, Ye Feng secretly smiled when he saw the Undead Bone Dragon looking so overjoyed.

If you want this undead bone dragon to serve you sincerely, then you can never use carrots and 
sticks too much.

First use strong strength to oppress him and make him fearful, and then give him some benefits so 
that the other party will not have too strong rebellious psychology, and the other party will naturally 
serve him wholeheartedly.

At this moment, Ye Feng stood in this abyss, waiting for the recovery of the undead bone dragon.

At this time, the Undead Bone Dragon was beaten badly by the eighteen-winged archangel 
summoned by Ye Feng. Therefore, the Undead Bone Dragon would not dare to go on the road for a 
while. Instead, it would silently absorb the surrounding undead under this abyss. Qi, and then 
quickly heal his injuries.

Ye Feng discovered that the broken bones on the Bone Dragon's body were being reconnected by 
rapid healing under the influence of the undead energy.

This kind of recovery speed is very fast, much faster than creatures with real flesh and blood.

When Ye Feng saw this scene, he immediately nodded slightly. The undead is indeed a very rare 
creature. It recovers its strength very quickly, and its life

It is very tenacious and difficult to kill directly. Even if there is only the last bone left in the body, it 
is estimated that it will quickly return to its original appearance and state in its heyday.

At this time, as the Undead Bone Dragon continued to recover, he finally completely connected all 
the bones in his body and regained his strength.



The Undead Bone Dragon immediately came to Ye Feng and said very respectfully: "Sir, I have 
recovered. We can set off directly."

Uh-huh!

Ye Feng nodded and immediately flew up to stand on the huge head bone of the undead bone 
dragon.

The undead bone dragon is like a very attractive mount, running quickly towards a certain direction 
in the ninety-fourth floor of the undead space.

The body of the Undead Bone Dragon is very huge, several kilometers long. It is like a super 
Tyrannosaurus rex made entirely of bones. It is running on the ground. The ordinary little undead 
around it are simply frightened and dare not near. .??.

And just when Ye Feng stood on top of the undead bone dragon, heading towards the place where 
the undead monarch lived.

The guardian of the Holy Tower who was observing in secret had a look of deep astonishment in his 
eyes.

He had been secretly observing Ye Feng's every move. He never thought that Ye Feng not only 
failed to pass through the necromantic space on the 94th floor as quickly as possible, but also 
started playing in the necromantic space.

After all, in his eyes, Ye Feng subdued the Undead Bone Dragon, seemingly just for fun.

Because the guardian of the Holy Tower did not know the specific conversation between Ye Feng 
and the Undead Bone Dragon. He was only observing secretly from a very far away place, so he 
could only see Ye Feng's every move and did not know the conversation between Ye Feng and the 
Undead Bone Dragon. What a big secret it contains.

At this time, when the guardian of the holy tower saw Ye Feng standing on top of the undead bone 
dragon, galloping around in the undead space on the 94th floor, he couldn't help but shook his head 
helplessly. Zhu sighed in admiration, "What this young man has done is really unpredictable."



After saying that, the guardian of the Holy Tower seemed to have thought of something, and 
actually stopped observing secretly. Instead, he exited the space of the Hundred Demons Holy 
Tower and flew quickly towards a certain direction of the Sun God Clan.

He seemed to want to report what Ye Feng did in the Hundred Demons Holy Tower to a mysterious 
big shot of the Sun God Clan.

After all, everything Ye Feng showed had exceeded the expectations of the guardian of the Holy 
Tower.

Ye Feng has a great possibility of entering the 100th floor of the Hundred Demons Holy Tower.

The secret of the 100th floor of the Hundred Demons Holy Tower is that intruders can directly 
control the entire Hundred Demons Holy Tower and become the new generation master of the 
Hundred Demons Holy Tower.

So this matter involves too much.

The guardian of the Holy Tower naturally wanted to report to the ancestor of the Sun God Clan who 
had lived for countless years in advance to see how the ancestor would decide this matter.

He just let nature take its course and let Ye Feng see if he could really enter the 100th floor.

Or block it secretly.

After all, the Holy Tower of Hundred Demons is not an ordinary treasure.

If it were an ordinary treasure, it would just be given to Ye Feng, an honorary elder.

You must know that the Holy Tower of Hundred Demons is regarded as a holy place by countless 
people of the entire Sun God Clan, and is even the spiritual belief of the entire Sun God Clan.



Therefore, this matter involves so much that even the guardians of the Holy Tower don't know what 
to do. They can only go to the deep area of the Sun God Clan and ask the ancestor of the Sun God 
Clan what to do.

Chapter 4912 Too dangerous

Boom!

The huge undead bone dragon ran across the entire land, causing the entire ground to shake rapidly, 
as if an earthquake had occurred.

At this time, many timid undead encountered an undead overlord-level existence as large as the 
undead bone dragon. Naturally, they were very frightened and fled in all directions, not daring to 
block the path of the undead bone dragon.

But at this moment, above the head of such a domineering bone dragon as the Undead Bone 
Dragon, stood a young man dressed in white and wearing snow.

This scene looks very shocking.

This young man in white clothes is naturally Ye Feng.

Ye Feng didn't know that the guardian of the Holy Tower was no longer observing him secretly, but 
went to the depths of the Sun God Clan, as if he wanted to find the ancestors of the Sun God Clan to 
see how to deal with his matter.

But even if Ye Feng knew about it, it probably wouldn't matter. Anyway, he had already benefited a 
lot from being in the Hundred Demons Holy Tower.

If he could get the wealth left by the undead monarch in the ninety-fourth floor of the undead space, 
then Ye Feng would definitely make a lot of money.

Even if the ancestors of the Sun God Clan don't let Ye Feng enter the 100th floor, Ye Feng doesn't 
think it matters. Anyway, he has already received enough benefits from the Hundred Demons Holy 
Tower.

At this moment, Ye Feng was standing on top of the huge bone dragon, looking at the rapidly 
retreating land around him, feeling a sense of great pride in his heart.



At this time, Ye Feng felt like he was standing on top of the bone dragon's head, as if he had 
become the overlord of this necromantic space looking down upon the world.

However, Ye Feng knows very well that such a powerful undead creature as the Undead Bone 
Dragon is very afraid of the place where the Undead Lord finally lives, which is enough to show 
that a unified undead kingdom was established in this undead space. That undead monarch is 
definitely an extremely terrifying guy.

Even if he has fallen now, his resting place definitely contains great dangers.

After all, the Undead Bone Dragon also said before that he alone would not dare to look for the 
inheritance and wealth left by the Undead Monarch, because there are many taboo and terrifying 
death creatures living there.

, even the Undead Bone Dragon cannot defeat it.

However, Ye Feng is still quite confident about his current strength, and most importantly, Ye Feng 
has a super trump card, which is the magic weapon of the Lord of Heaven, the Gate of Heaven.

The extremely high-level light attribute power contained in the Gate of Heaven is specifically 
designed to restrain the existence of such evil spirits.

Therefore, Ye Feng controls the Gate of Heaven. When fighting against the underworld creatures 
with special attributes such as undead creatures, the Gate of Heaven can help Ye Feng greatly 
suppress these powerful death creatures.

At this moment, while Ye Feng was thinking secretly in his heart, the huge undead bone dragon 
under his feet suddenly stopped.

He looked at the land in front of him and said loudly: "Master Ye Feng, we have arrived. The barren 
wasteland in front of us was the glorious kingdom of the undead. From here on, we have entered the 
land where the undead monarch once lived. The ruins of the royal palace that was established in the 
Kingdom of the Undead.”

"Um?"



At this time, when Ye Feng heard what the Undead Bone Dragon said, his eyes moved slightly and 
he immediately looked forward. He didn't expect to arrive so soon.

At this moment, the ground in front of Ye Feng indeed looked very dilapidated.

Because the ground in front is full of broken buildings, and even fragments of some buildings are 
still floating in the sky, forming a feeling of a broken sky city.

At this time, Ye Feng couldn't help but said: "It can be seen that this place was very glorious back 
then, but it only experienced a terrible chaos that resulted in this broken scene today."

The undead bone dragon immediately nodded and said helplessly: "Back then, the undead monarch 
established a unified undead kingdom on this undead land, trying to break through the shackles of 
the Hundred Demons Holy Tower. As a result, the supreme will in the Holy Tower of Hundred 
Demons was angered and was forcibly wiped out. The kingdom of the undead established by the 
undead monarch also followed.

Completely chaotic and broken. "

"Um?"

Hearing what the Undead Bone Dragon said, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly flashed slightly.

Unexpectedly, this undead bone dragon knew that he lived in the space of the Hundred Demons 
Holy Tower.

In fact, each floor of the Hundred Demons Holy Tower is very vast and huge. Ye Feng had already 
discovered when he broke through the level before that each floor of the Hundred Demons Holy 
Tower was like a small world.

The Hundred Demons Holy Tower, which has a hundred floors in total, is like a fusion of a hundred 
small worlds.



That's why Ye Feng felt that the Holy Tower of Hundred Demons was a very magical existence, and 
it was a very ancient and grand magic weapon that actually integrated a hundred small worlds.

Some of the creatures on each floor of the Hundred Demons Holy Tower don't even know that they 
live in a pagoda, but think that they live in a vast world.

However, this undead bone dragon seems to have a very good understanding of the undead land in 
which he lives. He knows that the place he lives in is just a small world among magic weapons.

At this moment, Ye Feng didn't say anything. He just looked at the broken ancient ruins not far 
ahead and said: "Since we have arrived, let's enter it as soon as possible and look for the remains 
left by the undead monarch. Heritage and wealth.”

Ye Feng is not in a hurry to continue to pass the level at this time. After all, getting good things and 
opportunities in the Hundred Demons Holy Tower is what Ye Feng really wants.

At this moment, Ye Feng stood above the head of the undead bone dragon and walked directly into 
the ancient ruins of the palace left by the undead monarch.

There were many broken buildings around, but Ye Feng didn't seem to find any particularly 
powerful undead wandering around.

This made Ye Feng a little curious. He couldn't help but look at the undead bone dragon under his 
feet and asked aloud: "Didn't you say before that the place where the undead monarch rests is very 
dangerous? There are many extremely powerful undead souls living there. Much more powerful 
than you, why haven’t I seen any powerful undead yet?

Not even some weak undead appeared. "

Hearing Ye Feng's question, the Undead Bone Dragon immediately scratched his head in confusion 
and said loudly: "Huh? It's really strange. I have snooped here many times over the years, and every 
time I can find a lot of people wandering around here. Powerful undead, but why are there no 
undead this time? Where did they go? "

Hearing what the Undead Bone Dragon said, Ye Feng's eyes flashed slightly and he said: "Could it 
be that there are other powerful beings? We entered the resting place of the Undead Monarch one 
step ahead of time and gave away all the powerful undead." Cleaned up?"



"impossible!"

At this time, the Undead Bone Dragon immediately shook his head vigorously and said loudly: "I 
am the only one who knows how to get to this place. It is impossible for other trialists to find this 
place..."

When he said this, the Undead Bone Dragon seemed to have thought of something, and suddenly 
his face showed a trace of fear, and he couldn't help but said loudly: "I suddenly thought of the 
biggest possibility, that is, it is hidden in me. The deep bloodline comes from the memories of 
ancestors. Legend has it that only when the Undead Lord wakes up again after ten thousand years, 
will all the powerful undead from the Undead Kingdom in this ancient ruins leave their wandering 
places and gather in the Undead Lord's presence. The sleeping place welcomes the undead monarch 
to wake up again. Could it be that the time of ten thousand years has come? The undead monarch is 
now awakening? All the powerful undead creatures that were wandering around before are probably 
gathered in this ancient ruins at this moment. The sleeping place of the core undead monarch 
welcomes the resurrection of the undead monarch again! "

At this moment, the Undead Bone Dragon was speaking, his tone full of fear, and he quickly said: 
"Master Ye Feng, maybe this is really possible, let's leave here as soon as possible, don't risk your 
life! If the Undead Lord really comes back, Once awakened and resurrected, even if Lord Ye Feng 
holds the gate of heaven, he cannot fight against the undead monarch who was at the peak of the 
undead creatures ten thousand years ago! Compared with those ancient big shots, our cultivation is 
still too weak after all. Let’s get out of here, it’s too dangerous!”

Chapter 4913 Overlord Undead

At this time, the Undead Bone Dragon was obviously scared.

He guessed that the Undead Monarch was very likely to be reviving now.

In the memory of the ancient bloodline, the Undead Bone Dragon naturally had a kind of awe and 
fear from the essence of life for the Undead Monarch who was at the top of the world back then.

At this time, Ye Feng smiled and shook his head, saying, "Since we are here, if we leave now, it 
would be too unwilling. No matter how dangerous it is, we must go and take a look."

After that, Ye Feng took the lead and immediately flew quickly towards the deepest part of the 
palace ruins.



Seeing Ye Feng directly enter it, the Undead Bone Dragon trembled a little, but finally gritted his 
teeth and followed behind Ye Feng. .??.

Because he knew that if he didn't follow Ye Feng, Ye Feng might kill it directly in anger and take 
away his dead crystal.

So the Undead Bone Dragon naturally followed Ye Feng's rhythm wholeheartedly at this time.

Seeing that Ye Feng was not afraid and rushed into the depths of the palace ruins of the undead 
monarch, the undead bone dragon naturally followed behind Ye Feng and couldn't help but say: "If 
Lord Ye Feng really wants to go in for an adventure, he should be low-key. Otherwise, the 
overwhelming human blood energy on Lord Ye Feng is likely to attract the attention of those 
powerful undead in an instant." At this time, hearing the undead bone dragon chasing him, Ye Feng 
nodded and said: "You make sense, okay, I get it." After that, in the horrified eyes of the undead 
bone dragon, the blood energy on Ye Feng's body, the pure human masculine power, at this moment, 
turned into the same death energy as the undead. Ye Feng's whole body suddenly became gloomy, 
just like a bloody human being turned into a lifeless undead in an instant. "What? How is this 
possible??" At this time, the undead bone dragon was stunned. He originally reminded Ye Feng, just 
to let Ye Feng suppress his blood energy as much as possible, so as not to let those powerful 
undeads discover the pure human blood in Ye Feng.

But he never thought that Ye Feng could actually transform his human blood energy directly into 
the sinister death energy.

Moreover, the undead bone dragon was completely unaware that the human in front of him was a 
living human.

Ye Feng had completely become a living dead undead.

At this moment, the undead bone dragon was completely convinced by Ye Feng, and couldn't help 
but exclaimed: "Lord Ye Feng is really the most amazing person I have ever seen, his methods and 
abilities are really incredible!"

The undead bone dragon has lived for so many years, and this is the first time he has encountered 
such a heaven-defying existence like Ye Feng, who can completely transform his entire life essence 
and power into their undead race.



At this time, Ye Feng smiled slightly and said, "In this case, those powerful undead, including the 
undead monarch, may not be able to detect the blood in my body. I have now completely become a 
creature of the underworld like you undead." At this time, Ye Feng said, without any hesitation, let 
the undead bone dragon point the way, and quickly rushed to the core area of this piece of imperial 
palace ruins. Soon, Ye Feng and the undead bone dragon came to the central area of this piece of 
ancient imperial palace ruins. Ye Feng immediately lay down slightly, because Ye Feng saw that in 
the palace hall in front of him, the surrounding buildings of the entire hall had collapsed and 
broken. But in the middle of the hall, there was an extremely huge golden altar. On this huge golden 
altar, there was a skeleton that was more than ten meters tall. This skeleton was human-shaped, just 
like the skeleton of the giant clan. This skeleton was wearing a black emperor's robe, a purple-gold 
crown on his head, and a pure golden sword in his hand. When the Undead Skeleton Dragon saw 
this scene, he was so excited that he couldn't help but whispered: "Lord Ye Feng, the tall skeleton 
lying on the golden altar in the distance is the Undead Monarch of the past. He is an Undead 
Monarch evolved from a terrifying skeleton warrior who fought all over the world. He is very 
powerful."

Ye Feng nodded slightly at this time.

Ye Feng could also feel that although this Undead Monarch was still sleeping and had not revived 
as imagined, he gave people a very unfathomable and terrifying feeling.

At this time, Ye Feng immediately looked around and found that there were indeed more than a 
dozen powerful undeads surrounding this golden altar, as if waiting for the Undead Monarch to 
wake up.

The dozen or so powerful undead surrounding them were all ancient undead in different forms. 
There were dragon corpses covered with golden scales, giant human-like undead with dead eyes, 
black-robed undead in soul state wearing black robes, a death knight riding on a unicorn skeleton 
horse, and a huge gray wolf that was several kilometers long, but its flesh and blood had long since 
rotted away, and its eyes were glowing green, obviously a gray wolf in undead state.

Ye Feng also saw several tall zombies with colorful poisonous gas emitting from their bodies. They 
seemed to be plague zombies among the legendary undead clan. In addition, there were several 
powerful hell skeletons and corpse monsters wearing armor. The warriors were all different types of 
undead. Their aura of power was several levels stronger than that of the undead bone dragon. They 
all surrounded the undead monarch.

Each of these undead overlords seemed to be injecting their own undead power into the golden altar 
in front of them, trying to resurrect the undead monarch.



Seeing this scene, Ye Feng immediately couldn't help but look at the undead bone dragon beside 
him and said loudly: "We can't let them succeed. Once the undead monarch wakes up, it will be 
impossible for us to get what the undead monarch left behind." Huge wealth.”

But as soon as Ye Feng finished speaking, the undead bone dragon beside him immediately said in a 
trembling voice: "There are more than a dozen powerful undead at the overlord level. There is no 
way we can be our opponents!"

At this moment, the undead bone dragon saw a dozen extremely powerful undead overlords, and 
was frightened for a moment.

Although the undead monarch has not completely awakened, it is impossible to fight against these 
dozen overlord undead in different forms just relying on the undead bone dragon and Ye Feng.

Ye Feng also frowned at this time. In fact, what the Undead Bone Dragon said makes sense. 
Although Ye Feng controls the Gate of Heaven, Ye Feng's cultivation is still much weaker than 
these ancient overlord undead. It's just that If you rely on yourself and the undead bone dragon, you 
can only deal with four or five powerful undead overlords at most.

But around the golden altar, there were more than a dozen undead overlords from the ancient era! 
At this time, the Undead Bone Dragon was obviously timid.

He guessed that the undead monarch was probably recovering now.

In the memory of the ancient bloodline, the Undead Bone Dragon naturally has a kind of awe and 
fear for the undead monarch who was at the peak of his life.

At this time, Ye Feng smiled and shook his head, and said loudly: "We've already come, if we leave 
like this now, wouldn't it be too unacceptable? No matter how dangerous it is, we must go and take 
a look."

After saying that, Ye Feng took the lead and immediately flew towards the deepest part of the 
palace ruins.

Seeing Ye Feng directly enter it, the Undead Bone Dragon trembled a little, but finally gritted his 
teeth and followed Ye Feng.



Because he knew that if he didn't follow Ye Feng, Ye Feng might kill him in a rage and seize his 
Necromantic Crystal.

Therefore, the Undead Bone Dragon naturally followed Ye Feng's rhythm wholeheartedly at this 
time.

Seeing that Ye Feng was not afraid and rushed into the ruins of the undead monarch's palace, the 
undead bone dragon naturally followed behind Ye Feng and couldn't help but said: "If Lord Ye Feng 
really wants to enter, If you go on an adventure, you should keep a low profile, otherwise, the 
immense human blood energy in Lord Ye Feng is likely to attract the attention of those powerful 
undead in an instant. "

At this time, when he heard the undead bone dragon chasing after him say this, Ye Feng 
immediately nodded and said: "What you said makes sense, okay, I understand."

After finishing speaking, in the horrified eyes of the undead bone dragon, the blood energy and pure 
human masculine power in Ye Feng's entire body suddenly turned into a death creature exactly like 
the undead at this moment. gas.

Ye Feng's whole body suddenly became gloomy, as if he had suddenly changed from a vigorous 
human race to a lifeless undead.

"What? How is this possible??"

At this time, the Undead Bone Dragon could be said to be stunned.

He originally reminded Ye Feng, just to let Ye Feng suppress the blood energy in his body as much 
as possible to prevent those powerful undead from discovering Ye Feng's pure human blood.

But he never thought that Ye Feng could actually transform the human blood energy in his body into 
the gloomy death energy.

Moreover, the Undead Bone Dragon was completely unaware that the human being in front of him 
was a living human being.



Ye Feng's whole person has completely become an undead like a living dead.

At this moment, the Undead Bone Dragon was completely convinced by Ye Feng and couldn't help 
but said in admiration: "Master Ye Feng is really the most amazing person I have ever seen. His 
methods and abilities are really impressive. Incredible!”

The Undead Bone Dragon has lived for so many years, and this is the first time that he has 
encountered such a heaven-defying existence as Ye Feng, who can completely transform his entire 
life essence and power into their undead clan.

At this time, Ye Feng smiled slightly and said: "In this case, those powerful undead, including the 
undead monarch, may not be able to detect the blood in me. Now I have become completely like 
you undead. A creature from the underworld."

At this time, Ye Feng said, without any hesitation, he let the undead bone dragon show the way and 
rushed towards the core area of the palace ruins.

Soon, Ye Feng and the Undead Bone Dragon were

We arrived at the central area of the ancient ruins of the palace.

Ye Feng immediately lay down slightly, because Ye Feng saw that in the palace hall ahead, all the 
surrounding buildings collapsed and shattered.

But in the middle of the hall, there is a huge golden altar.

On top of this huge golden altar, there was a skeleton that was more than ten meters tall.

This skeleton is human-shaped, just like the skeleton of the giant family.

This skeleton was wearing a black imperial robe, a purple-gold crown on his head, and a pure 
golden sword in his hand.

When the Undead Bone Dragon saw this scene, he was immediately very excited and couldn't help 
but whisper: "Master Ye Feng, the tall skeleton lying on the golden altar in the distance was the 



undead monarch back then, a warrior who fought in all directions. The undead monarch evolved 
from the extremely terrifying skeleton warrior and is very powerful.”

Ye Feng also nodded slightly at this time.

Ye Feng can also feel that although this undead monarch is still sleeping and has not revived as 
expected, it gives people a very unfathomable and terrifying feeling.

At this time, Ye Feng immediately looked around and found that there were indeed more than a 
dozen powerful undead surrounding the golden altar, seemingly waiting for the undead monarch to 
awaken.

The dozens of powerful undead surrounding them are all ancient undead in different forms, 
including dragon corpses covered with golden scales, huge human undead with dead eyes, and souls 
in the state of souls. , a black-robed undead wearing a black robe, a death knight riding a horned 
skeleton horse, and a wolf that was several kilometers long, but the flesh and blood all over his 
body had long since rotted, and his eyes were green. Guang is obviously a wolf in an undead state.

Ye Feng also saw several tall zombies with colorful poisonous gas emitting from their bodies. They 
seemed to be plague zombies among the legendary undead clan. In addition, there were several 
powerful hell skeletons and corpse monsters wearing armor. The warriors were all different types of 
undead, and their aura of power was several levels stronger than that of the undead bone dragon. 
They all surrounded the undead monarch.

Each of these undead overlords seemed to be injecting their own undead power into the golden altar 
in front of them, trying to resurrect the undead monarch.

Seeing this scene, Ye Feng immediately couldn't help but look at the undead bone dragon beside 
him and said loudly: "We can't let them succeed. Once the undead monarch wakes up, it will be 
impossible for us to get what the undead monarch left behind." Huge wealth.”

But as soon as Ye Feng finished speaking, the undead bone dragon beside him immediately said in a 
trembling voice: "There are more than a dozen powerful undead at the overlord level. There is no 
way we can be opponents!"

At this moment, the undead bone dragon saw a dozen extremely powerful undead overlords, and 
was frightened for a moment.



Although the undead monarch has not completely awakened, it is impossible to fight against these 
dozen overlord undead in different forms just relying on the undead bone dragon and Ye Feng.

Ye Feng also frowned at this time. In fact, what the Undead Bone Dragon said makes sense. 
Although Ye Feng controls the Gate of Heaven, Ye Feng's cultivation is still much weaker than 
these ancient overlord undead. It's just that If you rely on yourself and the undead bone dragon, you 
can only deal with four or five powerful undead overlords at most.

But around the golden altar, there were more than a dozen undead overlords from the ancient era!

Chapter 4914 Give it a try

Ye Feng fell into a slight silence at this time, because Ye Feng knew very well that if he relied on 
himself and the undead bone dragon, there would really be no way to fight against the undead 
overlords of the dozen or so ancient times.

After all, the strength of each undead overlord is a level higher than that of the undead bone dragon.

So even if Ye Feng possesses the Gate of Heaven, his chances of winning are slim.

So at this time, Ye Feng did not act rashly, because Ye Feng knew very well that since he wanted to 
get the treasures and wealth of the undead monarch, he must find a way to get rid of all the dozen 
undead overlords, otherwise, Ye Feng would There is no way for Feng to safely search carefully for 
the wealth left by the Undead Lord here, and find out where exactly it is.

Moreover, Ye Feng was also very interested in the undead crystals bred from the undead bodies of 
these dozen overlords.

Because Ye Feng knows very well that this level of undead overlords were born in very ancient 
times.

If the undead crystals in their bodies could be obtained, the energy contained in those undead 
crystals would be absolutely terrifying to the extreme.

After Ye Feng swallows it, his skill will definitely be greatly improved.



Therefore, whether it is to search for the inheritance and wealth left by the undead monarch safely 
and quietly, or to plot the undead crystals bred from the undead bodies of these dozen overlords, Ye 
Feng needs to find a way to surround the golden altar. All the dozen or so overlord undead 
surrounding him were killed.

At this time, Ye Feng was thinking silently, while the undead bone dragon next to him looked very 
worried.

He was really afraid that Ye Feng rushed out impulsively and wanted to fight to the death with these 
dozen undead overlords.

In this case, their fate will definitely be death without a burial place.

So at this time, the Undead Bone Dragon was naturally observing Ye Feng's expression carefully, 
seeming to want to judge what kind of decision Ye Feng wanted to make.

At this moment Ye Feng was thinking

After a while, he suddenly seemed to remember something, and immediately asked aloud in his 
mind: "By the way, Emperor Chu, although these undead are powerful, their souls are not protected 
by the bodies like ordinary creatures, so they must be very The fragility of their souls is directly 
exposed and burning. Emperor Chu, can you come out of my head later and fight against half of the 
undead overlords? As long as you can fight against half of the undead overlords, then the remaining 
The undead bone dragon and I should have no problem with the few undead overlords."

Hearing Ye Feng's question, Emperor Chu immediately said in his mind: "These powerful undead 
are indeed very powerful, but their souls, as Ye Feng said, are almost exposed to the outside. They 
are protected by real bodies like ordinary creatures, so it is very easy to harm their souls. If I take 
action, I should be able to suppress nearly half of the undead overlords. Coupled with Ye Feng and 
your Gate of Heaven, I can suppress all their undead overlords. It should be No problem."

Hearing what Emperor Chu said in his mind, Ye Feng immediately showed a look of joy in his eyes.

Ye Feng knew that this battle was definitely safe.

Since Emperor Chu said so, he would give it a try.



At this moment, Ye Feng immediately looked at the undead bone dragon beside him and said 
loudly: "I will rush out later to deal with the overlord undead around the dozen golden altars. You 
are stronger than these overlord undead." I want to lower it to a lower level and let you confront me 
head-on. I guess you won't be able to do it. You just need to assist me in sneak attacks in secret and 
try to find opportunities. Also, you have to pay attention to the undead monarch lying on the golden 
altar. , If he shows any signs of waking up, please notify me in time.”

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the Undead Bone Dragon almost jumped up in surprise and couldn't 
help but blush.

He changed his voice and said: "Master Ye Feng, please don't be impulsive. There are a dozen 
overlord undead. With your own strength, Master Ye Feng, even if you own the Gate of Heaven, 
you will never be theirs." Opponent, you will die without a place to die.”

Hearing what the undead bone dragon beside him said, Ye Feng just grinned and said, "I still have 
helpers."

After saying that, Ye Feng didn't want to explain anything to the undead bone dragon, so he just 
burst out with powerful power and rushed out instantly.

When the undead bone dragon beside him saw Ye Feng rushing out like this, his face suddenly 
changed with fear.

But thinking of what Ye Feng had said to him before, the Undead Bone Dragon could only grit its 
teeth and rush out behind Ye Feng.

He thought in his heart, just die. If he escapes now, Ye Feng will kill him. Anyway, he will die, so 
he might as well fight.

And just as the Undead Bone Dragon was thinking in his mind, he suddenly saw a very shocking 
scene.

Buzz!

A crimson light suddenly appeared in Ye Feng's head.



The moment this crimson ray of light emerged from his head, a majestic crimson giant of light that 
was several kilometers long condensed directly between the entire world.

Moreover, this red giant of light is no ordinary existence, and actually has a very strong sense of 
oppression on the souls of their undead.

After sensing all this, the Undead Bone Dragon immediately couldn't help but said in horror: "I 
didn't expect Master Ye Feng to have such a terrifying existence in his body. Could this be the will 
of some super strong person?" In Lord Ye Feng's head? Otherwise, it is impossible for this crimson 
giant of light to manifest such a terrifying sense of oppression to our undead simply by relying on 
his will. This existence was definitely a

An extremely terrifying super strong man. "

At this moment, seeing that the red giant of light in Ye Feng's head has such terrifying strength and 
has a natural suppression of their undead souls, the Undead Bone Dragon immediately lost its 
previous despair and fear, and instead Some are eager to try, maybe they can really kill these dozen 
undead overlords.

At this moment, after Emperor Chu emerged from Ye Feng's head, he instantly transformed into a 
huge red giant of light, which had a natural suppression on the undead.

So at this moment, Ye Feng no longer had any fear, but chose to give it a try.

Without any hesitation, Ye Feng directly released the Heaven's Gate. The Heaven's Gate turned into 
a huge white light portal, suspended above Ye Feng's head, exuding incomparable high-level light 
power. All the surrounding death auras have a huge suppressive effect, and even this pure power of 
light illuminates all the surrounding death auras and begins to melt them.

It has to be said that the power of light released by Ye Feng's extremely rare Gate of Heaven is 
enough to allow Ye Feng to fight against these powerful undead overlords who were born in the 
ancient times when his cultivation was weak.

At this moment, Ye Feng and Chu Huang's instant action could be said to be unexpected. It was like 
lightning, attacking the two nearest undead overlords.



The two undead overlords were a hell corpse and a tentacle monster covered with dead eyes.

The two undead overlords didn't even have time to react. They were instantly wiped out by the 
powerful attacks of Ye Feng and Emperor Chu, and two undead crystals as big as fists fell down.

"Be bold!"

And almost at this moment, the death of the two undead overlords instantly caused the other undead 
overlords surrounding the golden altar to become furious and roared.

Chapter 4915 Seven

At this moment, the nearly ten remaining undead overlords reacted one after another. They all flew 
high into the sky from around the golden altar, staring at them with deep anger and overwhelming 
murderous intent in their eyes. Seeing Ye Feng and Emperor Chu in front of them, they all spoke 
out: "Who are you two? You are so bold that you dare to sneak attack on the overlord undead like 
us? And there are only two of you, aren't you afraid of being beaten to death by a group of us?"

Hearing what these dozen undead overlords said, Ye Feng just smiled coldly and said: "You are here 
trying to resurrect the undead monarch. Of course I have to stop you, because I am here to rob what 
the undead monarch has left behind. of wealth.”

After finishing speaking, Ye Feng looked at Emperor Chu beside him and immediately said: "Let's 
do it."

Emperor Chu immediately nodded, and then the body of the majestic crimson giant of light, which 
was several kilometers tall, immediately flew down in the air, with a terrifying sense of oppression, 
and suddenly it fiercely moved towards nearly half of the overlords. The undead attacked and left.

Many of the undead overlords among this half couldn't help but laugh sarcastically and said, "How 
can you, just one of you, fight against so many of us undead overlords?"

But the moment they finished speaking, the red giant of light that Emperor Chu transformed into 
directly attacked their souls, causing them to scream in agony.

A headless undead riding on a skeleton horse immediately couldn't help but said in horror: "This 
crimson giant of light is so weird. It must be a terrifying existence transformed by the will of some 
peerless strong man. It can directly attack our souls, everyone must be careful!"



At this moment, the other half of the overlord undead seemed to realize this, and they immediately 
roared and surrounded Emperor Chu.

But at this moment, Ye Feng looked at the other half of the overlord undead, laughed loudly and 
said: "Your opponent is me!"

Uh-huh!

After saying that, Ye Feng charged directly towards the remaining half of the undead overlords.

At this moment, seeing Ye Feng rushing over, the remaining half of the undead overlords couldn't 
help but sarcastically said: "Boy, your cultivation is so much weaker than ours, what qualifications 
do you have to fight against us? ? And you are so bold to fight against half of our undead 
overlords!"

After saying that, the remaining half of the undead overlords immediately sneered, and then 
attacked Ye Feng, as if they wanted to kill Ye Feng in an instant.

But at the next moment, a door shining with bright white light appeared above Ye Feng's head.

It is the gate of heaven!

Ye Feng had to deal with half of the overlord's undead at this time. Naturally, he did not hesitate at 
all and directly released his powerful magic weapon, the Gate of Heaven, which was specially 
designed to restrain these underworld creatures.

Boom! !

At this moment, infinite bright white light burst out from the Gate of Heaven, covering the entire 
heaven and earth.

At this moment, the surrounding lifeless environment suddenly turned into an area and environment 
shrouded in white light.



These overlord undead are very powerful, but that is because they exist in this undead space.

But now Ye Feng has released the light power of Heaven's Gate, changing the surrounding 
environment. It is no longer so lifeless, but has become an area shrouded in white holy light.

In other words, these undead overlords have no source of power, and their strength is suddenly 
reduced.

Much weaker.

"Um?"

Seeing this scene, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly revealed a look of surprise.

I didn't expect to make such a discovery accidentally.

It can be considered an unexpected little surprise.

At this time, Ye Feng did not hesitate and directly summoned the previously extremely powerful 
eighteen-winged archangel from the gate of heaven.

At this moment, Ye Feng not only summoned one eighteen-winged archangel, but summoned seven 
eighteen-winged archangels at once, which was enough to deal with half of the remaining overlord 
undead.

Every eighteen-winged archangel can fight against an overlord undead.

But this is also Ye Feng's limit. ??

Because of Ye Feng's current cultivation level and skill reserve, it can only allow Ye Feng to 
maximize the use of the Gate of Heaven and summon seven eighteen-winged archangels.

At this time, a total of seven eighteen-winged archangels immediately rushed in front of the 
remaining half of the undead overlords, and fought fiercely with each of the undead overlords.



Boom!

At this moment, the entire field immediately erupted with a huge roar.

At this moment, while Emperor Ye Feng Chu was fighting frantically with these dozen undead 
overlords, the Undead Bone Dragon was lurking in the dark according to Ye Feng's guidance.

Suddenly, he saw an undead overlord who was seriously injured and had just withdrawn from the 
battlefield, recovering strength in a corner.

"good chance!"

Uh-huh!

The undead bone dragon rushed out from the darkness at once, and its huge steel dragon claws 
slammed into the overlord undead body.

\u003e

You know, the Undead Bone Dragon is actually a small overlord of the party. Although it is one 
level lower than these real undead overlords, when the opponent is seriously injured, the damage of 
the Undead Bone Dragon is still very huge. The entire body of the Overlord Undead was torn in 
half.

Before this undead overlord was about to die, he immediately yelled in anger and unwillingness: "A 
small undead bone dragon dares to sneak attack on me!! Damn it!!"

But before he could finish his words at this time, the Undead Bone Dragon stretched out a huge 
steel dragon claw and crushed his head. The soul fire also went out, and a fist-sized ball fell down. 
Necromantic crystal.

call!



At this time, the Undead Bone Dragon immediately opened its mouth and sucked in, absorbing all 
the unique death aura of this undead overlord.

The Undead Bone Dragon has no way to absorb and refine the undead crystals of such advanced 
overlord undead, but it can absorb the death aura left behind by the same kind of undead after death. 
This aura is ethereal, and Ye Feng has no use for it. Undead Bones The dragon is naturally a waste, 
and he can evolve his life. He only needs to keep the core of death energy, the Necromantic Crystal, 
to Master Ye Feng.

At this time, after the Undead Bone Dragon absorbed the death energy of an overlord's undead, it 
felt like it was about to transform.

His strength suddenly increased a lot.

The level of the undead has also improved a lot.

I saw that the bones on the body of the Undead Bone Dragon were originally white, but now even 
noble black and gold lines have begun to appear, making the Undead Bone Dragon look even more 
evil and domineering.

The undead bone dragon's face was full of ecstasy at this time. He knew that he made the right 
choice to follow Ye Feng and give it a try this time!

Chapter 4916 Let’s run quickly

After the undead bone dragon succeeded in the sneak attack at this time, it also evolved, so 
naturally it was very happy.

But then he didn't rush to make a sneak attack. Instead, he hid in the dark for fear that other undead 
overlords would pay attention to him.

At this time, several other undead overlords saw this scene and were very angry.

Because an extremely powerful member among them was secretly attacked and killed by an undead 
bone dragon from a small undead race, and was even sucked into the body by the special undead 
race's death energy. This made several other members The undead overlords were extremely angry, 
roaring and roaring. .??.



But at this time, under the oppression of the seven eighteen-winged archangels summoned by 
Emperor Chu and Ye Feng, these undead overlords roared angrily, but they were of no use.

First of all, the giant of red light that was thousands of meters tall and transformed into Emperor 
Chu had a natural suppression on this undead creature.

Because Emperor Chu himself is in a soul state, he can directly attack the soul fire in the minds of 
these undead without the protection of their bodies.

And the seven eighteen-winged archangels summoned by Ye Feng using the Gate of Heaven are all 
archangels formed from pure and extremely advanced power of light.

This very special creature possesses very advanced and pure light power. It naturally suppresses 
these undead creatures.

Therefore, under the crazy attacks of Ye Feng and Emperor Chu, all the undead overlords could no 
longer support themselves.

Suddenly, another overlord undead was jointly attacked by two eighteen-winged archangels, and his 
legs were shattered.

This undead overlord was a skeleton warrior who looked like a giant, but at this time, his legs had 
been shattered by two eighteen-winged archangels, and he fell to the ground screaming.

Uh-huh!

At this moment, there was a sudden fluctuation in the void, and the Undead Bone Dragon once 
again used its old tricks and attacked instantly.

Huge steel dragon claws,

In one fell swoop, he crushed the skeleton warrior's skull to pieces, and then captured and 
extinguished his soul fire.

"ah!!"



At this moment, the skeleton warrior let out an earth-shattering scream and was instantly attacked 
by the undead bone dragon, killing him immediately.

Snap!

A fist-sized Necromantic Crystal fell from his body once again.

The Undead Bone Dragon did not collect the Undead Crystal because he knew that this kind of 
thing was not something he could covet. It was something Ye Feng needed. The Undead Bone 
Dragon only took what Ye Feng didn't need, which was this The skeleton warrior contains the 
special aura of death of the undead clan.

Buzz!

At this moment, after the Undead Bone Dragon absorbed the death energy of another undead 
overlord, the bones in its body began to expand dramatically. From the previous kilometer, it 
suddenly expanded to tens of thousands of meters.

In other words, the undead bone dragon has suddenly evolved to a huge bone dragon that is more 
than 10,000 meters tall. It is completely composed of bones and is tens of thousands of meters long. 
It stretches across the sky and looks very visually impactful. feel.

At this time, the Undead Bone Dragon immediately laughed and said loudly: "I have finally evolved 
into an overlord-level undead, and I am on the same level as you overlord undead! Hahaha!"

At this time, the Undead Bone Dragon no longer had to attack secretly, but directly waved its tens 
of thousands of meters long steel dragon claws to attack the other undead overlords.

At this moment, after the Undead Bone Dragon successfully evolved and joined the battlefield 
again, the situation on the battlefield can be said to be one-sided.

Those undead overlords could no longer withstand their attacks and were suddenly attacked by Ye 
Fengchu.



The emperor and the undead bone dragon joined forces and directly shattered it into pieces.

All the undead overlords were killed!

Snap!

Snap!

At this time, more than a dozen fist-sized undead crystals suddenly fell from the bodies of the 
overlord undead after death.

At this moment, Ye Feng saw this scene and immediately burst into laughter and said loudly: "It 
seems we succeeded."

At this time, Ye Feng also spent a lot of energy, and his skill was almost exhausted, because 
maintaining the operation of the Gate of Light and condensing seven eighteen-winged archangels 
was a very labor-intensive matter.

Ye Feng quickly took back the Gate of Light.

A total of seven eighteen-winged archangels also disappeared between heaven and earth.

These archangels are not real creatures, but creatures condensed from the pure and incomparable 
power of light in the Gate of Light. They have no thoughts, only their own fighting consciousness.

At this moment, after Ye Feng took back the Gate of Light, he immediately reached out and grabbed 
all the dozen Necromantic Crystals on the ground into his hands.

At this time, Ye Feng looked at the fist-sized necromancy crystals in front of him, and his eyes were 
naturally filled with deep joy and excitement.

Because Ye Feng knew very well that the undead crystals dropped from such extremely advanced 
overlord undead were many times more powerful than the small undead crystals he had swallowed 
before.



At this time, Ye Feng was about to devour it, but suddenly at this moment, the undead monarch on 
the golden altar suddenly moved.

I saw the tall giant skeleton body of the Undead Lord lying on the golden altar. At this moment, his 
fingers moved slightly.

I clearly feel this change,

The undead bone dragon immediately roared and said: "Lord Ye Feng, destroy the body of this 
undead monarch quickly. Otherwise, when he wakes up completely, we will not be able to defeat 
him at all. Even if we put them all together, we will not be able to resist the undead." The power of 
a monarch.”

In fact, there is no need for the undead bone dragon. The moment Ye Feng discovered that the 
undead monarch moved his fingers, a terrifying death force appeared in the entire world, as if the 
entire heaven and earth were about to be filled. Breathing of death.

This is enough to show how terrifying this undead monarch is. A slight movement of his fingers 
actually caused such a change in the death energy of heaven and earth.

At this moment, Ye Feng had almost no hesitation and immediately asked Emperor Chu, including 
himself, to display Heaven's Gate again and attack the undead monarch crazily.

But at this moment, the undead monarch suddenly stretched out a finger.

The moment this finger was stretched out, countless death auras around it boiled instantly, and a 
huge and dark finger of death condensed directly high in the sky, with a majestic height of more 
than 100,000 meters.

The huge finger of death immediately attacked Ye Feng, Emperor Chu, and the Undead Bone 
Dragon.

boom! !

When the two collided, there was a huge roar.



The next moment, what made Ye Feng's face become very ugly was that the death finger condensed 
from one small finger of the undead monarch actually blocked the attacks of Emperor Chu, 
including his own Heaven's Gate and the undead bone dragon.

"Um?"

At this moment, even Emperor Chu suddenly showed a look of surprise in his eyes, as if he did not 
expect that this undead monarch had just awakened and had such terrifying power.

The undead bone dragon looked horrified and said, "Master Ye Feng, let's run!"

Chapter 4917 Metamorphosis

"Why run?"

Ye Feng yelled at this time and said: "Tiantian knows how to run! Come back! Attack this undead 
monarch who is about to wake up with all your strength. You must destroy it before he wakes up 
completely."

At this time, there was a crazy look in Ye Feng's eyes, and he actually opened his mouth and 
swallowed all the undead crystals that fell from the dozens of undead overlords just now.

Boom!

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately felt a terrifying force of death, exploding in his body, wildly 
increasing his power. ??

Ye Feng's cultivation aura immediately surged at a terrifying speed.

boom!

The second level of Heavenly Dao Realm!

boom!



The third level of heaven!

boom!

The fourth level of Heavenly Realm!

boom!

The fifth level of Heavenly Realm!

boom!

Heavenly Dao Realm Sixth Heaven!

boom!

The seventh level of Heavenly Dao Realm!

boom!

Heavenly Dao Realm Eighth Heaven!

boom!

The ninth level of Heavenly Dao Realm!

boom!

Perfection in the Tenth Level of Heavenly Dao Realm! !



At this time, Ye Feng's cultivation level can be said to be a crazy breakthrough. He suddenly 
jumped from the first level of the Heavenly Dao Realm to the tenth level of the Heavenly Dao 
Realm, Great Perfection!

Directly achieving the leap of almost an entire realm!

At this time, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly revealed a look of deep surprise.

Sure enough, these dozen undead souls are worthy of being the overlord undead souls that were 
born and existed in ancient times. The undead power contained in the undead crystals contained in 
them can be said to be extremely terrifying and majestic, making Ye The wind swallowed up a 
dozen undead souls of the overlord undead in one go.

After the spar, his cultivation level increased so much.

"This...is too exaggerated."

At this time, even the undead bone dragon beside him was stunned. It seemed that he did not expect 
that Ye Feng's cultivation level had broken through so much all at once. This was really incredible.

At this time, Ye Feng laughed loudly, and then instantly activated his extremely powerful immortal 
constitution. In an instant, Ye Feng immediately transformed into a majestic golden giant with a 
height of several thousand meters, and moved towards the gold crazily. He rushed in the direction of 
the altar, rushed directly in front of the undead monarch, and punched him hard.

Boom!

Ye Feng's golden fist struck the undead monarch, like a heavy ancient golden mountain suppressing 
it. It hit the huge skeleton body of the undead monarch in front of him, making a huge roar.

But the next moment, what surprised Ye Feng was that the bones on the undead monarch's body did 
not have any premature death or shattering, but did not leave a trace.

This made Ye Feng feel more and more horrified by the physical strength of the undead monarch.



This undead monarch is worthy of being a big figure in the undead space on the 94th floor of the 
Hundred Demons Holy Tower, which was once unified back then. He is indeed very powerful.

However, at this time, the undead monarch has not yet fully awakened and can only use the power 
of one finger.

At this moment, Emperor Chu, the eighteen-winged archangel in the Gate of Light, and the undead 
bone dragon restrained the power of the undead monarch's finger, while Ye Feng transformed into a 
golden giant and punched crazily to the right. He punched the undead monarch's body and attacked 
it.

Ye Feng's eyes were full of madness at this moment, and he said loudly: "I don't believe it anymore. 
My extremely powerful immortal body of the gods and the powerful cultivation skills I just broke 
through can't save you, who is dying."

The undead monarch was killed. "

Boom!

Boom!

At this time, Ye Feng struck hard with punch after punch, and even used the Sword of the Gods to 
slash the undead monarch crazily.

Under this terrifying attack, cracks slowly appeared in the bones of the Undead Monarch, just like 
porcelain being broken.

Click!

Wow!

Finally, at the end, Ye Feng's fist severely shattered the entire undead monarch's skeleton into 
pieces.

At this time, the undead monarch immediately let out an earth-shattering scream. ??



Uh-huh!

Then, a ball of soul fire flew out of the undead monarch's skull, and instantly rushed into Ye Feng's 
mind.

"not good!"

Seeing this scene, Emperor Chu immediately rushed into Ye Feng's head.

At this moment, the soul fire of the undead monarch in Ye Feng's mind turned into a huge monarch, 
trying to attack Ye Feng's soul crazily.

But the crimson giant of light that Emperor Chu transformed into was also very powerful and 
directly confronted the undead monarch.

When the two collide, after all, Emperor Chu is more powerful. After all, Emperor Chu comes from 
a higher-dimensional world of practice. He is an extremely mysterious guy. It can be said that he 
has almost no rivals at the soul level.

The soul fire of this undead monarch is already very powerful if he can compete with Emperor Chu 
for a few moves.

Finally, Emperor Chu put out the soul fire of this undead monarch.

Ye Feng immediately got a lot of soul fragments, and he could immediately feel that his soul power 
had grown tremendously.

Ye Feng's soul power was previously at 7,500

Level 10,000, but now Ye Feng has discovered that his soul power has soared to level 85 million.

After absorbing the soul fire of this undead monarch and turning it into soul fragments, Ye Feng's 
soul power suddenly increased by a full ten million levels!



At this time, Ye Feng could feel that his soul power had been incomparably enhanced, and his 
perception had become many times stronger than before.

At this moment, Ye Feng didn't hesitate at all. He immediately reached out and grabbed the undead 
crystal from the undead monarch's body.

At this moment, Ye Feng could sense that the death energy of the undead crystals bred in the undead 
monarch was much more powerful than the dozen undead overlords.

At this time, Ye Feng's face immediately showed a look of deep joy, and he swallowed it on the 
spot.

After all, Ye Feng didn't want to put the training resources in a storage ring, otherwise they might 
not be used later or might be forgotten.

So every time Ye Feng gets training resources, basically as long as there are no other dangerous 
situations, he will directly refine them on the spot and transform them into his own power, which is 
faster and more efficient.

At this time, after Ye Feng swallowed the undead monarch's undead crystal, he could immediately 
feel a death force that was more terrifying than the undead overlord, exploding in his body, and 
crazily increasing his power. .

Ye Feng had just broken through the cultivation bottleneck of the tenth level of the Heavenly Dao 
Realm. At this time, with the help of the terrifying energy in the core of the Undead Lord, he 
suddenly broke through and directly broke through to the half-step transformation above the 
Heavenly Dao Realm. territory!

Mortal transformation, this is a new and powerful level of cultivation, which means that the 
cultivator begins to transform from a mortal state to a greater level!

Let the body of the cultivator slowly begin to produce majestic power that can move mountains and 
fill seas. It is not the power of mortals, but the power of gods!

Chapter 4918 Sword of the Dead



At this time, Ye Feng clenched his fists and could feel the power surging like the ocean, boiling and 
roaring in his entire limbs.

Ye Feng felt that every blood vessel and every inch of his flesh contained explosive power.

Ye Feng knew that this was a change caused by his breakthrough and entering a new level.

Since the cultivator entered the realm of transformation, even if Ye Feng is only half-step into the 
realm of transformation, it is enough for Ye Feng to start from an ordinary human being, from a 
mortal, from a mortal creature, towards a greater level. Metamorphosis, gradually losing one's 
mortal body, mortal spirit and soul.

In short, after cultivators enter the realm of transformation, they will become stronger and stronger 
in the future, and will gain power far beyond that of ordinary creatures.

At this time, Ye Feng couldn't help but said happily: "This undead monarch is indeed a powerful 
undead at the monarch level who unified the undead space on the 94th floor of the Hundred 
Demons Holy Tower. As expected, the power is very terrifying. The necromantic crystal that was 
bred actually contains such majestic energy, allowing me to achieve so many breakthroughs in my 
cultivation."

At this moment, Ye Feng was talking, with a hint of anticipation in his eyes, and said loudly: "Now 
that all dangers have been resolved, we have killed the Overlord Undead, and we have also killed 
the Undead Monarch. Now I can finally find the inheritance and wealth left by the undead monarch 
with peace of mind."

Buzz!

At this time, Ye Feng immediately exuded his huge soul power and moved towards the surrounding 
area, trying to find the specific place where the wealth and inheritance left by the undead monarch 
were located.

At this time, Ye Feng searched for a while and found nothing special.

The undead bone dragon beside him stared at the golden altar in the middle and said loudly: 
"Master Ye Feng, the wealth and inheritance of the undead monarch may be contained in this 
golden altar."



Ye Feng nodded and said aloud: "How to turn on

This altar of the dead? If it is destroyed directly, will it damage the wealth stored in the golden 
altar? "

Ye Feng knew very well that the inheritance and wealth left by a big man like the Undead Monarch 
must be very precious. If he rashly destroyed this golden altar, he would probably destroy all the 
wealth and inheritance contained in it. If it falls, it will be a big loss.

After all, this time Ye Feng did not rush to break through, but stayed in the ninety-fourth floor of the 
Hundred Demons Holy Tower for such a long time, not just to get the precious wealth left by the 
undead monarch.

The Undead Bone Dragon was a little eager to try at this time and said: "Lord Ye Feng, let me try to 
see if I can activate this golden altar."

After saying that, the Undead Bone Dragon walked directly in front of the golden altar, then 
stretched out a steel dragon claw and touched it.

Buzz!

At this moment, the golden altar seemed to sense the power of the undead creature, and it instantly 
erupted with a terrifying suction force, directly absorbing the endless flow of undead energy from 
the undead bone dragon.

At this moment, due to the strong suction force, the Undead Bone Dragon was almost drained dry.

This made the Undead Bone Dragon immediately scream in horror and said: "Master Ye Feng, 
come and help me! I feel that all the undead energy in my body has been drained by this golden 
altar. If this continues, don’t mention me opening this golden altar, I’m afraid I will be drained by 
this golden altar and die instantly.”

"Um?"



When Ye Feng saw this scene, his eyes showed a look of surprise, as if he did not expect such a 
change to happen.

At this time, Ye Feng had no other choice but to walk in front of the undead bone dragon, then 
stretched out a hand and pressed it on the undead bone dragon.

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately burst out his own power and injected it into the body of the 
undead bone dragon.

"boom!!"

At this moment, the Undead Bone Dragon immediately felt a majestic energy like a vast ocean 
being injected into his body.

The Sword God of the Undead Bone Dragon was filled with deep astonishment at this time. At this 
time, he finally understood how powerful Ye Feng had become after breaking through a whole 
realm, and how powerful his skills were.

The Undead Bone Dragon originally thought that even if Ye Feng broke through a whole realm, he 
might not be able to defeat him if he didn't use the Gate of Heaven.

But now, the Undead Bone Dragon feels that even if Ye Feng doesn't use Heaven's Gate, he can 
definitely kill the Undead Bone Dragon instantly.

Because the Undead Bone Dragon can feel that Ye Feng gained too much energy this time, which 
increased Ye Feng's skill reserve hundreds of times!

Although it seems that Ye Feng's cultivation level is not as high as expected, his skill reserve is 
definitely far beyond his current level of cultivation level.

In other words, Ye Feng's reserve of skill may be hundreds of times that of ordinary practitioners at 
the same level as Ye Feng.

At this moment, when the Undead Bone Dragon was marveling at the huge reserve of Ye Feng's 
power, the power input by Ye Feng was transformed by the Undead Bone Dragon and injected into 
the golden altar.



The golden altar absorbed enough necromantic energy and finally stopped absorbing it.

At this moment, mechanical cracks appeared on the surface of the altar of the undead, and then with 
a "click-click" sound, a mechanism channel was opened directly.

There seems to be an underground space in this passage.

"Sure enough, there is a mysterious space!"

When Ye Feng saw this scene, his eyes suddenly lit up, and he immediately jumped into the 
underground space in the golden altar with the undead bone dragon.

The moment they jumped into the underground space, they were stunned by what they saw.

I saw that this underground space was very huge, as if an empty underground cave had been dug out 
under the ground.

In this underground space, treasures emitting golden light are stored.

These are all powerful magic weapons created by the undead monarch back then. Among them, the 
one with the strongest energy fluctuations, which can be called the king of weapons, is a white bone 
sword covered with a golden network.

The surface of this white bone sword seemed to be imprinted with dense golden veins.

Moreover, on the sword body of this white bone sword, there are dead eyes that make people feel 
very strange.

The moment Ye Feng entered the underground space, other magic weapons did not attract Ye Feng's 
attention at all, because they were nothing in Ye Feng's eyes.

But this bone-white sword, whose surface was covered with dense golden networks and dead eyes, 
instantly attracted Ye Feng's attention.



The undead bone dragon was also attracted in an instant, and said in horror: "Master Ye Feng, could 
this be the legendary undead monarch who came from the deepest part of the underworld? It is said 
to come from a higher dimension of the undead world. , the undead sword you got, right? This is the 
mysterious undead clan's holy weapon! In ancient legends, it is said that every time this undead 
sword appears, it will cause mountains of corpses and seas of blood. It’s a taboo thing that can cause 
endless death disasters! I didn’t expect it to appear in the legacy of the Undead Lord! It’s a double-
edged sword, it’s extremely powerful, but it will bring endless disasters!”

Chapter 4919 Model

At this time, hearing the Undead Bone Dragon say this, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly revealed a look of 
surprise.

Unexpectedly, this weird-looking white bone sword turned out to be the legendary Sword of the 
Dead.

This undead sword was not made by the undead monarch, because the undead monarch is not yet 
qualified to create such a powerful treasure.

Legend has it that this undead sword comes from a higher spiritual dimension of the undead world, 
and it is very likely that it comes from the legendary undead interface.

At this time, although there was a hint of fear in Ye Feng's eyes, he was more looking forward to the 
powerful magic weapon of coloring.

Although it is a double-edged sword, it is likely to bring disaster to the surroundings, but if he can 
completely control this undead sword, then Ye Feng will greatly improve his overall strength. .

After all, you must know that Ye Feng's current cultivation strength is already very powerful. If he 
can still have a Necronomicon Sword to exert its power, then Ye Feng's official combat 
effectiveness will instantly increase to a higher level.

Because an extremely powerful magic weapon, if used properly, can definitely greatly enhance 
one's combat effectiveness.

At this moment, seeing Ye Feng walking quickly towards the Sword of Death, the Undead Bone 
Dragon beside him couldn't help but look with a trace of worry in his eyes, and couldn't help but 
say: " Lord Ye Feng, you must be careful. Although this Sword of the Dead is not controlled by 



anyone now, the Sword of the Dead itself also has a very terrifying destructive power, and the 
extremely high-level power comes from a higher level. The power of the undead in the cultivation 
dimension, even if I have evolved to the overlord undead level, is still unbearable. I don’t know if 
you can bear it, Lord Ye Feng.” .??.??

Ye Feng grinned at this time and said aloud: "Many things are full of uncertainties. It is impossible 
to predict the dangers or opportunities in advance, but you have to give it a try."

After finishing speaking, Ye Feng walked up to this undead sword.

Buzz!

At this moment, Ye Feng could feel that this undead spirit

The sword does exude a very strange and advanced necromantic aura, which is different from the 
necromantic space aura in the Holy Tower of Hundred Demons.

The aura of death in the ninety-fourth level of the necromantic space of the Hundred Demons Holy 
Tower is very low-level, but the necromantic aura emitted from this sword of necromancy can be 
said to be extremely advanced, and it is worthy of being said. A magic weapon from a higher 
spiritual dimension, just like your own god ring.

Uh-huh!

At this time, Ye Feng did not hesitate. He took a deep breath, then stretched out his hand and 
grasped the undead sword in front of him.

Boom! !

Almost at the moment when Ye Feng held the Sword of the Dead, a terrifying death energy 
suddenly burst out from every dead eyeball on the Sword of the Dead, heading towards Ye Feng's. 
The whole person was enveloped in madness.

At this moment, Ye Feng's whole person was immediately enveloped by a very terrifying and 
advanced death force.



When the Undead Bone Dragon saw this scene, he immediately couldn't help but said in horror: 
"Master Ye Feng, throw away this Undead Sword in your hand, otherwise you will be killed 
instantly."

At this time, Ye Feng shouted loudly: "God Immortal Body, resist this death aura for me!"

Boom!

At this moment, Ye Feng's body immediately erupted with brilliant golden light.

These golden lights represent the original power of the immortal body of the gods.

If Ye Feng were a completely low-level spiritual being, no matter how strong his cultivation level 
was, he would probably be killed by this undead sword in an instant and drain all the life essence 
from his body. After all, he was in a higher dimension. The treasure is equivalent to a 
dimensionality reduction attack.

But Ye Feng has now merged with a completed immortal bone of the gods, and his own

The body constitution is also evolving in the direction of the Celestial Clan in a higher spiritual 
dimension, so Ye Feng actually resisted the erosion of the death power of the Sword of the Dead 
from a higher spiritual dimension.

boom! !

At this moment, Ye Feng's whole body erupted with blood energy as big as the ocean. Coupled with 
the unique golden power of the Celestial Clan, he actually suppressed the death power of the Sword 
of the Dead in his hand.

"Hahaha! It's nothing more than that!"

At this time, Ye Feng immediately burst into laughter, stared at the big bone sword in front of him, 
and said loudly: "Sword of the Dead, if you are more honest, you will be loyal to me quietly, 
otherwise, Even if I try my best, I will wipe out all your spirituality!"



Hearing Ye Feng's words, the Sword of the Dead, which had been struggling fiercely, finally 
became completely quiet.

At this time, the death aura on the Sword of the Dead also disappeared instantly.

But at this time, Ye Feng held the Sword of the Dead in his hand and immediately waved it forward.

Boom!

When Ye Feng waved the Sword of the Dead in his hand, the Sword of the Dead seemed to really 
become Ye Feng's weapon. It suddenly changed from a calm state to agitated. Every dead eyeball on 
the sword body All of them erupted with extremely terrifying high-level death energy, forming a 
death sword light tens of thousands of meters long, which instantly shattered a large area of land in 
front of them.

Seeing this scene, the Undead Bone Dragon was very excited and said: "Master Ye Feng, you are 
really amazing! In just a few seconds, you completely destroyed this legendary sword of disaster. 
He is under control, and the power caused by Master Ye Feng's use of the Sword of the Dead is 
really terrifying. "

At this moment, it can be said that the Undead Bone Dragon is completely convinced by Ye Feng. 
He regards Ye Feng as a role model, and his eyes are full of awe.

because

Everything he did for Ye Feng really overturned the undead bone dragon's perception.

At this time, Ye Feng was very satisfied with carrying this undead sword behind his back.

Then Ye Feng continued to look around and said: "Continue to look for the wealth left by the 
undead monarch."



At this time, Ye Feng and the Undead Bone Dragon continued to walk towards the deep area of the 
underground space. Along the way, they did find a lot of piles of undead crystals, and many of them 
were completely made from the high-level bones of the undead. Various magic weapons and so on.

However, Ye Feng has never seen the inheritance left by the undead monarch.

What Ye Feng actually wants most is the top inheritance left by the Undead Monarch. If he 
practices it himself, he will definitely be able to exert powerful power.

However, after Ye Feng swallowed and absorbed the Necromantic Crystals obtained along the way, 
he also achieved a huge breakthrough, which directly allowed Ye Feng to break through from the 
half-step transformation state to the real first level of transformation.

In fact, if you want to break through from the half-step mortal realm to the real first level of mortal 
realm, it is equivalent to crossing a big realm bottleneck, which is very difficult.

Especially for Ye Feng's body, which is like a bottomless pit, it is even more difficult, as difficult as 
climbing to the sky.

But in the underground space, there are too many undead crystals that the undead monarch left for 
himself.

The undead monarch probably thought that after resurrecting after many years, he could use these 
huge undead crystals to train his men, form an undead army, and rebuild his undead kingdom. 
Unfortunately, he made a wedding dress for Ye Feng. That's why Ye Feng was able to accumulate 
enough power and break through to the true first level of mortal transformation.

At this time, the Undead Bone Dragon said aloud: "Lord Ye Feng, we are about to reach the deepest 
part of the underground space under this golden altar. If the inheritance of the Undead Lord is stored 
here, then it must be In the deepest place ahead, let’s search quickly.”

Chapter 4920 Golden Skeleton Palm

Hearing what the Undead Bone Dragon said, Ye Feng naturally nodded, and then immediately 
followed the Undead Bone Dragon and walked quickly towards the deepest part of the underground 
space.

When they came to the end of this underground space, they immediately saw a huge treasure box 
made of gold, placed on the deepest ground.



The surface of this treasure chest is also inlaid with many gems, all of which are gems of different 
colors, including rubies, sapphires, black gems, etc., exuding a bright gemstone light.

At this moment, the Undead Bone Dragon seemed to be under a spell, with deep fanaticism in its 
eyes. It ignored Ye Feng's orders and rushed towards the huge treasure box.

"Um?"

Seeing this scene, Ye Feng immediately showed a hint of sullenness in his eyes. It seemed that he 
did not expect that this undead bone dragon would be so bold now. He rushed towards the treasure 
chest without any orders of his own. .

"Um?"

But the next moment, Ye Feng seemed to have discovered something. His eyes suddenly changed 
slightly and he said loudly: "No! This undead bone dragon did not rush over on his own initiative. 
He was hit by a stone on this huge treasure box. I was confused by the different colored gems.”

Because at this moment, Ye Feng looked at the gems on the surface of this huge treasure box, and 
felt a trance for a moment. It seemed that the huge treasure box had a fatal temptation, and he 
wanted to get close to it quickly.

But Ye Feng's soul power was strong and he resisted this temptation in an instant.

But the Undead Bone Dragon was not as powerful as Ye Feng. He was instantly fascinated and 
rushed towards the huge treasure chest involuntarily.

Ye Feng immediately understood. It wasn't that the Undead Bone Dragon didn't obey his orders and 
was so bold, but because the Undead Bone Dragon was now completely confused.

At this moment, after Ye Feng knew all this, his expression immediately changed. Looking at the 
undead bone dragon rushing forward, he couldn't help but said: "Wake up quickly! You

Bewitched! This huge treasure chest must be in danger! "



At this moment, Ye Feng immediately shouted loudly and wanted to reach out and grab the back of 
the undead bone dragon as it rushed out.

But it was already too late.

At this time, the Undead Bone Dragon had arrived in front of the huge treasure chest and was about 
to open it.

But the treasure chest made a "click" sound, and the lid opened by itself.

A skeletal hand that looked like it was made of gold stretched out instantly from inside.

This golden skull palm looks very strange, very ancient, and has very terrifying power.

The moment this golden skeleton palm stretched out, it crushed the entire body of the undead bone 
dragon, the extremely powerful undead overlord.

Even the fire of the soul could not escape the obliteration of this golden skeleton palm.

At this moment, Ye Feng saw this scene, and his eyes suddenly showed shock and anger.

It seemed that he did not expect that the Undead Bone Dragon would die unexpectedly at the last 
moment.

This made Ye Feng's eyes suddenly show a cold look as he stared at the golden skeleton palm.

However, Ye Feng was also a little scared. If the Undead Bone Dragon hadn't blocked this disaster 
for him, he would probably have died.

Because at that moment, the power of that golden skeleton palm was so terrifying that even Ye Feng 
might not be able to resist it for a moment, and his entire body would be crushed and he would be 
killed instantly.



At this time, Ye Feng was on guard, and immediately retreated quickly, and then without any 
hesitation, he released the Gate of Heaven above his head.

Now Ye Feng's skill has been greatly improved compared to before, so this

At one time, Ye Feng could condense ten eighteen-winged archangels from the Gate of Heaven.

Each of the eighteen-winged archangels is thousands of meters tall.

A total of ten huge eighteen-winged archangels were condensed and summoned from the Gate of 
Heaven at this moment, surrounding Ye Feng, making Ye Feng look like a real heavenly being. Like 
the Lord.

At this moment, Ye Feng stared at the huge treasure box with vigilance in his eyes, and then 
commanded: "No matter what, just give me a direct crazy attack from the huge treasure box." The 
golden skull palm comes out.”

Hearing Ye Feng's words, all ten eighteen-winged archangels nodded instantly, and then they all 
held the light scepter in their hands and blasted away at the golden skeleton palm born from the 
huge treasure box in front of them.

Boom! !

At this moment, the terrifying attack of the power of light was all poured into the palm of this 
golden skeleton.

But what horrified Ye Feng was that even if he used all his strength and the attacks of ten eighteen-
winged archangels condensed from the Gate of Heaven, there was no harm to this golden skeleton 
palm. .

The moment it hit the golden skeleton palm, not even a trace was left on the golden skeleton palm, 
and it could not be destroyed at all. Naturally, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly revealed a look of surprise.

Ye Feng knew very well that a combined attack of ten eighteen-winged archangels was enough to 
wipe out powerful beings two or three realms higher than his current level. There was nothing in the 
world that could stop the ten eighteen-winged archangels. Archangel's crazy attack.



But this golden skeleton palm stretched out from the huge treasure chest is so strong and terrifying.

At this moment, Ye Feng even had

There was a hint of retreat, because this mysterious extended golden skull palm must be an 
extremely terrifying thing. It is difficult to imagine how terrifying the owner of this golden skull 
palm is. Wake up, maybe you can leave here first.

But the moment Ye Feng had this idea, Emperor Chu in his mind suddenly said: "Ye Feng, don't 
leave in a hurry. This golden skull palm should not be a complete individual, it is just a palm. The 
undead bone dragon was instantly wiped out just now. It should be the automatic behavior of this 
golden skeleton palm. In other words, this golden skeleton palm is a protective mechanism of this 
huge treasure box. This golden skeleton palm is not some kind of powerful body. part of a separate 
entity."

Hearing what Emperor Chu said in his mind, Ye Feng's eyes revealed a look of astonishment.

Then Ye Feng looked forward and found that the golden skull palm really didn't seem to fight back. 
It just quietly stretched out the gap in the huge treasure box and stopped there.

As long as no one gets close to the huge treasure box, this golden skull palm really doesn't seem to 
attack anyone.

Ye Feng couldn't help but said in surprise: "Emperor Chu, have you ever encountered this golden 
skull palm before? This golden skull palm is not the palm of a terrifying creature, but a specially 
built mechanism. The single palm used here is equivalent to some kind of protective magic 
weapon? "

Emperor Chu in his mind first nodded, then shook his head, and said aloud: "I can't remember 
clearly, but there seems to be a record of this in my memory fragments. This golden skull palm 
should have been The palm of some very mysterious and powerful existence was cut off and refined 
into a very terrifying forbidden weapon. In any case, Ye Feng, you can find a way to get this golden 
skull palm and see if you can fuse it with it. In the palm of your hand, it will become a powerful 
attack weapon with monstrous power."
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