
Ancient 4971

Chapter 4971: Promote it

At this time, the moment this poisonous hedgehog appeared, the power it caused was very 
terrifying.

Because this poisonous hedgehog is tens of thousands of meters tall and majestic, standing there 
like a mountain covered with spikes, and it also exudes a poisonous aura.

The surrounding flowers, plants and trees withered in an instant when exposed to the poisonous 
smell.

So at this time, the pressure caused by this poisonous hedgehog was still very strong, and people 
suddenly felt a terrible sense of depression in their hearts.

At this moment, even though he knew that Ye Feng now had special means to deal with such 
poisonous monsters, Su Qingmo still had a trace of nervousness on his face when facing this 
terrifying and huge poisonous hedgehog. color.

After all, Su Qingmo knew very well that if the two of them couldn't work together to kill this 
poisonous hedgehog, then they would definitely die.

After all, such a close distance, there is no way to escape. .??.

At this time, Ye Feng suddenly said: "Miss Su, just assist me remotely. You can't get close, 
otherwise you will definitely be enveloped by the poisonous air and die instantly."

Ye Feng also sensed it instantly at this time. This poisonous hedgehog was more terrifying than 
imagined, and the poisonous aura on his body was very terrifying.

When Su Qingmo heard what Ye Feng said, he immediately nodded, then stared at Ye Feng very 
solemnly, and said loudly: "Ye Feng, you must be careful, after all, it is the most dangerous for you 
to get close to this poisonous hedgehog. ”

Ye Feng nodded, smiled and said, "Don't worry, it'll be no problem."



After saying that, Ye Feng didn't want to waste time. He suddenly stepped on the ground, and his 
whole figure rushed to the sky in an instant, charging directly towards the poisonous hedgehog.

At this moment, Ye Feng didn't hesitate at all and directly used the martial arts he had just practiced.

The peerless inheritance of the Five Poison Sect, the extremely poisonous field.

boom! !

At this moment, Ye Feng's body immediately burst out with a very majestic poisonous energy, 
directly condensing an extremely poisonous field on Ye Feng's body and surroundings, and on the 
poisonous hedgehog. The poisonous aura emanating from it was actually faintly able to compete 
with it.

Seeing this scene, this poisonous hedgehog seemed to have a look of surprise in his eyes.

Obviously, this poisonous hedgehog still has his own consciousness. He knows that Ye Feng is 
definitely different from what he looks like. He is definitely not just a human boy.

However, the poisonous hedgehog had already chased Su Qingmo. Even with Ye Feng's help, it was 
impossible for the poisonous hedgehog to retreat so suddenly.

So at this moment, the poisonous hedgehog immediately let out a very loud roar, and then 
immediately charged towards Ye Feng.

You know, the entire body of this poisonous hedgehog is nearly tens of thousands of meters long.

So at this moment, the poisonous hedgehog was like a mountain, pressing towards Ye Feng, and it 
was also carrying a terrifying poisonous aura.

Ye Feng did not hesitate at this moment and directly inspired the power of the immortal body of the 
god.



I saw that Ye Feng's whole body immediately transformed from an ordinary boy, covered in golden 
light, to a young golden war god, and he was instantly collided with this poisonous hedgehog.

Boom!

At this moment, Ye Feng waved his fist fiercely.

golden fist,

Suddenly it became as big as a mountain and struck hard on the poisonous hedgehog.

Boom!

At this moment, Ye Feng's golden fist struck the sharp thorns of the poisonous hedgehog, without 
piercing Ye Feng's fist at all.

Instead, Ye Feng's golden fist burst out with tremendous power, sending the poisonous hedgehog 
flying backwards in an instant.

At this moment, Ye Feng could immediately sense that this poisonous hedgehog was not as 
powerful as he thought.

The power of his immortal body is much stronger than that of this poisonous hedgehog.

The reason why Su Qingmo was being chased by this poisonous hedgehog was mainly because of 
the terrifying poisonous aura in this poisonous hedgehog.

Ye Feng was not afraid of this poisonous energy at all, which naturally greatly reduced the overall 
strength of the poisonous hedgehog. Ye Feng sent the poisonous hedgehog flying backwards in an 
instant.

"Um?"



Seeing this scene, Su Qingmo's beautiful eyes not far away suddenly revealed a look of deep 
surprise, and she couldn't help but said: "Ye Feng, you are really amazing! You are so amazing!" 
The strength of the body is simply comparable to these beasts from ancient times!"

Ye Feng laughed loudly and said aloud: "Except for the poisonous body of this poisonous 
hedgehog, there is nothing else to fear. I actually admire it."

After saying that, Ye Feng didn't need Su Qingmo to take action at all, he just continued to rush 
forward, and struck hard at the poisonous hedgehog with two golden fists.

Boom!

At this moment, the poisonous hedgehog was directly blasted by Ye Feng, and its whole body was 
immediately shattered. In the end, there was no trace of it at all.

Any resistance was directly killed by Ye Feng with two golden fists.

"What a powerful body!"

Seeing Ye Feng's incomparable bravery, Su Qingmo not far away suddenly showed deep surprise in 
his eyes.

She stared at Ye Feng's golden body and felt a little incredible.

At this time, Ye Feng looked at Su Qingmo who was not far away and said, "Give this poisonous 
hedgehog to me. I have an important role."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, Su Qingmo naturally said: "You killed this monster, Ye Feng. Of course 
it belongs to you, Ye Feng."

Ye Feng nodded at this time and directly put the entire majestic body of this poisonous hedgehog 
into the storage ring.

Then Ye Feng didn't hesitate at all, and immediately began to secretly devour the majestic energy of 
the poisonous hedgehog contained in the storage ring.



You know, although this poisonous hedgehog was easily eliminated by Ye Feng, in fact, the 
cultivation level of this poisonous hedgehog was still very terrifying, a whole realm and a half 
higher than that of Ye Feng.

Therefore, the blood energy contained in its body is still very majestic.

Buzz!

After Ye Feng swallowed it, he immediately felt the powerful energy injected into his Dantian, 
causing Ye Feng's skill to continue to increase rapidly.

Boom! !

Finally, at a certain moment, Ye Feng's body suddenly erupted with a terrifying aura of cultivation.

Ye Feng actually broke through on the spot!

Breaking through the current bottleneck of the tenth heavenly perfection of the Lord Lord Realm, 
and stepping into the half-step soul elixir realm above the Lord Lord Realm!

Chapter 4972 Cultivation System

Soul Dan Realm, this is a very powerful realm.

When a practitioner breaks through to the soul elixir realm, he or she will gradually condense a 
huge soul-state inner elixir in his soul.

You must know that it is impossible for ordinary cultivators to cultivate soul power, but after 
entering the soul elixir realm, ordinary cultivators will also allow their soul power to transform and 
become more powerful.

Therefore, only practitioners who have entered the soul elixir realm have more powerful spiritual 
thoughts and can quickly lock on the enemy.

That's why Ye Feng was chased so embarrassingly by the Great Elder of the Inner Sect of the Five 
Poison Sect before, and could not escape the lock of the Great Elder of the Inner Sect of the Five 



Poison Sect. It was because the cultivation of the Great Elder of the Inner Sect of the Five Poison 
Sect had stepped into In the soul elixir realm, one's own soul has undergone a transformation, so it 
possesses the extremely powerful power of divine thoughts.

At this time, after Ye Feng stepped into the half-step soul elixir realm, he could naturally feel the 
transformation of his soul power.

However, this transformation is not so obvious compared to other ordinary cultivators.

Because Ye Feng himself is a soul master.

Therefore, after Ye Feng entered the half-step soul elixir realm, although his soul had undergone 
some transformation, it was actually just a drop in the bucket.

After all, Ye Feng's soul power is already very huge. ??

However, stepping into a new level of power has finally increased Ye Feng's skill reserves many 
times, and enhanced Ye Feng's combat effectiveness a lot.

At this moment, Su Qingmo next to her sensed the transformation of Ye Feng's cultivation aura, and 
immediately couldn't help but reveal a look of deep surprise in her beautiful eyes, and said loudly: 
"What? Ye Feng, you Why did you suddenly break through?”

Ye Feng smiled slightly and said: "I suddenly had an epiphany during the battle, so I broke through 
the bottleneck and entered the half-step soul elixir realm."

This reason has been used by Ye Feng to cover up the breakthrough caused by secretly devouring 
other living beings. It is absolutely

It is the best reason and cannot be used too much.

Sure enough, when Ye Feng said this, Su Qingmo believed it immediately.

After all, there is no other reason to explain Ye Feng's sudden breakthrough in cultivation.



After all, what Ye Feng just swallowed was that he put the monster into his storage ring and 
swallowed it secretly.

So Su Qingmo only knew the surface and didn't know what was going on inside.

So she naturally believed Ye Feng's words.

Ye Feng knew that the reason why he was able to use the Devouring Power openly in the Northern 
Territory was because he was almost invincible in the Northern Territory.

Therefore, even if others knew that he had practiced this rather strange technique, they would not be 
able to do anything to him.

But things are different now.

Now Ye Feng has come to the glorious land of Zhongzhou, which is the most glorious land of ten 
thousand monsters and where there are many powerful people.

Therefore, Ye Feng felt that it would be better for him to hide his devouring ability at the beginning.

Even in front of your friends, don't use it directly.

Otherwise, if he attracts the attention of some super powerful people, he will be in trouble.

Therefore, every time Ye Feng uses his devouring ability, he naturally tries his best to put the 
opponent into the storage ring and secretly devoure him, and then explains it with the reason of 
enlightenment.

In this case, you can perfectly conceal your incredible ability.

As for the epiphany he said, whether the other party believed it or not, Ye Feng didn't care about the 
other party. Anyway, he had already given the reason.

At this moment, Su Qingmo showed



Ran believed it, after all, Su Qingmo had a mysterious origin and had seen many super geniuses 
who were able to achieve enlightenment.

At this moment, Su Qingmo stared at Ye Feng, with an inexplicable look in her beautiful eyes.

Because as she continued to get along with Ye Feng, she realized more and more that Ye Feng was 
definitely not as simple as she imagined.

Su Qingmo even suspected that Ye Feng was not from a sect at all, but came from an extremely 
mysterious and transcendent power, just like Su Qingmo.

Su Qingmo also came from a mysterious super power and came out to practice alone.

She felt that Ye Feng might also exist like this, but Ye Feng was unwilling to reveal his true identity.

Su Qingmo thought so, but actually she really misunderstood Ye Feng.

Ye Feng really didn't hide this.

Ye Feng really has no family or sect now. He came to the land of Zhongzhou from a small place.

But even if Ye Feng knew Su Qingmo's inner thoughts, he didn't bother to explain anything.

Ye Feng just looked in a certain direction not far away and said loudly: "Miss Su, the direction this 
monster is chasing you should be where the cave of Old Man Du is located."

Su Qingmo nodded and said aloud: "Before I had a chance to explore Old Man Wandu's cave, I was 
chased out by this terrifying poisonous hedgehog. Now we can go directly to explore Old Man 
Wandu's cave. ”

Ye Feng nodded when he heard what Su Qingmo said. After all, Su Qingmo had just promised him 
that he would help Su Qingmo deal with this terrifying poisonous hedgehog, and the other party 
would take him to share the poisonous hedgehog. The old man's cave.



Ye Feng had heard before that Old Man Du's cave was the cave of an extremely ancient and 
powerful man. There must be a huge amount of luck hidden in it, and there were many rare 
treasures.

However, Ye Feng and Su Qingmo just met by chance before, so Ye Feng couldn't directly say that 
he also wanted to explore the cave of Wandu Old Man, and Su Qingmo didn't say much.

But now, the two of them have experienced fighting together, and Ye Feng also helped Su Qingmo a 
big favor by getting rid of the poisonous hedgehog that was chasing her.

And Su Qingmo now sees clearly that Ye Feng is very powerful, especially Ye Feng's ability to not 
be afraid of poison at all, which Su Qingmo attaches great importance to.

After all, there must be many poisonous dangers in Old Man Wandu's cave.

Therefore, if you can drag Ye Feng to explore Old Man Du's cave with you, it will be equivalent to 
finding yourself a powerful and professional helper.

Because Ye Feng is not afraid of all kinds of poisons.

At this moment, Su Qingmo naturally hoped that Ye Feng would go with him.

Even if she had to share the good things left by Old Man Du with Ye Feng, Su Qingmo felt it was 
worth it.

After all, with Ye Feng here, her danger will be reduced a lot.

At this moment, Su Qingmo took Ye Feng and flew quickly in the direction of Old Man Du's cave.

Ye Feng was also following Su Qingmo at this time.

Ye Feng felt that the benefits he gained from taking action this time were still very considerable.



After all, the old man Wan Du knew that he was an extremely ancient existence.

Moreover, Ye Feng has now begun to practice the inheritance of poison, such as the poison field 
obtained from the elder of the inner sect of the Five Poison Sect.

Therefore, Ye Feng also became interested in the inheritance of poison.

Perhaps, I can also do more research on the poisonous training system, and it might become another 
big killer for me in the future.

Chapter 4973 North Sea

Ye Feng's two strongest trump cards now, the first one is his extremely powerful physical strength, 
which can crush enemies of the same level, and even crush existences that are several realms 
stronger than himself.

The second strongest trump card is the soul master level.

Ye Feng's attacks at the soul level are still very powerful.

Therefore, Ye Feng has these two extremely powerful trump cards, and they have unique abilities, 
which makes Ye Feng's combat effectiveness very powerful.

Now Ye Feng feels that the poisonous training system is also very good.

After all, Ye Feng had seen before that the strong men of the Five Poison Sect were all very 
powerful, largely because of this poison, which could cause great harm to ordinary practitioners.

That's why Ye Feng felt that maybe he could also study more about the inheritance and power of the 
poisonous cultivation system, and maybe it could become one of his most powerful trump cards.

After all, Ye Feng knew very well that when he next practiced on the Zhongzhou land, the most 
glorious place in the entire world of monsters, the enemies and various situations he encountered 
would be very dangerous.

If I have one more powerful trump card, it will definitely be of great help to me in the future in 
Zhongzhou.



At this time, Ye Feng was following Su Qingmo, thinking silently in his heart.

If you can get the inheritance of this ancient figure in the cave of Old Man of All Poisons, it will be 
a huge opportunity for you.

At this moment, when Ye Feng was thinking in his heart, Su Qingmo, who was leading the way, 
suddenly stopped, then looked at Ye Feng beside him, and said loudly: "Ye Feng, we have arrived at 
Wandu. The old man’s cave.”

Ye Feng looked forward and found a small hillside in the jungle not far away.

It's this seemingly ordinary hillside. Halfway up the hillside, there is the entrance to a cave covered 
by countless trees.

If you don't look carefully, you won't even notice it.

this

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately smiled and said: "Then let's go in directly."

Hearing Ye Feng's casual tone, Su Qingmo's eyes flashed slightly, but he didn't say anything more 
and just nodded.

After all, Su Qingmo didn't really believe in Ye Feng's strength at first, but after seeing Ye Feng's 
previous battle with the poisonous hedgehog that was chasing her, Su Qingmo already regarded Ye 
Feng as a He is an extremely powerful person.

Especially Ye Feng's ability to not be afraid of poison made Su Qingmo feel very incredible.

So when Su Qingmo heard Ye Feng's casual tone, she felt that Ye Feng was not arrogant, but that he 
was really powerful, very strong, and very confident.

So at this time, Su Qingmo nodded, without any hesitation, and quickly led Ye Feng towards the 
cave of the old man Wandu.



Uh-huh! Uh-huh!

Soon, the two flew halfway up the mountainside, and then came to the entrance of the Ten 
Thousand Poison Old Man's Cave.

Ye Feng looked inside and found that the entrance of the cave was pitch black, and he couldn't see 
what kind of things existed in the cave.

However, Ye Feng could immediately feel that as long as he was close to the entrance of the cave, 
he could clearly smell a faint poisonous gas in the surrounding air.

Ye Feng guessed that the closer he went to the depths of this poisonous old man's cave, the stronger 
the toxins in the air would be.

Ye Feng looked at Su Qingmo beside him and couldn't help but said: "Miss Su, I guess the deeper 
the cave is, the richer and stronger the poisonous gas in the air will be. Can you withstand the 
stronger the poisonous gas in the air?" Are the toxins getting stronger?"

Su Qingmo nodded, and suddenly took out a ring that looked like it was made of crystal.

A transparent mask was placed on his face, covering his entire respiratory system.

At this time, Su Qingmo said with a smile: "This is the crystal mask I carry with me to prevent 
various poisonous gases from being breathed into the body. This is a mask made of anti-toxic 
crystals that are special to the North Sea where I live. It can prevent my respiratory system from 
being poisoned by inhaling various toxins. Ye Feng, do you need one?"

Ye Feng's eyes suddenly revealed a look of surprise, then he shook his head and said, "I don't need 
it, you can just wear it yourself."

After saying that, Ye Feng walked quickly towards the depths of the cave.

But at this time, Ye Feng was thinking that Su Qingmo seemed to have let something slip just now, 
saying that the raw material of the crystal mask she was wearing came from the North Sea.



It seems that this Su Qingmo is not a figure in the land of Zhongzhou, but a young man from a 
powerful force in the northern ocean connected to the land of Zhongzhou. ??

Ye Feng thought secretly in his heart, and then walked towards the inside of the cave.

When the two of them walked into the cave, they immediately saw the bodies of many dead 
creatures scattered on the ground around them. They had completely decayed, leaving only 
skeletons scattered on the ground. above.

At this time, the two of them glanced at each other casually and continued walking towards the 
depths of the cave.

When they walked to the middle area of the cave, they immediately saw a huge blood pool on the 
entire ground.

However, the blood in this blood pool has completely dried up, leaving only blood stains on the 
wall of the pool.

There was nothing special about this blood pool, but Ye Feng saw something unusual and 
immediately stretched out his hand to stop Su Qingmo next to him.

Su Qingmo was a little confused and asked: "Ye Feng, did you find out

What happened? "

Ye Feng nodded slightly and said aloud: "If we continue to move forward, we must cross this blood 
pool, but there seems to be energy fluctuations from ancient formations in this blood pool."

"Ancient formation?"

Hearing what Ye Feng said, Su Qingmo's beautiful eyes suddenly showed a look of surprise. Then 
he glanced at the dried blood pool and couldn't help but said: "I didn't see anything. Moreover, the 
water in this blood pool has completely dried up, so the formation should be useless. "



Ye Feng shook his head and said aloud: "I sensed a very obscure fluctuation. It is most likely a trap 
left by the old man Wan Du. Let me give it a try."

Whoosh!

After saying that, Ye Feng just flicked his finger, and a ray of vitality was flicked out by Ye Feng. A 
clone made of light condensed in front of the two of them and walked towards the dried blood pool 
in front.

"boom!!"

When this clone just walked to the blood pool, the blood pool, which was originally extremely 
calm, suddenly burst out with a very strong blood-colored light, and it was also accompanied by 
highly toxic gas, which directly used Ye Feng's vitality to The condensed clone was instantly 
enveloped in the blood pool, and was directly poisoned into a pool of pus.

"What?"

Seeing this scene, Su Qingmo immediately looked shocked and couldn't help but said: "What a 
poisonous formation!"

When he said this, Su Qingmo seemed to realize something, and immediately couldn't help but look 
at Ye Feng beside him. There was a deep brilliance in his beautiful eyes, and said loudly: "Ye Feng, 
you are actually fighting against There is still research on Fa Yiyi? No, it is not just as simple as 
research. You can see through the vicious formation hidden in this blood pool in an instant. So, Ye 
Feng, you are still a formation master? Only a master can do this and see through such a deep 
formation in an instant! Ye Feng, you are really incredible!"

Chapter 4974 This is fate

At this time, Su Qingmo stared at Ye Feng, her beautiful eyes filled with deep brilliance.

Because Su Qingmo came into contact with Ye Feng, and was shocked to the extreme by the 
various methods Ye Feng used.

Each of Ye Feng's different methods was very magical, which made Su Qingmo even have a vague 
feeling of admiration for Ye Feng.



But then Su Qingmo quickly shook his head and dismissed this thought in his heart.

At this moment, Su Qingmo seemed to have thought of something and couldn't help but ask: "Ye 
Feng, since there is such a terrifying formation in this blood pool, how can we pass the formation in 
this blood pool?" No, because this blood pool is blocking our route to the deepest part of the Ten 
Thousand Poison Old Man's Cave."??

Hearing what Su Qingmo said, Ye Feng immediately smiled and said: "Since I can sense this 
formation, then I can take you through this formation safely."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, Su Qingmo once again showed a look of deep surprise in his eyes, and 
couldn't help but said: "Ye Feng, are you really a formation master?"

Ye Feng laughed and said: "I don't have much in-depth research on formations, but I have a natural 
ability. My eyes can see through various formations, and I can master the details of each formation. 
Running trajectory, so I can pass through every formation safely."

"What?"

Su Qingmo was even more shocked when she heard what Ye Feng said. She didn't expect that Ye 
Feng had such an incredible talent. It was simply incredible.

After all, many very magical talents are only possessed by some special races in the world.

But Ye Feng is just an ordinary human being, and he has such a magical talent. Naturally, Su 
Qingmo feels very uncomfortable.

Incredible.

After all, Su Qingmo also had a very mysterious origin and a very special identity, so she had seen 
all kinds of peerless geniuses, but compared with Ye Feng, these peerless geniuses didn't seem to be 
that amazing.

The various methods and talents that Ye Feng, an unknown or even unknown human race boy, 
unintentionally displayed were simply incredible.



At this moment, Su Qingmo became even more curious about Ye Feng's true identity, and couldn't 
help but ask: "Ye Feng, who are you? Can you tell me?"

When Ye Feng heard what Su Qingmo said, he couldn't help but smile helplessly, shook his head 
and said: "Miss Su, I really didn't lie to you, I really am a person with no family, and Coming from 
a small place like the Northern Territory, I came to the land of Zhongzhou just to pursue stronger 
power and stronger inheritance.”

Hearing what Ye Feng said, Su Qingmo obviously didn't believe it, and immediately couldn't help 
but look at Ye Feng with a resentful look, and said loudly: "We are so familiar with each other, so 
forget it if you don't tell me, anyway. I will definitely find out your true identity in the future."

Hearing Su Qingmo's words, Ye Feng was stunned for a moment, then shook his head helplessly 
and said: "I have told the truth, and if you still don't believe me, then I won't There is nothing we 
can do."

After finishing speaking, Ye Feng stared at the formation in the blood pool in front of him and said 
loudly: "Miss Su, we just met not long ago, men and women are not allowed to be intimate, but 
there is nothing we can do now."

After saying that, Ye Feng stretched out his hand and took hold of Su Qingmo's small white hands, 
and then

Then he took the opponent directly and flew quickly towards the formation in the blood pool in 
front.

If Ye Feng wants to safely lead Su Qingmo through this formation, he must pull the other person 
along and follow his own pace, otherwise, he may be hurt by the formation.

At this moment, seeing Ye Feng holding her hand directly, Su Qingmo subconsciously wanted to 
struggle, but seeing Ye Feng's firm eyes, Su Qingmo gave up the struggle and let Ye Feng hold her 
hand. He shuttled through the formation.

At this time, looking at Ye Feng's back in front of him, for some reason, Su Qingmo suddenly felt a 
sense of security beyond being alone.



Su Qingmo has always been a loner. Whether she is practicing in her place of residence or looking 
for various opportunities and fortunes outside, she has always been a loner. This is related to her 
origin. ??

But now, Su Qingmo suddenly felt an inexplicable sense of security and even a warm feeling of 
protection from Ye Feng, a stranger of the opposite sex.

This made Su Qingmo's beautiful and cold face reveal a hint of shyness.

However, Su Qingmo quickly restrained her shyness, and thought to herself, "What are I thinking 
about? It's just the first time that I and Ye Feng met, so it's not that bad yet."

But the more Su Qingmo thought about it, the more she felt inexplicably towards Ye Feng.

"We made it through safely."

And just when Su Qingmo was thinking secretly, even feeling a little like a deer bumping into each 
other, Ye Feng's voice suddenly sounded.

At this time, Ye Feng had already led Su Qingmo through the dangerous formation in the blood pool 
and safely arrived at the other side of the blood pool.

side.

At this time, Su Qingmo's eyes suddenly showed deep surprise. She stared at Ye Feng and couldn't 
help but said: "Ye Feng, you are really amazing. Fortunately, I met you this time. Otherwise, I 
would probably have died if I had explored this old man’s cave alone.”

Hearing what Su Qingmo said, Ye Feng grinned and said, "This is fate."

Hearing Ye Feng's words, Su Qingmo seemed to have thought of something. He couldn't help but 
take out a token made of blue crystal from his storage ring and handed it to Ye Feng. He said loudly: 
"Ye Feng, since you said that we are so destined, you can take this token and we can communicate 
with each other through this token in the future."



Hearing what Su Qingmo said, Ye Feng's eyes showed a look of surprise. It seemed that he did not 
expect that this mysterious and beautiful girl would take the initiative to give him her contact 
information.

Ye Feng smiled slightly and without thinking too much, he put the blue crystal token into the 
storage ring and said, "Okay, if we have time in the future, we will keep in touch."

Ye Feng also knew that this Su Qingmo not only looked so beautiful, but also had extraordinary 
status and strength.

Now that Ye Feng has chosen to come to Zhongzhou to hang out, it is naturally beneficial to have so 
many friends with extraordinary status. These are connections.

While Ye Feng was thinking secretly in his heart, Su Qingmo looked in the direction not far away, 
couldn't help but show a look of surprise in his eyes, and said loudly: "Ye Feng, look, we are After 
passing through the dangerous blood pool formation, I seemed to have arrived at the deepest area of 
Wandu Old Man's Cave. I saw a huge mahogany coffin not far away, placed in an ancient stone 
chamber. That should be Wandu Old Man's Cave. The old man’s coffin.”

Chapter 4975 The third eye

At this time, Su Qingmo said, not rushing into the stone room she saw.

Because Su Qingmo had just learned the lesson about the formation hidden in the blood pool, now 
she no longer dared to enter a new area rashly.

So she directly told Ye Feng beside her, hoping to let Ye Feng sense in advance whether there was 
any danger in this stone room.

At this moment, Ye Feng nodded and took Su Qingmo, walking quickly towards the deepest stone 
chamber not far away.

When Ye Feng came to the door of this stone chamber, he directly emitted his soul power and 
covered it inside.

Buzz!



At this moment, Ye Feng sensed it, then shook his head and said loudly: "I don't feel any danger in 
this stone room. There shouldn't be any problems. We can just go in directly."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, Su Qingmo nodded immediately, breathed a sigh of relief, and followed 
Ye Feng directly into the stone chamber.

For Su Qingmo, she now completely believed in Ye Feng's ability, so when Ye Feng said that there 
was no danger in this stone room, she naturally walked in directly. .??.

The moment the two of them entered this closed stone room, they immediately felt a creepy feeling.

After sensing this feeling, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly became alert, he looked at Su Qingmo beside 
him, and said loudly: "Be careful, although there are no terrible formations in this stone chamber, 
there must be some. There are other traps that we haven’t discovered yet.”

Hearing what Ye Feng said, Su Qingmo immediately nodded very cautiously and moved closer to 
Ye Feng.

Obviously, in Su Qingmo's eyes now, every word Ye Feng said was very important.

After all, when Ye Feng was in the blood pool just now, he showed off his skills, so Su Qingmo 
naturally paid great attention to Ye Feng.

So at this time, since Ye Feng reminded him, Su Qingmo naturally took it seriously.

At this moment, the two of them walked slowly towards the huge mahogany coffin in the middle of 
the stone chamber. They wanted to open the coffin of Old Man Wandu first to see if the wealth left 
by Old Man Wandu was in his coffin. among.

But the moment the two of them were almost close to the mahogany coffin.

boom! !

A terrifying sound suddenly sounded.



Almost at the next moment, what made Ye Feng and Su Qingmo's expressions change was that the 
calm mahogany coffin in front of them suddenly exploded.

A huge zombie covered in black hair immediately jumped out from the broken mahogany coffin.

This huge zombie covered with black hair is more than two meters tall. Its face can no longer be 
seen clearly, because every pore on the entire face is covered with black hair, giving people a very 
ferocious look. and terrible.

Moreover, on the face covered with black hair, there were two fangs made of silver metal, which 
were more than one meter long. It looked like a very scary vampire zombie from the ancient era. .

At this moment, Su Qingmo couldn't help but said in horror: "Oh no, this old man with ten thousand 
poisons has changed!"

Ye Feng also had a look of surprise in his eyes at this time, as if he didn't expect that this old man of 
ten thousand poisons would turn into a corpse in this small cave.

Moreover, the appearance after the corpse transformation is still so ferocious and terrifying. The 
whole body is covered with black hair, and long black hair grows out of every pore on the face. It 
does not feel like a natural corpse transformation. , as if it was specially sacrificed by some 
mysterious existence to become this ferocious look.

After thinking about this, Ye Feng suddenly felt an inexplicable emotion in his heart.

If this old man of ten thousand poisons is here and has simply transformed himself, then it is only a 
minor problem.

But if this old man of ten thousand poisons is really some kind of mysterious existence, who used 
some special method to refine him into such a terrifying and ferocious black-haired zombie over the 
long years, then this matter is not so serious. It's simple, it may involve extremely terrifying 
mysterious power.

At this time, Ye Feng immediately looked at Su Qingmo beside him. Seeing that the other party was 
full of fighting spirit, Ye Feng immediately understood that Su Qingmo was not as profound as he 
thought.



However, Ye Feng is not sure whether his idea is true now. After all, there seems to be no other 
mysterious existence around him.

So at this time, Ye Feng temporarily gave up his thoughts and first dealt with the poisonous old man 
who burst out of the coffin in front of him.

At this moment, when Ye Feng was thinking, Su Qingmo beside him had already taken action.

Buzz!

I saw an extremely bright ocean blue light erupting from Su Qingmo's body. A crystal sword 
appeared in her hand, and she immediately pointed towards Wan, who was covered in black hair 
and turned into a black-haired zombie. The poisonous old man attacked and left.

Bang!

But at the next moment, the crystal sword in Su Qingmo's hand struck the poisonous old man 
zombie. It could not hurt him at all, but made a harsh roar like a metal collision.

Seeing this scene, Su Qingmo suddenly showed a look of surprise in his eyes, and couldn't help but 
said: "My crystal sword is made of the most precious ice crystal under ten thousand meters in the 
North Sea. It's like cutting iron like mud. I didn't expect that even the black hair on the black-haired 
zombie turned into by the poisonous old man could not be cut off. This kind of zombie must be very 
advanced, and I don't know how it was produced."

Hearing what Su Qingmo said, the speaker was unintentional, the listener was intentional, and Ye 
Feng's eyes flashed slightly.

Could it be that this poisonous old man really did not transform into a corpse by himself, but was 
refined into such a special and terrifying zombie by some mysterious existence.

An inexplicable sense of urgency suddenly arose in Ye Feng's heart, and he immediately said aloud: 
"Quickly deal with the black-haired zombie that the poisonous old man turned into, and then hurry 
up and get out of here."



After saying that, Ye Feng instantly activated his Immortal Body of God, and his whole body turned 
into a young God of War. He rushed forward in an instant, his two big golden hands instantly 
expanded to the size of mountains, and he fiercely charged towards The black-haired zombie 
transformed by the old man Wan Du bombarded away.

Boom!

Ye Feng's two big golden hands were majestic and heavy. They were many times more powerful 
than Su Qingmo's crystal sword. They instantly defeated the black-haired zombies that Old Man 
Wan Du had turned into.

At this time, seeing this scene, Su Qingmo immediately said happily: "Let me carry out the killing 
blow!"

After saying that, Su Qingmo closed her eyes instantly, and her eyebrows split open, and a third eye 
appeared.

This third eye is like a sapphire, very beautiful. It bursts out an ice-blue laser beam instantly, tearing 
the void in an instant, with terrifying penetrating power, and suddenly " With a "puff" sound, it 
pierced the heart of the black-haired zombie transformed by Old Man Wandu, and shattered the 
zombie core of the black-haired zombie.

Boom!

At this moment, the black-haired zombie transformed by Old Man Du fell to the ground, completely 
losing its ability to move.

When Ye Feng saw this scene, his eyes suddenly looked at Su Qingmo not far away in surprise.

As expected, this girl has an extraordinary origin, a mysterious identity, and possesses such a lethal 
means.

Ye Feng felt that even his current immortal body of a god might not be able to resist the blue 
crystal-like laser beam that burst out instantly.

Chapter 4976 Bewitching



At this time, Ye Feng suddenly understood that this Su Qingmo, this mysterious girl, must have an 
extraordinary origin and a very noble identity. Otherwise, it would be impossible to derive such a 
powerful third eye.

At this moment, Ye Feng was quite serious about Su Qingmo.

However, I have already received the blue crystal token that the other party gave me. If I really have 
a chance in the future, I can walk around with the other party more. It can be regarded as a very 
powerful connection.

Just as Ye Feng was thinking secretly in his heart, Su Qingmo immediately flew in front of the 
black-haired zombie transformed by the old man who was killed. After confirming that the other 
party was completely dead, Su Qingmo suddenly He breathed a sigh of relief.

At this moment, Su Qingmo's beautiful face seemed to be a little pale.

Obviously, using the terrifying destructive power erupted from the third eye would consume a lot of 
Su Qingmo's skills, causing her to enter a weak state in an instant.

It is estimated that if Ye Feng, a powerful helper, was not there to protect him, Su Qingmo would 
not have rashly used this third eye that was very draining on him.

At this moment, Su Qingmo closed her third eye again, and her forehead turned into a pure white 
forehead again.

At this time, although Su Qingmo's face was a little pale and it was obvious that she had consumed 
a lot, she was still very happy, because she killed the zombie turned into by the poisonous old man 
in an instant, and the threat was instantly eliminated.

At this time, Su Qingmo walked directly towards the mahogany coffin not far away, wanting to 
carefully search for the wealth left by Old Man Wandu.

At this time, Ye Feng came to the black-haired zombie transformed by the old man Wandu.



Ye Feng carefully investigated and found that the black-haired zombie transformed by the 
poisonous old man had all the blood and energy drained from his body, turning it into a robot-like 
puppet that knew no pain.

At this time, Ye Feng felt more and more certain about his previous guesses.

This all-poisonous old man doesn't look like a zombie that he evolved into, but rather like he was 
transformed into something.

It was specially refined by the mysterious existence.

Thinking of this, Ye Feng suddenly felt an inexplicable sense of urgency in his heart.

At this moment, Ye Feng wasted no time and immediately took out the zombie core bred from the 
black-haired zombie's body.

This zombie core had just been shattered by Su Qingmo using special means.

But there is no loss to Ye Feng whether it is crushed or not. As long as all the fragments are 
collected, the energy contained in it will still be the same as the zombie core before it was crushed.

At this time, Ye Feng directly put it into the storage ring and swallowed it secretly.

Boom!

At this moment, a very huge zombie energy was immediately injected into Ye Feng's dantian.

You must know that Ye Feng's cultivation level has just broken through to the half-step soul elixir 
realm, so swallowing this zombie core bred by the ten thousand poisonous old man did not allow Ye 
Feng to completely break through the current half-step soul elixir realm. , but it also made Ye Feng's 
skill greatly increase, which can be regarded as a very good accumulation.

If Ye Feng can still get a good amount of energy next time, he will definitely be able to change 
quantitatively and cause qualitative changes, and break through in an instant.



At this time, Ye Feng did not hesitate and walked directly towards Su Qingmo who was not far 
away, wanting to take this girl Su away from here as soon as possible.

Because Ye Feng always feels that there are other dangers here, even dangers that he cannot resist.

And just when Ye Feng walked to Su Qingmo's side, he suddenly saw that Su Qingmo's eyes were 
emitting a strange red light.

At this moment, Su Qingmo was staring at something in the mahogany coffin, as if he was 
confused.

"This is……"

When Ye Feng saw this scene, he immediately

Just by secretly saying "No", he knew that Su Qingmo must have been confused by some very 
mysterious force in his mind and spirit, so his eyes glowed red, as if he was possessed.

Uh-huh!

Ye Feng immediately stretched out his hand, put a finger on Su Qingmo's eyebrows, and shouted: 
"Wake up!"

boom! !

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately burst out his huge soul power.

You must know that Ye Feng's soul power has grown to a full 85 million level before. Even in the 
land of Zhongzhou, he is estimated to be a very powerful soul power.

So at this moment, Ye Feng released a huge amount of soul power and rushed directly into Su 
Qingmo's mind. In an instant, it was like a thunder, exploding in Su Qingmo's head.

Su Qingmo's confused spiritual soul was suddenly pulled back and reawakened.



At this moment, Su Qingmo was immediately frightened and broke into a cold sweat. A trace of fear 
appeared on her beautiful face, and she said, "Ye Feng, what happened to me just now?"

Ye Feng said aloud: "You seem to be confused by some mysterious thing in your spirit and soul. 
Your eyes are emitting red light, which makes people feel very strange, as if they are possessed by a 
demon."

At this time Ye Feng said, the red light in Su Qingmo's eyes had completely disappeared, obviously 
saved by Ye Feng.

Su Qingmo naturally knew that it was Ye Feng who saved him, so he couldn't help but said with 
great gratitude: "Ye Feng, it's really thanks to you this time. Otherwise, I would have died long ago 
without a burial place. I didn’t expect that the map of Old Man Poison’s cave that I accidentally 
obtained would lead me to such a dangerous place, more dangerous than any place I had ever 
experienced alone.”

Hearing what Su Qingmo said, Ye Feng immediately nodded and said: "This old man of ten 
thousand poisons is indeed quite weird. It is very possible that he is not just an ancient figure. There 
is something behind him."

Perhaps other mysterious beings are involved. "

At this time, Ye Feng carefully stated his guess. After Su Qingmo heard this, his eyes suddenly 
showed a hint of fear, and he couldn't help but said: "If it's really like Ye Feng, you said If that’s the 
case, then we need to leave here quickly to avoid being targeted by the mysterious being behind Old 
Man Wandu, and I’m afraid neither of us will be able to leave.”

Ye Feng nodded, looked inside the mahogany coffin, and found a small Bagua mirror at the bottom 
of the mahogany coffin.

This Bagua Mirror is only the size of a palm.

But just such a small Bagua mirror confused the spirit and soul of top geniuses like Su Qingmo just 
now.



Ye Feng immediately stretched out his hand and grabbed the Bagua Mirror in his hand.

This Bagua mirror seems to exude some mysterious power, trying to confuse Ye Feng.

"snort!"

But Ye Feng just snorted coldly, and his powerful soul power directly resisted this temptation.

Ye Feng said aloud: "The secret of Old Man Du may be hidden in this Bagua Mirror, but now let's 
leave this dangerous place and go outside to study this Bagua Mirror carefully."

Su Qingmo immediately nodded, and quickly left the cave of the Wandu Old Man with Ye Feng.

And not long after they left.

Buzz!

The void suddenly fluctuated.

A mysterious figure wrapped in a black robe walked out of the void.

When he saw the destroyed cave and the body of the killed Old Man Du, his expression suddenly 
changed and he hurriedly walked towards the mahogany coffin, as if he was looking for something.

When he found that the whole mahogany coffin was empty, he immediately shouted angrily: "Who 
is so bold? How dare you destroy the layout of my Corpse God Cult in the Ten Thousand Demons 
interface! How audacious! When I find the culprit, You must be cut into pieces!"

Chapter 4977 I am very touched

In fact, Ye Feng's guess was correct. There really was a mysterious being behind this poisonous old 
man, that is, this strong man in black robes.

This strong man in black robes should come from a very special and powerful interface. It is very 
likely that he comes from the highest level of heaven where the great world of origin is located.



After all, the layout of the Corpse God Sect mentioned in the words of this strong man in black 
robes in the interface of ten thousand demons is enough to show that this strong man in black robes 
is definitely not from the interface of ten thousand demons, but from a higher level outside the 
interface of ten thousand demons. interface.

It is very likely that it comes from heaven.

However, it is also possible that it comes from a higher-dimensional world of practice, which is 
more advanced than the heavenly world, but this possibility is relatively low.

In any case, Ye Feng relied on his keen judgment to leave the cave of Old Man Du in time, and took 
Su Qingmo away from this dangerous place.

Otherwise, if Ye Feng and Su Qingmo are still in this cave when this black-robed strongman arrives, 
they will probably be in danger, and the end will definitely be very miserable.

After all, the strength of this mysterious existence from a higher interface is definitely a 
dimensionality-reducing blow to young people like Ye Feng and Su Qingmo.

At this moment, Ye Feng didn't know that he had escaped a huge crisis by relying on his keen 
judgment.

At this time, Ye Feng and Su Qingmo had completely moved away from the cave of Old Man Du, 
and came to a very remote place in the mountains of Wandu Valley.

At this moment, Su Qingmo glanced behind him and said loudly: "Ye Feng, we are far enough away 
from Old Man Wandu's cave now. Even if a very powerful mysterious existence suddenly arrives, it 
is impossible to find it. We, after all, the jungles in this Wandu Valley are very dense, the mountains 
are green, and the terrain is very complicated. "

Ye Feng nodded and said aloud: "It is indeed far enough now."

After finishing speaking, Ye Feng directly took out the palm-sized Bagua Mirror that he had found 
from the coffin of Old Man Wandu.



At this moment, Su Qingmo wanted to look at the Bagua Mirror, but Ye Feng stopped him and 
couldn't help but said: "Miss Su, you have been confused by this Bagua Mirror once before, so this 
time Don't continue to look at this Bagua mirror, otherwise, I guess you will continue to be 
bewitched.

Confused. "

Hearing what Ye Feng said, Su Qingmo's face suddenly changed slightly, then nodded and said: 
"Okay, then Ye Feng, you can do your own research."

When he said this, Su Qingmo seemed to have thought of something. He couldn't help but glance at 
Ye Feng and said loudly: "Ye Feng, do you also have research on the spiritual level? Otherwise, 
why can you get me out of my bewitched state? Wake up in it.”

Ye Feng smiled and said aloud: "Yes, I also have a lot of research on the spiritual and soul level, so 
I was able to reawaken you in time."

Hearing Ye Feng's confirmation, Su Qingmo's beautiful eyes once again showed a deep brilliance.

Although the time with Ye Feng was not that long, the various methods Ye Feng unintentionally 
displayed refreshed Su Qingmo's understanding of Ye Feng again and again.

Not only are each of Ye Feng's different abilities extremely magical, but they also have brand-new 
methods and abilities one after another.

Su Qingmo simply couldn't imagine how many trump cards Ye Feng still had that were not 
revealed.

Su Qingmo became even more determined at this time. Ye Feng was definitely not without any sect. 
He definitely came from an extremely terrifying transcendent power. It might even be bigger than 
the power behind him. Otherwise, it would be impossible for him to be at such an age. At a young 
age, he had so many magical and heaven-defying methods and abilities.

While Su Qingmo was secretly guessing who Ye Feng was, Ye Feng was concentrating on studying 
the palm-sized Bagua Mirror obtained from the coffin of Old Man Wandu.



At this time, Su Qingmo could only turn his back to the Bagua Mirror and silently wait for Ye 
Feng's research results.

At this moment, without any hesitation, Ye Feng directly released his huge soul power and 
enveloped the palm-sized Bagua Mirror.

Buzz!

The moment Ye Feng's soul touched the Bagua Mirror, Ye Feng immediately felt that this seemingly 
small Bagua Mirror seemed to contain a huge ocean.

big space.

Ye Feng's soul power entered this huge space, and he immediately saw an incredible scene.

I saw that in the inner space of this Bagua Mirror, there were actually countless chains formed by 
black poisonous gas, locking a giant dragon whose entire body was composed of golden light.

This golden dragon was tens of thousands of meters tall, but Ye Feng discovered that this golden 
dragon seemed to have no name of its own. It seemed to be a golden dragon without any 
consciousness, and it was completely made of a special kind of dragon. It is composed of golden 
energy and is bound in this Bagua realm.

Ye Feng's soul power turned into a soul body, and he immediately flew in front of the golden 
dragon. After sensing it carefully, Ye Feng's expression immediately changed.

This giant golden dragon turned out to be a very advanced dragon of luck!

In other words, this golden dragon is not an actual creature, but a luck dragon composed entirely of 
the power of luck.

Ye Feng couldn't help but guess in his heart, could it be the mysterious being behind Old Man 
Wandu who captured so much luck and condensed it into a dragon of luck, and locked it in this 
Bagua Mirror, probably to take advantage of Old Man Wandu The special zombie he turned into 
suppressed this dragon of luck.



Ye Feng sensed it carefully and found that the power of luck contained in this dragon's body was 
actually from the same source as the Ten Thousand Demon Interface.

Ye Feng's expression immediately changed.

It seems that my guess is correct.

The mysterious existence behind this all-poisonous old man is probably an extremely terrifying 
existence.

It was actually able to steal the power of the interface and the power of luck from the Ten Thousand 
Demons interface!

At this time, Ye Feng did not hesitate and simply exited the Bagua Mirror with his soul body.

At this moment, Ye Feng discovered that a line of text appeared on the surface of the Bagua Mirror.

This is a secret of inheritance.

It is the inheritance of Old Man Wandu!

The inheritance of this Old Man of Ten Thousand Poisons should come from a mysterious place, 
most likely from outside the interface of Ten Thousand Demons.

A more advanced interface.

Ye Feng guessed that it should be heaven.

This is a set of advanced inheritance from heaven!

At this moment, after Ye Feng's soul body exited the Bagua Mirror, he looked directly at Su 
Qingmo, who had his back turned to him, and said loudly: "Miss Su, I think it is necessary for me to 
tell you everything I discovered. , after all, this is what we get together.”



After finishing speaking, Ye Feng told Su Qingmo the secret of the fortune dragon trapped in the 
middle of the Bagua Mirror, and also told the inheritance information of Old Man Wan Du 
displayed on the surface of the Bagua Mirror. Su Qingmo.

Then Ye Feng said very solemnly: "The mysterious existence involved in this Old Man of Ten 
Thousand Poisons is very likely to come from a heaven that is more advanced than the interface of 
Ten Thousand Demons. The inheritance of Old Man of Ten Thousand Poisons also comes from the 
heaven. This time we Good luck. Let's practice this set of inheritance together. As for the dragon of 
luck in the Bagua Mirror, I felt it and found that for the time being, with my strength, I can't unlock 
the dragon that trapped it. The poisonous chain, so Miss Su, we need to discuss how to deal with 
this luck dragon."

"That golden dragon of luck, Ye Feng, you can use it yourself."

At this time, Su Qingmo said directly.

"this……"

When Ye Feng heard what Su Qingmo said, he was about to say something, but Su Qingmo 
immediately shook his head, with a slight smile on his beautiful face, and said loudly: "Ye Feng, 
this This time, I mainly wanted to inherit the inheritance of the old man Wandu, and now there is an 
unexpected surprise, that is, the inheritance of the old man Wandu actually comes from a higher 
level of heaven. This is tantamount to a huge chance, and this time Ye Feng, you are the main force. 
If it weren't for you, Ye Feng, I would have died on the way, let alone the inheritance of Old Man 
Wan Du. And the thing that touches me the most is, Ye Feng, do you know what it is? Your honesty. 
There is absolutely no need for you to tell me that there is a destiny dragon trapped in the inner 
space of the Bagua Mirror, because I can’t detect it, but you still told me. This is great sincerity and 
respect for me. I am very touched by his performance, so this luck dragon cannot be unlocked for 
the time being, so just hold it yourself, Ye Feng, and you can use it directly when you can unlock it 
later.”

Chapter 4978 Illegitimate Daughter

At this moment, after hearing Su Qingmo's words, Ye Feng suddenly showed a look of surprise in 
his eyes, as if he did not expect Su Qingmo to be so generous.

But if you think about it carefully, what Su Qingmo said was also very true.

Because this time, Ye Feng did the most credit for exploring Old Man Du's cave.



Although Su Qingmo holds the map to find the cave of Ten Thousand Poison Old Man, if Ye Feng 
had not helped Su Qingmo, Su Qingmo would definitely have died completely this time.

Because the danger contained in Old Man Wandu's cave is really too great.

Not to mention the huge poisonous hedgehog we encountered before, which was very terrifying.

Coupled with the formation in the blood pool blocking the way in the middle of Wandu Old Man's 
cave, it is even more frightening.

So if it weren't for Ye Feng, Su Qingmo might have been completely killed as she said, and died in 
the cave of Old Man Wandu.

That's why Su Qingmo said such words. .??.

Ye Feng didn't say anything more or be pretentious. He just nodded and put the Bagua mirror with a 
fortune dragon sealed into his storage ring.

Later, Ye Feng has stronger means to rescue the dragon of luck in the Ten Thousand Demons 
interface. In this case, Ye Feng can directly devour the dragon of luck and increase his power.

At this moment, Ye Feng and Su Qingmo began to comprehend the inheritance of Old Man Poison 
obtained from the Bagua Mirror.

In Su Qingmo's eyes, although the inheritance of Old Man Du was quite powerful, it was just the 
inheritance of an ancient figure.

But now that Ye Feng has decrypted it, behind Old Man Du, there may be a mysterious being from 
a higher-level interface.

Therefore, the inheritance of Old Man Du is very likely to come from the heaven, the strongest 
interface in the world where the legendary origin world is located.



Although the heavenly world is not a higher cultivation dimension, it is the most advanced interface 
in the latitude where the great world of origin is located.

Therefore, for Ye Feng and Su Qingmo, who are among the tenth-ranked Ten Thousand Demon 
Interfaces, if they can get a set of inheritance from the top-ranked Heaven Realm, it would be very 
good, and it would be a huge opportunity.

melted.

At this time, Ye Feng and Su Qingmo began to understand the inheritance left by Old Man Wandu.

The inheritance left by the old man Wandu is called Wandu Dafa. This is not an offensive 
inheritance, but an inheritance that can introduce practitioners into the poisonous cultivation system.

Therefore, if Ye Feng and Su Qingmo successfully cultivate the inheritance left by the old man Wan 
Du, the Wan Du Dafa, then they will be able to learn and comprehend at will, and even create their 
own dramas. The inheritance of Poison.

Although Ye Feng's strongest means are the physical strength and soul power, being able to obtain 
another training system is also a very good trump card for Ye Feng.

At this moment, Ye Feng and Su Qingmo began to specialize in practicing and understanding the 
inheritance left by Old Man Wandu.

Three minutes later, Ye Feng suddenly opened his eyes and said aloud: "I have succeeded in 
enlightenment."

"What?"

Hearing what Ye Feng said, Su Qingmo, who was practicing together across from him, suddenly 
opened his eyes wide, with a trace of astonishment on his beautiful and cold face. He couldn't help 
but said: "I just said I just started to sort out the information in the entire inheritance, and you 
haven’t even started to comprehend it yet, Ye Feng, how is this possible?”

Ye Feng smiled slightly at this time, suddenly stretched out his hand, and violently grabbed the void 
of a tree in front of him.



Buzz!

At this moment, a poisonous aura appeared in Ye Feng's palm, directly covering the trees in front of 
him.

The next moment, the trees immediately withered completely.

"Um?"

Seeing this scene at this moment, Su Qingmo's eyes suddenly showed a look of amazement, and 
couldn't help but said: "Ye Feng, I didn't expect that you have really succeeded in enlightenment. It 
has only been a few short seconds." Minutes, your ability to comprehend is really incredible.”

At this moment, Su Qingmo suddenly discovered another incredible ability of Ye Feng, which was 
the ability to comprehend.

Ye Feng's speed in practicing inheritance is really fast, almost unbelievable.

At this time, Su Qingmo couldn't help but sigh and said: "Ye Feng, you will definitely be able to 
make a great name in the land of Zhongzhou in the future."

Ye Feng smiled slightly and said, "I hope so."

At this moment, Su Qingmo nodded, stood up, and said loudly: "It seems that we are going to 
separate. Things here are completely over."

Ye Feng also nodded slightly at this time, looked in a certain direction not far away, and said loudly: 
"I hope we can meet again in the future."

When Su Qingmo heard this, he couldn't help but put on a beautiful smile on his face, and said 
loudly: "Of course we can meet again, I gave you my exclusive blue crystal token, we can have 
Opportunity to contact directly.”



When Ye Feng heard this, he immediately nodded, smiled and said, "Oh, yes, I almost forgot about 
this."

Su Qingmo couldn't help but roll her eyes at Ye Feng and said loudly: "This girl gave you 
something, and it is also an exclusive token. You should remember it carefully."

Ye Feng laughed and said aloud: "Okay, then I will write it down. If there is a chance in the future, 
we will contact you directly through your token." ??

Su Qingmo nodded, then seemed to have thought of something, and suddenly said: "Ye Feng, 
although you won't tell me your true identity, before leaving, I am willing to tell you my identity. 
Where do I live?" In the ocean area to the north of Zhongzhou, that is, Beihai, I come from the 
super power of Beihai, Beihai Dragon Palace. My strength and foundation are probably similar to 
the top super sects in Zhongzhou. I can also be regarded as the dominant force in the ocean, and I 
am She is the daughter of the "Beihai Dragon Emperor" who controls the Beihai Dragon Palace.

When Ye Feng heard what Su Qingmo said, he immediately showed a look of deep surprise on his 
face, and couldn't help but said: "Miss Su, you are actually the daughter of the Dragon King of 
Beihai Dragon Palace? So what is Miss Su's identity?" Very noble, but why are you always alone 
when you go out to practice and enter dangerous situations? Logically speaking, with your noble 
status as the daughter of the Dragon Emperor, you should always be surrounded by stars and 
protected by countless strong men. ”

Hear Ye

After Feng said this, a bitter smile suddenly appeared on Su Qingmo's beautiful face, and she said 
loudly: "Although I am the daughter of the Dragon Emperor of Beihai Dragon Palace, I can't be said 
to be the daughter of the Dragon Emperor. , The Dragon Emperor has many heirs, both sons and 
daughters, and I can’t even be considered an ordinary daughter because I am the Dragon Emperor’s 
illegitimate daughter. In public, I don’t even I am recognized as the daughter of the Dragon 
Emperor, so if Ye Feng comes to Beihai in the future, I am sorry that I cannot give you the treatment 
of a distinguished guest of the Beihai Dragon Palace, because I am just an illegitimate daughter who 
lives in the cracks and is not recognized. , so I work hard and practice hard so that I can be 
recognized by everyone and regain my self-esteem and confidence. "

Hearing Su Qingmo's words, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly showed an inexplicable look.

Immediately, Ye Feng walked up to Su Qingmo. Looking at the friend in front of him who was full 
of beauty and nobility, but seemed to have a little inferiority in his heart, he couldn't help but patted 



the other person's shoulder and said loudly: "As long as the heart If you keep the thought of struggle 
and practice hard, you will be able to achieve your goals. The same is true for me. We must work 
hard to practice together and encourage each other in the future. "

Hearing what Ye Feng said and feeling the weight of the opponent's palm, Su Qingmo's beautiful 
face seemed to reveal an inexplicable look, and she couldn't help but said: "Ye Feng, you are my 
second A friend and my only good friend, I will take your words to heart.”

Uh-huh!

After saying that, Su Qingmo suddenly took a step forward. Under Ye Feng's rather surprised gaze, 
he immediately took the scent into his arms, hugged Ye Feng, and then quickly stepped back.

Su Qingmo's beautiful face showed what seemed to be a very warm smile, and she said aloud: "Ye 
Feng, I am very happy to meet such a good friend like you. Let's meet again in the future."

After saying that, Su Qingmo's beautiful figure disappeared into the distance in an instant.

At this moment, Ye Feng looked at the other person's leaving back, smiled slightly, and then flew 
quickly in the opposite direction.

Ye Feng was going to continue his previous plan, disguised as the great elder of the inner sect of the 
Five Poison Sect, and entered the Five Poison Sect to do some good for himself and make up for the 
embarrassing situation when he was chased by many powerful men of the Five Poison Sect.

Chapter 4979 Disciple

This time, Ye Feng did not get lost again because he had previously obtained a detailed map of the 
vicinity of Ten Thousand Poison Valley from Su Qingmo.

Therefore, Ye Feng could not get lost again this time, but quickly arrived at the edge of the Ten 
Thousand Poison Valley.

Not far ahead, on a huge mountaintop, there appeared a majestic palace covering several kilometers. 
It looked very noble and magnificent.

This palace is where the headquarters of the Five Poison Sect, the largest force nearby, is located.



The place where Ye Feng was going at this moment was the headquarters of the Five Poison Sect.

Because Ye Feng was hunted down miserably by many powerful men from the Five Poison Sect 
this time, especially when he was chased and killed by the Great Elder of the Inner Sect of the Five 
Poison Sect, he almost died directly.

Even though Ye Feng finally used various strategies to kill the elder of the inner sect of the Five 
Poison Sect, Ye Feng felt that this revenge must be avenged. ??

Of course, Ye Feng would not directly attack the entire Five Poison Sect, because that would 
undoubtedly mean seeking death.

You know, even though Ye Feng's cultivation strength has greatly increased now, compared with the 
Five Poison Sect, the only first-rate power nearby, Ye Feng still looks much weaker.

Ye Feng's current strength is not enough to challenge a first-rate power head-on.

So what Ye Feng wants to do is to disguise himself as the Great Elder of the Inner Sect of the Five 
Poison Sect, sneak into the core team of the Five Poison Sect, and then use the huge power of the 
Great Elder of the Inner Sect of the Five Poison Sect to make money for himself. Do your best.

After he has gained enough benefits and allowed his cultivation skills to undergo qualitative 
transformation once again, Ye Feng will prepare to leave the Five Poison Sect and head to the final 
destination of this trip to Zhongzhou, which is the eldest princess of the Blood Demon Dynasty. The 
Divine Phoenix Sect, where Dongfang Yue belongs, is a super sect.

Because Ye Feng knows very well that the extremely powerful inheritance and various cultivation 
resources he wants, as well as all kinds of information about the special training place in 
Zhongzhou, those ordinary big forces or the so-called

The powerful forces cannot give it to themselves at all.

Only the overlord-level super sects who enter the land of Zhongzhou can meet Ye Feng's needs.



So at this time, Ye Feng's final destination was naturally to join a super sect like the Divine Phoenix 
Sect.

But before that, Ye Feng went to the Five Poison Sect to get some benefits.

Buzz!

At this moment, Ye Feng was using his own power, directly transforming it into the power of the 
Five Poison Sect's exclusive poisonous attributes.

You know, Ye Feng had previously obtained the special skill of the elder of the Five Poison Sect, 
the poison field.

In addition, Ye Feng also learned the peerless inheritance of the Wandu Old Man from the higher 
heaven, the Wandu Dharma.

Therefore, Ye Feng's methods in terms of poisonous power are no longer the same.

Ye Feng now wants to disguise himself as the Inner Sect Elder of the Five Poison Sect, which is 
very easy and simple.

Although the cultivation level of the Great Elder of the Five Poison Sect is three or four levels 
higher than that of Ye Feng, Ye Feng's real combat power is very strong. Under normal 
circumstances, as long as he does not take full action, he will not reveal his flaws.

So at this time, Ye Feng didn't hesitate at all, and immediately used his power, directly becoming 
the original power of the elder of the inner sect of the Five Poison Sect, and transformed and 
changed his appearance and form into the five poisonous sect. The form of the great elder of the 
poisonous sect.

In the blink of an eye, Ye Feng has transformed from a handsome young man into a burly old man, 
full of majesty and poisonous aura. He looks like a ruthless character at first glance.

At this moment, Ye Feng successfully transformed himself into the inner sect elder of the Five 
Poison Sect, and then



Finally, he took out a set of black robes from his storage ring and put them on.

Uh-huh!

At this moment, Ye Feng did not hesitate at all. He directly regarded himself as the real elder of the 
inner sect of the Five Poison Sect and flew quickly towards the headquarters of the Five Poison 
Sect.

For Ye Feng, it is very simple to pretend to be the elder of the inner sect of the Five Poison Sect.

But if you want to successfully sneak into the core circle of the Five Poison Sect and reap benefits 
secretly, this is still very challenging. .??.

Therefore, Ye Feng decided not to make any random moves after entering the Five Poison Sect.

Wait until you understand everything and stabilize before making plans.

At this time, Ye Feng secretly thought that he had entered the headquarters of the Five Poison Sect.

When Ye Feng came to the inner area of Wudu Sect, he immediately saw a very brilliant scene.

The majestic palace that was several kilometers long and visible in the distance was just a part of 
the Five Poison Gates.

In the entire base camp, a special palace was built on every hilltop, and there were also many attics 
and residences built among the mountains and valleys.

Moreover, high in the sky, including deep in the mountains, there are disciples of the Five Poison 
Sects, all practicing among them and flying to and from each other.

Obviously, the Five Poison Sect has developed for so many years, so it has developed into such a 
huge figure today.



Ye Feng estimated that the total number of disciples of the Five Poison Sect was estimated to be 
hundreds of thousands.

Ye Feng secretly sensed it at this moment, and his expression changed slightly.

Because Ye Feng sensed that there were many extremely powerful auras in the headquarters of the 
Five Poison Sect.

There is a lot of breath, better than myself

Much more powerful.

At this time, Ye Feng was very glad that he did not provoke directly, but chose to disguise himself 
as the inner sect elder of the Five Poison Sect, a member of the Five Poison Sect, and blended into 
the Five Poison Sect. In this way, he could develop silently. Gaining benefits secretly.

Just when Ye Feng was secretly thinking about you, suddenly a beautiful woman wearing a red 
dress flew over not far away.

This beautiful woman looks very young, but her appearance is very mature. She has a charming and 
coquettish feeling. You can tell at a glance that she is not ordinary.

At this moment, Ye Feng did not recognize this charming woman. Ye Feng just flew quickly 
towards the inner area of the Five Poison Sect, wanting to quietly find out where the elder of the 
inner sect he was pretending to live. where.

But at this moment, the graceful and charming woman flying in front suddenly flew directly in front 
of Ye Feng, bowed respectfully, her voice was naturally charming, and said: "Disciple Enchantress, 
greetings Master!"

Um?

At this time, Ye Feng was suddenly stunned by what this graceful and charming woman said.



Ye Feng immediately stared at the beautiful and voluptuous young woman in front of him, thinking 
to himself, he didn't expect that the inner sect elder of the Five Poison Sect was so lucky to have 
accepted such a beautiful, fairy-like disciple. And his cultivation is not weak.

At this moment, Ye Feng was very happy. He didn't expect that he wanted to find out some 
information about the Five Poison Sect, but he didn't know how to find out. He didn't expect that he 
would give him a pillow when he fell asleep. This inner sect leader of the Five Poison Sect The 
elder's disciples came directly to the door.

At this moment, Ye Feng naturally nodded his head in a pretentious manner, and then said loudly: 
"Enchantress, lead the way, I want to return to the place where I live, and I want to ask you 
something."
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At this time, after hearing what Ye Feng said, Yao Ji, a disciple of the great elder of the inner sect of 
the Five Poison Sect, immediately nodded and led the way very respectfully.

And Ye Feng looked at the other party's exquisite and beautiful back, with a hint of a meaningful 
smile in his eyes.

At this time, Ye Feng followed the enchantress and soon passed through the mountain ranges and 
arrived halfway up a mountain that looked very deserted.

There are no buildings around this mountain, only a golden palace built on the mountainside.

When Ye Feng saw this scene, his eyes suddenly showed a look of surprise.

It seems that the great elder of the inner sect of the Five Poison Sect still has great power in the Five 
Poison Sect. He can actually monopolize a huge mountain and only build the palace where he lives.

At this moment, Enchantress and Ye Feng landed at the door of this golden palace.

At this time, Ye Feng carefully sensed the soul power emitted by Ye Feng, and his eyes suddenly lit 
up.



Because Ye Feng instantly sensed that there seemed to be many special energy fluctuations of 
heaven and earth resources deep in the palace where the great elder of the inner sect of the Five 
Poison Sect lived.

It seems that the cultivation resources of the inner sect elder of the Five Poison Sect are not only 
stored in his storage ring, but also a large part of them are hidden in his residence.

Ye Feng is now pretending to be the inner sect elder of the Five Poison Sect, which means that these 
remaining cultivation resources belong to him.

This made Ye Feng quite excited. This was an unexpected gain.

You know, Ye Feng came to Wu Du Sect not to stay here for a long time.

So after getting these cultivation resources left by the great elders of the Five Poison Sect, Ye Feng 
was naturally prepared to devour them all at night when no one was around and turn them into his 
own power.

After all, Ye Feng does not intend to develop here for a long time. The best way is to get the 
benefits directly, use them directly, and transform them into his own power.

At this time, Ye Feng secretly planned in his heart. After all, this is his place of residence, and no 
one will care about him.

At this moment, Ye Feng

Looking at the enchantress in front of him, he asked aloud: "I have been away from home for a long 
time. Are there any special changes in our Five Poison Sect recently?"

When the demon queen heard what Ye Feng said, she did not doubt Ye Feng's identity. After all, the 
inner sect elder of the Five Poison Sect went out of the sect to chase Ye Feng. Now that Ye Feng has 
come back disguised as the inner sect elder, it has indeed been nearly a year. Half a month's time.

As for the Great Elder of the Inner Sect of the Five Poison Sect, as a powerful figure in the entire 
Five Poison Sect, he naturally needs to know the trends of the entire Five Poison Sect at all times.



After all, the internal struggle among the Five Poison Sects is also quite fierce.

Although Ye Feng now pretends to be the Inner Sect Elder of the Five Poison Sect and has a 
distinguished status, there must be potential enemies among the Five Poison Sect.

At this moment, as a disciple of the great elder of the Five Poison Sect, this enchantress was 
naturally in awe of Ye Feng and had no idea of doubting Ye Feng's identity.

The Enchantress immediately lowered her beautiful face and said respectfully: "Tell me, Master, 
there hasn't been anything particularly big happening in our Five Poison Sect recently. The only 
thing that has been quite sensational recently is probably the incident in our Five Poison Sect." A 
disciple mistakenly entered an ancient formation in the surrounding jungle. That formation actually 
led to an ancient ruins. Now many important people from our Five Poison Sect have passed by, and 
the master has been outside. I don’t know about this, so the disciple is very anxious. Now that the 
master is back, the master should take the disciple with him to take a look. Otherwise, all the good 
things in the ancient ruins will be stolen by the other five poison sects. The big shot occupied it.”

At this time, the Enchantress spoke in a rather anxious tone.

Although this enchantress's cultivation strength is not weak, she is at the same level as Ye Feng, and 
is already considered a very powerful cultivation among the younger generation.

But as a young person, she would definitely not dare to go to that ancient ruins alone.

Because this ancient ruins is now occupied by many big figures from the Five Poison Sect.

So Enchantress has been looking forward to the return of her master. Her master is the elder of the 
inner sect of the Five Poison Sect. He has a very high status among the Five Poison Sect and can 
definitely be regarded as a big shot among the Five Poison Sect.

If Master takes action, he will definitely be able to get a lot of good things from the ancient ruins 
connected by that formation.

At this moment, when Ye Feng heard what Enchantress said, a look of surprise suddenly appeared 
in his eyes.



I didn't expect that I would encounter such a good thing just after arriving at Wu Du Sect.

You know, Ye Feng has no intention of developing himself in the Five Poison Sect for a long time. 
He is just a fake of the great elder of the inner sect.

Therefore, Ye Feng uses his identity as the Great Elder of the Five Poison Sect to do anything 
without any taboos, even to rob various resources. Anyway, he can just get a profit and run away 
without fear of any consequences, let alone destroy the entire The Five Poison Gates are in chaos. 
The more chaos there is, the better it is for you.

At this time, Ye Feng had already made up his mind and immediately looked at the Enchantress in 
front of him and said loudly: "Okay, we will set off directly tomorrow to go to the ancient ruins 
connected by the ancient formation. I want to see it. Even if the so-called big shots in our Five 
Poison Sect occupy various cultivation resources, if I go, they must obediently hand over the 
various cultivation resources they have occupied. Anyone who dares to disobey me will be killed by 
me. "

At this moment, Ye Feng was speaking with a tone that was completely in line with the ruthless 
character of the elder of the Five Poison Sect.

When Enchantress heard Ye Feng say this, she immediately became overjoyed and said quickly: 
"Master is wise!"

At this time, Ye Feng waved his hand and said aloud: "I have been out for half a month and am a 
little tired. I will have a rest tonight. We will set off tomorrow. Come to my place tomorrow 
morning and go with me. "

The Enchantress's cultivation level is quite good, and Ye Feng doesn't know where the ancient ruins 
are, so naturally he has to go with the Enchantress as a guide to avoid revealing that he knows 
everything about the Five Poison Sect. A secret I don’t understand.

At this time, I heard Ye Feng say this,

An inexplicable look suddenly appeared in the beautiful eyes of the enchantress, and she said aloud: 
"Master has been away for half a month, sleeping in the open air. He must be tired. Why not let the 



disciple help the master relieve his fatigue? The disciple has recently started practicing It is a 
special method that can help Master quickly recover his tired spirit."

Hearing what the Enchantress said, Ye Feng's eyes revealed a look of surprise.

It seems that this enchantress has also cultivated an inheritance with the ability to assist in healing.

Ye Feng immediately nodded and said: "Okay, then come in and help me recover and relieve my 
fatigue."

"Yes, Master."

The Enchantress got Ye Feng's consent, and her beautiful and alluring eyes suddenly revealed a look 
of deep joy, and she quickly followed Ye Feng into the golden palace in front of her.

A night of silence.

…

Early the next morning, the beautiful figure of the enchantress walked out of the palace tiredly and 
waited outside.

At this time, Ye Feng entered the treasure house of cultivation resources left by the elder of the 
inner sect of the Five Poison Sect.

At this moment, Ye Feng opened the door of the private treasure house of the elder of the inner sect 
of the Five Poison Sect, and was almost blinded by the flash.

Because everything contained inside is a variety of energy crystals that emit light.

Including sapphires with ocean energy, gray gems with earth-attribute power, and even very 
advanced energy amethysts.

Only very large mineral veins can produce one or two of these things.



Unexpectedly, the great elder of the inner sect of the Five Poison Sect actually collected so much. 
He put it here probably for his future cultivation, but it was not used for the time being. It was 
temporarily stored here, but now it is all cheap for Ye Feng. .

"Buzz!"

Ye Feng naturally did not hesitate at this time, and directly released the Devouring Domain, 
instantly covering all the energy crystals in the private treasure house of the elder of the Five Poison 
Sect, as well as various other energy crystals. Training resources.
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