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Chapter 5121 Legendary Figure

At this moment, the sudden appearance of the poisonous formation made everyone panic.

Everyone agreed that this was probably the revenge of the dark demons they had dealt with before.

But at this time, Hei Wuchang shook his head and said: "The wilderness we are in is already within 
the territory of our Daxuan Dynasty, so no matter how arrogant those dark demons are, they will 
never dare to There is such a vicious poisonous formation lurking within the territory of our Daxuan 
Dynasty."

"makes sense."

Hearing what Hei Wuchang said, everyone nodded.

Ye Feng seemed to have thought of something at this time, and couldn't help but said: "Is it the 
commander of the Black Armored Army that I offended before? When we just entered the border 
city, the commander of the Black Armored Army sent a team A mysterious killer in black wanted to 
assassinate me in a sneak attack. Fortunately, Senior Hei Wuchang took action at that time and 
killed the killer in black directly. Otherwise, I might have been killed by a sneak attack. "

"Um?"

Hearing what Ye Feng said at this time, Hei Wuchang immediately nodded and said: "It is very 
likely that the killer sent by the commander of the Black Armored Army wants to kill Ye Feng, but 
this time he Not only do we want to kill you, Ye Feng, but we also have to bury all of us here, 
including Princess Qiqi. Because Princess Qiqi and I both saved you, Ye Feng, the commander-in-
chief of the Black Armored Army probably killed us. Everyone sees it as a thorn in their side, 
thinking that they are all Ye Feng’s accomplices and want to trap and kill us all.”

Hearing Hei Wuchang's analysis, Princess Qiqi was very angry and couldn't help but said: "When 
we go out this time, we will tell my brother, His Royal Highness, that the commander-in-chief of 
the Black Armored Army must be thrown into prison."



But the moment Princess Qiqi finished speaking, an eerie old voice suddenly sounded outside the 
poisonous formation: "You have already
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There is no chance to return to the palace, because you will be slowly poisoned to death by me in 
this poisonous formation. "

At this moment, the moment the voice finished speaking, everyone immediately saw that at the top 
of the poisonous formation, an old figure wearing a skull robe was floating there, looking very eerie 
and terrifying.

At this moment, when Hei Wuchang saw the old man wearing a skeleton robe, he couldn't help but 
his face suddenly changed, and he said loudly: "It's you, the poisonous ancestor!"

At this time, when Hei Wuchang said the name of the old man wearing a skull robe, Princess Qiqi, 
who was standing aside, suddenly changed her face and couldn't help but said: "He is the legendary 
poisonous one." Ancestor?"

At this moment, seeing such a drastic change in Princess Qiqi's face and Hei Wuchang's face 
becoming very ugly, Ye Feng was a little curious and couldn't help but asked: "Poison Ancestor? 
What does that look like?" A very powerful character? Can you be so surprised?"

Princess Qiqi immediately nodded deeply at this time and couldn't help but said: "Ye Feng, you just 
came to our Daxuan Dynasty not long ago, so it is normal for you not to know. This poisonous 
ancestor is in our Among the Daxuan Dynasty, he was definitely a first-class legendary figure. It 
was not how powerful his cultivation was, but the poisonous technique he practiced. It was simply 
terrifying, even if it was better than him. If a strong man who has reached several realms encounters 
the poisonous ancestor, he will die, because the poison of the poisonous ancestor is simply not 
something that ordinary people can withstand, even if it is a very powerful super strong person, if 
he touches it, The poisonous gas released by the extremely poisonous ancestor will kill him 
instantly, and he simply cannot withstand this toxicity.

"

Hearing what Princess Qiqi said, Hei Wuchang couldn't help but nodded. His face was more solemn 
than ever before, even more solemn than when he met the super strong men among the dark demons 
before.



Hei Wuchang couldn't help but said: "I didn't expect that the commander-in-chief of the Black 
Armored Army would be able to recruit such a vicious person as the Venomous Ancestor."

At this moment, the poisonous ancestor flying high in the sky immediately showed a sarcastic smile 
on his face and said loudly: "The commander-in-chief of the Black Armored Army is not qualified 
to invite me. He is the leader of the family behind him. The old family leader invited me out. I 
received some favors from the old family behind the leader of the Black Armored Army. Now he 
has promised to give me half of the entire family's wealth, so I will reluctantly take action, 
otherwise I have no interest in doing anything to you bastards."

When he said this, the Venomous Ancestor suddenly stared at Hei Wuchang, who was shrouded in 
coldness in the Venomous Formation, smiled faintly, and said loudly: "You are not bad, your 
cultivation is very strong, almost as good as mine. Because my level is almost there, but the 
poisonous technique I possess cannot even resist the superpowers who are several levels stronger 
than me, so I’ll poison you, the more threatening person, first.”

After finishing speaking, the poisonous ancestor directly activated the poisonous formation, and a 
burst of poisonous gas rushed out, which directly enveloped Hei Wuchang.

Buzz!

At this moment, Hei Wuchang didn't even have time to react. All of a sudden, his skin turned 
completely black. He was poisoned in an instant, and his whole body was powerless. He couldn't 
even use his own cultivation skills. It's working.

"What?"

Seeing this scene, Princess Qiqi couldn't help but said in shock: "This kind of poisonous technique 
is so terrifying that even senior figures like Senior Hei Wuchang were poisoned and unable to move 
in an instant. How is this right?
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Against this poisonous ancestor, we have completely become fish on the chopping block. Do we 
really want to all die in this wilderness today? "



At this time, even members of the royal family like Princess Qiqi suddenly felt a little desperate.

Because the reputation of this poisonous ancestor is too terrifying.

At this moment, Hei Wuchang also had a deathly gray look in his eyes.

A group of golden armored guards were surrounding them, their faces full of despair.

Because the poisonous formation carefully arranged by the poisonous ancestor here cannot be 
broken at all, and the poisonous energy cultivated by the poisonous ancestor himself is even more 
terrifying, and the powerful elders like Hei Wuchang have absorbed a little bit of it. After the poison 
gas, all the power was lost in an instant, and it was impossible to exert power at all.

So at this time, everyone felt that they were probably dead today.

But at this time, Ye Feng was probably the only one who looked calmer among everyone present.

Because Ye Feng's constitution is the immortal body of a god, he is naturally immune to all kinds of 
poisonous gases.

In addition, Ye Feng's eyes can see through any formation in the world, and he can pass through the 
formation safely.

It's just that what Ye Feng is worried about now is that the poisonous ancestor's own cultivation is 
very powerful, and he doesn't know whether he can fight against him.

But at this time, Ye Feng was much stronger than before, because Ye Feng's cultivation level had 
broken through to the new level of Xuanzhao Realm.

And the most important thing is that Ye Feng uses the giant spirit god's bloodline that he has fused 
to activate the giant spirit god's ax, a magical weapon, which can explode with power far beyond his 
current power.

So at this time, Ye Feng was thinking whether to fight to the death with this poisonous ancestor, or 
to lead everyone out of the formation and escape in a hurry.



Chapter 5122 Immune to Poison Gas

For Ye Feng, his current cultivation level is already very powerful, and he still holds the ax of the 
Giant Spirit God in his hand.

The most important thing is that Ye Feng's Immortal Body of God is too strong, so Ye Feng is not 
directly immune to these so-called poisonous gases.

At this time, Ye Feng was fully capable of leading everyone to break through this poisonous 
formation, leave the scene directly, and return to the palace.

But Ye Feng felt that just escaping like this was really unfair to the poisonous ancestor.

Because this poisonous ancestor is extremely vicious, and he wants to poison them all in the 
wilderness, he must severely injure him, or even kill him directly. The fate that the poisonous 
ancestor deserves most is the fate he deserves.

So at this time, Ye Feng suddenly showed a ruthless look in his eyes, and said to everyone around 
him: "These poisonous formations are of no use to me at all. I put this poisonous formation The 
magic will be broken immediately. When the time comes, all of you will follow me and kill this 
poisonous ancestor directly."

boom! !

After finishing speaking, before anyone around him could say anything surprising, Ye Feng had 
already exploded with the power of his Eye of Heaven and Earth.

At this moment, two bright beams of light burst out from Ye Feng's eyes. They seemed to be able to 
penetrate everything, and instantly tore apart the poisonous formations around them.

At this time, everyone around saw this scene and their eyes widened.

Whether it was Princess Qiqi, the group of golden armored guards, or Hei Wuchang, an older and 
powerful man, all had deep shock in their eyes.



Hei Wuchang couldn't help but said: "What kind of method is this?? Such a complex poisonous 
formation was broken in an instant. How could this happen?"

At this moment, Ye Feng did not explain anything, but said aloud: "Next, I will resist all the 
poisonous gas, and you can just use your strength to attack from a distance."

Ye Feng knows very well that people like Hei Wuchang, the golden armored guards, Princess Qiqi, 
etc., have no way to get close to the Poison Ancestor, even if their cultivation base is very powerful, 
and even Hei Wuchang has a higher cultivation level than himself. It is impossible for four or five 
powerful elders in the big realm to get close to the poisonous ancestor.

Because of the poisonous energy of the poisonous ancestor, they could not resist it at all, and they 
would be stunned and killed by the poison in an instant.

Therefore, it was the most correct choice for them not to get close to the poisonous ancestor.

But that's not to say that Hei Wuchang and the others don't have any role. Many powerful people 
can carry out long-range attacks from a distance to assist themselves, which is also a huge help.

Ye Feng, on the other hand, was alone and rushed towards the poisonous ancestor.

At this time, the Venomous Ancestor also had a look of surprise in his eyes, and he couldn't help but 
said: "You are quite interesting, you kid. I didn't expect you to be able to break through the 
poisonous formation carefully arranged by me. It seems that You are very knowledgeable in 
formations, but there is no way for you to win this battle because your cultivation is too weak."

After finishing speaking, the poisonous ancestor immediately released extremely terrifying 
poisonous gas. These poisonous gases rotated rapidly, and even condensed into tornadoes of 
poisonous gas directly in front of the poisonous ancestor. It spun directly towards Ye Feng.

leaf
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Feng didn't hesitate at this moment, and instantly burst out with the powerful power of the immortal 
body of the god.



Boom!

At this moment, Ye Feng suddenly burst out with golden light, and his whole body turned into a 
young god. Everything in his body turned into gold, as if it was cast from gold.

Whether it's the membranes, eye pupils or even hair, they all turned into golden threads.

At this time, Ye Feng's appearance looked very cool and noble.

At this moment, it was the first time that Ye Feng displayed the terrifying power of his immortal 
body in front of Qiqi Princess Hei Wuchang and other royal family members.

So at this moment, when everyone behind him saw this scene, their eyes showed deep shock and 
astonishment.

Because Ye Feng's whole body seemed to be shrouded in golden light at this moment, and his whole 
body seemed to be made of gold. He looked very noble and gave people a very strong visual 
impact.

Princess Qiqi has never seen Ye Feng look so noble and cool.

At this moment, Hei Wuchang couldn't help but said in horror: "What kind of physique does Ye 
Feng have? He can burst out with such precious and terrifying golden power, which makes him not 
even afraid of poisonous gas." ? This is really unbelievable! What kind of terrifying body function 
must it have to be immune to all poisonous gases!"

At this time, Ye Feng passed through the poisonous tornado and would not be harmed by the 
poisonous gas at all.

"What?"

Seeing this scene, the Venomous Ancestor, whose face was full of sarcasm just now, finally widened 
his eyes completely. It seemed that he had never thought that his proud trump card, the Venomous 



Qi, could not be used against him. Ye Feng caused damage and did not even affect Ye Feng's 
condition at all.

This is the first time Venomous Ancestor has encountered such a heaven-defying person, and he is 
not afraid of the poisonous energy he has cultivated for thousands of years.

At this time, the poisonous ancestor couldn't help but said in horror: "Boy, what kind of person are 
you? How is it possible that my poisonous gas has no effect on you? My poisonous gas is fused 
with The poisonous gas of thousands of poisonous insects under the world is also combined with 
the poisonous miasma in countless swamps, as well as the corpse poison of thousands of years old 
zombies. Finally, the top poisonous gas that was successfully cultivated is integrated into my origin. 
Once I release this This kind of poisonous aura, even a strong person who is two or three realms 
stronger than me, will definitely be poisoned and die in an instant. I didn't expect that you kid could 
not be affected at all. This is simply impossible, you kid! What kind of physique can withstand such 
terrifying poisonous energy?"

But at this time, Ye Feng didn't bother to respond to the endless words of the poisonous ancestor. 
Instead, he held the ax of the giant spirit god in his hand, with a firm and cold look in his eyes, and 
said loudly: "Poisonous Ancestor" Ancestor, the last person you should offend is me. If you dare to 
ambush me here, set a trap, and poison me and my friends, then you will definitely die!"

Boom!

At this moment, Ye Feng did not hesitate at all. Holding the Giant Spirit God's Ax in his hand, he 
directly activated the Giant Spirit God's bloodline and promoted the strongest Giant Spirit God 
power among the Giant Spirit God's Ax. He directly and violently An ax struck in the direction of 
the poisonous ancestor in front.

"Boom!"

The terrifying light burst out from the ax blade, as if it could tear the sky and the earth apart, and 
chop the world into pieces!

Chapter 5123 Evidence

Boom!

At this time, the Giant Spirit God Ax in Ye Feng's hand completely burst out with terrifying power, 
as if it could tear the heaven and the earth apart.



Because you must know that the ax of the Giant Spirit God was originally a magical weapon. Now 
that it is stimulated by the blood of the Giant Spirit God Ye Feng, it can naturally explode with 
earth-shattering destructive power.

Even though the cultivation level of this poisonous ancestor was four or five realms higher than that 
of Ye Feng, he still felt the aura of death at this time.

Because the light of the ax blade erupted from the ax of the giant spirit god seemed to be able to cut 
his entire body in half instantly and completely split it into pieces.

At this moment, the poisonous ancestor immediately couldn't help but said in horror: "This is the 
legendary ax of the giant spirit god? How can you kid activate the original power of the ax of the 
giant spirit god, which is lower than me?" A whole four or five realms can actually explode with 
power that can hurt me, this is impossible!”

At this time, the poisonous ancestor could be said to be completely shocked.

Because first of all, the poison formation could not trap Ye Feng, and Ye Feng broke the formation 
in an instant.

Secondly, the poisonous energy that he was most proud of did no harm to Ye Feng at all.

Ye Feng's physique is equivalent to being immune to any poisonous energy.

Now Ye Feng relies on the magic weapon of the Giant Spirit God Ax in his hand to burst out the 
power that can destroy a super strong man like him.

Therefore, this series of operations was naturally an eye-opener for the Venomous Ancestor, and he 
was extremely shocked to Ye Feng, a seemingly ordinary young man.

At this moment, the Venomous Ancestor wanted to retreat to avoid being killed by the ax of the 
Giant Spirit God in Ye Feng's hand.



But at this time, a group of strong men such as Hei Wuchang and Princess Qiqi from behind also 
launched their own attacks.

Hei Wuchang directly condensed a huge black hand high in the sky, covering the sky and the sun, as 
if it could suppress everything, and bombarded directly towards the poisonous ancestor.

At this moment, Princess Qiqi also used a dozen long swords of different colors, and instantly 
stabbed the poisonous ancestor in front of her.

As for the dozen or so golden armored guards, they all used their own methods one after another.

Therefore, under the siege of everyone, the poisonous ancestor can
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It was said that he was attacked from both sides and could not escape from all directions. In the end, 
he could only be hit by the ax of the Giant Spirit God in Ye Feng's hand.

"Click" sound!

The poisonous ancestor was split in half instantly and was completely killed.

At this moment, when everyone saw this scene, they all breathed a sigh of relief.

This poisonous ancestor, the terrifying figure in legend, was finally completely killed.

At this time, everyone looked at Ye Feng with deep shock.

Because they never expected that Ye Feng would be able to turn the tide at the critical moment and 
completely kill the poisonous ancestor.

Because you must know that the most important thing is that the poisonous energy of the poisonous 
ancestor does no harm to Ye Feng at all, which is what shocks everyone the most.



Because you must know that even an old and powerful person like Hei Wuchang cannot resist the 
poisonous gas of the poisonous ancestor without any injuries. After just inhaling a little poisonous 
gas, he became weak and completely lost all combat effectiveness.

Ye Feng, on the other hand, was directly immune to the invasion of those poisonous gases, and he 
could not be harmed at all. This terrifying physique and body functions naturally shocked everyone 
to the extreme.

Even Hei Wuchang couldn't help but look at Ye Feng, his eyes filled with deep shock.

At this moment, he suddenly understood that this seemingly ordinary young man was giving him 
more and more surprises.

Because of the various methods Ye Feng used one after another, everyone increasingly felt that this 
young boy was an extremely mysterious and terrifying guy.

At this moment, Hei Wuchang even felt that the Giant Spirit God's Ax was following Ye Feng, not 
only because Ye Feng successfully integrated the Giant Spirit God's bloodline, but also because Ye 
Feng had heaven-defying talents and abilities.

Buzz!

At this time, Ye Feng did not hesitate and directly released the Devouring Domain and began to 
devour the entire Poison Ancestor.

Boom!

At this moment, the poisonous ancestor's skill was immediately absorbed by Ye Feng.

The skills of the poisonous ancestor were contaminated with severe poison, but after Ye Feng 
absorbed it, he could completely convert it into his own skills. The energy in Ye Feng's dantian 
immediately began to grow rapidly and continuously. The cultivation momentum also rapidly and 
continuously broke through at this time.



After all, you must know that the cultivation skills of this poisonous ancestor are four or five levels 
higher than Ye Feng, comparable to the super strong dark demon with eighteen wings on his back 
whom Ye Feng killed before.

Therefore, after Ye Feng devoured the poisonous ancestor at this time, his skill naturally achieved 
an extremely rapid breakthrough and growth.

boom!

The second level of Xuanzhao Realm!

boom!

The third heaven of Xuanzhao Realm!

boom!

The fourth level of Xuanzhao Realm!

boom!

The fifth level of Xuanzhao Realm!

boom!

The sixth level of Xuanzhao Realm!

boom!

The seventh heaven of Xuanzhao Realm! !



At this time, Ye Feng's cultivation level suddenly increased tremendously, directly breaking through 
the sixth level of heaven, from the first level of Xuanzhao realm, to the seventh level of Xuanzhao 
realm.

This huge breakthrough naturally made Ye Feng very excited and happy.

This time, the Poisonous Ancestor set a trap and ambushed them to poison them all, but was killed 
by Ye Feng instead. It can be said to be an unexpected surprise.

However, Ye Feng was also very fortunate that he happened to meet a person like the Poisonous 
Ancestor this time.

Because Ye Feng knew very well that if a strong man with other attributes and four or five realms 
higher than him came, he would not be his opponent at all.

Because the killing weapon that the Poisonous Ancestor was most proud of, that is, the poisonous 
gas he cultivated, had no effect on Ye Feng at all. Ye Feng was immune to poison gas, so he was 
able to break through the trap of the poisonous formation so easily, and was also immune to the 
poisonous gas attack launched by the Poisonous Ancestor, killing the Poisonous Ancestor. 
Otherwise,
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If so, Ye Feng could only use and open up a space wormhole and escape with everyone.

However, if it weren't for the character of the Poisonous Ancestor, Hei Wuchang, as an old strong 
man, could also directly fight against him, and maybe he could kill him directly at that time.

So this time Ye Feng took the lion's share because Ye Feng was not afraid of the poisonous gas.

At this time, after Ye Feng's cultivation had a breakthrough, he took the storage ring from the body 
of the Poisonous Ancestor.

At this moment, Ye Feng searched the storage ring of the Poisonous Ancestor, and his eyes suddenly 
lit up.



Because there were a lot of wealth in the storage ring of the Poisonous Ancestor.

Most of these wealth were some very strange treasures and utensils with various poisonous 
properties, as well as some poisonous insect nests, etc.

Ye Feng himself could not use these things, but when he returned to the palace and sold them in the 
black market, he could definitely earn a lot of wealth.

At this moment, after Ye Feng finished searching, he immediately looked at Hei Wuchang, Princess 
Qiqi and others behind him, and said with a smile: "Let's go, let's go back to the palace directly."

Hearing Ye Feng say this, everyone nodded.

Princess Qiqi's eyes were very cold at this moment, and she said: "When I return to the palace this 
time, I will report to my brother, the Crown Prince, that the commander of the Black Armor Army 
must be thrown into prison, and the family behind him must be directly confiscated. He dared to 
send assassins to kill members of the royal family privately. He is really bold." At this time, Hei 
Wuchang cut off the head of the Poisonous Ancestor, and his eyes were also very cold. He said: 
"The head of this Poisonous Ancestor can be used as evidence. Take it back directly and convict the 
commander of the Black Armor Army directly, including the family behind him. Convict 
thoroughly!" Obviously, even an old strong man like Hei Wuchang couldn't suppress his anger and 
murderous intent at this time. Because if Ye Feng was not immune to the poisonous air this time, 
perhaps all of them would be buried here. This commander of the Black Armor Army, including the 
so-called old patriarch of the family behind him, is really abominable. He actually hired such a 
vicious existence as the Poisonous Ancestor to set a trap and kill them.

Chapter 5124 The Prince is Frightened and Furious

At this time, Ye Feng nodded and said loudly: "Let's continue returning to the palace of the Daxuan 
Dynasty. Now that the biggest threat, the Poison Ancestor, has been completely eradicated, there 
should be no big danger next. "

Hearing what Ye Feng said, everyone nodded. Hei Wuchang also put the poisonous father's head as 
evidence in his storage ring.

Next, everyone continued to fly into the air, flying quickly towards the palace of the Daxuan 
Dynasty.



Sure enough, everyone did not encounter any danger after that, because within the territory of the 
Daxuan Dynasty, except for the deep-rooted dynasty leaders like the commander of the Black 
Armored Army, no one had the courage to ambush Ye Feng and his group. .

After all, whether Hei Wuchang is the protector of His Royal Highness the Crown Prince, or 
Princess Qiqi is the only princess in the royal family, the status of this group of people is very 
noble.

At this time, everyone returned to the palace, and Princess Qiqi immediately said: "Let's go directly 
to our brother."

Hei Wuchang also nodded and said loudly: "His Royal Highness the Crown Prince has the full right 
to decide this matter, and there is no need to report it to His Majesty the Emperor."

Ye Feng also nodded at this time. After all, a figure like the commander of the Black Armored 
Army, although his status is still very high, is not high enough to report to His Majesty the Emperor.

After all, the Emperor of the Daxuan Dynasty seems to have fallen into seclusion and is practicing 
some very mysterious and powerful techniques, so many things will basically be decided by the 
prince.

And Ye Feng knew very well that it was probably the fake Dark Demon Emperor disguised as the 
emperor who had obtained something very special and was refining it silently.

After all, if His Majesty the Emperor in the disguise of the Dark Demon Emperor wants to practice, 
he will definitely emit extremely strong demonic energy. Therefore, if he does not announce a 
retreat from the outside world, someone may accidentally see the current state of the Emperor when 
he is practicing. The demonic aura all over his body will definitely expose the identity of this Dark 
Demon Emperor completely.

Ye Feng had some guesses in his mind at this time, but he didn't say much.

Because Ye Feng now knows very well that before he is sure that he can deal with the Dark Demon 
Emperor, he cannot act rashly, otherwise he will alert the snake. If the Dark Demon Emperor goes 
crazy, it is estimated that the entire imperial city of the Daxuan Dynasty will fall into a disaster, 
which will be extremely extreme. horrifying.



You must know that the existence of the Demon Emperor level among the dark demons is 
extremely powerful. To deal with such a vicious enemy, you must plan slowly and not act rashly.

At this moment, Princess Qiqi came to the palace where His Royal Highness lived angrily.

Ye Feng and Hei Wuchang also followed Princess Qiqi.

At this time, Princess Qiqi came to the palace where His Royal Highness the Prince lived, and 
shouted directly: "Brother, come out quickly, this time I am really angry to death!"

After finishing speaking, His Highness the Crown Prince's figure appeared in front of everyone and 
walked out of the palace.

At this moment, the prince looked at his irritable sister, couldn't help but shook his head and smiled, 
and said loudly: "Qiqi, you are already a grown-up, why are you still so irritable when something 
happens? As my elder Your Highness, the princess of the Xuan Dynasty, how can you behave like 
this?"

Hearing what the prince said, Ye Feng smiled slightly and said, "Your Highness, Princess Qiqi is 
really angry this time. Listen carefully to what she said."
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"Um?"

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the prince showed a look of surprise in his eyes.

Because the prince knew that Ye Feng was not a person who did not distinguish between right and 
wrong, but a very stable young prodigy.

So at this time, Ye Feng explained for Princess Qiqi. The prince naturally looked at Princess Qiqi 
and couldn't help but ask: "What happened to you? Why are you so impatient and angry?"

Princess Qiqi said directly at this time: "Brother Prince, when we returned to the palace from the 
border city, we encountered the poisonous ancestor ambushing and intercepting us on the way."



"What?"

Hearing what Princess Qiqi said, the prince's face immediately turned fierce, and he couldn't help 
but say: "The Venomous Ancestor, the most ruthless and vicious old monster in the legend of our 
Daxuan Dynasty, actually ambush you and sneak up on you. Then how did you come back alive? 
Logically speaking, you should be dead by now."

Hearing what the prince said, Princess Qiqi immediately stretched out her white little hand, grabbed 
Ye Feng's palm, and said very proudly: "This time it's all because Ye Feng saved us. Ye Feng has 
extremely powerful With his physique and body functions, he was immune to the poisonous energy 
of the poisonous ancestor, so he successfully helped us return to the palace and killed the poisonous 
ancestor. "

"What?"

Hearing what his biological sister said, the prince's eyes widened and he stared at Ye Feng for a 
moment. It seemed that he couldn't believe that a young man like Ye Feng could kill such a 
poisonous ancestor. Peerless old monster.

After all, you must know that the reputation of the Venomous Ancestor in the Daxuan Dynasty is 
really terrifying. Anyone who hears the name of the Venomous Ancestor will tremble all over and 
dare not discuss anything, let alone Go and confront the poisonous ancestor directly.

Unexpectedly, his sister actually said that Ye Feng directly killed the poisonous ancestor. This is 
really incredible.

At this time, Ye Feng smiled slightly and said: "Thanks to the help of Senior Hei Wuchang and 
others, otherwise, we would not have been able to kill the poisonous ancestor so smoothly."

After Ye Feng finished speaking, Hei Wuchang sighed and said: "Young Master Ye Feng is really 
too humble. This time, Young Master Ye Feng is the main force. Even I inhaled a trace of poisonous 
gas and completely lost my fighting power. If it hadn’t been for Mr. Ye Feng, we wouldn’t have 
been able to come back alive.”

After saying that, Hei Wuchang took out the poisonous ancestor's head that he had cut off before 
from his storage ring and threw it on the ground.



At this moment, seeing the head of the poisonous ancestor, the prince completely believed it.

He couldn't help but look at Hei Wuchang, his expression was a little serious, and he said loudly: 
"Hei Lao, what is going on? Why did the Venomous Ancestor ambush and intercept you?"

At this time, Hei Wuchang's eyes also turned cold, and he said loudly: "This is why Her Royal 
Highness Princess Qiqi is angry."

At this time, Princess Qiqi hurriedly said: "It's all because the commander-in-chief of the Black-
armored Army, the old head of the family behind the commander-in-chief of the Black-armored 
Army, invited a terrible person like the Venomous Ancestor to want... Poisoned us all."

"What?"

Hearing what Princess Qiqi said, the prince showed a look of shock and anger in his eyes, and said 
loudly: "The commander of the Black Armored Army is one of the ten imperial guards who protect 
the royal family of our Daxuan Dynasty. Why do you think so?" To kill you, this is so audacious!" 
At this time, Ye Feng nodded and said loudly: "Let's continue returning to the palace of the Daxuan 
Dynasty. Now that the biggest threat, the poisonous ancestor, has been completely eradicated, 
what's next? There shouldn’t be much danger.”

Hearing what Ye Feng said, everyone nodded. Hei Wuchang also put the poisonous father's head as 
evidence in his storage ring.

Next, everyone continued to fly into the air and flew quickly towards the palace of the Daxuan 
Dynasty.

Sure enough, everyone did not encounter any danger after that, because within the territory of the 
Daxuan Dynasty, except for the deep-rooted dynasty leaders like the commander of the Black 
Armored Army, no one had the courage to ambush Ye Feng and his group. .

After all, whether Hei Wuchang is the protector of His Royal Highness the Crown Prince, or 
Princess Qiqi is the only princess in the royal family, the status of this group of people is very 
noble.



At this time, everyone returned to the palace, and Princess Qiqi immediately said: "Let's go directly 
to our brother."

Hei Wuchang also nodded and said loudly: "His Royal Highness the Crown Prince has the full right 
to decide this matter, and there is no need to report it to His Majesty the Emperor."

Ye Feng also nodded at this time. After all, a figure like the commander of the Black Armored 
Army, although his status is still very high, is not high enough to report to His Majesty the Emperor.

After all, the Emperor of the Daxuan Dynasty seems to have fallen into seclusion and is practicing 
some very mysterious and powerful techniques, so many things will basically be decided by the 
prince.

And Ye Feng knew very well that it was probably the fake Dark Demon Emperor disguised as the 
emperor who had obtained something very special and was refining it silently.

After all, if His Majesty the Emperor in the disguise of the Dark Demon Emperor wants to practice, 
he will definitely emit extremely strong demonic energy. Therefore, if he does not declare a retreat 
from the outside world, someone may accidentally see the current state of the Emperor when he is 
practicing. The demonic aura all over his body will definitely expose the identity of this Dark 
Demon Emperor completely.

Ye Feng had some guesses in his mind at this time, but he didn't say much.

Because Ye Feng now knows very well that before he is sure that he can deal with the Dark Demon 
Emperor, he cannot act rashly, otherwise he will alert the snake. If the Dark Demon Emperor goes 
crazy, it is estimated that the entire imperial city of the Daxuan Dynasty will fall into a disaster, 
which will be extremely extreme. horrifying.

You must know that the existence of the Demon Emperor level among the dark demons is 
extremely powerful. To deal with such a vicious enemy, you must plan slowly and not act rashly.

At this moment, Princess Qiqi came angrily to the palace where His Royal Highness lived.

Ye Feng and Hei Wuchang also followed Princess Qiqi.



At this time, Princess Qiqi came to the palace where His Royal Highness the Prince lived, and 
shouted directly: "Brother, come out quickly, this time I am really angry to death!"

After finishing speaking, His Highness the Crown Prince appeared in front of everyone and walked 
out of the palace.

At this moment, the prince looked at his irritable sister, couldn't help but shook his head and smiled, 
and said loudly: "Qiqi, you are already a grown-up, why are you still so irritable when something 
happens? As my elder Your Highness, the princess of the Xuan Dynasty, how can you behave like 
this?"

Hearing what the prince said, Ye Feng smiled slightly and said, "Your Highness, Princess Qiqi is 
really angry this time. Listen carefully to what she said."
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"Um?"

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the prince showed a look of surprise in his eyes.

Because the prince knew that Ye Feng was not a person who did not distinguish between right and 
wrong, but a very stable young prodigy.

So at this time, Ye Feng explained for Princess Qiqi. The prince naturally looked at Princess Qiqi 
and couldn't help but ask: "What happened to you? Why are you so impatient and angry?"

Princess Qiqi said directly at this time: "Brother Prince, when we returned to the palace from the 
border city, we encountered the poisonous ancestor ambushing and intercepting us on the way."

"What?"

Hearing what Princess Qiqi said, the prince's face immediately turned fierce, and he couldn't help 
but say: "The Venomous Ancestor, the most ruthless and vicious old monster in the legend of our 
Daxuan Dynasty, actually ambush you and sneak up on you. Then how did you come back alive? 
Logically speaking, you should be dead by now."



Hearing what the prince said, Princess Qiqi immediately stretched out her white little hand, grabbed 
Ye Feng's palm, and said very proudly: "This time it's all because Ye Feng saved us. Ye Feng has 
extremely powerful With his physique and body functions, he was immune to the poisonous energy 
of the poisonous ancestor, so he successfully helped us return to the palace and killed the poisonous 
ancestor. "

"What?"

Hearing what his biological sister said, the prince's eyes widened and he stared at Ye Feng for a 
moment. It seemed that he couldn't believe that a young man like Ye Feng could kill such a 
poisonous ancestor. Peerless old monster.

After all, you must know that the reputation of the Venomous Ancestor in the Daxuan Dynasty is 
really terrifying. Anyone who hears the name of the Venomous Ancestor will tremble all over and 
dare not discuss anything, let alone Let’s go directly to confront the poisonous ancestor.

Unexpectedly, his sister actually said that Ye Feng directly killed the poisonous ancestor. This is 
really incredible.

At this time, Ye Feng smiled slightly and said: "Thanks to the help of Senior Hei Wuchang and 
others, otherwise, we would not have been able to kill the poisonous ancestor so smoothly."

After Ye Feng finished speaking, Hei Wuchang sighed and said: "Young Master Ye Feng is really 
too humble. This time, Young Master Ye Feng is the main force. Even I inhaled a trace of poisonous 
gas and completely lost my fighting power. If it hadn’t been for Mr. Ye Feng, we wouldn’t have 
been able to come back alive.”

After saying that, Hei Wuchang took out the poisonous ancestor's head that he had cut off before 
from his storage ring and threw it on the ground.

At this moment, seeing the head of the poisonous ancestor, the prince completely believed it.

He couldn't help but look at Hei Wuchang, his expression was a little serious, and he said loudly: 
"Hei Lao, what is going on? Why did the Venomous Ancestor ambush and intercept you?"



Hei Wuchang's eyes also turned cold at this time, and he said loudly: "This is why Her Royal 
Highness Princess Qiqi is angry."

At this time, Princess Qiqi hurriedly said: "It's all because the commander-in-chief of the Black-
armored Army, the old head of the family behind the commander-in-chief of the Black-armored 
Army, invited a terrible person like the Venomous Ancestor to want... Poisoned us all."

"What?"

Hearing what Princess Qiqi said, the prince showed a look of shock and anger in his eyes, and said 
loudly: "The commander of the Black Armored Army is one of the ten imperial guards who protect 
the royal family of our Daxuan Dynasty. Why do you think so?" To kill you is so audacious!”

Chapter 5125 Going to jail

Hearing what the prince said at this moment, Princess Qiqi immediately said: "Because the former 
commander-in-chief of the Black Armored Army wanted to kill Ye Feng, and even sent a 
mysterious killer in black to assassinate Ye Feng. As a result, I Senior Hei Wuchang resisted, so the 
commander of the Black Armor Army hated all of us because of this, and wanted to get rid of all of 
us, including the family behind him, because only Only the old head of the family behind the leader 
of the Black Armored Army is qualified to hire such a vicious person as the Poison Patriarch."

"So that's it."

Hearing Princess Qiqi's explanation, the anger on the prince's face became even more intense, and 
he said directly: "This commander-in-chief of the Black Armored Army is so brave."

When he said this, the prince suddenly frowned and said loudly: "But I can't convict him directly. 
Otherwise, I would be exercising my father's rights. But now my father is in deep trouble." In 
retreat, you don’t care about worldly affairs, so this matter is still a bit tricky.”

Hearing what the prince said, Princess Qiqi immediately spoke out in a very angry voice: "Brother, 
please do justice for once! Now that the evidence is available, the head of the poisonous ancestor is 
in our hands."

After hearing Princess Qiqi's request, the prince seemed to want to say something else. After all, he 
had a lot of worries.



But at this time, Ye Feng suddenly came to the prince's side, looked at the prince meaningfully, and 
then said in the prince's ear: "Prince, the current emperor is no longer the real emperor." Yes, I 
wonder if you have investigated clearly during this period?"??

Hearing Ye Feng's words, the prince's face suddenly changed. Then the prince nodded, looked at 
Princess Qiqi and Hei Wuchang in front of him, and said loudly: "Okay, this time I will do it for 
you." You uphold justice and there is no need to report to the emperor."

Obviously, during the time that Ye Feng left, the prince probably found out that his father was not 
his biological father at all, but a terrifying demon who practiced magic.

So at this time, the prince didn't want to report anything to the current emperor. He just took 
Princess Qiqi and Hei Wuchang and walked quickly towards the residence of the commander of the 
Black Armored Army.

Ye Feng also followed behind at this time, and the group came directly to the residence of the 
commander of the Black Armored Army.

The commander-in-chief of the Black Armored Army lives in the southwest area of the palace.
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Some of them are the residences of various powerful people, and they are where the commanders of 
the imperial guards of the Daxuan Dynasty lived.

Almost all the commanders of the ten imperial guards live in this place.

At this moment, the prince led everyone directly to the residence of the commander of the Black 
Armor Army, and then said coldly: "Commander of the Black Armor Army, come out and confess 
your crime!"

After the prince finished speaking, a middle-aged man wearing black armor immediately walked 
out of the mansion in front of him.

It is the commander of the Black Armored Army!



At this moment, the commander of the Black Armored Army stared at Ye Feng standing behind the 
prince for a moment. His eyes were full of deep astonishment, and he couldn't help but said: "Your 
boy is not dead yet?"

At this moment, Ye Feng smiled coldly and said: "Many people used to want to kill me, but in the 
end they all died themselves. But I am still alive and well, and I have lived until now."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the commander of the Black Armored Army immediately understood. 
He reported it to the family and asked the family to send assassins to assassinate Ye Feng. It can be 
said that all the missions have failed.

At this time, seeing the prince looking like he was raising an army to accuse him, the commander of 
the Black Armored Army had a ferocious look in his eyes, and he burst out with terrifying 
cultivation power and charged towards the prince, trying to kill the prince. He was imprisoned and 
seemed to be using this to blackmail everyone.

But at this time, everyone around him was already on guard. Hei Wuchang took the lead and used a 
big black hand. In an instant, he was on par with the commander of the black armored army.

It has to be said that Hei Wuchang, as one of the four guardians of His Highness the Crown Prince, 
is indeed powerful. However, he had encountered a poison master like the Poison Ancestor before, 
so he lost his fighting power in an instant.

Under normal conditions, Hei Wuchang is still very powerful.

At this time, a group of golden armored guards swarmed around and quickly subdued the 
commander of the black armored army.

At this time, Hei Wuchang led a group of golden armored guards and directly attacked Hei 
Wuchang.

The commander-in-chief of Army A was trapped by Suo, and then forced him to kneel on the 
ground and came to Ye Feng and the prince.



At this time, the prince slowly spoke out: "Leave the commander of the Black Armored Army to Ye 
Feng to handle."

Ye Feng nodded slightly at this time and walked up to the commander of the black armored army.

At this moment, the eyes of the commander of the Black Armored Army were filled with 
overwhelming anger and murderous intent, and he said loudly: "Boy, I didn't expect you to be so 
tough, but you have offended me and our family, and you will definitely die."

At this moment, Ye Feng only showed a faint smile in his eyes. Looking at the commander of the 
black armored army who was oppressed and kneeling on the ground in front of him, he just said 
lightly: "You are already a prisoner, and you still dare to speak harshly."

After finishing speaking, Ye Feng waved his hand lightly and said: "First, put the commander of the 
Black Armored Army in prison, and then force him to find out that this commander of the Black 
Armored Army attempted to murder Princess Qiqi, me and a group of royal family members. 
conspiracy to determine the crime of the entire family behind the leader of the Black Armored 
Army."

"What?"

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the commander of the Black Armored Army suddenly shouted with 
anger and unwillingness: "One person does the work and the other takes responsibility! Everything 
was planned by me and has nothing to do with the family behind me." .??.

The commander of the Black-armored Army was filled with shock and anger at this time, because 
he never thought that Ye Feng would not only put him in prison, but also use this to destroy the 
entire family behind him. This was the commander-in-chief of the Black-armored Army. The leader 
couldn't bear it.

But at this time, Princess Qiqi said coldly: "Stop defending. The poisonous ancestor who wanted to 
murder us has already said it. You, a small commander of the black-armored army, cannot possibly 
Please ask him to assassinate us. It is the poisonous ancestor hired by the old patriarch of the family 
behind you. He wants to kill us, so the family behind you will also pay a huge price for this. "

Hearing what Princess Qiqi said, the commander of the Black Armored Army immediately showed 
deep fear in his eyes.



He never expected that such a terrifying figure as the Venomous Ancestor would take action, but not 
kill Ye Feng and others.

At this moment, the commander of the Black Armored Army immediately showed deep despair and 
despair on his face.
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A look of horror.

At this time, the prince also waved his hand and said loudly: "Just do what Ye Feng said, first put 
the commander of the Black Armored Army into prison, and let him personally admit that the old 
head of the family behind him is also involved. for this murder of our royal family.”

When he said this, the prince looked at Ye Feng beside him, patted Ye Feng's shoulder, and said 
loudly: "Next, I will send many strong men to assist you, Ye Feng, to take down the black armored 
army commander from behind. The whole family has been confiscated, but all the wealth needs to 
be reported and handed over to the royal treasury of our entire Daxuan Dynasty. "

Hearing what the prince said, Ye Feng's eyes immediately lit up and he said, "Okay, prince, don't 
worry, I will take care of this matter."

Ye Feng knew very well that the fact that the prince was able to put the entire commander-in-chief 
of the Black-armored Army into prison and let him ransack his home was enough to show that the 
prince valued him very much and wanted to personally solve the commander-in-chief of the Black-
armored Army and him. Behind the whole family's troubles, in this case, Ye Feng will have no 
trouble in the palace in the future.

At this time, Hei Wuchang's eyes also lit up, because Hei Wuchang is an older generation and 
knows very well that if a family is confiscated in the palace, especially a big family like the leader 
of the Black Armored Army, there will definitely be a lot of money, although most of the wealth 
will be handed over to the Daxuan Dynasty. of the royal treasury, but the person who presided over 
the house confiscation would definitely be able to make some money.



At this moment, Hei Wuchang immediately said: "Let me help Ye Feng and protect Ye Feng. After 
all, in the family behind the leader of the Black Armored Army, there may be older and stronger 
people who would hate young people like Ye Feng. cause harm."

Ye Feng also nodded immediately at this time and said loudly: "Senior Hei Wuchang's cultivation is 
very powerful and he is a peerless master among the elders. If Senior Hei Wuchang assists me, there 
will be absolutely no problem."

The prince was too lazy to care about these trivial matters at this time, but nodded and said aloud: 
"Okay, the task of running the family of the Black Armored Army will be left to you two. After the 
house raid is over, Ye Feng, remember Come to me, I have something to tell you."

After saying that, the prince took Princess Qiqi and left the scene directly.

At this moment, Ye Feng and Hei Wuchang looked at each other, with deep smiles on their faces.

Chapter 5126 Residual Value

Next, Ye Feng and Hei Wuchang directly led more than a dozen golden armored guards and took 
the resisting black armored commander directly into the prison.

The prince and Princess Qiqi had already left the scene.

At this moment, in the extremely dark prison inside the palace, the commander of the Black 
Armored Army was pierced by black chains all over his body and tied to a torture rack.

At this moment, Hei Wuchang was leading a dozen golden armored guards, constantly torturing the 
commander of the black armored army, making him spit out the true information.

Ye Feng, on the other hand, was sitting on a rattan rocking chair not far away, eyes slightly closed, 
waiting silently.

In the midst of endless torture, the commander of the Black Armored Army finally gave in.

The old head of the family behind him was also involved in this murder. ??



And the reason for their murder was not only because they had a grudge against Ye Feng, but 
because they seemed to be instructed by some very scary and mysterious figure behind the scenes to 
take advantage of every opportunity to assassinate and eliminate as many members of the Daxuan 
Dynasty royal family as possible. member.

After receiving the news, even Hei Wuchang, an elder and strong man, felt frightened and couldn't 
help but said in anger: "This leader of the Black Armored Army and the group of people behind his 
family are... Who is the mastermind behind the scenes? He is so bold and wants to silently get rid of 
every member of our Daxuan Dynasty royal family. This is simply crazy! Our Daxuan Dynasty is 
considered the overlord in the entire land of Zhongzhou. Who among the top powers dares to target 
the royal family of our Daxuan Dynasty like this?”

Hearing what Hei Wuchang said, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly showed a flash of color.

The commander of the Black Armored Army and the family behind him, and those behind the 
scenes may be the Dark Demon Emperor disguised as His Majesty the Emperor.

Because Ye Feng knew very well that the Dark Demon Emperor, disguised as the current emperor 
of the Daxuan Dynasty, must have wanted to slowly control the entire Daxuan Dynasty's royal 
family.

So if he sets up a strategy to slowly get rid of the real royal members of the Daxuan Dynasty royal 
family, then
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Then among the royal family in the entire palace, the Dark Demon Emperor can be the only one in 
the family, and there is no need to be so cautious in hiding his true identity.

Because no matter how powerful the Dark Demon Emperor is, there are still many extremely 
powerful elders of the royal family living in the small world of the royal family. Therefore, the Dark 
Demon Emperor cannot directly reveal his true identity, otherwise both sides will suffer.

But he can use conspiracies and traps to continuously murder official members of the royal family. 
In this case, after all the members of the entire royal family are eliminated one by one, the Dark 
Devil Emperor can dominate the palace and royal family of the entire dynasty. , cultivate your own 
cronies, you can truly slowly control the entire Daxuan Dynasty's royal family, and slowly replace 
the entire Daxuan Dynasty's royal family with your own dark demons.



At this moment, after Ye Feng thought of this, his heart became more and more urgent.

It seemed like he was going to speed up.

After completely solving all the troubles of the Black Armored Army Commander and the family 
behind him this time, Ye Feng was going to ask the Giant Spirit God Ax about its wishes to see if 
the Giant Spirit God Ax was willing to temporarily suppress the entire dynasty. The instrument of 
luck was exchanged for the Imperial Jade Seal, so that he could rescue the real emperor Xuan Wuji.

While Ye Feng was thinking in his heart, Hei Wuchang looked at the half-dead Commander-in-
Chief of the Black-armored Army in front of him and said loudly: "He has already recruited 
everything. We can go directly to the Commander-in-Chief of the Black-armored Army." The 
family behind it was charged and then the house was ransacked. "

Hearing what Hei Wuchang said, Ye Feng also became interested, nodded, and said loudly: "Okay, 
senior Hei Wuchang, go and make preparations. Leave this commander of the Black Armored Army 
to me now, and let me exploit him." Use the rest of it."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, Hei Wuchang seemed to understand what Ye Feng wanted to do, and 
immediately looked to his side very cooperatively.

A dozen golden-armored guards spoke out: "Let's leave. Mr. Ye Feng has something special to say 
to the commander of the black-armored army."

After saying that, Hei Wuchang left the prison directly with a dozen golden armored guards, leaving 
Ye Feng and the commander of the black armored army alone in the prison.

At this moment, the commander of the Black Armored Army had been tortured to death. He looked 
at Ye Feng and said, "I have already recruited them all. I have no remaining value. Give me a happy 
life and let me die completely." Bar."

At this moment, looking at the commander of the black armored army in front of him, Ye Feng 
smiled mysteriously and said: "No, no, no, of course you still have huge residual value."

Uh-huh! .??.



After finishing speaking, Ye Feng suddenly stretched out a hand, opened his palm, and his five 
fingers were like iron bars. He immediately clasped it on the head of the commander of the black 
armored army. He instantly released the Devouring Domain and began to fight crazily. Absorb the 
powerful skills and blood energy of the commander of the black armored army.

"ah!!"

At this moment, the eyes of the commander of the Black Armored Army suddenly showed a look of 
horror, and he shouted in horror: "What are you doing? You can actually rob me of the skills that I 
have worked hard to cultivate all my life. How is this possible? ? No! I have worked hard for 
decades to make a wedding dress for you!"

However, the shouts of the commander of the black armored army had no effect at all.

In the horrified and desperate eyes of the commander of the black armored army, Ye Feng 
successfully absorbed all the skills of the commander of the black armored army.

Ye Feng's cultivation aura suddenly broke through quickly.

After all, you must know that although the commander of the Black Armored Army is not as 
powerful as an old senior like Hei Wuchang, he is still very powerful. After all, as the commander 
of the Heijia Army, one of the top ten imperial guards of the Daxuan Dynasty, he is naturally very 
powerful. What's so powerful is that it has two brushes.

Therefore, the skills he provided to Ye Feng were still very

# Every time verification appears, please do not use incognito mode!

huge.

After Ye Feng absorbed the blood energy and skills of the entire Black Armored Army commander, 
his cultivation level immediately began to make breakthroughs one after another.

boom!



The eighth level of Xuanzao Realm!

boom!

The ninth level of Xuanzhao Realm!

boom!

The tenth level of Xuanzhao Realm is complete! !

At this time, after Ye Feng devoured the power and energy of the entire Black Armored Army 
commander, his cultivation level suddenly broke through the third level of heaven. From the 
seventh level of Xuanzhao realm, he directly improved and broke through to the tenth level of 
Xuanzhao realm, making Ye Feng perfect. Feng's skill immediately increased tremendously, and his 
combat effectiveness also improved a lot.

This made Ye Feng very satisfied.

The residual value of this black-armored commander is still very good.

At this moment, Ye Feng walked out of the prison after devouring the entire Black Armored Army 
commander.

When Ye Feng walked out, Hei Wuchang and a group of golden armored guards were waiting for 
Ye Feng to come out.

At this moment, the eyes of many golden armored guards looking at Ye Feng were full of 
inexplicable fear.

Obviously, in the prison just now, the leader of the black-armored army screamed like a slaughtered 
pig, which must have frightened the group of golden-armored guards waiting outside. They don't 
know what terrible things Ye Feng did inside. matter.



Hei Wuchang was already used to it, and he said with a smile: "Master Ye Feng, let us first inform 
His Highness the Crown Prince about what is going on here and the information about the 
recruitment of the Commander-in-Chief of the Black Armor Army, and then His Highness the 
Crown Prince can legitimately issue the summons. , let’s go to the family behind the leader of the 
Black Armored Army to raid their homes.”

Hearing Hei Wuchang's arrangement, Ye Feng immediately nodded and said with a smile: "Okay, it 
seems that senior Hei Wuchang is already familiar with this kind of thing. The procedures are clear. 
Everything is arranged by senior Hei Wuchang. Yes, let’s go to the prince’s place now.”

Chapter 5127 Appointment

At this time, Ye Feng, Hei Wuchang and a group of more than a dozen golden armored guards left 
the prison area of the Daxuan Dynasty royal family and walked quickly towards the place where the 
prince lived.

Soon, they arrived at the place where the prince lived.

At this time, Hei Wuchang walked directly into the prince's palace and said loudly: "Your Highness, 
we have tortured out all the information that the commander of the Black Armored Army knows."

Hearing what Hei Wuchang said, the prince walked out from the inside of the palace and couldn't 
help but asked: "Since you have asked, then you can go directly to the family behind the 
commander of the Black Armored Army to inspect and question the crime."

Hei Wuchang suddenly spoke out at this time: "Your Highness, not only did we torture and 
interrogate from the mouth of the commander of the Black Armored Army, the information about 
the family behind him participating in the assassination of our royal family members, but we also 
discovered a more... Big secret."??

"oh?"

Hearing Hei Wuchang's solemn words, the prince also showed a look of surprise in his eyes, and 
asked aloud: "What else did you torture out?"

Hei Wuchang said slowly: "The family behind the commander-in-chief of the Black-armored Army 
seems to have a very mysterious and powerful behind-the-scenes instigator. They instruct the family 
behind the commander-in-chief of the Black-armored Army to hire some terrible people. The 
assassin, assassinating the royal members of our Daxuan Dynasty, seems to be a vicious plan 



specifically targeting the royal members of our Daxuan Dynasty, and wants to wipe out all the royal 
members of the Daxuan Dynasty. "

"What?"

Hearing what Hei Wuchang said, the prince's eyes suddenly became extremely frightened and 
angry, as if he never thought that this matter would be more complicated than imagined.

Not only was the personal grudge between the commander of the Black Armored Army and Ye 
Feng involved, but it also involved a mysterious behind-the-scenes instigator who secretly 
controlled some powerful families in the Daxuan Dynasty to assassinate real members of the royal 
family.

At this time, the prince's eyes suddenly flickered, and then he glanced at Ye Feng.

The prince happened to see it, and Ye Feng
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He was also looking at him all the time.

The two looked at each other and seemed to understand the meaning in each other's eyes.

That is the mysterious commander behind the Black Armored Army and his family. It is very likely 
that he is related to the Dark Demon Emperor who is now disguised as the emperor.

Hei Wuchang didn't know about this because it involved too much.

So at this time, Ye Feng and the prince looked at each other and did not say anything directly.

Because the more people know about it, the more likely they are to alert others.

So at this time, the prince glanced at Hei Wuchang and said loudly: "You go down first, I have 
something special to tell Ye Feng."



When Hei Wuchang heard this, his eyes flickered, and then he smiled and said, "Yes, Your 
Highness."

Hei Wuchang is a senior figure and has been following the prince for many years, so he naturally 
knows that if the prince asks him to leave at this time, there must be secret matters to discuss.

Hei Wuchang thought of this and glanced at Ye Feng meaningfully.

He suddenly felt that Ye Feng, the latest young man to come to the Daxuan Dynasty, would be 
reused by His Highness the Crown Prince in the future, and his cultivation talent was so terrifying 
that he would definitely be able to become the leader of the entire Daxuan Dynasty, or even the 
entire Wanwan Dynasty. A big shot in the land of Zhongzhou in the demon world.

At this time, Hei Wuchang paid more and more attention to Ye Feng's heart.

Before, he felt that Ye Feng was just a young genius who would take a long time to grow in the 
future. In his eyes, Ye Feng was just a junior.

However, at this time, after witnessing Ye Feng's various powerful methods and the importance His 
Highness the Crown Prince attached to Ye Feng, Hei Wuchang naturally paid more and more 
attention to Ye Feng.

At this moment, Hei Wuchang was preparing to retreat, but it was too late

Zizi seemed to have thought of something, and suddenly stopped Hei Wuchang, and said loudly: 
"By the way, since we are going to ransack the house, and it is such a big family, we must not only 
have a good reputation, but also have a legitimate name. Hei Wuchang, your The identity is enough, 
but Ye Feng has no identity now. He can't be allowed to raid homes as a royal guard. That would be 
too cheap and would not convince the public, so I decided to appoint Ye Feng as the latest Black 
Armored Army Commander, the former Commander-in-Chief of the Black Armored Army was 
directly convicted and died for the following crimes. He attempted to murder members of the royal 
family. In the future, the Commander-in-Chief of the Black Armored Army, one of the top ten 
Imperial Guards, will be Ye Fenglai, and Ye Feng will serve as the leader of the Black Family. The 
military commander can also be in close contact with me at all times, which is also of great benefit 
to me. "



"What?"

Hearing what the prince said, Hei Wuchang suddenly showed a look of deep horror in his eyes. It 
seemed that he did not expect that Ye Feng was so valued by His Highness the prince, and he 
directly appointed Ye Feng as the commander-in-chief of the Hei Family Army.

You must know that the Black Armor Army is one of the top ten imperial guards. The position of 
commander of the Black Armor Army is definitely the second rank, second only to those ministers 
in the court.

Moreover, the commander-in-chief of the Black Armored Army is still a position of real power. He 
can control the Black Armored Army, one of the ten largest imperial guards. There are hundreds of 
thousands of them, all of whom are the best of the best.

At this moment, Hei Wuchang immediately understood that His Highness the Crown Prince 
intended to train Ye Feng to become the pillar of the entire Daxuan Dynasty royal family in the 
future.

At this time, Hei Wuchang couldn't help but look at Ye Feng, his tone became quite polite, and he 
said: "Then I would like to congratulate Young Master Ye Feng in advance for becoming the new 
generation commander of the Black Armored Army, oh no, Now we can no longer call Ye Feng a 
young master, he should be called Master Ye."

It has to be said that Hei Wuchang is an older person who is very observant. As one of the 
protectors of His Royal Highness, Hei Wuchang naturally has a very high emotional intelligence.

At this time, I heard Hei Wuchang calling
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Mr. Ye, Ye Feng suddenly smiled in surprise, and then said aloud: "Senior Hei Wuchang is serious."

Hei Wuchang immediately shook his head and said: "Since Mr. Ye has become the commander of 
the Black Armor Army, and his status is higher than mine, I naturally have to use the honorific title, 
otherwise it will be too shameful."



When he said this, Hei Wuchang clasped his fists at the prince again and said loudly: "Master Ye 
Feng will be the new generation commander of the Black Armor Army. I will truthfully pass on this 
news. When the time comes, the leader of the Black Armor Army will I will also ask people from 
the Palace Supervisory Authority to make the commander’s identity token as soon as possible and 
give it to Lord Ye Feng.”

After saying that, Hei Wuchang retreated directly from the palace.

At this moment, Ye Feng was also a little unbelievable. It seemed that he did not expect that the 
prince would directly make himself the commander of the new generation of black armor army. 
This was a very high position.

At this time, Ye Feng immediately smiled and said: "Thank you for your attention, Prince."

At this time, the prince smiled slightly and said loudly: "You have made great achievements this 
time, and you are naturally qualified to become the new generation commander of the Black 
Armored Army."

After finishing speaking, the prince suddenly looked at Ye Feng, his eyes became a little serious, 
and he said aloud: "You heard what Hei Wuchang said just now. The family behind the leader of the 
Black Armored Army seems to have a behind-the-scenes instigator. Do you think it’s the dark 
demon who is pretending to be my father now?”

Ye Feng nodded slightly at this time and said loudly: "It's 100% that faker. He has now announced 
to the outside world that he is in seclusion. He is probably practicing a very scary demon technique, 
but his actions have not stopped. He has been behind the scenes. Supporting various forces, he 
wants to be detrimental to the entire Daxuan Dynasty royal family. To put it bluntly, he wants to 
secretly assassinate all members of the entire royal family, and then he can dominate the family. 
This matter, the prince feels that he must Don’t you just tell the ancestors of the royal family in the 
small world inside the palace?”

Chapter 5128 Real Power Figures

For Ye Feng, the current development of things has been somewhat beyond expectations.

Because Ye Feng never thought that the Dark Demon Emperor disguised as the Emperor of the 
Daxuan Dynasty would actually do such a crazy thing, directly and secretly supporting some big 
families in the dynasty, or some external forces, who wanted to Now the real royal members of the 
Daxuan Dynasty are being secretly eliminated one by one.



Therefore, Ye Feng felt that if possible, this matter should be told to the ancestors in the small world 
within the Daxuan Dynasty.

After all, with only Ye Feng and the prince, it would be difficult to directly confront the crazed Dark 
Demon Emperor.

At this moment, the prince thought for a moment, then shook his head and said loudly: "We cannot 
leak this news for the time being, because if it is leaked and alert the snake, the consequences may 
be even more serious. We don't know the disguise at the moment. How powerful is the dark demon 
who became my father? The ancestors in the small world within our dynasty don’t know if they can 
really fight against the dark demon who is now pretending to be my father. Demon clan, so don’t act 
rashly for the time being, not to mention that the dark demon clan is currently in deep retreat and 
does not care about the outside world, so this window period is a good opportunity for us to find a 
way to deal with this dark demon clan. "

Hearing what the prince said, Ye Feng nodded, smiled and said, "Then follow the prince's 
instructions."

In fact, for Ye Feng, it is best to deal with the threat of the Dark Demon Emperor by himself, 
because this is considered an agreement between himself and the Emperor Xuan Wuji of the 
Daxuan Dynasty.

And Ye Feng also knows that if the news is really told to the ancestors in the small world inside the 
palace, some ancestors may be afraid, but they will not dare to confront the Dark Demon Emperor, 
or even surrender directly to the enemy. These situations will It is possible.

Therefore, it is indeed the wisest choice not to leak this news now, otherwise, there may be worse 
consequences than now.

At this time, Ye Feng immediately said: "Prince, when I finish searching the house, you 
immediately take me to the small world inside the palace. I will use the ax of the giant spirit god to 
temporarily replace the imperial seal and suppress the national spirit." Luck, I need the imperial seal 
to do something very important."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the prince's eyes revealed a look of curiosity, and he said, "Ye Feng, 
what do you need the Royal Seal for?"



Originally, the prince felt that Ye Feng needed the Imperial Jade Seal because he wanted to use the 
power of luck in the Imperial Jade Seal to practice.

But now, the prince felt that this matter might not be as simple as he thought.

Because Ye Feng seems to attach great importance to the Royal Seal, and it is definitely not just as 
simple as taking it and practicing it.

Because the Giant Spirit God's Ax is more suitable for Ye Feng to cultivate the power of his Giant 
Spirit God's bloodline than the Imperial Jade Seal.

At this moment, Ye Feng smiled mysteriously and said aloud: "It's better for the prince not to know 
about this matter for now, otherwise I'm afraid that you won't be able to control it and do something 
impulsive, so wait until I really get it When we get to the Imperial Seal, I will tell you the truth 
about the matter."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the prince's eyes flickered. Although he wanted to ask something else, 
seeing Ye Feng being so determined, the prince couldn't say anything more.
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, could only nodded and said aloud: "Okay, then I will wait for the day when you tell the truth."

At this time, the prince patted Ye Feng on the shoulder, sighed, and said aloud: "Now the Daxuan 
Dynasty may be extremely powerful in the eyes of everyone, but only us insiders know that the 
entire Daxuan Dynasty is really plagued by internal and external troubles. It's too serious. It's in 
danger. The building is about to collapse. Ye Feng, I'm lucky to have met a mysterious and powerful 
genius like you who can help me fight this crisis. I hope the two of us can work together to save the 
entire Daxuan Dynasty. "In the quagmire."

When Ye Feng heard what the prince said, he immediately smiled and said: "Prince, don't worry, 
there will be no problem, as long as I am here."

After saying that, Ye Feng left the palace where the prince lived and walked outside.



When Ye Feng walked outside, his eyes were suddenly stunned, because Ye Feng saw that there 
were hundreds of thousands of black armored guards standing in the Royal Garden Square outside.

This large group of black armored guards is like a black ocean, gathered together, giving people a 
very majestic but full of murderous atmosphere.

At this time, Hei Wuchang came over with a smile from not far away, and said loudly: "Master Ye 
Feng, these are the black armored troops, one of the ten royal guards that you will command in the 
future. With hundreds of thousands of elites, they will only obey your orders from now on."

After saying that, Hei Wuchang took out a black steel token and gave it to Ye Feng.

At this time, Ye Feng got the black steel token. Suddenly, the entire black steel token turned into 
pieces. All of these fragments automatically fit together on the surface of Ye Feng's body, forming a 
The black armor covered Ye Feng's entire body.

Ye Feng immediately felt that this set of black armor was very advanced and could greatly enhance 
his defense and combat effectiveness.

Hei Wuchang immediately smiled and said: "Master Ye Feng, this token is the personal token of the 
commander of the Black Armored Army that I just applied for you, and this token can also be 
turned into a protective armor to help Lord Ye Feng increases his combat power."

When Ye Feng heard what Hei Wuchang said, his eyes suddenly showed a look of surprise.

Unexpectedly, the identity token of the commander-in-chief of the Black Armored Army can be 
turned into armor, covering his body and improving his various abilities. It is really amazing.

It seems that the Daxuan Dynasty is indeed one of the most powerful overlords in the land of 
Zhongzhou. This kind of weapon refining methods and craftsmanship have reached a magical level 
of proficiency.

At this moment, Ye Feng looked at the hundreds of thousands of black armored troops in the entire 
square, his eyes full of high spirits. He did not expect that he would become the commander of the 
black armored army, commanding hundreds of thousands of elite black armored troops. , this is a 
real person with real power.



At this time, hundreds of thousands of black-armored troops respectfully said together: "See you, 
Commander-in-Chief!"

Ye Feng immediately felt a sense of majesty.

At this moment, Hei Wuchang smiled slightly and said loudly: "Master Ye Feng, let's take hundreds 
of thousands of elite Black Armored Army troops and go directly to the family behind the previous 
leader of the Black Armored Army to question the crime."

Chapter 5129 Wang Family

At this time, hearing what Hei Wuchang said, Ye Feng immediately nodded, and said a little 
energetically: "Okay, then let's just go and ransack the house."

At this time, Ye Feng gave an order, and hundreds of thousands of black-armored troops, all in 
uniform, followed behind Ye Feng and Hei Wuchang, and galloped towards the outside of the 
palace in a mighty manner.

The family behind the previous generation of Black Armored Army commander was in the 
southwest area of the imperial city, not in the palace, because only regular royal members can live 
in the palace. As for some big families or nobles, they can only live in the palace. Inside the 
imperial city outside the palace.

At this moment, Ye Feng led hundreds of thousands of murderous black-armored troops and walked 
out of the palace.

When they arrived at the Imperial City, everyone was attracted by this terrifying aura.

You must know that the residents living in the imperial city of the Daxuan Dynasty are all 
extraordinary, and there are many strong people living in the imperial city.

But even so, he was still shocked by this terrifying posture. ??

Because they have never seen the entire black armored army dispatched.

At this moment, people were talking about it.



Especially everyone, staring at Ye Feng at the front of the black-armored army, their eyes filled with 
deep awe.

Everyone knows that the young man at the front of the Black Armor Army is definitely the 
commander of the Black Armor Army. Otherwise, he would not be qualified to have hundreds of 
thousands of Black Armor Army follow behind him.

So at this time, someone couldn't help but said in admiration: "At such a young age, he has become 
the commander of the Black Armored Army of our Daxuan Dynasty. He is really a boy born from a 
hero."

At this time, everyone's eyes were full of awe, looking at Ye Feng.

At this time, Ye Feng also clearly noticed the awe-inspiring looks of everyone in the entire imperial 
city.

Regarding this, Ye Feng's expression was very calm.

When Hei Wuchang saw Ye Feng's plain look, a look of approval suddenly appeared in his eyes.

Because Ye Feng is indeed rare to see
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A peerless talent, not only with his own cultivation, but also with extremely powerful strength and 
extremely high talent. In addition, he also has a good attitude that is neither arrogant nor impetuous. 
His future achievements are limitless. Even Hei Wuchang is very impressive. .

Next, Ye Feng led the mighty hundreds of thousands of black armored troops and finally arrived 
outside the family behind the previous generation of black armored army commander in the 
imperial city.

This family is still very large and covers a vast area.



At this moment, Ye Feng said directly to the hundreds of thousands of black generals behind him: 
"Send out all of them and surround the entire family."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, hundreds of thousands of black-armored troops gave orders one after 
another. In an instant, they turned into a torrent of black steel and surrounded the entire family.

Ye Feng and Hei Wuchang, on the other hand, led the ten most powerful black-armored troops and 
walked quickly towards the inside of the family.

When they came to the door of the family, a family guard from the family immediately came out 
and said loudly: "Outsiders are not allowed to enter the Wang family's residence area."

Obviously, the family behind this previous generation of black-armored commander was called the 
Wang family.

But at this time, before these Wang family guards could say anything, the ten strongest black-
armored troops behind Ye Feng and Hei Wuchang swarmed forward and sent all the Wang family 
guards flying backwards.

A black-armored soldier said coldly: "Our commander-in-chief has personally come to investigate 
and ask everyone to get down. Otherwise, we will kill them on the spot."

The ten Black Army troops behind Ye Feng are the ten strongest beings among the Black Armored 
Army. They are the leader of the team and are directly under the command of Ye Feng, the general. 
Therefore, their style of doing things is naturally very iron-blooded and killing. Ye Feng needs to 
worry and say more.

Ye Feng was very satisfied with this, and he and Hei Wuchang walked slowly towards the inside of 
the Wang family.

At this moment, he was thrown upside down and lying on the ground.

When the group of royal guards saw the menacing group of people and the hundreds of thousands 
of black troops outside, their hearts suddenly became cold.



They knew that their family was probably causing trouble, and the commander-in-chief of the 
Black-armored Army had turned into a young man like Ye Feng, which meant that the commander-
in-chief of the Wang family in the Black-armored Army might have been completely executed.

So when they thought of this at this time, the group of royal guards were all filled with despair.

They knew that their entire Wang family was doomed.

At this moment, Ye Feng and Hei Wuchang have entered the inner area of the Wang family.

The first thing that catches the eye is a group of luxurious buildings. .??.

Especially the middle hall is the most luxurious hall in the entire Wang family. It is thousands of 
meters tall and looks very majestic, even comparable to the central hall of the royal palace.

Seeing this scene, Hei Wuchang immediately snorted and said: "The Wang family is so majestic. 
The palace they built for themselves is actually comparable to the palace hall in the palace."

When Ye Feng heard what Hei Wuchang said, he just smiled slightly and said loudly: "That can't 
fight against the royal family of our Daxuan Dynasty."

After finishing speaking, Ye Feng glanced at Hei Wuchang beside him, then flew directly to the sky, 
overlooking the entire Wang family area, and said loudly: "All members of the Wang family, come 
out and kneel on the ground. You, the entire Wang family, are trying to murder me." The royal 
members of the Daxuan Dynasty must pay the price for this, because it is a great sin."

After Ye Feng's words fell, countless people from the entire Wang family immediately walked out 
of their respective homes in a panic.

All the members of the Wang family had expressions of deep astonishment and horror on their 
faces. It seemed that they did not expect that the Wang family, who was so good, could become 
criminals who murdered members of the royal family.

At this time, Hei Wuchang suddenly took out the heads of the previous commander of the Black 
Armored Army and the poisonous ancestor from the storage ring, threw them on the ground, and 
then directly used the recording token. He tortured Heijia before releasing him



# Every time verification appears, please do not use incognito mode!

What the military commander said.

Hei Wuchang said coldly: "The previous generation of the black armored commander of your Wang 
family, together with your old head of the Wang family, dared to hire a vicious person like the 
Venomous Ancestor in an attempt to murder our royal family member, the Princess. This is This is a 
heinous crime. This is the crime of rebellion. So today, all of you in the Wang family will be taken 
into prison and tortured. The members of the Wang family who were not involved in this matter will 
spare your lives and be exiled to the frontier. But who is involved in this matter? I have to ask about 
this matter in the afternoon!”

At this moment, Hei Wuchang's words set the tone for the whole thing. No one in the Wang family 
dared to resist, and they all knelt there honestly, kneeling in front of Ye Feng and Hei Wuchang.

At this moment, Hei Wuchang looked at everyone, pointed at Ye Feng and said: "From now on, Mr. 
Ye will be the new generation commander of the entire Hei family army. This time he will be 
responsible for checking your entire Wang family."

At this moment, everyone in the Wang family felt shocked and amazed when they looked at such a 
young man as Ye Feng. It seemed that they did not expect that such a young man could become the 
new generation commander of the Black Armored Army.

And at this moment.

Boom!

Suddenly, a terrifying aura suddenly erupted from a palace inside the Wang family, and it was about 
to flee into the distance.

Sensing this aura, Hei Wuchang immediately smiled coldly and said loudly: "It is the mastermind of 
this plan to murder the royal family members, the old head of the Wang family. He actually wants to 
escape, but it is a pity that it is too late."



At this time, Ye Feng had already asked a group of elite black armored soldiers to surround the 
entire Wang family.

Therefore, no matter how powerful the old head of the Wang family is, he will not be able to break 
through the blockade of hundreds of thousands of elite black armored troops for a while.

And Hei Wuchang rushed in that direction instantly, wanting to arrest the old head of the Wang 
family in person.

Ye Feng is quite relaxed at this time. He has a very high status now. He only needs to watch the 
people around him do things, and there is no need to do it himself.

Chapter 5130 Swallowed on the spot

At this time, Ye Feng just had to observe everything quietly.

The old patriarch of the Wang family not far away was surrounded by hundreds of thousands of 
elite black armored soldiers, and then Hei Wuchang took action directly and fought with the old 
man of the Wang family to the end, and finally completely suppressed the old patriarch of the Wang 
family.

Swish!

At this moment, Ye Feng flew over directly and saw an old man in luxurious clothes, who was 
oppressed to kneel on the ground by a group of black armored soldiers and Hei Wuchang.

This person is the old patriarch of the Wang family.

It was also a vicious person like the poisonous ancestor he hired who ambushed and killed Ye Feng 
and others on the way.

At this moment, after Ye Feng flew over, he stared at the old patriarch of the Wang family and 
slowly said, "Do you plead guilty?"

The old patriarch of the Wang family stared at Ye Feng at this time, and his old eyes were full of 
complex expressions, with regret, cruelty, and anger.



The old patriarch of the Wang family said, "I didn't expect that there would be such a brilliant 
young man like you beside the crown prince of the Great Xuan Dynasty. It's really God's will that 
our Wang family will be destroyed."

At this time, Ye Feng suddenly asked, "Who is the mastermind behind the scenes who ordered your 
Wang family to harm the royal family members of our Great Xuan Dynasty?"

Hearing Ye Feng's question, the old patriarch of the Wang family's face suddenly changed, and he 
couldn't help but said, "I don't know, I don't know anything!"

Boom!

After saying that, the old patriarch of the Wang family suddenly exploded his dantian and died 
directly.

"What?"

Seeing this scene, the faces of the surrounding black-armored soldiers all changed slightly. It 
seemed that they didn't expect that the old patriarch of the Wang family, such a powerful old figure, 
a peerless master, was asked a question casually, and he was scared and chose to commit suicide to 
protect the secret.

At this moment, Hei Wuchang's face was very solemn. He couldn't help but look at Ye Feng beside 
him and said, "It seems that the mastermind behind the Wang family is much more terrifying than 
we imagined. The old patriarch of the Wang family, as the head of a big family, such a big figure, 
actually blew himself up for fear of leaking the news. It's really creepy." Hearing what Hei 
Wuchang said, Ye Feng's eyes just flashed slightly, and he didn't say much, because Ye Feng already 
had the answer in his heart. That is, the behind-the-scenes supporter behind the Wang family must 
be the dark demon emperor who is now disguised as the emperor. However, Ye Feng didn't say 
anything directly. He just asked the old patriarch of the Wang family just to confirm his guess, but 
he didn't expect that the other party would blow himself up directly. At this moment, Ye Feng 
naturally would not waste time. He looked directly at Hei Wuchang and a group of black-armored 
soldiers in front of him and said, "Since the strongest of the Wang family has been completely 
killed, then you will directly enter the major houses and palaces of the entire Wang family, search 
out all the valuable things, and then pile them all up in the middle square outside. I will count them 
one by one, and after the gathering is completed, I will directly hand them over to the treasury of 
my Great Xuan Dynasty."



Hearing what Ye Feng said, Hei Wuchang and a group of black-armored soldiers all nodded, and 
then went to search their homes.

And Ye Feng was in the square at this time, waiting for the final inventory.

Of course, at this moment, Ye Feng naturally did not hesitate at all, and immediately released the 
devouring field and began to devour the power energy of the old patriarch of the Wang family.

You must know that the old patriarch of the Wang family is an extremely powerful figure, a peerless 
strong man comparable to Hei Wuchang. As the head of a large family, his cultivation strength is 
naturally very strong.

Buzz buzz buzz!

After Ye Feng began to devour, he immediately felt a huge and powerful energy injected into his 
Dantian.

The aura of Ye Feng's power immediately began to break through rapidly.

Boom!

At this moment, Ye Feng's body suddenly burst out with a huge and new cultivation momentum.

At this moment, Ye Feng's cultivation broke through the bottleneck of the current tenth level of 
Xuanzhao Realm, and directly broke through to the half-step Jiuding Realm above Xuanzhao 
Realm!

Jiuding Realm, this is an extremely powerful level of cultivation!

Ye Feng was originally in the tenth level of Xuanzhao Realm, and it was estimated that he would 
need to practice for several decades before he could normally practice to the half-step Jiuding 
Realm.

Because Ye Feng's current level of cultivation is already very high, if he wants to break through a 
big bottleneck, he must practice for a long time.



However, the power and energy of the old patriarch of the Wang family was so magnificent that Ye 
Feng directly broke through this bottleneck, directly breaking through the bottleneck of the tenth 
level of Xuanzhao Realm and entering the half-step Jiuding Realm above Xuanzhao Realm.

At this moment, even if Ye Feng was only half-step Jiuding Realm, he could feel how powerful this 
new realm of cultivation was.

At this moment, Ye Feng did not hesitate at all. He just waited there, waiting for everyone to 
plunder all the wealth of the Wang family and gather them on the square. Then, Ye Feng would 
naturally select some cultivation resources that he could use and directly devour them to strengthen 
his cultivation. Maybe he could continue to break through the bottleneck of the half-step Nine Ding 
realm and step into the real Nine Ding realm.

This time, the prince asked Ye Feng to host this house-confiscation mission, which actually tacitly 
allowed Ye Feng to get some benefits from it. Ye Feng would naturally not waste this opportunity.

After waiting for a whole half day, Hei Wuchang and a group of elite masters among the black 
armored guards finally walked out of the palace complex of the entire Wang family and gathered on 
the square.

At this moment, one by one, the black armored soldiers released all the wealth of the Wang family 
that they had plundered from the storage ring and piled up on the square in front of Ye Feng.

Hei Wuchang also looted a lot, but he didn't dare to keep anything. He piled them all on the square 
where Ye Feng was standing at this time, and left it to Ye Feng to decide.

Because Ye Feng was the host of this time, he naturally had great power.

At this moment, Ye Feng suddenly saw a lot of wealth piled up in front of him, including many 
Wang family's peerless inheritances, or some very precious resources of heaven and earth, rare 
treasures, and many specially made armors, etc.

Seeing this, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly revealed a faint coldness, and he said aloud: "This Wang 
family is really ambitious. They secretly made so many armors, wanting to arm their own people 
and attempt to rebel."



Hearing Ye Feng say this, everyone responded.

And Ye Feng swallowed some of the high-level cultivation resources directly on the spot.

Boom!

The aura of Ye Feng's cultivation immediately broke through, and he directly stepped into the real 
first level of the Nine Ding Realm from the previous half-step Nine Ding Realm!

Ye Feng devoured these high-level cultivation resources at this moment, without hiding them, and 
devoured them directly in front of everyone, making many Black Armored Army soldiers show awe 
in their eyes.

Sure enough, now their new generation of Black Armored Army commander is a favorite of the 
prince, and directly used so many high-level resources searched from the Wang family. It seems that 
the prince acquiesced.

At this moment, Hei Wuchang's eyes flickered, and then he immediately said politely: 
"Congratulations to Lord Ye for his breakthrough in cultivation. In time, Lord Ye's cultivation will 
sooner or later surpass mine, and even become a great figure in our Great Xuan Dynasty in the 
future. He will be a well-known figure in the entire Zhongzhou land of the Ten Thousand Demons 
Interface."
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