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Chapter 5131 Much Worse

At this moment, Hei Wuchang, as one of the prince's protectors and an old-generation warrior in the 
Great Xuan Dynasty, began to compliment Ye Feng.

Obviously, Ye Feng's continuous rapid breakthroughs, as well as his acquisition of the Giant Spirit 
Axe and the attention of His Royal Highness the Crown Prince, really shocked and shocked old-
generation warriors like Hei Wuchang.

Ye Feng's growth rate is really too fast!

At this moment, Ye Feng smiled slightly and said, "If Senior Hei Wuchang wants anything, he can 
also choose a few from them. I won't report such trivial matters."

When Hei Wuchang heard what Ye Feng said, he immediately smiled and said, "Okay, thank you, 
Lord Ye."

At this moment, Hei Wuchang also selected several inheritance books and some special weapons 
and armor. It is obvious that Hei Wuchang is very interested in inheritance and weapons.

At this time, Ye Feng seemed to have suddenly discovered something. He walked directly to the pile 
of wealth, stretched out his hand, and grabbed a piece of debris.

The four characters "Great Thunder Mantra" were written on this fragment, which seemed to be a 
very special ancient inheritance.

However, the reason why Ye Feng felt strange was not because he knew this inheritance, but 
because the fluctuations emitted from the fragment with the four characters "Great Thunder Mantra" 
were the energy fluctuations from the higher latitudes of the outer world that Ye Feng was now very 
familiar with. .??.

This made Ye Feng's eyes suddenly show a look of surprise. It seems that this fragment and the 
inheritance of the Great Thunder Mantra recorded on this fragment are likely to be the inheritance 
from the higher dimension of cultivation in the outer world.



This naturally made Ye Feng very interested.

Because Ye Feng's own immortal body of the God and the blood of the giant spirit god he 
possessed, Ye Feng's combat power has been greatly improved. Ordinary inheritances are no longer 
useful to Ye Feng, and they are not of much significance to Ye Feng.

After all, what Ye Feng is practicing now is
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The unique inheritance of the Giant Spirit God's bloodline, the Giant Spirit Four Sacred Skills, so 
Ye Feng doesn't look down on ordinary inheritances.

But if this set of Great Heavenly Thunder Curse really comes from the higher dimension of the 
outer world, then Ye Feng feels that this must be a very powerful inheritance. After practicing it, he 
will definitely be able to greatly enhance his overall strength.

So at this time, Ye Feng did not hesitate at all, and put this ancient fragment engraved with the 
inheritance of the Great Heavenly Thunder Curse into his storage ring, so that he could slowly 
practice and comprehend it in the future.

For Ye Feng, although there is only one fragment left of the inheritance of the Great Heavenly 
Thunder Curse, and the inheritance secrets recorded in it have been damaged, Ye Feng's deduction 
ability is very powerful.

Ye Feng's evil comprehension ability allows Ye Feng to successfully practice the complete 
inheritance through the damaged inheritance of the skills.

So at this time, Ye Feng naturally has no worries. As long as this fragment records a part of the 
inheritance secrets of the Great Heavenly Thunder Curse, then Ye Feng will one day deduce the 
entire inheritance and practice it successfully.

At this time, Ye Feng was quite happy. This time, he came to the Wang family to confiscate their 
property. Not only did his cultivation level leap across a whole realm, but he also obtained a 



powerful inheritance that was suspected to come from the higher cultivation dimension of the outer 
world, the Great Heavenly Thunder Curse.

Ye Feng's overall strength has really been greatly improved this time.

At this moment, Ye Feng and Hei Wuchang both got what they wanted. Ye Feng immediately waved 
his hand with high spirits and said, "Let's go directly back to the palace, take all the wealth with us, 
and then hand it over to the treasury of the Great Xuan Dynasty."

Ye Feng knew very well that he was only a helper beside the prince after all, so it was good to get 
some benefits from the wealth of the Wang family. He had to know when to stop, otherwise, the 
prince's face would not be acceptable.

At this time, Ye Feng got what he wanted, and he was naturally very happy. He took everyone and 
left the Wang family in a mighty manner.

And many observers in the surrounding imperial city saw this scene, and they all showed regret in 
their eyes.

Someone couldn't help but sigh and shook his head, saying, "This Wang family is really miserable. I 
don't know why they offended the royal family and were directly confiscated."

While everyone was talking about it, Ye Feng, the Black Armored Army and Hei Wuchang had 
returned to the palace and came to the place where the prince lived.

At this time, Ye Feng and Hei Wuchang walked directly into the palace where the prince lived.

At this moment, the prince was standing in the palace, and seemed to be talking to a very 
mysterious person.

Sensing the arrival of Ye Feng and Hei Wuchang outside, the prince immediately made the 
mysterious person disappear in front of him.

At this time, Ye Feng's eyes flickered, but he didn't say much.



After all, the prince is the future heir of the entire Great Xuan Dynasty. Now he knows that his 
father has mysteriously disappeared. The current emperor is a disguised dark demon. So the prince 
will definitely make friends with all kinds of powerful people and mysterious people to help him 
consolidate his position and power. Ye Feng is just one of them.

However, Ye Feng did not think there was anything wrong. After all, the more the prince considers, 
the more powerful people he makes friends with, which is also very helpful for Ye Feng.

Because now the prince and Ye Feng have the same goal, that is, to deal with the dark demon 
emperor who is now disguised as the emperor, so as to preserve the power of the orthodox royal 
family of the entire Great Xuan Dynasty.

At this moment, after Ye Feng and Hei Wuchang walked in, the prince immediately smiled and 
asked:
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"How is the Wang family's property search going? Did you get any useful information from the 
interrogation?"

Hei Wuchang spoke first: "Your Highness, the entire Wang family's private wealth is very huge. It 
has now been counted by Lord Ye Feng and handed over to the imperial treasury."

When the prince heard what Hei Wuchang said, he nodded immediately.

And Hei Wuchang continued to speak: "But the old patriarch of the Wang family, even if he blew 
himself up and died, did not reveal the identity of the mysterious man who was behind him."

"Hmm?"

Hearing what Hei Wuchang said, the prince said: "Okay, I know, you go down first, I have 
something to discuss with Ye Feng alone."

"Yes, Your Highness."



Hei Wuchang immediately clasped his fists respectfully and left the hall.

At this time, the prince walked in front of Ye Feng and couldn't help asking: "Can you confirm that 
the mastermind behind the Wang family is the super powerful dark demon who is now disguised as 
my father?"

Ye Feng shook his head at this time and said: "As Hei Wuchang said just now, I didn't ask anything, 
but I can confirm that there is a 90% chance that the mastermind behind the Wang family is the dark 
demon who is now disguised as His Majesty the Emperor."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the prince nodded and said: "During the time when you confiscated the 
family, I contacted some intelligence agencies, which are private intelligence agencies that I have 
secretly cultivated for so many years. I have obtained a very shocking truth, that is, many big 
families and dignitaries in our palace have been coerced and lured by the super powerful dark 
demon who is now disguised as my father. Not only are they targeting our orthodox royal family 
members, but they are also colluding with the dark demons outside the territory, trying to erode the 
territory of our entire Great Xuan Dynasty step by step. The current situation is much worse than I 
imagined."

Chapter 5132 The Truth

The prince was still quite worried when he said this.

At this moment, Ye Feng suddenly remembered that when they came to the palace where the prince 
lived, the prince seemed to be talking to a mysterious person.

That mysterious person should be the intelligence department that the prince secretly cultivated.

It seems that this prince is still very good, much better than those powerful and wealthy children 
who only know how to eat and wait for death.

At this time, Ye Feng nodded and said, "According to what you have found out, it is indeed very 
bad now. However, the dark demon who is temporarily disguised as His Majesty the Emperor is in 
seclusion and should not pose any great threat. As long as he is in seclusion, he will not know the 
preparations we have made outside. And I will tell you something very important next."

"Hmm?"



Hearing what Ye Feng said, the prince suddenly became serious and couldn't help saying, "I asked 
you before, what is your identity, Ye Feng, and why do you know so many truths. Now it seems that 
you really want to show me your cards."

Ye Feng smiled and said, "Indeed, we have known each other for so long now, and I think the prince 
is also a very reliable person, so I will naturally tell you everything I know."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the prince immediately became very curious and solemn, and said, 
"Then I will listen to what the truth is, Ye Feng."

Ye Feng nodded and said He said: "The dark demon who is now disguised as His Majesty the 
Emperor is actually the most powerful Dark Demon Emperor among the dark demons, so I have 
never dared to act rashly."

"What?"

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the prince's face immediately became very ugly, and he said: "I didn't 
expect that he was actually a figure of the Demon Emperor level among the dark demons. No 
wonder he is so powerful and can secretly support so many big families to serve him. However, he 
should not dare to act rashly for the time being. After all, many of the older generation figures in 
our royal family's inner world are still in seclusion and practicing. If this Dark Demon Emperor 
dares to tear his face openly, his end will not be too good. "

Ye Feng nodded and said: "This is indeed the case at present, and this is not the point I want to say. 
The point I want to say is that I and your father, the real emperor Xuan Wuji, have met, and we have 
met a long time ago. I came to the Great Xuan Dynasty this time because of this matter. "

"What?"

At this moment, the prince immediately widened his eyes, as if he had never expected Ye Feng to 
say such a thing.

Ye Feng actually met his real father Xuan Wuji?

At this moment, the prince was a little bit overwhelmed for a while, because some of the news Ye 
Feng said at this time was too explosive, so that the prince could not accept it for a while.



After all, the prince had long thought that his father might have been secretly eliminated by the 
Dark Demon Emperor, or had mysteriously disappeared, but he did not expect Ye Feng to do so.
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A young man actually met his extremely powerful father. Even Ye Feng came to the palace of the 
Great Xuan Dynasty, probably because of the plan between him and his father.

This made the prince suddenly feel that Ye Feng was an extremely unfathomable guy. He had 
concealed it for so long and didn't say such a thing.

At this moment, the prince stared at Ye Feng and couldn't help but said in ecstasy: "Where is my 
father? Why doesn't my father come back directly?"

Ye Feng immediately said: "Senior Xuan Wuji is now trapped in a dark prison, and his whole body 
is pierced by the dark chains condensed by the Dark Demon Emperor. Only the Imperial Jade Seal, 
which has the luck of a country, can break the black chains on Senior Xuan Wuji and rescue him. 
This is why I have always wanted to get the Imperial Jade Seal."

Hearing Ye Feng say this, the prince Suddenly, a deep surprise appeared on his face, and he said, "I 
underestimated you, Ye Feng. I didn't expect that you wanted the imperial seal not for your own 
selfish desires, but to save my father. Great, too great!"

Hearing what the prince said, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly showed a smile, and he said, "Your father, 
Xuan Wuji and I have discussed all the plans, so I will help him wholeheartedly, and will also help 
the royal family of your entire Great Xuan Dynasty."

Ye Feng said this at this time, but he did not say that he would share half of the interests of the 
entire Great Xuan Dynasty in the future.

Because there is no need to tell the prince about this for the time being, otherwise, it may cause a 
gap between the two of them.

After all, Ye Feng is now very clear that he and the prince must be closely united to fight against the 
Dark Demon Emperor.



And the situation is indeed worse than Ye Feng imagined, because he didn't expect that the Dark 
Demon Emperor is not only alone now, but also secretly supports and controls so many big families 
and dignitaries, betraying the entire imperial family of the Great Xuan Dynasty.

And the most critical thing now is that we don't know which big families have betrayed the entire 
imperial family.

So at this time, one move will affect the whole body, and we must do it slowly to finally solve the 
harm of the Dark Demon Emperor.

At this moment, the prince thought of something and immediately said, "Then let's hurry to the 
small world inside our palace and take the imperial seal to save my father. As long as my father is 
rescued, we won't be afraid of the Dark Demon Emperor."

Ye Feng shook his head when he heard the prince say this, and said, "Prince, you are too optimistic. 
If Senior Xuan Wuji is really so powerful, he would not be trapped in a remote area by the Dark 
Demon Emperor, so saving your father is only the first step. After saving your father, you can't 
directly fight with the Dark Demon Emperor. The Demon Emperor will show his cards, otherwise 
the whole body will be affected. The entire imperial family of the Great Xuan Dynasty will be 
greatly shaken and many people will be killed. In any case, rescue your father first, so that it will be 
easier to discuss with more people. "

Hearing Ye Feng say this, the prince nodded immediately and couldn't help but said: "Ye Feng, you 
are more thoughtful. Then I will take you to the small world inside our palace and strive to get the 
imperial seal, and then we will go directly to rescue my father. "At this time, the prince said this, 
still quite worried.

At this moment, Ye Feng suddenly remembered that when they came to the palace where the prince 
lived just now, the prince seemed to be talking to a mysterious person.

That mysterious person should be the intelligence department that the prince secretly cultivated.

It seems that this prince is still very good, much better than the rich and powerful descendants who 
only know how to eat and wait for death.



At this time, Ye Feng nodded and said, "According to what you have found out, it is indeed very 
bad now. However, the dark demon who is temporarily disguised as His Majesty the Emperor is in 
seclusion and should not pose any great threat. As long as he is in seclusion, he will not know the 
preparations we have made outside. And I will tell you something very important next."

"Hmm?"

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the prince suddenly became serious and couldn't help saying, "I asked 
you before, what is your identity, Ye Feng, and why do you know so many truths. Now it seems that 
you really want to show me your cards."

Ye Feng smiled and said, "Indeed, we have known each other for so long now, and I think the prince 
is also a very reliable person, so I will naturally tell you everything I know."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the prince immediately became very curious and solemn, and said, 
"Then I will listen to what the truth is, Ye Feng."

Ye Feng nodded and said He said: "The dark demon who is now disguised as His Majesty the 
Emperor is actually the most powerful Dark Demon Emperor among the dark demons, so I have 
never dared to act rashly."

"What?"

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the prince's face immediately became very ugly, and he said: "I didn't 
expect that he was actually a figure of the Demon Emperor level among the dark demons. No 
wonder he is so powerful and can secretly support so many big families to serve him. However, he 
should not dare to act rashly for the time being. After all, many of the older generation figures in 
our royal family's inner world are still in seclusion and practicing. If this Dark Demon Emperor 
dares to tear his face openly, his end will not be too good. "

Ye Feng nodded and said: "This is indeed the case at present, and this is not the point I want to say. 
The point I want to say is that I and your father, the real emperor Xuan Wuji, have met, and we have 
met a long time ago. I came to the Great Xuan Dynasty this time because of this matter. "

"What?"



At this moment, the prince immediately widened his eyes, as if he had never expected Ye Feng to 
say such a thing.

Ye Feng actually met his real father Xuan Wuji?

At this moment, the prince was a little bit overwhelmed for a while, because some of the news Ye 
Feng said at this time was too explosive, so that the prince could not accept it for a while.

After all, the prince had long thought that his father might have been secretly eliminated by the 
Dark Demon Emperor, or had mysteriously disappeared, but he did not expect Ye Feng to do so.
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A young man had actually met his extremely powerful father. Even Ye Feng's coming to the palace 
of the Great Xuan Dynasty might be because of the plan between him and his father.

This made the prince suddenly feel that Ye Feng was an extremely unfathomable guy. He had 
concealed this for so long and had not said such a thing.

At this moment, the prince stared at Ye Feng and couldn't help but said in ecstasy: "Where is my 
father? Why doesn't he come back directly?"

Ye Feng immediately said: "Senior Xuan Wuji is now trapped in a dark prison, and his body is 
pierced by the dark chains condensed by the Dark Demon Emperor. Only the Imperial Seal, which 
has the luck of a country, can break the black chains on Senior Xuan Wuji and rescue him. This is 
why I have always wanted to get the Imperial Seal."

Hearing Ye Feng say this, the prince Suddenly, a deep surprise appeared on his face, and he said, "I 
underestimated you, Ye Feng. I didn't expect that Ye Feng wanted the imperial seal not for his own 
selfish desires, but to save my father. Great, too great!"

Hearing what the prince said, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly showed a smile, and he said, "Your father, 
Xuan Wuji, and I have discussed all the plans, so I will help him wholeheartedly, and will also help 
the royal family of your entire Great Xuan Dynasty."



Ye Feng said this at this time, but he did not say that he would share half of the interests of the 
entire Great Xuan Dynasty in the future.

Because there is no need to tell the prince about this for the time being, otherwise, it may cause a 
gap between the two of them.

After all, Ye Feng is now very clear that he and the prince must be closely united to fight against the 
Dark Demon Emperor.

And the current situation is indeed worse than Ye Feng imagined, because he didn't expect that the 
Dark Demon Emperor is not only alone now, but also secretly supports and controls so many big 
families and dignitaries, betraying the entire Great Xuan Dynasty.

And the most important thing now is that we still don’t know which big families have betrayed the 
entire royal family.

So at this time, one move will affect the whole body, and we must take it slowly to finally solve the 
threat of the Dark Demon Emperor.

At this moment, the prince thought of something and immediately said, "Then let's hurry to the 
small world inside our palace and take the imperial seal to save my father. As long as my father is 
rescued, we won't be afraid of the Dark Demon Emperor."

When Ye Feng heard what the prince said, he shook his head and said, "Prince, you are too 
optimistic. If Senior Xuan Wuji is really so powerful, he would not be trapped in a remote area by 
the Dark Demon Emperor. So saving your father is just the first step. After saving your father, you 
can't confront the Dark Demon Emperor directly. Otherwise, the whole body will be affected. The 
entire imperial family of the Great Xuan Dynasty will be greatly shaken and many people will be 
killed. In any case, rescue your father first. It will be easier to discuss with more people at that 
time."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the prince nodded immediately and couldn't help but said, "Ye Feng, 
you are more thoughtful. Then I will take you to the small world inside our palace and strive to get 
the imperial seal. Then we will set out to save my father."

Chapter 5133 Guardian

At this time, after Ye Feng and the prince had discussed it, they flew directly towards the small 
world inside the palace.



On the way, Ye Feng was also asking for the opinion of the Giant Spirit God Ax behind him.

The Giant Spirit God's Ax naturally listened to Ye Feng, and there was no problem at all. After all, 
Ye Feng only used the Giant Spirit God's Ax as a temporary substitute for the Imperial Seal to 
suppress a country's destiny.

After rescuing Xuan Wuji, Ye Feng will return the Royal Seal and then redeem the Giant Spirit God 
Ax.

However, the prince said aloud on the way: "I wonder if the elders of the royal family who guard 
the Jade Seal of the Dynasty in the small world will agree with us? After all, the Jade Seal of the 
Dynasty is too important. It is the foundation of our entire Daxuan Dynasty. Symbol, if it really 
doesn’t work, why don’t you tell them the truth? Just say that we took the Royal Seal to save my 
father.”

"no."

Ye Feng immediately shook his head and said: "Now we are not sure whether the Dark Demon 
Emperor disguised as the emperor has bribed some of the elders and powerful men in the small 
world, so we'd better not let others Know the truth, otherwise, if you alert the enemy, you may be in 
trouble. "

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the prince nodded quickly. After all, the Dark Emperor could secretly 
support so many big families, so he might also be able to secretly control some of the elders and 
powerful men in the royal family and let them work for him.

Therefore, even some powerful elders of the royal family in the small world inside the palace 
cannot be trusted too much.

At this moment, after the prince finished speaking, he no longer wasted time, and he and Ye Feng 
concentrated on flying quickly towards the small world inside the palace.

Soon, they came to the entrance of the small world.



At the entrance to the small world of the inner palace, stood two tall and burly men, each more than 
ten meters tall, just like humans from the giant spirit clan.

At this time, the prince directly revealed his identity and said loudly: "I have something very 
important to do and I want to enter the inner small world. I also ask you two to open the door to the 
inner small world as soon as possible and let us enter it." ,do not waste time."

Hearing what the prince said, the two guards guarding the door suddenly showed a faint smile in 
their eyes, and said loudly: "Even if you are the current prince, if you want to enter the small world, 
you have to pay a fee. ”

"Um?"

Hearing what the two guards guarding the gate said, the prince's eyes suddenly showed a cold look, 
as if he did not expect that the other party would actually reach out to benefit from his highness, the 
prince.

However, the prince was now anxious to enter the small inner world, so he did not say anything 
more. Instead, he stretched out his hand with an expressionless face, and popped out two top-quality 
crystal stones and delivered them to the hands of the two guards.

These two giant spirit-like guards who were more than ten meters tall were naturally very happy to 
receive the benefits, and they directly said: "Okay, then you can go in directly."

The prince didn't want to care about anything, he simply nodded and prepared to take Ye Feng into 
this small world.

"Wait a minute."

But at this time, suddenly one of the two guards wearing golden armor spoke up.

He stared at Ye Feng with a look on his face.
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With a slight smile of disdain, he said aloud: "Prince, you can enter the small world, but this strange 
boy beside you who doesn't know where he came from is not a member of our royal family. He 
cannot enter the small world, even if you have more friends. You can’t enter even with tolls.”

"What?"

Hearing what the tall guard said, the prince's eyes suddenly showed a look of shock and anger, and 
then he couldn't bear it anymore and said loudly: "You are here to collect tolls privately, so I won't 
say anything. I didn't expect it." You still don't let my friends enter the inner world. Ye Feng is my 
closest friend. Why can't he enter the inner world? I don't remember that our palace's inner world 
has this rule. Outsiders are not allowed to enter. As long as Anyone brought by the orthodox 
members of our royal family can enter the inner world."

Hearing what the prince said, the guard who was more than ten meters tall in golden armor 
immediately smiled disdainfully and said: "Our inner world has its own rules. Even if you are an 
orthodox member of the royal family, you are not qualified. to question our decision.”

"You are really bullying people too much!"

Hearing what the tall guard said, the prince's face suddenly showed an angry look. Then he directly 
pulled Ye Feng beside him and said: "Let's go directly to the small world. I want to take a look." Do 
these two guards dare to take action against us?"

After saying that, the prince pulled Ye Feng and quickly walked towards the entrance of the small 
world.

But just when they were halfway there, suddenly a tall guard held the golden sword in his hand and 
slashed towards the prince and Ye Feng in an instant, saying coldly: " Even if you are a member of 
the royal family, you cannot act like this. Come back quickly."

boom!

After he finished speaking, a terrifying and majestic aura suddenly erupted from the tall guard.

That kind of terrifying cultivation power is five or six realms higher than Ye Feng's current level. 
It's very terrifying.



The prince and Ye Feng were unable to resist at all, and were about to fly backwards after being 
directly hit by the powerful energy.

It must be said that these two guards are indeed the guardian guards of the small world inside the 
palace. Their cultivation strength is indeed extremely powerful.

But at this moment.

Boom!

Ye Feng's body suddenly burst out with an extremely terrifying momentum.

And this momentum is very special. It is not Ye Feng's own breath, but the breath power of the 
Giant Spirit God's Palace on his back.

At this moment, the two tall guards didn't even have time to react. There was an innate pressure 
from the depths of their blood, which made them kneel on the ground "thump" and "thump" in front 
of Ye Feng.

At this moment, the two tall guards were terrified that a towering phantom that stood tall and 
upright emerged from the axe on Ye Feng's back.

It was the phantom of the ancient giant spirit god!

At this moment, the two tall guards were immediately terrified, but they also said in awe: "What? 
This is the pressure from our ancestral gods? Boy, who are you? How is it possible that you have 
the will of the giant spirit god that our giant spirit clan believes in?"

Chapter 5134: The Fortune of a Nation

At this moment, Ye Feng suddenly showed a trace of surprise in his eyes. It seemed that he did not 
expect that the ax of the Giant Spirit God would automatically derive the will of the Giant Spirit 
God, and for these two extremely powerful guards, he had Such a huge suppressive force directly 
caused the opponent to kneel in front of him, which Ye Feng did not expect.



After all, in Ye Feng's eyes, the Giant Spirit God's Ax is rarely used by oneself. Unless he uses the 
Giant Spirit God's blood to stimulate the opponent, the Giant Spirit God's Ax can burst out with 
earth-shattering power.

But this time, the Giant Spirit God Ax took action on his own initiative. He probably saw the two 
tall guards attacking him, so he took the initiative to protect himself. This made Ye Feng very 
grateful to the Giant Spirit God Ax.

After all, the Giant Spirit God's Ax has its own will and is not his own weapon. Ye Feng is naturally 
very grateful to the other party for taking the initiative to protect him.

Moreover, Ye Feng was very surprised that these two guards, who were more than ten meters tall, 
were actually members of the Giant Spirit God clan. Otherwise, it would be impossible to encounter 
the Giant Spirit God's will in the Giant Spirit God's Ax. He knelt directly on the ground.

At this moment, looking at the two tall guards in front of him screaming in terror, Ye Feng said 
coldly: "It doesn't matter who I am, the important thing is that in the ax of the giant spirit god The 
will of the giant spirit god obeys my orders, so you two get out of here and let me enter the small 
world."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the two tall guards immediately nodded and bowed and said, "Yes, yes, 
sir!"

At this moment, these two tall guards, although their cultivation level is five or six realms higher 
than that of Ye Feng, and they are extremely noble beings, but in front of Ye Feng, they don't dare to 
do anything now. Say one more word of disapproval.

Because Ye Feng has been recognized by the will of their clan's ancestor, the Giant Spirit God, Ye 
Feng has natural suppression over them.

In front of Ye Feng, they simply had no room for resistance.

So at this time, the two guards naturally listened to Ye Feng's words.

At this time, seeing this scene on the court, the prince stared at Ye Feng in disbelief, and couldn't 
help but said excitedly: "I didn't expect that Ye Feng, you have been recognized by the Ax of the 
Giant Spirit God, and you can actually do it." It is really useful to have a natural suppression of the 



giant spirit clan. If we deal with the Dark Demon Emperor, we can ask these two extremely 
powerful guards of the giant spirit god clan to help us. After all, they The cultivation strength of the 
two is very terrifying and powerful.”

Hearing what the prince said, Ye Feng nodded slightly and said: "Let's not talk about this first. Let's 
enter the small world first, take out the imperial seal, and rescue your father from imprisonment 
first."

The prince nodded immediately, and he and Ye Feng walked directly into the small world.

Looking at the disappearing figures of Ye Feng and the prince, the two tall guards were still a little 
shocked and couldn't help but said: "Who is this young man? He can actually obtain the will of the 
spirit in the ax of our ancestors. The recognition is really incredible, and the Ax of the Giant Spirit 
God has disappeared for so many years, and it has appeared again. It seems that the world is going 
to be in chaos again. "

At this moment, the two tall guards were talking, with complicated expressions on their faces.

At this time, Ye Feng and the prince had already entered the small world inside the palace.

#Every time verification appears, please do not use incognito mode!

At this moment, Ye Feng saw the inside of the entire small world, which was very vast.

This is definitely an independent space, different from the outside world. It is full of auspicious 
aura, and there is also the royal aura of the entire Daxuan Dynasty, which is continuously injected 
into this small world.

This is really a good place for every generation of strong men from the Daxuan Dynasty to retreat 
for cultivation and retirement.

Buzz!

At this time, Ye Feng took a breath casually, and immediately he could feel a very strong power of 
luck, which was absorbed into his lungs, and then spread towards the entire body, invisibly 
strengthening Ye Feng's energy. strength.



"Um?"

This made Ye Feng's eyes suddenly reveal a look of surprise.

The power of luck in this small world is really strong.

The prince also noticed the change in Ye Feng's expression, and couldn't help but smile and said: 
"This small world inside the palace is the most noble place in our entire Daxuan Dynasty, and it is 
also the rarest place, because not only is the natural environment here very It is good, and it is an 
independent small space. The living density is very low. No one usually disturbs the practice. And 
the most important thing is that this independent small world connects the destiny power of our 
entire Daxuan Dynasty, because the Jade Seal of the Dynasty is in Here, the power of destiny of 
countless people of the entire Daxuan Dynasty will eventually gather here. Although the elders and 
powerful men in our royal family cannot plunder all the power of destiny, the entire small world has 
undergone huge changes in energy. The nourishment of the power of luck is also everywhere filled 
with the breath of the power of luck. Practicing here has the effect of getting twice the result with 
half the effort."

Ye Feng nodded, and then asked aloud: "Where is the imperial seal?"

The prince looked in a certain direction and said aloud: "The place where the power of luck is 
strongest is the place where the imperial seal is located."

After the prince finished speaking, he directly used his royal skills to sense the place where the 
power of luck was strongest, specifically where it was, and then took Ye Feng to fly directly in that 
direction.

Soon, they passed through most of the small world and finally arrived at the place where the 
imperial seal was.

A huge mountain peak appeared here, floating in the void, looking very majestic.

At the top of this mountain, a total of ninety-nine totem poles were built, which looked very 
shocking.



In the void around these ninety-nine totem poles, there are golden dragons of luck shrouding each 
other, giving people a very sacred and grand feeling.

At this time, Ye Feng immediately saw that in the middle of the ninety-nine totem poles, floating a 
cube as big as a mountain, the whole body seemed to be made of gold and jade.

That is definitely the most precious jade seal of the Daxuan Dynasty that suppresses a country's 
fate!

Seeing this scene at this time, the prince was also quite excited and said quickly: "Let's go over and 
have a look."

Ye Feng nodded, and the two of them flew directly towards the mountain peak.

But before they could approach the mountain that carried the royal seal, an old man wearing a 
golden robe suddenly appeared in front of them.

The old man in golden robe had a pair of unfathomable old eyes and asked slowly: "Why did the 
prince come to the place where the royal seal is? Is there anything special?" At this moment, Ye 
Feng's eyes suddenly revealed a trace of Silk's look of surprise seemed to have never expected that 
the Giant Spirit God's ax would automatically derive the Giant Spirit God's will, and it had such a 
huge suppressive force on these two extremely powerful guards that they directly made the other 
party kneel in front of her. In front of him, this was something Ye Feng didn't expect.

After all, in Ye Feng's eyes, the Giant Spirit God's Ax is rarely used by oneself. Unless he uses the 
Giant Spirit God's blood to stimulate the opponent, the Giant Spirit God's Ax can burst out with 
earth-shattering power.

But this time, the Giant Spirit God Ax took action on his own initiative. He probably saw the two 
tall guards attacking him, so he took the initiative to protect himself. This made Ye Feng very 
grateful to the Giant Spirit God Ax.

After all, the Giant Spirit God's Ax has its own will and is not his own weapon. Ye Feng is naturally 
very grateful to the other party for taking the initiative to protect him.



Moreover, Ye Feng was very surprised that these two guards, who were more than ten meters tall, 
were actually members of the Giant Spirit God clan. Otherwise, it would be impossible to encounter 
the Giant Spirit God's will in the Giant Spirit God's Ax. He knelt directly on the ground. .??.??

At this moment, looking at the two tall guards in front of him screaming in terror, Ye Feng said 
coldly: "It doesn't matter who I am, the important thing is that in the ax of the giant spirit god The 
will of the giant spirit god obeys my orders, so you two get out of here and let me enter the small 
world."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the two tall guards immediately nodded and bowed and said, "Yes, yes, 
sir!"

At this moment, these two tall guards, although their cultivation level is five or six realms higher 
than that of Ye Feng, and they are extremely noble beings, but in front of Ye Feng, they don't dare to 
do anything now. Say one more word of disapproval.

Because Ye Feng has been recognized by the will of their clan's ancestor, the Giant Spirit God, Ye 
Feng has natural suppression over them.

In front of Ye Feng, they simply had no room for resistance.

So at this time, the two guards naturally listened to Ye Feng's words.

At this time, seeing this scene on the court, the prince stared at Ye Feng in disbelief, and couldn't 
help but said excitedly: "I didn't expect that Ye Feng, you have been recognized by the Ax of the 
Giant Spirit God, and you can actually do it." It is really useful to have a natural suppression of the 
giant spirit clan. If we deal with the Dark Demon Emperor, we can ask these two extremely 
powerful guards of the giant spirit god clan to help us. After all, they The cultivation strength of the 
two is very terrifying and powerful."

Hearing what the prince said, Ye Feng nodded slightly and said: "Let's not talk about this first. Let's 
enter the small world first, take out the imperial seal, and rescue your father from imprisonment 
first."

The prince nodded immediately, and he and Ye Feng walked directly into the small world.



Looking at the disappearing figures of Ye Feng and the prince, the two tall guards were still a little 
shocked and couldn't help but said: "Who is this young man? He can actually obtain the will of the 
spirit in the ax of our ancestors. The recognition is really incredible, and the Ax of the Giant Spirit 
God has disappeared for so many years, and it has appeared again. It seems that the world is going 
to be in chaos again. "

At this moment, the two tall guards were talking, with complicated expressions on their faces.

At this time, Ye Feng and the prince had already entered the small world inside the palace.
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At this moment, Ye Feng saw the inside of the entire small world, which was very vast.

This is definitely an independent space, different from the outside world. It is full of auspicious 
aura, and there is also the royal aura of the entire Daxuan Dynasty, which is continuously injected 
into this small world.

This is really a good place for every generation of strong men from the Daxuan Dynasty to retreat 
for cultivation and retirement.

Buzz!

At this time, Ye Feng took a breath and could immediately feel a very strong force of luck, which 
was absorbed into his lungs and then spread to his whole body, invisibly strengthening Ye Feng's 
strength.

"Hmm?"

This made Ye Feng's eyes suddenly reveal a look of surprise.

The force of luck in this small world is really strong.

The prince also noticed the change in Ye Feng's expression, and couldn't help but laughed and said: 
"This small world inside the palace is the most noble place in our entire Great Xuan Dynasty, and it 



is also the most scarce place, because not only is the natural environment here very good, but it is 
also an independent small space with a very low population density. Usually, no one disturbs the 
practice, and most importantly, this independent small world is connected to the force of luck of our 
entire Great Xuan Dynasty. Because the imperial seal is here, the force of luck of countless people 
in the entire Great Xuan Dynasty will eventually gather here. Although the old strong men in our 
royal family are not It is possible to plunder all the power of luck, but the entire small world has 
been nourished by the huge power of luck, and it is also full of the breath of luck everywhere. 
Practicing here has a good effect of getting twice the result with half the effort. "

Ye Feng nodded, and then asked: "Where is the imperial seal?"

The prince looked in a certain direction and said: "The place where the power of luck is the most 
concentrated is where the imperial seal is located."

After the prince finished speaking, he directly operated his royal skills, sensed the place where the 
power of luck is the most concentrated, and then took Ye Feng to fly quickly in that direction.

Soon, they passed through the space of most of the small world and finally came to the place where 
the imperial seal was.

A huge mountain appeared here, floating in the void, looking very majestic.

And at the top of this mountain, a full ninety-nine totem poles were built, which looked very 
shocking.

In the void around these ninety-nine totem poles, there were golden dragons of luck shrouding 
them, giving people a very sacred and grand feeling.

At this time, Ye Feng immediately saw that in the middle of the ninety-nine totem poles, there was a 
cube as big as a mountain, and the whole body seemed to be made of gold and jade.

That was definitely the most precious imperial seal of the Great Xuan Dynasty that suppressed the 
destiny of a country!

Seeing this scene, the prince was also quite excited, and hurriedly said: "Let's go and take a look."



Ye Feng nodded, and the two flew directly to the mountain.

However, before they approached the mountain carrying the imperial seal, suddenly an old man in a 
golden robe suddenly appeared in front of the two.

The old man in the golden robe had a pair of unfathomable old eyes, and slowly asked: "Why did 
the prince come to the place where the imperial seal is? Is there anything special?"

Chapter 5135: Moved to tears

Hearing the question from the old man in the golden robe, the prince immediately nodded and said, 
"Senior, we came here this time to borrow the imperial seal."

"What?"

Hearing the prince say this, the old man in the golden robe's eyes suddenly flashed with a golden 
light, and he couldn't help but said, "The imperial seal is a treasure that suppresses the luck of a 
country. It's very risky for you to do this, prince. I will never allow this to happen."

Hearing the old man in the golden robe say this, the prince was about to say something, but Ye Feng 
beside him suddenly said, "Senior, we are not going to plunder the imperial seal directly, but borrow 
it for a period of time. During this period of time, I will use other things to replace the imperial seal. 
Suppressing the luck of a country will not affect the luck of the entire Daxuan Dynasty."

After saying this, Ye Feng directly took out the Giant Spirit Axe behind him.

"Hmm?"

Seeing the Giant Spirit Axe that Ye Feng took out, the old man in the golden robe looked at it 
carefully, and then suddenly couldn't help but said in surprise: "This is the magic weapon of the 
past, the Giant Spirit Axe?"

Ye Feng immediately smiled and said: "Senior, you have good eyesight. This is the Giant Spirit 
Axe. But now I have found it again and brought it back to the Great Xuan Dynasty. The Giant Spirit 
Axe is the strongest magic weapon of the Great Xuan Dynasty. It is capable of replacing the 
imperial seal and temporarily suppressing the luck of a country for a period of time."



Hearing what Ye Feng said, the old man in the golden robe hesitated a little. After all, he is an old 
senior who guards the imperial seal of the entire dynasty. Naturally, he will not let the imperial seal 
be taken away casually.

Although the other party is the prince of the current Great Xuan Dynasty, he should not do anything 
that harms the dynasty, but if an accident occurs during the use of the imperial seal, then, as the 
guardian, he will definitely be held accountable.

So at this time, the old man in the golden robe still shook his head and said, "No, I can't let you take 
such a risk."

Hearing what the old man in the golden robe said, Ye Feng glanced at the prince beside him, and the 
prince also glanced at Ye Feng, then couldn't help but stepped forward, staring at the old man in the 
golden robe, and said, "Senior, we have something very important to do this time to take the 
imperial seal. This matter concerns the safety of our entire Great Xuan Dynasty. Please be tolerant 
and let us take the imperial seal. We will return it when we finish our work."

Hearing what the prince said, the old man in the golden robe still said very firmly, "No, I can't let 
you take the imperial seal casually, even if there is a giant spirit axe to replace it."

Hearing the old man in the golden robe's firm refusal, both the prince and Ye Feng showed a look of 
disappointment in their eyes.

The prince wanted to say something, but was pulled by Ye Feng, who said, "Prince, let's go, since 
the senior doesn't want to, forget it."

After that, Ye Feng forcibly pulled the prince away.

On the way back, the prince couldn't help but ask: "Ye Feng, why did you pull me away?"

Ye Feng shook his head and said: "This old man in the golden robe obviously doesn't want us to 
take the imperial seal in a proper manner, so we can only steal the imperial seal secretly.
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"What?"



Hearing Ye Feng say this, the prince widened his eyes and said: "Once the imperial seal is stolen, it 
will definitely cause a shock to the entire Daxuan Dynasty small world. At that time, there will 
definitely be countless old-generation strong men coming to hunt us down. Even if I am the prince, 
I will definitely not be able to fight against those angry old-generation strong men."

Hearing the prince say this, Ye Feng said: "I will take the blame for this crime, Prince, don't get 
involved."

Hearing Ye Feng say this, the prince immediately said righteously: "How can that be, you took the 
imperial seal to save my father, but you are the only one who bears the blame. I don't agree."

Ye Feng immediately shook his head and said: "Prince, you can't share the crime of stealing the 
imperial seal with me, otherwise, we will have no spies in the palace. Prince, you still need to be 
steady in the palace for the time being. The first thing is to win over as many old people in the 
dynasty as possible. The first one is a strong man of the generation, standing on our side, and the 
second one is secretly watching any movement of the Dark Demon Emperor who is now disguised 
as His Majesty the Emperor, and can react at any time, so as not to let the Dark Demon Emperor 
completely control the entire imperial family of the Great Xuan Dynasty. If I can steal the imperial 
seal, I will immediately rescue your father, that is, Senior Xuan Wuji. At that time, whether the two 
of us sneak back to the palace of the Great Xuan Dynasty or go to other places, let Senior Xuan 
Wuji's strength and cultivation recover temporarily. With you, the prince, in the palace, the situation 
will become much better. If the two of us are wanted and hunted down together, then we will lose 
control of the situation inside the palace of the Great Xuan Dynasty, and it may be very troublesome 
at that time. "

Hearing Ye Feng's analysis, the prince felt that it was very reasonable, and could not help but 
nodded, and said aloud: "Okay, then I will wrong you, Ye Feng first. "

Ye Feng immediately smiled and said aloud: "What's wronged, for the bright future of the entire 
Great Xuan Dynasty, everything is worth it. "

Hearing Ye Feng's words, the prince was moved to tears. He couldn't help but patted Ye Feng on the 
shoulder and said, "Ye Feng, you are really a loyal person to my Great Xuan Dynasty!"

At this moment, the prince was extremely moved. He didn't expect Ye Feng to be so loyal to the 
Great Xuan Dynasty and devoted himself to it.



But what the prince didn't know was that the reason why Ye Feng was so dedicated was mainly for 
his future rewards.

Because Ye Feng and Xuan Wuji, the real Great Xuan Emperor, had an agreement that if he could 
help the entire Great Xuan Dynasty survive this crisis and eliminate the threats of the Dark Demon 
Emperor and the dark race, then Xuan Wuji was willing to share the entire Great Xuan Dynasty 
with Ye Feng.

By then, Ye Feng would be half an emperor!

This is the motivation for Ye Feng to work so hard.

However, Ye Feng did not say what he was thinking. After all, the prince was so moved to tears at 
this moment. If he said what he really thought, it would be too much of a downer. Let the prince be 
silently moved, which is also good.

At this moment, Ye Feng did not say much, but asked the prince to leave the small world and return 
to the palace.

He used the space wormhole technique to hide in the void, waiting for the dark night to see if he 
could successfully steal the imperial seal. Hearing the question from the old man in the golden robe, 
the prince immediately nodded and said, "Senior, we came here this time to borrow the imperial 
seal."

"What?"

Hearing the prince say this, the old man in the golden robe's eyes suddenly flashed with a golden 
light, and he couldn't help but said, "The imperial seal is a treasure that suppresses the luck of a 
country. It's very risky for you to do this, prince. I will never allow this to happen."

Hearing the old man in the golden robe say this, the prince was about to say something, but Ye Feng 
beside him suddenly said, "Senior, we are not going to plunder the imperial seal directly, but borrow 
it for a period of time. During this period of time, I will use other things to replace the imperial seal. 
Suppressing the luck of a country will not affect the luck of the entire Daxuan Dynasty."

After saying this, Ye Feng directly took out the Giant Spirit Axe behind him.



"Hmm?"

Seeing the Giant Spirit Axe that Ye Feng took out, the old man in the golden robe looked at it 
carefully, and then suddenly couldn't help but said in surprise: "This is the magic weapon of the 
past, the Giant Spirit Axe?"

Ye Feng immediately smiled and said: "Senior, you have good eyesight. This is the Giant Spirit 
Axe. But now I have found it again and brought it back to the Great Xuan Dynasty. The Giant Spirit 
Axe is the strongest magic weapon of the Great Xuan Dynasty. It is capable of replacing the 
imperial seal and temporarily suppressing the luck of a country for a period of time."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the old man in the golden robe hesitated a little. After all, he is an old 
senior who guards the imperial seal of the entire dynasty. Naturally, he will not let the imperial seal 
be taken away casually.

Although the other party is the prince of the current Great Xuan Dynasty, he should not do anything 
that harms the dynasty, but if an accident occurs during the use of the imperial seal, then, as the 
guardian, he will definitely be held accountable.

So at this time, the old man in the golden robe still shook his head and said, "No, I can't let you take 
such a risk."

Hearing what the old man in the golden robe said, Ye Feng glanced at the prince beside him, and the 
prince also glanced at Ye Feng, then couldn't help but stepped forward, staring at the old man in the 
golden robe, and said, "Senior, we have something very important to do this time to take the 
imperial seal. This matter concerns the safety of our entire Great Xuan Dynasty. Please be tolerant 
and let us take the imperial seal. We will return it when we finish our work."

Hearing what the prince said, the old man in the golden robe still said very firmly, "No, I can't let 
you take the imperial seal casually, even if there is a giant spirit axe to replace it."

Hearing the old man in the golden robe's firm refusal, both the prince and Ye Feng showed a look of 
disappointment in their eyes.

The prince wanted to say something, but was pulled by Ye Feng, who said, "Prince, let's go, since 
the senior doesn't want to, forget it."



After that, Ye Feng forcibly pulled the prince away.

On the way back, the prince couldn't help but ask: "Ye Feng, why did you pull me away?"

Ye Feng shook his head and said: "This old man in the golden robe obviously doesn't want us to 
take the imperial seal in an orderly manner, so we can only steal the imperial seal secretly.
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"

"What?"

Hearing Ye Feng say this, the prince widened his eyes and said: "Once the imperial seal is stolen, it 
will definitely cause a shock to the entire small world of the Great Xuan Dynasty. At that time, there 
will definitely be countless old masters coming to hunt us down. Even if I am the prince, I will 
definitely not be able to fight against those angry old masters."

Hearing the prince say this, Ye Feng said: "I will take the blame for this, prince, don't get involved."

Hearing Ye Feng say this, the prince immediately said righteously: "How can that be, you took the 
imperial seal to save my father, but you are the only one who bears the blame. I don't agree."

Ye Feng immediately shook his head and said, "Prince, you can't share the crime of stealing the 
imperial seal with me, otherwise, we won't have any spies in the palace. Prince, you still need to be 
steady in the palace for the time being. The first thing is to win over as many old and powerful 
people in the dynasty as possible to stand on our side. The second is to secretly watch any 
movement of the Dark Demon Emperor who is now disguised as His Majesty the Emperor, and be 
able to respond at any time. Don't let the Dark Demon Emperor completely control the entire 
imperial family of the Great Xuan Dynasty. If I can steal the imperial seal, I will immediately 
rescue your father, that is, Senior Xuan Wuji. At that time, whether the two of us sneak back to the 
palace of the Great Xuan Dynasty or go to other places, let Senior Xuan Wuji's strength and 
cultivation recover temporarily. With you, the insider, The situation in the palace will become much 
better. If we are both wanted and hunted, we will lose control of the situation inside the palace of 
the Great Xuan Dynasty, which may be very troublesome. "



Hearing Ye Feng's analysis, the prince felt that it was very reasonable. He could not help but nodded 
and said, "Okay, I'll let you down for a while, Ye Feng."

Ye Feng immediately smiled and said, "What's there to be wronged about? For the bright future of 
the entire Great Xuan Dynasty, everything is worth it."

Hearing Ye Feng's words, the prince was moved to tears. He could not help but pat Ye Feng on the 
shoulder and said, "Ye Feng, you are really a loyal person to my Great Xuan Dynasty!"

At this moment, the prince was extremely moved. He did not expect Ye Feng to be so loyal to the 
Great Xuan Dynasty and devoted himself to it.

But what the prince did not know was that the reason why Ye Feng was so dedicated was mainly for 
his own reward in the future.

Because Ye Feng and Xuan Wuji, the real Great Xuan Emperor, had an agreement that if he could 
help the entire Great Xuan Dynasty survive this crisis and eliminate the threat of the Dark Demon 
Emperor and the dark race, then Xuan Wuji would be willing to share the entire Great Xuan 
Dynasty with Ye Feng.

At that time, Ye Feng would be half an emperor!

This is the motivation for Ye Feng to work so hard.

However, Ye Feng did not say what he thought in his heart. After all, the prince was so moved that 
he cried at this moment. If he said his true thoughts, it would be too bad. Let the prince be moved 
silently, which is also good.

At this moment, Ye Feng did not say much, but let the prince leave the small world directly and 
return to the palace.

And he used the space wormhole technique to hide in the void, waiting for the dark night to see if 
he could successfully steal the imperial seal.

Chapter 5136 Dark Hero

For Ye Feng, since he has entered the small world inside the palace this time, he must get the 
Imperial Seal.



Because Ye Feng knew very well that the imperial seal was the most critical thing to rescue Xuan 
Wuji, the real emperor.

If the Imperial Jade Seal cannot be obtained, it will be impossible to rescue Xuan Wuji.

This has a huge impact on Ye Feng's next plan to deal with the entire Dark Demon Emperor.

Because Ye Feng knew very well that just by relying on junior figures like himself and the prince, 
no matter how fast they grew, they would never be able to catch up with the cultivation and strength 
of the Dark Demon Emperor in a short period of time.

Only by rescuing a super strong man like the real emperor Xuan Wuji and helping him regain his 
original strength can it be possible to unite to deal with the Dark Demon Emperor.

So Ye Feng asked the prince to leave this small inner world first, so as not to be identified as the 
thief who stole the jade seal.

Ye Feng temporarily took all the blame on himself, and only after he finally rescued Xuan Wuji 
could he tell the truth to the world.

So Ye Feng had to do all this.

Even if he is charged with being hunted.

Because the current Daxuan Dynasty does not need a hero on the surface.

The hero on the surface is of no use.

The current Daxuan Dynasty needs a hero in the darkness who can bear the blame.

Ye Feng must become a hero in this darkness! Silently bear all the so-called guilt!



At this moment, Ye Feng was hiding in the void, slowly lurking in the direction of the Imperial Jade 
Seal he had just discovered.

It has to be said that Ye Feng's spatial talent is still very strong.

Moreover, the space wormhole that Ye Feng awakened was very magical. Even the old man in gold 
robe who guarded the imperial seal before had extremely powerful cultivation, and it was absolutely 
impossible for him to find Ye Feng hiding in the void.

At this moment, Ye Feng kept approaching the imperial seal in the void.

Ye Feng immediately saw it in the void. On the mountain peak in front of him, the Imperial Jade 
Seal was entangled in the power of luck and suspended high in the sky.

Ye Feng saw it. There was not only an old man in gold robe, but also an old man in white robe.
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The old men, two very powerful elders of the royal family of the Daxuan Dynasty, were hiding in 
the surrounding void, guarding the jade seal of the dynasty.

At this time, Ye Feng knew very well that the moment he obtained the imperial seal, his specific 
location would be discovered instantly by these two powerful elders. In this case, Ye Feng would be 
chased crazily.

But Ye Feng has no choice now, he can only fight.

And with the Giant Spirit God's Ax on his back, Ye Feng was actually somewhat confident that he 
could evade the pursuit of several strong men.

call!

At this moment, Ye Feng took a deep breath, and without any hesitation, he immediately rushed out 
of the void. In an instant, he appeared in front of the Imperial Jade Seal. He immediately put the 
Imperial Jade Seal into his storage ring, and then instantly He lurked into the void again.



The whole operation was completed in one go!

Even the two powerful elders who were guarding the surroundings did not notice this sudden 
change at all.

They didn't react until Ye Feng stole the imperial seal, and then they immediately shouted in shock 
and anger: "Which thief dares to be so bold and dares to steal the energy of our Daxuan Dynasty?" 
The object of luck, the Imperial Seal? Come and give me your life!”

Boom!

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately felt that two senior superpowers behind him were frantically 
bombarding the void, trying to force himself out of the void.

Ye Feng felt it at this time, and his whole body was about to break into pieces.

Ye Feng guessed that these two elders were more than a dozen levels stronger than himself.

Their power was able to penetrate the deep void and attack Ye Feng.

At this moment, Ye Feng's Immortal Body of the God, even though it was very strong, was almost 
falling apart under the attack of such a terrifying old man.

Buzz!

But suddenly at this moment, the Giant Spirit God Ax carried on Ye Feng's back suddenly emitted a 
bright white light,

A huge ancient shield condensed directly on Ye Feng's back.

This huge shield is completely made up of the light emitted by the Giant Spirit God's Ax, forming 
an ancient giant spirit shield that can withstand a lot of damage, which immediately relieves Ye 
Feng's pressure a lot.



At this moment, Ye Feng suddenly felt that his pressure was much less and his speed was much 
faster.

Swish, swish, swish!

Ye Feng fled crazily in the void, quickly escaping towards the outside of the entire Daxuan Dynasty.

The two powerful elders who were chasing behind him immediately called for friends and 
summoned a dozen elders who had the same cultivation level as them.

Seeing this scene, Ye Feng couldn't help but take a breath of air. This Daxuan Dynasty was indeed 
the overlord-level power in the land of Zhongzhou. The elders and powerful men in the royal family 
were really terrifying.

There are more than a dozen senior experts who are more than a dozen realms higher than Ye Feng. 
This kind of background is simply extremely profound!

At this moment, although Ye Feng sighed in his heart, the situation was very urgent.

Although he was protected by the giant shield condensed by the giant spirit axe behind him, the 
pressure from more than a dozen old royal masters was still very terrifying.

Fortunately, Ye Feng was escaping in the deep void. If he was in the outside space, even with the 
protection of the giant spirit axe, he would be crushed into pieces in an instant.

Fortunately, Ye Feng had the art of escaping from the void.

At this time, Ye Feng opened up one wormhole after another and fled quickly in the deep void.

Even if the cultivation of these old figures of the royal family of the Great Xuan Dynasty was more 
than a dozen realms higher than Ye Feng's current level, it was useless.



Ye Feng had a solid immortal body of the gods, and the protection of the giant shield condensed by 
the giant spirit axe behind him. Ye Feng would not have any problems for a while, but could flee 
quickly.

Soon, Ye Feng escaped from the palace of the entire Great Xuan Dynasty and came to the 
wilderness outside.

But those people were still chasing him, so Ye Feng could only harden his heart and continue to fly 
outside the territory of the Great Xuan Dynasty.
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Fly quickly.

Soon, Ye Feng came to the outside of the territory and entered the wilderness and deep forests 
outside.

But at this time, a group of more than a dozen old masters of the Great Xuan Dynasty were still 
chasing Ye Feng.

At this moment, Ye Feng could only continue to flee and continue to flee to the deepest part of the 
wilderness and deep forests.

Soon, Ye Feng fled to the deepest part.

At this time, more than a dozen old masters of the Great Xuan Dynasty, because of their too strong 
aura, directly attracted a very terrifying monster in the deep wilderness and deep mountains.

Buzz!

It was a huge dragon with 19 heads. The 19-headed dragon roared, and the whole sky and the earth 
seemed to be vibrating.

More than a dozen old figures of the Great Xuan Dynasty couldn't help but change their faces at this 
moment, and dared not move forward.



Because if we go further, we will reach the deepest area of this wilderness.

In the deepest part of the Great Wilderness Forest, there live extremely terrifying creatures.

The dragon with 19 heads just now is definitely a forbidden creature in the deepest part of the Great 
Wilderness Forest.

"Damn it, let that kid run away!"

At this time, an old and powerful man in the Great Xuan Dynasty couldn't help but say: "Even if 
this kid runs away, it's useless. He will definitely be killed by some forbidden creatures in the 
deepest part of this Great Wilderness Forest. As long as the imperial seal is not obtained by some 
people with ulterior motives, there will be no problem. Even if it is lost, it will not cause much harm 
to our Great Xuan Dynasty."

At this moment, after more than a dozen old and powerful men of the Great Xuan Dynasty finished 
speaking, they temporarily stationed in the outer area of this Great Wilderness Forest, forcing Ye 
Feng, not letting Ye Feng escape, and letting Ye Feng fend for himself inside.

After all, they didn't know the real purpose of Ye Feng stealing the imperial seal, they just thought 
that Ye Feng was a thief who wanted to harm their Great Xuan Dynasty.

At this moment, Ye Feng took the imperial seal and went deep into the deepest area of the vast 
forest. He landed on a quiet grassland and breathed a sigh of relief. Those old guys finally stopped 
chasing him.

Chapter 5137: Colorful-clothed woman

At this time, Ye Feng took the Yuxi of the Dynasty and prepared to leave the depths of this wild 
forest and go to the place where the real emperor of the Daxuan Dynasty, Xuan Wuji, was trapped, 
and hurry up to rescue Xuan Wuji.

After all, for Ye Feng, the most important thing now is to rescue the real emperor Xuan Wuji, and 
then find a way to restore Xuan Wuji to his previous strength. Only in this way can he be truly 
qualified to fight against the Dark Demon Emperor who is now pretending to be the emperor. .



But just when Ye Feng was about to leave here, a mysterious figure suddenly appeared in front of 
Ye Feng.

It was a woman wearing colorful clothes. She looked extremely beautiful, but there was no aura of 
cultivation about her.

But Ye Feng knew that this was definitely not a mortal, but an extremely terrifying figure.

Otherwise, with such a powerful cultivation level, I can't sense any aura from the other party. This is 
simply terrible. The other party is absolutely unfathomable.

Ye Feng immediately became vigilant because he didn't know the purpose of the other party 
suddenly appearing in front of him.

At this moment, Ye Feng couldn't help but said: "Who is the girl? Why are you blocking my way?"

The woman in colorful clothes stared at Ye Feng at this moment, couldn't help but smile slightly, 
and said loudly: "Where are you from?"

Hearing the woman in colorful clothes ask this question, Ye Feng's eyes showed a look of surprise.

However, the other party was unfathomable, so Ye Feng could only nod his head honestly, and 
replied aloud: "I come from the Daxuan Dynasty in the land of Zhongzhou."

"Daxuan Dynasty?"

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the woman in colorful clothes nodded slightly and said loudly: "No 
wonder you can carry the ax of the Giant Spirit God on your back."

Hearing what the woman in colorful clothes said, Ye Feng's eyes immediately changed slightly, and 
he quickly said, "Senior, do you want to snatch the Giant Spirit God's Ax from me?"

After saying that, Ye Feng burst out with an extremely powerful cultivation aura without hesitation, 
and he wanted to leave here immediately.



But just when Ye Feng burst out with a terrifying cultivation momentum and was about to escape, 
the mysterious woman in colorful clothes in front of him suddenly stretched out a finger as white as 
an onion and pointed it directly at Ye Feng's. A little bit in the direction.

Buzz!

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately felt an inexplicable and huge power appearing in the entire 
world.

Ye Feng's powerful cultivation aura was directly blocked in a small space.

Ye Feng couldn't even open up the void.

At this time, sensing all this, Ye Feng suddenly showed a wry smile on his face.

It seems that this woman in colorful clothes is much more terrifying than she imagined. This kind of 
cultivation is simply earth-shattering, as grand as the sky.

Ye Feng couldn't help but feel a little helpless in his heart, why he was getting stronger and stronger, 
but every time he met such a terrifying person who was much stronger than him.

At this moment, Ye Feng was about to say something, but the woman in colorful clothes smiled 
slightly and said loudly: "Little fellow of the human race, you don't need to be too nervous. I don't 
want to rob you of the giant spirit god." "Axe, I just want to borrow your Giant Spirit God's ax."

"Um?"

listen
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When the woman in colorful clothes said this, Ye Feng suddenly showed a look of doubt in his eyes, 
and said loudly: "Senior's cultivation is so terrifying, why do you still need my Giant Spirit God's 
Ax? Logically speaking, the Giant Spirit God Although the ax is a magical weapon in our Daxuan 



Dynasty, in the eyes of a terrifying and powerful person like my predecessor, it is probably not that 
precious. "

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the woman in colorful clothes smiled slightly and said: "What I need is 
not the Giant Spirit God's Ax itself, but the Giant Spirit God's will contained in the Giant Spirit 
God's Ax. Since the Giant Spirit God's Ax is willing to be carried on your back, it means that the 
Giant Spirit God's will contained in the Giant Spirit God's Ax is obeying your orders, so I want you 
to control the Giant Spirit God's Ax. With the will of the giant spirit god, help me do something. 
After completing this thing, I will not only let you go, but also give you a huge opportunity to help 
you transform your entire strength. "

Hearing what the woman in colorful clothes said, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly flashed.

This woman in colorful clothes obviously used both soft and hard tactics, not only forcing herself 
through strong strength, but also throwing out a huge bait of chance.

However, the other party did not directly arrest him and force him to do things, which already 
shows that the other party is quite well-educated.

At this time, Ye Feng was thinking in his heart whether he should take the risk and follow this 
woman in colorful clothes.

Because Ye Feng now guesses that this woman in colorful clothes is definitely not a super strong 
person among the human race. It is very likely that she is a woman who took the form of an 
extremely terrifying taboo creature deep in this wild forest.

Therefore, the beautiful young woman in front of her may very well be an extremely terrifying 
monster.

At this time, seeing Ye Feng thinking, the woman in colorful clothes smiled slightly and said: 
"Don't think that I am threatening you, and thus have a rebellious mentality. If I really want to 
threaten you, I have countless means. I can make you obedient. The reason why I am talking to you 
politely is because I respect your choice. After all, you are the person chosen by the Giant Spirit 
God Ax. I still respect Zhongzhou like the Giant Spirit God Ax very much. The choice of a rare 
magical weapon on earth."

Obviously, the reason why this woman in colorful clothes was so polite to Ye Feng was mainly 
because the Giant Spirit God Ax chose Ye Feng, and it had nothing to do with Ye Feng himself.



Ye Feng also knows this. After all, his current cultivation level may be regarded as a top-notch 
existence among the younger generation of Daxuan Dynasty, but in the eyes of some elders, or in 
the eyes of such taboo monsters deep in the wild forest, , that is absolutely nothing, just an ant 
among the human race, entirely because the Ax of the Giant Spirit God created this condition for 
himself.

At this time, since the situation was like this, Ye Feng didn't hesitate much. He just nodded and said: 
"Since the seniors are so sincere, then the juniors naturally have nothing to refuse, so they will 
follow you, seniors." Right, but the Giant Spirit God's Ax has its own will, and I can't control the 
Giant Spirit God's will. When the time comes, if the Giant Spirit God's will is unwilling to help, I 
still need to discuss it with the Giant Spirit God's Ax. "

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the woman in colorful clothes didn't care, she just smiled slightly, a 
faint smile appeared on her beautiful face, and said loudly: "Since the Ax of the Giant Spirit God 
has chosen you, it will definitely listen to you. of."

After saying that, the woman in colorful clothes walked directly towards a certain direction deep in 
the wilderness forest, while Ye Feng followed directly with a deep expression on his face. At this 
time, Ye Feng took the Yuxi of the Dynasty and prepared to leave the depths of this wild forest and 
go to the place where the real emperor of the Daxuan Dynasty, Xuan Wuji, was trapped, and hurry 
up to rescue Xuan Wuji.

After all, for Ye Feng, the most important thing now is to rescue the real emperor Xuan Wuji, and 
then find a way to restore Xuan Wuji to his previous strength. Only in this way can he be truly 
qualified to fight against the Dark Demon Emperor who is now disguised as the emperor. .

But just when Ye Feng was about to leave here, a mysterious figure suddenly appeared in front of 
Ye Feng.

It was a woman wearing colorful clothes. She looked extremely beautiful, but there was no aura of 
cultivation about her.

But Ye Feng knew that this was definitely not a mortal, but an extremely terrifying figure.

Otherwise, with such a powerful cultivation level, I can't sense any aura from the other party. This is 
simply terrible. The other party is absolutely unfathomable. ??



Ye Feng immediately became vigilant because he didn't know the purpose of the other party 
suddenly appearing in front of him.

At this moment, Ye Feng couldn't help but said: "Who is the girl? Why are you blocking my way?"

The woman in colorful clothes stared at Ye Feng at this moment, couldn't help but smile slightly, 
and said loudly: "Where are you from?"

Hearing the woman in colorful clothes ask this question, Ye Feng's eyes showed a look of surprise.

However, the other party was unfathomable, so Ye Feng could only nod his head honestly and 
replied aloud: "I come from the Daxuan Dynasty in the land of Zhongzhou."

"Daxuan Dynasty?"

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the woman in colorful clothes nodded slightly and said loudly: "No 
wonder you can carry the ax of the Giant Spirit God on your back."

Hearing what the woman in colorful clothes said, Ye Feng's eyes immediately changed slightly, and 
he quickly said, "Senior, do you want to snatch the Giant Spirit God's Ax from me?"

After saying that, Ye Feng burst out with an extremely powerful cultivation aura without hesitation, 
and he wanted to leave here immediately.

But just when Ye Feng burst out with a terrifying cultivation momentum and was about to escape, 
the mysterious woman in colorful clothes in front of him suddenly stretched out a finger as white as 
an onion and pointed it directly at Ye Feng's A little bit in the direction.

Buzz!

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately felt an inexplicable and huge power appearing in the entire 
world.

Ye Feng's powerful cultivation aura was directly blocked in a small space.



Ye Feng couldn't even open up the void.

At this time, sensing all this, Ye Feng suddenly showed a wry smile on his face.

It seems that this woman in colorful clothes is much more terrifying than she imagined. This kind of 
cultivation is simply earth-shattering, as grand as the sky.

Ye Feng couldn't help but feel a little helpless in his heart, why he was getting stronger and stronger, 
but every time he met such a terrifying person who was much stronger than him.

At this moment, Ye Feng was about to say something, but the woman in colorful clothes smiled 
slightly and said loudly: "Little fellow of the human race, you don't need to be too nervous. I don't 
want to rob you of the giant spirit god." Ax, I just want to borrow your Giant Spirit God’s ax.”

"Um?"

listen
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When the woman in colorful clothes said this, Ye Feng suddenly showed a look of doubt in his eyes, 
and said loudly: "Senior's cultivation is so terrifying, why do you still need my Giant Spirit God's 
Ax? Logically speaking, the Giant Spirit God Although the ax is a magical weapon in our Daxuan 
Dynasty, in the eyes of a terrifying and powerful person like my predecessor, it is probably not that 
precious. "

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the woman in colorful clothes smiled slightly and said: "What I need is 
not the Giant Spirit God's Ax itself, but the Giant Spirit God's will contained in the Giant Spirit 
God's Ax. Since the Giant Spirit God's Ax is willing to be carried on your back, it means that the 
Giant Spirit God's will contained in the Giant Spirit God's Ax is obeying your orders, so I want you 
to control the Giant Spirit God's Ax. With the will of the giant spirit god, help me do something. 
After completing this thing, I will not only let you go, but also give you a huge opportunity to help 
you transform your entire strength. "

Hearing what the woman in colorful clothes said, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly flickered.



This woman in colorful clothes obviously used both soft and hard tactics, not only forcing herself 
through strong strength, but also throwing out a huge bait of chance.

However, the other party did not directly capture him and force him to do things, which already 
shows that the other party is quite well-educated.

At this time, Ye Feng was thinking in his heart whether he should take the risk and follow this 
woman in colorful clothes.

Because Ye Feng now guesses that this woman in colorful clothes is definitely not a super strong 
person among the human race. It is very likely that she is a woman who took the form of an 
extremely terrifying taboo creature deep in this wild forest.

Therefore, the beautiful young woman in front of her may very well be an extremely terrifying 
monster.

At this time, seeing Ye Feng thinking, the woman in colorful clothes smiled slightly and said: 
"Don't think that I am threatening you, and thus have a rebellious mentality. If I really want to 
threaten you, I have countless means. I can make you obedient. The reason why I am talking to you 
politely is because I respect your choice. After all, you are the person chosen by the Ax of the Giant 
Spirit God. I still respect Zhongzhou like the Ax of the Giant Spirit God. The choice of a rare 
magical weapon on earth."

Obviously, the reason why this woman in colorful clothes was so polite to Ye Feng was mainly 
because the Giant Spirit God Ax chose Ye Feng, and it had nothing to do with Ye Feng himself.

Ye Feng also knows this. After all, his current cultivation level may be regarded as a top-notch 
existence among the younger generation of Daxuan Dynasty, but in the eyes of some elders, or in 
the eyes of such taboo monsters deep in the wild forest, , that is absolutely nothing, just an ant 
among the human race, entirely because the Ax of the Giant Spirit God created this condition for 
himself.

At this time, since the situation was like this, Ye Feng didn't hesitate much. He just nodded and said: 
"Since the seniors are so sincere, then the juniors naturally have nothing to refuse, so they will 
follow you, seniors." Right, but the Giant Spirit God's Ax has its own will, and I cannot control the 
Giant Spirit God's will. If the Giant Spirit God's will is unwilling to help, I will need to discuss it 
with the Giant Spirit God's Ax. "



Hearing what Ye Feng said, the woman in colorful clothes didn't care, she just smiled slightly, a 
faint smile appeared on her beautiful face, and said loudly: "Since the Ax of the Giant Spirit God 
has chosen you, it will definitely listen to you. of."

After saying that, the woman in colorful clothes walked directly towards a certain direction deep in 
the wilderness forest, while Ye Feng followed directly with a deep expression on his face.

Chapter 5139: Heart of the Mineral Vein

At this time, seeing such a group of civilized and polite people transformed by top monsters, Ye 
Feng felt a lot more relaxed, and even felt that this was a huge opportunity that he had encountered 
unintentionally.

At this moment, Ye Feng looked at everyone in the audience with expectant eyes.

The woman in colorful clothes first looked at the person in the first row. He was a middle-aged man 
wearing light yellow clothes. He didn't know what kind of terrifying monster he was in the form of, 
but his cultivation was unfathomable.

The woman in colorful clothes said: "Master Huangshu, let's start with you and give Ye Feng a 
chance to make a fortune. Don't be perfunctory. Otherwise, if Ye Feng is not satisfied, the ax of the 
giant spirit god in his hand will definitely not be the same." Help us."

Hearing what the woman in colorful clothes said, the middle-aged man in light yellow clothes, 
known as Huangshu Zhenren, immediately burst into laughter and said loudly: "I am not a stingy 
person. Since I ask for help from others, , then it will definitely satisfy the other party.”

When he said this, the middle-aged man stared directly at Ye Feng, his rough face full of boldness, 
and said loudly: "Young man, what kind of thing do you want, just tell me directly, I As long as 
there is, I will definitely give it to you.”

Hearing what the Yellow Squirrel Master said, Ye Feng glanced at the woman in colorful clothes 
next to him, with a hint of questioning in his eyes.

After all, Ye Feng was not very familiar with these monsters, and he did not dare to say anything 
too extreme.



Seeing Ye Feng looking at her, the woman in colorful clothes smiled slightly, with a warm smile on 
her beautiful face, and said loudly: "Ye Feng, this is a rare opportunity, just open your mouth like a 
lion, Don’t worry so much.”

Hearing what the woman in colorful clothes said, Ye Feng was naturally no longer polite, but 
looked at the middle-aged man known as Huangshu Zhenren, and said slowly: "I want to be able to 
improve my cultivation level. The resources of heaven and earth should preferably be the most 
advanced energy crystals or some very precious high-level elixirs.”

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the yellow rat master immediately laughed and said: "I have a lot of 
these things. I usually live in the underground space, and I can often accidentally encounter some 
things buried deep underground. Precious mineral veins, among some precious mineral veins, I can 
sometimes find some very high-grade energy crystals, which are condensed from the core of each 
mineral vein. "

When he said this, the middle-aged man took out a stone that exuded a faint earthy yellow light 
from his storage ring.

This stone is only the size of a fist, but the energy fluctuations it emits when it is taken out are as 
vast as the ocean.

Ye Feng's eyes suddenly lit up. This stone was definitely not an ordinary energy crystal. It was not 
even a high-level energy crystal. It was like the core condensed from an entire mineral vein. .

At this moment, Master Huangshu smiled slightly and said: "This is a heart of mineral veins, and 
the energy contained in it is as huge as the ocean. I originally wanted to keep it for some 
particularly outstanding ones among my disciples. Talents can use it, but this time since we want to 
ask the ax of the giant spirit god in your hands to help us solve a very difficult matter, then this 
piece of mineral heart will be given to you. "

After Master Huangshu finished speaking, he directly delivered the heart of the mineral vein to Ye 
Feng's hands.

Ye Feng was very surprised at this moment. He didn't expect that he could get such a precious 
mineral vein.
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Heart.

This is the energy of an entire mineral vein, gathered into a stone. I can't imagine how much energy 
is contained in this fist-sized stone.

So at this moment, after Ye Feng got the heart of the mineral vein, he swallowed it directly without 
any hesitation.

"What?"

Seeing this scene, many monsters present were shocked.

Especially Huangshu Zhenren, he couldn't help but said anxiously: "Young man, don't be impulsive. 
This is not an ordinary energy crystal, but the heart of a mineral vein condensed from an entire 
mineral vein. The energy is endless. If you swallow it all at once, you will definitely explode and 
die instantly. Your cultivation is too weak and you cannot withstand the energy of an entire mine 
heart."

boom!

But the moment the Huangshu master finished speaking, Ye Feng suddenly burst out with an 
extremely powerful aura.

Ye Feng's cultivation level actually broke through on the spot, from the first level of Jiuding Realm 
to the second level of Jiuding Realm in an instant!

In addition, Ye Feng's cultivation momentum is still increasing, and it seems that he will continue to 
make breakthroughs.

This shows that Ye Feng is now rapidly digesting and absorbing the energy in the Mineral Heart.

Ye Feng did not explode and die at all. Instead, he was rapidly using the energy in the heart of the 
mineral vein to crazily improve his skills and cultivation.



"What?"

Seeing this scene, not to mention the real Huangshu, but also the strong men transformed by other 
monsters around him, were all shocked to the extreme at this moment.

Even the strongest young man in golden robes among the people, including the woman in colorful 
clothes who brought Ye Feng here, stared at Ye Feng in surprise, as if they did not expect that such a 
small human race boy like Ye Feng would He actually has such a strong digestive ability.

You must know that even beings of their level would not dare to swallow an entire mineral heart 
rashly.

"As expected of the person chosen by the Ax of the Giant Spirit God, he is indeed quite powerful."

At this time, Huang Shuzhen couldn't help laughing.

At this moment, Ye Feng was frantically refining the energy in the Mineral Heart.

The reason why Ye Feng swallowed the refining directly on the spot was not only because he 
wanted to use this heart of mineral veins to improve his cultivation level as soon as possible, but 
also because he deliberately showed off his magical ability to make these wild forests deep. The top 
monsters here know that although they are just an ordinary human boy at the moment, their talents 
and abilities are definitely not that simple and ordinary.

Ye Feng is increasing his weight in the eyes of these monsters and striving for more benefits for 
himself.

The woman in colorful clothes seemed to understand what Ye Feng meant by doing this. She 
immediately couldn't help laughing and shook her head, with an inexplicable look on her beautiful 
face: "What a funny little guy, but this kind of The ability is indeed quite miraculous.”

And the young man in golden robe who was transformed into the giant dragon with nineteen heads, 
the strongest among them all, stared at Ye Feng and said loudly: "This little guy is quite suitable for 
us. If you have the chance, ask him if he would like to practice and live together with us." At this 
time, seeing such a group of civilized and polite top monsters, Ye Feng felt a lot more relaxed. I 
even felt that this was a huge opportunity that I encountered accidentally.



At this moment, Ye Feng looked at everyone in the audience with expectant eyes.

The woman in colorful clothes first looked at the person in the first row. He was a middle-aged man 
wearing light yellow clothes. He didn't know what kind of terrifying monster he was in the form of, 
but his cultivation was unfathomable.

The woman in colorful clothes said: "Master Huangshu, let's start with you and give Ye Feng a 
chance to make a fortune. Don't be perfunctory. Otherwise, if Ye Feng is not satisfied, the ax of the 
giant spirit god in his hand will definitely not be the same." Help us."

Hearing what the woman in colorful clothes said, the middle-aged man in light yellow clothes, 
known as Huangshu Zhenren, immediately burst into laughter and said loudly: "I am not a stingy 
person. Since I ask for help from others, , then it will definitely satisfy the other party.”

When he said this, the middle-aged man stared directly at Ye Feng, his rough face full of boldness, 
and said loudly: "Young man, what kind of thing do you want, tell me directly, I As long as there is, 
I will definitely give it to you.”

Hearing what the Yellow Squirrel Master said, Ye Feng glanced at the woman in colorful clothes 
next to him, with a hint of questioning in his eyes.

After all, Ye Feng was not very familiar with these monsters, and he did not dare to say anything 
too extreme.

Seeing Ye Feng looking at her, the woman in colorful clothes smiled slightly, with a warm smile on 
her beautiful face, and said loudly: "Ye Feng, this is a rare opportunity, just open your mouth like a 
lion, Don’t worry so much.”

Hearing what the woman in colorful clothes said, Ye Feng was naturally no longer polite, but 
looked at the middle-aged man known as Huangshu Zhenren, and said slowly: "I want to be able to 
improve my cultivation level. The resources of heaven and earth should preferably be the most 
advanced energy crystals or some very precious high-level elixirs.”

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the yellow rat master immediately laughed and said: "I have a lot of 
these things. I usually live in the underground space, and I can often accidentally encounter some 
things buried deep underground. Precious mineral veins, among some precious mineral veins, I can 



sometimes find some very high-grade energy crystals, which are condensed from the core of each 
mineral vein. "

When he said this, the middle-aged man took out a stone that exuded a faint earthy yellow light 
from his storage ring.

This stone is only the size of a fist, but the energy fluctuations it emits when it is taken out are as 
vast as the ocean.

Ye Feng's eyes suddenly lit up. This stone was definitely not an ordinary energy crystal. It was not 
even a high-level energy crystal. It was like the core condensed from an entire mineral vein. .

At this moment, Master Huangshu smiled slightly and said: "This is a heart of mineral veins, and 
the energy contained in it is as huge as the ocean. I originally wanted to keep it for some 
particularly outstanding ones among my disciples. Talents can use it, but this time since we want to 
ask the ax of the giant spirit god in your hands to help us solve a very difficult matter, then this 
piece of mineral heart will be given to you. "

After Master Huangshu finished speaking, he directly delivered the heart of the mineral vein to Ye 
Feng's hands.

Ye Feng was very surprised at this moment. He didn't expect that he could get such a precious 
mineral vein.
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Heart.

This is the energy of an entire mineral vein, gathered into a stone. I can't imagine how much energy 
is contained in this fist-sized stone.

So at this moment, after Ye Feng got the heart of the mineral vein, he swallowed it directly without 
any hesitation.

"What?"



Seeing this scene, many monsters present were shocked.

Especially Huang Shu Zhenren, who immediately couldn't help but said anxiously: "Young man, 
don't be impulsive. This is not an ordinary energy crystal, but the heart of the ore condensed from 
an entire ore vein. The energy in it is endless. If you swallow it all at once, you will definitely 
explode and die instantly. Your cultivation is too weak and you can't bear the energy of the entire 
heart of the ore vein at all."

Boom!

However, at the moment when Huang Shu Zhenren's voice fell, Ye Feng's body suddenly burst out 
with an extremely powerful momentum.

Ye Feng's cultivation actually broke through on the spot, directly from the previous Jiuding Realm 
First Heaven, and instantly broke through to the Jiuding Realm Second Heaven!

In addition, Ye Feng's cultivation momentum is still increasing, and it seems that he will continue to 
break through.

This shows that Ye Feng is now rapidly digesting and absorbing the energy in the heart of the ore 
vein.

Ye Feng did not explode and die at all. Instead, he was rapidly using the energy in the heart of the 
ore vein to madly improve his skills and cultivation.

"What?"

Seeing this scene, not to mention Huang Shu Zhenren, even the other monsters around were all 
extremely surprised at this moment.

Even the strongest young man in a golden robe, including the colorful woman who brought Ye Feng 
here, stared at Ye Feng with surprise, as if they didn't expect that Ye Feng, a small human boy, 
would have such a strong digestion ability.



You know, even beings of their level don't dare to rashly swallow a whole vein heart.

"It's worthy of being the person chosen by the Giant Spirit Axe. It's really amazing."

At this time, Huang Shu Zhenren couldn't help laughing.

At this moment, Ye Feng was frantically refining the energy in the vein heart.

The reason why Ye Feng swallowed and refined it directly on the spot, in addition to wanting to use 
this vein heart to improve his cultivation as soon as possible, there was another reason, that is, 
deliberately showing his magical ability, so that these top monsters in the depths of the Great 
Wilderness Forest know that although he is currently just an ordinary human boy, his talent and 
ability are definitely not so simple and ordinary.

Ye Feng was trying to improve his weight in the eyes of these monsters and gain more benefits for 
himself.

The colorful-clothed woman seemed to understand what Ye Feng meant by doing this. She couldn't 
help but smile and shook her head. An inexplicable look appeared on her beautiful face: "What an 
interesting little guy, but this ability is really amazing."

The strongest among the crowd, the giant dragon with 19 heads, the young man in a golden robe, 
stared at Ye Feng and said: "This little guy is quite suitable for us. If there is a chance, ask him if he 
is willing to practice and live with us in the future."

Chapter 5140 Dragon Blood Crystal

At this moment, it is obvious that Ye Feng has become synonymous with extreme genius in the eyes 
of all the superpowers transformed by monsters.

Because Ye Feng did something that even they might not be able to do.

The energy contained in the heart of the mineral vein that Huang Shuzhen took out was like a vast 
ocean. Even these extremely powerful monsters would not be able to swallow a heart of the mineral 
vein at once.

Therefore, Ye Feng's move naturally increased his weight in the minds of many superpowers.



At this moment, Ye Feng is just continuing to refine this heart of mineral veins.

Ye Feng had only refined nearly one-fifth of the energy just now, and his cultivation level suddenly 
broke through an entire level, from the first level of the Jiuding Realm to the second level of the 
Jiuding Realm, very fast.

Now Ye Feng continues to refine the remaining energy of the Mineral Heart, and the cultivation 
aura on his body is rapidly and continuously breaking through again.

boom!

The third level of Jiuding Realm!

boom!

The fourth level of Jiuding Realm!

boom!

The fifth level of Jiuding Realm! !

At this time, Ye Feng's cultivation finally stopped completely.

Ye Feng could feel his cultivation at this moment. After making so many breakthroughs at once, his 
strength and combat effectiveness had been greatly improved.

At this moment, Ye Feng opened his eyes and had completely refined the heart of the mineral vein.

At this time, Ye Feng immediately looked at the real Huangshu in front of him, smiled and said, 
"Thank you, senior, for the gift."

At this moment, this middle-aged man in light yellow clothes showed a very appreciative 
expression on his face. He couldn't help but patted Ye Feng on the shoulder and said loudly: "You 



really impress me. Ah, I thought you were very ordinary, very ordinary, but I couldn’t figure out 
why such a magical weapon as the Ax of the Giant Spirit God would choose a boy like you. I didn’t 
expect that you showed off your skills to us when you came up. Good for you."

Obviously, Ye Feng's behavior just now shocked everyone.

Even though these are all super strong men transformed from the top monsters in the wild forest, 
they all admire Ye Feng's ability to digest them.

Moreover, this method of breakthrough is too simple and crude. It directly eats the energy from the 
outside world and strengthens one's own power. It is really surprising.

At this moment, the woman in colorful clothes showed a surprised smile in her eyes. She looked at 
Ye Feng and said aloud: "Ye Feng, you never expected that you have such a powerful ability. Even I 
can't." I don’t dare to swallow and refine an entire mineral core in an instant.”

Hearing what the woman in colorful clothes said, Ye Feng just smiled and said, "My ability is 
indeed quite special."

At this moment, the woman in colorful clothes looked at the second figure, which was a woman in a 
red dress. She looked very mature and had a sense of charm. She was probably some kind of very 
powerful monster. of.

At this moment, the woman in colorful clothes said: "Sister Red Snake, it's your turn to give Ye 
Feng a gift."

At this time, Ye Feng was still looking forward to it.

After all, being the first to give him a gift has allowed him to achieve so many breakthroughs.

There were a dozen big shots present!

at this time
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, Ye Feng stared at the woman in the red dress, and immediately clasped his fists and said: "Senior, 
the first choice I want is the resources of the world that can directly improve my cultivation skills."

This woman, who was called the Red Snake by the woman in colorful clothes, was staring at Ye 
Feng in front of her, with a faint smile on her charming face, and said aloud: "Okay, since I need 
something from you this time, then I will definitely give you something that will satisfy you.”

After saying that, the woman called Red Snake took out a red crystal-like thing from her storage 
ring.

Ye Feng stared at this piece of red crystal, with a look of surprise in his eyes.

Because Ye Feng did not sense any energy fluctuations from this red crystal, it meant that it was not 
an energy crystal.

Ye Feng couldn't help but asked: "Senior Red Snake, I don't feel any energy fluctuations from this 
red crystal stone. Can this improve my cultivation skills?"

Hearing Ye Feng's question, Red Snake smiled slightly and said: "This piece of red crystal is a 
dragon's blood crystal passed down from ancient times by our Red Snake clan. It contains a drop of 
the ancient Red Dragon clan. "Dragon blood, the reason why you can't sense energy is because this 
crystal stone itself has no energy. It is mainly used to seal a drop of the ancient red dragon's blood."

"Um?"

Hearing what the red snake said, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly showed a bright color, and he quickly 
said: "It's so precious, it's actually a drop of the blood of an ancient red dragon!"

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately took the red crystal stone into his hands.

Because Ye Feng knew very well that a drop of the red dragon's blood sealed in this red crystal was 
absolutely extremely precious.

Because a drop of ancient red dragon's blood not only contains huge dragon energy.



And you must know that the innate bloodline furnace awakened by Ye Feng's immortal body in the 
sixth stage allows Ye Feng to directly activate the power of any bloodline he has integrated into it to 
display the corresponding innate bloodline ability.

Therefore, if Ye Feng can successfully refine and fuse this drop of ancient red dragon's blood, then 
Ye Feng will not only be able to obtain a huge amount of dragon energy.

The most important thing is that after Ye Feng successfully fused the bloodline of the red dragon, he 
could display the innate ability of the ancient red dragon.

So at this moment, Ye Feng opened his mouth and swallowed the red crystal without any hesitation.

Seeing Ye Feng do this, everyone present had a look of astonishment in their eyes, as if they didn't 
expect that Ye Feng would swallow whatever he got, which was really strange.

Even the red snake who gave Ye Feng the red crystal couldn't help but show a hint of surprise in his 
eyes, and then he couldn't help but shake his head and smile, and said aloud: "He is indeed an 
interesting little guy. "

At this time, everyone's eyes were fixed on Ye Feng, as if they wanted to see whether Ye Feng could 
continue to create miracles, and whether he could still refine the drop of the ancient red dragon's 
blood in the red crystal on the spot. In this way, the cultivation level can be improved.

Because everyone knows that energy crystals are relatively easy to refine and digest, but the blood 
of the ancient red dragon sealed in that piece of red crystal is a drop of the blood of the red dragon 
that could rival the gods back then. Ah, it contains energy as vast as the ocean, and it has the special 
energy of the dragon clan, which is difficult for ordinary people to refine.
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