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Chapter 5491 Demonic Mountains

When Ye Feng entered the new cultivation level of the Half-Step Divine Realm, he could 
immediately feel that his skills had increased unprecedentedly, and his combat effectiveness had 
also been greatly improved.

At this moment, Ye Feng was naturally very happy. As expected, practicing in this dark empire was 
many times faster than practicing in heaven.

At this time, Ye Feng continued to comprehend the peerless inheritance of the first-generation Dark 
Emperor, the Dark Emperor Technique, that he had learned before.

This is the strongest inheritance in the Dark Empire. Now that Ye Feng has obtained it, he naturally 
wants to understand it as much as possible.

However, this set of inheritance is indeed very complicated. Even though Ye Feng has a very 
powerful ability to comprehend, he is only able to use the Dark Emperor Technique until now, and 
has not comprehended the Dark Emperor Technique to a perfect state.

Otherwise, when Ye Feng used the Dark Emperor Kung Fu in the restaurant, what was condensed 
was not the shadow of the Dark Emperor, but the actual Dark Emperor, which was equivalent to 
possessing all the power of the first-generation Dark Emperor.

But now Ye Feng is estimated to be able to only exert one percent of the power of the first 
generation Dark Emperor, but that is already very terrifying.

Throughout the night, Ye Feng kept comprehending this inheritance.

When Ye Feng opened his eyes in the morning, he had become much more proficient in 
understanding this set of inheritance.

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately walked out of his room without any hesitation.

Because Ye Feng had already sensed it, the little princess had long been standing outside her room.



At this moment, Ye Feng opened the door of his room and immediately saw the little princess 
wearing a warrior's attire, standing outside his door.

When Ye Feng saw this scene, he immediately smiled and said loudly: "Your Highness the Princess 
stayed outside my door for so long. Is there anything special?"

Hearing Ye Feng's question, the little princess sensed the obvious change in Ye Feng's cultivation 
aura, and found that Ye Feng's cultivation had improved a lot, and he had directly broken through a 
big realm. She couldn't help but be very surprised. He asked loudly: "In just one night, Ye Feng, 
your cultivation level has broken through again? It's really incredible. If I had your speed of 
breakthrough, I'm afraid I wouldn't be afraid of Princess Honglian and others. The prince and 
princess."

Hearing what the little princess said, Ye Feng smiled slightly, walked up to the little princess, and 
said: "Don't worry, I am your captain of the guard. If you are in any danger in the future, I will 
always be by your side to protect you." you."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the little princess immediately nodded very moved, and then seemed to 
have thought of something, and said loudly: "Ye Feng, I came to you early this morning to find 
something special for you. things.”

Hearing what the little princess said, Ye Feng immediately asked curiously: "Is there something so 
important that you have to come to my place in person?"

The little princess spoke up and said: "Soon, the upper echelons of our dark empire will organize a 
trial for the younger generation in a very dangerous place in our dark world called the Demonic 
Mountains. Originally, I did not want to participate in such a dangerous training activity. But it is 
said that this time there may be very precious chance creations in the Demonic Mountains. I learned 
this from an acquaintance of the upper echelons of the royal family, so this time many princes and 
princesses, including the children of other nobles, will participate in this trial. Lian, I would like to 
invite you, Ye Feng, to join us."

Hearing what the little princess said, Ye Feng immediately nodded and said, "Okay."

Ye Feng is also very interested in this kind of trial.



After all, Ye Feng has now settled down in the Dark Empire for the time being, so if good luck can 
appear in this kind of trial, it will naturally be a huge attraction to Ye Feng.

After all, Ye Fengke has never forgotten that he has to go to a base of the Sky Thunder Clan on the 
edge of the Dark World to look for Sky Thunder seeds on behalf of the Emperor of the Dark 
Empire.

Therefore, Ye Feng will naturally not waste any opportunity to improve his strength.

At this time, the little princess suddenly said: "But if you want to participate in this kind of trial task 
specially held by the upper class of the royal family, you must have enough status as a legitimate 
heir of the royal family. I don't know if you, Ye Feng, are qualified. Participate, I have signed up for 
you anyway, it depends on whether the royal family will agree."

Hearing what the little princess said, Ye Feng smiled confidently and said: "If the upper echelons of 
the royal family led by His Majesty the Emperor of the Dark Empire review the list of people who 
will participate in the Demon Mountain Trial this time, then I will definitely will be agreed to."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the little princess looked at Ye Feng in surprise and said, "Why are you 
so confident?"

Ye Feng smiled slightly and didn't say much.

At this time, Ye Feng was naturally very confident, because Ye Feng had reached a secret agreement 
with the emperor of the Dark Empire.

Therefore, if Ye Feng wants to participate in the trial of the Demonic Mountains and is seen by the 
Emperor of the Dark Empire, he will definitely agree.

Because the emperor of the dark empire must also hope that Ye Feng can improve his strength as 
soon as possible so that he can go to the edge of the dark world and help him, the emperor, find the 
sky thunder seeds in the sky thunder clan base.

This is why Ye Feng agreed to cooperate with the emperor of the Dark Empire before.



Because Ye Feng knew very well that if he had such a secret agreement with the Emperor of the 
Dark Empire, then the Emperor of the Dark Empire would definitely favor him in some ordinary 
matters.

In other words, Ye Feng had such a big backer as the Emperor of the Dark Empire behind him, 
which could play a huge role at a critical moment.

For example, only the legitimate descendants of the royal family or the descendants of some 
marquises could participate in the trial of the Demon Mountain Range this time, but Ye Feng was 
now considered a secret collaborator of the Emperor of the Dark Empire. So when Ye Feng's name 
appeared on the review list, the Emperor of the Dark Empire would definitely turn a blind eye and 
let Ye Feng participate in the trial of the Demon Mountain Range this time.

While Ye Feng was talking to the little princess, suddenly a royal maid in a silver robe flew over 
from a distance, holding two black tokens in her hands.

One black token was engraved with the name of the little princess, and the other black token was 
engraved with Ye Feng's name.

The royal maid flew in front of Ye Feng and the little princess, and said respectfully: "Your 
Highness, Lord Ye Feng, you have passed the review to participate in the Demon Mountain Range 
Trial. Here are the special identity tokens made for you two. When the time comes, you can take 
these two special identity tokens to the Demon Mountain Range and directly enter the Demon 
Mountain Range to participate in this royal trial. I wish you both good luck."

Chapter 5492: Female Emperor

At this moment, hearing the royal maid in front of her say this, the little princess's eyes suddenly 
showed a look of surprise. She couldn't help but look at Ye Feng beside her, and said in surprise: "I 
didn't expect Ye Feng that what you said was so accurate. You actually passed the review."

When Ye Feng heard the little princess say this, he smiled slightly and said, "Of course."

At this moment, Ye Feng directly took two tokens from the royal maid in front of him and handed 
the little princess's token to the little princess.

At this time, the royal maid nodded and left the scene.



The young princess held the token in her hand, looked at Ye Feng and said, "Let's go to the Demon 
Mountain Range as soon as possible. I estimate that many princes and princesses and other princes' 
descendants have already gone there. I wonder if they have brought very powerful guards or some 
protectors."

Ye Feng nodded and said, "Those princes with deep backgrounds, or some princes' descendants, 
will definitely bring very powerful guards or protectors. They have various means to make the 
upper echelons of the royal family allow them to bring these people."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the young princess' eyes showed a trace of worry, and she said, "If there 
are really strong people of the older generation involved, then we may be in danger. After all, there 
is no one around me. A powerful old protector. "

When Ye Feng heard what the young princess said, he smiled slightly and said, "You have me, that's 
enough."

"Huh?"

When the young princess heard what Ye Feng said, she immediately showed a look of surprise in 
her eyes, and then she couldn't help shaking her head and said, "Ye Feng, I admit that you are very 
powerful, but you are only a young generation. The old people in our Dark Empire have much 
deeper cultivation than you do now, and you can't fight against those old strong men."

When the young princess said this, Ye Feng just smiled slightly and said, "You'll know when the 
time comes."

"Hmm?"

Seeing Ye Feng so confident, the young princess didn't know whether Ye Feng was really confident 
or too conceited.

But at this time, the young princess had no other way. After all, the identity token had been taken, 
and they could only go to the Demon Mountain Range to see if they could try their luck.

At this moment, the little princess said: "I hope our luck is not too bad, and we don't run into those 
young geniuses who are carrying powerful old figures. After all, the entire Demon Mountain Range 
is very large and vast. It may not be possible to meet other people in the whole trial. I participated in 



a trial organized by the royal family of our Dark Empire before. It was in a desolate Gobi Desert. 
That trial lasted for three days and three nights. I didn't meet anyone from beginning to end. I was 
very lucky. I was able to find various natural cultivation resources and hunt some natural monsters 
by myself."

Swish!

At this time, Ye Feng nodded, and then flew directly to the sky.

The little princess also flew to Ye Feng's side, took out a map from her storage ring, and said: "Let's 
go directly to the Demon Mountain Range now."

Ye Feng nodded, and followed the little princess to fly quickly in the direction of the Demon 
Mountain Range.

For Ye Feng, participating in this kind of trial organized by the royal family of the Dark Empire is a 
very good choice.

Because Ye Feng knew very well that if he went out to practice alone, he would not know which 
places in this dark world were full of dangers, and he might encounter some forbidden monsters and 
be wiped out instantly.

However, the trial missions organized by the royal family of the Dark Empire usually select places 
that will not endanger the lives of young geniuses as trial places.

Therefore, there should be no too terrifying danger in this demon mountain range, and he would not 
encounter the most terrifying existence, otherwise he would be wiped out in an instant.

Just as Ye Feng was thinking secretly in his heart, Ye Feng followed the little princess beside him 
and left the territory of the Dark Empire and flew quickly in another direction of the dark world.

The entire dark world is very wide and huge. Ye Feng estimated it slightly and found that the area of 
the entire dark world is probably not much smaller than that of the heaven.

This made Ye Feng understand a little in his heart. It seems that many dark races in the entire dark 
world are keen to cross the wasteland and invade the entire heaven. It is really not that their own 



place is not enough. I am afraid that in addition to wanting to obtain the cultivation resources of the 
heaven, the biggest reason is still the threat from the Tianlei clan.

Because the dark world and the higher world outside the domain are interconnected, and in the 
interconnected place, the Tianlei clan is the most powerful higher race.

The Tianlei clan has always wanted to completely destroy the dark race, obtain the dark world 
where the dark race is stationed, and use it to control the heaven connected to the other side of the 
dark world, as well as the entire low-level latitude cultivation world where the heaven is located.

It must be said that the Tianlei clan is very ambitious.

At this moment, Ye Feng thought secretly in his heart, and did not tell his thoughts to the little 
princess beside him.

Because these are too grand for the current little princess.

Even if the little princess knew, it is estimated that there would be no great effect to help herself.

I can only wait for the little princess's status in the entire royal family to become higher and higher 
in the future, and it is not impossible for Ye Feng to help the little princess become the new 
generation of the empress of the entire dark empire in the future.

If the little princess can really become the new generation of the female emperor of the Dark 
Empire, then Ye Feng's status in the entire dark world will also rise.

After all, the little princess is the offspring of a prince in the Dark Empire. If she is very strong and 
talented, and has a strong helper around her, she still has a chance to compete for the next 
generation of the Dark Empire.

After all, in the entire Dark Empire, there is no rule that only the offspring of the previous 
generation of the Dark Empire emperor can compete for the throne.

The offspring of other princes, or the descendants of nobles with royal blood, are all qualified to 
compete for the new generation of the Dark Empire emperor.



Just as Ye Feng was thinking secretly, the little princess beside him suddenly said: "Ye Feng, look at 
the black mountain ahead, we have arrived, that is the Demon Mountain Range."

Ye Feng heard the little princess' voice at this time, and immediately looked forward not far away. 
Sure enough, he saw an endless black mountain range, which was composed of mountains and 
peaks one after another. It was shrouded in darkness everywhere, giving people the feeling that they 
had come to a dark hell, and everywhere was filled with a wild atmosphere that made people feel 
cold.

This is the trial site this time, the Demon Mountain Range.

Chapter 5493 Senior Liu

At this time, Ye Feng looked at the endless black mountains in front of him and immediately felt 
that it was very dangerous. It was very likely that there was a huge crisis hidden, which was much 
more dangerous than he imagined.

At this moment, the little princess landed directly with Ye Feng.

At the entrance of this demonic mountain range, there are several guards of the Dark Empire 
wearing golden armor, guarding here to prevent strong men from other forces from entering.

At this moment, after the little princess and Ye Feng landed, they immediately took out their 
identity tokens.

Seeing the two identity tokens, this group of powerful golden armored guards from the Dark Empire 
immediately nodded and said, "I wish you both good luck."

After this group of golden armored guards collected their identity tokens, they immediately made 
way to enter the Demonic Mountains.

At this time, Ye Feng and the little princess walked directly into it slowly.

Soon, the two figures disappeared into the dark jungle of the Demonic Mountains.



At this moment, after seeing the two people leaving, one of the golden armored guards suddenly 
took out a sound transmission token from his storage ring, and suddenly whispered to the sound 
transmission token. He said: "Call Princess Honglian, the little princess and Ye Feng have entered 
the Demonic Mountains and are heading towards the first mountain of the Demonic Mountains."

And almost at the moment when the golden armored guard finished speaking, somewhere in the 
Demonic Mountains, Princess Honglian suddenly received the message indirectly. She immediately 
looked to her side with a trace of resentment in her eyes. An old man in a purple robe spoke out: 
"Senior Liu, the little princess and Ye Feng, the powerful young genius next to her, have just 
entered this demonic mountain range. They should be close to it at this time. This is the first 
mountain in a demonic mountain range. Please ask Senior Liu to help me secretly deal with these 
two hateful guys. As long as they die in this demonic mountain range, no one will know that we did 
it. ”

Hearing what Princess Honglian said, the old man in a purple robe, who Princess Honglian called 
Senior Liu, immediately nodded and said loudly: "I am the protector of Her Royal Highness the 
Princess. Since Her Royal Highness has If you are a mortal enemy, then I will naturally take action 
to help the princess clear these obstacles."

Hearing what Senior Liu said at this moment, Princess Honglian suddenly showed a very excited 
look on her face.

Princess Honglian knew very well that her protector was a powerful protector who was personally 
rewarded to her by His Majesty the Emperor of the Dark Empire three years ago. She was an elder 
secretly cultivated by the Dark Empire and was very powerful.

Not to mention the little princess, even Ye Feng next to the little princess can never be his opponent 
as a protector.

Because the cultivation level of this senior Liu is nearly six or seven realms higher than that of Ye 
Feng. This is simply a huge gap.

No matter how powerful Ye Feng's true combat power is, he will never be able to cross six or seven 
realms to fight against this Senior Liu.

So at this time, Princess Honglian naturally felt that Ye Feng and the little princess were already 
dead.



At this moment, when Princess Honglian and Senior Liu were rushing to the first mountain of the 
Demonic Mountains, Ye Feng and the little princess had just stepped onto the first mountain after 
entering the Demonic Mountains from the entrance.

At this moment, the little princess said: "Ye Feng, let's leave this first mountain directly. Many 
young geniuses of the younger generation should have arrived in the Demonic Mountains in 
advance. Their preferred place to search for resources should be This is the first mountain, so there 
is no need for us to waste time in this first mountain. The good things here and the naturally 
cultivated cultivation resources have probably been looted long ago. Let’s head straight towards this 
area. Rush over to the deeper mountains of the Demonic Mountains."

Hearing what the little princess said, Ye Feng nodded slightly and said, "That's the truth, then let's 
go directly to other mountain ranges."

At this moment, Ye Feng and the little princess left the first mountain directly without wasting any 
time.

Uh-huh! Uh-huh!

Not long after the two left, Princess Honglian arrived at the first mountain with her guardian, Senior 
Liu.

However, they searched all over the first mountain and found no trace of Ye Feng and the little 
princess.

This made Princess Honglian's face suddenly become extremely ugly, and she couldn't help but 
said: "These two guys are so cunning. They didn't stay on the first mountain for too long and left 
directly, but they couldn't escape. Yes, Senior Liu, we must follow their aura and hunt them down! 
This trial in the Demonic Mountains is the best opportunity to get rid of these two nasty guys, the 
little princess and Ye Feng. We missed it. But there is no chance to kill them again, because there 
are regulations in the imperial city of the Dark Empire that do not allow the killing of children with 
royal blood. That Ye Feng was also named a third-grade noble before, and there is no way to kill 
them in the imperial city. Kill."

Hearing what Princess Honglian said, Senior Liu who was standing aside immediately nodded and 
said: "Don't worry, Your Highness, I have sensed the aura of the little princess from the entrance of 
the first mountain. As long as we follow the instructions With the scent of the little princess, I will 
definitely be able to find these two young men, Ye Feng and the little princess. When I meet them, I 
will take action and get rid of them all in an instant. "



At this moment, Senior Liu was speaking with a very confident tone.

After all, he had already learned from Princess Honglian that the little princess was no threat at all. 
Even Princess Honglian could beat the little princess.

Mainly that Ye Feng.

But although Ye Feng is very powerful in combat, his own cultivation level is still not comparable 
to that of an elder like him.

Ye Feng's cultivation level, I learned from Princess Honglian, is six or seven levels lower than 
Senior Liu himself. This is an insurmountable gap.

At this moment, Princess Honglian nodded immediately, and she and Senior Liu were very eager to 
chase after the little princess's aura, hoping to secretly execute the two of them in this demonic 
mountain range as soon as possible.

While Princess Honglian and Senior Liu were secretly chasing after them, Ye Feng and the little 
princess had already crossed several mountains and arrived at some mountains deeper in the Dark 
Mountain Range.

Buzz!

At this moment, Ye Feng exuded soul power and immediately discovered a cave in the mountains 
not far away, which seemed to have strong energy fluctuations.

This made Ye Feng's eyes light up. He immediately looked at the little princess beside him and said 
loudly: "There seems to be treasures in the cave in front. Let's go over and have a look. I sensed that 
there seems to be a high-level spiritual being in it." The energy fluctuations of the medicine.”

Chapter 5494 Tentacle Monster

Hearing what Ye Feng said at this time, the little princess suddenly became interested and 
immediately said: "Let's go in quickly and take a look. Maybe there is some unique elixir growing 
in this cave."



At this moment, Ye Feng nodded, and he and the little princess walked quickly towards the cave.

Halfway through the walk, the little princess seemed to have thought of something, and suddenly 
took out a black long sword from her storage ring, which exuded a very strong magic wave.

The little princess said aloud: "This kind of place where peerless elixirs grow is often guarded by 
very powerful and vicious monsters, so we must be careful."

Hearing what the little princess said, Ye Feng smiled slightly and said: "I didn't sense any scary 
monsters. If there were scary monsters here, then this peerless elixir would have been destroyed 
long ago. That terrible monster has been eaten and won’t wait until now.”

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the little princess nodded, feeling that it made sense, but she still held 
the extremely powerful weapon, the black long sword, that she had specially brought here, in her 
hand, and followed Ye Feng's side, keeping alert at all times. .

When the two of them walked into the cave, they immediately saw that there was a lotus flower 
emitting colorful light growing in the cave, and there were no monsters guarding it.

Seeing this scene, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly showed a look of surprise.

Because Ye Feng sensed a very strong medicinal power fluctuation from this colorful lotus.

Obviously, this colorful lotus flower is a very high-level elixir.

The little princess' eyes suddenly lit up, and she couldn't help but say: "I didn't expect such a 
precious colorful lotus to grow here, and no one has discovered it. Until today, no monsters or 
people have come to pick it. "

Uh-huh!

After the little princess finished speaking, she flew forward and prepared to pick this colorful lotus 
flower.

But suddenly at this moment, black vines shot out from the mud growing around the colorful lotus.



The tips of these black vines turned out not to be plants, but the mouths of monsters with silver 
fangs.

"Um?"

Seeing this scene, the little princess was immediately startled. She quickly held the black sword in 
her hand and slashed forward.

Click!

Click!

The black long sword in the hands of the little princess should be an extremely powerful weapon 
she brought out especially for this trial in the Demonic Mountains.

So at this moment, the black long sword in the little princess's hand cut off all the black vines with 
monster mouths flying out of the surrounding mud.

The next moment, the little princess wanted to continue picking this colorful lotus.

But black vines flew out from the surrounding mud one after another.

These black vines were the same as the previous black vines. The tips of these black vines had the 
fangs of monsters, and they quickly bit towards the little princess.

At this moment, no matter how sharp the black sword in the little princess's hand was, she couldn't 
cut off the hundreds of black vines that covered the sky at once.

At this moment, Ye Feng flew directly over and punched out fiercely.

Boom! !



A terrifying fist wind suddenly burst out from Ye Feng's fist, forming a huge shock wave that 
shattered hundreds of black vines that flew out of the mud.

It has to be said that the power of Ye Feng's fist is simply terrifying to the extreme.

At this moment, the little princess immediately retreated quickly to Ye Feng's side. She couldn't 
help but said with some fear: "Sure enough, there are terrible monsters lurking in the place where 
this peerless elixir grows."

Ye Feng nodded and said aloud: "These black vines are most likely the tentacles grown on a 
monster. They have been hidden in the mud under this colorful lotus. Even I didn't sense it outside."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the little princess nodded and said, "It seems that we are going to have a 
fierce battle this time."

At this moment, just as the two of them were talking.

Boom!

The entire cave floor suddenly began to vibrate rapidly.

The next moment, the mud under the colorful lotus quickly surged.

As the silt surged, a huge monster covered in silt crawled out of the ground.

The huge monster was covered in mud, and there were dense black tentacles everywhere, which 
were the black vines that the two of them had just seen.

The tips of these black tentacles have monster fangs growing out, giving people a very vicious look.

As for the colorful lotus that the two of them saw, it turned out to be not a real elixir, but a part of 
the body of this monster covered with black tentacles, growing on the top of its head.



Seeing this scene, the little princess immediately understood something and couldn't help but said: 
"No wonder this colorful lotus has been growing here for so long without any other practitioners or 
demons picking it. It turns out that this is not true. The elixir, this colorful lotus is part of this black 
tentacle monster, specially used to attract other creatures to come here, and then be attacked and 
eaten by this monster covered with black tentacles. "

At this moment, Ye Feng nodded, with a hint of surprise in his eyes, as if he had not expected that 
the colorful lotus he sensed was not a real elixir, but a bait growing on the head of the monster 
covered with tentacles.

At this moment, Ye Feng showed a cold smile on his face and said, "Since this monster is so 
insidious, let's get rid of it here!"

For Ye Feng, although this colorful lotus was not a real elixir, he was a little disappointed, but the 
blood energy contained in the body of this monster covered with tentacles was also magnificent. If 
he could kill it and swallow it, he might be able to greatly increase his skills.

At this moment, the little princess had already rushed out.

The little princess's cultivation was not much weaker than Ye Feng's, but her combat power was 
definitely much weaker than Ye Feng's.

But this time, in order to participate in the trial of the Demon Mountain Range, the little princess 
specially asked her father for an extremely advanced black long sword, which is the sword in her 
hand. It is said that it was a peerless treasure that her father refined when he followed the Dark 
Emperor to conquer the world. It also absorbed countless dead souls on the battlefield, which can 
greatly enhance the little princess's combat effectiveness.

At this moment, the little princess held the black long sword in her hand and chopped forward.

Boom!

The black long sword in her hand immediately burst out a black sword light that was several 
thousand meters long, with a terrifying cutting force, directly chopped down at the monster covered 
with tentacles.

"Woo woo woo ~"



In addition, countless dead souls emerged from the sword body of the black long sword in the little 
princess's hand, roaring and roaring, which added to the power of this black long sword!

Chapter 5495 Sword Formation

Boom!

At this moment, the monster covered with tentacles immediately activated all the tentacles on its 
body and rushed out in an overwhelming manner, blocking all the black sword light of the little 
princess for a while.

Seeing this scene, the little princess immediately showed a low look in her eyes and said: "The 
black tentacles on this monster are too strong. Each black tentacle is like a spear cast from metal. It 
has strong defense and terrible attack power. Even the Dark King Sword given to me by my father 
can't split its tentacle defense for a while."

At this moment, Ye Feng, who was standing beside him, immediately said: "You hold the black 
tentacles on this black monster, and leave the rest to me."

Swish!

After Ye Feng finished speaking, he directly burst out his extremely powerful physique and 
instantly rushed towards the black tentacle monster.

Seeing Ye Feng rushing over, the monster immediately activated the tentacles on its body, trying to 
wrap around Ye Feng.

But at this moment, the little princess shouted coldly, saying: "These tentacles on your body have 
resisted my Dark King's Sword, so don't think they can have any other effect."

At this moment, the little princess directly strengthened the killing power of the black sword in her 
hand. Black sword beams burst out from the black sword frantically, slashing at the black tentacle 
monster like a flash of sword.

Under the restraint of the little princess, all the tentacles on the black monster could not attack Ye 
Feng.



So Ye Feng was under much less pressure at this time, and he could directly attack the body of the 
black monster.

At this moment, Ye Feng did not hesitate at all, and punched out one punch after another, and 
directly hit the black monster hard.

Boom!

Boom!

But the next moment, what surprised Ye Feng was that his extremely powerful fist, when it hit the 
black monster, actually made a muffled humming sound like hitting a war drum, and could not 
cause any damage to the black monster.

"Huh?"

Seeing this scene, Ye Feng's eyes immediately showed a look of surprise.

After all, Ye Feng's physical strength has always been something Ye Feng is proud of, and it is very 
powerful.

But he didn't expect that the body of this black monster was so strong, much stronger than the 
tentacles on his body. Even with the strength of Ye Feng's current immortal body, he couldn't cause 
any damage to this black monster.

At this moment, the black monster didn't speak, but there seemed to be a mocking sound coming 
from his stomach.

Ye Feng didn't hesitate at this moment, and immediately said coldly: "I will kill you today!"

At this moment, Ye Feng directly took out nine black swords.

Each black sword was engraved with the words of the ancient dark race, and it looked very ancient 
and powerful.



At this moment, seeing the nine black swords that Ye Feng took out, the little princess not far away 
suddenly widened her eyes slightly and said aloud: "Are these nine black swords the legendary nine 
dark swords? This seems to be the natal sword of the emperor of our Dark Empire. I once had the 
honor of seeing His Majesty the Emperor use these nine dark swords. They can be combined 
together to form a terrifying power. How come they are in your hands, Ye Feng?"

Ye Feng smiled slightly and said aloud: "This is given to me by His Majesty the Emperor. He said 
that I have a very good talent and can become a pillar of the entire Dark Empire in the future."

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the little princess couldn't help but nodded immediately and said aloud: 
"It seems that His Majesty the Emperor values you very much, which is great."

For the little princess, Ye Feng is her captain of the guards and is on the same boat with her.

The more Ye Feng is valued by His Majesty the Emperor, the greater the benefits will be for the 
little princess.

At this moment, Ye Feng did not hesitate at all and immediately released nine black swords.

At this moment, nine dark swords spun around Ye Feng, forming a sword formation in an instant, 
just like a fast-spinning blood drop, and madly cut the monster covered with tentacles.

This time, the black monster could no longer laugh at Ye Feng, because Ye Feng's nine dark swords 
were peerless weapons used by super-powerful figures such as the emperor of the Dark Empire. 
They were very powerful and very sharp.

Moreover, the nine dark swords were connected together to form a fast-spinning sword formation 
with terrifying cutting power, which cut the skin of the monster in an instant, and black blood 
flowed out.

"Howl!"

At this moment, the monster covered with tentacles immediately let out a painful howl, and finally 
knew that it was afraid, and immediately drilled into the mud, trying to escape from here quickly.



Because its black tentacles were entangled by the little princess, and its body was now cut through 
by Ye Feng's dark sword, so the monster knew that it would never be a match for Ye Feng and the 
little princess, two powerful dark races.

So at this moment, the black tentacle monster quickly fled the scene and wanted to leave.

But at this time, Ye Feng laughed and said, "Since you want to sneak attack and kill us, you can't 
escape today."

Swish!

At this moment, Ye Feng directly stretched out a hand.

Ye Feng's hand immediately turned into a big black hand, and instantly grabbed the monster 
covered with tentacles, and directly caught the monster in his hand.

The black monster wanted to resist Ye Feng, but Ye Feng's nine dark swords spun quickly, directly 
cutting its body in half, and it died instantly.

"Finally dead!"

At this moment, the little princess immediately relaxed and couldn't help but say: "Finally killed 
this monster covered with tentacles! This monster is really powerful."

Ye Feng couldn't help but nodded at this moment and said: "These dark monsters born in this 
demon mountain range are really powerful, each one is extremely powerful. The tentacles on this 
monster have terrifying attack power, and its body defense is so strong that even my fist can't break 
its defense. In the end, it was the nine dark swords given to me by His Majesty the Emperor that cut 
and hurt it. It is really hard to kill."

After Ye Feng finished speaking at this moment, he naturally didn't hesitate at all. He directly 
released his devouring field and began to devour all the blood and energy of the monster on the 
spot!

Chapter 5496 Leaving the Ground

Boom!



At this time, as Ye Feng released the devouring field, all the blood energy and beast essence in the 
black monster's body were swallowed and absorbed by Ye Feng, and quickly injected into Ye Feng's 
Dantian, strengthening Ye Feng's skills.

This monster with black tentacles all over its body is still very powerful. Ye Feng and the little 
group leader worked together to kill it.

So at this time, after Ye Feng swallowed it, he could immediately feel a huge amount of energy, and 
immediately began to rapidly strengthen his skills.

Ye Feng was at the bottleneck of his current cultivation. At this moment, under the accumulation of 
this huge energy, he suddenly broke through, directly breaking through the current bottleneck of the 
half-step God Realm, and promoted to the real God Realm First Heaven!

At this moment, Ye Feng felt a very powerful new force, surging in every inch of his flesh and 
bones.

This is the power of a new realm!

Ye Feng could feel that his combat effectiveness was increased hundreds of times at this moment.

At this moment, Ye Feng was naturally very happy. He didn't expect that he could get so much 
energy just after entering this demon mountain range.

Seeing this scene at this time, the little princess beside him also showed a trace of surprise in her 
eyes, and couldn't help but said: "Ye Feng, your ability to absorb the energy of other monsters to 
improve your own skills is really incredible. It seems that this demon mountain range is very 
suitable for you to practice here, because you can not only use the natural and natural spiritual 
medicine in this demon mountain range, but also directly absorb the energy contained in the bodies 
of various monsters in the demon mountain range. You know, this mountain range is called the 
demon mountain range because there are many ancient demons and monsters that survived in 
ancient times, and each of them is very powerful."

Ye Feng nodded and said: "The stronger these demons are, the more energy we get after we kill 
them."



Ye Feng actually had some sighs in his eyes at this time. It seems that he didn't expect that the 
monster in such a small cave could actually make his cultivation break through directly. It was 
really a bit unexpected.

However, thinking that this is the dark world, and this demon mountain range is a place where the 
Dark Empire specially trains its young generation, it is very normal for these mountains to breed 
such terrible monsters.

At this moment, the little princess said: "Ye Feng, although hunting these powerful demons can 
indeed give you enough energy, you must be careful not to provoke those monsters that we can't 
beat, otherwise it is very likely to be backfired."

Hearing what the little princess said, Ye Feng just smiled slightly and said: "Of course, I will 
definitely not overestimate my ability."

At this moment, Ye Feng said, and walked directly out of the cave with the little princess.

When they walked out, Ye Feng looked around and said: "Let's go to a nearby mountain."

The little princess nodded, and continued to fly quickly towards a mountain on the left with Ye 
Feng.

They don't have any fixed direction now, anyway, they are walking around in this demon mountain 
range composed of thousands of mountains to see if they can find any opportunities.

The upper echelons of the Dark Empire did not say how many days the trial would last. Anyway, 
when the time came, a super-powerful person would send a signal on this Demon Mountain Range, 
asking everyone to retreat, which meant the end of the trial.

So Ye Feng would naturally not waste time now, and would make the most of this trial opportunity 
to find more cultivation resources grown in the Demon Mountain Range to strengthen his own 
skills, and hunt more demons, devour the demons' energy, and quickly strengthen his own 
cultivation realm.

At this moment, after Ye Feng and the little princess came to another mountain range, they 
immediately discovered that in this mountain range, there were actually many spiritual medicinal 
fruits like strawberries growing all over the mountains.



"Hmm?"

Seeing this scene, the young princess couldn't help but reveal a look of astonishment in her eyes, 
and said aloud: "Are these fruits all valuable spiritual medicines? How could they grow so much?"

Ye Feng shook his head and said aloud: "We came to this demon mountain range not too early, but 
there are spiritual medicines all over the mountains, and no one has come to pick them yet, which 
means there must be something wrong."

At this moment, the young princess also nodded and looked around carefully. Suddenly, she seemed 
to see something and couldn't help but say aloud: "Ye Feng, look! There seems to be a body in that 
fruit bush."

Hearing what the young princess said, Ye Feng immediately looked in that direction, and indeed 
found that there was a body lying in the grass in the spiritual medicine fruit forest not far away.

At this moment, Ye Feng and the young princess walked over and saw the clothes worn by the body, 
which were the clothes of the younger generation of their Dark Empire, but they had been dead for 
a long time.

What made the two of them feel quite strange was that the blood of the younger generation of the 
Dark Empire seemed to have dried up, and the vitality in their bodies had completely disappeared.

"Hmm?"

Seeing this scene, the little princess couldn't help but glance at Ye Feng beside her, and said loudly: 
"The death of this person is quite strange, as if all the blood has been sucked out of his body."

At this time, Ye Feng's eyes showed a look of thinking, and suddenly he said quickly: "Get off the 
ground quickly!"

Uh-huh!



Almost at the moment Ye Feng finished speaking, metal thorns suddenly appeared from the entire 
ground.

Fortunately, Ye Feng reacted very quickly. He directly pulled the little princess beside him and flew 
into the air before he could react.

The next moment, the two of them saw that the ground that originally looked so beautiful and full 
of elixir fruits suddenly sprouted sharp metal-like thorns.

If the two people hadn't reacted quickly enough, they would have been pierced just now.

Seeing this scene at this time, the little princess couldn't help but said: "It seems that there is 
something terrible hidden under the ground. Use this beautiful-looking elixir fruit to attract the 
surrounding creatures." to pick it up and sneak attack it.”

Ye Feng nodded and said aloud: "It is somewhat similar to the tentacle monster we encountered in 
the cave before. It uses a colorful lotus flower that grows on its head that looks like a peerless elixir 
to lure other creatures to come over. Picking, so as to make a sudden attack."

Chapter 5497 Fierce Battle

Hearing Ye Feng say this, the little princess couldn't help but sigh and said, "Why are all the 
monsters that grow in this demon mountain range so cunning?"

At this moment, the little princess also understood that under this piece of land full of spiritual 
medicine fruits, there should be a very scary monster from the demon mountain range lurking, 
hunting other creatures here.

And almost at the moment when Ye Feng and the little princess just finished speaking, the ground 
of the entire hillside collapsed.

Boom!

The next moment, a huge monster covered with metal spikes appeared.

This huge monster looked like a snow-white giant bear, but on the top of its head, it was covered 
with long metal spikes.



At this moment, the snow-white giant bear immediately roared and rushed directly towards Ye Feng 
and the little princess in the sky, wanting to kill them on the spot.

At this moment, Ye Feng didn't hesitate at all, and punched out fiercely.

Ye Feng's punch burst out with the power of the immortal body of the god, which was very 
powerful, and collided with the snow-white giant bear.

Boom! !

Accompanied by a terrifying roar, Ye Feng's punch actually blasted the snow-white giant bear 
backwards in an instant, and directly hit the mountain below, causing a huge vibration.

The next moment, the little princess rushed forward, and the Dark King's Sword in her hand 
immediately burst out with terrible ghost power and extremely sharp sword light, piercing the head 
of the snow-white giant bear and killing it instantly.

Swish!

Ye Feng flew over and said, "Not as powerful as the tentacle monster in the cave just now."

At this moment, Ye Feng said, and there was a trace of emotion in his eyes.

Before, Ye Feng was always proud of his perception ability, which could detect various dangers and 
creatures in advance.

But when he came to this demon mountain range, Ye Feng found that his detection ability, including 
soul power, seemed to be weakened a lot.

Ye Feng guessed that the terrain and environment of this demon mountain range might be very 
special, which could greatly weaken the detection ability of the creatures entering it, and even 
suppress his soul power.

In this environment, his means of predicting danger in advance were not as powerful as before.



Ye Feng felt that he should pay more attention to some dangers that might appear at any time in this 
demon mountain range.

At this moment, Ye Feng thought secretly in his heart, and directly released the swallowing field 
and began to swallow the snow-white giant bear that was killed.

This giant bear looked very majestic and huge, but in fact, it provided Ye Feng with less energy than 
the previous tentacle monster.

So after Ye Feng swallowed it, he did not make a breakthrough in his cultivation, and still stayed in 
the first level of the God Realm.

But it added a lot of power reserves to Ye Feng, as long as he accumulated slowly, he would always 
be able to break through.

At this time, Ye Feng did not hesitate at all, and he and the little princess walked towards the other 
direction of this mountain directly, wanting to find other opportunities.

However, before they found other opportunities, they suddenly heard a sound of shouting and 
fighting not far away.

"Huh?"

Hearing this sound, the little princess' eyes moved, and she said: "We should have met other 
trialists. Fighting in this demon killing, it is estimated that they encountered very difficult 
monsters."

Ye Feng nodded and said: "Let's go and take a look."

Ye Feng actually didn't want to get involved in other people's fights and right and wrong, but since 
there was such a big battle in this demon mountain not far away, it means that other trialists must 
have encountered very powerful monsters.

And Ye Feng is very interested in the monsters born in this demon mountain.



Because these monsters can provide Ye Feng with great blood energy, which is more than the 
energy provided to Ye Feng by some natural treasures.

So Ye Feng naturally wants to go and take a look.

According to the direction from which the shouts and fighting sounds came, Ye Feng and the little 
princess soon approached that area.

However, the two did not fly over openly, but lurked over.

At this moment, Ye Feng and the little princess were lying in a bush, looking forward, and found a 
valley in front of them.

The shouts and fighting sounds came from the valley in front of them.

At this moment, the two looked into the valley and immediately saw a large group of strong men 
from the Dark Empire fighting with thousands of huge apes covered with black scales.

These huge apes should have human wisdom, holding all kinds of steel weapons in their hands, and 
were frantically besieging these strong men from the Dark Empire.

And the cultivation aura of this group of strong men from the Dark Empire was very high, even 
seven or eight realms higher than Ye Feng and the little princess now.

Among this group of strong men, a young man in a golden robe was very eye-catching.

This young man in a golden robe turned out to be the eldest prince who had a conflict with Ye Feng 
in the Imperial City Restaurant of the Dark Empire before.

"It's the eldest prince."

At this moment, when the little princess saw this scene, her eyes suddenly showed surprise, and she 
said loudly: "As expected of the eldest prince, he actually brought so many powerful masters to help 
him test in this demonic mountain range."



Ye Feng nodded at this time, and said with a serious face: "This eldest prince is indeed rich in 
background, and he has brought dozens of such powerful people together, even if I meet him now, 
Definitely not an opponent.”

The little princess nodded and said aloud: "It seems that they were suddenly attacked by thousands 
of these black-scaled giant apes. They were quite unlucky."

When Ye Feng heard what the little princess said, his eyes flickered slightly, he looked at the 
direction behind the valley, and couldn't help but said: "I'm afraid it's not that simple. With the 
eldest prince and the dozens of powerful men from the empire beside him, With such strength, it is 
not that difficult to escape from the siege of thousands of black-scaled giant apes, because these 
black-scaled giant apes only have a numerical advantage, and their individual strength is not as 
strong as the people on the side of the eldest prince. The eldest prince It shouldn’t be that difficult 
for these people to escape. They are fighting fiercely here, most likely to get some very precious 
treasure in this valley.”

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the little princess was stunned for a moment. Then she understood what 
Ye Feng meant and couldn't help but said expectantly: "Ye Feng, you want to take advantage of the 
two sides to fight. , sneaking into the depths of that valley to look for precious treasures? "

Ye Feng immediately smiled and said, "Indeed, I have this idea."

Chapter 5498 Ice Tree

At this time, after Ye Feng finished talking to the little princess, he naturally did not hesitate and 
immediately flew towards the deep area of the valley quickly.

The little princess said aloud: "Ye Feng, I am just outside this valley. I will pay attention to the 
fighting situation here at any time and report the situation to you. You go to the depths of the valley 
and search for cultivation resources as quickly as possible. If the situation here If there is any 
change, I will tell you at any time and notify you through the sound transmission token."

Hearing what the little princess said, Ye Feng immediately nodded, smiled and said, "Thank you 
very much."

Uh-huh!

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately flew quickly towards the depths of the valley.



Of course, Ye Feng's direction was not to go directly through the entire valley, but to condense the 
talent he had previously, the space wormhole, directly through the void, and to the deep area of the 
valley, which would not cause the eldest prince to be disturbed at all. The attention of this group of 
strong men, or the black-scaled giant apes living in this valley.

So at this time, Ye Feng came to the depths of the valley very secretly.

When Ye Feng came to the depths of this valley, he immediately discovered that the deep areas of 
this valley were filled with ice, and there was heavy snow like goose feathers falling from the sky.

"Um?"

Seeing this scene, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly showed a look of surprise.

Outside this valley, it looks like spring all year round. Unexpectedly, deep in this valley, there is 
heavy snow falling, and there is a cold breath everywhere in the air.

This made Ye Feng's eyes suddenly show a hint of thinking, and he couldn't help but wonder in his 
heart, could the treasure hidden deep in this valley have something to do with ice attributes.

At this moment, Ye Feng naturally did not hesitate at all and immediately continued flying towards 
the deepest part of the valley.

Buzz!

At the same time, Ye Feng didn't hesitate at all. He directly released his soul power and began to 
explore where the treasures were in the depths of the valley.

Ye Feng knew very well that since the eldest prince brought so many strong men to attack this 
valley, it meant that there must be great things in the deep areas of this valley. Otherwise, the eldest 
prince would definitely not provoke these extraordinary things. The powerful black-scaled giant ape 
is now under siege and will be unable to move for a while.



At this moment, with the exploration of Ye Feng's soul power, Ye Feng suddenly sensed a very 
strong energy fluctuation.

Ye Feng sensed this kind of energy fluctuation carefully, and it seemed that it was not the 
fluctuation of a magic weapon, but the fluctuation of a kind of spiritual creature born in the earth.

This made Ye Feng's eyes suddenly light up, and he couldn't help but murmured: "Could it be that 
the ice-attributed treasure that makes this deep valley area full of frozen ice is a peerless medicine 
king?"

At this moment, Ye Feng was thinking, becoming more and more certain that there was definitely a 
very high-level Medicine King growing deep in this valley.

Because only the king of elixirs has the ability to influence and change the environment of the 
world around his growth area.

Ye Feng was naturally very happy at this moment and quickly continued flying in the deepest 
direction.

Fortunately for Ye Feng, Ye Feng did not encounter such a powerful black-scaled giant ape deep in 
the valley along the way.

Because it is estimated that all the black scale giant apes should have gone to the central area of the 
valley to fight against the group of powerful men of the eldest prince of the Dark Empire.

At this moment, Ye Feng can be said to be a fisherman.

At this moment, Ye Feng had arrived at the deepest area of the valley.

Ye Feng immediately saw from a distance, a big tree that seemed to be completely made of ice, 
growing on the ground not far away.

And the area around this big ice tree is all covered with ice.

This ice tree is the peerless medicine king that Ye Feng guessed. He didn't expect it to grow so big.



At this moment, Ye Feng could already sense that this big ice tree contained the extremely majestic 
power of the Medicine King.

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately flew towards the big ice tree.

Ye Feng felt that this big ice tree should be the medicine king cultivated by the black-scaled giant 
ape clan living in this valley. It probably took hundreds of years. No wonder the eldest prince 
brought so many strong men with him. They even did not hesitate to attack this valley by force.

It seems that the eldest prince also has the news that this big ice tree is in this valley.

But this is normal.

Because almost all of the younger generations in the Dark Empire who come to the Demonic 
Mountains for trials have very distinguished status and are members of the royal family, and they 
must have all kinds of information in their hands.

The eldest prince came here to practice, and brought so many senior experts with him. I am afraid 
that he also has a lot of information about the places where various opportunities were created in the 
Demonic Mountains, so he was able to accurately come to this place.

At this moment, Ye Feng naturally did not hesitate at all, and immediately flew quickly towards the 
big ice tree.

But just when Ye Feng was about to approach the big ice tree, suddenly the air of ice in the air 
became more and more terrifying. Ye Feng's whole body was suddenly frozen, and even Ye Feng's 
whole body was covered with ice. His blood energy was frozen, and his entire life was about to 
freeze and wither.

At this moment, Ye Feng's eyes suddenly showed a look of surprise.

Sure enough, this ice tree is very extraordinary. The cold air in the air within a radius of more than 
ten meters is so terrifying that it freezes Ye Feng's current level of immortal body.



After all, you have to know that Ye Feng's blood energy is very strong, and ordinary power can't 
hurt Ye Feng's body at all.

But I didn't expect that Ye Feng, with such a strong physique, would be frozen in front of this ice 
tree.

At this time, Ye Feng finally understood why there were no strong men from the black scale giant 
ape clan guarding such an important place here, because there was no need to guard at all.

Because the space within a radius of more than ten meters of this ice tree is like a life restricted 
area, and anyone who comes will be frozen in an instant.

Even Ye Feng's immortal body can't stand this terrifying cold air.

But at this moment, Ye Feng instantly activated the peerless inheritance he had received from the 
Cold Ice Emperor before, the Ice Giant Art.

At this moment, Ye Feng changed his entire power from the dark race to the Ice Giant clan.

At this moment, Ye Feng's entire body expanded rapidly, and he expanded directly into a majestic 
frozen giant with a height of tens of thousands of meters.

Ye Feng possessed the power of the same attribute, so he was naturally not afraid of the icy air 
released by the ice tree.

Because Ye Feng also became a creature with the attribute of ice.

Ye Feng stretched out a big ice hand at this moment, uprooted the ice tree, and swallowed it in an 
instant.

Chapter 5499: Hurry up and take action

Boom!

At this moment, when Ye Feng swallowed the entire ice tree, a terrifying medicinal power suddenly 
exploded in Ye Feng's body.



This medicinal power is completely the power of ice attribute, but Ye Feng has now become an ice 
giant. He is not afraid of this kind of ice attribute power at all. Instead, he can transform this kind of 
ice attribute power into his own power.

At this time, the aura of Ye Feng's cultivation immediately began to surge rapidly.

After all, the level of this ice tree itself is very high. Ye Feng guessed that it is the king of spiritual 
medicines.

Therefore, the energy provided by this king of medicine is very huge, and the medicinal power is 
sufficient, so that Ye Feng's power immediately began to grow wildly at an incredible speed.

At the same time, Ye Feng's cultivation momentum also began to rise step by step.

Boom!

The second level of the God Realm!

Boom!

The third level of the God Realm!

Boom!

The fourth level of the God Realm!

Boom!

The fifth level of the God Realm!

Boom!

The sixth level of the God Realm!



Boom!

The seventh level of the God Realm!!

At this moment, Ye Feng's cultivation breath finally stopped completely.

At this moment, Ye Feng's eyes were naturally full of excitement. He didn't expect that the energy 
provided by a big ice tree was so huge that it directly allowed his cultivation to break through the 
sixth level, from the first level of the God Realm to the seventh level of the God Realm!

This made Ye Feng extremely happy.

This time, he lurked deep in this valley and really got something good.

At this moment, Ye Feng continued to explore the surroundings and found that there were no other 
good things.

It seems that the most precious thing in this valley is this big ice tree.

Ye Feng sighed. This big ice tree can grow to today's level and contains such a huge medicinal 
power. It is estimated that the black scaled giant apes in the entire valley have cultivated for 
hundreds of years to be able to do this.

At this moment, Ye Feng was about to leave, but suddenly at this moment, a cry of surprise came 
from not far away: "Who are you, kid? You actually plundered the Medicine King in the Ice 
Valley?"

At this moment, Ye Feng immediately turned around and saw several strong men from the Dark 
Empire, who should be people around the eldest prince, who had come here.

But the eldest prince himself was not among these people.



It is estimated that the eldest prince and other strong men were holding back those black-scaled 
giant apes, allowing these people to take the time to escape and come here to plunder the ice tree, 
but they didn't expect that Ye Feng got there first.

If the eldest prince came, he would definitely know that Ye Feng was the captain of the guards 
beside the little princess.

But at this time, these people were all masters around the eldest prince. They had never seen Ye 
Feng and didn't know who Ye Feng was.

At this moment, Ye Feng just grinned and said aloud: "Sorry, I got this ice tree first."

Swish!

At this moment, after Ye Feng finished speaking, he jumped up and disappeared from the scene.

"Damn it!!"

At this moment, the masters beside the eldest prince were extremely angry.

They never thought that they had fought in the valley for so long and finally had time to let them 
come here in advance, but they didn't expect that they were beaten by others.

Moreover, they sensed that the cultivation aura on Ye Feng's body was not so strong, and was much 
weaker than them.

So letting such a weak person steal the fruits of victory really made the masters beside the eldest 
prince feel angry.

But at this time they had no way, they could only chase and kill Ye Feng in the direction of his 
escape, wanting to kill Ye Feng.

At this moment, Ye Feng didn't want to entangle with these people. After all, although his 
cultivation had improved a lot, he was still a lot weaker in the face of these super masters beside the 
eldest prince.



At this moment, Ye Feng quickly left here, returned to the outside of the valley, and came to the 
place where he had just observed.

The little princess continued to observe here.

Ye Feng pulled the little princess and ran away immediately, saying, "I have been discovered, hurry 
up and leave here."

"What?"

Hearing what Ye Feng said, the little princess immediately showed a nervous look in her eyes, and 
said, "You were seen by the eldest prince? That's bad."

Ye Feng shook his head and said, "It was not seen by the eldest prince, but by several other masters 
beside the eldest prince. They don't know me and don't know who I am."

When the little princess heard what Ye Feng said, she immediately breathed a sigh of relief and said, 
"That's good. As long as the eldest prince doesn't know that it was you, Ye Feng, who did it, they 
will have no reason to deal with us openly in the future."

Ye Feng nodded at this moment, took the little princess to perform the void wormhole, and soon left 
here.

The masters beside the eldest prince who were chasing behind saw that Ye Feng disappeared in a 
blink of an eye, and they couldn't lock Ye Feng's breath at all. They immediately understood that 
although Ye Feng's cultivation was much weaker than theirs, he was definitely a leader in escaping.

At this moment, the masters beside the eldest princes all had very ugly expressions on their faces.

They had fought in the valley for so long and lost many brothers, but they didn't expect that the last 
peerless medicine king would be obtained by Ye Feng, a kid who didn't know where he came from. 
This really made the masters around the eldest prince feel very unwilling.

At this moment, Ye Feng and the little princess had completely left the area near this valley.



At this moment, the little princess looked at Ye Feng beside her and sensed the breakthrough of Ye 
Feng's cultivation aura. He actually broke through the sixth level and stepped into the seventh level 
of the God Realm.

This terrifying speed of progress made the little princess stare blankly, and her beautiful little face 
showed a shocked expression.

Because she had never seen anyone as amazing as Ye Feng, who broke through so much in just a 
short moment.

The little princess knew that Ye Feng probably used his amazing swallowing ability again to 
swallow up the good things in the deep valley just now, so he was able to improve so much.

But before the little princess could say anything, two people suddenly flew over from a direction 
not far away.

These two people, one is an old man, and the other is wearing a red dress, with some resentment on 
their faces.

These two people are Princess Honglian who has been chasing Ye Feng and the little princess, and 
her protector, Senior Liu.

At this moment, Princess Honglian saw Ye Feng and the little princess standing not far away, and 
immediately showed an extremely excited expression on her face, and said aloud: "Finally found 
you two, Senior Liu, hurry up and kill them, don't give them a chance to escape!"

Chapter 5500 Taking Advantage

At this time, when they heard what Princess Honglian said, Ye Feng and the little princess both had 
a look of astonishment in their eyes. It seemed that they did not expect that Princess Honglian had 
been chasing them both.

At this moment, the little princess seemed to realize something, and immediately couldn't help but 
show a look of anger on her face, and said loudly: "Ye Feng, when we enter this demonic mountain 
range, those guards guarding the demonic mountain range Among them, there must be a crony of 
Princess Honglian who tipped her off, so she knew that we had arrived at the Demonic Mountains 
and had been chasing the two of us. "



Hearing what the little princess said, Ye Feng nodded and said loudly: "That should be the case, 
otherwise, they would not be able to find our location so quickly and accurately."

At this moment, hearing what Ye Feng and the little princess said, Princess Honglian across from 
her immediately burst into laughter and said loudly: "You two are indeed a little clever, but it is of 
no use, even if you already know it. How I found you two doesn’t make any sense, because you two 
will definitely die next.”

At this moment, Princess Honglian immediately looked at Senior Liu beside her and said with a 
smile: "The next step will be left to you, Senior Liu."

At this time, Senior Liu nodded and slowly walked towards the direction of Ye Feng and the little 
princess.

Although he walked very slowly, with every step he took, the aura on his body became stronger. In 
the end, it was like a majestic mountain, oppressing the hearts of Ye Feng and the little princess, 
making the little princess Ye Feng They all felt a very terrible sense of depression.

At this moment, the little princess was even a little out of breath. She couldn't help but look at Ye 
Feng beside her and said loudly: "Ye Feng, this senior Liu is definitely the protector of Princess 
Honglian. His cultivation is too strong. He is an old and powerful person in our Dark Empire, what 
should we do?"

The little princess knew that Ye Feng did not escape for a moment, so there must be a way.

But the little princess didn't know what Ye Feng could do, because Senior Liu's cultivation level 
was much higher than Ye Feng's.

At this moment, Ye Feng smiled coldly and said: "This Princess Honglian has targeted us again and 
again, and now she even wants to kill us secretly in the countryside of this mountain. Then She 
won’t be able to leave today.”

"Um?"

Hearing what Ye Feng said, Princess Honglian who was not far away immediately showed a 
sarcastic smile on her face and said loudly: "You are an unknown boy, you think you are so great, 
but in fact you are nothing at all. You I have experienced their combat power, and it is indeed very 



powerful, and that is only for the younger generation. You must know that the strength of the older 
generations of strong men in our Dark Empire is not something that a young person like you can 
resist. You will definitely die today. "

At this time, Princess Honglian looked at her protector and said loudly: "Senior Liu, take action 
quickly, don't give these two people a chance to talk nonsense."

Hearing what Princess Honglian said, Senior Liu nodded and flew quickly in the direction of Ye 
Feng and the little princess. In an instant, he stretched out a big hand, like an eagle stretching out its 
huge talons. He wanted to crush the two of them in an instant.

The little princess was standing next to Ye Feng at this moment, looking at Ye Feng, as if she 
wanted to judge what Ye Feng should do.

But at this time, Ye Feng smiled coldly and said: "It's a good time to appreciate the strength of the 
older generations of our Dark Empire royal family today."

boom!

At this moment, Ye Feng directly burst out the cultivation power of the seventh level of the Divine 
Realm that he had just broken through.

If it had been before, Ye Feng might have fled here without hesitation.

But in the past few days, Ye Feng has received a lot of opportunities, and his cultivation has also 
improved greatly. He has broken through to the new seventh level of the Divine Realm, so Ye Feng 
has some confidence to fight with this powerful elder.

At this moment, when he saw Ye Feng bursting out with cultivation momentum and actually 
rushing towards him, Senior Liu was stunned for a moment, and then his eyes revealed a deep 
mockery and he said: "You are a boy whose cultivation level is five or six realms lower than mine. 
You dare to attack me. You really look down on me. Today I will let you know what the majesty and 
strength of the strong elders mean."

Boom!



Almost at this moment, Senior Liu, the protector of Princess Honglian, rushed in front of Ye Feng, 
his five fingers formed into claws, and grabbed Ye Feng's Tianling Cap, as if he was going to kill Ye 
Feng's head in an instant. crumb.

It has to be said that this senior Liu didn't take Ye Feng seriously at all, and he didn't use any 
powerful inheritance methods at all. He simply stretched out a hand to crush Ye Feng to death in an 
instant.

But at this moment, Ye Feng's fist had already shot up, and it instantly collided with Senior Liu's 
palm.

Boom!

At this moment, the two collided, and a terrifying roar suddenly erupted on the spot.

Click!

The next moment, accompanied by a crisp sound, Senior Liu's palm was directly fractured by Ye 
Feng's fist. A large number of bones were broken instantly, and the entire palm was bloody and 
bloody.

"ah!"

This pain caused Senior Liu to scream in agony.

Although this was not fatal, the five fingers were fractured and broken by Ye Feng's fist, which 
naturally made the old strong man with strong willpower like Senior Liu feel painful.

"What?"

At this moment, seeing this scene, Princess Honglian, who was originally full of sarcasm on her 
face, suddenly showed deep astonishment in her eyes.

She seemed to have never thought that Ye Feng's strength was so strong that he could have an 
advantage in physical strength.



At this moment, the little princess also widened her eyes slightly, as if she did not expect Ye Feng's 
fighting power to be so fierce.

At this time, Senior Liu quickly retreated and stared at Ye Feng, somewhat doubtful.

But then he sneered, shook off the blood on his fingers, and then said: "It seems that you are a 
young man who specializes in physical training. It is indeed very rare and rare to be able to train 
physical strength to this level, but it is useless. I suffered a loss just now, and I will never let you get 
close again this time."

Boom!

At this moment, Senior Liu directly mobilized his huge mana and displayed his peerless inheritance.

At this time, he finally started to carry out a long-range inheritance attack.

"Boom!"

At this moment, a long black river of energy immediately rushed out of Senior Liu's body.

This is a powerful inheritance in the Dark Empire, which can make his mana instantly form a long 
black river, with the power to wash and smash everything.

The black river on Senior Liu's body suddenly bombarded in front of Ye Feng, trying to smash and 
kill Ye Feng instantly.
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