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Chapter 151 Fifth place

Jiang Li’s sudden attack tore through the last veil, ruining Qian Shixi’s original plan. The banquet 
was about to end before it even started.

One had to know.

Qian Shixi was well-prepared. The level-three killing formation and the black and white elders were 
enough to kill all of Jiang Li’s men. Then, they would capture Jiang Li alive and interrogate him 
about the ‘ancient puppet technique’.

now.

the plan was ruined by jiang li.

The most important thing was ...

Qian Shixi was here to welcome Jiang Li and the others to the banquet, so he only had the two 
elders with him.

It was the best time to make a move.

“Do it.”

Jiang Li waved his right hand and attacked first.

“Kill!”

Kachaa! Kachaa!

In an instant.



The hundred perfected-stage level two electric meches attacked at the same time. Lightning flashed 
and the terrifying electric energy was released.

“!!!”

Everyone’s pupils contracted in shock.

“Grand completion of Tier 2!”

“They’re all at the great circle of Tier 2!”

“Si si si ...”

guo yi and the others cried out in alarm.

“You’re looking for death!”

The black and white elders shouted angrily.

“Qi of double fiends.”

boom!

The next moment.

The black elder and the White elder joined forces. The spiritual Qi of heaven and earth gathered and 
formed a black and white light. They intertwined together and formed a Tai Chi diagram.

bang bang bang bang!

The attacks from the hundred perfected-stage level two electric meches were all blocked.



“Rumble!”

The reception hall trembled. The tables and chairs in the surroundings were torn into pieces of 
wood by the energy storm. The ground also cracked, and a Spider-web like crack appeared.

Jiang Li, how dare you attack me? ”

Qian Shixi shouted angrily.

“Are you talking nonsense?”

Humph! Jiang Li snorted.

ynsh01. ”

let’s go. Jiang Li waved his hand and glanced at Qian Shixi. do it now and kill the enemy as soon as 
possible.

“Yes.”

Shua!

Ynsh01 quickly stepped off the stage. Mechanical psionic energy circulated around its body, 
forming a powerful force. Its arms turned into Sickles and fired psionic cannons.

BOOM! BOOM!

The two psionic cannonballs bombarded the black and white elders.

“Double fiend palm!”

Thump!



The black elder and the White elder shouted in unison. They struck out their palms at the same time. 
Their Xiantian Zhen Qi condensed and turned into a huge black and white handprint, blasting 
forward.

Bang!

An explosion sounded.

The black-and-white handprint shattered, and the psionic Cannonball exploded, filling the sky with 
a dazzling light. Ynsh01 was approaching at high speed.

On the other side.

In the banquet hall.

“There’s some movement in the reception hall.”

“Something must have happened.”

“Quick, we’ll rush over immediately.”

The men that Qian Shixi had arranged here heard the noise from the reception hall and immediately 
reacted. They took the ‘Army-slaughtering sword case’ and rushed to the reception hall as fast as 
they could.

...

BOOM! BOOM! boom!

An intense battle had already erupted.

the black and white elders were indeed late-stage tier 3 experts. because of their cultivation 
techniques, they were able to use a joint attack technique to block ynsh01’s continuous attacks.



bang!

JJ01 raised the sniper rifle, aimed at Qian Shixi, and fired. The energy bullet tore the air apart, 
forming a vortex.

“True Qi of Blood Fiend!”

Qian Shixi formed a hand seal with both hands and condensed his true Qi to form a true Qi Shield. 
It easily blocked JJ01’s energy bomb and then shattered it with one palm.

“Xiantian true Qi!”

Zhuo linyue exclaimed, ” I didn’t expect the third Prince to be a level-three inborn warrior. A level-
three inborn warrior can open the heaven and earth bridge and master the heaven and earth spiritual 
energy. His strength is far beyond that of a level-two inborn warrior.

even if Jiang Li has a hundred men of perfected-stage level two, he can’t fight against a level three 
inborn.

“jiang li, you deserve to die.”

...

qian shixi’s eyes were bloodshot and his blood-red genuine qi filled the air. his terrifying aura and 
killing intent condensed into a powerful force that crushed toward jiang li.

“......”

I’m not afraid. Jiang Li did feel the pressure. He circulated his inner force with all his might and 
resisted the force.

“Electric energy control!”



Kachaa! Kachaa!

The 100 electric-powered meches charged at Qian Shixi. Lightning gathered and generated a huge 
amount of electricity. It turned into a beam of electric light and shot toward Qian Shixi.

shua!

Qian Shixi’s figure flashed and disappeared like a bloody light. He used his speed to avoid the joint 
attack of the 100 electric meches.

“BOOM!”

the electric light beam hit the ground, creating a huge crater and charring it black.

“die!”

Buzzzzzz!

The next moment.

Qian Shixi was short and fat, but he was agile and fast. In the blink of an eye, he was in front of 
Jiang Li. He gathered his genuine Qi and threw out a palm.

Qian Shixi grinned.

“Roar!”

It was the roar of a beast.

It was the two early-stage level-three zombie puppets. They roared and quickly rushed in front of 
Jiang Li, blocking Qian Shixi.

“Thump!”



The Red Dragon puppet corpse’s body was burning with black flames, forming a flood Dragon. It 
held the halberd with both hands and directly stabbed out with a powerful force.

at the same time.

Jiang Boyi’s zombie puppet’s sharp claws tore through the air and attacked Qian Shixi with all its 
might.

“What is this?”

Qian Shixi’s pupils contracted and he was shocked.

“BOOM!”

The two sides collided.

qian shixi’s genuine qi collapsed, and the palm print was broken. the powerful force sent qian shixi 
flying, injuring his internal organs and causing him to spit out blood.

“Ah!”

Qian Shixi screamed.

“Your Highness!”

the black elder and the white elder exclaimed.

“Si si si ...”

“rank three! Two tier 3 experts!”

Jiang Li has three level-three subordinates.



“this suan ni, this suan ni”

Everyone was extremely shocked.

how is this possible?!

Qian Shixi also widened his eyes in disbelief.

“Double fiend domain!”

“whoosh!!!”

The black and white elders let out a long cry and displayed their strongest means. Black and white 
evil Qi spread out and gathered with the spiritual Qi of heaven and earth, forming an innate domain.

All the power within the domain was under the control of the black and white elders.

“Psionic energy control!”

“Whoosh!!!”

Ynsh01 also used his strongest skill. It was as if endless mechanical psionic energy was flowing out 
of ynsh01’s body and spreading to the surroundings, forming a psionic domain.

“Shatter!”

Kachaa! Kachaa!

The psionic energy spread and enveloped the black and white elders “dual fiend domains, creating 
an extremely powerful twisting and shattering force. Under the pressure of the psionic energy, the 
dual fiend domains constantly shattered.



“Ah!”

The black and white elders screamed.

“No! This is impossible!”

“The great circle of rank three! You’re actually at the perfected stage of Tier 3!”

The black elder and the White elder screamed in fear.

“BOOM!”

The double fiend domain was completely crushed.

Pfft! Pfft!

the black and white elders were seriously injured.

“!!!”

Qian Shixi’s eyes widened. He was extremely shocked when he heard what the black and white 
elders said. Jiang Zhizhi and Jiang Li actually have a subordinate who is at the perfected stage of 
tier three.

“He’s the one who’s crying!”

“Your Highness!”

At this moment.

Qian Shixi’s subordinates who had been set up in the banquet hall finally arrived. They rushed into 
the reception hall as fast as they could and shouted loudly.



“hurry up! Quickly set up a Grade 3 killing formation!”

Qian Shixi was overjoyed and extremely excited. this is our only chance. The ‘Army-slaughtering 
sword case’ is the most powerful technique King Qian gave me. As long as I set up a Tier 3 killing 
formation, I can even kill a perfected Tier 3!

“Hurry up!”

Qian Shixi shouted.

“Yes!”

“Set up the formation!”

Qian Shixi’s subordinates immediately reacted and moved quickly. They were extremely fast and 
skilled. It was obvious that this was not the first time they had set up a formation and had practiced 
it many times.

“Stop them!”

stop! Jiang Li shouted.

“Roar!”

The Red Dragon puppet roared. The Black Flame condensed and merged with the halberd in its 
hand. It then threw the halberd. The long halberd cut through the sky and pierced the man holding 
the ‘Army slaughtering sword case’.

“don’t even think about it!”

BOOM!

Qian Shixi shouted and then jumped up. He used all his strength to block the halberd thrown by the 
Red Dragon puppet corpse.



“Hahahahaha!”

haha! Qian Shixi laughed. Jiang Li, once the formation is completed, you’ll die!

“third prince, it’s too early for you to be happy.”

you’re right, ” Jiang Li said coldly.

“Let’s see who will have the last laugh.”

Qian Shixi shouted.

“Biochemical poison!”

“Whoosh!!!”

ynsh01 used his skill, and the biochemical poison spread and invaded the bodies of the black and 
white elders, gradually transforming them.

“Ah!”

The black elder and the White elder let out a shrill scream. The pain was like dismembering a 
thousand pieces of flesh. It almost shattered their souls. Such a tragic scream sent a chill down 
everyone’s spine.

“The black and white elders.”

qian shixi couldn’t bear it and shouted, ” ” don’t worry. i’ll definitely kill jiang li to avenge you. ”

Qian Shixi tried his best to stop Jiang Li’s meches.

The injuries on his body worsened.



clang! Clang! Clang!

At this moment.

The killing formation was set up.

The ‘Army-slaughtering sword case’ opened, and countless sword Qi and sword light rushed out, 
filling the entire reception hall. A hundred stage two and a thousand stage one experts stood around 
the reception hall, maintaining the operation of the ‘Army-slaughtering sword case’.

Grade 3 killing formation!

The Army-slaughtering sword formation was set up successfully.

“Your Highness, the formation is complete.”

The subordinates of Qian Shi said in unison.

“Good, good, good, hahaha Yingluo.”

qian shixi laughed. he laughed loudly and happily. he stood up from the ground and looked at jiang 
li. although he was covered in blood, he had a proud smile on his face.

“jiang li, you’ve lost. you’ve already lost.”

qian shixi shouted, “the level-three killing formation has been formed. it has covered the entire 
reception hall. you have no chance now. i didn’t expect you to have so many powerful men.”

moreover, you even found the opportunity to launch an attack first, putting me in a passive position. 
The trap that I had set up in advance was also not used.

“In fact, it even caused the deaths of the black and white elders.”



however, it doesn’t matter anymore. The stage three ‘Army slaughtering sword formation’ has been 
completed. Even a perfected stage three expert can’t break through the ‘Army slaughtering sword 
formation’.

Jiang Li, prepare to die in despair and wailing.

At the same time.

The black and white elders ‘screams stopped. Their entire bodies turned pitch-black, and even their 
eyes turned completely black, devouring all light.

Immediately after.

The black and white elders stood up unsteadily from the ground.

The transformation was a success!

Two late-stage third rank walking corpse puppets!

“Roar!”

The black and white demons, who had transformed into late stage rank 3 walking corpses, let out a 
long roar, as if announcing their birth to everyone.

“Black and white elders, what are you two doing?”

Qian Shixi was stunned.

“That’s why, third Prince, it’s too early for you to be happy.”

Jiang Li looked at Qian Shixi’s stiff expression as if he was looking at a dying man. His tone was 
calm, but it made Qian Shixi’s heart shiver.



Shua! shua! shua!

In ynsh01, two early-stage and two late-stage rank-three walking puppets stood in front of Jiang Li 
and faced Qian Shixi.

Five!

Five stage three experts!

This terrifying pressure made Qian Shixi’s face pale and his legs tremble.
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