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Chapter 73 internal worries

first of all, city Lord Jiang, you need to know that the ‘three laws of the human race’ isn’t set by a 
single human dynasty, imperial dynasty, or imperial dynasty. Instead, it was initiated by the ‘martial 
immortal court’, and then, after experiencing the test of time, all the dynasties, imperial dynasties, 
and imperial dynasties, and so on, jointly set and passed the highest rules.

“Therefore, as long as you are a member of the human race, you must abide by the ‘three laws of 
the human race’,” han Liqi said slowly.

“Oh.”

Jiang Li nodded. I can understand that. Go on. What’s the specific? ”

“The first of the three great laws of the human race is that marriage with any other race is forbidden. 
The second one is that all human beings have the absolute right to expand their territories, and all 
non-humankind cities they conquer will belong to them, without any interference from any other 
human forces. As long as the territory they conquer is large enough, they can even establish 
dynasties, Supreme dynasties, or even Supreme dynasties.”

third, it is everyone’s responsibility to protect the human race.

“Just these three?”

Jiang Li asked.

“Yes,”

Han Liqi nodded.

“I think we should add one more.”



Jiang Li said.

“This bi an, why do you say that?”

Han Liqi looked suspicious.

“You can add a fourth one,’study hard and improve every day’.”

it’s my responsibility. Jiang Li smiled. it’s the third rule,’it’s everyone’s responsibility to protect the 
human race’.

“City Lord Jiang.”

Han Liqi’s expression was solemn as he said in a deep voice, ” “We can’t joke about this. The three 
laws of the human race are related to the rise and fall of the entire human race. We can’t be 
careless.”

“So please don’t make such jokes in the future to avoid unnecessary trouble.”

thank you for the reminder, Sir. Jiang Li shrugged. I’ve noted it down.

“City Lord Jiang, please accept the decree.”

Han Liqi gave the Imperial edict to Jiang Li again.

“Yes.”

Jiang Li thought about it and took the ‘imperial edict’.

“Oh, that’s right,”

han liqi smiled. ” i forgot to tell city lord jiang something. from today onwards, i will take over 
yang zike’s position and take charge of the yongan city county government. ”



“I’ll be taking office today.”

“Oh, greetings, County Lord han.”

Jiang Li, ” Jiang Li raised his eyebrows and greeted with a smile.

“city lord jiang is too polite.”

Han Liqi returned a smile. I hope that the two of us can work together sincerely in the future and be 
honest with each other. We can build Yongan city together.

“Well said, well said.”

of course. Jiang Li smiled. of course.

“Farewell.”

Han Liqi cupped his hands.

“Ma han, go see County Lord han off.”

Jiang Li shouted.

“No need.”

Han Liqi waved his hand. I know the way to the county government office.

han Liqi. Jiang Li watched han Liqi leave the hall.

“Jiang Zhiyu, city Lord Jiang, the regional King has asked me to pass you a message.”



at this moment.

Jiang Donglai got up from the ground and touched the swollen half of his face. He was very angry 
in his heart, but he didn’t dare to say anything. His tone was particularly nervous and nervous, and 
his expression was even more respectful.

“speak,” he said.

jiang li just glanced at it.

the Commandery Prince said that the ‘blood refining bead’ is of great importance. So, please hand it 
over to the Black Dragon Commandery, city Lord Jiang.

Jiang Donglai said.

Jiang Li said indifferently, ” I risked my life to get this. This King wants to take it away? ” There’s 
no such good thing in this world.”

Governor Jiang, although you are the governor, Yongan city is under the jurisdiction of the Black 
Dragon County.

I’m kindly advising you to think twice before you act, ” Jiang Donglai said. after all, the ‘blood 
refinement bead’ was made by the evil formation of the ‘half-monster Alliance’.

“This isn’t anything good, it’s an ‘evil thing’.”

It was obvious.

The Commandery Prince of the Black Dragon County just wanted the blood-refining beads. As for 
the ‘important matter’ and the ‘evil thing’ of the half-monster Alliance, he didn’t care.

...

They were all excuses.



One had to know.

The ‘blood refinement bead’ was made from the lives of tens of thousands of living beings, 
including a few stage two living beings. It was a ‘treasure’ that could help one break through to 
stage three.

The most important thing was ...

the commandery prince of the black dragon county was a warrior at the peak of the second stage. he 
had been at the peak of the second stage for a long time. when he heard the news about the blood 
refining bead, he was like a cat that had smelled fish. he couldn’t hold back anymore.

If it wasn’t for the fact that he had to care about his reputation.

he would have personally joined the battle long ago.

“Wang Gang, throw him out.”

jiang li waved his hand. he wasn’t interested in talking anymore.

“yes, chief sovereign.”

Shua!

...

” yes, ” wang gang replied. his figure flickered and disappeared. the next moment, he appeared 
beside jiang donglai and grabbed his collar.

“Yingluo, what are you doing?”

Jiang Donglai’s voice trembled.



“ah!”

Wang Gang swung his right hand and Jiang Donglai was sent flying out of the hall, screaming. He 
crashed through the door and fell to the ground.

And it was face first, rubbing against the ground and rolling a few meters.

It hurt just looking at it.

“jiang zhizhi, jiang li zhizhi.”

Jiang Li! Jiang Donglai pointed at Jiang Li with trembling fingers.

“If you don’t get lost, do you believe I’ll make you stay here forever?”

Jiang Li said in a deep voice.

“......”

Jiang Donglai was shocked. He didn’t even dare to say a word and turned to run out.

“Hahahahaha!”

In the surroundings.

many members of the sirius gang burst into laughter when they saw this.

“you’ve really thrown away all the face of the black dragon.”

Han Liqi also turned around and shook his head.



In the main hall.

“Wang Pingyuan,”

Jiang Li said.

“Your subordinate is here.”

Wang Pingyuan bowed respectfully.

“Send someone to follow Jiang Donglai, but don’t alert the enemy. Let’s see what he’s up to.”

keep an eye on han Liqi too, “Jiang Li said. send someone to keep an eye on him too.

“As you wish, sect master, oh no, I mean Lord City Master.”

Wang Pingyuan said.

“Go on.”

go. Jiang Li waved his hand.

“Yes.”

Wang Pingyuan turned around and walked out of the hall.

I haven’t heard anything from Qinglin city and the barren city recently. The half-monster Alliance 
seems to have disappeared. But the Black Dragon County showed up first.

Jiang Li tapped the armrest with his right index finger and murmured, ” “Black Dragon County’s 
King, I’d like to see what kind of tricks you’re going to play.”



“Ma han.”

jiang li shouted.

“Your subordinate has arrived.”

Ma han immediately ran in.

“Go and call Hong Tianqi.”

Jiang Li said.

“Yes.”

Ma han nodded and left with the order.

In the afternoon.

Hong Tianqi arrived.

Hong Tianqi, head instructor of the reserve city guards, greets the city Lord.

Hong Tianqi knelt down and saluted.

“Instructor Hong, you don’t have to be so polite.”

get up. Jiang Li looked up. get up.

“Thank you, city Lord.”

Hong Tianqi stood up.



Although the city hadn’t been informed that Jiang Li had become the new city Lord yet, there was 
no ceremony.

However, as the head instructor of the city guards, Hong Tianqi had received the news in advance.

In reality.

After the battle in Qingshan Valley, Hong Tianqi was lucky enough to touch the barrier of level two. 
He would probably break through to level two soon.

Plus, Hong Tianqi was knowledgeable, so he could be a good help.

“What’s the situation with the city guards?”

what is it? ” Jiang Li asked.

“Thank you for your concern, city Lord. Because of the last war, the city guard Army suffered 
heavy losses, and only less than 1000 of the original 5000 soldiers are left.”

Hong Tianqi sounded depressed.

“a thousand people.”

Jiang Li frowned. that’s too little.

For now.

Jiang Li didn’t have enough meches to form an Army, mainly because he didn’t have enough energy 
points. If he had enough energy points, he could have thousands of meches.

But now ...

He also needed the strength of the city guards and the gang members.
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