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Chapter 82 Elite troops

It would consume 140 energy points to upgrade any early-stage mech to the perfected stage of level 
one.

This time, Jiang Li ranked 310th.

thus, he had used up 43400 energy points.

Shua! Shua!

meches. Jiang Li saw all the meches in front of him flash with light. Each mech had obvious 
changes.

It only took a few seconds.

The promotion was complete.

The 310 meches were all promoted to the perfected stage of level one, and their military ranks were 
all Sergeant.

“My Lord!”

The three hundred and ten meches saluted at the same time.

“good, good.”

okay. Jiang Li nodded in satisfaction.

biochemical mech No. SH01 upgraded.



jiang li upgraded the only level-two bio-mech he had.

shua!

It consumed 14000 energy points.

Wuwuwuwuwu!

The light flickered.

Biochemical mech SH01’s appearance didn’t change much. Its weapons were still rocket launchers 
and rotary Gatling guns, but it was more powerful and its rank was promoted to first lieutenant.

unit type: biochemical mech

[ rank: grand completion of rank-two ]

[ No.: SH01 ]

skill 1: level-one ultimate biochemical poison

skill 2: rank-two ultimate biochemical physique

biochemical machinery: Chi Chi (omitted) ”

advancement requirements: one level-three soul Tinder, 10000 energy points ”

jiang li finished reading the information of biochemical mech sh01.

make 600 combat meches, 600 cold weapon meches, 600 firearm meches, and 600 biochemical 
meches.



Jiang Li used another 24000 energy points and created 2400 meches, 600 of each type.

Shua!

The manufacturing interface appeared.

Four illusionary human figures appeared, each with a ‘X600’ beside it, and countless light spots 
filled the illusionary human figures.

It gradually solidified.

A minute later.

The production was completed.

Buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz!

In an instant.

The illusionary figures turned real. 2400 meches appeared in front of Jiang Li.

A dense crowd of people.

They stood in four teams in neat rows.

“Greetings, chief sovereign!”

The 2,400 meches saluted Jiang Li at the same time. It was indeed an impressive scene. Jiang Li felt 
like he was experiencing a ‘military parade’.

“Very good,” he said.



Jiang Li was all smiles.

Shua!

At this moment.

A notification popped up in front of Jiang Li.

congratulations, my Lord. As you created 600 cold weapon meches at the same time, a special 
probability has been triggered. You’ve received level-one elite meches, hammer mech, spear mech, 
and Archer mech.

“Oh.”

it’s a special chance. Jiang Li raised his eyebrows. I’ve made a lot of cold weapon meches before, 
but none of them triggered the special chance. This time, I triggered it three times.

“JC01, CQ01, and GJS01, step forward.”

stop! Jiang Li shouted.

“Yes.”

...

Immediately.

Three clearly different meches walked out from the cold weapon meches. Their weapons weren’t 
alloy daggers but special weapons.

unit Type: Giant hammer mech (elite)



[ rank: early stage of rank one ]

[ No.: JC01 ]

skill 1: level-one low-grade cold weapon Mastery ”

skill 2: level-one inferior-grade hammer technique ”

[ machinery: Jian Jia (omitted) ]

” advancement requirement: 40 energy points ”

......

unit type: spear mech (elite)

...

[ rank: early stage of rank one ]

[ no.: cq01 ]

” skill 1: level-one low-grade cold weapon mastery ”

skill 2: level-one inferior-grade spear technique ”

[machinery: Jian Jia (omitted)]

advancement requirement: 40 energy points ”

......



troop type: Archer mech (elite)

[rank: early stage of rank one]

[no.: gjs01]

skill 1: level-one low-grade cold weapon Mastery ”

skill 2: Level 1 low-grade archery

[machinery: Jian Jia (omitted)]

advancement requirement: 40 energy points ”

......

Three elite troops.

He was only at the early stage of level one, but he already had two skills. Other than ‘cold weapon 
Mastery’, he also had a unique exclusive skill, so he was even stronger.

Furthermore ...

the energy points required for a promotion were twice that of a normal troop class.

The giant hammer mech carried two huge iron hammers on his back. They were black and made of 
special alloy. They were heavy and powerful.

The body and handle of the hammer were half the height of the giant hammer mech.

The spear-wielding mech held a black spear. It was a head taller than the spear-wielding mech.



The Archer mech held a black longbow in its hand and carried two quivers on its back. Each quiver 
contained 50 arrows.

upgrade all meches to the perfected stage of level one.

Jiang Li checked the information of the three elite units. He didn’t upgrade them yet. He used 
335580 energy points and upgraded 2397 meches.

among them.

Six hundred combat meches, six hundred firearm meches, six hundred biochemical meches, and 
five hundred and ninety-seven cold weapon meches.

Shua! shua! Shua!

lights flashed on the two thousand meches. the gloves on the combat meches changed. the cold 
weapon meches had more weapons, and the firearm meches were equipped with rifles, submachine 
guns, and machine guns.

finally.

The biochemical mech didn’t change much, only its muscles had expanded.

All the meches were promoted from private to Sergeant.

He opened the Dominator panel.

After the series of upgrades and the number of soldiers he had just killed, his energy points had 
been reduced to 48620 points, which meant that he had used up 392980 points.

“there are less than fifty thousand energy points left. i can’t send more soldiers. i need to leave 
enough energy points to replenish the ammunition of the firearm meches and repair them.”

Jiang Li thought.



promoted to three elite troops.

Soon after.

Jiang Li upgraded all three elite troops to the perfected stage of level one and two of their skills 
were upgraded to the best-grade.

At the same time.

Their weapons had all reached the level of a Supreme-grade Tier 1.

In reality.

Jiang Li originally planned to upgrade the three elite troops to level two. After all, elite troops were 
stronger than ordinary troops.

However, there were only four level-two soul Tinders, and two soul Tinders were needed to upgrade 
an elite soldier to level two. The abilities of the Archer mech and the sniper mech overlapped.

so,

In the end, Jiang Li decided to upgrade the giant hammer mech to level two first and save two level-
two soul Tinders for later. As for the spearmen and the archers, he would deal with them later.

unit Type: Giant hammer mech (elite)

[ rank: grand completion of rank-one ]

[ No.: JC01 ]

” skill 1: level 1 ultimate cold weapon mastery ”



” skill 2: rank-one supreme hammer technique ”

[ machinery: Jian Jia (omitted) ]

advancement requirements: two level-two soul Tinders, 200 energy points ”

upgrade to JC01 giant hammer mech.

jiang li confirmed.

Buzzzzzz!

Two level-two soul Tinders were merged into the body of the giant hammer mech, and 200 energy 
points were used to upgrade the giant hammer mech.

Several rays of light flickered on his body.

A few seconds later.

the promotion was completed.

The giant hammer mech had obvious changes.
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