
Army 851

Chapter 851 dao attainment

Jiang Li was at the critical moment of his breakthrough. He was subliming the machinery heavenly 
Dao and creating the machinery great Dao. He had become the ancestor of the great Dao. The 
outside world was also in chaos.

the border war of universe ocean.

buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz! “whoosh!!!”

At this very moment.

The entire universe ocean had undergone tremendous changes. The new life race and the life spirit 
race had each occupied half of the universe ocean.

obviously.

The ‘new generation’ had expanded much faster than Jiang Li had expected. In just 10000 years, 
they had already occupied one-third of the entire universe ocean.

In reality.

The 30 patriarchs of the great Dao from the six clans also felt an extremely huge pressure.

The ‘non-existent’ sea water and the ‘existing’ sea water collided. At the point of contact, a wave 
that could destroy everything was produced. The two were like fire and water, unable to co-exist.

only one side would be destroyed.

The new generation.



“Finally,”

The heaven Lord stood in the middle of universe ocean, his figure like a dream. He looked down at 
everything, at the countless new generation race members, and slowly said, ” “It’s about to start.”

It turned out.

after the heaven lord had become the ‘ancestor of the new life’, he had helped the new life race 
expand continuously. that was why the new life race had been able to occupy half of universe ocean 
in a short 10000 years.

Therefore ...

unknowingly.

the heaven Lord’s prestige in the new generation was rising.

the original thirty newborn ancestors were even more satisfied with the heaven Lord’s decision, and 
they naturally supported it.

so,

the heaven Lord had gathered all of the new life race Army.

As for the number of soldiers in the new generation Army, it could no longer be described as a 
‘number’.

Similarly.

The 30 patriarchs of the great Dao of the six races also received the news immediately in order to 
prepare for the upcoming ‘final battle between the two races’.

They had also gathered all their forces.



In reality.

This was no longer just a matter of a ‘Super Fantasy world’, but a matter that could affect the life 
and death of the entire living spirit race. The military forces of all worlds were gathered.

The Army of the living beings and the new beings gathered.

They headed toward the border battlefield of universe ocean.

The most bitter, intense, and terrifying final battle was about to erupt between the two sides. 
Whether it was the living spirit race or the new generation, they had all sent out all the soldiers they 
could.

Because ...

This battle was a matter of life and death.

He had to win.

“We will win this battle, and we must win.”

The God race.

One of the five ancestral gods, the ‘karma ancestral God’, said in a deep voice.

“Yes.”

the 30 great dao ancestors stood together. most of them were silent, and only a few of them nodded 
in response.

“Martial ancestor.”



One of the five demon patriarchs, the ‘origins demon ancestor’, asked, ” “The ancestor of the 
Purple Phoenix hasn’t arrived yet?”

The martial ancestor just glanced at the origin demon ancestor coldly and didn’t reply.

“I believe she will be here.”

The old man said.

“Yes.”

The other great Dao ancestors nodded.

Within the great cosmos.

The world of origin.

Buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz! “whoosh!!!”

The aura of Dao spread around Jiang Li. He was about to succeed.

“That’s great.”

I’ve mastered the Dao. Bai Zifeng looked at Jiang Li with a happy smile on her face. I’ve mastered 
the Dao. I’ll be able to make a breakthrough soon.

“then, zhenzhen”

...

After sensing for a while, Bai Zifeng had already sensed the Qi movement at the border battlefield 
of universe ocean. the war between the new generation race and the living spirit race is about to 
break out.



“Whether it’s for the sake of the living spirit race, or to kill that newborn ancestor and revive 
mother, I must participate in this war.”

Buzzzzzz!

Bai Zifeng looked at Jiang Li again. She was surrounded by the mist of the great Dao.

After that.

there was a flash of light.

Bai Zifeng disappeared from the origin realm.

Buzzzzzz! Wuwuwuwuwu!

Jiang Li merged with the machine Dao that he created. In the depths of his mind, the ‘super 
mechanical Army’ had also changed greatly under the nurturing of the machine Dao.

The scene changed.

at the border battlefield of universe ocean.

...

Shua!

Bai Zifeng’s figure emerged from the space.

“They’re here.”

The martial ancestor said.



“Yes.”

Bai Zifeng nodded.

“Then, let’s get ready.”

The martial ancestor took a deep breath and looked in the direction of the new generation. His eyes 
were filled with crazed killing intent, and it even caused the water of universe ocean to surge.

“Yes.”

Bai Zifeng said.

Buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz! “Whoosh!!!”

At the same time.

The time and space in universe ocean were distorted. One after another, huge black holes appeared, 
forming stable plane passages.

” kill!!! ”

” all troops, charge!!! ”

“Kill!”

“......”

The next moment.

Just like that, the war between the new generation and the living beings erupted.



from the huge black hole vortexes, huge legions poured out one after another. their numbers were 
already uncountable.

At this moment.

The Army of the new generation and the Army of the living creatures clashed together, fighting for 
their lives.

Laws, rules, and heavenly Dao.

It formed an incomparably bright and dazzling radiance that covered more than half of the 
battlefield. The battle had only just begun, but it had already caused such a violent reaction.

“Rumble!”

It seemed like ...

The entire universe ocean was shaking.

“Hahahahaha!”

suddenly.

Maniacal laughter rang out from the new generation.

Buzzzzzz! buzzzzzz!

One figure after another appeared.

the high and mighty patriarchs of the great Dao of the six clans.



the heaven Lord was walking through universe ocean. Other than the heaven Lord, there were also 
thirty new ancestors, but they were no longer all in human form.

“I’m very happy.”

” i’m honored to be able to speak with you as equals, ” the heaven lord continued.

“You are the heaven Lord.”

one of the five Elder Gods of the God race, the divine Dao Elder God, looked at the heaven Lord.

“yes, i am.”

the heaven lord smiled. ” i thank lord ancestor god for remembering my name. ”

“what do you want to do?”

The divine Dao Elder God asked.

“what are you doing?”

The heaven Lord shrugged his shoulders. don’t tell me you guys didn’t see it? This world has 
become filthy. I’m cleaning this world, washing away the filth of this world.”

“For example, the ‘six clans’.”

“You are the filth of this world.”

“You’re looking for death.”

One of the five ancestral fiends, the chaos ancestral fiend, had a cold expression.



“you want to kill me?”

the heaven Lord laughed, very happily. that’s right. You did this in the past, but it’s a pity that I 
didn’t die and was even resurrected in a new form.

then, I’ll always have such a powerful strength to take revenge for myself and wash away my past 
humiliation.

“I’m very happy.”

” hahaha ... the heaven Lord heartily laughed. truly, I’m extremely happy. In addition, soon, 
something even more delightful will happen because all of you will die.

“You’re full of nonsense.”

BOOM!

” die! the Samsara ancestral God thrust out a finger, unleashing the light of the great Dao of 
Samsara and shooting it at the heaven Lord.

shua!

” rebirth! the heaven Lord also thrust out a finger, and the power of rebirth, comparable to the 
power of a great Dao, transformed into a silver finger that clashed with the light of the Samsara 
great Dao.

Bang!

There was a loud bang.

The two finger radiances were destroyed at the same time.

It dissipated into nothingness.



“Let’s do it,”

The martial ancestor shouted.

BOOM! BOOM! BOOM!

in that instant.

The light of martial arts enveloped the martial ancestor’s entire body. Martial arts were Supreme. 
The martial ancestor charged in front, and his gaze was only fixed on the ‘ancestor of new life’ from 
the beginning to the end.

He took a closer look.

This new born ancestor was not in human form, but a ball of pitch-black fog. Within the fog, 
countless weapons appeared and disappeared.

furthermore ...

Behind each weapon, a figure condensed.

He was one of the 31 new ancestors,’weapon ancestor black fog’.

The most important thing was ...

back then.

Bai Zifeng’s mother,’Jiang Yan’, had died at the hands of weapon ancestor black fog. She had been 
killed by one of weapon ancestor black fog’s weapons, the’ embroidery needle’.

Clang clang clang!



countless weapons flew out. the martial ancestor’s one punch broke all techniques. under this 
punch, the weapons condensed by the black mist were destroyed one after another.

The next moment.

The martial ancestor and weapon ancestor black fog were fighting each other.

“Kill!”

A battle on the level of the great Dao erupted.

Universe ocean had become their battlefield. The 30 great Dao ancestors and the 30 new generation 
ancestors were fighting.

“ancestral dragon, descend!”

Buzzzzzz!

Bai Zifeng waved her right hand.

Roar! “Roar!”

The Dragon’s Roar resounded through the sky.

After that.

A nine-clawed ancestral Dragon appeared.

“Kill!”

Bai Zifeng intended to attack ‘weapon ancestor black fog’.



“Where do you want to go?”

Buzzzzzz!

the heaven lord appeared and blocked bai zifeng’s path. endless silver light appeared, and the power 
of rebirth transformed into a boundless god statue that blocked the nine-clawed ancestral dragon.

“You!”

Bai Zifeng’s face darkened.

“Oh.”

” you ... the heaven Lord looked at Bai Zifeng and finally came to his senses. I remember you. You 
were one of those who entered the heaven Lord’s Secret realm, and you entered the final legacy 
Land.

“I didn’t expect that you would also ‘achieve Dao’.”

“it’s a pity,”

if you had attained Dao earlier, you might have been able to live a little longer. However, it’s too 
late now, because you will all die.

“you’re full of nonsense.”

Roar! Roar! “Roar!”

The next moment.

” kill! Bai Zifeng waved her hand, summoning countless divine beasts to surround the heaven Lord.

“The myriad world of divine statues.”



Buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz!

the heaven Lord had also summoned countless god statues to block Bai Zifeng’s divine beast.

“Rumble!”

The battle of the great DAOs had broken out.

The war between the new generation and the living beings had officially begun.

universe ocean was surging with endless waves.

Who knew how many worlds had been destroyed because of this.

the most important thing was ...

The destroyed world gave birth to ‘bizarreness’.

it was a vicious cycle.

The world of the great cosmos.

The world of origin.

Jiang Li opened his eyes. He had become one with the great Dao of machinery and had made a 
breakthrough. He had become the ancestor of the great Dao and finally achieved Dao.

The machinery great Dao appeared.

In that instant.



countless mechanical worlds appeared behind jiang li and started to spread.

Gradually.

It spread to the entire universe ocean.

Hence.

A strange phenomenon occurred.

The machinery great Dao affected the entire universe ocean.

Even ...

Under the influence of the machinery great Dao, universe ocean had even given birth to a true 
Machinery World.

“this is a kasaya.”

“The great Dao! this is the great dao!”

“Another great Dao ancestor has been born.”

“......”

countless living beings were shocked.

at the same time.

Countless members of the new generation were also shocked.

Jiang Li had a breakthrough.



It shook the entire universe ocean, which in turn affected the war between the new generation race 
and the living spirit race.

Chapter 852 Obliteration

After that.

The strange phenomenon gradually disappeared.

Buzzzzzz! buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz!

The strange phenomenon turned into countless lights and merged into Jiang Li’s body.

jiang li opened his eyes.

After that.

His consciousness spread out, and in an instant, it had already enveloped the entire universe ocean. 
He knew that the war between the new generation race and the living spirit race had broken out.

Furthermore ...

Jiang Li had reached his limit.

The ancestor of the great Dao.

There was really no way forward.

“The great Dao.”



great Dao, ” Jiang Li murmured, feeling the power of the machine Dao. it’s indeed the power of the 
great Dao.

Shua!

let’s go. Jiang Li stepped out.

In an instant.

He had crossed countless spaces and distances, directly crossed the obstacles of time and space, and 
arrived at the border battlefield of universe ocean. He had appeared in the battlefield.

“Jiang Li!”

The martial ancestor was shocked. He looked at Jiang Li in disbelief. it’s you! You’ve actually 
‘attained the Dao’ and become the ‘ancestor of the great Dao’. ”

“this suan ni, this suan ni”

“tsk, tsk.”

the reincarnation ancestral god sighed.

“I didn’t expect this!”

Ancestral fiend destruction was also very shocked.

“Hahahahaha!”

this is great! The 32nd ancestor of the great Dao has been born in our six races!

“This battle! We will definitely win!”



“......”

The patriarchs of the great Dao also laughed out loud.

“Damn it!”

the heaven Lord’s face was gloomy.

“Why would I?”

why did the 32nd great Dao ancestor appear? ”

we are the true darlings of universe ocean. Only the new generation race can bring new life to 
universe ocean. The living spirit race is just a filth in universe ocean, a filth that needs to be 
cleaned!

“Why?”

The group of new born ancestors also roared in anger.

“Father-in-law, I’m here to help you,”

Buzzzzzz!

weapon ancestor black fog. Jiang Li looked around and saw ‘weapon ancestor black fog’. He also 
recognized that it was the newborn ancestor who killed Bai Zifeng’s mother.

Hence.

without the slightest hesitation.

“Kill!”



BOOM!

Jiang Li stepped through the void of universe ocean. In an instant, he had crossed half of the border 
battlefield and arrived in front of weapon ancestor black fog.

“Die!”

buzzzzzz!

Jiang Li’s palm fell. The light of the great Dao of machinery bloomed. The power of the great Dao 
gathered and formed a palm print of the great Dao of machinery, which charged at weapon ancestor 
black fog.

Bang!

weapon ancestor black fog formed a giant sword and blocked jiang li’s attack.

“alright!”

The martial ancestor was overjoyed. Without any hesitation, he unleashed the power of the great 
Dao of martial arts and launched an extremely violent attack on weapon ancestor black fog.

BOOM! BOOM! BOOM!

The explosion reverberated through half of the battlefield at the border of universe ocean.

...

“Kill!”

let’s go! Jiang Li roared. The machine Dao was shining brightly around him. He joined hands with 
martial ancestor and attacked weapon ancestor black fog. Weapon ancestor black fog was soon 
suppressed.



He retreated step by step.

“Not good!”

“Weapon ancestor black fog is in danger!”

the life spirit race has given birth to the 32nd great Dao ancestor. Our current situation is not good. 
If anything happens to weapon ancestor black fog again, we’ll be in danger.

“Are we going to retreat?”

buzzzzzz! buzzzzzz!

The new generation ancestors discussed.

“You want to retreat? It won’t be that easy!”

the patriarchs of the great dao berated him one after another and pressed forward step by step.

...

This battle.

It was impossible to determine the winner in a short time in a battle between great DAOs. The battle 
of great DAOs had been going on for nine years, and the war between the new generation and the 
living spirit race had also been going on for nine years.

“Ah!”

Pfft!

Finally ...



the war lasted for nine years.

Jiang Li seized the opportunity and found weapon ancestor black fog’s main body. He formed a 
sword of the great Dao of machinery and stabbed weapon ancestor black fog.

weapon ancestor black fog shrieked in pain as blood splattered.

He was injured.

“Hahahahaha!”

the martial ancestor was extremely excited and laughed out loud. That’s great! Good son-in-law! 
hurry up! Join forces with me and we must kill weapon ancestor black fog this time. It will be very 
difficult to find another chance like this in the future.”

“Yes, father-in-law.”

yes, ” Jiang Li replied.

BOOM! boom! boom!

weapon ancestor black fog screamed in pain. because his main body was injured, he was almost out 
of breath under the joint attack of jiang li and martial ancestor.

“Bastard!”

Weapon ancestor black fog bellowed.

“Divide!”

buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz! Wuwuwuwuwu!



Hence.

Weapon ancestor black fog unleashed his ultimate move.

In an instant.

Weapon ancestor black fog split into many black fog figures. Each of them was holding a weapon 
and attacked Jiang Li and martial ancestor.

super divine mechanical Army, help me.

stop! Jiang Li roared.

Buzzzzzz!

Hence.

The screen of the Super mechanical Army appeared. Next to Jiang Li, virtual screens appeared one 
after another with figures on them.

Buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz! “Whoosh!!!”

One by one, the virtual screens started to absorb the ’empty’ water of universe ocean.

Almost instantly.

The figures on the virtual screen became real.

shua!

[ mechanical great Dao warrior! [ creation successful! ]



A notification popped up.

“Kill!”

jiang li roared.

“Kill!”

“I’ll kill enemies for the hegemon!”

“......”

boom! boom! BOOM!

Jiang Li blocked all the black mist clones of weapon ancestor while the Warriors of the great Dao of 
machinery fought with the black mist clones.

“You can’t run away.”

BOOM!

The martial ancestor let out a loud roar and unleashed the might of his martial Dao. He stared at the 
true body of weapon ancestor black fog and attacked. He punched through weapon ancestor black 
fog’s chest.

It came out of his body.

“Ah!”

Weapon ancestor black fog let out a shrill cry.

“weapon ancestor black fog!”



The rest of the newborn ancestors shouted loudly.

Buzzzzzz! Wuwuwuwuwu!

the group of new ancestors wanted to rush over to help weapon ancestor black fog, but they were all 
blocked by the group of dao ancestors. they had no chance at all.

” the heaven lord’s clone. ”

It was a critical moment.

in the end, the heaven lord had created an extremely secretive clone that avoided bai zifeng and the 
other great dao ancestors. he self-destructed and charged toward the martial ancestor.

“Be careful, father-in-law.”

I’ll go. Jiang Li’s pupils constricted.

BOOM!

” die! ” jiang li created a mechanical true body and crashed into the heaven lord’s clone. the two 
collided and exploded. they both died.

“Die!”

The martial ancestor shouted crazily.

“Rip!”

Weapon ancestor black fog’s body was torn into two halves by the martial ancestor, and his blood 
sprayed all over the sky. The two halves of weapon ancestor black fog’s body turned into a light 
mist and fled into the distance.



in the blink of an eye.

The two halves of his body merged into one.

Obviously.

Weapon ancestor black fog was the ancestor of the new life, an existence on the same level as the 
ancestor of the great Dao. How could he be killed so easily? even if his body was torn to pieces, he 
could still be resurrected.

“we have to cut off his spacetime.”

stop! Jiang Li shouted.

“Good son-in-law, please help me.”

The martial ancestor roared.

“yes.”

yes, ” Jiang Li replied.

Buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz! “Whoosh!!!”

Hence.

machine Dao! Jiang Li released the machine Dao with all his might and cut off time and space. 
Weapon ancestor black fog was trapped by the terrifying power.

“Die!”

The martial ancestor roared and rushed toward weapon ancestor black fog.



The two sides were engaged in an intense battle.

fortunately ...

Weapon ancestor black fog was already injured. Facing the martial ancestor’s crazy attacks, he was 
gradually disappearing. Jiang Li couldn’t help because he had to cross time and space, so he used 
the ‘super divine mechanical Army’ to create mechanical great Dao Warriors to help martial 
ancestor.

“Ah!”

weapon ancestor black fog let out a shrill cry.

“Die!”

BOOM!

The martial ancestor roared. He was covered in blood. His huge fist was covered with the power of 
the martial Dao. He punched weapon ancestor black fog’s head.

BOOM! boom! BOOM!

Not only that.

The martial ancestor attacked crazily, punching out one punch after another, shattering the space of 
universe ocean and turning weapon ancestor black fog’s body into dust.

what?!

“Weapon ancestor black fog, he’s a coward!”

“Impossible! this is impossible!”



“I won’t! I definitely won’t!”

“Weapon ancestor black fog was the ancestor of the new. How could he have fallen? It’s impossible 
for him to die!”

“......”

fear rose in the hearts of the new born ancestors.

how did this happen?!

the heaven Lord was also completely dumbfounded.

“Hahahahaha!”

The celestial ancestor laughed wildly.

“Amazing! Amazing! He’s really too powerful!”

The reincarnation ancestral God said in shock.

“He actually killed a newborn ancestor.”

ancestral fiend destruction asked in shock.

“Kill!”

“Pursue and attack!”

“......”

the battle intent of the ancestors of the great dao was high.



“i ran ran, i ran ran successfully!”

The martial ancestor was stunned for a moment, then he was overjoyed.

To tell the truth.

The martial ancestor was also the ancestor of the great Dao. He clearly understood how difficult it 
was to kill the ‘newborn ancestor’.

It was almost impossible.

it would be difficult even if they surrounded him.

Therefore ...

Although killing ‘weapon ancestor black fog’ was the only hope of resurrecting Jiang Yan, he knew 
how slim the chances were.

However ...

He didn’t think about it.

It was a success.

he had really succeeded.

With Jiang Li’s help, the martial ancestor and Jiang Li worked together to kill weapon ancestor 
black fog. They used all their means to cut off time and space. The martial ancestor finally blew up 
weapon ancestor black fog.

“Hahahahaha!”



The martial ancestor laughed out loud.

Buzzzzzz!

At this moment.

among the dust, there was a black light of the origin. it escaped into universe ocean when the 
martial ancestor was careless.

“Not good.”

Buzzzzzz!

The martial ancestor reacted and was about to stop him, but he was too late.

“No!”

The martial ancestor roared and widened his eyes. He was filled with endless unwillingness.

“Mechanical cage.”

Buzzzzzz!

Jiang Li, on the other hand, was on his guard because he knew how difficult it was to kill a newborn 
ancestor.

plus ...

Jiang Li didn’t attack. Instead, he used the machinery Dao to cut off time and space. That was why 
Jiang Li could react in time. He used the machinery Dao to form a cage of Dao and trapped weapon 
ancestor black fog.

“That’s Yingluo.”



the martial ancestor was a little shocked.

“The great Dao is annihilated.”

BOOM!

Jiang Li clenched his right fist. The cage of the great Dao of machinery exploded. The destruction 
of the great Dao caused an explosion that was powerful enough to destroy the endless time and 
space.

Hence.

Under this power.

Weapon ancestor black fog’s origin had truly been reduced to ashes.

Nothing was left.

As for using the ‘ultra-divine mechanical Army’ to capture the rebirth origin of weapon ancestor 
black fog? This was impossible. As long as the source of rebirth was not destroyed, weapon 
ancestor black fog would not die. He would definitely be resurrected.

It was impossible even if they created a new mech Army with the ‘super mech Army’.

Chapter 853 Resurrection

Weapon ancestor black fog died in Jiang Li’s hands. He couldn’t escape because the death of the 
new ancestor naturally caused many strange phenomena.

Instantly.



A myriad of strange phenomena emerged in universe ocean.

There was also the wailing of the ‘great Dao’.

after that.

The universe ocean, which had never rained before, started to rain blood-colored rain.

This caused countless living beings and newborn races to be shocked.

” retreat!!! ”

retreat! the heaven Lord stared at Jiang Li as if he wanted to engrave Jiang Li’s face into the depths 
of his soul. everyone, retreat!!!

“Let’s go!”

“Retreat!”

“......”

Immediately after.

The new generation ancestors also immediately gave their orders.

“Chase!”

Naturally, the patriarchs of the great Dao would not let go of the Army of the new generation so 
easily. Furthermore, the death of ‘weapon ancestor black fog’ was a great opportunity to rebuild the 
new generation.

He definitely couldn’t let him off so easily.



Hence.

A pursuit began.

The new life race Army escaped while the life spirit race Army chased after them.

An even more brutal battle began.

“......”

Laozi looked at this scene silently, and a faint look of pity appeared on his face. He sighed and said, 
” is it finally going to come to this? ”

“Hahahahaha!”

The martial ancestor was overjoyed. He looked at Jiang Li with excitement.

“Father.”

Buzzzzzz!

Bai Zifeng flew over and stood beside Jiang Li. She looked at Jiang Li with a touched expression 
and said, ” “Hubby, thank you.”

“This is what a married couple should do.”

not to mention, ” Jiang Li said. I killed weapon ancestor black fog to save my mother-in-law.

“good, good, good,”

The martial ancestor laughed out loud, and his expression became more and more satisfied. well 
said. You’re really my good son-in-law. I was wrong before. I apologize to you.



“My daughter’s taste is really high.”

“Father-in-law, you’re too kind.”

No. Jiang Li waved his hand and said, ” if father-in-law didn’t beat weapon ancestor black fog to 
death and forced him to escape with his origin, I wouldn’t have killed him.

“Hahahahaha!”

haha. the martial ancestor laughed again. this is the credit of the two of us.

“It’s done,”

“Let’s cut the crap. I’ll resurrect Jiang Yan immediately,” the martial ancestor said with a serious 
expression.

“Yes.”

Jiang Li and Bai Zifeng both nodded and said in unison, ” “Do you need our help?”

“no need,”

The martial ancestor waved his hand, ” it’s just reversing time and space. To me, it’s a piece of cake.

Soon after.

Jiang Li, Bai Zifeng, and the martial ancestor came to the place where Jiang Yan died. They looked 
at each other and the martial ancestor started to use martial arts with all his might.

buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz! Wuwuwuwuwu!

The power of the great Dao was released at full force.



“spacetime reversal.”

BOOM!

The martial ancestor roared, and the power of martial arts pierced through time and space. Time and 
space were like a roll of tape, more like a toy that was controlled by the martial ancestor.

Time and space continued to reverse.

In the end.

It was the time of Jiang Yan’s death.

...

Jiang Yan had fallen here.

Since weapon ancestor black fog was dead, the martial ancestor could easily change the time and 
space, cutting off and destroying the time and space where Jiang Yan had died.

buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz!

this way ...

Jiang Yan was completely gone in a short time.

Time and space were restored.

In that instant.

Jiang Yan was successfully resurrected. She appeared in front of Jiang Li, the martial ancestor, and 
Bai Zifeng. She looked at the martial ancestor in confusion.



“Whitey,”

“what’s wrong with me?” jiang yan asked.

“Yan ‘er,”

...

The martial ancestor walked over, and the two of them hugged.

It was hundreds of thousands of years.

Jiang Yan was finally resurrected.

soon after.

The martial ancestor slowly explained everything.

“So I’ve already died once.”

what’s more, I didn’t expect you to be able to kill weapon ancestor black fog, ” Jiang Yan said with 
emotion. Bai Lang, you’ve actually killed weapon ancestor black fog.

“my daughter.”

Jiang Yan looked at Bai Zifeng.

“Mother,”

bai zifeng was also very excited.



after that.

The two of them hugged.

They separated after a long time.

” you’re jiang li, right? ”

jiang yan looked at jiang li.

“Yes.”

yes. Jiang Li nodded and cupped his hands. I’m son-in-law Jiang Li.

“Why are you calling me mother-in-law? you’re too polite.”

“Just call her mom,” Jiang Yan waved her hand and said.

“This bi an ...”

Jiang Li was stunned, but seeing Jiang Yan’s expression, he took a deep breath and said seriously, ” 
“mom,” she said.

“Good, good, good,”

Jiang Yan looked at Jiang Li and Bai Zifeng with a big smile. The more she looked at them, the 
happier she was. I have to say, my daughter has good taste. She takes after me.

After that.

Jiang Li and the others left for the world of the multiverse.



Since Jiang Yan had been resurrected.

the in-laws of both parties naturally had to meet.

As for the war at the border of universe ocean, it had already ended. The new generation race had 
escaped into universe ocean that ‘existed’. It wasn’t that easy for the Army of the life spirit race to 
enter universe ocean.

They would be ‘corroded’.

Therefore ...

The war could only be temporarily ended.

The most important thing was ...

Although weapon ancestor black fog had been killed in this battle and the newborn race had 
suffered heavy losses, the terrifying aftermath of the battle had also destroyed a large number of 
worlds.

as a result, more strange and new races were born.

The ‘present’ sea water expanded again.

Through this war.

Jiang Li also realized the seriousness of the matter.

As long as a war broke out and caused the destruction of the world, it would give birth to strange 
and new races, expanding the territory of the ‘existing’ sea.

so,



It was almost impossible for the new generation to be exterminated.

The world of the great cosmos.

The elders of the two families met.

the family was harmonious and happy.

The martial ancestor’s face was also full of smiles, no longer cold and serious as before. His eyes 
didn’t hide his love for Jiang Yan.

It could be seen.

Even the ancestor of the great Dao had seven emotions and six desires.

Jiang Li’s parents, Jiang beiguo and Zheng qiushui, were also shocked when they heard about Jiang 
Yan’s experience. They didn’t expect her to have experienced a real death.

Time flew by.

In the blink of an eye, a thousand years had passed.

because jiang li had killed a new ancestor,’weapon ancestor black fog’, and the new generation was 
heavily injured.

so,

No more wars were launched, and they almost disappeared.

At the same time.

The six clans ‘immortal court issued an order.



From today onwards.

They forbade any more Wars against the myriad world and closed the passageways between the 
myriad world to prevent the destruction of more worlds and the birth of more new races.

However ...

This was only a temporary solution.

Unless the new generation was completely eliminated from the roots, otherwise, there would come 
a day when the ‘nothingness’ of universe ocean’s water would be completely wiped out.

But unfortunately ...

The ancestors of Dao of the six clans, including Jiang Li and Bai Zifeng, tried everything but 
couldn’t find the origin of the new generation and destroy it.

Until ten thousand years later.

Bai Zifeng was pregnant, and there was a new life in her body. This made Jiang Li nervous, 
nervous, and excited.

“Hahahahaha!”

After hearing the news, he was stunned.

The martial ancestor and Jiang Yan were overjoyed. They asked Jiang Li and Bai Zifeng questions. 
In order to let their children grow up healthily, they didn’t dare to sense with the power of great Dao 
in case of any accidents.

naturally, zheng qiushui and jiang beiguo were ecstatic.

“Tsk, tsk, I can’t believe I’m pregnant.”



“Those are two ancestors of great Dao!”

“It’s hard to imagine what kind of child will be born after the Union of two great Dao ancestors. the 
child of dao? Or Yingluo?”

“congratulations,”

The patriarchs of the great Dao from the other five clans came to congratulate him.

Time flew by.

Day after day, year after year, Jiang Li and Bai Zifeng were watching over the growth of their child. 
Bai Zifeng’s belly was getting bigger and bigger like normal people.

He could already feel the beating of life.

However ...

” what? ” jiang li panicked.

Because ...

it had been 100000 years since bai zifeng became pregnant. although the six clans had tried 
everything, they were still unable to stop the erosion of ‘existence’ against ‘non-existence.’

It was as if it was silent.

and now.

Almost two-thirds of the entire cosmic sea was already covered by ‘existing’ seawater.

It was hard to imagine.



jiang li found it hard to imagine.

what would it be like when his child was born?

“Is my child going to face destruction the moment he is born?”

Jiang Li was silent. even Yingluo and Yingluo didn’t have the chance to be born, Yingluo.

“No!”

jiang li clenched his fists. ” i won’t allow this to happen. i won’t allow it. how can my child 
experience such a thing? ”

Hence.

jiang li tried everything he could. he read the ancient books of the six races and even sneaked into 
the deepest part of universe ocean. he was attacked by several new ancestors and was seriously 
injured.

Fortunately, he managed to escape.

However ...

However, Jiang Li didn’t gain much. Even though he had annihilated a large number of the new 
generation, he still couldn’t stop it from happening. It was like how universe ocean operated.

Even if Jiang Li was the ancestor of Dao, he couldn’t change it.

After escaping back.

The patriarchs of Dao from all the clans knew that Jiang Li was seriously injured. They were 
shocked and came to ask about the situation. Jiang Li told them everything he had found.



The patriarchs of the great Dao of the six clans were also silent.

After that.

He went into seclusion to heal his injuries.

However ...

master? ” Jiang Li’s words kept echoing in his mind.

“Hahahahaha!”

hahahaha ... Wu Wang laughed and looked at Jiang Li with pity. it’s useless, Jiang Li. No matter 
what you do, you can’t stop it.

“Everything has already been set in stone.”

back then, I wanted to end your suffering, but you killed weapon ancestor black fog instead, causing 
my plan to fail completely.

if that’s the case, then struggle with all you’ve got. Struggle with all your might and die in endless 
despair.

A hundred years later.

Jiang Li recovered from his injuries.

“Is there really no other way?”

Jiang Li was silent.

Yes, it was.



Jiang Li really couldn’t find any other way.

“i, your father!”

what? ” Jiang Li was shocked. yes, I must know something!

buzzzzzz!

Hence.

jiang li rushed out of the room and wanted to find ‘daddy li er’, but he suddenly realized that he 
couldn’t sense any aura from’ daddy li er’.

After that.

When Jiang Li went to ask the celestial ancestor and the others.

“speaking of which, i haven’t seen him in a long time.”

The celestial ancestor replied.

“I’m not sure,”

The ancestor of technique shook his head.

......

The patriarchs of DAOs of the six clans had never seen ‘Laozi’ Li Er ‘since the last Great War.

Chapter 854 Dao discussion



“He’s missing?”

Jiang Li didn’t believe it. how can I just go missing? ” Something must have happened, and it must 
have happened after that great battle.”

“Why? Why is it like this?”

At this moment.

Jiang Li’s mind was filled with confusion because he couldn’t think of where his father was. He 
couldn’t find his father, Li Er, and he couldn’t think of a way to break out of this situation.

Everything was lost again.

Only time continued to pass by. The ‘present’ sea water in universe ocean continued to erode the 
‘void’ sea water, and the area of the living beings became smaller and smaller.

Countless worlds were destroyed.

The most important thing was ...

Another hundred thousand years passed.

The ‘existing’ water had already occupied four-fifths of universe ocean, and the area occupied by 
the living beings was only one-fifth. Even ten thousand years ago, one of the greater worlds, the 
‘immortal world’, had been destroyed.

Finally ...

The new generation launched a full-scale invasion of the living race.

At the front line of the border battlefield in universe ocean.



All the time.

There were tragic Wars breaking out. Countless creatures had died and become dust in universe 
ocean. There might not even be any dust left.

The patriarchs of the great Dao had participated in the war many times, but they could not stop the 
attack of the new generation.

Even though ...

There were only 30 new ancestors in the new life race, while the living spirit race had 32 great Dao 
ancestors, including Jiang Li and Bai Zifeng.

however ...

I’m missing.

so,

There were only 31 left.

In addition, Bai Zifeng was pregnant, and her combat power had dropped drastically. At most, they 
could only be considered 30 patriarchs of the great Dao. The top combat power of the two races was 
equal.

In reality.

He didn’t know how long this situation could last.

Jiang Li would always read the Tao Te Ching that his father gave him from time to time, trying to 
find a way to solve this problem.

“The nameless origin of all things, the famous mother of all things.”



that’s why, in universe ocean, the water named ‘Wu’ is the beginning of everything. As time 
passes,’you’ is the mother of all things.

“so,”

“Is this the final result of the operation of the Dao?”

therefore, no matter if it’s the heavenly Dao or the great Dao, all things, all spirits, all worlds, all 
laws, and all rules are actually the operation of ‘Dao’. Everything has been predestined.

“I can’t change this ending.”

“Because this is the fate of the ‘Dao’.”

There was silence.

Jiang Li kept silent.

Thinking of this ...

Jiang Li felt helpless.

so,

It was impossible to change and end all of this, unless one could surpass ‘Dao’?

However ...

Was that even possible?

That was impossible!



“......”

Jiang Li kept silent.

One had to know.

When ‘Dao’ had been created by ‘Dao ancestor’, it had maintained the operation of universe ocean. 
On the basis of’ Dao’, countless laws, rules, and heavenly Dao had been created.

in the end.

He had even created the great Dao.

so,

the ‘dao’, which had been a little thin at the beginning, had become a supreme existence under the 
filling of the myriad world and myriad spirits. it had become the’ dao ‘that controlled the entire 
universe ocean.

Even the ancestors of the great Dao would feel tiny in front of this ‘Dao’.

Perhaps it was because only one-fifth of the area was left, which was the source of the living 
creatures, that the expansion of the ‘existing’ sea water began to slow down.

...

It gave the living beings more time.

Finally ...

Until seven hundred and ninety thousand years later.



Waa waa waa

there was a cry.

Jiang Li’s child was born. The child between Jiang Li and Bai Zifeng was a boy. When he was born, 
the phenomenon of the great Dao appeared.

Furthermore ...

This Dao phenomenon affected the entire universe ocean in an instant.

when he was born.

Jiang Li’s children were the ‘Masters of rules’.

They were born with ‘laws’!

...

he’s born. My biological grandson is born.

The martial ancestor shouted excitedly.

“Alright, alright, alright.”

Jiang Yan’s face was full of smiles.

“hahahahaha!”

Jiang beiguo laughed.

“My grandson is finally born.”



“I’ve been pregnant for 990000 years,” Zheng qiushui replied.

Hence.

The myriad worlds were celebrating.

The patriarchs of the great Dao of the six clans had all come to congratulate him.

Jiang Li named his child ‘Jiang Zi’. He used his name and Bai Zifeng’s name to form the name.

This celebration lasted for a full nine years.

Jiang Zi also grew up under the love of thousands.

Because she was the ‘child of Dao’, Jiang Zi’s height and appearance had always been that of a 
child, even though her mind had matured very quickly.

He looked like a mischievous child.

Jiang Li was happy to see his child born and grow up happily, but every time he thought about the 
more serious situation, he felt that he had to be careful.

Jiang Li always frowned.

“Is there really no other way?”

jiang li took a deep breath.

A thousand years later.

jiang zi was already an eleven or twelve-year-old teenager. she was really beautiful and extremely 
handsome. every time she appeared, she would attract countless women.



Even Jiang Li, her father, was a little envious.

However ...

And it was this year.

Jiang Zi created the heavenly Dao of morality and became the master of the heavenly Dao.

Unparalleled.

At the same time.

The final battle also erupted this year.

Furthermore ...

The ‘present’ seawater suddenly accelerated the erosion and transformation of the ‘void’ seawater. 
The resistance of ‘void’ had also reached its limit and could no longer continue.

As expected.

With such a speed.

Ten thousand years at most.

Everything would be over.

The living spirit race would be exterminated.

Even if Jiang Li was the ancestor of Dao, he wouldn’t be able to stop them. He might even die with 
them. Everything would be over.



“You want it to end like this?”

no way! Jiang Li took a deep breath. His eyes were filled with fighting spirit. absolutely impossible!

kill!!!

Jiang Li yelled.

BOOM! boom! BOOM!

Within universe ocean.

Endless battles broke out. Jiang Li rushed in and killed countless newbies, but he was quickly 
stopped by the heaven Lord. The two started fighting again.

“jiang li.”

” Hmph! the heaven Lord coldly laughed. I told you long ago that everything you did was a futile 
struggle.

“Hmph,” he snorted.

I won’t give up until the last moment, ” Jiang Li scolded. I won’t give up so easily.

“Kill!”

“Rumble!”

the battle of the great daos broke out again.

At this moment.



Including Jiang Li and Bai Zifeng, the battle between the 31 great Dao ancestors and the 30 new 
generation ancestors broke out.

It produced an unparalleled might.

However ...

Even if the living beings had the advantage, it would be of no use.

A hundred years later.

Jiang Li and the others led the living beings to retreat to the battlefield to strengthen their defense 
and resist the invasion of the new generation. Even Jiang Zi joined the battle.

“Zi ‘er,”

On this day.

Jiang Li stood in universe ocean with his hands behind his back. Behind him was the vast universe 
and the Super Fantasy world.

now.

Jiang Li’s universe and the Super Fantasy world had become the Core Worlds of the living beings.

“Father.”

Jiang Zi was dressed in a white robe. She looked young, but there was an extremely strong 
murderous aura between her brows.

“How much longer do you think we can hold on?”



Jiang Li asked.

“......”

Jiang Zi was silent.

Zi ‘er, ever since you were born, the new born race has already become powerful. Even if our life 
spirit race has one more ancestor of the great Dao than the new born race, we still can’t avoid the 
arrival of this day.

” i can’t, ” jiang li said slowly. ” if we can’t stop the spread of ‘something’, we can’t stop it. ”

“This isn’t father’s fault.”

Jiang Zi said.

“Father.”

Jiang Zi paused for a moment, then continued,”Does it really have to be destroyed between the new 
generation race and the living spirit race?”

“can’t they co-exist?”

“Co-existence?”

No. Jiang Li shook his head. do you really think we can decide all of this? No, that’s not true. 
Whether it’s our living spirit race or their new life race, we can’t stop the spread of ‘some’. ”

“The general trend has been set.”

“Do you really think that the new generation race is willing to fight to the death with us? No, that’s 
not it. They’re equally afraid, equally afraid of death.”



“Everything seems to be controlled by an invisible ‘hand’, and this invisible’ hand ‘is called: He 
said.”

“The ‘Dao’ has decided everything.”

“you can understand?”

“Dao Taowu”

Jiang Zi was stunned for a moment before she reacted. all of this is related to the ‘Dao ancestor’? ”

“Be careful with your words.”

jiang li said.

“......”

Jiang Zi shut her mouth.

After a while.

Jiang Zi couldn’t help but ask,”so, is this the reason why the Dao ancestor’s clone suddenly 
disappeared?” This is because everything has already been decided by the ‘Dao’. ”

“Father.”

Jiang Zi finally understood. I understand now, ” he said. in fact, our true opponent from the 
beginning was never the new generation.

“But ‘Dao’, right?” he asked.

the ‘Dao’ that rules, determines, and confirms everything? ”



“......”

Jiang Li was silent. He looked down at the rolling universe ocean and didn’t say anything else.

That’s right!

Jiang Zi was right.

From the beginning to the end.

the true enemy would not be the new generation.

It was Dao.

However ...

Want to resist the ‘Dao’?

Was that even possible?

That’s impossible!

it was impossible to succeed!

He was destined to fail.

In reality.

jiang li didn’t understand these things until the day jiang zi was born. he understood the root of 
everything, but the more he understood, the more helpless he felt.

Jiang Li was thinking the same thing.



Perhaps the other great Dao ancestors also knew about this, but they chose to remain silent, not 
discuss, and not discuss this matter because they didn’t want everyone to despair.

“Father.”

Jiang Zi took a deep breath. He looked at Jiang Li with admiration and said, ” “I’ve known since I 
was born.”

my father is invincible. He is omnipotent. He is the strongest, best, most outstanding, omnipotent, 
and most omnipotent father in the world.

“no matter what the final result is.”

“I’ve always believed in you.”

Buzzzzzz!

At this moment.

” jiang li. ” bai zifeng arrived and walked towards jiang li slowly. her eyes were filled with 
gentleness as she came to jiang li’s side.

“Honey, what are you doing here?”

jiang li was stunned.

Chapter 855 Fate

“I’m here to see what you two are talking about,”

bai zifeng smiled. ” hubby, it’s just as zi ‘er said. i’ve always believed in you. it’s because of this 
that i agreed to your request. ”



“At that time,”

you’re only 3000 Dao Masters. Who knows how far you’re from the ancestor of the great Dao? ”

” but didn’t you still disregard everything and say what you felt in front of everyone? ”

“Why are you so confused now?”

“......”

jiang li opened his mouth and looked at jiang zi and bai zifeng who were standing beside him. he 
took a deep breath and smiled.

“Yup,”

why? ” Jiang Li asked. what am I confused about? ”

“Father.”

“No matter what the final result is, at the very least, we’ve done our best,” Jiang Zi said firmly.

“Even if I fail.”

“We will also not regret it.”

“Hahahahaha!”

” haha. ” jiang li laughed. ” well said. you’re my son indeed. ”

After that.



Jiang Li, Bai Zifeng, and Jiang Zi held hands tightly.

Hence.

Ten years later.

Jiang Li returned to earth and entered the Jiang family’s ancestral land.

He was in a deadly seclusion.

This time.

Jiang Li put aside all his confusion and concerns. He took out the Tao Te Ching and immersed 
himself in it, trying to understand the mysteries of it.

Countless Dao characters were spinning around Jiang Li like tadpoles.

Nine years later.

Maybe it was because Jiang Li had been reading and studying the Tao Te Ching for the past million 
years, or because he had thrown away all his worries and confusion.

Jiang Li had a new understanding.

That’s right.

He had comprehended the ‘Dao’.

He had comprehended the ‘Dao’ of the ‘ancestor of Dao’ from the ‘Tao Te Ching’.

In such a situation.



Just like how the ‘master of the heavenly Dao’ comprehended the great Dao created by the ‘ancestor 
of the great Dao’, Jiang Li comprehended the’ Dao ‘created by the’ ancestor of the Dao ‘this time.

Hence.

The scene in front of him changed.

Buzzzzzz!

The scene changed.

Jiang Li’s consciousness entered a mysterious world. When he ‘opened’ his eyes, he saw a familiar 
face.

I!

It’s actually me, Li Er!

“You’ve finally come.”

I’ve been waiting for you for a long time. Li Er smiled and looked at Jiang Li.

“Senior,” he said.

Oh? ” Jiang Li came back to his senses. what is this place? ”

“You don’t have to call me senior anymore.”

“Since you’ve already comprehended the ‘Dao’ of the ‘Dao ancestor’, then you’re the same as me, 
an existence of the same level,” Lear said, waving his hand.

“The daofather’s Dao.”



Jiang Li took a deep breath and understood.

“yes.”

Li Er nodded. that’s right. Back then, when I created the ‘Tao Te Ching’ and comprehended the 
omnipresent ‘Dao’, I resonated with the’ Dao ancestor’.

“And so ...”

“I entered this place and became the ‘clone’ of the ‘Dao ancestor’ that roamed the universe.”

“Now.”

...

Lear extended two fingers. you have two choices.

“Choice?”

Dao ancestor? ” Jiang Li asked, ” senior, can you tell me where the ‘Dao ancestor’ is? ” What realm 
is he at?”

“Like I said, you don’t have to call me senior.”

Li Er said.

“I’m used to it,”

senior, ” Jiang Li said. I’ll call you senior.

“As you wish.”



“You want to see Dao ancestor?” Li Er asked.

“Yes.”

okay. Jiang Li nodded.

...

“Alright,” he said.

Li Er agreed.

After that.

Jiang Li looked over and saw a figure sitting in a circle in front of him.

There was only his back view.

In that instant.

“Ah!”

” ah! ” jiang li screamed as if his consciousness had collapsed.

At this moment.

It was just a glance.

Jiang Li seemed to see everything, the root of everything, all things, all kinds of information, and all 
kinds of unpredictable horror.

he couldn’t look at it at all.



“This bi an ...”

Jiang Li was shocked.

“Did you see that?”

Li ‘er said, ” this is Dao ancestor. It’s just that when Dao ancestor created’ Dao’, he also became 
‘Dao’. When the’ Dao ‘created by Dao ancestor took control of the entire universe ocean, and the 
heavens and realms created countless laws and rules, heavenly Dao, and great Dao with Dao as the 
foundation ...

“The daofather is also slowly beginning to be influenced by the ‘Dao’.”

“Water can carry a boat, but it can also capsize a boat.”

“......”

I can’t believe it, ” Jiang Li said. I can’t believe it.

“If I have to give the cultivation level of ‘Dao ancestor’ a title ...”

“it can be called the beginning of dao.”

“The beginning of Dao.”

Jiang Li murmured.

in Dao ancestor’s current state, even he himself can’t change the operation of ‘Dao’. That’s because 
changing’ Dao ‘is destroying himself.

Li Er continued, ” I walk as the incarnation of the Dao ancestor and act according to the will of the 
Dao ancestor.



“in fact,”

“Dao ancestor walked out of the ‘Super Fantasy world’, and he didn’t want to see the destruction of 
the’ Super Fantasy world’,” Li Er said.

“I also don’t want the living spirit race to die out.”

“But,”

The ‘Dao’ has been set! can not be changed!”

“Is there really no other way?”

what? ” Jiang Li asked.

“there is.”

” of course, ” li er said. ” there are forty-nine chances of dao evolution, but one will disappear if one 
burrows into the earth. in other words, everything has a chance of survival. it’s not destined. ”

“What is a chance of survival?”

what? ” Jiang Li asked.

“didn’t you find it?”

Lear smiled. furthermore, you have already succeeded.

“That is to comprehend the ‘Dao’.”

as long as you can successfully comprehend ‘Dao’ and operate according to ‘Dao’, you won’t be 
affected in any way. You’ll be able to grasp that chance of survival, ” Lear said.



“that’s why i said you have two choices.”

Lear extended two fingers again.

“What choice?”

jiang li asked.

“The first one.”

integrate the ‘Dao’, integrate the’ Dao ‘you’ve comprehended, just like what I’m doing now, ” Lear 
said. you will exercise the rights of the’ Dao ‘and act according to everything in the’ Dao’.

“And you will be with the ‘Dao’ for all eternity.”

“no longer affected by anything.”

even if the entire living spirit race perishes and all the ancestors of the great Dao die, you won’t 
have any problems. You can even sit still and watch the rise and fall of fate.

“Of course.”

if you choose this step, then you must operate according to the rules of ‘Dao’. You can’t disobey, 
obstruct, or make any changes.

“Am I the only one who can live?”

Jiang Li asked.

“Yes,”

li er nodded. ” only you, because you are the only one who has comprehended ‘dao’. ”



“What’s the second?”

Jiang Li asked.

“......”

lear shrugged his shoulders. ” without a doubt, that is to give up on the integration with the ‘dao’. 
then, you will die in the upcoming cultivation tribulation. ”

“......”

Jiang Li fell silent again.

Obviously.

even though lear said he had two choices, it was only one.

Angelica and death.

“No!”

Dao ancestor. Jiang Li raised his head and looked at Li Er. Even though he was in extreme pain and 
his consciousness was about to collapse, he was still staring at the back of the ‘Dao ancestor’.

“This is not the result I want.”

if there’s a way for one person to live alone, then there’s a chance for the entire race to survive, ” 
Jiang Li said. merging with the Dao is only a chance for one person.

“and what i want ...”

“It’s the ‘tunneling to the ground’ that makes the myriad world and myriad world more flexible.”



Buzzzzzz!

As soon as he finished speaking.

Jiang Li’s consciousness disappeared from the ‘Dao world of origin’ in the ‘universe ocean’.

Only Li Er was left.

As well as the ‘Dao ancestor’, who had been sitting in a circle, with only his back view.

“First there was the daofather, then there was the Daoist.”

Li Er also couldn’t look straight at the ‘Dao ancestor’. His eyes were bleeding. Dao ancestor, can he 
really find a chance to live for all the creatures in the world? ”

“......”

Silence!

There was only silence!

“Pfft!”

In the closed-door cultivation room.

Jiang Li woke up and spat out blood.

what was more terrifying was ...

The remaining power of ‘Dao’ spread in Jiang Li’s body. Countless cracks appeared in his body of 
Dao. The mechanical Dao seemed to be wailing.



Terrifying!

It was terrifying!

Jiang Li just looked at the Dao ancestor and almost died.

It was too terrifying.

“I will definitely find it.”

Buzzzzzz!

Jiang Li went into closed-door cultivation again.

This time.

However, Jiang Li’s consciousness was divided into thousands of parts. With the help of the ‘super 
mechanical Army’ and the ‘game God’, every part of his consciousness became a’ game character’.

Of course.

Jiang Li’s game characters weren’t just the living creatures, but even the new ones. Jiang Li’s 
consciousness incarnation grabbed a handful of sand and threw it into his face.

they appeared in every corner of universe ocean.

Obviously.

This was the solution Jiang Li thought of.

He was sensing all the creatures in the universe, the new generation, and all the experiences in 
universe ocean. All the experiences would become a part of Jiang Li’s memory.



They would become the resources for Jiang Li to find a chance to survive.

However ...

Ten thousand years after Jiang Li went into seclusion.

The war had broken out again.

Furthermore ...

This battle was even more brutal. The great Dao ancestors gave it their all and didn’t hold back. The 
two sides fought into the deepest part of universe ocean.

Countless wails could be heard.

Withering!

The myriad world and myriad spirits were withering!

Countless members of the new generation were dying.

Obviously.

The patriarchs of the great Dao were making their final efforts and venting their anger. They were 
still hoping that they could stop all this as long as they killed all the new ancestors.

“Where’s Jiang Li?”

The reincarnation ancestral God was covered in blood as he roared, ” “where is he? Why didn’t he 
appear this time? Why? Could it be that he has already given up?”

“Ah!”



bastard!!!

“......”

The patriarchs of the great Dao roared.

“......”

Bai Zifeng and the martial ancestor were silent.

Unknowingly.

only one-tenth of universe ocean was left in the territory of the living beings.

He had already reached a dead end.

“You all have no hope.”

the heaven Lord looked down at the various great Dao ancestors.

“Just give up.”

The ancestor of the demonic dragon clan looked at the ancestors of the great Dao and said, ” “You 
already knew, didn’t you? It’s impossible, and resistance is futile. Everything is already set in 
stone.”

“Isn’t it enough to kill so many of our new generation race?”

“Accept the reality.”

The group of new born ancestors roared.



The world of the great cosmos.

On earth.

Buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz!

Jiang Li’s consciousness was all over universe ocean. Although he was in seclusion, he still knew 
about the war and the defeat of the living beings.

However ...

Jiang Li didn’t come out of seclusion.

Because ...

When the experiences of countless consciousness incarnations appeared in Jiang Li’s mind like a 
movie, countless scenes appeared in front of his eyes.

“All of everything is so disdainful.”

Jiang Li suddenly looked up and opened his eyes. The river of fate was reflected in his pupils. it’s 
all destined!

“Everything has ‘fate’.”

Chapter 856 The end!

Jiang Li woke up. He woke up from his cultivation and tried to comprehend the beings. After 
countless attempts, he found a way to survive.

And that was fate!



Everything.

All living beings.

Everything had its own fate.

From the smallest unicellular organism to the largest in the universe, even the ancestor of the great 
Dao, everything was in the long river of fate.

With the destruction of the living creatures, the ‘non-existent’ seawater disappeared and was 
gradually replaced by the ‘existing’ seawater. The new race replaced the living creatures in the 
universe.

This was ‘destined’.

The long river of fate flowed.

All living beings were just a drop of water or a grain of sand in the river of fate. When combined 
together, they formed the ‘River of fate’ that ran through the entire universe ocean.

Hence.

Jiang Li woke up.

His figure appeared on Earth and crossed through time and space. In an instant, he had already 
arrived at the final battlefield between the living spirit race and the new generation race.

Jiang Li appeared.

“Father!”

Jiang Zi looked up and instantly woke up. He looked up at the figure standing above all living 
beings, his eyes full of excitement. great, father is finally here!



“Hubby!”

Bai Zifeng’s eyes were filled with excitement.

“li ‘er.”

Jiang beiguo and Zheng qiushui also shouted.

“Brother!”

Jiang Lijun and Jiang Wenxin shouted.

“......”

At this moment.

All living beings looked up.

“Jiang Li.”

Jiang Li. the patriarchs all looked at Jiang Li. you’re finally here. We thought you were going to be 
a coward.

“jiang li.”

“So what if you’re here?” Wuzi shouted. Do you think you can stop us? it’s impossible, everything 
is just a lie.”

“Accept the reality.”

“Let us send you on your last journey!”



“......”

The group of new born ancestors shouted loudly.

“Everyone,”

Jiang Li stood above all living beings and looked down at them. His eyes crossed infinite obstacles 
and space, including the new generation.

All of them were within Jiang Li’s sight.

This glance.

Jiang Li looked at the entire universe ocean.

At this moment.

In the world of origin of universe ocean.

“What are you going to do next?”

li er was looking at jiang li.

“This is a Kasaya, a Kasaya of fate.”

Suddenly.

Li Er heard a voice. It was the voice of the Dao ancestor.

“What?”



Li Er was shocked. When he turned around, he could only see the back of Dao ancestor. Li Er did 
not dare to look at him directly and quickly retracted his gaze. just now, just now, just now, just 
now.

“Fate? what fate?”

Had the Dao ancestor awakened?

How is this possible?

Buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz! “whoosh!!!”

Universe ocean.

The light of the great Dao of machinery appeared around Jiang Li, but it was gradually suppressed. 
The light of fate slowly appeared.

...

“Fate!”

it’s fate, ” Jiang Li said. everything has its own fate!

“All living beings, gather into a River.”

Buzzzzzz! Wuwuwuwuwu!

Hence.

jiang li seemed to have turned into a whirlpool of fate, attracting all the living beings in the 
universe. the light of fate floated in the air.

After that.



They all gathered towards Jiang Li.

what’s this bi an?!

Wuzi was shocked. fate?! Is this our destiny?”

“This Suan ni, this Suan ni”

...

“Impossible! How could such a thing exist?”

Is this fate?!

“No!”

The new generation ancestors roared.

“Don’t you guys understand?”

Jiang Li looked down at the new ancestors and said slowly, ” back then, I comprehended the Dao of 
Dao ancestor. The Dao created by Dao ancestor became the law of universe ocean’s operation.

” i’ve comprehended the dao of the dao ancestor, so i’ve found a chance of survival, which is to 
integrate the dao and become the executor of the dao, but also an outsider and an observer. ”

” everything in universe ocean will have nothing to do with you. you won’t be able to change 
anything that’s caused by the operation of the dao. ”

“dao ancestor!”

“You’ve already transcended. Why are you still here?”



“ridiculous! you’re lying!”

wuzi and the others roared.

“......”

The martial ancestor and the others were extremely shocked.

In reality.

They all knew.

Lao Zi Li Er, who used his Dao ancestor clone to walk the world, was actually a transcendent being. 
He had left the chess game in universe ocean and become an outsider.

Thus, they were very clear.

“because i gave up.”

Jiang Li smiled and looked at Jiang Zi and Bai Zifeng. I don’t want to be an outsider.

“Because!”

“I want to change all of this! find a chance of survival for all living beings!”

“Now!”

“I’ve found it. It’s fate! The fate River is formed by the fate of all living beings, and it runs through 
universe ocean. Dao sets the laws of universe ocean, and I set the fate of universe ocean!”

“Today!”



“I am the ancestor of fate!”

BOOM!

fate! Jiang Li shouted. The light of fate shone through the universe. Jiang Li gathered the fate of all 
living beings, including the new generation.

It formed the river of fate.

but ...

To universe ocean, the life spirit race and the new life race were only part of the fate of universe 
ocean. The river of fate that Jiang Li controlled was connected to the river of fate of universe ocean.

“BOOM!”

Kachaa! Kachaa!

jiang li’s body started to crack.

The terrifying fate struck.

In that instant.

It almost destroyed Jiang Li.

but ...

Jiang Li held on. The light of the great Dao of machinery bloomed to resist the erosion of the river 
of fate. The martial ancestor, the immortal ancestor, the human ancestor, the Dharma ancestor, Bai 
Zifeng, the ancestral God of Samsara, the ancestral fiend of destruction, the ancestral God of karma, 
the Yin Yang ghost ancestor, the soul demon ancestor, and the life and death barbarian ancestor 
were all killed.



The patriarchs of the great Dao merged the power of the great Dao into Jiang Li’s body.

The river that was helping Jiang Li resist fate.

“Stop them!”

wuzi roared.

“You’re crazy.”

one of the new ancestors, the demonic dragon ancestor, roared, ” “Do you know that if the river of 
fate comes back, we will all be turned to dust!”

“Stop!”

“We can’t do it.”

“Just watch,”

The group of new born ancestors shouted.

“Damn it!”

Wuzi gritted his teeth. He was extremely unwilling to accept this, and there was a faint fear in his 
eyes.

The difference between Jiang Li’s River of fate, which gathered all living beings, and the river of 
fate in universe ocean was too great. It was like the difference between a stream and a Yellow River.

Under the impact.

He was almost forced to retreat.



It could be said that ...

If it wasn’t for the help of the ancestors of Dao, Jiang Li wouldn’t have been able to hold on.

However ...

It was too difficult.

it was still too difficult.

Buzzzzzz!

At this moment.

Dao De Jing ” flew out of Jiang Li’s pocket. Li Er created Dao De Jing after he comprehended Dao. 
Now, Jiang Li comprehended Dao through Dao De Jing.

so,

The Tao Te Ching contained the Dao of the ‘Dao ancestor’.

The Dao in the Tao Te Ching was triggered by Jiang Li.

In that instant.

The power of the Dao ancestor erupted, causing all DAOs to submit, all living beings to bow, and 
all living beings to kneel. This power was as if the Dao ancestor had personally taken action.

BOOM!

The ‘Tao Te Ching’ turned into a beam of light and rushed into the ‘River of destiny’.



“Ah!”

fate! Jiang Li shouted. fate!

BOOM!

An explosion sounded.

The light of fate exploded, filling the entire universe ocean and the entire battlefield. The dazzling 
light blocked the eyes of all living beings.

“How is it?”

“Did you succeed?”

“I don’t know, Zhenzhen”

Everyone’s eyes were fixed on it.

finally ...

When the light dissipated.

The river of fate in universe ocean also slowly faded away.

Everything seemed to have returned to normal.

“Hahahahaha!”

” hahahaha! ” wu wang laughed hysterically. ” i knew it, i knew it. jiang li, you can’t succeed. you 
can’t succeed! ”



“Hahahahaha!”

six clans immortal court, you’ll definitely be destroyed today!!!

“......”

The ancestors of the great Dao were seriously injured and they also suffered the backlash of fate. 
Their faces were pale. The reincarnation ancestral God raised his head and stared at Wu Zian 
viciously. ” you can try. before i die, i’ll definitely pull you down with me!!! ”

“No! Something’s wrong!”

“Quickly look! There was light! There’s light!”

“What?”

“It’s Yingluo, it’s Yingluo.”

suddenly.

It was the light of fate.

a figure slowly walked out of the hazy, white, and dazzling light and appeared before everyone.

It was Jiang Li.

He had succeeded.

At the center of his eyebrows.

there was a ‘mark of fate’ that was constantly changing shape.



“I bear the fate.”

it’s fate. Jiang Li said, looking down at all living beings. His eyes were cold and emotionless. He 
had become the carrier of fate. fate is activated, and everything changes.

As soon as he finished speaking.

Even universe ocean was stunned.

Immediately after.

An extremely terrifying change had occurred.

The ‘non-existent’ and ‘there’ seawater was fusing and producing a fusion. It began to be 
indistinguishable from each other, and at the same time, it possessed the two characteristics of ‘non-
existent’ and ‘there’, becoming a new existence.

It was called the sea of fate.

It was tainted with the aura of fate.

“Hahahahaha!”

The reincarnation ancestral God laughed wildly.

“It’s settled just like that?”

The celestial ancestor was in disbelief.

“that’s great.”

everyone cheered.



“You finally don’t have to fight anymore?”

finally, Yingying has finally ended!

“That’s great.”

......

“Your fate has been eliminated.”

master. Jiang Li pointed at Wu Wang.

“You’re so silly!”

Wuzi wanted to fight back, but he suddenly found that the power of fate had fallen on his body. He 
began to disappear, unable to stop the erosion of fate.

“No!”

there was a sorrowful cry.

Ownerless, dead.

“Retreat!”

retreat! the new generation ancestors reacted and immediately led the new generation Army to 
retreat under Jiang Li’s gaze.

And so.

Everything was settled just like that.



The new life race and the living spirit race coexisted.

Just as Jiang Zi said, Jiang Li’s wish came true.

“Jiang Zhizhi.”

Buzzzzzz!

the patriarchs of the great dao still wanted to say something.

but ...

Jiang Li suddenly disappeared in the dazzling light of fate.

In the next instant.

The world of origin.

Jiang Li appeared here.

“Jiang Li.”

Li Er looked at Jiang Li’s emotionless eyes and sighed. is it really worth it? After you become the 
executioner of the ‘Dao’, at least you still have your own consciousness, but you’re just an 
outsider.”

“But now ...”

“If you forcefully bear the weight of ‘fate’, how can you withstand the impact of the river of fate? It 
won’t be long before you lose your self-consciousness.”

“Is it really worth it?”



“......”

Jiang Li didn’t respond to Li Er. He just walked towards Dao ancestor.

“You’re smarter than me.”

Suddenly.

I’m sorry, ” Dao ancestor said again. Not only that, but he also sat up from the futon.

“Ah!”

Li Er screamed in pain. He couldn’t look straight at it and almost died.

Buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz!

The light of fate enveloped and isolated everything.

“......”

Dao ancestor ... Li Er looked at the area covered by the light of fate. He couldn’t see Jiang Li and 
Dao ancestor anymore. has Dao ancestor really recovered? ”

Within the light of fate.

“Daofather.”

thank you for your help. Jiang Li bowed to Dao ancestor and said respectfully, ” thank you for your 
help.

“Did I make a move?”



The daofather replied.

At this moment.

Dao ancestor. Jiang Li looked at Dao ancestor.

He suddenly realized.

The Dao ancestor was actually a person without a face.

No!

It shouldn’t be called faceless.

Instead, its appearance was constantly changing.

even ...

Jiang Li could see Bai Zifeng, Jiang Zi, the martial ancestor, and even his own face.

“did you see that?”

“This is the price,” Dao ancestor said.

“Back then,”

I created the Dao because I want to use the power of all living beings to control the ‘River of 
destiny’ and bear it, ” Dao ancestor said to Jiang Li.

“As you can see, I failed.”



“I created the Dao, but the Dao has also restricted me.”

“I was born from all living beings, but I am also trapped by all living beings.”

“Until today.”

you’ve appeared. You’ve comprehended the fate of all living beings and condensed the fate River of 
all living beings. You’ve connected the fate River of all living beings with the fate River of universe 
ocean.

“you bear the weight of fate.”

“You’ve succeeded, but you’ve also failed.”

“the rolling waves of the river of fate will one day completely destroy your consciousness.”

“Just like me today.”

“I can’t control fate, and I can’t bear it,”

“I wish you the best.”

suddenly.

dao ancestor’s tone paused, and he revealed an extremely shocked expression.

Because ...

A ball of light flew out from between Jiang Li’s eyebrows. It was this ball of light that carried the 
mark of the river of fate.

“You’re so silly!”



what? ” Dao ancestor looked at Jiang Li in shock.

“Yes,”

Jiang Li smiled and said slowly, ” I did not personally bear the fate, but let the ‘super mech Army’ 
bear it.

with the connection with the Super divine machinery Army, I borrowed the power of fate.

“hahaha yingluo, hahaha yingluo”

Dao ancestor laughed wildly. His laughter spread throughout the entire universe ocean, in the ears 
of all living beings, and in the depths of their souls.

“Congratulations on your success.”

“He has such great willpower to give up his fate,” said Dao ancestor.

“Congratulations, Qianqian.”

Buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz! Wuwuwuwuwu!

After that.

The Dao ancestor began to dissipate. Starting from his feet, he gradually spread upwards, turning 
into dust and also into vast specks of light. He completely dissipated.

He had fallen.

The daofather had fallen.

There was no mistake.



Because the ‘Dao ancestor’ made a move at the last moment. He activated the ‘endless Dao power’ 
in the ‘Dao de Sutra’ and helped Jiang Li.

In the end.

jiang li carried his fate with the help of the ‘super mechanical army’.

Similarly.

Because of the backlash from the ‘Dao’, the last bit of’ Dao ancestor” s consciousness had 
disappeared, and he had completely integrated with the ‘Dao’ he had created.

in reality.

Dao ancestors were very powerful!

It was so powerful that Jiang Li felt suffocated!

Powerful enough to resist fate!

Unfortunately ...

they were still destroyed by the ‘dao’ that they had created.

However ...

At the last moment, he saw Jiang Li carry his fate with the help of the ‘super mechanical Army’. He 
left without any regrets.

The ‘Dao ancestor’ would never disappear.

Because ...



The Dao of universe ocean was eternal.

“......”

Jiang Li took a deep breath and looked at the ‘light ball’ floating in front of him with a complicated 
expression. He put the light ball on the futon of the Dao ancestor.

The ball of light floated quietly.

The light was hazy.

It was shrouded in the brilliance of fate.

Jiang Li looked at the ‘Army of super mechas’ quietly.

In the end.

okay. Jiang Li turned around decisively.

“You’re leaving, right?”

At the same time.

The light of the ‘ball of light’ fluctuated, and a sound was actually emitted.

“You’re so silly!”

huh? ” Jiang Li was shocked. He turned around and looked at the ‘ball of light’. He saw the’ ball of 
light ’emit a strong light and a solid figure was formed.

It was exactly the same as Jiang Li.



“thank you,” she said.

‘Jiang Li’ smiled stiffly. Perhaps it was his first time trying to smile. you gave me a real life.

“Chief sovereign.”

the memories of our adventures will be forever buried in the deepest part of my memories. I will 
carry fate, carry the long river of fate, until it disappears forever.

“It’s just that he’s angry.”

from now on, I won’t be taking risks with you anymore. If you encounter danger again, I can’t help 
you anymore. I can’t help you anymore, Yingluo.

It was an intermittent voice.

The solidified figure was blurry.

This was the impact of the river of fate, and the Super divine machinery Army could not hold on 
any longer.

“Chief sovereign, give me a name.”

This was his last request.

you will be called the ‘super mech Army’. You will always be. You will always be Jian Jia.

Jiang Li shouted.

“Thank you, Yingluo.”

Buzzzzzz!



The figure dissipated.

It turned into the light of fate.

Drip ~ drip ~

Jiang Li’s tears fell from the corner of his eyes.

“I’m sorry, Yingluo. I’m sorry, Yingluo.”

Jiang Li kept talking.

Until ...

The light of fate dissipated.

when li er saw jiang li lowering his head and crying, he couldn’t see the dao ancestor anymore. the 
dao ancestor’s futon was a ball of light that was covered in the light of fate.

“Jiang Li, bi an.”

Li Er had just opened his mouth.

“The daofather has left.”

I should go, ” Jiang Li said. I’ll come back when I have time.

“You’re so silly!”

lear did not know what to say.

Buzzzzzz!



okay. Jiang Li left.

“Then What is this?”

Lear looked at the ‘ball of light’ on the futon. The light of fate was shrouding it, constantly 
flickering and jumping.

Jiang Li returned to the multiverse.

A family reunion.

jiang zi, bai zifeng, and the others were extremely happy.

They hugged each other.

The war was over.

Everything was thriving.

Until ...

a hundred thousand years later.

On a certain day.

All the worlds in universe ocean, every world, every living being, even the single-celled ones, heard 
a voice.

[ the river of fate has been activated. ]

[ are you ready? It’s time to change your fate! ]



[ the ‘super divine mechanical Army’ is at your service. ]

[ master panel ]

[ Lord: ]

[ game: super mechanical Army ]

[ interface: Army type ]

Mechanical Army type (can be expanded), mechanical Navy type (can not be expanded), 
mechanical air Force type (can not be expanded), mechanical interstellar type (can not be 
expanded), special mechanical Army type (can not be expanded)

energy points:

Tinder of fate: 0 ”

?............?

“what is this?”

“Change fate?”

really?!

“Why do I not believe it?”

“I don’t care anymore. I’m already like this. How bad can I be?”

“Tell me, what should I do?”



“......”

In the universe.

Countless living beings were shocked and excited.

This was something that covered the entire universe ocean.

“are you back?”

Jiang Li looked at the interface in front of him.

Shua!

A virtual screen appeared.

A face that was almost identical to Jiang Li’s appeared.

A notification popped up.

[ my Lord, long time no see! ]

“Yes.”

I see. Jiang Li nodded and smiled. long time no see.

Buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz! Buzzzzzz!

Instantly.

All the patriarchs of the great Dao and the new ancestors had arrived.



Jiang Li, what are you going to do? ”

The patriarchs of the great Dao and the new ancestors questioned.

“This is a new era.”

jiang li stood up, put his hands behind his back, and looked at the ancestors of dao and new life. he 
said, ” this is an era where everyone can control their own fate.

“So, are you all old fogeys? Of course, that includes me. Are you all ready? In this new era, to 
control your own fate?”

“Father.”

Jiang Zi walked over and said with a firm gaze, ” “your child is ready.”

“hahahahaha!”

Jiang Li stood at the top of universe ocean and everyone looked up at him.

“Fate?”

“Then let’s try.”

“looks like it’ll be interesting.”

“......”

The ancestors of the great Dao and the new ancestors laughed.

“Of course.”



Jiang Li said.

the entire book was finished!
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