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Hong Changqing didn’t know how to answer Maxton’s questioning. 

He can’t tell his own big disciple that he will stay in Aurous Hill in the future, and only 
charlie will follow his lead? 

Therefore, he could only say to Maxton, “Maxton, as a teacher for so many years in the 
Taizhen Dao, it can be regarded as dedicated. Now that he is old, he wants to relax. 
Look at the beautiful scenery and pleasant climate in Aurous Hill, which is really very 
pleasant.” It is in line with my teacher’s preferences, so I plan to settle here for a while 
as a teacher, and try to see if I can make a breakthrough in my cultivation.” Maxton 
frowned and asked, “Master, for so many years, more than 

half of your time You were in retreat, when Mrs. An invited you out of the mountain, 
weren’t you in retreat? At that time, you told me that after you rescued Mr. An’s family, 
you would continue to go back to the teacher’s door for retreat, but then you came here 
without saying a word After leaving Aurous Hill, why do you suddenly say that you want 
to give up the position of head and settle down in Aurous Hill?” 

Hong Changqing could only explain, “Well, after staying in one place for a long time, my 
heart will become slack, so I also want to try another environment. “ 

Maxton looked at Hong Changqing, then at charlie who was sitting beside him, and 
couldn’t help but ask, “Master, even if what you said is the truth, you shouldn’t let me go 
if you want to pass the position to me.” Come to Aurous Hill, according to Taizhen Dao’s 
practice, the ceremony of passing the throne must be held in front of other senior 
brothers.” Hong Changqing waved his hand awkwardly, and said, “Oh, what did you say 

? Those are dispensable formalisms. Since it is the head of the throne, as long as I 
pass the seat to you, as for the others, it does not matter whether they are present or 
not. When the time comes, you will take my head When the token goes back, they will 
naturally respect you as the new head.” 

Maxton said with some dissatisfaction, “Master, this is the tradition of Taizhen Dao after 
all. As the head of Taizhen Dao, you can’t ignore the tradition of Taizhen Dao Right? 
Moreover, your choice of this occasion is a bit too casual, which sect have you heard of, 
the head pass ceremony is held in a hotel room?” Hong Changqing heard that, his 
expression was somewhat ashamed 

. 

It is really inappropriate to say that it is a bit inappropriate to pass the position of head in 
a hotel. 



Helpless, he could only bite the bullet and say, “The matter of passing on the position is 
not enough to mobilize the teachers. I can’t call the disciples of the Taizhen Dao who 
traveled thousands of miles to Aurous Hill to be a witness, right? I am the master.” Why 
do you have the nerve to torment everyone like this?” 

Maxton asked him aggressively, “Then why don’t you go back to the United States? 
Even if you want to stay in Aurous Hill, out of respect for Taizhen, you should take a few 
days to go back Going to the sect, at worst, you can go back to Aurous Hill after the 
succession ceremony is over!” “ 

This…” Hong Changqing was speechless when asked by Maxton. 

On this issue, he himself is very guilty. 

The reason why he called Maxton over from the United States to pass the position in 
the hotel was nothing more than to let charlie see his attitude. 

To put it bluntly, all of this is just to cater to charlie. 

However, in order to cater to charlie, he had to neglect the rules of the teacher’s school. 

At this time, Maxton saw that Hong Changqing hesitated and couldn’t say anything, so 
he looked at charlie from the corner of his eye and said, “Master, you just said that as 
long as you pass on the seat to me, others It doesn’t matter whether you are present or 
not, so I want to ask you, since there is no need for fellow disciples to be present to 
witness, why did you invite this Mr. Wade over? 
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 He must not be too sincere, right?” Hong Changqing was even more embarrassed 

, Hastily coughed twice, and blurted out, “Maxton, I invited Mr. Wade to come here. On 
the one hand, Mr. Wade and I have a deep friendship, and on the other hand, Mr. Wade 
is in Aurous Hill…” Maxton didn’t believe him at all 

. Speaking, said coldly, “Master, since I came in, I found that you are very respectful to 
this Mr. Wade. Combined with this matter, I think the reason why you want me to come 
to Aurous Hill and plan to pass on the throne to me here, You just want to show off in 
front of Mr. Wade, right?” 

Hong Changqing didn’t expect what Maxton said, and said with a blushing old face, “Oh, 
Maxton… Let me tell you something from the bottom of my heart as a teacher. I have 
devoted most of my life to Taizhen Tao. In the future, I want to do something for my 
teacher. What you do, if you still regard it as a teacher and your master, don’t break the 
casserole here and ask the end. After the master passes on the position of master to 



you, and the teacher stays in Aurous Hill to practice, you go back to the United States. 
Don’t you think it’s enough to carry forward the Tao of Taizhen?” 

Seeing Hong Changqing’s resolute attitude, Maxton sighed helplessly, nodded and said, 
“Okay! Now that Master has made up his mind, I won’t persuade you anymore, but I 
There is something I want to tell you.” 

Hong Changqing hurriedly said, “Just say it!” 

Maxton said, “I am still young, so I may not have the ability to carry forward the Taizhen 
way. I can temporarily take over as the head of the sect, and wait for you, Master. When 
will you change your mind, I will return the position of head to you.” 

Hong Changqing waved his hand and said, “No need, no need, just be your head!” 

Maxton said firmly, “Master, how do you decide? It’s your freedom, I just want to 
express my attitude.” 

After that, she didn’t talk nonsense with Hong Changqing, but said with some emotion, 
“Okay, master, don’t gossip, don’t you want to pass on the throne? Let’s start now!” 

“Okay, okay.”Hong Changqing breathed a sigh of relief, and hurriedly took out the 
prepared incense sticks and incense burner, lit six sticks of incense sticks, and handed 
three of them to Maxton. 

Afterwards, he faced the north, and said respectfully, “The ancestors of Taizhen Dao 
are above, and below is Hong Changqing, the thirty-ninth generation head of Taizhen 
Dao. Here, I officially pass on the position of head to my personal disciple, Long.” 
Maxton, from now on, Maxton will be the fortieth generation head of Taizhen Dao, I 
implore the patriarchs of Taizhen Dao to bless Maxton and Taizhen Dao!” After finishing 
speaking, he held three sticks of incense 

above his head and worshiped , and then looked at Maxton, and dictated to her a series 
of requirements for the head of Taizhen Dao. 

After completing these ceremonies, Hong Changqing took out a token of the head of the 
sect from his waist, handed it to Maxton, and said, “Maxton, this is the token of the head 
of Taizhen Dao. You keep it. The token is here, you are the head of Taizhen Dao!” 

Maxton nodded and took the token with both hands. 

Hong Changqing took out another piece of paper filled with calligraphy, and said to 
Maxton, “Maxton, this is the complete version of “Taizhen Hunyuan Dao”, which has 
been passed down for thousands of years by Taizhen Dao. , You must memorize this 
whole manual by heart, and you must not miss a single word!” “ 



Okay.” Maxton took the paper, opened it, looked at it, and put it in his arms. 

Hong Changqing let out a long breath, and said, “Maxton, from now on, you are the 
fortieth head of Taizhen Dao. You will be the master of all affairs of Taizhen Dao in the 
future. You can prepare to return to the United States immediately. If you need help with 
anything, please contact me at any time, and I will definitely try my best to help you.” 

Maxton nodded, then looked at Hong Changqing, and asked him, “Master, Master, the 
old man passed it on to you. What about the medicine cauldron?” 
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“Medicine cauldron?!” 

Hong Changqing was startled when he heard Maxton’s question. 

He was very puzzled and thought to himself, “How could Maxton know about the 
medicine cauldron? Didn’t Master, the old man, say that this secret can only be known 
by the head of the sect and should not be told to anyone else?! How could he keep this 
secret?” Tell Maxton about it?” 

Thinking of this, he purposely played sloppy eyes, “Maxton, who did you hear about the 
medicine cauldron? Why didn’t I know?” 

Maxton frowned, and said in a somewhat angry tone “Master! Master, the old man told 
me about it a Maxtontime ago. He said that Taizhen Dao has a town treasure, a 
medicine cauldron that is quite effective in refining medicine! The old man also said that 
only the future master can have it. Qualified to inherit this treasure, since you have 
decided to give me the position of master, then the medicine cauldron should also be 
passed on to me, otherwise how will I explain to my master and my personal disciple in 
the future?” Hong Changqing never 

dreamed Thinking of, before passing on the medicine cauldron to him, his master had 
repeatedly instructed him not to reveal the secret of the medicine cauldron to anyone 
before passing on the throne, but in the blink of an eye, he revealed this The matter was 
told to Maxton. 

He couldn’t help but wonder in his heart, “Master, Master, do you love Maxton too 
much, or do you distrust me too much?” 

Immediately, he was so embarrassed that he could only stammer and say, “Maxton, this 
matter You must have misremembered the matter, Taizhen Dao does not have any 
medicinal cauldrons, I guess the old master is deliberately teasing you.” Maxton shook 
his head and said, “ 



Impossible, Master told me clearly, too The true way does have such a medicine 
cauldron, and it is absolutely impossible for his old man to joke about this kind of thing!” 

She couldn’t help asking Hong Changqing, “Master, the medicine cauldron is a token of 
the Taizhen way that has been passed down for thousands of years, and it will never 
arrive. You here, you just want to keep it for yourself?” 

“I didn’t…” Seeing that Hong Changqing couldn’t be fooled, he could only say 
helplessly, “Maxton, I will take the head of the teacher to assure you, the one you said 
The medicine cauldron is not in my hands, if it is in my hands, I will definitely give it to 
you without hesitation.” 

Maxton frowned even more tightly, “Master, if the medicine cauldron is not in your 
hands, then whose hands is it? Master handed it to you, you must have lost it, right? !” 

Hong Changqing said vaguely, “Maxton, this medicine cauldron is really out of my 
hands right now, and I really can’t find it back, so you’d better treat it as if you really 
don’t have such a thing.” 

When Hong Changqing said these words, he was also very disturbed. He originally 
thought that Maxton didn’t know the existence of the medicine cauldron and planned to 
get away with it, but he didn’t expect that Maxton knew this clearly. If he didn’t take out 
the medicine cauldron If you give it to her, then you will naturally become a sinner of 
Taizhen Dao. 

However, that thing has been lost to charlie by himself now, and it is definitely 
impossible to ask charlie to get it back at this time. 

Therefore, he can only sacrifice his own reputation. Even if the disciples of Taizhen Dao 
in the future know that he has lost the treasure passed down from the ancestors of 
Taizhen Dao, he can only recognize it. 

When Maxton heard Hong Changqing’s words at this time, she was also very angry. 
She didn’t expect that Hong Changqing deliberately concealed the matter of Yao Ding 
first, and when she asked him personally, he would actually play a rogue. 

Maxton couldn’t help asking him, “Master, what do you mean by treating Taizhen Dao 
without such a thing?” 
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Hong Changqing said cheekily, “It’s because you forgot that Taizhen Dao has a 
medicine cauldron from now on. “ 



Maxton said angrily, “Master, what’s the difference between you and a father who loses 
his son and goes home and tells his family ‘everyone just pretend they never had this 
son’? Do you think it’s appropriate?” 

Hong Changqing couldn’t hold back, so he could only smash the pot and said, “Then 
the medicine cauldron is indeed gone now, and I really can’t find it, what can you tell me 
to do?” Maxton asked him, “I need to know, the medicine 

cauldron How did it disappear, and who owns the medicine cauldron?” 

Hong Changqing dodged her eyes, and said falteringly, “Maxton…Since the medicine 
cauldron is gone, what’s the point of you breaking the casserole and asking after all? ? 
What you have to do now is to quickly return to Taizhen Dao with the sect leader token, 
and do your role as sect master well!” 

Maxton argued rationally, “Since you passed on the headship to me, then I have the 
obligation to recover the treasure that has been passed down for thousands of years for 
Taizhen Dao, so no matter what, I have to find and bring back the medicine cauldron.” 
After that, she stared at Hong Changqing closely, and asked, “Master, think about the 
thirty-eight heads of Taizhen Dao 

before you, if you don’t take the medicine cauldron back to Taizhen Dao, you can sleep 
well Is it?” 

Hong Changqing didn’t know that he should respond to Maxton’s question at all, and in 
desperation, he could only say bitterly, “Maxton, to tell you the truth as a teacher, I lost 
the medicine cauldron in a bet.”  

Maxton  was shocked, and blurted out, “Master, what qualifications do you have to bet 
on the inheritance of Taizhen Dao?” 

Hong Changqing said helplessly, “I am not qualified, but I have already done this. I have 
nothing to do. If you are not satisfied, after you go back, you can tell the whole Tai Tai 
about my affairs.The true way, let me become a sinner of the too true way through the 
ages, I have no objection to these. “ 

Maxton said seriously, “Master, I don’t want you to become a sinner of the Taizhen Dao 
through the ages, I just want to get back the treasure of the Taizhen Dao!” 

After that, she gritted her teeth and said, “Master, tell me who the medicine cauldron 
lost to. I will go to him and ask him if he would like to sell the medicine cauldron to me. If 
he is willing, no matter what. ” I will try to figure out how much money it takes, but if it 
doesn’t work, I’ll ask my father for it! “ 

Hong Changqing looked very embarrassed, but because of his guilty conscience, he 
didn’t know how to answer for a while. 



charlie, who had been silent all this time, smiled slightly at this time, “Miss Maxtondon’t 
have to embarrass Hong Tianshi, his medicine cauldron has already lost to It’s mine, 
now it’s mine. “ 

Maxton looked at charlie in surprise, and asked, “Mr. Wade, I want to know how my 
master lost the medicine cauldron to you?” “ 

charlie said lightly, “Ms. Maxtondoesn’t need to ask about the specifics, you just need to 
know that the medicine cauldron is in my hands now, and I’m not going to sell it. 

Maxton said anxiously, “Mr. Wade, this is the treasure of our Taizhen Taoist school!” 

charlie said lightly, “It used to be, but it’s not anymore, and I don’t care about its origin, I 
only know that it is now It’s mine.” 

Maxton immediately asked him, “Mr. Wade, how much money will it take for you to 
return the treasure of my Taizhendao Zhenpai? Tell me the number, and I will try my 
best to persuade my father to call you money!” 

charlie smiled and said, “Although I don’t know how much money Miss Long’s father 
has, I can tell you one thing clearly, even if you put all your father’s assets in front of 
me, I will not agree! “ 

 


