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At this moment, Wu Shuhang, who had grown accustomed to life and death, suddenly felt a wave of 
grief. 

It was also then that he realized Andre was dead, and the reason he was still alive wasn’t because 
the Lord of England had shown him mercy. According to her, the fact that he had been given the 
Reshaping Pill was an insult to her, and she would likely prefer for this matter to never come to light. 

Killing both him and Andre would have been the best solution. 

The reason Andre was dead but Wu Shuhang was still alive must have been that his brother had 
recently disappeared. The Lord of England couldn’t afford to kill him too, or it would demoralize the 
army and cause greater losses. 

In the end, the lives of the Wu family weren’t as important as her reputation. 

At that moment, Jadiel said on the other end of the video, “Shuhang, remember this: you must never 
tell anyone about this, not even your family. You must carry this secret to the grave. If you ever let it 
slip, it won’t just be your life in danger. Do you understand?” 

Jadiel’s words only reinforced Wu Shuhang’s suspicions. 

This wasn’t just about keeping him quiet; it was a threat to his entire family. If he revealed this 
secret, he would likely be executed. 

Wu Shuhang was furious but didn’t dare show it. He quickly responded, “Grandpa, don’t worry, I 
won’t tell anyone!” 

Jadiel nodded. “Your Right Army Governor’s Office has withdrawn to Spain, right?” 

“Yes,” Wu Shuhang replied. “They’ve all withdrawn.” 

“I’ll talk to your brother, Wu Shuhan, and have him take over immediately,” Jadiel said. “We’ll send 
someone to pick you up.” 

In a panic, Wu Shuhang said, “Grandpa, I want to leave right now. I can’t stand being here any 
longer…” 

“You’re too exposed right now. You can’t act recklessly,” Jadiel warned. “What if they’re watching 
you and discover the new location of the Right Army Governor’s Office?” 

Wu Shuhang suddenly thought of Charlie Wade’s earlier actions and cried, “But, what if that man 
comes back and gives me another Remodeling Pill? I’m scared he’ll do it again, and my hands will 
be cut off… I can’t take it, Grandpa… It’s unbearable…” 



“How is that possible?” Jadiel said. “He already gave you one of those valuable Remodeling Pills. 
Why would he give you another?” 

“But Grandpa, I’m terrified! That guy doesn’t play by the rules. When he gave me the pill, he didn’t 
seem to care about its value at all!” 

Jadiel paused for a moment, then said, “Here’s what you should do: go to the largest hospital in 
Casablanca and tell the doctor you had an accident where your hands were cut off by a machine. 
Get admitted for treatment.” 

“Hospitalized?” Wu Shuhang was confused. “Wouldn’t that make my whereabouts public?” 

“You’re already exposed,” Jadiel replied. “If someone is looking for you, they’ll find you anyway. As 
long as you don’t go back to the Right Army Governor’s Office, it doesn’t matter where you are.” 

“You’re right…” Wu Shuhang agreed. 

“Once you’re in the hospital, they’ll document your injuries in your medical records,” Jadiel 
explained. “That person won’t dare give you another Remodeling Pill.” 

Wu Shuhang asked, “Grandpa, how are you so sure? What if he comes to the hospital to give me 
another pill?” 

 


