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Meanwhile, Trevor, standing nearby, couldn’t help but feel a twinge of jealousy. 

He knew Tawanna had feelings for charlie Wade and, with his impending return to the 
U.S., she would be spending the next 20 performances working closely with charlie 
Wade, sharing long hours together. He couldn’t help but wonder if her feelings for 
charlie Wade might deepen over time. 

However, Trevor felt powerless. He wasn’t a wealthy man. Tawanna often flew him 
around on her private jet or sent it to pick him up after his games, which had already 
drawn ridicule from the media. His earnings were far less than Tawanna’s, and he relied 
on her generosity to enjoy such luxuries. 

He was ridiculed for flying on a private jet, and if he gave up his career as a professional 
athlete to stay with his mother full-time, he would likely face even harsher criticism from 
fans and the media. 

This left him with no choice but to return to the United States, even if it meant leaving 
Tawanna behind with charlie Wade. 

While he trusted that charlie Wade wouldn’t harbor any improper intentions toward 
Tawanna, he couldn’t help but worry that Tawanna might not resist showing her 
affection for charlie Wade. 

At that moment, charlie Wade thought about his wife, Claire, and her interest in 
attending Tawanna’s concert. He said, “By the way, Tawanna, bruce Auto gave out all 
the concert tickets through a lottery, but Churan and I didn’t win. Could you help us out 
and let us watch your performance backstage?” 

Tawanna smiled warmly and replied, “Of course, no problem! My team is preparing all 
the performance materials right now. I’ll have them make two special consultant passes 
for you. That way, you can move freely backstage. You can chat with me while I’m 
getting ready, and when I’m performing, you can watch from the wings of the stage. 
You’ll have access wherever you’d like.” 

Claire was thrilled but hesitated. “Won’t this cause you any trouble?” she asked. 

Tawanna waved her hand dismissively and said, “Not at all! I’m usually very relaxed 
backstage with my team, and having you around will make me feel even more at ease.” 

Overjoyed, Claire quickly said, “Thank you so much, Miss Tawanna! We’ll make sure 
not to cause you any inconvenience!” 



Wanting to build a closer bond, Tawanna took Claire’s hand and said, “Actually, when I 
first met Mr. Wade, we had some disagreements over our differing perspectives. But 
later, he helped me understand so much, and I truly value the connection we’ve made. I 
also cherish meeting you and sincerely hope we can become good friends. So, if you’re 
willing to be my friend, please don’t be so formal with me!” 

Claire, touched by her sincerity, nodded enthusiastically. 

Tawanna added, “By the way, I’m not sure what Mrs. Wade does for a living, but if you 
don’t have any other plans coming up, you’re welcome to attend all my concerts in 
Huaxia.” 

Then, she asked deliberately, “Do you think you’ll have time to join the four concerts in 
other cities?” 

Claire quickly replied, “I run my own design company. My schedule is usually packed 
with business, so while attending the concerts in Aurous Hill won’t be an issue, I 
probably won’t be able to travel to other places.” 

“Alright then, but you must come to all the Aurous Hill concerts,” Tawanna said with a 
look of regret, though she was secretly pleased. 

Her real intention in asking Claire was to find out if she would accompany charlie Wade 
to all 20 concerts. 

When Claire mentioned she couldn’t attend the remaining 16, Tawanna pretended to 
look disappointed but felt a quiet sense of excitement inside. 

 


