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Chapter 1131

When Gu Shaoyang saw the city lord coming, he immediately took off his mask. When the head of 
the Lin family saw it, he immediately became even more angry.

"You are a coward! He actually came to see me on behalf of a villain!"

The head of the Lin family who had been caught at this time couldn't move, so he could only curse 
continuously, but Gu Shaoyang turned a deaf ear. He let him curse, and the city lord also had the 
same attitude as Gu Shaoyang.

Finally, wait After the head of the Lin family finished scolding him, the city lord began to speak.

"There seems to be no need for us to see each other again. I hope you will get better results in the 
future"

"Now let me help you a little bit, let me help you out. Once you are freed, you will be completely 
liberated, and you won't have so much pain!"

The city lord imitated the behavior of the head of the Lin family and deliberately threatened him. 
When the head of the Lin family saw the city lord walking toward him with the knife in his hand, 
dense beads of sweat immediately appeared on his forehead.

"Let me get to know you now."The city lord was approaching the head of the Lin family with a 
knife in his hand, and Gu Shaoyang had been standing aside to ensure the safety of the city lord.

If the head of the Lin family suddenly made any move, he would be able to stop it in time.

But fortunately he He was not prepared. It seemed that he had never thought that the city lord would 
join the human alliance to deal with him. In the end, the head of the Lin family was finally 
institutionalized, and the people who kidnapped children in Dongcheng were finally eliminated.

Gu Shaoyang will be behind the scenes. After the Black Hand was eliminated, the signal flares 
agreed between him and the major guardians in the city also bloomed in the air. When they saw the 



flares, they immediately entered the place Gu Shaoyang told them. In the end, the baby in the tree 
hole was the child in the forest. , and all the people in the flower shop's pond were arrested.

And they also took good care of the innocent children, but those children were not happy after 
learning that they had been rescued. But he was a little scared.

Because he had been locked up for a long time, but during such a long time, their parents did not 
look for them, so the children were a little hurt.

And some children were taken away from them. Some were deceived from other places, and some 
were sold by their parents, so they were homeless. Now that they have been rescued, they don’t 
know where they can study to settle down, so now they still have some Scared.

As for the children's worries, Gu Shaoyang had already considered it, so after Dongcheng's 
protector rescued the children, he had people release news throughout the city, telling everyone that 
the children had been found.

And some After hearing the news, people still didn't believe it. After all, the child had been lost for 
so long. How could it be possible that so much time had passed and they were found as soon as they 
said they found it.

But in the end, when they actually saw the child walking on the street , there are indeed abducted 
children who found their way home on their own, while their parents held them at home and cried 
bitterly.

Some of the other lost children have not yet been found, and the parents who did not receive the 
bodies hurried Go to the location mentioned in the message to search for their children.

In the search of many parents, many children were found and returned to their families.

But in the end, there were still some children who did not find their homes. These remaining The 
children who were born are the children that Gu Shaoyang was thinking about.

For these children, Gu Shaoyang came up with a way to let them go to families where the children 
have not been found.



In this way, one of them has no parents and the other has no children. The two complement each 
other and everyone can Make up for each other and fill the vacancy in the heart.

This can also solve the problem of the child. Of course, some families are not willing to do this. 
They want to have children again on their own, and the rules set by Gu Shaoyang and others will 
not force them. They are all voluntary..So

, in the end, for the remaining children, Gu Shaoyang let them live together temporarily. If someone 
wants to adopt them later, then they will have a home. If no one is willing to adopt them, then they 
can also have a shelter. A place where it rains.

They will not be allowed to starve and freeze, begging for food on the street, and grow up pitifully.

After Gu Shaoyang tied up the head of the Lin family and cleaned up, Gu Shaoyang quietly 
withdrew, and then pushed the city lord out. In the end, it was up to the city lord himself to explain 
what happened on the surface to the people.

Gu Shaoyang's own mission has been completed. Now he only needs to do what he promised to the 
guard and the guard's wife before, and he is ready to continue to another place to complete the 
mission.

In this way, Gu Shaoyang headed towards the guard's home with a baby in his arms. When the 
guard and his wife did not see their child where they were looking for the child, they thought Gu 
Shaoyang was there.
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Everything I said before was deceiving them. But when they finally got home, they discovered that 
Gu Shaoyang had already been waiting at home with their children.

It was just that the two of them had been anxious to find the child after hearing the news, so they 
went to the place where they were looking for the child.

But they didn't find it in the end, so the two of them felt very sad, but in the end they discovered 
that it was them who were scaring themselves, and it turned out that they were overthinking.

Therefore, the mood of the guard couple was like riding a roller coaster, going up and down, very 
exciting. When Gu Shaoyang finally waited for the guard couple at their home, he felt relieved.



Then I saw Gu Shaoyang walking towards the child and the guard couple, but the guard couple 
were a little at a loss when they actually saw their child.

What they had imagined in their hearts before was how the children they saw would be like and 
how carefully they would care for them.

But now when the child was held in front of them, the guard couple did not even have the courage 
to reach out and hug the child because they were afraid that it was just a dream.

If they let them go out of fear, the child and Gu Shaoyang will turn into nothing and disappear into 
the air.

So Gu Shaoyang and the guard couple were in the hall, staring at each other for a long time. It was 
not until the baby in Gu Shaoyang's arms suddenly started crying that the guard couple began to 
realize that all this was true.

Everything that is happening now is not their dream, it is actually happening to them! Their child is 
really back!

"The child should be hungry. Feed him quickly. He has been drinking milk before."

Gu Shaoyang had never taken care of a crying baby, so when the child in his arms started to cry, he 
handed it to the guard's wife.

When the guard's wife saw the child that Gu Shaoyang handed over, she subconsciously caught it 
with her hands. , the guard also quickly put his big palm on the child, for fear that something would 
go wrong.

Now the guard couple finally held their child in their arms, and the two of them couldn't help but 
hugged each other and cried bitterly, like this Gu Shaoyang was a little overwhelmed after seeing 
the scene.

So he simply walked out. After he heard the crying inside gradually getting quieter, Gu Shaoyang 
continued to walk in.



At this time, the guard couple had already put aside their own emotions. Adjusted well, so when 
facing Gu Shaoyang, they were full of gratitude.

All the dissatisfaction with Gu Shaoyang they had attributed to themselves, and they hoped that Gu 
Shaoyang could forgive them.

But Gu Shaoyang didn't mind it at all, and finally guarded After the couple said thank you to Gu 
Shaoyang for a long time, Gu Shaoyang left their home.

Because Gu Shaoyang still owed a meal, he had to make up for it when he left.

In this way, Gu Shaoyang When he came to the street, he started to buy meat and snacks, and also 
bought a lot of small toys. Finally, he carried a lot of things to the children's territory.

All the children who had been treated by Gu Shaoyang before gathered together, just to be with 
him. Gu Shaoyang had a meal.

They had been begging Gu Shaoyang for this meal for a long time, and now it was finally possible, 
which was very rare for them.

In the end, Gu Shaoyang bought a table of good food and showed off his cooking skills. , and then 
Gu Shaoyang had a pleasant meal with the children.

After the meal, Gu Shaoyang played wildly with the children, just like a child.

Finally, after playing with the children, Gu Shaoyang returned to the previous inn Inside.

The shopkeeper originally wanted to take Gu Shaoyang for a chat, but when he saw Gu Shaoyang's 
exhausted look, he ultimately did not do that.

And Gu Shaoyang returned to his room to rest, and this time he rested, He just slept for a whole day 
and night without opening his eyes once.

When he woke up, he couldn't tell whether it was day or night, but whether it was this morning or 
last night.



But after he woke up, Gu Shaoyang He opened the door and window and saw the weather outside. 
When he saw the clear sky outside, his mood that had been melancholy for a long time finally 
cleared up. At this time, Dongcheng had gradually returned to its former liveliness. Some families 
did not dare to have more children before. People are now taking the time to create humans, just to 
have another child of their own.

Seeing that Dongcheng has returned to its former bustle, for Gu Shaoyang, in addition to 
successfully completing the task, more is in his heart Satisfaction.

In the spirit hunting organization, when the people inside discovered that Gu Shaoyang had 
completed the most difficult task, they couldn't help but look at him with admiration. At the same 
time, they were even more looking forward to the speed at which he would complete the tasks later.

He has just taken over the task now. It didn't take long for him to complete one-tenth of the task.
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Pack your bags and hit the road.

Although there are still many difficulties on the road, Gu Shaoyang has never thought of giving up.

When leaving Dongcheng, Gu Shaoyang was silent. After a sound sleep in the inn, Gu Shaoyang 
left happily without telling anyone or leaving a letter.

Except when a child was playing together before leaving, he said - the days are long.

So when everyone found out that Gu Shaoyang was gone, he had already left Dongcheng for a long 
time. The innkeeper found that Gu Shaoyang was in a dull mood after leaving, but more 
importantly, he hoped to meet him again.

""There is no banquet in life." This sentence has always been very important in Gu Shaoyang's 
heart, and he himself has always looked down on his feelings.

After all, he is in the world, and if he takes his feelings too seriously, it will not be good for him. 
Doing many things is not conducive to his being ruthless to complete the task.



No, Gu Shaoyang's next task is to assassinate others.

If his heart is not ruthless enough, then let him assassinate someone innocently, how likely is he to 
agree? ?

Embarking on the journey, the place Gu Shaoyang came to this time was Yancheng. There was a 
super corrupt official here who was deeply hated by the people, but because he was so corrupt. So 
no one could send troops to touch him, and he himself He lives like a little emperor, with a leisurely 
life, surrounded by beautiful women, and a lot of wives and children.

And he is also inhumane. As long as he likes that beautiful person, he will rape her whether she 
wants it or not. He robbed her and took her home as a concubine. This corrupt official even killed 
many women's families for this reason.

The girls in Yancheng were also miserable. Because of this, many families had girls. No one dared 
to let the girl go out easily, for fear of being seen by him and being defiled.

After Gu Shaoyang learned about the situation in Yancheng, he began to prepare to assassinate this 
corrupt official, preparing to deal with him as soon as possible.

And this corrupt official also knew that he must There are many people who want his life, so he will 
bring a lot of bodyguards with him every time he travels. The walls around his home are also 
reinforced with first-class, high-quality defense materials.

And he himself Although he likes beautiful women, he always asks people to carry her away after 
doing something with her, and he will never spend the night with her.

And when he sleeps at night, he is also raped on his bed. He was protected by a barrier, and 
someone kept vigil for him when he slept at night, so he could sleep so peacefully.

After arriving in Yancheng, Gu Shaoyang quickly figured out the situation, and after he understood 
the situation clearly, he was ready to take action.

Although this big corrupt official cherished his life very much and took all kinds of protective 
measures very well, he overestimated his own defense, lowered his assassin, and lowered the hatred 
of others towards him. In this way,



Gu Shaoyang soon She has already planned her own route.

He has bribed a peerless beauty to cooperate with him, and asked the peerless beauty to wait on the 
roadside. As long as the big corrupt official passes by, he will give him a gust of wind at the right 
time. Then the beauty's The veil was just blown up. When the corrupt official passed by, he would 
definitely not be able to help but take a second look. As long as he looked at it, he would be 
addicted to Gu Shaoyang holding you.

So Gu Shaoyang fell in love with the peerless beauty in the corrupt official. When he was about to 
take her away, he had to take the beauty away first, but Gu Shaoyang had to act like he was not 
strong enough.

In the end, he was deliberately caught by the corrupt official's men, and then waited until he and the 
peerless beauty were both caught by the corrupt official. When returning to his mansion, this 
corrupt official will definitely threaten the peerless beauty with Gu Shaoyang's life.

Finally, the peerless beauty will also make a request and want to thank Gu Shaoyang. When she 
thanks Gu Shaoyang, Gu Shaoyang will give her a packet of medicinal powder. This powder can 
make people unconscious immediately.

For the corrupt official and his guards, the effect will be very good. By then, Gu Shaoyang will be 
able to deal with the corrupt official while they pass by, and the beautiful woman will be fine.

After Gu Shaoyang made such a plan, he quickly implemented it together with the peerless beauty, 
and things developed very smoothly. As expected by Gu Shaoyang, the corrupt official suddenly 
rose to the top without any hesitation.

After he took the bait, they continued to rely on the plan, and everything went smoothly in the end. 
Gu Shaoyang also successfully captured Gu Shaoyang and his men.

And when Gu Shaoyang captured the corrupt official, he was not in a hurry to kill him.

Instead, according to the employer's request, the corrupt official was hung alive at the door of 
Yancheng for three days and three nights, and finally his head was dropped to the ground and his 
body was quartered.



Let him accept the cruelest punishment!

When the people of Yancheng discovered that the man tied to the city gate was a corrupt official, 
everyone threw eggs, stones and cabbage leaves at him, hoping to vent their anger.
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After the corrupt official was institutionalized, all the girls he had captured in his backyard over the 
years were saved and left the corrupt official's home. But in the end there were still some homeless 
people, so they chose to stay. where.

In addition, after the peerless beauty released all the women in the corrupt official's family, she also 
found a lot of evidence of the corrupt official's corruption and handed it over to Gu Shaoyang, who 
took the evidence and put it directly at the location designated by his employer.

The final task was completed very quickly, and he set out on the journey again.

This time when Gu Shaoyang set off towards his next destination, he kept doing many small tasks 
on the way.

The progress bar of his mission was also rising slowly, and within the spirit hunting organization, 
when everyone saw the progress bar of Gu Shaoyang completing the mission, they couldn't help but 
admire him.

The speed with which he completed the task has surpassed the spirit hunting organization's first 
place in completing the task quickly and accurately.

And depending on the time it takes Gu Shaoyang to complete the task now, I'm afraid it won't be 
long before he can complete it all. He had previously planned that it might take him a year to 
complete the task, but now that he has less than half a month, Gu Shaoyang Two-fifths of the 
mission has been completed.

Moreover, the speed at which he completes the task continues to skyrocket. I am afraid that if it 
takes him a year to complete the task, he can successfully complete it in just one month.

Time seemed to pass by. When Gu Shaoyang completed the task, he set the final location to 
complete the task as the inn where the boy in white was.



Because the boy in white had not contacted him for a long time, and if he completed the mission 
near the boy in white, he could stay in the same inn with him.

As long as the two of them can meet again, Gu Shaoyang can also help him solve some things, and 
he doesn't need to worry about it himself.

And the people in the ghost hunting organization will not doubt who he will come into contact with 
when he goes to the inn, what secrets or bad things.

In this way, Gu Shaoyang sang in the direction of the inn where the boy in white was and walked to 
complete the task. From time to time, he would encounter people who were in danger on the way.

And when Gu Shaoyang meets him, he will help him, but he will not leave his name or any trace. 
Others can only see his back.

So when Gu Shaoyang was heading in the direction of the boy in white, there was another name for 
Gu Shaoyang in the world - back figure.

And many people simply referred to him as Shadow.

When Gu Shaoyang heard someone discussing this matter while he was resting, he would not pay 
attention to it, let alone admit it, as if what they discussed had nothing to do with him and had 
nothing to do with him.

And just when Gu Shaoyang was about to arrive at the inn where the boy in white was staying, he 
suddenly saw a very familiar figure on the road - the boy in white!

At this time, the boy in white didn't know why, but he was walking freely on the street. Behind him, 
Gu Shaoyang also observed carefully, and no one was following him.

So he was a little confused as to what the young man in white was doing now.

Because he didn't understand, Gu Shaoyang didn't dare to interrupt rashly. He could only watch 
quietly from the side until he saw the boy in white return to his room in the inn.



Gu Shaoyang just started to go to the room of the boy in white.

At this time, because the young man in white had already recovered, he had already felt when Gu 
Shaoyang approached his room, and Gu Shaoyang had already noticed his vigilance.

So when Gu Shaoyang just entered the room of the boy in white, Gu Shaoyang immediately took 
over and started fighting with him.

In the room, the two people refused to give in to each other. After Gu Shaoyang and the boy in 
white fought for a long time, the boy in white realized that it was Gu Shaoyang who was fighting 
him, so he quickly stopped what he was doing.

After the boy in white stopped what he was doing, Gu Shaoyang also stopped his hand. The two of 
them stood with their hands behind their backs. The breeze blew the corners of their clothes slightly. 
Finally, the two looked at each other and sat on the stool together.

After the boy in white and Gu Shaoyang sat down, the boy in white took the initiative to reach out 
and give Gu Shaoyang and himself a cup of tea.

As before, Gu Shaoyang picked up the tea and drank it in one gulp, while the boy in white looked at 
Gu Shaoyang, waiting for him to tell him the purpose of his visit and what happened.

Similarly, Gu Shaoyang is also waiting for the boy in white to see if he has anything to tell him 
recently.

"You go ahead and say it."Gu Shaoyang raised his hand to signal to the boy in white, and the boy in 
white also smiled lightly and nodded.

"In fact, nothing has happened recently. It's just that someone in my family has been eyeing me 
recently, so life has been a bit difficult, but I can't expose it."

The boy in white spread his hands, feeling helpless. During the time that Gu Shaoyang left, the boy 
in white also hid himself very well and did not expose himself.
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However, although the boy in white did not reveal that he knew martial arts, people in his family 
discovered his traces, so the boy in white has been followed these days.



In order not to expose the fact that his cultivation level had been restored, the boy in white could 
only keep evading. However, he did not use martial arts, so his whereabouts were always exposed 
to others.

After Gu Shaoyang came back this time, he told the matter. He hoped that he could give a solution, 
and it would be best to solve all the people who were following him.

In this way, the problem can be solved at the root without letting the boy in white be suspected by 
people in his family.

However, if Gu Shaoyang really does this, then it is very likely that he will be suspected by the 
family of the boy in white. However, because there is a spirit hunting organization behind him, his 
threat is greater than that of the boy in white. a lot less

"How long have they been following you, and are they trying to get at you? Kill and silence?"

After Gu Shaoyang heard the words of the boy in white, he immediately frowned, and then asked 
immediately. When the boy in white heard what Gu Shaoyang said, he just nodded heavily and 
looked solemn.

"Okay, I understand what you mean. I will definitely get rid of these people and prevent you from 
being exposed, but you yourself must not expose your recovery of cultivation. Once I do it, others 
will be suspicious. I am yours, they will definitely attack you directly"

"At that time, they will definitely use whatever means necessary, and I will definitely be entangled 
by other people and unable to escape. You have to be careful."

Gu Shaoyang guessed the approximate result and told the boy in white. After the boy in white 
finally discussed it with Gu Shaoyang, the two reached a consensus.

"Now that my matter has been resolved, how are you doing in the organization recently? Is there 
anyone making things difficult for you?"

After solving the matter of the boy in white, the boy in white took the initiative to ask Gu 
Shaoyang.



Faced with the boy in white's concern, Gu Shaoyang answered truthfully. He did not hide anything, 
because so far, he has not encountered any difficult things.

"Don't worry, everything is fine for me in the organization, and I have met an old doctor. He can 
talk to the organization and help me secretly. Now I can complete the task more easily. I believe I 
will be able to control it soon."

"So you don't have to worry, I just need to take care of it and you can do it yourself."

After saying that, Gu Shaoyang patted the young man in white on the shoulder and said 
comfortingly. The two people quickly discussed the matter, and the greetings between them quickly 
ended.

"Okay, I'm going back first. Those who are watching you in the inn, I will make them disappear."

Finally, Gu Shaoyang left the room of the boy in white after saying that. After Gu Shaoyang left, the 
boy in white also lay back on the bed and closed his eyes quietly to rest.

Now that Gu Shaoyang came back, the boy in white also relaxed. No. No longer worried that 
someone would pose any threat to him.

The next day, when there was a little light in the morning, the boy in white was awakened by the 
sound of fighting in the inn.

The residents in the inn also heard the sound of fighting. They opened the door one after another 
and checked.

When the boy in white opened the door, what he saw was Gu Shaoyang and three or two men in 
black fighting together. Both sides looked like they would not give up.

Seeing the boy in white here, he instantly remembered He and Gu Shaoyang discussed the matter, 
but he did not expect that it would happen so quickly. The three or two men in black who were 
fighting with Gu Shaoyang intentionally or unintentionally tried to kill the young man in white 
when they discovered that the door of the young man in white was open. The place was changed to 
the door of the boy in white.



In this way, any harm they caused to the boy in white could be said to have been done accidentally 
during the fight.

But just when they wanted to push Gu Shaoyang towards the boy in white, Gu Shaoyang had 
already noticed their thoughts when they were led in the direction.

When Gu Shaoyang discovered their thoughts, he quickly blocked their way, turned around and 
came to the boy in white, and closed the door of the boy in white.

"Is it possible that you crazy people still want to accidentally hurt others?"Gu Shaoyang saw 
through their thoughts and directly stated their thoughts and what they were going to do.

When the people next to him heard Gu Shaoyang's words and the actions of the three or two men in 
black, they The melon-eating crowd immediately closed their doors to prevent accidental injury.

In this way, Gu Shaoyang successfully saved the boy in white from danger and made the men in 
black dare not approach him again. However, Gu Shaoyang was also punished for this. black people 
hit harder

"Since you have a Bodhisattva heart, then we will send the Buddha to the West!"

Seeing that his plan was disrupted by the people in front of him, one of the men in black said very 
fiercely, and several black people next to him also immediately heard what he said.
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They dealt a fatal blow to Gu Shaoyang, but because of the huge gap in strength between them and 
Gu Shaoyang, no matter how much strength or tricks they used, they could easily be resolved by Gu 
Shaoyang.

And compared to Gu Shaoyang's easy response, the three or two men in black who fought with Gu 
Shaoyang were not so relaxed.

I saw that their spiritual power was becoming more and more overdrawn, their breaths were a little 
disordered, and their movements gradually became a little sluggish.



When Gu Shaoyang saw that they were almost unable to hold on any longer, he immediately 
released Da Zhao and understood the lives of the three people in an instant.

The people who were hiding in the room and listening to the sound of fighting soon saw only a few 
drops of blood suddenly appear in front of their door, and a scream, and the sound of fighting 
outside the door stopped.

After the fighting stopped, the people hiding in the room cautiously tried to open the door to check 
what was going on outside.

And when they opened the door, they didn't see what the strong man had just seen, just the bodies 
of three or two men in black lying on the corridor.

And they also cautiously stepped forward to check the pulse of the men in black, only to find that 
they had already expired and died cruelly.

When they took another two steps forward and came to the railing in front of the corridor, when 
they looked down, they saw that the boy who had just fought with the man in black was sitting 
downstairs holding chopsticks, eating elegantly. with the food on the plate.

Looking at his elegant appearance, the melon-eating crowd could not associate what he said at this 
time with the man in black who had just fought.

It was as if the person just now and the person now were two completely different people. After the 
people saw Gu Shaoyang's true strength, they admired him very much. At the same time, they 
would only take a detour when passing by him..

He was afraid that if they said something wrong in front of him, they would die tragically like those 
men in black.

Only the boy in white saw the dead faces of the men in black, and looked at Gu Shaoyang with a 
look of admiration and pride.

Just when the rest of the melon-eaters were hiding far away, the boy in white went straight 
downstairs and sat on the table next to where Gu Shaoyang was.



"Shopkeeper, give me all the good wine and food in your store!"The young man in white said 
arrogantly. After the shopkeeper heard his instructions, he immediately came forward with the 
waiter and answered very respectfully.

"Well done! Guest!"When the shopkeeper got the request from the boy in white, he turned around 
and came to Gu Shaoyang's side.

It turned out that when Gu Shaoyang was fighting with the man in black, he damaged a lot of things 
in the inn, which made the already dilapidated inn. After going through a fight, he became even 
more precarious.

Among the people fighting, the only one left was Gu Shaoyang, so the shopkeeper could only ask 
him for compensation. Although Gu Shaoyang was very powerful, the shopkeeper still stepped 
forward.

"Sir, you just damaged the items in our store, which totaled about five taels of silver. Did you pay 
on credit? Or pay immediately?"

The shopkeeper stood in front of Gu Shaoyang and said very respectfully. At this time, Gu 
Shaoyang, who owed money, was like an uncle. As soon as he slightly raised his eyes to look at the 
shopkeeper, the shopkeeper felt a slight tingling on his spine. The chill.

In the end, under the threat from Gu Shaoyang's eyes, the shopkeeper had no choice but to leave 
angrily, but just when he turned around and took two steps, he was stopped again.

"etc!"

Gu Shaoyang's voice suddenly came to mind, and after the shopkeeper heard Gu Shaoyang's voice, 
he felt even more frightened. Oh my god, it couldn't be because I asked him for compensation just 
now, so now she wants my life! If I had known it , I stopped asking just now, it was unnecessary!

The shopkeeper who was stopped in his tracks now acted out a drama in his heart that Gu Shaoyang 
was about to wreak havoc on him. At this time, he did not dare to turn around. He didn't dare to 
move forward. For a moment, he stood on the same spot, not daring to move.



When the people next to him saw the shopkeeper's actions, they didn't dare to step forward to help. 
They all didn't know how the shopkeeper should take the next step. When taking action, Gu 
Shaoyang's voice sounded again

"Shopkeeper, shouldn't you come up to me and ask me when a customer calls me?"

At this time, Gu Shaoyang's voice suddenly became a little impatient, and the shopkeeper's ears 
were keenly aware of his emotions, so he immediately turned around, walked up to him with a 
smile on his face and asked

"Sir, do you have any instructions?"When he walked in front of Gu Shaoyang, the shopkeeper didn't 
dare to mention the compensation just now, as if the five taels of silver compensation he mentioned 
before was not what he said.

But the shopkeeper's silence didn't mean that Gu Shaoyang wouldn't mention it again. Then I heard 
Gu Shaoyang raise his eyes slightly, look at the shopkeeper and say

"Take a look at this thing. Can it withstand your five taels of silver compensation?"
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Then Gu Shaoyang took out a token from his arms and put it on the table. As soon as the 
shopkeeper saw the token, he immediately knelt down in front of Gu Shaoyang.

The people around saw the shopkeeper's actions and couldn't help but have doubts in their hearts, 
but their suspicions were all about whether Gu Shaoyang was threatening the shopkeeper, and the 
shopkeeper had to give in to him because he was worried about his own life.

Although the people around me saw the shopkeeper kneeling down to Gu Shaoyang, they all 
wanted to rush up to help the shopkeeper, but because of the huge difference in strength between 
themselves and Gu Shaoyang, they all just clenched their fists tightly in place. I feel resentful in my 
heart.

Gu Shaoyang was sitting at the table downstairs and could clearly feel the anger of the people 
upstairs, but he remained unmoved. He just calmly took the token on the table back and put it in his 
arms.

"So do I still need to compensate?"



Gu Shaoyang didn't pay attention to the mood of the people eating melons upstairs. He calmly 
picked up another piece of beef with his chopsticks, put it into his mouth and chewed it carefully, 
and then asked the shopkeeper. The shopkeeper heard

Gu Shaoyang's words , and the token he just saw, his head immediately swayed back and forth, his 
eyes full of respect.

"Of course I don't need you to compensate me. I just offended you blindly, so please don't mind."At 
this time, the shopkeeper's attitude towards Gu Shaoyang immediately changed 180 degrees, and 
the people upstairs were caught off guard.

"Then step back and don't tell others my identity."After listening to the shopkeeper's words, Gu 
Shaoyang took off his clothes and whispered in the shopkeeper's ear. After speaking, he continued 
to turn around and enjoy his food. After receiving Gu Shaoyang's instructions, the shopkeeper 
immediately stepped back respectfully. He never mentioned compensation, and the shopkeeper 
personally led people to dispose of the bodies of several men in black who died tragically after 
fighting with Gu Shaoyang upstairs.

This series of operations made the people upstairs feel helpless. , and after seeing this scene, they 
were even more afraid to go downstairs. They felt more and more that it was because Gu Shaoyang 
threatened the shopkeeper that the shopkeeper was so obedient.

But in fact, the reason why the shopkeeper listened to Gu Shaoyang so much was And also helped 
him get rid of the body of the man in black upstairs, not because he was threatened by Gu 
Shaoyang, but because Gu Shaoyang was his immediate boss.

And he also had the power to decide his life and death, so how could he Are you willing to die to 
anger him?

But Gu Shaoyang's identity cannot be exposed, so the shopkeeper treats Gu Shaoyang so 
respectfully, which makes others speculate too much.

In order not to cause too much trouble in the inn, Gu Shaoyang enjoys After finishing his food, he 
left the inn directly. After he left, a group of melon-eating people upstairs came downstairs in twos 
and threes. After the melon-eating people came downstairs, they did not dare to sit down where Gu 
Shaoyang had just done The people on the table were afraid that he had some quirks.



Just when Gu Shaoyang took a few steps out of the inn, a young man followed behind him. This 
young man was dressed in white and was the same man who had met Gu Shaoyang the night 
before. The young man in white who stayed in the same room.

After Gu Shaoyang noticed that she was behind him, he immediately found a quiet place and 
waited. Then he only saw the young man in white appear behind him.

"Brother Gu didn't expect you to act so quickly to deal with those people, but your actions so 
quickly will definitely arouse their suspicions, and you can deal with all three of them at once, 
which will inevitably attract more people.."

The young man in white who was following Gu Shaoyang made sure that no one was following 
him. After that, he said to Gu Shaoyang very solemnly. Gu Shaoyang also knew what he said, but he 
still did it:"Of course I know, but I stay here. The time is not long, so I can only make a quick 
decision, and I still have tasks on my own, so I can’t stay here too long."

"Now that I have killed all their people, they will definitely suspect that I have a relationship with 
you, so you must not have contact with me in the next few days, and I can only show that I am 
related to them. If there is a personal grudge between us, only in this way can their hatred be 
diverted to me, and you will be a little safer."

"And I have a ghost hunting organization protecting me, so even if they have objections, they can't 
do anything to me."

Gu Shaoyang is well aware of the benefits that the spirit hunting organization can bring to him, and 
he must maximize the benefits of his organization.

"Okay, Brother Gu, you must pay attention to safety in the spirit hunting organization."

As for Gu Shaoyang's affairs in the soul hunting organization, the boy in white couldn't help much, 
so he could only pray for him silently in his heart, hoping that he would not be discovered. After

Gu Shaoyang finished talking to the boy in white, he left first, Because he had a mission near the 
inn where the boy in white was.
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The young man in white slowly left that place after Gu Shaoyang left for a long time, so as not to be 
discovered that the two of them left in tandem.



Just after Gu Shaoyang left, the boy in white returned to the inn, but when he went back, he found 
that there were suddenly several more people in the inn.

And the auras of the suddenly added people were exactly the same as the aura of the man in black 
who died this morning. Instantly, the boy in white judged that these new people should be targeting 
the man in black. Cause of death, and himself.

And now that he has returned to the inn and been exposed in front of them, he will be in great 
danger this morning. If he is not careful, when he wakes up tomorrow morning, it will be his body 
that is being watched!

When he thought of this, the boy in white felt a little nervous, but he was not afraid.

Because although there are many new people in the inn now, their strength is not as good as his. 
They just have more people, so as long as he can detect them one by one, these people are not a 
problem for him.

And these people during this trip were not only targeting him, their targets were also the three dead 
men in black, so the new group of people would also go to avenge the three dead men in black.

After all, someone killed their companion, which is an insult and a challenge to them. If this matter 
spreads to the world, and others don't say a word after being bullied, then there is no telling what 
will happen in the future. How many people bullied them.

So in order to prevent such things from happening in the future, they must avenge the three men in 
black who have died. This is also an excuse for them to establish their power.

Therefore, the new group of people will definitely look for trouble with Gu Shaoyang. Behind Gu 
Shaoyang is the spirit hunting organization. Even if they want to establish their authority, they may 
not dare to attack him easily. In the end, they may only die at Gu Shaoyang's hands. in hand.

And in this way, their plan will not be realized, and the strategy will be ruined. At the same time, the 
whereabouts of the boy in white will be very safe, and he will be able to achieve multiple goals with 
one stone! Why not do it!



Therefore, Gu Shaoyang put a lot of thought into carrying this plan to the end. In order to make it 
perfect, he also made special assumptions in his mind, just to prevent his relationship with the boy 
in white from being exposed.

But the young man in white who had been hidden behind Gu Shaoyang had no idea about Gu 
Shaoyang's plan.

Soon, Gu Shaoyang returned to the inn, and the new people who entered the inn and wanted to take 
revenge on Gu Shaoyang became a little worried after seeing Gu Shaoyang's figure.

"Boss, this person’s strength seems to be above ours, and together we are probably not enough!"

One of the men belonging to the men in black faction said to their boss this time, and their boss also 
realized this.

Facing Gu Shaoyang, who was more powerful than them, the leader of the men in black couldn't 
help but frowned, but Soon he thought of a way to deal with Gu Shaoyang

"It's okay, I've thought of a way, come over here."

The men in black were sitting on the table in the lobby of the inn, surrounding the leader of the man 
in black and listening to his ideas. Gu Shaoyang was upstairs and just glanced at the group of 
people downstairs and felt their malice toward him. So Gu Shaoyang carefully released his spiritual 
consciousness to check their strength.

After confirming that the combined strength of a group of them was not as strong as him alone, Gu 
Shaoyang didn't take it to heart and turned around and returned to his room.

And when Gu Shaoyang turned around When he returned to his own room, the leader of the man in 
black downstairs was discussing with his men how they should deal with Gu Shaoyang.

And soon they came up with a method, and also implemented the specific operations on the person. 
In this way, they only had to wait for the opportunity to start taking action.

After Gu Shaoyang returned to the room upstairs, he began to close his eyes and rest. He had just 
gone out and completed some tasks, but he had not yet started taking action on the ultimate task.



Here , he plans to complete some small tasks first before doing the ultimate task, because in this 
way he can stay here longer and eliminate some dangers around the boy in white.

And he stays here with the boy in white. After completing the task, no one in the organization 
would doubt him, which was also a cover for him.

When Gu Shaoyang stayed in the inn with his eyes closed until dark, a group of men in black 
suddenly came to them downstairs. The room was ready to go.

Finally, at the order of the man in black, they jumped out of the window one after another, and 
surrounded the windows, doors, and roof of the room downstairs where Gu Shaoyang was.

They blocked all Gu Shaoyang's paths. They were surrounded, and then only one person was seen 
taking out a small wooden tube from his arms, and then slowly blowing air towards the window of 
the room where Gu Shaoyang was.
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And the thing the man in black was blowing was exactly a kind of drug!

Although Gu Shaoyang set up a barrier outside his room, and the ability of the man in black could 
not break the barrier he set up, the drug in the hands of the man in black could quietly break through 
Gu Shaoyang's barrier. world and enter his room.

Once this drug is taken by Gu Shaoyang, the drug's effect will react on his body. After the reaction, 
the man in black outside the door can control Gu Shaoyang.

However, because masters like Gu Shaoyang always have a layer of protective armor on their 
bodies, even if the man in black wants to control Gu Shaoyang to commit suicide, he cannot break 
through his own protective armor.

Therefore, they could only control Gu Shaoyang to open the door, and then follow them to the 
countryside far away from the inn. In this way, even if someone found Gu Shaoyang's body the next 
day, no one would notice that it was the man in black who did it.

And soon, Gu Shaoyang was controlled by them to the suburbs.



Seeing the progress going so smoothly, the people in black thought that Gu Shaoyang was doomed 
today and that they could complete their task quickly. However, just when they surrounded Gu 
Shaoyang and prepared to attack him, Gu Shaoyang suddenly woke up.

When he saw that all the big moves of the men in black were about to fall on Gu Shaoyang, he 
suddenly opened his eyes and dodged their attacks with a teleport.

But although Gu Shaoyang dodged their attack, they failed to stop in time, and their camp against 
Gu Shaoyang still formed a circle, so for a while, the tricks they used were about to fall on their 
own people..

At the critical moment, the people in black had no choice but to flee in panic when they saw the 
cruel attack they were about to face.

But because they had just surrounded Gu Shaoyang very tightly, there was almost no gap between 
them. As they fled in all directions, many people inevitably bumped into each other.

And just when they collided together and tried to avoid the vicious attacks released by their 
teammates, it was already too late, so soon only a few squeals were heard, and all the people in 
black were hit, and it was their own ruthless attacks. trick.

On the other side, after escaping, Gu Shaoyang squatted under a tree to watch the show. In fact, he 
knew it clearly from the time when the people in black were discussing the plan downstairs.

And now he is just cooperating with them.

When the people in black were still discussing the plan at the inn, Gu Shaoyang discovered their 
malicious intent and began to eavesdrop on their conversation when he entered the room. Gu 
Shaoyang used his hearing to its maximum effect, so he He heard clearly the plan of the man in 
black.

After he learned of their plan and deployment, Gu Shaoyang was ready to take advantage of the 
situation, go with the flow and benefit others.

That's why when the people in black blew the drug into Gu Shaoyang's room, it was so smooth 
when they wanted to control Gu Shaoyang.



Because all of this was done with Gu Shaoyang's tacit approval.

And when Gu Shaoyang watched several of them attack each other, Gu Shaoyang did not forget to 
touch up the blows at the side.

Some of the people in black were dying after enduring the harsh attacks from their teammates, but 
they could barely recover without Gu Shaoyang's last hit.

However, Gu Shaoyang was not a good person. When he saw that they were so weak, he stood up 
directly. He only released a little bit of the pressure around him, but the men in black who had 
already lost their blood could no longer hold on and fell to the ground. Sorry.

Only the leader of the men in black was left in the end.

Only then did the leader of the men in black realize that all their plans were under Gu Shaoyang's 
control, and that it was himself, the leader of the men in black, who had caused this situation.

Looking at the lifeless teammates lying on the ground around him, the leader of the man in black 
felt very sad and blamed himself. When he turned his gaze to Gu Shaoyang, his eyes were full of 
resentment.

"It's you! all because of you! It’s because of you that my teammates became like this! Just wait for 
me!"

At this time, the leader of the man in black was already dizzy with anger. He attributed all the faults 
to Gu Shaoyang. However, Gu Shaoyang did not refute what the leader of the man in black said. He 
just stepped forward lightly and walked towards the man in black. The leader was approaching.

Just when Gu Shaoyang was about to approach the leader of the men in black, he suddenly picked 
up the member of the men in black who was closest to the leader of the men in black, and turned his 
face, which was very painful when he died, towards the leader of the men in black. Head man

"Blame me? Look at your teammate, how painful it was when he died! And all this is actually 
because of you!"



"This is all because you have made your own decisions and thought of all these ways to think that 
you can deal with me. But in fact, don’t you know that I am so powerful that I can’t hear your 
discussion? Don't you know your conspiracy?"
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Gu Shaoyang looked at the man in black who was lying on the ground dying, with a very mocking 
expression. After the man in black heard Gu Shaoyang's words, the grief and self-blame in his eyes 
changed instantly.

After Gu Shaoyang saw through the inner thoughts of the man in black, he immediately turned his 
head away and did not dare to look into his eyes again.

When Gu Shaoyang saw his actions, he confirmed his own thoughts

"Haha, it seems that what I said is right. There must be some hatred between you and the other men 
in black, or you are jealous of them, so you use this opportunity to kill them."

"But you didn't expect that your method was too clumsy and could easily be seen through."

Gu Shaoyang flipped up his hair, put down the dead man in black he was carrying, and took a step 
forward to squat in front of the only living leader of the man in black.

Then he moved his face and forced He looked at himself, and at the same time, he forcefully pulled 
up the hand he had secretly hidden behind his back.

"how? Your secret has been exposed and you still want to tell your organization about the 
unfinished business of your mission?"

Gu Shaoyang took out the signal transmission fruit from the hand of the man in black, and played 
with it while staring at the man in black to see his expression.

And the man in black noticed that his own movements were After being exposed, I was not only 
worried.

How could this person be so smart and know what I was thinking!



Could it be that his strength is not what I saw on the surface! Could it be that he was hiding his 
strength!

No! What if? Is this really the case, then I have to report to the organization, otherwise more and 
more people will come to die! The leader of the man in black is currently thinking about how to 
report to his organization about Gu Shaoyang..

But the next second, Gu Shaoyang directly broke the thought in his heart, and asked him to just wait 
for this thought to die.

I saw Gu Shaoyang directly stretched out a hand and hit the neck of the man in black fiercely. With 
one chop, there was only a cracking sound of the spine on the neck.

The body supported by the random man in black fell directly to the ground, motionless. After 
completely dealing with the group of men in black, Gu Shaoyang also stood up. He left here and 
returned to the inn.

When Gu Shaoyang returned to the inn room, there was already a white figure in his room - the boy 
in white

"Is it solved?"Hearing the figure of the door being opened, the young man in white in the room 
immediately composed a composition. After seeing his figure, Gu Shaoyang immediately closed the 
door behind him and arranged a barrier.

"Why did you come here?"Seeing the figure of the boy in white, Gu Shaoyang's tone could not help 
but be a bit reproachful.

Although the boy in white always entered his room before, the situation is different now.

There were not so many people staring at him before, but now there are many pairs of Eyes are 
always watching his whereabouts, so if the person who is watching him knows that the boy in white 
came to his room, both Gu Shaoyang and him will be in great trouble.

"It's okay, don't worry, those people were all lured away by you. They should be here to test this 
time. Those men in black are all the people this time."



The young man in white has figured out the details clearly, so he would be so bold. Otherwise, even 
if he was given a hundred courages, he would not dare to joke with his own life and Gu Shaoyang's 
life.

"So what are you doing here? What's going on?"After listening to the words of the young man in 
white, Gu Shaoyang felt less blamed and his mood calmed down.

"I’m just here to tell you to go back quickly. If you stay here all the time, they may be 
disadvantageous to you. If you really anger them by then, I’m afraid they won’t care about the 
organization behind you."

The boy in white doesn't understand the thoughts of the people who are chasing him, but he can 
probably guess what they are thinking about the people behind them. That's why now he specially 
came to remind Gu Shaoyang, because they were all pretending during the day He didn't seem to 
know each other, so he could only contact him at night.

As for this matter, Gu Shaoyang knew that it would be safer to leave early, so he came to tell him 
tonight

"Okay, I know, but they are not scary to me yet. Even if I want to leave, I have to complete the final 
task."

After Gu Shaoyang learned the information told by the boy in white, he had to advance his plan.

At least he planned to destroy the organization of this group of men in black. But now after hearing 
the words of the boy in white, Gu Shaoyang felt a little difficult.

So he felt a little difficult. He was going to complete his mission within the spirit hunting 
organization first, and then go back directly.

He would wait until he was in a high position in the spirit hunting organization and had a certain 
degree of control and could mobilize the power of the organization to help the boy in white before 
he came to see Bai Yi. Young man.

This way he no longer has anything to worry about.
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