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Suddenly, Megan held Finneas by the hand. “Finneas, what I’ve shared with you is the truth. If I’ve said a 
single lie, let me die a terrible death. I beg you. Can you believe me this once, please?” 
 
Gazing at Megan, Finneas felt he was indeed hurt by Selena. “What we need to do now is to cooperate 
and matchmake Merry with Pierre. Once Merry is married to Pierre, we’ll have the Fowler Family as our 
patron, and by then, we don’t need to be afraid of her!” 
 
Finneas contemplated Megan’s words and thought, Selena is now officially together with Pierre, and 
she’s telling me we have to matchmake Pierre with Merry? But how? No… Wait a second! If Pierre finds 
out about Selena’s past in Springvale, he’ll certainly break up with her for the sake of his own reputation 
and dignity. This means—there’s still a chance! 
 
After thinking it through, Finneas finally nodded. Seeing that, Megan’s eyes welled up with tears of joy 
as she nestled up against Finneas and started sobbing. 
 
Selena Yard, just you wait. I’ll surely bring you down. 
 
Instead of dwelling on the incident wherein Pierre had bought the expensive jade bracelet for Meredith 
at the auction, Selena was busy preparing for the upcoming press conference of the clothing brand CiCi. 
This would be the first official collaboration event between JNS Corporation and Fowler Corporation. 
 
Previously, there was no clear evidence about the collaboration between the two companies, but now, 
they could finally make an official announcement. 
 
Obviously, this was crucial for Selena because this would be JNS Corporation’s biggest leap ever, as well 
as their first step in advancing their market to Astoria. Hence, everything had to go according to plan. 
 
This time, the press conference was held in a venue solely used by Fowler Corporation only. It was no 
news that the Fowler Corporation would rarely open up their venue for others. For that reason, 
everyone could tell how highly the Fowler Corporation thought of this press conference. 
 
At this moment, Selena was so busy that she personally looked into every single detail at the venue, in 
fear that there would be any accident. 
 
In order to express JNS Corporation’s sincerity, Selena personally came over to attend the press 
conference. 
 
By now, most of the mass media of Digton City had gathered around the venue, seated according to the 
arrangement of the event organizer. 
 
Meanwhile, at the back stage, Selena was running a final check with a few people in charge. 
 
“Who’s the person in charge from Fowler Corporation?” asked Selena. 
 
In fact, Pierre was the one who was responsible for this project ever since the beginning, so naturally, it 
would be best if he could personally attend this press conference himself. 
 



 
“It’ll be Director Lewis.” 
 
Upon hearing that reply, Selena couldn’t help but feel a bit disappointed. Then again, she figured it was 
only right that he wouldn’t attend such an event personally, for it wouldn’t befit a person of his worth. 
 
Before she could think of anything else, the emcee announced that the press conference was about to 
start. 
 
Dressed in a black professional corporate attire, Selena looked absolutely stunning as she walked up the 
stage confidently. 
 
“Hello everyone, I’m Selena Yard, the president of JNS Corporation. I’m delighted to have your 
acquaintance here today in attending the official launch of our new clothing brand CiCi. This brand is a 
special collaboration between JNS Corporation and LAYA, the subsidiary company of Fowler 
Corporation. Most of you are aware that Forever Gown, being the subsidiary company of JNS 
Corporation, focuses on marketing wedding gowns and evening gowns, and we have yet to venture into 
daily wear…” 
 
Without a warning, a piercing noise sounded during the speech, causing everyone to cover their ears 
instinctively. 
 
When Selena realized that her microphone wasn’t functioning, she signaled the staff below the stage to 
check on it. 
 
Just then, strange images started appearing on the big screen behind Selena! 
 


