
《Billionaire CEOWon't Leave》
Chapter 110

Luo Luo saw kangmobei, and first humed quietly, turning Xiao Pang's back to
kangmobei. Kangmobei stood patiently a few meters away from him, waiting quietly.

Bai nianxi smelled the smell from the north of Kangmo, with a faint taste of fatigue.

This confrontation didn't last long. Luo Luo was defeated first, turned around and
rushed to Bai nianxi's leg.

Waving two hands for a hug, "Xiao Xi, Xiao Xi."

Bai nianxi stoops to hold him up and looks at Luo Luo. His heart is soft again.

Luo Luo buries his head in Bai nianxi's arms and greedily sucks Bai nianxi's fragrance.
He is really afraid that mommy will never come back and that he will never see her
again.

Thinking about this, I felt wronged and cried.

Even cry is forbearance, dead frown, big eyes full of tears, eyes are red, that lovely
mouth tightly together, very wronged.

Bai nianxi's heart is painful and painful, holding Luo Luo gently shaking to coax him,
"baby doesn't cry, baby doesn't cry."

Conmobei didn't speak. He looked at Lolo's eyes gradually deeper. His eyes were as
deep as the sea. He was not only afraid, but also afraid.

"You can't do today's things any more. You can't do it once. Do you hear me?"

Luo Luo will cry tears cross flow face buried in white Nian Xi's neck, did not pay
attention to the words of Kang Mo north.

"Do you hear me?" Conmobei asked again, with anger in his words.

Bai nianxi touched Luo Luo's head and gently advised him, "Luo Luo, tell Dad you
heard me."



Lolo nodded his head.

The eye son of Kang Mo North hung down, returned to own room.

Kangmobei seems to sleep very deep, and Bai nianxi doesn't disturb her.

After lulling Lolo to sleep, Bai nianxi took a book and went to the sofa downstairs to
read it. It's ten o'clock in the evening. It's neither early nor too late.

These two days her rest is not enough, said she did not mean to be false, had such a big
thing, how can still be safe. Now I can't sleep much, so I just pour myself another glass
of red wine.

A message came, and Bai nianxi opened it to see it. It was Lu Yichen.

"Did you sleep?"

"Not yet. What's up?" Bai nianxi came back.

Lu Yichen on the other side of the screen seemed to hesitate for a moment, "I've seen
what happened on the Internet. Are you ok?"

"Well, it's OK."

Lu: "that's good."

Bai: "thank you for your concern."

Lu: "look what you say."

After a moment of silence, the chat seemed to break down. Bai nianxi always felt that
Lu Yichen had something else to say. He asked, "you're not looking for me just to ask
this, are you?"

Lu Yichen looks at the message from Bai nianxi on the mobile phone screen and
laughs. Yes, if there is nothing else, how can he disturb her for no reason?

Knowing that she is surrounded by the omnipotent komobei, where will she be bullied?

Lu: "well, I want to tell you something about the past."

Bai: "what happened before?"



Lu: "do you remember what happened at Huang Ruoling's wedding last time?"

Of course, she remembered, not only remembered, but also impressed.

Lu: "why didn't you tell me what happened in those years?"

Bai nianxi is a little strange, "what's the matter?"

"The necklace thing," he said

Bai nianxi suddenly thought about the necklace. That's what she was puzzled about. In
her memory, it didn't happen. If it wasn't for the dream, she didn't even have the
slightest impression.

Thinking about this, Lu Yichen, who is opposite, has sent another message, "when I
heard this, I was shocked. I didn't go to Xie Shiyan because of my family. I didn't
expect that such a thing would happen. Why didn't you tell me when you were
wronged?"

Bai nianxi was dull for a moment and didn't answer.

Probably because he found something wrong with his tone, Lu Yichen added: "after
you left that day, I asked some former classmates, and they said that you were pulled
to the police station at that time..."

At this point, Lu did not go on.

Once a classmate told him that a boy came over at that time. Finally, Bai nianxi left
with the boy.

He thought, was that the time when she and the boy were together? If he had been
there at that time, would he be the one standing beside her now?

But it didn't come out after all.

Just asked: "later, how did you deal with it?"

Later? Later she didn't know. Because she didn't remember it at all. If it was like Lu
Yichen's saying, who was the boy in the dream?

"Who did you ask?""A few former classmates." Lu Yichen silent, some afraid of Bai
nianxi misunderstanding, explained: "I believe you, I believe you will not do to steal
the necklace."



"How many former classmates? Which ones exactly? "

Lu Yichen thought about it and gave several names.

After listening to Bai nianxi, he fell into meditation.

These people mentioned by Lu Yichen have nothing to do with her. If they are like Liu
Qinglan, she can still think that they collude to frame her, but the students mentioned
by Lu Yichen have no need to do so.

That is to say, they are telling the truth. At the banquet of teacher Xie, she stole Huang
Ruoling's necklace and was taken to the police station. It really happened.

But why, she doesn't remember?

Not only don't remember, even in her memory, it's not the same thing at all?

In her memory, after graduating from the college entrance examination, she broke up
with the Bai family, went abroad, and met Jiang zhiang

Lu Yichen said that they had not seen each other in five years, but according to her
memory, it should have been six years.

Reality and memory, which is wrong? Why did it go wrong?

That dream, strange dream, has it ever happened? If so, who is the boy?

Lu Yichen waited for a long time, but he didn't wait for the news from Bai nianxi. He
just thought that he had asked too many questions, which made Bai nianxi unhappy.

After thinking about it, I sent the last message.

"Nianxi, I'm sorry. I didn't mean anything else. I just wanted to understand what
happened in those years. I didn't know about that all the time, and I didn't hear from
you. I was very surprised when I heard about it at Huang Ruoling's wedding last time.
I'm just sad, I didn't know you were still suffering from these grievances at that time
It's getting late. Let's have a rest early. "

The hint of the news wakes Bai nianxi from his meditation. He takes a look at the
news from Lu Yichen. Bai nianxi doesn't know what to say.

How can she blame him? She's just at a loss.

It seems that her fate is not in her own hands, but can be arranged at will.



"Well, don't think about it. I don't blame you. You should rest early."

After turning off his cell phone, Bai nianxi poured himself a glass of red wine.
Somehow, the more he drank, the more sober he was.

There was a sound of walking upstairs. Bai nianxi looked up and found that
kangmobei had woken up and was standing on the fence.

One hand in the abdomen, heavy steps down the stairs, pale.
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