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The Kang family has been falling out these days.

Since the affair between Su Yihao and Zhai Kexin broke out, Kang Xinyue chose to
forgive Su Yihao, but her temperament changed greatly.

Kang Xinyue was very angry about the bar. That day, he let Su Yihao kneel outside for
a night. The next day, he found that Su Yihao was gone and he couldn't get in touch
with Su Yihao's people.

Kang Xinyue thinks that Su Yihao can't bear her and runs away. These days, she has
been sending people to look for Su Yihao.

But Su Yihao is lying in the ward that Shen Hedan sends people to monitor. How can
he be found by Kang Xinyue's people.

Unable to find Su Yihao, Kang Xinyue makes trouble at Kang's home.

Kangmobei received a call from the Kang family. Originally, he thought it was the old
man who urged him because of his marriage. Kangmobei asked people to hang up
directly. Unexpectedly, he called several times later.

Kangmobei is sitting in the office. Secretary Xing has come to repay him several times.
Finally, kangmobei asks Secretary Xing to get through.

"Hello." Conmber's voice was cold.

"Mobei." From the other side came the voice of the old man, which seemed to be
mixed with several quarrels, like Kang Xinyue's voice.

Kang Mobei said he was listening.

Kang Taiye said it again, the main meaning is to let Kang Mobei use his power to help
Kang Xinyue find Su Yihao.



It would be much easier to find Su Yihao with the help of the power of komobei.

After hearing Kang's request, Kang Mobei frowned slightly. Of course, he knew what
Su Yihao was doing and where he was.

Agreed to come down, conmobei directly came to the hospital.

The injury on Bai nianxi's body is not very serious. Some of them are scratched. It's
better to recover slowly.

"Come home with me tonight."

As soon as Kangmo North opened her mouth, Bai nianxi's eyebrows began to frown.
The two words of Kang family really made her have a headache when she heard them.

"Why do you suddenly say you want to go back?"

Looking at Bai nianxi, Kang Mobei explained, "Su Yihao has disappeared. They asked
me to help them find him."

Mentioning Su Yihao, Bai nianxi's eyebrows are deeper.

The old accounts between her and Su Yihao have not been settled properly, but now
Su Yihao is still in a coma, she can't get along with a half dead man, can she?

Kangmobei held out his hand to hold Bai nianxi's hand and said, "I will introduce you
to you as my wife when I go back this time."

Bai nianxi was stunned.

"As for Su Yihao, you can say it if you like." Kangmobei looks at Bai nianxi. He
respects her ideas.

He knew that there should be a history between Bai nianxi and Su Yihao that he didn't
know. Bai nianxi never mentioned it to him, so he didn't ask.

Bai nianxi didn't remember before, but now she remembered how to face Su Yihao.
She decided for herself.

As long as she knows, he will always stand behind her.

Bai nianxi is silent, thinking of her and Su Yihao, as well as all the causes and
consequences of that year.



Just as he thought about it, the phone in conmbe's pocket rang.

Conmobei got through, listened to the words on the phone, his face suddenly moved,
and then looked at Bai nianxi.

Bai nianxi noticed something and looked at it.

"Well, I see." With that, he hung up the phone and said to Bai nianxi, "Su Yihao is
awake."

Su Yihao wakes up.

"Isn't Kang Xinyue looking for Su Yihao?" Bai nianxi looked at Kang Mobei, his eyes
slightly condensed, "it's better to take him here tonight."

Five years ago, it's always said, isn't it? What we should have done five years ago is
still something we should continue to do, isn't it?

Kangmobei looked at Bai nianxi's expression and narrowed his eyes slightly.

Kangmo north to white nianxi choose a soft fitting clothes, will not affect the wound
on the body, and let the makeup artist to white nianxi into a simple and elegant
makeup.

In the hospital for a few days, Bai nianxi has not applied powder, although also
good-looking, but always too plain, such a dress, the whole person immediately bright
and beautiful.

In the evening, conmber took Lolo with him.

Two people follow beside Bai nianxi, whose spirit is like the left and right Dharma
protector of Bai nianxi.

Su Yihao was sent by Shen Hedan's people. When he arrived, because he had just
woken up, he looked pale and haggard.

Bai nianxi and Su Yihao just met at the gate of Kang's house.

When Su Yihao saw Bai nianxi, his pale face was even more white. Bai nianxi came
near with a skirt, raised the corner of his eyes, and said with a smile: "Mr. Su's
expression is like seeing a ghost?"

"You..."



"Hello." Bai nianxi stretched out his hand, "Su Yian."

Su Yihao shivered all over.

Bai nianxi's smile is beautiful, but it makes people feel cold."It seems that Mr. Lai Su
is flying on the branch, and he is not willing to pay attention to my once poor old
acquaintance."

Bai nianxi took back his hand and restrained his smile. His eyes were indifferent and
he looked sad. "But brother an, how can you do this to me?"

Kang Mo north also leads Luo Luo to stand behind Bai Nian Xi, smell speech two
people is cast to come over four sharp eyes, as if want to put Su Yi Hao's strangled
ashes into smoke.

Kangmobei's eyebrows are affected by the killing intention. It turns out that Su Yihao
is the one who whispers in his dream, brother an?

Su Yihao's Adam's apple rolled and said in a low voice, "Bai nianxi, what are you
doing?"

"What do you say?" Bai nianxi takes a look at Su Yihao. The look in his eyes makes
people despair.

Kangmo goes to the north and walks to Bai nianxi. Bai nianxi says nothing more. He
puts his hand into Kangmo's arm and goes inside.

Su Yihao, Kang Xinyue.

Oh, what a nice couple.

Bai nianxi went in first. This time, it was different from the past. Although he was still
unwilling, Bai nianxi came in with his head high.

The power of hatred is infinite.

Kang Xinyue sees Su Yihao coming up behind Bai nianxi, and immediately pours on
him and roars: "Su Yihao!"

Go to Su Yihao in front of, in front of the public is a slap in the face, "these days you
go where! You're leaving me, aren't you! Isn't it? "

"No, it's not." Su Yihao repeatedly denied.



"Then what did you do?" Kang Xinyue stares at Su Yihao and insists that he give an
explanation.

Su Yihao lowered his head and didn't know what to say.

Bai nianxi suddenly said: "why is Miss Kang aggressive? Mr. Su just had a car
accident and stayed in the hospital bed for a few days."

"Car accident?" Kang Xinyue twisted her eyebrows and found that Su Yihao was
really pale and haggard. She turned to Bai nianxi and said, "how do you know?"

"Of course I know." Bai nianxi said calmly, "after all, Mr. Su, in order to hold me, I
had a car accident."

All the people in the Kang family were surprised.

Hijacking?!
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