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Kangmobei shrinks his brows and asks the police officer to fix his position. He turns
around and rushes out. Bai nianxi also runs out behind kangmobei.

Lolo suddenly appeared, I don't know whether it is good or bad.

If he stays by Jiang zhiang's side honestly, Jiang zhiang won't hurt him. At least, he
won't be in danger for the time being.

But now he escaped by himself, which is very likely to infuriate Jiang zhiang. Luo Luo
can't run away from Jiang zhiang. If Jiang zhiang catches up with Luo Luo, what will
he do in a rage

It's too much to think about!

Conmobei used the fastest speed to get to the area where Lolo was located, and the
police officers of the police station also ran over.

There are really few people around here. Luoluo runs all the way, because he is afraid
to attract Jiang zhiang, he does not dare to cry for help, so he can only hide.

But he was caught by Jiang zhiang just before the arrival of Kangmo north.

Jiang zhiang's eyes are full of anger, but a four-year-old dares to play with him
wantonly!

The baseball bat in his hand would like to wave to Lolo like this.

It's better to die!

However, the distant sound of the siren made him stop. Conmobei had already chased
him.

In his mind, Luo Luo can't die. Luo Luo is in his hands and can be used.

Not far away is an abandoned hospital building.



The top of an abandoned hospital building.

Jiang zhiang is holding Luo Luo in his hand. Luo Luo is put on the edge of the roof
guardrail by him. When the wind blows, he is tottering.

Kangmo north and Bai nianxi stand on the opposite side not far away. They dare not
move. For fear that Jiang zhiang's mood will be unstable, they throw Lolo down from
the roof of the hospital.

The police and doctors behind him stood behind him with guns in their hands, but they
did not dare to shoot at will.

Because Luoluo is in the hands of Jiang zhiang. If Jiang zhiang falls down, Luoluo
will only fall off the roof.

The sky is still under light rain, the whole a city, gray.

The rain hit people, piercing cold.

All of them didn't take umbrellas. They were drenched in the rain and were soaked by
the cold rain.

"Jiang zhiang, what do you want?" When Bai nianxi opened his mouth, his voice was
hoarse and trembling.

"I told you what I wanted, didn't I? Bai nianxi, what I want is you, what I want is you!
"

Now that things have come to this point, Jiang zhiang doesn't want to hide his
emotions any more, so he just yells out directly.

"Me?" Bai nianxi's eyes congealed, "why? Because of love? "

"Otherwise?" Jiang zhiang asked, "don't you know if I love you?"

In the cold wind, Bai nianxi's voice sounded extremely cold, "do you love me or not,
you should ask yourself, this question, you know best. Jiang zhiang, what do you want
from me? "

Jiang zhiang was stunned.

She asked him, what do you want?

In the past, Bai nianxi would not ask like this. Looking at Bai nianxi's eyes at the



moment, there is a kind of piercing indifference and deep desolation.

She, remember?

"Four years ago, you suddenly appeared at my side and took me away. In these four
years, you never told me what happened before. Jiang zhiang, what do you want?
What do you want from me? "

This question, she has been puzzled, knowing that Jiang zhiang has a purpose to
approach her, but what is the reason for him to stay with her for four years?

Jiang zhiang was stunned, "do you remember?"

Bai nianxi nodded, "I remember."

It turned out that she had all remembered.

Just, looking at the current situation, Bai nianxi doesn't seem to know about the Shen
family? Maybe Shen Hedan didn't tell her?

Otherwise, others may not be able to guess, but how could she not guess the purpose
of his doing so?

However, one side of the north, the eyes are clear.

After Bai nianxi told him everything that had happened before, and he knew the
relationship between Shen Hedan and Bai nianxi, he had already guessed the cause and
effect.

Conmobei's eyes were cold, with a touch of irony, "do you think you can climb up the
Shen family if you catch her?"

Jiang zhiang's body is slightly stiff, and his eyes are shocked when he looks at
kangmobei. Will kangmobei know?

"Four years, what a big game." Kangmobei's face slightly raised, against the cold rain,
even more chilly, "Jiang zhiang, you are really patient, full four years, waiting for
you?"

He didn't expect that his overall plan had been seen through by commobei. In the great
shock, Jiang zhiang's steps moved slightly, and his whole body was in a flash, as if he
was about to fall downstairs.Luo Luo in the hand also follows to shake together, see of
person a burst of fear.



Bai nianxi called out directly, "Lolo!"

Originally, Bai nianxi didn't know what kangmobei was saying. The meaning of the
words made her feel strange.

But Jiang zhiang's reaction can't tolerate her to think much, Luo Luo's situation is very
dangerous now!

Fortunately, Jiang zhiang just shook a little, and then immediately stabilized himself.

What if conmbe knows? In a word, at this point, some things should not be done and
have already been done, so we have to work hard and go on.

But Bai nianxi, also sooner or later must know all these.

Yes, he used to play this game of chess for four years. In this game, he exhausted his
patience and saw that everything was about to come naturally, but he failed in the end.

Bai nianxi went to kangmobei again,

what is his forbearance and patience in recent years?

"Mommy..." Lolo is shaking in the rain. Originally, he was wearing thin clothes. When
he was drenched in the rain, the whole person was shivering.

The usual white skin is exposed at the moment. It looks very pale, and the pink on the
face is all faded. The whole person is pale like a lifeless doll.

"Lolo is still a child, you let him go!" The pain in Bai nianxi's heart is very deep. All
this should not involve Luo Luo. Luo Luo is so small that he has no reason to bear the
pain.

"Don't you have a request? Don't you have something to talk about? I, I'll follow you. "
Bai nianxi is good at patting his heart, "I can be your hostage, you let Lolo go."

Jiang zhiang shakes his head. He is not stupid.

Now he, as long as he let go of Lolo, waiting for him, is death.

"Jiang zhiang! You can't do that! Lolo is innocent Bai nianxi couldn't calm down at all.
She couldn't bear to look at Lolo again. Every time she looked, it was like someone
was picking out her heart with a knife.

A warm hand caresses Bai nianxi's shoulder and holds her to his arms.



Como turned north and said softly, "Lolo will be OK."

But the voice sounds cold without a trace of temperature, only the deep eye color
reveals his fear under anger.

Finally, Jiang zhiang spoke out his conditions, "I want you to go with me, I want you
to be with me, marry me, and spend the next life with me, Bai nianxi, can you do it?"

Jiang zhiang's smile, son and man, Bai nianxi, which one would you choose?
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