
《Billionaire CEOWon't Leave》
Chapter 93

Bai nianxi is stunned. He raises his head and shakes a portrait of a person in his mind.
Then he automatically searches for a name that matches the person in front of him.

"Huang Ruoling?"

"It's me," Huang said with a smile A hand stretched out, and then put on the arm of the
man around, "Lin you, remember, this is the white night in those years."

Bai nianxi helps the forehead, this is exactly what evil fate, eat a meal here,
unexpectedly still can meet Lin you and Huang Ruoling this pair!

Seeing the way that Bai nianxi and Huang Ruoling know each other, both kangmobei
and musili seem to have raised a little interest.

When Lin you sees Bai nianxi, his expressionless face suddenly moves. How can he
not remember Bai nianxi? This is the girl who loved him to death.

Although he was the school grass, he never thought that his personality charm would
be so great.

All of a sudden, there is a kind of pride that people prefer. Lin You's face is a bit
deliberately reserved and arrogant.

Huang Ruoling tilted her head slightly and leaned on Lin you, as if she was acting like
a coqueter. "Two days ago, she asked Lu Yichen to contact you and send you an
invitation to my marriage with Lin you. As a result, today Lu Yichen told me that you
didn't have time and didn't come."

With a sigh, "we sincerely want to invite you."

This saying, anyone who knows a little bit about that year should think that Bai nianxi
deliberately evades his beloved man's wedding, right?

With a smile, "I'm really sorry that I have no time because I have a job."

"In fact, Lin you and I hope you can be there. After all..." Huang Ruoling looks at Lin



you next to her with a different meaning. She wants to stop talking.

Bai nianxi prayed in her heart, my aunt, don't poke out the misunderstanding of that
year. The great God of kangmobei is still around her!

Mu Sili was intrigued, and his eyes were full of the desire for gossip.

"After all, you like Lin you for so many years..."

As soon as Huang Ruoling's unkind words came out, Bai nianxi began to shiver.

Sure enough, the central air-conditioning system of commobei began to refrigerate
again.

Mu Sili was stunned for a moment, then looked at the icy face of Kang Mobei, and
tried to restrain his smile.

"I really..."

"If you don't have time, I'll give you a holiday."

Kangmo north cold mouth, suddenly blocked Bai nianxi's words.

My God! What's wrong with conmber! She said no time not to go, he will give her a
holiday!

When Kang Mobei opens her mouth, Huang Ruoling notices that Kang Mobei, who
had only focused on Bai nianxi before, is now noticing that he is a man whose
appearance, behavior and bearing are far more than ordinary people.

And this man, still standing beside Bai nianxi?

I don't know what it's like.

Bai nianxi's participation in the wedding has become a foregone conclusion. Musi Li
also decides to step in and happily agrees to Huang Yaohua's invitation.

"Miss Bai, see you the day after tomorrow." Mousse half leans in front of his Ferrari
car body, saying goodbye to Bainian Xi in a jubilant tone.

Bai nianxi resisted the impulse of going to Bai for a moment, and got into the car of
kangmobei.

After komobi's car drove away, Musi leans on the side of the car and looks at Bai



nianxi's direction. His eyes become confused.

Casually lit a cigarette, smoke, no one can guess what he was thinking.

Bai nianxi probably won't believe it. He's in Mu's family, but he's famous for his
decisiveness.

Conmobei didn't drive home directly, but drove to the riverside.

Kangmo North's speed was very fast, and the windows on both sides were rolled down.
Bai nianxi was sitting on the front passenger's seat, and his whole body was about to
be blown into a mess.

"Kang Don't drive Quick... " The words were drowned in the wind.

Conmbers had no intention of slowing down. The riverside road was used as a racing
track because there were very few people coming and going.

In his spare time, he will also take part in some car races. He is familiar with the road
conditions.

"Kang Stop... "

Kangmobei took a look at Bai nianxi on the co driver. The whole person had been
tossed to madness by the extremely fast speed.

Release the accelerator, turn to the brake, a sharp screech of the brake sound, the car
suddenly stopped.

White read night slow over God, wheezing breath.

Conmobei stepped down from the car and went to the guardrail on the Bank of the
river. He put his hands in his trousers pocket. It was already dark. However, city a is a
city that never sleeps. The colorful night light of the city still shines brightly in the sky.

Commo faces the river to the north, and the cool river wind blows on his face.

The silhouette under the night light is still handsome, tall and upright, and noble.

Bai nianxi stubbornly resisted the impulse to vomit. After recovering, he went to
kangmobei and said, "Mr. Kang, what are you doing here?"Conmobei looked back a
little, "I'll show you the scenery."

Good end, why take her to see the scenery, Bai nianxi heart abdominal Fei, but still go



to the north side of the station.

Conmber squinted at her from the top. "Is it good?"

How dare she not sell his face as president of Kangda? Bai nianxi nodded carelessly,
"good looking."

"Where is it good?"

Bai nianxi said: "you look."

……

It seems that for the first time in his life, conmberg was choked.

Then, Bai nianxi saw that a dense red appeared from the white face of kangmobei, and
then spread to the ears of kangmobei.

Bai nianxi pointed to Kang Mobei's face and stammered: "Mr. Kang, are you
blushing?"

"No

"Really Bai nianxi stretched out his hand to touch Kang Mobei's face, "it's still very
hot! You are blushing

Conmber turned his head a little annoyed, "illusion."

No way! Even if the sky is dark, she can still see clearly, "you are blushing!"

As soon as the voice fell, kangmobei had turned around and put his arms around Bai
nianxi's waist. His breath was hot and ambiguous, and he lowered his voice, "if you
say no, you don't have it."

"But you know..."

"One more word." In the dark eyes of conmo north, the dark light twinkled. He drew
close to his body again. His burning eyes were fixed on Bai nianxi's lips. "Believe it or
not, I've done you here."

Bai nianxi was frightened by this sentence from kangmobei, and he was in a state of
horror and panic. If he really was Then she really has no face to live again!

He shook his head in panic.



It seems that he has found a way to cure this woman, and his eyes are shining.

Two palms hold Bai nianxi's waist. With a little effort, Bai nianxi is carried by him
and sits on the guardrail beside the river.

Kangmobei separated Bai nianxi's legs and approached him in an ambiguous posture,
"who is Lin you?"
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