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Chapter 91 

"No." Seeing how eager Nyx seemed to be. Felix suddenly spoke, stopping them. The 
voice grew a bit more serious as Feliz scolded Theon, "Keep some dignity. Theon, this 
is a live broadcast," 

Showing the belly in public like this didn't seem appropriate. Nyx immediately realized 
this, pulled her hand back, and nodded. "Alright." 

The viewers in the live stream were extremely disappointed. 

[No, I want to see it.] 

[Don't treat us like outsiders.] 

[Ahhhhil 

[Is there anything advanced subscribers can't see?] 

I want to see.] 

Though I'm not General Lane, it still feels really immersive.] 

Hurry up and continue.] 

Amidst the viewers cries and pleas, Nyx rubbed Theon's cars and promised him, "Til 
brush your fur next time when we're not live" 

Interrupted by Theon, she forgot where she had left off brushing the Black-maned Lion, 
so she also promised Felix, "III brush it for you next time too." 

Just then, she got a little tired of sitting, stood up to stretch, and walked around the 
garden, showing the viewers the various plants in the little garden. 

It was the warmest season on Central Planet, and most of the flowers were blooming. 
The sweet, mixed fragrances filled the air, kissed 



e sun, spreading throughout the garden. 

Nyx broke off a branch, picked a few unknown little flowers, and with her fingers 
weaving, she made a harmonious-colored flower crown. After sizing it up, she placed it 
on the Black-maned Lion's head. "Here, for you, Felix" 

The serious and majestic Black-maned Lion looked unexpectedly cute with the 
adornment. Nyx couldn't help but laugh out loud. Her soft laughter made the Black-
maned Lion's heart melt. He lowered his head and circled around in front of Nyx to 

show off 

The viewers were speechless for a moment. 

[I'm speechless.] 

[Doesn't Marshal Lane think this looks bad for his image?] 

[I stopped wearing things like this when I was three.] 

[How can a male wear flowers?] 

Although the flower crown was indeed exquisite, and it didn't look ridiculous on the lion's 
head but rather beautiful, it really didn't match Marshal Lane's image. 
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Suddenly, some viewers finally reacted. 

[Wasn't Marshal Lane quite proactive when he was brushed just now? 

[Seems like he was a bit too eager.] 

[If I'm not mistaken, he even pushed Thron aside.] 

[Competing for affection with his nephew?] 



[Marshal Lane's image is ruined.] 

Although people were joking about how Marshal Lane lost his image in the competition 
for affection, everyone had to admit that nothing was more important than winning Nyx's 
favor. 

Theon wasn't willing to back down, wrapping himself around Nyx. “Nyx, you can't be 
biased." 

26% 

When he said this, the viewers were shocked. All females were biased. With all the 
males around, no female ever treated everyone equally. 

Even if the males used all their tricks to win the female's favor, they might not get much 
more affection. What really mattered was which male the female liked more. 

[General Lane's gotten cocky, hasn't he?] 

[If I dared talk to my matron like that, I'd be slapped.] 

[Not just competing for affection, but openly saying it?] 

[What boldness.] 

[Only because Nyx is so nice.] 

But even if the female was nice, she wouldn't tolerate the males acting so recklessly. 
The viewers thought that Theon might 

lose 

ecause of this. 

“Alright, alright,” Nyx nodded and reassured him, Theon likes blue flowers, I remember.” 

She didn't just make a flower crown for Theon. Zayne had healed from his injuries and 
had already started working again. He wasn't home, but she made one for him as well. 

Aurelius had been busy with official duties, only occasionally transforming into a little 
white cat to seek affection from her. She kept him in mind and made one for him too. 

Each of the four males received a flower crown, one each. The viewers gradually 
stopped calling the flower crowns childish, instead feeling a twinge of jealousy. 

[Forget what I said earlier, males should wear flower crowns.] 



[Flower crowns are the best accessory for males.] 

[The strongest male should wear the most beautiful flower crown.] 

[Can we get a few as well!] 

[If there's a giveaway, I bet I could be the lucky winner.] 
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Chapter 911 

[Females want them too! Stop the raffle for the males, give us a separate pool for the 
females.] 

[Agreed.] 

26% 

The comments flooded in, and Nyx couldn't help but laugh as she read what the 
audience was saying. “Alright, I'll do a raffle for flower crowns, but only ten spots." 

Any more and she wouldn't be able to make enough, and the flowers in her little garden 
couldn't handle her picking them so recklessly. 

She didn't create a distinction between males and females, so she opened the raffle to 
all viewers. The ten lucky winners, whether male or female, couldn't help but take 
pictures and post them on StarNet to show off. 

Countless people expressed their envy, offering large sums of money to buy the flower 
crowns, but no one was willing to part with theirs. 



Since they couldn't get the same flower crown, they tried to get the same comb. In no 
time, Nyx's signature combs sold out, and the stores had to restock repeatedly. They 
were restocked and sold out again in seconds, always in short supply. 

This type of comb had barely been used by anyone before; in the space age, people 
had more convenient ways to manage themselves. The comb had become an antique, 
and most people bought it for collection or decoration purposes. 

With just her own effort, Nyx turned a comb that used to sell only a handful each month 
into a hot-selling item across the empire. The massive amount of dollars poured in, and 
the merchants couldn't stop grinning, daring to contact Nyx. 

By coincidence, Nyx, who usually didn't pay much attention to unfamiliar private 
messages, happened to see the merchant's message and the carefully designed 
picture—A cute little person holding the comb, with two adorable lions playfully cuddling 
around her. 

In that moment, Nyx's heart softened. She asked Felix and Theon, and of course, 
neither of them minded. So Nyx agreed to the merchant and authorized them to use 
their images for the advertisement. 

It wasn't for the ad money; it was simply because the design was so cute, she really 
liked it. Because of this, 

the trend of buying the combs intensified, lasting for a long time. 

Ons 

1. many males excitedly posted. 

[After watching the livestream, my matron really combed my fur.] 

[Same here.] 

[So happy.] 

[I'm the only one in my family whose beast form is furry, and matron now favors me the 
most, heh.] 

The furry males were ushering in their spring. Married furry males saw their family 
status rise, and unmarried 

furry males were becoming quite popular in the mating market. 

Other males whose beast forms didn't have fur couldn't help but feel envious. 



[Why are there so many furry creatures around Nyx?] 

[Sigh, we're unworthy.] 

I've been crying for days 1 
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[No choice, females are always picky about us.] 

[Nyx shouldn't dislike us, right? She even petted Black Mamba before.) 

Nyx stopped scrolling when she saw the message about Black Mamba on StarNet. 

Previously, Felix had promised to help her find someone, but she hadn't received a 
response. 

20% 

Since awakening, so much had happened to her, and she had been busy helping the 
females with their treatment. She'd forgotten to follow up with Felix. 

And the young military school student had remained silent in her friend list, neither 
reaching out nor 

responding to her 

messages. 

"Felix." Nyx grabbed Felix and asked, "Have you found Kian?” 
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Hearing Kian's name from Nyx. Felix froze for a moment. Since the day he received 
Kian's Intelligent Brain, he had thoroughly investigated him. He had found his family 
background and his experience competing in the Underground 

Arena. 

He had even tracked down the shop where Kian bought the blue iris necklace and 
uncovered the tension between him and Ashton Naturally, he knew that he was the 
Black Mamba whom Nyx had previously calmed. 

As Felix continued his investigation, he discovered that Kian's father, who hadn't been 
granted bail by the matron, had been detained in the Supervision Office. But Kian had 
forged documents and smuggled his father out. 

Taking his father with him was enough to prove his unwavering determination to betray 
the empire. The military had issued a warrant for Kian's arrest, though it hadn't yet been 
posted across the empire. 

Felix didn't tell Nyx about this because it would upset her. But since Nyx asked again, 
Felix hesitated, about to speak when the Intelligent Brain suddenly rang with an urgent 
communication. 

"Hold on. Nyx, Felix said, his expression turning serious. 

The message came from Rex. This well-informed cabinet member had received some 
urgent intel. 

Rex: [Two people died early this morning, it was an assassination.] 

Rex: [One was a noble, the other a cabinet member. In the noble's house, they found 
links to an inducer, suspected to be the mastermind behind the previous attack on Lord 
Nyx] 

Rex: [The Security Bureau is investigating secretly. I will continue to follow up.] 

Felix immediately cross-referenced the deceased's details with the previous list of 
names, realizing that both 



of these individuals were on that list and had malicious intentions toward Nyx. 

And now, these two had been swiftly and cleanly taken out-this couldn't be a 
coincidence. 

M 

this? Felix fell into thought, his face darkening. He had a strong feeling that this matter 
wasn't over. 

The news didn't stay contained for long, and soon it spread across the empire. In just 
one night, two major figures were dead, and the whole empire was buzzing with talk. 

Before the heat of this event could die down, things escalated again—One after 
another, several high– ranking officials were assassinated. The killer was quick and 
efficient, very skilled at escaping. The targets seemed to be very specific. 

The Security Bureau still couldn't identify the killer, but by looking into the victims' 
identities, they found the killer's choices to be very deliberate. These deceased nobles 
had all been involved in shady dealings for years, and some even had deep 
connections with the Underground Arena. 

In no time, everyone who had committed wrongdoings among the nobility was in a state 
of fear. Seizing the opportunity, the royal family quickly took action. With the design of 
Crown Prince himself, they gathered many pieces of evidence and took down several 
entrenched factions. 

The empire's territory was vast, and there were certainly still areas with corruption, but 
at least on the Central Planet, a thorough purge had occurred. 

Many of the empire's parasites were eradicated, and countless arrogant and 
untouchable nobles and officials were crushed, including the Quill Family. 
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Ashton had just returned to school, his first day back at the Imperial Military Academy. 
Before even starting claw, he was shocked by the news of his father's arrest. 

Many knowing glances were cast around him, and he couldn't help but break into a cold 
sweat, shaking like a leaf. He thought. How could this happen?' 

The general public was thoroughly satisfied with the fate of these corrupt nobles. The 
entire empire cheered, praising the royal family and Crown Prince, even hailing the 
unidentified killer. 

He only killed bad people. And he was so strong. Many people began to admire him, 
calling him the “Justice Killer." The public was in a frenzy, while the Security Bureau 
was overwhelmed. 

With so many nobles assassinated on the Central Planet and the killer still not caught, it 
was clear that Central Planet was no longer safe, and a storm was brewing. 

At the military, Felix sat in his office, watching a video with a serious expression. It was 
footage of Kian participating in combat competitions during his time at the Imperial 
Military Academy. 

On the desk were several photos of the crime scenes where the nobles had been 
assassinated, showing their positions when they died. 

Felix compared Kian's fighting habits and techniques, scrutinizing every detail, and then 
looked at the fatal injuries of the victims, replaying it all in his mind. His expression grew 
heavier, and his body tensed. 

If his judgment was correct, this male named Kian was the very same “Justice Killer" 
who had been making waves recently. Without hesitation. Felix immediately drafted a 
report, submitting it to various departments, to issue a nationwide wanted 

notice for Kian 

Theon,” Felix called his nephew over when they returned to the estate, handing him a 
stack of files on Kiani. "Be extra cautious around this person." 

Theon read through the documents carefully, then hesitated. “Could he be doing all this 
to protect Nyx?" 

Felix nodded slightly. He thought the same. All the nobles who were killed, one by one, 
were on that list of people who had originally planned to harm Nyx 

They 



ple had ill intentions towards Nyx and were plotting against her, but before they could 
carry out their plans, they lost their ines first. The first noble who was killed had already 
been confirmed to be the "boss" mentioned by the assailants in the hospital. 

It seemed like Kian was protecting Nyx, in a sinful, crazy way. He didn't gather sufficient 
evidence or follow legal procedures; he just identified who intended to harm Nyx and 
used the most primitive form of violence to solve the problem at its root. 

"Even though it seems like he's protecting Nyx, we can't just let him go." Felix said 
coldly. A person this reckless was an unstable potential danger for Nyx. 

Theon nodded, understanding, I will protect Nyx closely and make sure he doesn't get a 
chance to act" 

Just reminding Theon wasn't enough. Felix hesitated and knocked on Nyx's door. "Nyx, 

there's something I need to tell you about Kian❞ 

Nyx ran over and opened the door. Has Felix already found Kian? Where is he?' she 
wondered. Nyx looked at Felix with bright, hopeful eyes. 

Felix couldn't bear to see her upset, but he steeled himself and spoke, “He has betrayed 
the Empire and joined the Space Pirates." 
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For a moment, Nyx looked bewildered. Although she had no clear idea about Space 
Pirates, she knew they weren't good people: 

She simply couldn't reconcile Kian with the Space Pirates. Nyx didn't believe it. She 
quickly skimmed through the information Felix handed her, her body swaying slightly. 

Felix was quick to support her and helped her sit down by the bed, kneeling on one 
knee and carefully watching her expression. He knew Nyx wouldn't be able to handle 
this kind of shock. 



The case Nyx's emotions, the materials he showed her were much more toned down 
compared to the ones Theon received. They contained solid evidence-facts without any 
speculation on his part about Kian being a 

“justice killer." 

First, it was just his guess, and there was no concrete evidence yet. Second, if Nyx 
knew that Kian had killed so many people, she might collapse even further. 

Felix gently held Nyx's hand and seriously reminded her, "From now on, you must stay 
alert around this person. If you see him near you, don't believe any of his lies and make 
sure to tell us immediately 

Nyx remained silent for a long time. She held the documents in her hand, flipping 
through them over and over again. Suddenly, she pulled out the blue iris flower 
necklace from her drawer and tightly clutched it in her 

hand. 

Before, she had only known that Kian's family life was unhappy. After seeing these 
documents, she understood just how miserable Kian had been 

To buy expensive medicine for his out-of-control father, he had to risk his life-fighting in 
illegal underground matches. That must have been dangerous, 

'Did he join the Space Pirates to get more medicine to save his father? she thought. A 
wave of frustration and helplessness. washed over Nyx. If she had known all this earlier, 
she could have saved Kian's father. Maybe then Kian wouldn't have made such a big 
mistake. 

Felix quietly stayed by Nyx's side, gently patting her back in an attempt to calm her 
down. 

Deeply heartbroken, Nyx remained dejected for many days before finally regaining a 
little bit of her spirit. In 

the  

ision Office, there were still many out-of-control males, just as unfortunate as Kian's 
father. 

After several days, the Supervision Office once again welcomed an SSS-level female. 

The director was enthusiastic and personally greeted Nyx. Soon, the office was filled 
with a shocked scream. "What did you say? You plan to do Mental Soothing for the out-
of-control males in the Supervision Office?" 
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“That's not appropriate. The director of the Supervision Office thought Nyx had gone 
crazy 

Mental Soothing was a very private matter, usually only done by a partner. Even though 
he knew that Nyx was a special 555- level female, capable of Mental Soothing without 
mating, he still found it hard to accept. 

"Your Mental Soothing, after all, still requires some physical contact. These males are 
all strangers to you" Touching so many unfamiliar males with her own hands, it was too 
crazy 

"Don't worry, I know my limits. I won't touch them carelessly," Nyx said, of course having 
considered this, and had already tested it with her guardians. 

She didn't need to touch them. She could purify the black mist, though it would be less 
efficient 

The Supervision Office Director was dumbfounded. Logic told him he shouldn't believe 
it, but he'd witnessed too many miracles with Nyx, and he felt she wouldn't he to him. 
“Well, perhaps you can give it a try 

After some thought, the Supervision Office Director tentatively asked. "Can I 
recommend the first candidate for Mental Soothing 

Currently, they were housing a big shot who, when he went berserk, was terrifying-
almost as bad as Marshal Lane. If Nyx could save him, it would solve a major headache 
for the Supervision Office. 

Nyx nodded in agreement. 

As they walked, the Supervision Office Director rambled on, introducing Nyx. "Lord Kai 
used to be the Empire's Chief Diplomat, but he had to step down for a while due to a 
high Loss of Control Index. He's an 58– level male, and his beast form is a leopard" 

Just as they were talking, a deafening alarm suddenly rang through the entire 
Supervision Office. 



What's going on?" The Director watched as a group of staff, carrying injection guns, ran 
around in panic. 

the staff stopped and reported, out of breath and visibly flustered, “Lord Kai is missing"" 

The Supervision Office Director sucked in a sharp breath. 

Nyx was shocked as she listened to the report. That leopard had actually pretended to 
be hit by the injection gun and faked being unconscious. The staff thought the 
tranquilizer had worked and were about to move him, but he took the chance to escape. 
Such a smart leopard. 

Is anyone injured?" Nyx asked. 

The staff nodded solemnly. "Larry, the one who was supposed to inject the tranquilizer, 
got slashed and is receiving 

Treatment 

Nyx fell silent. It seemed that the leopard really held grudges-he was vengeful. 
Thankfully, no one had died. But the staff weren't optimistic. “After Lord Kai lost control, 
his temper became unpredictable. He's a violent madman. If we don't find him quickly, 
there will definitely be big problems” 

Nyx turned to Theon, urging. “Theon, you should go help too. 

Theon shook his head. “I must stay with you" No one was more important than Nyx. 
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“Yes, yes, the Supervision Office Director wiped the sweat from his forehead, shaking 
his head in despair, “If the leopard runs here to Lord Nyx, we're in trouble." 



His words were like a prophecy. Before he could finish speaking, a pair of gleaming 
beastly eyes suddenly appeared from around a corner, staring fixedly in their direction. 

It was a leopard. Before anyone could react, those beastly eyes rapidly closed the 
distance. The agile leopard stirred up a fierce wind as it charged towards them, the 
target being-Nyx. 

Theon's pupils constricted, and he immediately moved to shield Nyx. In an instant, he 
and the leopard were engaged in a fierce struggle. The sound of their bones and 
muscles clashing was so intense it was terrifying. 

The frantic animal roars sent a jolt through Nyx's nerves. She instinctively took a step 
back but quickly regained her composure and stepped forward, attempting to break up 
the fight. 

"Step back, Nyx Theon shouted loudly. 

But Nyx didn't care. She stubbornly charged towards them. As Nyx approached, the 
leopard let out an excited roar, seemingly wanting to leave Theon and jump at her 
instead. 

Theon couldn't let that happen. He seized the leopard's momentary lapse and slammed 
it harshly to the ground. 

The leopard was enraged and roared. 

It suddenly unleashed an uncontainable burst of strength, twisting and flipping Theon 
over. Then, it bared its vicious fangs and charged straight for Theon's throat, intending 
to take out this annoying obstruction first. 

"Theon!" Nyx cried out, ignoring the differences between male and female, and with 
both hands, she tightly hugged the mad leopard around the waist, preventing it from 
attacking Theon. 

Nyx's feeble strength couldn't stop the rampaging male; instead, she was easily 
dragged and almost stumbled.. 

The director, who was standing nearby, instinctively closed his eyes, unable to watch 
the tragedy unfold. The staff rushed forward to intervene, but instead, they only made 
the leopard more furious. 

enly, a soft body pressed against the leopard's back, causing its movement to slow for a 
moment, hesitation creeping 

into its actions. 



The hesitation lasted only a second, but the arrival of the staff seemed to ignite the 
leopard's anger further. It didn't stop attack and charged forward again 

Nyx lost her footing and stumbled a few steps, then tilted, falling to the ground. The 
strength disparity was enormous, and the leopard could have easily shrugged off this 
annoying little attachment. 

But it seemed to intentionally slow down, lowering its body to offer Nyx a seat on its 
strong back. Nyx plopped down onto the leopard's muscular back. Finally, it stopped. 

She panted heavily, her hand on her chest, and looked down at the leopard, meeting its 
cold, unfeeling gaze. Nyx froze in fear-She had never seen such a gaze in any animal. 

From childhood, whether wild or domesticated, animals had always been affectionate 
toward her. Even the fiercest would show gentleness in her presence. 

But this leopard's gaze held no warmth whatsoever. In the moment of shock, the 
leopard's throat emitted a low growl, and it bared its teeth at her aggressively. Nyx 
quickly jumped off its back, ran several steps toward Theon. 
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Behind her, the leopard's green eyes remained fixed on her retreating figure, showing 
clear dissatisfaction with her escape. A group of staff rushed forward, holding injection 
guns.  

The leopard seemned to scoff, giving them a contemptuous glance before its gaze 
returned to Nyx. Its eyes tangible. Nyx clearly sensed its focus on her. It didn't seem so 
indifferent. 

felt almost 



She calmed herself slightly and walked back toward the leopard. This time, she didn't 
meet its eyes but lowered her gaze to show her harmlessness. The effect was 
immediate. 

From Nyx's perspective, though, the others could see that as Nyx approached, the 
leopard's eyes filled with unmasked interest. It eagerly scratched the ground a few times 
with its paws. 

It seemed it could no longer hold back and walked toward Nyx, lowering its head to sniff 
her, her hair, neck, and waist. 

Its tail, which had been hanging low, now stood upright, and the leopard's nostrils flared 
as it became almost entranced. Nyx took the opportunity to release her Soul Form—a 
small sapling. 

Without any physical contact, a faint glow emanated from the sapling, surrounding the 
leopard. The dark, ominous black mist around it gradually thinned. 

The process was slow. The leopard, at times, swished its tail, crouched down, or spun 
in circles, shaking its head and wagging its tail to try to attract Nyx's attention.. 

But Nyx remained focused, clearing the black mist. Although her gaze was on the 
leopard, she didn't pay 

attention to its 

every move. 

She never reached out to pet the unfamiliar leopard. After a while, the leopard's gaze 
grew more puzzled. Its green eyes blinked, then it suddenly lunged forward. 
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Theon, who had been keeping an eye on the situation, could no longer sit still. He had 
been reluctant to interfere, considering how focused Nyx seemed. He was unsure of 
what might happen if he interrupted, 

So, he clenched his fists and endured, watching helplessly as the leopard moved closer 
to Nyx, sniffing her, and then began to make flirtatious gestures, trying to seduce her. 



Fortunately, Nyx remained unmoved. However, the leopard grew bolder. Seeing that 
Nyx ignored him, he suddenly leaped 

at her 

Theon reacted quickly, catching Nyx just in time, preventing her from hitting the ground. 
In the blink of an eye, the two males, who had never gotten along, clashed again, this 
time even more fiercely and aggressively than before. 

The black mist, which had finally started to thin, returned with vengeance. The leopard, 
filled with hostility, truly lived up to the staff's description-he was a vicious, mad animal. 

Nyx dizzily shook her head and shouted, "Stop!" 

It didn't work. The leopard didn't listen at all. But Theon, at the sound of her shout, 
almost missed his strike and nearly got bitten by the leopard. The staff couldn't help; 
they wanted to assist General Lane but couldn't find the right moment. 

The battle in front of Nyx was dizzying, and she tried to use the same trick again to grab 
the leopard and stop its movements, but the leopard anticipated her actions, already 
prepared, and easily dodged, leaving her unable to catch even a single hair. 

While fighting with Theon, the leopard even swung its tail, teasing Nyx. After being 
played with several times, Nyx was at a loss. 

This leopard was the wildest animal she had ever seen with her own eyes, sensitive, 
nervous, and full of aggression. Completely exhausted, she just sat down on the 
ground. She hadn't planned to fake an injury, but by accident, it worked. 

As Nyx fell to the ground, both the leopard and Theon stopped, turning to look at her. 
Nyx was rendered speechless. Suddenly struck by inspiration, she quickly pretended to 
have hurt her knee, covering it with both hands, and letting out a 

ss of pain. 

Nyx.” Theon dropped the leopard and hurried over to her. 

Worried for her too much, the usually sharp male seemed to lose his sense of judgment 
and was genuinely deceived by her poor acting 

The leopard seemed conflicted. It looked at Nyx with disdain, as if thinking, "Where did 
this fragile little thing come from?" 

Although it didn't give Nyx a friendly look, its worry still showed through in its actions. 
After pacing around a few times, the leopard couldn't help but get closer to Nyx. 



Ignoring Theon, the leopard bent down to sniff her knee, trying to assess her injury. 

Taking advantage of the quiet moment, Nyx made a gesture, speaking softly, "Be good, 
sit down, okay!" 

The leopard's ears twitched, pretending not to hear. Nyx's tone became more serious, 
"Sit down.” 

The leopard glanced at her. It clearly understood what Nyx meant, but pretended not to, 
refusing to obey, showing its 

stubbornness 
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Realizing that Nyx wasn't actually injured, the leopard figured out it had been tricked 
and bared its teeth, growling fiercely at 

Nyx. 

This time, Nyx wasn't scared. She stared at the leopard expressionlessly. As expected, 
the leopard just put on a show of force. growling a few times before calming down, 
circling around her, and suddenly getting closer. 

Its hot breath hit her neck, and Nyx couldn't help but shiver, every hair on her body 
standing on end. It seemed like it wanted to bite her neck, but the skin there was 
delicate and fragile, and the leopard hesitated, unwilling to bite. 

Not her arm either. Her clothes couldn't handle being pulled. The leopard changed 
positions several times, trying different angles, but none of its attempts succeeded. It 
grew a bit restless, pushing its head against Nyx, nudging her, trying to get her to walk 
with it. 



Theon wanted to stop this shameless harassment, but Nyx, fearing another fight might 
break out, quickly shook her head. “Let's go, where do you want to take me?” Nyx stood 
up, fulfilling the leopard's wishes. 

While coaxing it, she used her mental power to continue soothing the leopard. Naturally, 
the others didn't dare let Nyx go alone with the crazy leopard, so they followed closely 
behind. 

Being too close might anger the leopard, triggering another fight at any moment, but 
staying too far away risked an accident where they couldn't save Nyx in time. 

The group had to follow at a safe distance, surprised to see that the leopard actually led 
Nyx back to its containment room. The other uncontrolled males in the Supervision 
Office hated being confined and constantly tried to escape, but they always failed 

However, this leopard, despite having successfully escaped, seemed to only want to 
wander around for a bit and, after playing, leisurely returned to its containment room on 
its own. 

This room was its nest. The room was decorated with mountain and forest scenes. To 
Nyx, it didn't look like a containment room but more like an exhibit area in a high-end 
zoo, 

Why doesn't the other Male Beastmen get such treatment?' she thought. 

Tng Nyx's suspicious gaze, the Supervision Office director awkwardly explained, "This 
containment room was decorated 

Kai himself before he lost control"  

It seemed that he had calmly accepted the fact that he would be staying in the 
Supervision Office long-term, perhaps for the rest of his life, and had leisurely made 
himself a comfortable nest. 

In fact, he even generously donated a large sum of Starcoins to the Supervision Office, 
improving the living conditions of other males as well. 

This was quite unexpected for Nyx. It was rare for a male to be so calm and open about 
their loss of control-it was as if he had completely given up struggling, almost like he 
had written his will. 

"Could it be because he's an SS-level male and can't find a female with strong enough 
mental power to provide him with Mental Soothing, so he just gave up and is waiting for 
death?" Nyx stroked her chin, deep in thought. 



Taking advantage of her distraction, the leopard skillfully hid its figure behind the 
landscaping, blending into the surroundings. When Nyx came to her senses and tried to 
continue with Mental Soothing, she found that the leopard had already disappeared. 

"Where did it go? she thought. As she looked around in confusion, the leopard suddenly 
jumped out, scaring her with its sudden appearance. 
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Seeing her pale face, the leopard's colorful tail wrapped around her wrist and gently 
flicked, as if trying to comfort her. Nyx was rendered speechless. 

After being teased several times, Nyx confirmed that the leopard had no malicious 
intent: it seemed to just find this fun. She thought. What a mischievous leopard. 

Unable to resist, Nyx reached out and pinched its ear. The leopard dodged left and 
right, its fluffy ears trembling as it avoided Nyx's pinching 

Whether it was because the black mist was gradually being purified or because it was 
back on its own turf, the leopard seemed to be in a much better mood, energetically 
circling Nyx, showing off, and making low, powerful sounds at her. 

Nyx didn't understand. The people around her, however, were stunned. 

The leopard turned and picked up a heavy stone, bringing it to Nyx. The staff 
recognized it immediately: this 

was his favorite stone, the one he often used to sharpen his claws, made of rare gold 

Theon took a deep breath, fuming with anger. This leopard was trying to court Nyx. 
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The leopard's every move was clearly showing off its strength, sending signals of 
courtship to the female. Theon clenched his fists so tightly they made a creaking sound. 

"Calm down, calm down. The director of the Supervision Office grabbed him, fearing 
that he would rush over and ruin everything again. 

Although the leopard was courting. Nyx hadn't actually accepted. Not only had she not 
accepted, Nyx wasn't even aware of what the leopard was doing. She was completely 
focused on battling the black mist, occasionally giving the leopard a casual 

response. 

The concentration of black mist gradually decreased to a critical level. The leopard's 
gaze began to change. The green beast eyes suddenly had a more human-like quality, 
and when they landed on Nyx, its pupils jolted. 

Seeing a female was like a blow to the head, and the leopard had a dazed expression. 
But it quickly regained its composure, shook its head to hide its brief lapse, and stepped 
back a few paces to maintain a safe distance from Nyx. 

"Don't move," Nyx stopped it. The Mental Soothing isn't finished yet." 

Unlike the soft, soothing tone she used with others, she was no longer gentle with this 
leopard. Nyx thought she was being fierce, but her voice still had that soft quality to it. 

The leopard's gaze shifted again, showing a mixture of emotions. Obediently, it returned 
to her side but kept its distance, lying down in a submissive posture. 

The leopard, now fully aware, finally became docile, and the efficiency of Mental 
Soothing increased significantly. Nyx let out a long breath. Feeling Nyx's Mental 
Soothing, the leopard closed its eyes, its heart tumultuous. 

“So this is an SS5-level female's Mental Soothing? It doesn't even require mating? he 
thought. 



Nyx didn't even touch him; they just sat facing each other in silence. Yet, he could 
clearly feel his chaotic soul being healed.  

Is this the power of an SSS-level female? The leopard's claws twitched. 

Nyx nodded, signaling it was over, the staff rushed in, eagerly taking the leopard for a 
checkup. Last time, when Nyx gave Mental Soothing to Marshal Lane, it brought the 
Loss of Control Index down to 18, which shocked everyone at the Supervision Office. 

This time, no one knew if the miracle could continue. 

'I'll rest for a while, then soothe next male," Nyx said, slumping in the chair, leaning on 
Theon, speaking to the Supervision 

Office director. 

The Supervision Office director nodded in understanding. “I'll prepare something for you 
to eat.” After thinking for a moment, he added, "If you feel like your mental power is too 
drained, don't continue, please don't push yourself." 

After soothing the males, all females needed rest for several days. No female, except 
Nyx, intended to soothe two males in one day. The Supervision Office director trusted 
Nyx's ability, but he couldn't help feeling concerned. 

Nyx smiled helplessly and sighed. The little sapling in the Sea of Consciousness was 
still lively, so she had some energy left. Mental Soothing wasn't tiring for her; it was just 
the mental battle with the leopard that had drained her. This leopard was really hard to 
handle. 

"You were much better than him," Nyx couldn't help teasing Theon. 
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Theon huffed, still unhappy about the leopard's courtship. Nyx smiled and gently 
squeezed his finger, and his mood immediately improved, but deep down, the strong 
desire to mate could not be suppressed. 

That unfamiliar leopard actually dared to court Nyx. Thinking that he hadn't formally 
courted Nyx yet, Theon felt defeated. unwilling to be one step behind. 

Nyx noticed Theon's breathing quicken and tilted her head in confusion, "What's wrong" 

Theon shook his head, signaling that he was fine. He couldn't rush it, nor could he be 
hasty. The time and place weren't right now, he couldn't behave like that senseless 
leopard and ignore the situation. 

After a short rest, Nyx continued to soothe the next male. Aside from the trouble with 
the leopard, the other males were just as cooperative as she expected. 

In front of her, no matter if the beast form was a large or small animal, a carnivore or 
herbivore, they all obeyed her. 

The efficiency of Mental Soothing increased greatly, though it couldn't compare to direct 
touch, it was still incredibly fast, and the drop in the Loss of Control Index thrilled the 
staff. 

A Loss of Control Index in the single digits. The rescued males couldn't believe their 
eyes, extremely grateful to Nyx. 

After soothing more than a dozen males, Nyx finally felt drained. During this time, as 
she treated the females, the little sapling had successfully sprouted two new leaves, 
proudly now having four leaves. After today's Mental Soothing, the four leaves had 
grown slightly larger. 

'Til continue tomorrow to soothe others,” Nyx promised the Supervision Office director. 

“Okay, okay.” The Supervision Office director responded excitedly, rubbing his hands 
and repeating his agreement. 

Those who had lived in the Supervision Office for years were finally saved. During his 
tenure, he had witnessed countless males' Loss of Control Index reach 100, beyond 
saving, as they died in madness, struggling in their final moments. 

With Nyx's strong support, he might never have to witness such tragedies again. The 
atmosphere in the Supervision Office was joyful, but rumors suddenly spread on 
StarNet 

[222] 



ou hear? Lord Nyx went to the Supervision Office to do Mental Soothing on strange 
males.] 

[Stop spreading rumors.] 

[If you dare to spread lies about Lord Nyx, you're dead ] 

[It's not a rumor, go check for yourselves, the Central Planet Supervision Office 
released several males today with ridiculously low Loss of Control Index] 

[One of them was Lord Kai] 

[A Loss of Control Index in the single digits?] 

[Oh my god.] 

Some people dug through the records and found Marshal Lane's Supervision Office visit 
records. Felix's Loss 

of Control Index had dropped from 89 to 18, and Nyx was clearly his bailor. 

Even without this evidence, it was easy to guess. After all, besides Nyx, no other female 
could bring the Loss of Control 

2/3 

Dreame-Read Romance Stories 

Open 

Chapter 95 

Index down to such a degree. 

[Impressive... but somehow, I feel uneasy:] 

[Me too.] 

[Forget about Marshal Lane, but today those were all strange males.] 

Although it was about saving someone, it's really hard to imagine.] 

I can't accept it.] 

[Why lower yourself like this!] 



In the public's view, the method of Mental Soothing was always assumed to be mating. 
Just thinking about how Nyx had provided Mental Soothing to so many unfamiliar 
males, her image, once god–like and unapproachable, instantly shattered. 

The Supervision Office couldn't allow Nyx's reputation to be tarnished and immediately 
released a statement, firmly declaring that Nyx's method of Mental Soothing was not 
mating, and that there was no physical contact with the males during the process. 

Before the official announcement was even made, many staff members and the males 
who had been saved were already defending Nyx. 

[Everyone, calm down] 

[I'm one of the males who received Mental Soothing today. There was a cage between 
Nyx and me. She 

didn't even touch me.] 

[Yeah. I can vouch for that. I work for the Supervision Office; you can check my 
personal information.] 

[Use your brain and you'll know Nyx couldn't possibly have touched so many males.] 

Lord Nyx can treat mental injuries of females, so doing Mental Soothing for males from 
a distance is no 

problem for her.] 

Guns and loyal supporters naturally believed in her abilities, but until the official 
announcement came, some 

people dn't buy it. 

[Who are you fooling?] 

[She lowered the Loss of Control Index to single digits without even touching anyone?] 

[Not buying it one bit.] 

[This is just a joke, haha] 

[Unless I see it with my own pues 
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The argument on Star Net was intense. After the guardians and Aurelius shut down a 
few accounts and dealt with the loudest troublemakers, the controversy only grew, with 
rumor-mongers raising the banner of free speech and opposing the silencing actions 

Inside the Supervision Office, everyone was as anxious as ants on a hot pan. Though 
they knew this matter wouldn't be taken well, seeing Nyx being slandered made them 
furious. They worried that Nyx would be disappointed and stop providing Mental 
Soothing for other males. 

Amid the uneasy atmosphere in the Supervision Office, Nyx showed up early the next 
morning as promised. Her emotions were incredibly stable, and she was completely 
unaffected by the discussions on StarNet. 

On the other hand, the males were all extremely angry. If it weren't for Nyx stopping 
them. Aurelius would have already blocked those malicious comments and forced the 
issue to quiet down, 

Nyx thought that, although that would have been effective, it would have made it seem 
like she was guilty. “Since everyone says seeing is believing,” she asked the Director of 
the Supervision Office, “Can I livestream it?" 

Livestreaming Mental Soothing was unprecedented. As soon as Nyx appeared on the 
official Supervision Office account's livestream, the crowd rushed in like hyenas 
scenting blood. 

[Livestreaming Mental Soothing?] 

[This is wild.] 

Is this a proper livestream?]  

[Has Nyx lost it? Has the Supervision Office lost it too?] 

Maybe I should get some Mental Soothing too. I'm good at it.] 

Fans angrily cursed at these despicable people while reporting them to the Female 
Protection Association. glanced at the comments but didn't argue. She simply nodded to 
the staff beside her. "We can start." 



A few staff members carefully brought the first male to receive Mental Soothing today 
and stood nearby. This male's beast form was a kingfisher, and his medical check-up 
showed his Loss of Control Index was as high as 88. 

The small kingfisher was trapped in a cage, flapping wildly, causing his feathers to fall 
off and his body to bleed. Normally, his feathers would be bright, but now he looked dull 
and disheveled, torn apart by the loss of control. 

The once lively comments began to quiet down. Anyone who saw such a scene couldn't 
help but feel heavy- hearted. There were many more males like him in the empire, and 
the only fate awaiting them was death. 

In the oppressive silence, Nyx approached the cage. As she got closer, the frantic 
kingfisher slowly calmed down, blinking his eyes and weakly chirping toward her. 

The audience couldn't see Nyx's Soul Form, but they could see her gaze, filled with pity 
and gentleness, directed at the kingfisher. It felt as if that gaze reached through the 
screen and touched them, stirring a warm and subtle feeling in their 

hearts. 

The agitated kingfisher showed Nyx an incredible amount of gentleness and quickly 
began to recover, visibly regaining his spirit. 
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Time passed second by second, and the livestream room was nearly sent Everyone 
beld their breach in nÉRVOUS anticipation. Suddenly, the kingfisher trembled and with 
a shaky voice, he said Lord Ne 

Hearing his voice, the livestream exploded in excitement 

[Did his consciousness really come back that quickly!] 

[What the hell?] 

[Is it over!] 



[Has the Loss of Control Index dropped already? 

The viewers urged the staff, hoping the medical results would come out quickly. There 
was actually no mating. 

In fact, seemed like Nyx did almost nothing, yet the Mental Soothing was complete. 

Watching with their own eyes as the Loss of Control Index dropped to single digits even 
though everything seemed so unreal, no one had any doubts left. 

After the kingfisher, other males appeared in the livestream, including a rhino with 
broken horns a crocodile chewing on its own tail and a golden snub-nosed monkey 
depressed to the point of losing fur 

These were all males Nyx had chosen for Mental Soothing first, prioritizing those in the 
worst condition 

As they watched Nyx save one after another, the people who had been hard-headed 
and causing trouble were forced into silence, barely muttering a few words like "staged" 
and "acting before quickly leaving the live stream. As soon as they were gone, the 
livestream returned to peace and calm. 

"In the future, whenever I do Mental Soothing for other out-of-control males. I'll stream 
in": 

The audience was ecstatic. 

In the future! 

usly!] 

Lord Nyx will continue doing Mental Soothing for other males!!] 

[Beast God!] 

Is this true? Really?] 

[My Loss of Control Index is really high; I just hope to meet Lord Nyx before I die] 

[My brother is also in the Supervision Office: I hope he gets out soon] 

In an Empire where the male-to-female ratio was 1:80, this news was like music to the 
ears of the males. Lond Nyx wasn't just an SSS-level female, she was clearly the Beast 
God's messenger sent to save humanity. 



Nyx kept her word. As the live streams continued, her reputation in the Empire soared. 
The saved males kept coming to thank her, with visitors arriving non-stop. Nyx began to 
sense that her males at home seemed to be a bit moody about it. 

"Do you need some Mental Soothing?" After dinner, she took the initiative and asked. 
Upon hearing this, the three males were all surprised 

Zayne was the first to recover, his gray-blue eyes lowered. “My Loss of Control Index 

isn't that high❞ But even though his 
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Loss of Control Index wasn't high, he still wanted Nyx's Mental Soothing. 

Not just Zayne. Theon and Felix felt the same way. It was in their nature-males were 
inherently possessive. 

Even though Nyx hadn't had any real contact with those other males, they couldn't help 
but feel jealous- jealous that Nyx's attention had been on those males. 

Nyx extended a finger and gently pressed it to Zayne's forehead, smoothing out the 
frown there. "Even if your Loss of Control Index isn't high. I can still give you Mental 

Soothing❞ 

These past few days, she'd been busy doing Mental Soothing for other males in the 
Supervision Office, and had indeed neglected her own. Now, she happened to have 
some new little combs, so she could comb their fur while doing Mental Soothing for 
them. 

Feeling Nyx's special attention and affection, the three males instantly had a spark in 
their eyes. Thankfully, Nyx's bedroom was big enough. With three oversized, fluffy 
males around her, they could still all fit. 

None of them wanted to lose out-they all wanted to be closer to Nyx. Nyx was 
overwhelmed by their enthusiasm, feeling so happy she could hardly breathe. 



“Queue up, queue up, take turns,” she struggled to calm herself and organize them. 

To decide who went first, they almost got into a scuttle, but eventually, under Nyx's 
control, they decided with 

a game of rock-paper-scissors. Felix was luckier and won first. 

The black-maned lion threw aside all his pride, lying in Nyx's arms and purring non-stop, 
no longer looking anything like the imposing Imperial Marshal. 

Nyx had completely forgotten the nervousness and stiffness she felt in front of Felix 
before, now smiling as she meticulously combed through the lion's fur. As the small 
comb moved bit by bit, Nyx focused intently, cleaning the black mist off the lion's body 
thoroughly. 

Once the black mist had faded to a certain degree, it became much harder to eliminate. 
Because of this, Nyx exerted quite a bit of effort, feeling a bit dizzy. Cleaning up this 
stubborn black mist wasn't exactly efficient 

te any other male, she wouldn't have continued, but for Felix, she wanted to do her best. 

The fur was gently combed, and the black-maned lion relaxed to the point of nearly 
dozing off. When the last trace of black mist vanished, he trembled and couldn't help but 
let out a thunderous roar. 

In an instant, Felix returned to his human form, his bones cracking as he felt an 
unprecedented clarity of mind and a surge of power, utterly astonished. 

“Come give me a check-up,” he turned to Zayne and said. 

Upon hearing this. Zayne's expression shifted, and he had some suspicions. The check-
up results came out quickly, confirming his guess-Felix's Loss of Control Index had 
been completely cleared. Not only that, his physical condition had taken a huge leap, 
with all his stats far exceeding those of an SS—level male. 

He wondered if it was the case that lowering the Loss of Control Index to zero allowed 
the Male Beastmen's power to be fully unleashed. Zayne couldn't help but sigh. This is 
truly a completely new topic. After all, before this, no Male Beastmen's Loss of Control 
Index had ever been reduced to zero. 

"SSS-level Nyx was overjoyed. "Then I'll definitely do more Mental Soothing for Felix in 
the future." 
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She had always felt Felix's work was dangerous, often having to go on missions. If 
Felix's power could rise 

even further, it would undoubtedly be overwhelming both within and outside the empire, 
and she could worry 

less. 

To be fair, Theon and Zayne couldn't be left out either. Nyx sat on the carpet, patting 
her thigh, signaling for Zayne, who was second in line, to lie down. The huge white wolf 
acted like a dog in front of her, wagging its 

tail happily. 

Outside the window, a pair of green beastly eyes lurked in the darkness, silently 
watching the warmth inside 

the room. As Nyx happily played with the three beasts, the green eyes gradually turned 
more restless, 
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Judging the number and strength of the opponents, the leopard did not reveal itself 
rashly. It was very good at concealing its movements, and even the most alert of 
animals hadn't noticed the presence of such a fierce predator nearby. 

Its gaze lingered on Nyx, its claws digging into the tree trunk, making a screeching 
sound that left deep scratches. Finally, it seemed to have made a decision, quickly 
disappearing, leaving only a faint shadow in the darkness. 

Inside the room, the males were immersed in affection with Nyx, unaware that a leopard 
had lingered outside. Nyx was completely unaware. 

It wasn't until morning when she opened her eyes and saw the bloody corpse of the 
prey outside the window that the room erupted in a deafening scream. 

The guardians rushed in, fearing something had happened to Nyx, their hearts nearly 
stopping. 

"Nyx” Seeing the female safe and sound, curled up on the bed, the guardians calmed 
down. 

Theon quickly darted to the window, frowning as he opened it and picked up the prey. It 
was a freshly dead deer, still giving off heat. The wound suggested it had been killed by 
a large cat, a single, clean strike. 

It's fine. Nyx." Zayne held Nyx and gently comforted her. 

This didn't feel like a threat. It seemed more like a gift from some big cat. But it was 
strange that there was such a large predator in the manor. Such a dangerous animal 
shouldn't be in the manor, let alone outside Nyx's window. 

I'll check the security system, Felix said gravely. 

After carefully inspecting, the security system was operating normally without any 
issues. Felix reviewed the manor's surveillance footage and spotted a leopard. Most of 
the footage was blurry, but when the leopard got close to Nyx's window, its figure was 
clearly visible. 

"That's Theon froze. He leaned in for a closer look and confirmed the leopard's identity. 
"Kai.” 

fought with this leopard a few times, and he wouldn't mistake it. It wasn't just any 
leopard, but an SS-level Male man. No wonder it could break through the security 
system and storm into the manor. 

"Breaking into private property and harassing females-does he want to go to jail?" said 
Theon. 



Felix raised his hand to stop Theon's angry reprimand and pointed at the leopard on the 
screen. “Look at its condition. It seems like it's lost control. 

"How could that be?" Theon frowned. “Nyx just did a Mental Soothing for him a few 
days ago." 

Without another word, Felix contacted the Supervision Office. Sure enough, they gave a 
confirming answer. The director sighed with a bitter smile. “Lord Kai has indeed lost 
control again. Last night, we got an alert, but we haven't been able to find his 
whereabouts" 

Kai was an SS-level male, and the Supervision Office found it very tricky. The last time 
he lost control, like Felix, he had proactively gone to the Supervision Office before 
losing control. But this time, it happened suddenly. 

Upon hearing the leopard appeared at the Marshal's manor, the director earnestly 
requested Felix to keep an eye out and step in if needed to help subdue Kai.  
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With the leopard's stealthy abilities and brutal nature, the Supervision Office likely 
wouldn't be able to handle 

it. 

Felix nodded and agreed, “Understood. Even if the director hadn't mentioned it, he 
would still keep an eye on it, because that leopard had its sights set on Nyx. 

The small deer was just the beginning. It seemed that after Nyx accepted the gift, the 
leopard felt encouraged and repeatedly tried to offer more gifts to Nyx 

Every morning when she woke up. Nyx faced various kinds of prey. From the initial 
shock, she gradually started to get 



to it. 

The guardians had tried staking out by Nyx's window to catch the leopard, but they 
hadn't succeeded. 

used 

During their stakeouts, the leopard wouldn't show up by Nyx's window, but as soon as 
Nyx played around the manor during the day, she would find the prey. 

The leopard had an amazing ability to observe, accurately predicting Nyx's movements 
and placing gifts in her path. No matter how hard the guardians tried to keep watch, it 
seemed they couldn't stop the leopard from trying to win Nyx's favor. 

Nyx was utterly helpless. She already knew who the leopard leaving her gifts was. She 
already knew who the leopard leaving her gifts was. 

Does the leopard really like me that much? But during the Mental Soothing, the leopard 
bared its teeth, threatened messed with me, she thought. 

me, 

and 

Theon didn't tell Nyx that Kai had once tried to court her, and that his current actions 
might also be part of his pursuit. Or maybe he had already taken Nyx as his mate and 
was trying to feed her. 

The thought of this made Theon's temples throb. This couldn't continue. The guardians 
decided to take the initiative, and Nyx went with them to Kai's home. 

Kai's father was an Earl, and his manners were refined. In front of an esteemed SSS-
level female, he was extremely respectful, but when Nyx asked about Kai, he coldly 
turned up the corner of his mouth. 

"The not my son. His matters have nothing to do with me," Darius May, the Earl, said 
coldly, avoiding the topic of Kai 

ether. 

Eliana May, Darius's matron, appeared, greeting Nyx warmly but showing no concern 
for Kai. "Im not his birth mother. He's a bastard." 

Eliana seemed indifferent when talking about this. Marriages among the nobles were 
often for the sake of benefits and family alliances, and it wasn't rare for both parties to 
ha 
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Theon, who had been walking beside Nyx, immediately became alert and looked 
towards the thicket. The sound grew louder, as if some large animal was trying to 
emerge from there. 

26% 

'A leopard?' Without a second thought, Theon rushed towards the noise-Startled, the 
leopard turned and dashed off into the distance. 

The forest was dense, and as Thron moved through it, his clothes were occasionally 
caught on branches, hindering his 

progress. Frustrated, he shifted into beast form. 

But the lion's large frame didn't adapt well to the dense jungle, and after following the 
trail for a while, he was tricked and lost the target. 

The incident happened so suddenly. Nyx stayed put, looking around. She didn't wander 
off but sat on a nearby chair, waiting for Theon to return. Soon after, the rustling in the 
woods started again. 

“Theon?” Nyx turned her head at the sound, only to be startled when she met a pair of 
familiar green eyes. The leopard, having been wandering outside for these days, 
seemed to have fully turned into a real wild beast, exuding raw animal instincts. As their 
eyes met, the massive body suddenly pounced, fiercely pinning her down onto the 
chair. 

“Ah!” Nyx cried out. All Nu 

The hard edge of the chair dug into her arm, and this time, it wasn't pretend-she really 
felt the pain and hissed as she held her arm. This completely surprised the leopard; he 
hadn't expected Nyx to be so fragile. The leopard jumped up in shock, awkwardly 
pacing around Nyx in circles, and then raised his paw, angrily scratching at the hard 
metal edge of the chair. His claws were sharp enough to slice through iron. 



A loud crashing sound rang in Nyx's cars, making her shudder and widen her eyes. 
Ordinary leopard claws shouldn't have this kind of strength. 

She seriously suspected that the leopard was threatening her. If she didn't comply, 
perhaps her fate would be like that of this 

As Nyx watched in fear, the leopard, having vented his frustration, cautiously moved 
closer to her again, this time trying to lick her arm. 

Wild animals heal by licking their wounds, and the leopard seemed to think Nyx was too 
clumsy to do it herself, so he decided to take over. 

"Don't lick.” Nyx quickly stopped him by pushing his large head away, not letting him do 
it 

The tongue of a cat was covered with sharp barbs, and she feared that it would make 
things worse if he licked her, so she blocked him. To calm the leopard down. Nyx 
pushed the prey she had picked up toward him. 

The Jeopard tilted his head in confusion and pushed the prey back toward her with his 
paw. He was good at hunting and wouldn't go hungry. He was more than capable of 
feeding his female. 

But it seemed like she didn't want to accept him. 

He wondered, “Why is she rejecting me now when she accepted it before? Does she 
not like this prey? Or is it because I accidentally hurt her earlier, making her upset? 
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After a bit of back-and-forth, seeing that the leopard was insistent on offering the gift, 
Nyx finally relented. "Fine. I'll hold 



onto it for you." 

A glint of satisfaction flashed in the leopard's eyes as he leaned in to sniff her neck. 

Her fair and soft neck emitted a sweet fragrance, and the leopard's eyes half-closed in 
delight, his sharp teeth clenching and unclenching, tempted to bite down on the soft 
flesh of Nyx's neck, but he hesitated. 

She was too fragile. He wondered what he should feed his partner to make her 
stronger. A partner this fragile couldn't handle him. The leopard shook its fur, troubled. 

Having a wild beast pushing against the back of her neck, seemingly weighing how to 
strike, Nyx couldn't help but shiver and finally shouted. "Theon!" 

Come catch this leopard!' she thought. 

Hearing Nyx's call, the angry golden-haired lion roared and sped back, but missed 
again. That sly leopard had already vanished like the wind-gone without a trace. 

After this lesson, for several days, as soon as Nyx went out during the day. Theon 
stayed by her side, never giving the leopard a chance. At night, Theon stayed outside 
Nyx's window, not allowing the leopard to come 

near. 

In the middle of the night, light rain began to fall. Nyx was woken by the sound of the 
rain and, looking out the window, saw that Theon was still outside, keeping watch. 

"Do you want to come in and sleep?” She knocked on the window and waved at him. 
Although she felt a little shy about being alone with him in the room at night, she 
couldn't let Theon stay out in the rain. 

Theon seemed even more shy than she was. Hearing Nyx's invitation, the innocent 
young male's ears turned red and warm. He lowered his head, hesitating for a while 
before finally gathering the courage to crawl through the window into the bedroom. 

I'll sleep on the floor. I won't move, Theon turned into a lion and lay at Nyx's feet, 
seriously assuring her. shy about inviting him to the bed, Nyx carefully covered him with 
her blanket. For a moment, the large lion was ded by the sweet scent of Nyx. He almost 
couldn't resist rolling over on the spot. 

This happy life was something he could never have imagined before meeting Nyx. Just 
being allowed into the room, and staying close to his beloved female, made him feel 
incredibly content. 



Early the next morning, Felix and Zayne's faces changed when they saw Theon walking 
out of Nyx's bedroom with at satisfied look on his face. With Theon's character, he 
wouldn't do something like sneaking into a female's bedroom, so Nyx probably invited 
him. 

"It was raining last night. Nyx asked me to come in to avoid the rain, Theon explained 
calmly. Because of the rain, Nyx had slept in longer than usual and hadn't woken up yet. 
She rarely let herself sleep in, and the males didn't want to wake her up. 

No one stopped her, and Nyx slept deeply, only waking up close to noon. By then, the 
rain had stopped, though the sky was still a bit gloomy. She felt all her muscles soft 
from sleep, sluggishly getting out of bed and sitting there, lost in thought. 

Suddenly, there was a light tap on the window. Nyx's heart skipped a beat, and her 
previously fuzzy mind instantly cleared. She turned to look-A large, fluffy leopard paw 
appeared in front of her. 

Instinctively. Nyx wanted to shout for help, but quickly stopped herself. She feared the 
leopard might run off before anyone 
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could arrive. It would be better to lure the leopard in first, then call for help. 
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Nyx made up her mind and waved at the leopard through the window, trying to catch its 
attention and ease its wariness. The leopard stared at the suddenly friendly female, 
unblinking, intrigued. 

Nyx walked over and opened the window. "Come in. 

The leopard seemed unmoved, still quietly observing her. From the slight rubbing of his 
paw, Nyx could tell he wasn't as calm as he appeared. But no matter how much she 
coaxed, he didn't take the bait. 

After thinking for a moment, Nyx took a few steps back, sat down, and signaled for the 
leopard to come over, increasing her efforts to entice him. The temptation was too 



strong, and the leopard couldn't resist. After hesitating for a moment, he finally jumped 
through the window. 

Seemingly remembering how his previous rash actions had hurt her, this time he moved 
slowly and carefully, approaching Nyx with graceful, measured steps. Nyx held her 
breath.  

3/3 

 

 

 
Of The Beastmen 99 

Chapter 99 

The leopard was very alert. Even in front of Nyx, he didn't show much trust, with his 
ears always perked up, vigilant. It seemed like as soon as there was any movement, he 
would disappear right on the spot. 

If it weren't for Nyx's irresistible charm, he would never have been so easily hooked. 
That night, he saw a few guys lying on her lap, and he felt a twinge of jealousy. 

And now, after his persistent pursuit, she had finally given him a chance. The leopard 
couldn't hold back his excitement and burrowed his head into Nyx's arms. 

The opportunity had come. Nyx hugged him tightly, restraining his movement, and 
shouted loudly, "Theon, Zayne, Felix!" 

She couldn't let this leopard wander around any longer. Catching him was for his own 
good. 

The leopard roared in disbelief, snarling, as if betrayed. His emerald eyes gleamed with 
hatred. He opened his large mouth, ready to bite the female, but when he got close, he 
couldn't bring himself to do it. 

The leopard retracted his teeth, avoiding her vulnerable neck, and instead lowered his 
head to lick Nyx twice, as if marking her as his own. 

Though his tongue had barbs, Nyx wasn't injured due to the clothes between them, but 
she inhaled sharply, instinctively loosening her grip and clutching her clothes tightly. 



The leopard avoided her neck and chose a more delicate spot. The naive leopard 
thought the female was indeed soft, while Nyx's face turned bright red. "Pervert!" 

Seizing the opportunity when she loosened her grip, the leopard immediately jumped 
out of the window and fled. 

The guardians rushed into the bedroom, leaving Zayne to comfort Nyx, while the two 
male lions chased after the leopard, disappearing in the blink of an eye. 

Are 

you hurt, Nyx?” Zayne asked, gently checking if she had been scratched or bitten by the 
leopard. 

Ny hook her head, no wounds, but her face remained flushed for a long time. She was 
too embarrassed to tell Zayne what 

ard had done. 

After some time of wandering, it seemed the leopard had become familiar with every 
corner of the estate. Even though the two male lions chased him, he still managed to 
hide successfully. 

Theon's face was grim. "I'm going to chop down those trees." 

Felix didn't object. His patience had reached its limit. Once Kai returned to normal, he 
was going to have a good talk with him using fists. 

After breakfast, Nyx's mood calmed a little, and she stopped Theon from chopping down 
the trees. The trees in the estate were growing beautifully; it would be a pity to cut them 
down. 

The leopard had already set his sights on her and would surely come after her again. 

This time, it was her own recklessness, next time, she should try to hold the leopard off 
first, use Mental Soothing to at least calm him for a moment, then call someone to 
restrain him. 

"Next time, we'll catch him, Nyx comforted the frustrated Theon. 
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To relax, Nyx gave herself a half-day break. In the afternoon, she went out to stroll the 
streets with Theon. Going on a date with Nyx made Theon overjoyed. He threw all his 
worries aside, tightly holding Nyx's hand. 

"Do you want to eat that, Nyx? Theon noticed Nyx staring at a stall selling ice cream 
and leaned down to ask her. 

Nyx blinked, nodded in agreement. Actually, she had a vague feeling that someone's 
scorching gaze was fixed on her, but it wasn't directed at the stall 

However, when Theon asked, she actually felt like eating it. As for that gaze, maybe it 
was just an overly enthusiastic fan. When out and about, she couldn't avoid being 
stared at, but she had gotten used to it. 

Anyway, with Theon around, even the most enthusiastic fan wouldn't dare to approach 
and disturbs her. The vendor was overjoyed to see an SSS-level female wanting their 
ice cream, and generously gave Nyx almost double the portion. It was so much that Nyx 
couldn't finish it. After taking a few bites, she shook her head, indicating she had 
enough. 

Theon naturally took over the remaining ice cream. It was completely normal for a male 
to eat his female's leftovers. Theon didn't mind at all, even enjoying it. 

In a dark corner, the leopard was watching this scene intently. The food that Nyx had 
eaten was now being carefully tasted by the male beside her. 

Remembering how Nyx had betrayed him, and now, in front of him, she was being 
intimate with another male, the leopard couldn't resist reaching out his claws to scratch 
the ground, lowering his body and showing a fierce look. His ears were flattened like 
airplane wings. 

His eyes slowly turned red with rage. The leopard shook his head, his mind seeming to 
cloud over, and after struggling for a moment, he suddenly exploded into a frenzied 
roar, charging toward Theon. 

The crowd gasped. 



"A leopard!" 

“Such terrifying speed-Is this really a leopard?”  

"It must be a Male Beastman." 

"This one's SS-level. It definitely is." 

Wher 

pard made its move, anyone with combat experience immediately assessed its strength. 
An SS-level male, beast form as a leopard, his identity was already clear. 

"Lord Kai?" 

"Oh my god." 

"He lost control again." 

"Nyx please save him!" 

It was obvious to anyone with keen eyes that the leopard was out of control, not just 
losing it, but going wild. The Loss of Control Index might have already skyrocketed 
above 90. If the Loss of Control Index hit 100, there would be no saving him. 

Nyx was anxious, but this time, the fight between Theon and the leopard was even 
fiercer than when they were at the Supervision Office. She couldn't intervene. She could 
only brace herself and urgently perform Mental Soothing for the leopard. 
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The onlookers didn't dare step forward, holding their breath, hoping Nyx could save the 
leopard. But they also knew that under these circumstances, asking Nyx to perform 



Mental Soothing for the leopard was unrealistic. Most likely, they would have to wait for 
Supervision Office or Marshal Lane to intervene. 

Nyx's forehead broke out in a light sweat. Fortunately, she had spent a lot of time in the 
Supervision Office performing Mental Soothing for many Male Beastmen, and the 
sapling had grown a fifth leaf, expanding its purification range significantly 

She managed to dissipate the black mist on the leopard, even as his frantic movements 
made it hard to track. As the black mist faded, the leopard's eyes slowly regained some 
calimmess. His attacks slowed, and he distanced himself from Theon, turning his head 
to look at Nyx. 

With some of his composure back, the leopard stopped clinging to Theon and slowly 
walked toward Nyx. That was the true target he wanted to approach. 

As he drew closer to Nyx, the black mist continued to fade. Just as he was about to get 
even closer, the expression in his eyes changed completely. He froze, rooted to the 
spot. 

Nyx breathed a sigh of relief. She had succeeded. When she looked up, she was 
shocked to see the now- rational leopard step back several paces, distancing himself 
from her as if she were some kind of disaster. 

Murmurs spread through the crowd. 

It seems like he's fine? 

Incredible." 

"Huh?" 

"Why did Lord Kai pull away?" 

"They are the opposite sexes. It's normal for him to keep his distance." 

"But that's Lord Nyx!" 

"Doesn't he like Lord Nyx?" 
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The leopard, now calm, completely lost all his previous affection for Nyx. 

The Supervision Office staff arrived and took the leopard away. Nyx followed closely 
behind, still uneasy. 

Along the way, the leopard didn't speak a word to her. He was silent and stiff, like a 
stone. This was completely different from the image Nyx had of him. 

It was as if just as the crowd had said, he didn't like Nyx. Being too close to her made 
him uncomfortable, so he kept his 

distance. 

The atmosphere was incredibly awkward. Seeing the leopard's cold attitude, Nyx didn't 
dwell on it. She stopped trying to press him and instead turned to check if Theon was 
injured. 

Tm not hurt.” Theon pulled her into an embrace, resting her head on his shoulder. "Rest 
for a while, Nyx." Nyx had expended a lot of energy trying to soothe leopard, so she 
obediently snuggled against Theon and closed her eyes to 

At a moment when no one was paying attention, the leopard's emerald eyes shifted 
silently, landing on the two of them before quickly looking away. 

Just that one glance made a wave of agitation rise within him. He shook his ears, and 
then lay down. He forced himself not to look and listen. He would never let himself be 
captured by a female, never become a slave to one. 

Nyx had no idea the leopard was going through such inner turmoil. She only felt relieved 
once she saw him safely arrive at the Supervision Office. 

"Lord Kai's situation is quite special. We'll keep him here for a while longer until he 
stabilizes, a staff member at the Supervision Office told Nyx. 

“Okay, Nyx nodded. "If he loses control again, please let me know anytime. I'll help.” 

The staff member gratefully nodded, but suddenly heard a soft voice from not far away, 

"No need❞ 

Nyx look 

rin surprise and froze for a moment. The newcomer was a young and handsome male, 
with striking green eyes that due attention. He was dressed simply yet appropriately, 



exuding grace and elegance. He was the least intimidating male Nyx had met since her 
arrival in this world. 

He didn't approach Nyx but instead bowed from a distance. "Greetings, Nyx. I am Kai." 

Standing upright, his gaze met Nyx's perfectly—polite yet not making her feel 
scrutinized or uncomfortable. Nyx couldn't fathom how this male could be the same as 
that leopard. 

Kai's demeanor was flawless, as though he were wearing a mask. After the polite 
exchange, he clarified his intentions. Thank 

your previous Mental Soothing, but you needn't worry about me anymore. I will remain 
in the Supervision Office." 

you 

for 

Nyx was taken aback, her eyes trembling slightly. He was refusing Mental Soothing. 
Nyx had never encountered such a situation before, and her brows furrowed deeply. 
"But- 

Before she could finish, Kai added, "There are many males who look forward to your 
Mental Soothing. You needn't waste your energy on someone like me.” 

With that, he respectfully bowed again before turning and walking away, leaving Nyx 
standing there, unsure of what to do. 
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Nyx was a little worried. The next day, while performing Mental Soothing for other 
males, she asked the staff at the Supervision Office for more information about Kai. 
Sure enough, Kai had lost control again. 

"I want to see him.” Nyx couldn't help but furrow her brows. 

The Supervision Office was also concerned about Kaï's condition and naturally didn't 
refuse Nyx's request. 

Through the transparent viewing window, Nyx once again saw the familiar leopard. The 
moment she arrived, the leopard. eagerly approached her, its green eyes full of her 
figure, lying by the window and staring at her intently. 

The barrier of the viewing window seemed to make the leopard anxious, and it rammed 
forcefully into the transparent glass. The holding room had been personally designed by 
Kai, with special materials capable of withstanding his outbursts. 

But with the small female right there, the leopard was unwilling to give up easily. He 
even seemed unwilling to stay in his familiar nest, wanting only to break through the 
barrier and get to Nyx. 

Nyx watched helplessly as the leopard repeatedly slammed into the sturdy partition, as 
if it wouldn't stop until it bled. She quickly crouched down, reached her hand through the 
food slot, and gently shook it, trying to catch his attention. 

The staff were horrified and rushed to stop Nyx. 

"Don't do that." 

"Please, don't." 

"It's too dangerous." 

The leopard was indeed attracted and leaned towards Nyx's shaking hand. He lowered 
his body and carefully observed her delicate, fragile hand, sniffing around it in circles. 

In the tense atmosphere, the leopard studied for a while but didn't do what the staff 
feared. Instead, he turned around, pushed his lunch through the food slot into Nyx's 
hand, and let out a low growl, hoping she would accept it 

Trapped in the holding room, he couldn't hunt. He could go hungry, but his fragile 
female had to be fed. The staff watched this in shock. In the leopard's survival instinct, 
this kind of selfless offering shouldn't exist, yet it was happening with Kai. Nyx felt a 
strange mix of emotions. Without realizing it, she had grown attached to this leopard. 



For the next few days, Nyx visited Kai every day. Occasionally, Kai would temporarily 
regain control. During these moments, his attitude toward Nyx was unusually cold. 
Although his words were gentle, he treated Nyx no differently from anyone else, as 
though he didn't care for her at all. 

Nyx 

to him kindly, “I won't touch you, we can maintain some distance. 

Mental Soothing, you don't need to feel any pressure, she replied. 

Her Mental Soothing was different from the others; it didn't require physical contact. 
Even if Kai didn't like her, there was no need to reject her Mental Soothing 

But Kai still refused. "What do you want from me?" He couldn't understand Nyx's 
persistence. 

There was nothing about him that was worth the persistence of an SSS-level female. "Is 
it because I've been cold toward you that it has sparked your desire to conquer me?” 

He didn't want to be a lapdog circling around Nyx just because he had received Nyx's 
kindness. Kai gave a self-mocking smile. 
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As an SSS-level female, Nyx was never short of male admirers. Even if it seemed like 
she showed some interest in him, that interest would surely be shallow and fleeting. 



Once he really became Nyx's dog and was abandoned, there would only be one 
outcome-death. His mother died from depression caused by unrequited love, and he 
inherited her obsession completely. Rather than tragically repeating the same fate, he'd 
rather die from losing control. 

Nyx sighed helplessly, shaking her head, “I didn't mean that. 

She didn't need so many males surrounding her. Right now, she had three guardians 
and a cute Cotton Candy, which was already more than enough. If there were any 
more, she might not be able to handle it. After a long silence, Kai lowered his eyes, his 
tone returning to calm, "I'm sorry for what I said earlier. You 

can punish me as 

you see fit." 

Any number of lashes would be fine. He was used to receiving punishment. 

Of course, Nyx wouldn't hold onto such a small offense. For the leopard with such a 
tragic background and who had hardly known kindness, she had a great deal of 
tolerance, fully understanding his defensive, prickly 

demeanor. 

"There's no need for punishment, but please believe me, I truly don't have any improper 
thoughts," said Nyx. 

The reason she was so persistent was because Kai's Loss of Control Index was rising, 
and she watched as the leopard became more and more insane and agitated. It was 
hard for her to bear. 

"You aren't punishing me?" Kai was stunned. 

He had been prepared to be beaten half to death, thinking that was the lesson he 
deserved. But Nyx had casually brushed it off 

Why is she being so lenient with me? he thought. Kai's gaze flickered slightly, but soon 
returned to stillness. 

Even though Kai acted disdainfully toward Nyx in his human form, in his beast form, the 
leopard's longing for Nyx was completely unmasked. Every time they met, the leopard 
almost wanted to punch a hole in the wall 

and rush to Nyx's side. 



Nyx had refused several times, yet he still stubbornly saved his food for Nyx, even if it 
meant going hungry himself, and his once glossy fur had lost some of its shine.  

The staff at the Supervision Office couldn't understand if Kai liked Nyx or hated her. 

At 3:00 pm, it was Nyx's regular visiting time for Kai, which had been happening for 
several days. 

Today 

elly returned to normal. In his human form, the young male was well-dressed, quietly 
sitting in the was no 

sign of anticipation on him, unlike when he was a leopard-he would already be wagging 
his tail at the window, eagerly waiting for Nyx. 

Nyx didn't show up at the expected time. Kai substly shifted his sitting position. At 3:10 
p.m., Kai stood up 

and began pacing. At 3:30 p.m., his perfect disguise finally showed a crack. He 
impatiently called for the staff, "Where isn't she here yet?" 

 

 

 
 

 


