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Chapter 661

Someone tried to attack Leo

While Leo had become huge as soon as we came to this world, I still could not believe that she was 
the strongest creature here.

To me, she was always my buddyeven if her appearance changed a little.

In any case, after seeing her fight monsters, and after we spent time in this world, I started to 
understand that there really wasnt anything that could stand against her.

She had even knocked Rahle out of the air so easily.

Stillto try to defeat Leoor any Silver Fenrir. That sounded very foolisheven if this person was from 
the royal family.

You know this person, Mr. Ekenhart?

Well, he was the duke, so it would not be surprising.

Mmm. Well, yes. I was thinking that you two would meet eventuallybut not like this It is the person 
that we spoke of before, regarding that weapon.

He meant the katana.

I suppose he didnt say it directly, because Mr. Harnes was here.

Apparently, it was because of this person that he readily believed that I came from another world.

So they were from the royal family



But chief. The person seems to have been cooperative?

We villagers came together and made a request. As we did not want to cause trouble for Mr. Takumi 
or Leo

I seewell. I can see how that would work

This personthey see Silver Fenrir as enemies?

No, not exactly But it is complicated. Though, it should be fine, as Leo would not lose anyway.

Booom!

What was that sound and shaking!?

What!?

Its coming from outside. Your Grace, stay here. I shall go look

No, Sebastian. Its fine. I can already guess what happened. HahIm sorry, Mr. Takumi. Will you 
come with me now?

Uh, yes.

I had thought it was an earthquake at first, but it sounded like something heavy had dropped.

And so as Mr. Ekenhart sighed, we stepped out of Mr. Harness house.

Woaaah!! I found you, Silver Fenrir!

Wuff?



The first thing that I saw was a man running towards Leo as she played with the dogs. The man was 
holding a katana above his head.

The guards were stunned after the noise, and were not prepared to stop him.

Leo!

Its fine, Mr. Takumi.

Mr. Ekenhart?

See. Leo does not care.

Ah

When I looked at her

Wou Wou?

You! You! You cowardly Silver Fenrir!

Wou

While the man was swinging madlyhe was never able to reach Leo.

This was because Leo was pressing his face with her front paw and keeping him at bay.

It looked like an adult handling a wild child.

Hah Normally, he would not make such a fool of himself Only, he is terrible with using a sword. If 
it was magiche is one of the best in the world



I see

Mr. Ekenhart let out another sigh.

But if he was such a great magician, why was he using a sword? Why not fight Leo with magic?

I didnt mention it before, but he is not trying to kill a Silver Fenrir. However, he thinks it is his duty 
to defeat the strongest monster. He already knows that they are superior with magic, and so he is 
trying with a sword

Hah

Had he lost with magic in the past then?

I was a little relieved to know that he wasnt trying to kill Leo, butgetting Leo to admit defeat did not 
seem that hard to me.

I would just dangle some sausages in front of her. Of course, I would feel bad, and would not do 
such a thing just so that I could say that I beat her.

The bird monster wanted a friendly relationship So if it is so scared of Silver Fenrirs, then surely it 
would not have attacked? It just wanted to make contact, I suppose? It seems that way Mr. Takumi. 
Is that why you were so surprised earlier? One of the reasons the

The traveler was an important person We were showna crest. Crest? In other words, this person was 
a noble? It is something that proves you are a noble. A commoner would not have it. Howeversurely 
the villagers wouldnt even know what it is? Wellit was a crest that everyone in

Sebastian remembered something So, what is the monster saying? After Leo frightened it, it does 
not seem hostile anymore. Is it safe? Indeed Leo had finished talking with the bird monster, and so 
we moved away. I wanted to talk with the others for now. We were dozens of meters
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A woman came and intervened

“You! Damn it!”

“In any case, I must stop this. Your Excellency, have you not done enough?”

“Hmm. I know that voice. Tsk… But I finally found a Silver Fenrir. I will not give up!”

“But you were already defeated from the beginning.”

“What are you talking about! I have not lost…”

“Hmm?”

“Wou?”

“Please stop this at once!”

It was unusual to see Mr. Ekenhart speak to a superior with a tone of respect.

Regardless, the man did not stop flailing his arms.

It was then that a woman seemed to appear out of nowhere, and she hit the man on the head.

It looked quite painful… Also, she had a lot of courage, approaching a man who was swinging a 
sword so wildly.

“Excuse me, Lord Liebert. It has been a long time.”

“Yes. But I see that you have not changed at all… Is he alright?”

“One needs to be this strict, or he will not listen. Don’t worry. He actually likes it.”



“I-I see…”

“Gah… Even if I’m alright, it still hurts, you know? Even though the other part is true…”

“You did not even listen to Lord Liebert’s voice. It is your fault.”

“Yes, but… Oh, nevermind…”

He was fine with it…?

After being hit on the head and falling to the ground, he got back up to his feet as if nothing had 
happened.

“Ah, sorry. I sensed the presence of a Silver Fenrir and got carried away.”

“Hah… You are lucky that it was good Leo, Your Excellency. Any other Silver Fenrir would have 
attacked you…and you would have been in great danger.”

“It is in the past. Besides, I’ve already lived long enough. It would not be the worst way to die.”

“Do not say such things, Your Excellency. You are an important figure in this country. You cannot 
die so easily.”

“Wou… Wuff?”

“Uh, I don’t understand what is happening either, Leo.”

Leo looked at me as if she did not know what to do. But I wasn’t sure either.

Still…Mr. Ekenhart was usually the one to make Sebastian and Ms. Claire sigh with exasperation. 
But now it was his turn.



Speaking of Ms. Claire and the others, they also seemed to be at a loss, and were just staring 
quietly.

“Hmm? Could it be that you are this Silver Fenrir’s owner?”

“Uh, well… I guess?”

“Wuff!”

The man suddenly turned around to face me. He had realized that Leo and I were talking.

I didn’t really like to think of myself as her owner now. But I just nodded anyway.

Though, Leo barked as if to say, ‘That is right!’

“I see, I see. Uh, I am sorry about earlier. I was excited… Ahh, it is not because I hate Silver Fenrirs 
or anything. Do not worry. My name is Euto. And you?”

“Ah, Takumi… And this is Leo.”

“Takumi. Good. And Leo…a good name. It is very dashing and masculine, I suppose? Perfect!”

“Wou!!”

He had a very casual and cheerful way of speaking. It did not give the impression of someone from 
the royal family, or a great noble like Mr. Ekenhart.

Well, I suppose Mr. Ekenhart was purposely acting like that, so he would be intimidating.

As for this…Euto? He began to pet Leo while praising her name.

His hostility towards her was completely gone…



“Uh, sorry. But please don’t call Leo such things. She is a girl…”

“Oh? A girl? Ah…yes…a very nice name!”

It was possible that Leo did not mind, but I decided to correct him anyway.

After all, it was my fault for giving her that name.

Still… He was the first person who seemed to be surprised that Leo had that name while being a 
girl.

He was definitely strange… And his dark hair and eyes were certainly familiar…

I was the Duke’s favorite A child with Ms. Claire… The mere thought was embarrassing and much 
too soon. Well, at least I didn’t have to worry too much about Tilura… Well, who knew what would 
happen? “With Barsler, it has already been decided. Because he only has one daughter.…

I started cooking in the kitchen “In any case, please go and deliver the herbs.” “Yes, I will take them 
to Mr. Kalis!” I had no idea why Milina and Nick thought so highly of me. Still, I did not want to 
keep Mr. Kalis waiting too long, and I…

I told them about the misunderstanding “Hohoho. Liza will be very happy when she hears about it.” 
“Um…don’t do that. It’s embarrassing.” “Hmm, but embarrassing Mr. Takumi is also good. Don’t 
you agree, Claire?” “Indeed… Oh! Um! No… That would be rude to him, father.” “You should just 
admit it…
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I talked with the stranger

“Your Excellency…”

“Yes, I know. Indeed… Hart. Is there any place where we can talk without being bothered?”



“Yes. As I said before, the chief’s house would be appropriate. Is that alright, chief?”

“Ah, yes! Certainly! Please use it for as long as you want!”

“It won’t be very long, ahaha. For now, Hart and Mr. Takumi?”

“Yes, it should not be too many people.”

“Very well. Can I leave it to you…Hart?”

“Yes, certainly.”

“…Uhh?”

“Wuff?”

Apparently, I was going to join the other three in some conversation. But I didn’t really understand 
what was going on.

In fact, I was more distracted by the fact that he was calling Mr. Ekenhart ‘Hart’…

“So, where should we begin?”

“With confirming…”

“Indeed.”

After getting Mr. Harnes’s permission, we returned to the house so that the four of us could talk.

Apparently, the woman was called Ms. Lugretta, and she was standing behind Lord Euto…kind of 
like how Sebastian stood.



She had a greatsword on her back, and long hair that went to her waist.

She was taller than Ms. Claire…similar to me. And since she was fully covered in armor, she must 
be a guard like Phillip.

However, the armor was completely black, and she had a mysterious air about her… She had even 
glared at me. It was quite intense.

As for the man, he was dressed more casually in leather. Aside from the sword at his waist, he 
looked like an ordinary traveler.

He was probably a few years older than me.

“Now, Mr. Takumi.”

“Yes.”

“You really don’t have to be so nervous, alright? We are not going to eat you… Well, maybe you are 
the one who should say that, since you have a Silver Fenrir. In any case, just call me Mr. Euto. So…
you have come from a different world, have you?”

“Huh…? How did you know?”

“I did not say anything.”

If it wasn’t from Mr. Ekenhart, how?

It was just a fantastical idea… Even if I had the Gift, you wouldn’t know I was from a different 
world…

Even at the mansion, only a few servants knew. I had not even told Liza.



I did mean to tell her eventually, though she would find it difficult to understand. I did not want to 
confuse her while she was still getting used to her new environment.

“No one told me. I just thought about it after looking at you. Because I am also from another 
world…”

“Huh?”

“Well, I suppose you would be surprised… There are not many of us. Only Hart and a few others 
know about me.”

“…This is why I believed you immediately, Mr. Takumi. Because I already knew someone like 
you.”

“I see…”

“Well, there are others like us. But only a few important people know about it. So do not go around 
talking about it, alright?”

“To be precise, it is those who rank above a marquis who know. Someone like Lord Liebert would 
be told. Though, it is only told to the head of the house, and not their children or servants.”

“Well, in Mr. Takumi’s case, he has not been forbidden. So if he thinks he can trust someone, then 
that is fine.”

“…Though, he may be targeted.”

“That is why we have a special power, isn’t it now?”

“Indeed. A power that can be very useful, if used correctly.”

I could hardly understand or keep up with what they were talking about.

I was surprised that there were other people like me.



However, that did make me feel…kind of happy.

“Hmm? Why are you smiling, Mr. Takumi?”

“No, it’s just…it’s nice that there are also other people from other worlds…”

“Huh, interesting. Some people I knew were upset to find out that they weren’t as special as they 
thought…”

“Yes, I heard that there were even people who tried to kill you.”

“Ah, there was someone like that. But since I was in this world longer, I was able to run away.”

“That is quite surprising to hear…”

The traveler was an important person “We were shown…a crest.” “Crest? In other words, this 
person was a noble?” “It is something that proves you are a noble. A commoner would not have it. 
However…surely the villagers wouldn’t even know what it is?” “Well…it was a crest that everyone 
in…

I decided to leave them and go to sleep “Sebastian!?” “Sebastian!?” “It is late. You must be quiet, or 
you will wake up the others. Unless you do not mind disturbing their sleep, even though it will 
affect their performance tomorrow.” Sebastian’s voice was very thorny indeed. I quickly opened…

We talked with Mr. Harnes “So, what happened with those dogs? I do not remember them being 
here the last time…” “Yes. They were not.” First, Mr. Ekenhart asked the thing he had been 
wondering about. “After Mr. Takumi and Leo saved our village, we had to think of other…
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Mr. Euto was a friendly person



“Well, since we are from the same place, let’s be friends, Takumi. You don’t have to speak formally 
with me.”

“Oh, do you mean you’re from Japan?”

“Yes. Not all of the others are. And so people like you are rare.”

“You should do what you like, Mr. Takumi. Besides, since you have Leo, you are even higher in 
rank in some ways.”

“Ah…in that case… I will?”

“Great! Now, I’m sure you have it too, Takumi. Can you tell me about it?”

“About what…?”

“The Gift. It is not an ability that just anyone has. But you do have it, don’t you?”

“Uh…”

Yes, I had a Gift called Weed Cultivation.

However, unlike Leo, that was something that I was supposed to keep a secret. And I rarely used it 
in front of other people.

I suppose it was possible that Mr. Harnes had told him… But he did not seem like the kind of 
person that would do that.

“Oh, are you suspicious of me now?”

“No… But, uh…how did you know that I had it?”

“Indeed… There is one condition in order to gain it. And you happen to fit it. As do I.”



“Huh?”

When I had first come to this world, Sebastian had said that no one else in the country had it.

“Judging by your reaction, you don’t know what the condition is. But I suppose it is to be expected, 
if you haven’t met anyone else like that.”

“So…what is the condition? I had heard that no one else in this country had the Gift…”

“Well, that’s because it is kept a secret. Only a small few know about it.”

So Mr. Ekenhart would have known…but not Sebastian.

“In any case, it is quite simple. You have to have come from another world. If you are such a 
person, then you will have the Gift.”

“Another world… But I’ve heard of people awakening to their ability shortly after being born?”

“Because they were the descendants of someone who came from another world. They inherited the 
ability. However, it is not a sure thing.”

“I see…”

In other words, everyone in this world who has it either came from another world, or was the child 
of someone who did. That would explain why it was so rare.

“So, what is your ability, Takumi? I have to know if it is dangerous or not. Perhaps it will have a 
negative effect on this country…on this world. But then again, you have a Silver Fenrir. That might 
actually be more important…”

He said with a laugh.



Mr. Ekenhart was laughing as well. Though, Ms. Lugretta was looking at me sharply. She probably 
really did want to know if it was a dangerous ability or not.

“Uh, it is called Weed Cultivation. An ability…that allows you to make plants…”

“Weed Cultivation… Hmm… What do you think?”

“It does not sound very dangerous to me. I doubt there is a problem?”

“…It depends on how it is used. But if that is what you think, Lugretta, then we’ll leave it at that. 
Besides, he does not seem like a dangerous person.”

I suppose he was thinking about poisonous plants… The thought had occurred to me as well. Even 
if I had no intention of ever doing something like that.

While I was relieved, Mr. Ekenhart was also sighing…

Perhaps he thought there was a danger that the plans to make herbal fields would be stopped. He 
might even have been required to take responsibility, if they thought that I was a problem.

“Well, it would not be fair for me to ask and then not tell you mine. My Gift is Magic Control. A 
Gift where I can use any kind of magic. The effects can be used infinitely… I suppose it is the same 
with yours?”

“Effects…? Uh, like changing the plants into a different state?”

I made too much Loe “Well, since I made it without permission, you might not want it yet… I can 
always just keep it.” “...As it is a rare herb, we would gladly accept it regardless. I see, because we 
are going to the forest.” “Yes. But with Leo and…

We talked with Mr. Harnes “So, what happened with those dogs? I do not remember them being 
here the last time…” “Yes. They were not.” First, Mr. Ekenhart asked the thing he had been 
wondering about. “After Mr. Takumi and Leo saved our village, we had to think of other…



We Arrived in the town of Ractos “Mr. Takumi, why do you look so serious?” “No...I was just 
thinking about what these Gifts are.” “What they are…” “Mr. Takumi, while it is said that Gifts are 
something that give various abilities, there are not many people who have them. And…
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I could not understand what Mr. Euto was talking about

“Maltese turned into a Silver Fenrir… I don’t know if I should laugh or be surprised…”

“I was surprised…”

“Well, you were living together when it happened… Hmm? I see. Is that how it is?”

“Huh?”

“Takumi, this is a theory I have… About why we have Gifts if we come from a different world.”

Apparently, he had gotten an idea after thinking about how Leo had changed. But how was that 
related to the Gift?

“There is no guarantee that it is true. However, as people from another world, it is necessary for us 
to be able to live in this world. Not just with magic, but with language. Have you ever thought it 
was strange that you were able to understand words and letters?”

“I have thought about it. But I never came to any conclusion. It’s not like anyone could tell me the 
answer.”

“Indeed. My idea is that when we come here, our bodies are remade.”

“Remade?”

“In other words, we are made as a human from this world. I don’t know how. And I think that this 
world is in a different dimension.”



In this world, even if there were slight differences in the way that things sounded, I could 
understand things accurately. It was the same with writing.

Not only that, but if I tried to write in Japanese, it would come out as writing from this world…

Though, I didn’t know what that had to do with dimensions.

I wasn’t really good at thinking about such things.

“In any case, if our old world is a high dimension, and this is a low dimension, there would be 
excess energy when transitioning. And that energy is forced into our bodies and transforms into the 
Gift…”

“Uh, huh…”

And then we have the Maltese. As it traveled in the same way, the result of being reformed was 
turning into a Silver Fenrir. What do you think?”

“I don’t know…”

“Ah, there is one other thing I wanted to ask you. What time were you in Japan?”

“Time? I suppose it was night…because we went to sleep and woke up here.”

“Eh? Oh, you misunderstood. Uh…what year?”

“Ah, two thousand…”

And so I told him the year and month.

I didn’t remember the exact day, as I had been so busy with work.



“I see. So it was about two years after me.”

“Two years… You seem like you’ve been here a lot longer.”

It felt like he had forgotten a lot in just two years.

But then again, I had not been here that long, so I didn’t know what it was like.

“Aye. Because even if I came two years before you in Japan, more time has passed in this world.”

“What?”

“Uhh… To put it simply, time moves differently in this world and the other world. For instance, 
there was someone who came just a few days after I did…but there was a ten year difference in this 
world. On the other hand, there was someone who traveled months later, and it had not even been 
twenty years here.”

“A few days can be ten years…but months not be twenty. Yes, I don’t understand the laws…”

“It is not as if people come here on some regular schedule. And so we don’t really know how it 
works. The cause or reason. A difference in time and dimension…it’s not something that can be 
proven. All that we can know for certain is that time does not move at the same speed as it does 
over there.”

The Gift really was an ability I didn’t understand “Papa. Why are you able to make herbs so easily? 
Uhh…grandpa said that plants only grow when you wait a long time.” “Plants and animals are like 
that… But as I told you before, it is because of the Gift.” “I…

I talked with the stranger “Your Excellency…” “Yes, I know. Indeed… Hart. Is there any place 
where we can talk without being bothered?” “Yes. As I said before, the chief’s house would be 
appropriate. Is that alright, chief?” “Ah, yes! Certainly! Please use it for as long as you want!”…



I told Mr. Haines about Weed Cultivation “Indeed, it is hard to imagine someone growing herbs in 
great quantities. Growing them at all is almost unheard of in this country. Most people gather what 
is found in nature. …Mr. Takumi? Sebastian?” “It will be fine. As Mr. Haines is the…
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Long life was an understatement

A few days on earth could be a decade here…

So even if we came two years apart, I wonder how long Mr. Euto had spent here.

Wait? Since there was no discernible logic to it, perhaps it could be the other way around, and he 
hadn’t been here that long at all?

He did look older than me, but not by a lot.

If we were close in age, perhaps he had only been here for a few years…

“Ah, that’s right. There is one thing that I know.”

“What is that?”

“When coming to this world, time continues to pass in the other world in one direction. So anyone 
who comes here has to have come after I did.”

“But… Does that mean you’ve been here for over ten years?”

“More like a thousand years.”

“Huh? This is not something to joke about…”

“It’s not a joke. I had a very difficult time when I first came here… After all, I had to make this 
country.”



“Uh…”

“It’s true, Mr. Takumi. He is the father of this country. You will see his name in history books.”

Humans could not live for a thousand years.

I laughed, thinking that it had to be a joke, but Mr. Ekenhart shook his head.

He said that it was all true. What!?

Ms. Lugretta was also nodding behind him. What did this mean…

“Well, a lot happened. That is all that you need to know. Also, the reason that I lived so long is 
simple. It was because of the Gift.”

“Gift? The Gift gives you a long life?”

“It’s not that simple. Also, it is more that you do not age. I wish that being immortal was added to it. 
But I suppose that was too much. I can still die…”

“But Your Excellency is vital to this country.”

“…As you can see, they will not allow me to die. Not that I want to do that at this moment.”

Not aging seemed impressive enough for me.

He said that it wasn’t just about having the Gift. But I wondered if something similar was 
happening to me…

“Ah, don’t worry. You are not like me. If everyone who had the Gift did not age, then there would 
be a lot more of us still alive.”



“Oh, I see…”

Don’t worry… But that was something that everyone with authority wanted on earth. It was often in 
stories.

There would be a lot of people who are desperate for it.

As for me… I did not know for sure…

“As I said before, my Gift is Magic Control. So I can use any type of magic…including magic that 
stops aging.”

“Oh, so that’s why you said it was because of the Gift.”

“Yes. Well, after using it, I lost consciousness for a few days. It is not magic that any human is 
supposed to use… Perhaps it is different for Silver Fenrirs. Also, I cannot use it on others. If you 
want to stop aging, you have to use that magic. I don’t know why such magic even exists…”

He shrugged his shoulders with exasperation. But he was still the one who had tested it.

I ignored what he said about Silver Fenrirs. I doubted that Leo would want to do that. And there was 
no point in thinking about it now.

Regardless, I decided to ask Euto to tell me more about himself.

If he was the one who founded this country, then I wanted to know why he chose a Silver Fenrir for 
the crest. Things like that.

“Ah, I made a bet with a Silver Fenrir. And I lost, so I had to make the crest like that.”

“A Silver Fenrir? So you were able to speak to one…”



“Well, I didn’t talk to it directly. Around that time, everyone supported me, and so I built this 
country. I wasn’t thinking about becoming a king or anything. But I just wanted a place for the 
people to live.”

“Hah…”

This was supposed to be a casual conversation, but it was on such a large scale.

The situation at the time, and how the place had originally been filled with monsters… It was quite 
a story.

It did not look like he was lying, but I wasn’t sure if I should believe all of it… It was difficult to 
imagine, as the present was so different.

“That’s right. When I first saw the Silver Fenrir, there was someone else with me… Hart’s ancestry. 
The first lord of his house.”

Sebastian remembered something “So, what is the monster saying?” “After Leo frightened it, it 
does not seem hostile anymore. Is it safe?” “Indeed…” Leo had finished talking with the bird 
monster, and so we moved away. I wanted to talk with the others for now. We were dozens of 
meters…

Sebastian became involved As we waited for dinner to be served, Tilura reported that she got 
permission from Rahle. Now that I thought about it, they seemed to be talking after training. Leo 
and Liza had been running with Sherry. But what did she need Rahle’s permission for? “For the…

More people would be going to the forest “Wait a minute, Mr. Takumi?” “Ms. Claire?” As I looked 
at Liza and waited for her answer, Ms. Claire suddenly interrupted me. “Well, uh… If little Liza 
stayed at the mansion, then she would be alone.” “But…well. As long as you and…
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We talked about the duke’s ancestor



“I have heard stories from you and also my father.”

“Yes, yes. It was quite a surprise when we first met. After all, she was friends with a Silver Fenrir. 
Just like Takumi and his Leo. They were like friends.”

Ms. Claire had told me about her as well.

How she had been on equal standing with a Silver Fernir. And after her achievements on the 
battlefield, she was given her title.

“What was her name again… Ah, yes. It was Josephine. A very beautiful and kind woman… Kind 
of like someone I saw earlier. Is she your daughter?”

“Yes. That was Claire.”

“I see. The blood is strong in your family, I suppose. Of course, it was so long ago that perhaps I am 
remembering wrong…”

“So her name was Josephine. But why was she able to be like that with a Silver Fenrir? Not only 
were they stronger than humans, but you said that no one would ever go near one.”

“She said it was because of her Gift. Well, she didn’t actually know what a Gift was until we met.”

“…You mean that she…?”

“Yes. She was from another world. Some place in Europe, I think.”

France or Italy? That seemed likely, judging by the name.

“My ancestor is from the same world as Mr. Takumi… I did not know that.”

“Huh? Didn’t I tell you, Hart? Ah, well…I never thought that such things mattered. Still, to have 
her descendants meet someone else from the same world… It is like fate.”



“No, I did not know of her origins…or that she had the Gift.”

“Well, she did not like to talk about herself that much. I think she only talked about the Gift with 
people she was very close to.”

“Well, it was so long ago that the stories likely changed little by little. Rumors get twisted as they 
are passed on from person to person.”

“…Exactly. She is full of surprises. There is so much that I don’t know about her.”

“Well, when we first met, there was so much going on that we could not sit down and talk about 
her. It is only now that I have seen Leo and your Claire that I have remembered… Back when this 
country was still you… Around five hundred years ago.”

“Five hundred years…”

Things really were on a different scale… It was no wonder he did not remember everything.

“And so this…Ms. Josephine? What was her Gift?”

“Uh, I believe that it was Understanding Language.’’

“Is that…a Gift that allows you to speak with others?”

“Correct. You can talk to anyone, regardless of race, as long as they are intelligent. Even monsters. 
But not orcs.”

“So that was how she was able to talk with Silver Fenrirs?”

“Yes. There was a supporting effect that made the other person more attentive. So she was able to 
communicate and become friends like that. Though, she said it was less effective with those that 
became too excited. It’s not something you would use during a battle… Though, it could be useful 
for negotiating.”



Attentive… That could be useful for work. I remember there being times when other people were so 
busy that they did not listen to me. Or they would assume that their mistake was my fault. And so 
they would ignore my explanations and become angry.

Well, that was in the old world. So it was too late to be jealous about that.

“By the time I met her, she was already living in the forest with fenrirs and the Silver Fenrir. So I 
suppose she must have gotten a lot of use out of it?”

“In the forest? If she was living there with the Silver Fenrirs… Could it be that…”

The First Forest was the Duke’s Forest “...The founder of this house. Do you mean the one who 
befriended the Silver Fenrir?” “Yes. And it’s said that the founder first met the Silver Fenrir in that 
forest. And the legend says their relationship was that of friends of equal standing.”…

I Learned About the Duke and Silver Fenrir Connection “The royal family uses the Silver Fenrir on 
their crest, as they symbolize a country that cannot be defeated. On the other hand, the Liebert crest 
shows the fangs and claws, which symbolizes how we will defeat any foe. Also…this is…

I Talked About Coming From Another World “There was something that really surprised me when I 
woke up in the forest.” “...What was it?” “Uh...that Leo had suddenly grown very big.” “What? But 
she is a Silver Fenrir. Surely it’s only natural that she would be so big?” “I don’t…

Chapter 668

It was a similar situation

“Yes, the fenrir forest, which is west of this village. When she first came to this world, it was in that 
forest. And when she woke up, she was surrounded in fenrirs. And without knowing it, she was 
using the Gift to befriend them. And then even a Silver Fenrir came out, and she befriended it as 
well. That’s what she said. As she was a nice person, it is no surprise they became friends easily.”

“So that is how… The story that was passed on was a little different. It said that she was saved by 
the Silver Fenrirs, when the fenrirs attacked her.”



“Indeed. That is what Ms. Claire told me.”

Well, since this was someone who had heard the story from her directly, it was clear that he should 
be believed.

Even if it was a long time ago, and his memory was fading.

“Still…the situation is very similar to when I came…”

“It is? Now that I think about it, you have not told me how you came yet, Takumi.”

“Well, it was…”

And so I told him and Ms. Lugretta how it had happened.

And while Ms. Lugretta and Mr. Ekenhart did not understand as much when I was talking about my 
old company, they did not interrupt to ask any questions.

“Hmm. Yes, it is similar. Even if you were with a Silver Fenrir from the beginning. And in a forest 
too. And then you ended up helping Ms. Josephine’s ancestor… It almost sounds like someone had 
planned for that to happen. Well, that’s not possible. But I suppose it is like fate?”

“Yes. I did not think it would be this similar… But thanks to that, I was able to meet you and Ms. 
Lugretta. Of course, Mr. Ekenhart and the others as well. I have nothing but gratitude.”

“In an way, it is like Mr. Takumi is the second coming of Josephine… He is even helping this house 
with his Gift.”

“I think that’s going a little too far…”

“In any case, we have some deep connections. Yes, that is important.”

The coincidences were odd, but it could only be described as fate.



“Yes, yes. And so Ms. Josephine…”

When she first came to this world, the country that Mr. Euto had created was not nearly as peaceful 
as it was noe.

There was tension near the border at all times, and fights would erupt. And since Euto was so 
powerful, he was busy moving from place to place and trying to keep order.

And then he found Ms. Josephine and took her away from the forest, where she finally met other 
humans…

Once she was among people again, she was greatly moved by the threat of the enemy, and so she 
took a stand.

Yes, ever since the country was founded, they had never invaded anyone else. All of the wars were 
due to being attacked by other countries. I suppose it was because Euto did not want to go to war if 
he didn’t have to.

As for Josephine, even though she was usually kind and gentle, she could not bear to see her friends 
die in battle. And so she insisted that she fight on the frontlines… I could see where Mr. Ekenhart 
and Claire inherited their personalities from.

In the end, several factors led to a situation where their defeat seemed unavoidable. But then, the 
Silver Fenrir that she had befriended in the forest appeared, and defeated the enemy.

Euto had also come in order to support her. And then they had made a bet over who could defeat 
more of the enemies. And since the Silver Fenrir won, it then became the symbol of the country, 
appearing on banners and crests.

“It was amazing… I thought that there was nothing that could defeat a Silver Fenrir that was 
fighting at full power.”

“It was that strong”?”

“Yes. While I was using magic to face a thousand soldiers, it was blowing away ten thousand. As 
you can imagine, it was not long before the enemy retreated…”



As someone who had never experienced a way, I could not really imagine what it might have been 
like. But the enemy must have felt overwhelming fear and despair at that moment.

The First Forest was the Duke’s Forest “...The founder of this house. Do you mean the one who 
befriended the Silver Fenrir?” “Yes. And it’s said that the founder first met the Silver Fenrir in that 
forest. And the legend says their relationship was that of friends of equal standing.”…

We talked about making the forest a little safer “It was only yesterday that we thought of fenrirs as 
being dangerous for humans. And now we have a friendly relationship.” “Well, it all thanks to Leo. 
And Sherry as well.” “As for Sherry, it was mainly because of Mr. Takumi…

Sebastian remembered something “So, what is the monster saying?” “After Leo frightened it, it 
does not seem hostile anymore. Is it safe?” “Indeed…” Leo had finished talking with the bird 
monster, and so we moved away. I wanted to talk with the others for now. We were dozens of 
meters…

Chapter 669

Euto apologized

“I’m sorry for attacking you!”

“Wuff?”

After we finished talking, we went outside again to see that Leo was waiting for us. And then Euto 
went down to the ground and bowed.

He had been attacking her just a moment ago, and so Leo looked rather confused.

“I guess he’s apologizing to you?”

“Wuff… Wou-wou?”



“She’s asking you if it wasn’t just a game…”

“Tsk. I was going all out…”

“You are just no good, Your Excellency.”

“To good Leo, it would seem like you were playing.”

But it wasn’t just Leo. The others were also surprised and confused about what happened. And so I 
had to do something.

“Leo. So you don’t mind?”

“Wuff.”

“She said it is fine. You can…stand up now. Mr. Euto?”

“It actually hurts me a little, that she does not care at all… Still, at least this country won’t become 
unstable because I challenged someone to a fight…”

Before we finished talking earlier, Ms. Lugretta and Mr. Ekenhart had also suggested that he 
apologize, as Leo might be angry. I knew that she wouldn’t be, but it didn’t stop him from 
apologizing frantically.

After all, they all thought that an angry Silver Fenrir could destroy a whole county.

“Well, you should be a little more thoughtful when dealing with Silver Fenrirs from now on.”

“Or not challenge them at all.”

“Saying such things is no use with him.”

“Hehe. You understand me well, Lugretta.”



Ms. Lugretta was just telling him to be more careful, and not that he should stop completely.

“By the way, the rest of you have some nerve as well. Those hats… I didn’t say anything about 
them before, as it seemed like something I shouldn’t mention…”

“Ah…”

I had forgotten all about that.

It was made at Mr. Halton’s store, so it was very comfortable.

“Uh, well…there is a reason for this. Because we wanted to amuse the children…”

“Hmm. Well, I am like that as well.”

“We don’t want to be compared to you… But nevermind…”

“Hah…”

“Ms. Lugretta?”

“No, it’s nothing. Don’t mind me.”

“Uh, yes…”

Liza and Tilura must have passed out the other hats, as the village children were now wearing them.

As Liza was smiling with the other children, it seemed like they were getting along… I was glad 
that I had bought them.

“Still, you sure changed a lot in a short while, Leo.”



“Wuff? Wou!”

“As long as you are having fun. And I see that you have calmed down.”

“Kyan!”

After the business of the hats, I started to pet Leo and saw that something was different. But she 
barked and wagged her tail happily.

As for what was different, there were dogs not just around her feet, but her back as well, making her 
look more colorful.

The dogs here were mostly brown or black, but some were also gray or a dark blue. And so it 
looked like Leo had spots in her white fur, which was quite fun.

Not only that, but on top of her head was the maltese that had been acting quite vicious earlier. 
Everytime Leo moved her head, it had to regain its balance again. It seemed quite amused by this.

And it barked in agreement when I addressed it.

I was glad that it and Leo had made peace while we were away.

A woman came and intervened “You! Damn it!” “In any case, I must stop this. Your Excellency, 
have you not done enough?” “Hmm. I know that voice. Tsk… But I finally found a Silver Fenrir. I 
will not give up!” “But you were already defeated from the beginning.” “What are…

The reason that Sherry was not injured “Hmm…I guess it’s because she is a fenrir. To not be injured 
after being hit so hard…” “Wuff. Wuff-wuff-wou!” “Uhhh, she says that fenrirs are able to protect 
themselves by enveloping their bodies in magic energy. That’s why she wasn’t injured.” “...That 
is…so…



I had an idea of what Leo was trying to say Had she lost under the pressure of Sebastian and the 
maids? While I may have just looked like a bystander, after hearing Ms. Claire talk about the Fenrir 
Forest, I was now quite interested in that forest we had…

Chapter 670

Lined up in front of royalty

“Your Grace, I have gathered everyone from the village and the mansion together. Except for Leo 
and the children…”

“Well done, Sebastian. Leo and Mr. Takumi are fine. And there is no need to force the children… 
Though, Tilura should be with Claire.”

“Certainly.”

As I was petting Leo and the other dogs, the people of the village had lined up, along with the 
servants from the mansion.

Was something about to happen?

“Your Excellency. Over here.”

“Yes, yes. I really don’t like these kinds of formalities.”

“But it is necessary.”

“Very well. I had gone on this journey in order to get away from this. But I suppose I have no 
choice right now.”

Mr. Euto really did not seem to like having to do this, but he was pushed forward by Ms. Lugretta.

When they were ready, Sebastian put a hand to his chest and raised his voice as if to make an 
announcement.



“From the royal family, Lord Euto. And Duke Ekenhart!”

“Huh?”

“Wuff?”

And then the line of people all dropped to their knees.

Aside from the children, the only people left standing was Mr. Ekenhart and Euto, and me…

“Hehe. Mr. Takumi is surprised.”

“If anything, we should be bowing to good Leo…”

They said with a smile. And then Euto turned back to the people and took a step forward.

He made some speech, as did Mr. Ekenhart, about being grateful for the reception. Things about 
hoping the village would be prosperous and the like… It all sounded very standard. I suppose it was 
tradition.

Leo and I watched without really understanding… I had never really seen something like it before.

“Hah, that was a surprise. To meet someone from the royal family in Range village.”

“Indeed. And then he suddenly attacked Leo.”

After the ceremony had ended, the village held a welcoming feast.

It was similar to the last time I came, where tables were brought out in the village plaza, and food 
was served.

Mr. Harnes was currently pouring some wine for Mr. Euto and Mr. Ekenhart. I was worried that 
they were getting too relaxed, but at least Sebastian and Ms. Lugretta were keeping an eye on them.



As for Liz and Tilura, they were with Rosalie and the other children, and seemed to be enjoying 
their food.

Leo, Sherry and Rahle too…they were with the dogs.

As for Ms. Claire and I, we sipped on a little wine and ate while talking about what had happened 
earlier.

Ms. Anne was going around the table and helping to pour wine for the villagers. It was apparently 
her way of showing how sorry she was. But the villagers seemed a little uncomfortable by it. Still, it 
showed that she was making an effort to talk and get involved with more people… So perhaps it 
was a good thing?

“Still, what were the three of you talking about? Father said it was nothing serious, but…”

Unfortunately, even if it was Ms. Claire, I could not really tell her the details about it.

So I would just have to tell her something that didn’t matter in order to satiate her curiosity.

“Oh, I just explained to him about Silver Fenrirs and Leo. And how I came to be here… Things like 
that.”

“I see. While Leo is important for our family, she will also become important for the country. So 
everything was alright?”

“Yes. He now understands that Leo would never hurt anyone without reason. She is not a threat. 
Well…I think it is obvious, after he bowed to Leo, that there will be no future trouble.”

The dogs jumped towards Leo “Kyan-kyan!” “Wuff!” “Wou? Wuff-wuff.” “You sure are popular, 
Leo. No one is scared of you anymore.” The people of the village had a few dogs with them. Some 
were interested in Leo while others were more cautious. But once Leo moved towards them and 
licked…



We started to explain to Mr. Haines “Huh? Well, most of the children seemed to enjoy playing with 
Leo. The parents were all happy to see it as well.” “So it wasn’t just the children, but the adults also 
accepted Leo?” “Yes. Leo and Mr. Takumi saved the village. Of…

Someone was advising the villagers As for the land where the house would be build for me and Ms. 
Claire, it would be to the north of the chief’s house, and next to the farmland. Because it would be 
more convenient if we lived close to the fields. However… “Isn’t…
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