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Therefore, Qin Cheng has been arguing against him all the time. If he only 
fights with old techniques, no one can compare with Wang Xuan. 

Even, with just one hand, he should be able to suppress any student in the old 
arts experimental class. 

Wang Xuan's body was boiling hot, and even became a little hot afterward. 
From the flesh to the bone, there seemed to be small electric currents passing 
through. 

This is the embodiment of gas extraction and internal cultivation with a certain 
degree of heat. 

Wang Xuan thought in his heart that wisps of morning glow would enter his 
body, and then he thought that there would be black mist emanating from his 
body. 

Correspondingly, his body appeared abnormal, his metabolism accelerated, 
and some sticky sweat was discharged from his body, which was wet. 

He felt that the flesh and blood seemed to be baptized by the morning glow, 
the inside and outside were clear, the energy was extremely abundant, and 
the whole body was full of strength. 

The morning sun passed through the woods, making the mist a pale golden 
color. Four young men and women came for a walk. The two men only 
occasionally said a word or two, mainly the two women were talking about 
something. 

One of the women is very beautiful, she keeps talking and laughs from time to 
time, and she has a lively personality at first glance. 

The other woman is very soft and beautiful, with a bookish charm and a gentle 
smile. 

They are also students of the old art experimental class, from Nova. 



"Look, isn't that Wang Xuan? Why does his body seem to be glowing?" The 
youthful and energetic woman opened her beautiful eyes wide, wondering if 
she was wrong. 

The somewhat quiet woman was surprised: "Shouldn't he be able to practice 
Qi gathering?" 

One of the two men was surprised: "In the experimental class...someone 
actually managed it!" 

But soon he shook his head again, because he knew that these were 
meaningless now. 

Another man also said: "Unfortunately, the old-age techniques are outdated 
after all, and now they are officially abandoned. We will return to Xinxing soon, 
and there are new discoveries over there. Grasp the opportunity, and the new 
era may coming soon." 

Several people are from New Star, and they all know the latest inside 
information. The old technique is considered outdated and has been 
abandoned. Now there is a better choice! 

It feels like a lifetime away. The rules have changed. You can vote monthly 
during the new book period. Please support me. 

There are chapters in the afternoon and evening. 

Wang Xuan's mind is quiet, his thoughts are concentrated, and he is in 
tranquility, but he still keenly senses the eyes falling on him. 

He opened his eyes and stared outside the forest. 

The four students from Xinxing were amazed, they were still far away, and 
Wang Xuan actually felt that there was an outsider coming? 

"Did you see it? The moment he opened his eyes, a little golden glow 
dissipated in his eyes." Zhou Kun among the four said in a low voice. 

Wang Xuan stopped, the gas collection and internal nourishment were over, 
his face was ruddy and energetic, and even his hair seemed to be shining 
brightly in the morning glow. 

The four walked quickly. 



Su Chan has a lively personality, and greeted her from a long distance away: 
"Wang Xuan, I seemed to see you glowing just now!" 

She is tall and is not afraid of the cold at all. She wears a short skirt with a 
slightly strapless shoulder, which makes her beautiful legs look straight and 
long under the stockings. Her long, shiny black hair hangs naturally on her 
shoulders, and there is a smile on her youthful and beautiful face. The eyes 
are beautiful and energetic. 

Wang Xuan smiled: "I can understand that you are praising me for being 
handsome, handsome, and sunny?" 

He is tall and straight, bathed in the morning glow, and his smile is indeed a 
bit dazzling, with piercing eyes, white teeth, and his whole body is very 
brilliant. 

"Zi Lian!" Su Chan pouted. 

 


