
Beyond Deep Space 

 
Chapter: 8 

Zhou Kun couldn't help but asked: "Wang Xuan, have you mastered the 
technique of gas extraction?" 

He has a fair face and delicate features, but he has a slightly melancholic 
temperament. In fact, he has a good physique, but he always gives people the 
feeling of lack of exercise. 

Several people are from Xinxing, they have been classmates for several 
years, and they are very familiar with Wang Xuan. 

Wang Xuan nodded: "Recently, it can be regarded as barely practiced." 

Among the four, Xu Wenbo was usually aloof and rarely dealt with classmates 
from the old soil, but now he couldn't help but speak with regret. 

"The old technique, from the time it first appeared to the present, is really a 
long time ago, and it is a bit outdated now." He shook his head. 

It was sunny in the morning, but it was still a little cool when the autumn wind 
blew and the fallen leaves rose. 

As the name suggests, Li Qingzhu is gentle and quiet, with a bookish air, and 
said gently: "You can't say that, the old technique can at least strengthen your 
body and prolong your life, and it is said that some people in ancient times 
may be very powerful." 

Several people from Xinxing knew that this road was no longer feasible, and 
now that she was abandoned, she was just comforting Wang Xuan. 

Although Wang Xuan was a little touched, he didn't regret choosing this path. 
At first, he studied old techniques out of interest, not for utilitarian purposes. 

Moreover, he has not let go of his original automation major, and has already 
successfully obtained his degree. 

Xu Wenbo shook his head: "Those are unfounded legends, besides, people 
born in this era, with extremely brilliant technology, even though there were 



really powerful people in ancient times, but if they are reborn in modern times, 
facing spaceships, mechanical arms, etc. , also seem meaningless." 

But when he looked into the distance, his eyes were very eager, as if there 
were flames beating, because he knew that there was a more shocking 
discovery on the side of Xinxing, which was a better choice, which made him 
secretly excited, and his heart was extremely enthusiastic ! 

Several people chatted for a while, Su Chan smiled and said to Wang Xuan, 
don't get too involved in the old art, after all, they have already graduated, and 
it's time to think about work issues. 

A few people from Xinxing know that when you choose the wrong path, no 
matter how hard you try, it is useless. 

Zhou Kun opened his mouth, wanting to say something, but in the end he 
could only pat Wang Xuan on the shoulder helplessly. 

Due to the admonition of the elders in the family, he cannot disclose any 
information until the situation on Xinxing's side is clear, and it is still in the 
stage of strict secrecy. 

"I wish you a smooth journey back to Xinxing, take care!" Wang Xuan nodded. 
He knew that if there were no accidents, it would be difficult for them to meet 
again in the future. 

The gate of the new star has long been closed to the old land. If it is not 
actively selected by that side, it will be difficult for people here to immigrate 
there. 

"If there is a chance before I leave, I will buy you a drink." Wang Xuan said 
with a smile. 

The four of them had already turned to leave, but Zhou Kun still staggered, he 
knew that Wang Xuan was laughing at him. 

He usually has a slightly melancholic temperament and doesn't talk much, but 
once he gets drunk, he will completely let himself go, eloquent and talk 
endlessly. 

Three years ago, it was Wang Xuan and Qin Cheng who fought with him and 
made him so drunk that he didn't even know what he said that night. 



Wang Xuan watched them go away. 

In the next few days, some students will go on long journeys and will return to 
their hometowns. 

People who have to be separated at the two ends of the starry sky are the 
most sad for each other. 

The pair of lovers in the class bid farewell in silence, until one party boarded 
the train and left, the other party cried bitterly. It was embarrassing. Their 
relationship had always been very good, but it ended like this in the end. 

In this late autumn, those who leave are undoubtedly frustrated. 

Although the news from Xinxing is very vague, many people already have a 
premonition that if they pass by Xinxing, they will miss the greatest opportunity 
in their life. 

The only slight consolation for those who leave is that the work problem has 
been resolved, which was promised when they joined the experimental class 
earlier. 

 


