
I Am A Boss Mommy That Wants To Slack 

 

Chapter 14: DNA Testing Again! 

 

The entire room fell silent. 

Lin Wanru clutched her fingers tightly and started screaming before anyone could 
speak. “That’s impossible! The report is written by a company Cichen trusted. There 
won’t be any problem.” 

At this moment, Chu Cichen’s expression was unfathomable. 

Matriarch Chu sighed. “Miss Shen, the Chu Family can guarantee the truth of this 
report. No one can amend anything here.” 

Shen Ruojing nodded. “Sorry, I expressed things wrongly. There’s no problem with this 
report, but there’s a problem with what you guys are understanding.” 

Her fair lanky finger pointed at the conclusion of the report. “Here, it is written there’s a 
99% chance that they might have the relationship of a father and son.” 

Shen Ruojing then continued, “In theory, as long as the similarity reaches 99%, it can 
be confirmed that they are related by blood. 

“Some fathers and sons have lower compatibility, so their reports will indeed show the 
99% chance. 

“However, there are also uncles and nephews who can reach 98% to 99% in the 
similarity of their DNA for the higher compatibility cases. 

“So strictly speaking, a single-sided test has no way to verify whether the two are uncle 
and nephew or father and son.” 

Matriarch Chu started. “Are there any solutions to judge then?” 

Shen Ruojing then glanced at the pale Lin Wanru. “Yes, since the uncle and nephew 
compatibility already reached 99%, the father and son’s percentage would only be 
higher. Get Chu Cichen and Little Ye to test again, and the answer will be out.” 

“NO WAY!” Lin Wanru shouted. She didn’t expect that Shen Ruojing actually 
understood such technicalities. 

Shen Ruojing frowned. “Why not?” 



Lin Wanru’s agitated reaction drew their attention, so everyone was looking at her. 

Lin Wanru nervously spoke, “I personally saw Cimo leaving your hotel room that night, 
so this can’t be fake. Hence, there’s no need to have Cichen do a DNA test!” 

Shen Ruojing teasingly spoke, “Miss Lin, it’s just another DNA test, and it’s a simple 
procedure. Do you have other motives seeing that you keep objecting to this?” 

Lin Wanru grew even more panicked. She continued speaking, “After so many years, 
Cichen only has a s*xual relationship with me! You should stop dreaming!” 

Shen Ruojing started as doubt filled her voice. “You guys…have a s*xual relationship?” 

Lin Wanru tugged Chu Cichen’s arm. “That’s right, you probably don’t know this, but the 
child you saved is my son! So, please give up on Cichen, stop disrupting our lives.” 

Not only did he have a s*xual relationship with Lin Wanru, but they even had a child… 

Shen Ruojing’s heart felt as though it was pricked by a needle. 

Her earlier spirited-self had vanished. She then calmly looked at Chu Cichen. “So you 
clearly didn’t lose your memories, but you are unwilling to acknowledge me. Is this the 
reason why?” 

Her gaze contained a sorrow so heavy that it couldn’t be lifted… 

She was sorrowful because she had made the wrong judgment! 

Chu Cichen clearly knew that he had never dated Shen Ruojing before…It was 
impossible for him to be her fiance. 

His heart grew heavier and he abruptly stood up. “Miss Shen, let me reiterate. I don’t 
know you, and I won’t do any DNA testing with your children!” 

To ordinary people, this DNA report was already enough to determine a father and son 
relationship. 

After saying this, he straightened his tie and walked out of the door. 

Seeing this, Lin Wanru heaved a sigh of relief and felt that she had regained life once 
more. 

She didn’t discover that all her actions were seen by Matriarch Chu. 

Shen Ruojing stood there in a dazed state. 



During all these years, her only regret in life was Chu Cichen. 

She had looked for him for five years and persisted for five years. 

She had also thought about what if he was married and had children. If that was the 
case, she would absolutely not pester him. 

But what was going on with his current actions now? 

Shen Ruojing’s tears dropped, and her eyelashes fluttered with complex emotions. She 
then said, “Matriarch Chu, Little Ye and Little Meng will stay here for a few days. I will 
pay you another visit in the future.” 

She didn’t like giving up when there were still so many unknown factors. 

She stood up and was preparing to leave, but a little figure suddenly rushed over to hug 
her leg. Chu Yu lifted his head and looked at her. “Beautiful aunty, don’t leave!” 

Chu Tianye clenched his little fists and spoke angrily, “Mommy, after I grow up and 
inherit daddy’s inheritance, I won’t provide for him when he is old and in retirement!” 

Chu Xiaomeng also went to hold her hand. Although she didn’t speak, her attitude was 
clear. 

Lin Wanru’s expression turned ugly when she looked at Chu Yu and the other children 
being so close to Shen Ruojing. She walked over to lift Chu Yu up. “Little Yu, don’t 
make trouble. Your daddy will never permit Miss Shen to enter the Chu Family…” 

“In that case, we will get beautiful aunty to stay and get daddy to leave!” 

Chu Yu shouted and hugged Shen Ruojing’s leg even tighter. He was determined not to 
let her leave. 

Matriarch Chu had never refused her grandchild before, so she helplessly spoke, “Miss 
Shen, we have plenty of guest rooms. Why don’t you stay here for now? Our family 
doctors are present too, so they can look at your wound and treat it.” 

Lin Wanru spoke unhappily, “This isn’t too convenient, right? After all, Shen Ruojing is 
still under investigation for child abuse. It’s unsuitable for her to stay together with the 
children.” 

Chu Cimo grew angry after hearing this. “Right, you don’t leave. Explain first! Why did 
you abuse my daughter?” 

After the DNA test results were out, he was certain that the children belonged to him. 



This was because he had asked the institution before and they had told him that 99% 
similarity meant that he could basically be certain they were his children. This was why 
he kept acting in the stance of their father. 

Shen Ruojing: “?” 

Chu Cimo pointed at Xiaomeng. “Look at how habitually silent she is. It’s all because of 
your abuse that she developed a psychological illness!” 

Chu Xiaomeng: “??” 

She clutched the fearsome-looking cloth doll and spoke timidly, “Mommy has never 
abused me.” 

At this moment, the doctor-in-charge entered and brought with him the medical reports 
of the two children. 

Chu Cimo grew more confident when he saw the doctor. “Shen Ruojing, I know you 
won’t admit it, and the children will shield you too. However, it’s fine. Doctor Li, tell her 
the results for Chu Xiaomeng!” 

Doctor Li quietly spoke, “The little young miss is very healthy, but she does have some 
problems psychologically. She has a slight social phobia, and there are usually two 
situations that cause this. Firstly, one must have been psychologically impacted so 
they’re afraid of strangers. Secondly, it’s because their intellect is too high and they 
dislike interacting with people of average IQ.” 

Chu Cimo directly ignored the second situation. “So, which psychological impact did she 
suffer?” 

Doctor Li: “The little young miss belongs to the second situation.” 

Chu Cimo: “?” 

He was extremely shocked but soon grew excited after that. “I actually have a genius 
daughter?!” 

After hearing their words, Matriarch Chu suddenly turned and shot a glance at the butler 
nearby. 

Not many people knew this, but when Chu Cichen was young, he took a very long time 
to speak. When they got a doctor to assess him, the result was that his intelligence was 
too high. It was also for this reason that the family decided to nurture him as the next 
successor in secret overseas. 



She then looked at Shen Ruojing again before speaking in a soft voice to the butler, “Go 
and get Cichen’s razor from his bathroom and do the DNA test again.” 


