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Even though they are both of the human race, Xuanqing had not yet established his 
Dao Court, but inevitably he will establish his own Dao Court. 

The enthusiasm of the three Old Heavenly Masters was indeed overwhelming. 

Xuanqing could only smile awkwardly, led by the three Old Heavenly Masters, ultimately 
to the Heavenly Masters Perspective in the Heavenly Court hosted by Elder Heavenly 
Master Zhang. 

After a discussion while drinking tea. 

The conversation between the three Old Heavenly Masters and Xuanqing was 
extremely pleasant, and the atmosphere of the Heavenly Masters Perspective was 
harmonious and joyful. 

Now that you have the Alliance Power Token rewarded by the Jade Emperor, opening 
your Dao Court is a sure thing. 

Elder Heavenly Master Ge touched his beard and smiled. 

Oh?bender 

Xuanqing was intrigued and took the opportunity to ask: Dare I ask Elder Ge, what 
exactly is the purpose of this Alliance Power Token? 

Upon hearing this. 

Elder Ge laughed heartily, then with a whisk in hand, pointed to Elder Heavenly Master 
Zhang, Hahaha, if you want to know the use of the Alliance Power Token, perhaps 
Friend Zhang would know best. 

I indeed know a thing or two. 



Heavenly Master Zhang gave a slight smile, and then said unhurriedly: I wont hide it 
from my friend Xuanqing, I too was rewarded by the Jade Emperor with an Alliance 
Power Token. 

I used this Alliance Power Token as the foundation to establish a Dao Court, to control 
the spirits of heaven and earth, to summon the vital energy, to control mountains and 
rivers, to purify the filthy air, to communicate with immortals, nothing is prior to Zhengyi! 

Subsequently, using the Three Five Sword that slay evil and the Yang Ping Governing 
Seal, two magical tools, to suppress the luck of the Dao Court, that the Dao Court I had 
established gradually flourished. 

If you ask what use this Alliance Power Token exactly has you can understand it as an 
equivalent of the small Fengshen List. 

A small Fengshen List? 

Upon hearing these words. 

Xuanqings breath quickened. 

Uncertainly. 

In his mind, he had an image of moments ago in the Lingxiao Bao Hall, where the 
Alliance Power Token was an illusion split from the seal in the hands of the Jade 
Emperor. 

Could it be the seal in the hands of the Jade Emperor is actually the renowned 
Fengshen List, and the Alliance Power Token is in fact an adaptation of the Fengshen 
List? 

Only in this way can it be explained why the Alliance Power Token possessed such 
formidable functions of commanding spirits and controlling mountains and riversetc. 

Huff- 

Xuanqing took a deep breath undercover, and then performed a bow,So thats how it is, 
thank you Elder Zhang for the detailed explanation! 

By the way, I have to visit the Douluo Palace once more to pay homage to the Ancestor 
Master, so I wont disturb you any longer. 

Upon hearing this. 

The three Old Heavenly Masters nodded with a smile. 



Go ahead, but remember to visit the Heavenly Masters Perspective when you come to 
the Heavenly Court in the future. Its lonely here, its also pleasant to have more friends 
to talk and discuss the Dao with. 

Hahaha, understood, understood, then I will take my leave now! 

Please do! 

After leaving the Heavenly Masters Perspective. 

Subsequently. 

According to the memory in his mind. 

Xuanqing found the Ascension Altar, where he was previously led by Star Lord Taibai, 
without much effort. 

One thing worth mentioning is. 

Now that his destiny has been designated as Secondary Fourth-Rank Immortal Official, 
he doesnt need to be accompanied by others, he can use the Ascension Altar on his 
own. 

Looking at the Ascension Altar in front of him. 

He took one step forward! 

Hummm- 

Just like the previous two times using the Ascension Altar, the surrounding space kept 
shifting and twisting, that familiar sense of dizziness once again attacked his mind. 

Moments later. 

Xuanqing arrived in front of Douluo Palace. 

The Five Elements Palace exhibits heaven and earth, and the Eight Trigram 

Furnace refines Qiankun Douluo Palace. 

Looking at the couplet on both sides of the palace gate, even though he was now in the 
mid-stage of the Integration of Void Stage, he still did not dare to look directly, otherwise 
he would feel as if his god soul was being torn. 

Inside Douluo Palace. 



In the main hall. 

Next to the Eight Trigrams Furnace, Child Jin Ling and Yin Ling Tongzi, one was 
fanning wind and the other was watching the fire. The expressions on their faces looked 
a bit bored. 

Thump-Thump- 

Footsteps echoed. 

The two child-like beings looked over and saw Xuanqing walking in, their faces 
immediately filled with a mixed expression of astonishment and joy. 

Good younger brother, you watch the fire. I, your elder brother will 

No, good elder brother, you watch the fire, your junior brother will go 

The two child-like beings looked at each other, then spoke in unison, Lets do Rock-
Paper-Scissors. The one who wins stays and works, the loser goes to play with Junior 
Brother Xuanqing. 

Alright. 

Rock, paper, scissorshahaha, good brother, please stay behind, Ive won! 

Yin Ling Tongzi laughed loudly and hastily handed over his fan to Child Jin Ling. He 
then got up and headed towards Junior Xuanqing. 

Over here. 

As soon as Xuanqing stepped into the main hall, he saw Yin Ling Tongzi running 
towards him. He was curious. 

Huh, Senior Brother Yin Ling, didnt you guys go to play in the Lower Realm, what is this 
? 

Upon hearing this. 

Yin Ling Tongzi carefully glanced to the side, then said in a lowered voice, Humph, Sir 
was too much, saying that my brother and I played too much, and swept us directly from 
the Lower Realm. 

He even told us to refine a Nine Directions Rebirth Pill, saying it would be used for the 
mortal emperor in the future, in a mysterious way. 



Jin Ling and Yin Ling were dredged up to refine pills, and, moreover, a Nine-turns 
Reincarnation Pill? 

Xuanqing was deep in thought. 

But, 

About this mythical game worlds Journey to the West Tricks, he had already learned of 
it from other places, so knowing one more piece of information wasnt surprising at this 
moment. 

I see. 

Xuanqing nodded, then asked again, By the way, Senior Brother Yin Ling, is our 
Ancestor Master busy at this moment? 

Hey- What could Sir be busy with? 

Yin Ling Tongzi casually waved his hand, perhaps a bit annoyed, and continued, Sir 
spends all day either sleeping or napping, he doesnt at all 

Ouch- It hurts Its killing me. 

Junior Brother Xuanqing, please check whats wrong with my head for me? Yin Ling 
Tongzi covered his head, shouting in pain. 

This 

The corner of Xuanqings mouth twitched a little. 

He saw a small red bump on the top of Yin Lings head, its shape almost identical to the 
bump he had before. 

Ehmwell Senior Brother Yin Ling, you continue to playI need to go and pay respect to 
our Ancestor Master. 

Whoosh- 

Without waiting for an answer, Xuanqing immediately rushed towards their Ancestor 
Masters study. 

Are you kidding me? 

If he stayed with this mischievous Yin Ling for too long, who knew whether he would get 
involved and be hit by Ancestor Master to get a bump?> 



Last time he was presented with a swelling by the Ancestor Master as a reward for his 
clever trick, even the use of his mana couldnt heal it quickly, and it still hurt several days 
later. 

Upon entering the room, 

he saw the Ancestor Master sitting with his legs crossed on a cushion, beneath the Yin-
Yang pattern on the wall behind him. His figure was still as elusive and towering as 
ever. 

Disciple Xuanqing, I pay homage to our Ancestor Master! As soon as he arrived, 
Xuanqing directly performed a grand ceremony. 

Upon seeing this, 

Taishang Laojun opened his eyes, and said calmly: If those two mischievous boys were 
as sensible as you, I would be at ease- 

Upon hearing these words, 

Xuanqing could not respond, but just coughed lightly with an awkward smile. 

Cough! Cough! 

This time I came to the Heavenly Court for an imperial decree, and I was thinking of 
you, Ancestor Master. So, I brought some Ginseng Fruits to visit you, and by the way I 
want to ask you something. 

With that, 

he took out more than ten Ginseng Fruits and respectfully handed them over.. 

Chapter 212: Ancestral Dragon Crystal! 

 

At this moment. 

Seeing the dozen or so ginseng fruits in front of him. 

Taishang Laojuns eyebrows twitched slightly, and he said in a speechless tone, 

Xuanqing, this ginseng fruit was originally in the Three Realms and is considered a well-
known treasure. 

Now..it is indeed made common by you, hahaha- 



Although he said so, his movements were not slow at all. After pocketing the ginseng 
fruit, he said indifferently: 

What do you want to ask? Go ahead and ask! 

Upon hearing this. 

Hehe~ 

Xuanqing let out a dry laugh and then asked, I want to ask you, in this world, what 
treasures can carry Heavenly Merits? 

Just like the Gathering Qi Bead, which can absorb incense and spiritual Qi, and this 
kind of Innate Qi-storing crystal can hold Heavenly Merits from the Heavenly Courts 
salary. 

A Gathering Qi Bead and a Qi-storing crystal appeared in Xuanqings hand. 

Seeing this scene. 

Taishang Laojun looked up and down at Xuanqing, with an expression on his face that 
was neither smiling nor not smiling. 

Being stared at by his Ancestor Master like this. 

Xuanqing felt a little uneasy and shrank his neck. Fortunately Ancestor Masters strange 
expression didnt last long, and he started talking. 

Xuanqing, Heavenly Merits will only be born in the Quantity Tribulation, which is 
extremely special, and there are very few objects that can carry Heavenly Merits that 
have been passed down to this day. 

Taishang Laojun gazed into the distance. 

Thinking slightly. 

The most advanced among them is, of course, the Taiji Diagram, Pangu Banner, and 
Chaos Clock formed by the Heaven-opening Axe. 

Next comes the Pangu Banner, Nine Heavens Breath Soil 

Treasures formed by the Heaven-opening Axe? 

Or Pangu Banner, Nine Heavens Breath Soil? 

Xuanqings mouth twitched slightly. 



He tentatively asked, Ancestor Master, is there anything worse, like something even I 
could get my hands on? 

Upon hearing this. 

Taishang Laojun thought for a moment, Speaking of which, there is indeed one thing 
that is the Ancestral Dragon Crystal! 

What is the Ancestral Dragon Crystal? How can I get it? I hope Ancestor 

Master can tell me. 

Xuanqings spirits lifted, and he hurriedly asked. 

The so-called Ancestral Dragon Crystal has to be traced back to the ancient times when 
the human race was not yet born in this Heavenly and Earthly realm 

As the Ancestor Master recounted. 

Gradually. 

A long and ancient historical period, as if being on the scene came rushing towards 
them. 

In the end the Dragon and Phoenix clans perished together, and before the Ancestral 
Dragon of the Dragon clan died, its blood spilled onto the Four Seas, and any rock 
tainted with Ancestral Dragon blood turned into an Ancestral Dragon Crystal. 

This Ancestral Dragon Crystal can help the Dragon clan enhance bloodlines and refine 
Dragon Qi. 

However after so many years., whether there is still any left, who knows! Taishang 
Laojun stroked his beard and said. 

Hearing this. 

Xuanqing sighed with relief. 

From Ancestor Masters words, it could be analyzed that the Ancestral Dragon Crystal, 
although precious, was much simpler than those Pangu Banner and the like. 

Whats more, Pangu Banner, Nine Heavens Breath Soil, and other things like that might 
not be exchangeable with ordinary Ingots even if they were uploaded to the Store. 

But this Ancestral Dragon Crystal was different. It was just a rock stained with Ancestral 
Dragons blood. Although it was precious, it 



The only worry now was whether there were any Ancestral Dragon Crystals left in the 
Dragon clan after so many years. 

Even if there was only one Ancestral Dragon Crystal left, as long as it was uploaded to 
the Mall, it would be no different from having an infinite amount for Xuanqing. He could 
simply exchange it for Ingots. 

Thank you, Ancestor Master, for telling me. I wont bother Ancestor Masters peace, I will 
take my leave!Xuanqing bowed and saluted. 

Seeing this. 

Taishang Laojun nodded slightly. 

Outside the room. 

The Silver-Horned child was seen covering his head with one hand while stealthily 
hiding outside the door, peeping in and out with a sneaky look. 

Seeing Xuanqing leaving, the Silver-horned childs eyes lit up as he hurriedly went up to 
him and asked, Junior Brother, have you finished your business? 

Uh Senior Brother Yin Ling, what are you? Xuanqing had a bad feeling in his heart. 

Hehe, my brother and I are bored here by the Eight Trigram Furnace. Do you have 
anyway to take us down to have some fun? 

As soon as these words came out. 

Xuanqings heart skipped a beat, and he hurriedly waved his hand, saying, Absolutely 
not. If I dared to do such a thing, our Ancestor Master would surely punish me. 

Although it was almost certain that these two child-like beings would go to the Lower 
Realm and become demons later on, he didnt want this incident to be blamed on 
himself. 

However. 

Seeing the pitiful look on Yin Ling Tongzis face, he couldnt help but soften his heart. 

Especially when he thought of how the other party had helped him absorb the Chaos 
Pill day and night using the pestle for grinding medicine, he couldnt forget this kindness. 

With this thought in mind. 

After thinking for a moment. 



Senior Brother Yin Ling, dont be disappointed. When I come up next time, Ill bring you 
some interesting toys to play with. 

Xuanqing consoled him. 

Oh- okay. Silver-horned child pursed his mouth and answered listlessly. 

Speaking of which. 

These two child-like beings had been brought to heaven since they were young, and 
although their cultivation was not low, their minds were still like those of ordinary seven- 
or eight-year-old children. 

After soothing the two child-like senior brothers. 

Xuanqing turned and left Douluo Palace, stepping back onto the Ascension Altar, and 
controlling it to descend to the Nine Heavens. 

Stepping out of the Ascension Altar. 

There was a Taoist with white hair and beard, wearing a white robe, with a five-pointed 
star on his forehead and holding a feather duster in his hand.bender 

It was none other than Star Lord Taibai. 

Upon seeing Xuanqing descend from the Ascension Altar, Star Lord Taibai went up to 
greet him. 

Friend Xuanqing, lets go. In a while, the gods will come to congratulate you, said Star 
Lord Taibai with a smile. 

Thank you, Star Lord! 

Xuanqing bowed slightly, expressing his gratitude. 

My young friend, you dont have to be so polite. Its an honor for me to host this banquet 
at my mansion, said the Star Lord. 

The two walked side by side, chatting casually. 

Its worth mentioning that. 

Since there were too many immortals outside the Southern Heavenly Gate who wanted 
to congratulate and give gifts, and Xuanqing was a Daoist immortal official who would 
eventually go to the Lower Realm, it was impossible for all these gods to flock to the 
mortal world to celebrate with him. 



Therefore. 

Xuanqing finally decided to borrow the Star Lord Taibais mansion and hold a promotion 
banquet in the Heavenly Court, inviting all the gods. 

As they say, making friends with gods from all walks of life and winning them over is the 
key to success in the pugilistic world. 

Star Lord Mansion! 

Stellar power was everywhere, and the Immortal Spirit Qi was extremely rich, even 
more so than in Lingxiao Bao Hall. 

Lord Star! 

Lord Star! 

All along the way in the Star Lord Mansion, there were divine servants and 
maidservants busily arranging various matters of the banquet. Upon seeing Star Lord 
Taibai, they immediately bowed in respect. 

Well, you all go ahead with your work. Youre doing a great job! 

Star Lord Taibai said cheerfully, and returned the smile to everyone, regardless of their 
status or position. 

Seeing this scene. 

Xuanqing marveled. 

No wonder Star Lord Taibai, who was mainly focused on battles, was actually known as 
the three realms good guy in the Heavenly Court.. 

Chapter 213: Going to advance yet again. 

 

In the Star Palace. 

Xuanqing and Star Lord Taibai, each sitting in a grand master chair. 

About half an hour later. 

Reporting to Star Lord and Right Deputy Celestial Envoy, there are guests outside, a 
divine servant kneeled on one knee. 



The two looked at each other, then stood up with a laugh, walking unhurriedly toward 
the entrance. 

At the entrance. 

The first one to offer congratulations was indeed that Celestial Official from the 
Household Registration Department who had once come down to earth to confer him. 

Congratulations on your promotion to a fourth-rank celestial, Right Deputy Celestial 
Envoy Xuanqing, ranked amongst the Lingxiao, please accept this humble gift as a 
token of my respect. 

The celestial official said so, smiling and swaying his head. 

Thank you, thank you Lord Zhang.We have ginseng fruit porridge prepared inside, you 
can have as much as youd like, please come in! 

A gleam flashed in the celestial officials eyes, he bowed his hands and entered the hall. 

With the arrival of the first celestial official, it seemed like some chain reaction was 
triggered, and immortals from all corners made their way to the Star Lord Mansion. 

Congratulations and cheers, young friend Xuanqing on your promotion to 

Right Deputy Celestial Envoy an old woman with a pouch around her waist. 

Hahaha, Lady Wind, Ive yet to thank you for lending the power of the wind bag.please 
come inplease- 

Following soon after. 

Immortals from the Thunder Department, Household Registration 

Department, Demon Driving Institute all made their way over. 

Its worth mentioning. 

Unbeknownst to whether they had received some news or not, surprisingly, two strong 
men from the Heavenly River Navy also made their way here, carrying a pole loaded 
with presents to celebrate. 

We received orders from General Zhu to congratulate Lord Xuanqing, congratulating 
you on your promotion to Right Deputy Celestial Envoy, ranked amongst the Lingxiao. 

The two strong men in silver-white armor, having firm and unyielding faces, looked 
extraordinary in their disposition. 



General Zhu? 

Xuanqing was initially taken aback, but he immediately realized, it must be referring to 
senior brother Zhu Ganglie in the human world. 

You two generals, isnt my senior brother Zhu Ganglie banished to the human 
realm..why is it so? 

Lord Xuanqing, you may not know, but we were subordinate to General Zhu for one 
day, and will remain so for the rest of our life, in the 300,000 Heavenly River Navy, there 
has never been a second General Zhu! 

Hearing their words. 

A thoughtful look flashed in Xuanqings eyes. 

I see.the banquet is already prepared.please, generals- 

Thank you, Lord Xuanqing. 

The two men bowed their fists in deep voices, and then, like the other guests, walked 
into the Star Palace. 

Inside the main hall. 

Seats were filled, with lively chatter it was a buzzing scene. 

Xuanqing sat in the main seat. 

By his side were some familiar people, the closest was his well-known acquaintance, 
Star Lord Taibai.bender 

Then there were others such as Lord Huo De, the Celestial Official from Household 
Registration Department, Lady Wind, the Five Epidemic Gods, and the several from 
Thunder Department and so on. 

Unlike the other tables where ginseng fruit porridge was served. 

On this table, ginseng fruits were served directly, and in front of everyone, there were 
two fruits on each plate, forming an auspicious pair. 

No one has started yet as they were waiting for their host, Xuanqing, to stand up and 
make his speech. 

Ahem- 



Xuanqing stood up. 

He looked around, observing all the celestial guests in the main hall. 

All the immortals who caught his gaze responded with nods and smiles. 

On this day, I am promoted to the position of Right Deputy Celestial Envoy of the Five 
Thunders, and I am honored to receive the congratulations from fellow daoists 

To be honest. 

He does not really enjoy doing this kind of thing, making speeches in front of so many 
people. 

But one cannot help it in the pugilistic world. It is all about give and take. Plus, when 
others are giving you face, bringing congratulations and gifts, you cant be too cold, 
otherwise, you would end up with no friends. 

After the speech. 

All the gods clapped and cheered, raising their glasses, and the atmosphere was 
jubilant. 

After feasting. 

Everyone did not disperse, but rather continued to converse and discuss Tao in the 
grand hall, occasionally demonstrating their skills or playing chess and drinking wine. 

At this moment. 

The banquet had entered its second day, and the grand hall was still bustling with 
activity. 

However, a trace of worry was visible in Xuanqings eyes. 

As the saying goes, one day in heaven is equivalent to a year on earth, he and these 
idle immortals are not the same. Matters in the mortal world were left unattended, and 
the Divines flower has not been cultivated and condensed. 

On one side. 

Star Lord Taibai seemed to sense something, concluded his chat with several other Star 
Lords, and walked over. 

Daoist Xuanqing, I see that your brow is furrowed. Is anything troubling you? 



Upon hearing this. 

That is true, one day in heaven equals a year on earth. The conferment at the 

Lingxiao Bao Hall has been delayedI cant afford any more delays 

Xuanqing gave a bitter smile and spoke of his worries. 

At this moment. 

He had been in the Heavenly Court for two full days, which equates to two years in the 
Lower Realm or two months in the real world. 

After hearing Xuanqings narration. 

Star Lord Taibai suddenly understood and said, If thats the case, why not speak up 
directly? We cant let it delay your cultivation. 

Hmm! 

Xuanqing nodded his head. 

His main purpose of coming to the Heavenly Court was to accept his promotion to 
Fourth-Rank, and to inquire about the Heavenly Merit treasure in Douluo Palace. 

Now that he had completed these two tasks, he didnt want to dawdle in the Heavenly 
Court any longer. After all, the passage of time, with one day in heaven being a year on 
earth, was too torturous for him. 

Thinking so. 

Xuanqing let the Qi Flower surge into his throat and addressed the chatting immortals: 

Im sorry to interrupt, but I have something to announce! 

A resounding voice echoed around the grand hall. 

All the gods looked in the direction of the sound, it emerged that the newly appointed 
Right Deputy Celestial Envoy of Five Thunders, Daoist Xuanqing was speaking, so they 
respectfully turned their attention to him. 

At this moment. 

Seeing all the divine beings attention was on him, Xuanqing intended to speak up about 
his unfinished tasks in the mortal world. 



However. 

An unexpected event occurred before he began to speak. 

Boom! 

A thunderbolt resounded in the sky above Star Lord Mansion, followed by the 
appearance of billowing dark clouds. 

Upon seeing this. 

Everyone was stunned. 

Huh Lord Li, is it your Department of Thunders thunderbolt that has struck the Star Lord 
Mansion? 

Impossible, besides, our Thunder Department doesnt have the authority to strike the 
Star Lord Mansion with a thunderbolt! 

An immortal from Fate Palace felt compelled to ask the Thunder Department immortal 
standing next to him, but received a denial. 

At this moment. 

The celestial phenomenon in the sky continued to change. 

The dark clouds and thunderbolt disappeared, replaced by auspicious signs as if fairy 
maidens were dancing gracefully amidst the celestial music. 

At this sight. 

Immediately. 

The gods felt a shudder in their hearts, and an incredible thought emerged in their 
minds. 

Did this newly promoted Right Deputy Celestial Envoy of Five Thundersget another 
promotion in merely two days? 

On the side. 

Star Lord Taibais eyes widened in shock as he watched the celestial phenomena in the 
sky, his mind profoundly shaken.. 

Chapter 214: The Jade Emperor Who Was Tricked by the Old Lord! 



 

Looking at the various auspicious signs and the divine power emanating from the sky 
above his Star Lord Palace, he couldnt fail to understand what had happened. 

Xu..Xuanqing Daoist friend, what is this? Star Lord Taibais voice trembled slightly, 
almost dropping the duster from his hand. 

Hearing this. 

Xuanqing chuckled bitterly and nodded his head, Thats right, I just mentioned that one 
day in Heaven equals a year on earth! 

Now that two days have passed in Heaven, two years have passed on earth. It is 
normal for me to be promoted againuhits normal. 

Normal? 

Even with Star Lord Taibais cultivation, he couldnt help but twitch the corner of his 
mouth. 

He really couldnt understand how someone just promoted to Secondary Fourth-Rank, 
had only two days pass and, well, two years in the Human World, would get another 
promotion to Fourth-Rank. 

Thisthis, is it called normal? 

At this moment. 

Inside the Star Lord Palace. 

The gods were also reacting to the heavenly phenomena, which were the scenes of 
Immortal Officers Promotion, and they looked at each other in disbelief. 

Silence! 

Unusual silence! 

Not a single immortal at the scene spoke, it was so quiet that you could hear a pin drop. 

Their eyes were filled with disbelief, and their hearts were already shaken by the two 
days advancement of the Immortal Official. 

After an unknown amount of time. 

Ahern- 



A cough broke the silence, and the gods suddenly awoke from their stupor. 

The sound came from above the main hall, and it was the Right Deputy Celestial Envoy 
who had shocked all the immortals, soon to be the Left Deputy Celestial Envoy. 

Fellow Daoist Friends, there is no need to be surprised by my promotion once again! 

As they say, one day in heaven is equal to one year on earth, and since I ascended to 
heaven, I have spent two days there while two years have passed on earth. 

So one promotion in two years, its quite normal, isnt it! 

As soon as these words were spoken. 

At first glance, they seemed to make sense, but in fact, they couldnt stand scrutiny, as 
such a rate of promotion had never occurred in the history of the Heavenly Court. 

However. 

Those who attended the banquet, more or less, knew that Daoist Xuanqing had a deep 
background, and even if they knew that his words were not true, no one was foolish 
enough to refute them. 

Well, what the Right Deputy Celestial Envoy says makes sense 

It would be impossible for anyone else to be promoted in two years, but for Daoist 
Xuanqing, its indeed normal. 

Hahaha, Daoist Xuanqing has extraordinary luck and is destined for greatness, its quite 
normal! 

The shock in the eyes of the gods had not dissipated. 

But on the surface, they all nodded and smiled, agreeing with Xuanqings one day in 
heaven, one year on earth theory. 

Seeing this scene. 

Xuanqing chuckled awkwardly and bowed with a bit of embarrassment. 

He seriously suspected that if there were any debate competitions in the Heavenly 
Court, he would surely win by giving a speech on the theme of My Great Master, Elder 
Zhenyuan. 

Just as Star Lord Palace was shocked by Xuanqings Immortal Officer Promotion. 



The Golden Palace of Clouds in the Thirty-Third Heaven. 

The Jade Emperors eyes were closed, leaning back on his Purple Gold Dragon 

Thronewith a look of enjoyment on his face. 

More importantly. 

In his hand was a fleshy-pink, baby-faced fruit with a bite taken out of it. 

*Sigh~* 

If I were to compare their deliciousness, this Ginseng Fruit is even betterhmm? 

The Jade Emperor opened his eyes, unable to resist a soft exclamation. 

He first looked down at the Ginseng Fruit in his hand, then glanced toward the direction 
of the Star Lord Mansion in the Nine Heavens. 

Snicker- No wonder, no wonder! 

A look of sudden realization appeared on the Jade Emperors face. 

After Xuanqings conferment ceremony, the Old Lord of the Douluo Palace sent some 
elixirs and ten Ginseng Fruits. 

At the time, he thought that the Old Lord was expressing his gratitude for conferring 
Xuanqing as Secondary Fourth-Rank, and didnt think too much about it. 

At this moment. 

He finally understood. 

It turns out that these Ginseng Fruits besides expressing gratitude, also had this added 
meaning. 

Forget it, forget it- 

The Jade Emperor sighed bitterly and swallowed the Ginseng Fruit with a bite. 

Come here, pass on my edict, let the Lingxiao Bao Hall open again for the conferment 
ceremony! 

Yes! 



A god-man guard knelt on one knee, answering loudly, his eyes also filled with shock 
because there was a court meeting just two days ago, and now they were going to have 
another court meeting. 

Accompanied by the Jade Emperors decree. 

In the minds of all the immortals in the Heavenly Court, there was the sound of Lingxiao 
Bao Hall opening again for the conferment court meeting. 

Suddenly. 

It was like a drop of cold water falling into boiling hot oil, the whole thing blew up. 

Because the decree did not mention any names and only asked all the gods to attend 
the conferment court meeting, they did not think that Xuanqing was being promoted 
again. 

Instead, they thought that it was really outrageous that the Human Race, as the 
protagonist of Heaven and Earth, had one Daoist Immortal Officer ascend just a few 
days before and now had another Daoist ascending. 

They didnt know if the chins of these gods would drop when they learned that the same 
Daoist was behind the two conferment court meetings. 

Heavenly Master Mansion. 

After Xuanqing left, the three Heavenly Masters did not disperse but felt it was rare to 
have a gathering in so many years, so they continued to drink tea and play chess. 

Ill take one of your pieces! 

Haha, youre in Huh? 

Zhang Heavenly Master and Ge Heavenly Master sat opposite each other at a 
chessboard, while Xu Heavenly Master was watching the battle on one side. 

At the moment the Jade Emperors decree sounded. 

They looked at each other, speechless for a moment. 

Who was promoted again? 

It shouldnt be. Among the Daoist Immortal Officers in the Human World now, Daoist 
Friend Xuanqing has already advanced, and although Yuan Tiangang of the Tang 
Dynasty also has the potential to ascend, it shouldnt be now. 



It is a bit strange! 

Lets go take a look at which Daoist friend from our Human Race has advanced again- 

Zhang Heavenly Master and Ge Heavenly Master stopped playing chess. 

They never thought that Xuanqing had been promoted to Immortal again and assumed 
that there was a new Daoist in the Human Race ascending. 

Lingxiao Bao Hall. 

Just like before. 

Various immortals gathered on both sides of the main hall. 

Under the support of the two fairy girls holding the five Ming fans and a group of ritual 
officers, the Jade Emperor went to the highest throne of the main hall. 

The Jade Emperor nodded to the ritual officer beside him. 

Then. 

The ritual officer bowed slightly, stepped forward, and shouted loudly outside the main 
hall: 

Announcing Right Deputy Immortal Minister of Taiji Palace and Deputy Commander of 
Five Thunder and Leader of Thunder Department Affairs Daoist Xuanqing! 

As soon as these words were uttered.bender 

Boom! 

The floodgate was opened. 

Except for the immortals who went to the Star Lord Mansion to attend the promotion 
banquet. 

All other immortals showed expressions of horror. 

This this is just a gap of two days, and both of the conferment ceremonies are for the 
same Daoist person. 

Incredible, unbelievable! 

The shocked emotions of the gods in the main hall did not affect Xuanqing in the 
pavilion. 



After the ritual officer announced the audience. 

Just like two days ago. 

Xuanqing walked at an unhurried pace, passing through the long corridor 

Stepping into the Lingxiao Bao Hall! 

Ignoring the shocked eyes of the gods, he came to the center of the main hall, facing 
the figure on the high platform and bowed slightly. 

Your servant pays his respects to the Jade Emperor! 

With the words your servant pays his respects to the Jade Emperor 

All the immortals came to their senses, even disregarding the rule that there should be 
no noise in Lingxiao Bao Hall, whispering to each other and talking in hushed voices to 
vent their shock. 

My beloved official, I am planning to 

Wait a minute! 

At this point. 

An untimely voice came from one side of the main hall, attracting everyones attention.. 
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On the high platform. 

The Jade Emperor originally planned to praise them as he did before, and then present 
the seal, conferring the promotion directly, hoping to finish the ceremony early and go 
back to eat Ginseng Fruit. 



However, before he could finish speaking, he was interrupted by a voice in the main 
hall. 

Looking over. 

The voice that interrupted him came from the left side of the main hall. The speaker was 
tall and stout, with a determined face, holding a Demon-suppressing Pagoda in his 
hand. 

Pagoda-Bearing Heavenly King Li Jing? 

The Jade Emperor was quite upset, and said with a frown, Heavenly King Li, do you 
have anything to say? 

Your Majesty! 

Li Jing seemed not to notice the Jade Emperors displeasure but instead stepped 
forward on his own, not bowing but holding his fists in both hands. 

I think this Daoist Xuanqing, who has not even lived a hundred years and just ascended 
two days ago, should not be conferred promotion nowIs it a bit inappropriate? 

May the Jade Emperorreconsider! 

When he finished speaking. 

He stared straight at the Jade Emperor, as if to sayif you dont reconsider, you will be a 
foolish ruler. 

Seeing this scene. 

Humph! 

The Jade Emperor couldnt help but snort coldly in his heart, revealing a trace of 
dissatisfaction in his eyes. 

It seemed these people from the Shimen were a little too arrogant in the Heavenly 
Court. Although Tathagata was an esteemed ruler, did they not know that he, the Jade 
Emperor, was the master of the Three Realms?bender 

However, 

This Pagoda-Bearing Heavenly King Li Jing, after all, was the Leader of the Three 
Armies of the Heavenly Court and had deep connections with Shimon. It was not 
appropriate for him, as the Jade Emperor, to directly confront them. 



With this thought, 

The Jade Emperor could only cast a warning glance at Li Jing, and then looked at the 
immortals in the main hall. 

What do my ministers think? 

Its worth mentioning that, 

When he said this, he deliberately cast his gaze on the Household Registration and 
Destiny Bureau, the Department of Thunder, the Demon Driving Institute, the Heavenly 
River Navy and other departments of the immortal officials. 

As expected, 

Encouraged by the Jade Emperors gaze, 

On top of the fact that this running dog of Shimon dared publicly ridicule Xuanqing, 
these colluding officials simply did not put them in their eyes. 

Tolerating what cannot be tolerated! 
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Right at this moment, 

A Thunder Department immortal, known for his hot temper, stepped forward. 

Your Majesty, in my opinion this Pagoda-Bearing Heavenly King Li is just spouting 
nonsense! 

As soon as these words were spoken, 

Hahaha, its just nonsense! 

I heard that Heavenly King Li wassomewhat fond of nonsense in his lifetime. 

Tsk tsk, I didnt expect that this old official of the Thunder Department would still have 
such a temper, no wonder he is under Universal Transcendence. 

In an instant, 

All the immortals in the main hall laughed and had joyful expressions on their faces. The 
atmosphere was extremely lively. 

As the object of this laughter Heavenly King Li, of course, couldnt be happy. 



How dare you, you little Thunder Department official! Even if your boss, Universal 
Transcendence, comes, he should give me some respect. You actually dare to speak to 
me like this? 

Heavenly King Lis face was pale, and he scolded angrily. 

Pfft~ 

This Thunder Department immortal just snorted, giving no importance to Li Jings words. 

It was very clear to him the status of Daoist Xuanqing in the mind of their own boss, 
Universal Transcendence. 

Frankly, if he gave you face, he would call you a Heavenly King. If he didnt give you 
face, he would call you an old dogWhat could you do about it? 

Right at this moment, 

An immortal official from the Household Registration and Destiny Bureau stood up. 

Your Majesty, Ive often heard my Lord say that Daoist Xuanqing is humble and of good 
character, as well as being a disciple of the Old Lord. This promotion is due to his great 
fortune and merit. 

Immediately following, 

Immortals from the Heavenly Official Mansion, Plague Department, Demon Driving 
Institute especially the Three Heavenly Masters, were furious. Even the immortals from 
the Heavenly River Navy also stood up one after another. 

Your Majesty, we believe that Taoist Xuanqings promotion is due to his profound 
blessings and the will of heaven! 

Your Majesty, I think. 

Your Majesty 

The walls pushed, and people fell back. 

These departments that spoke up almost encompassed the three religions that existed 
before the Heavenly Court. They might fight amongst themselves, but when faced with 
outsiders like Shimon, they were surprisingly united. 

Facing the condemnation of the entire world. 



Heavenly King Lis face turned pale, experiencing for the first time what it meant to bean 
enemy of the world! 

In the past, when he had spoken at court meetings, at most one or two immortals would 
stand up against him. But never like this time, when all the immortals stood up and 
attacked him. 

No, there was still one person left! 

In the entire main hall, there was still one immortal who hadnt expressed his opinion 
against him. 

At this thought, 

Heavenly King Li looked hopefully at the Jade Emperors sidethe one who was hailed as 
the good old man of the Three Realms, who never spoke ill of others, and who never 
fought with anyoneStar Lord Taibai. 

At that moment, 

On the high platform, 

The Jade Emperor spoke. 

Taibais ministerwhat do you think of this matter? 

At this remark, 

Everyone quieted down, their eyes filled with interest. 

They were well aware that in the entire Heavenly Court, if anyone had the closest 
relationship with Daoist Xuanqing, it would be Star Lord Taibai. Not to mention anything 
else, even the promotion banquethad been held in his Star Lord Mansion. 

However, 

Li Jing had never paid attention to these matters, and his heart was filled with 
expectations. 

In the past, when disputes arose during court meetings, it was always this good old man 
who stood up and mediated, turning big issues into small ones and small ones into 
nothing 

He must do the same this timeas he had always done before, and dismiss the matter! 

Old good man of the Three Realmsplease speak up, I cant bear the criticism 



from the heavens any longer. Pagoda-Bearing Heavenly King Li anxiously 

thought in his heart. 

Under the spotlight of everyone, 

Ahem- 

Star Lord Taibai shook his whisk in his hand, stepped forward, and bowed slightly 
before saying leisurely: 

Your Majesty, Ithink they are right! 

At that remark, 

Boom- 

Hahaha, I cant stop laughing! Heavenly King Li thought that Taibai would speak up for 
him! 

Exactlythe whole Heavenly Court, even Zeng Zhang Tianwang, the gatekeeper, knows 
that Star Lord Taibai and Xuanqing have a good relationship, but Li Jing doesnt. 

If it werent for my high cultivation, I would have laughed so hard that I would have 
become breathless! 

The main hall was filled with joy. 

The gazes of the gods at Pagoda-Bearing Heavenly King Li were like those on a clown, 
full of ridicule. 

Pfft~ 

Heavenly King Li could no longer bear the pointing of a thousand fingers, and he 
spewed out a mouthful of golden blood. He then fainted on the spot. 

Above the high platform, 

Seeing this, 

The Jade Emperor was speechless. 

Although Pagoda-Bearing Heavenly King Li Jing was shameless, as the leader of the 
Three Armies, his destiny and cultivation should have been high, so how could he 
possibly faint from spitting blood? 



It was clear at a glancehe was too embarrassed to face people and wanted to find an 
excuse to leave the main hall. 

Someone, help Pagoda-Bearing Heavenly King Li, he is unwell! Take him away! 

Yes! 

In the main hall, 

Just after the Jade Emperor spoke, 

Heavenly King Li, who had fainted from vomiting blood, trembled slightly in his soul. 

Although his movements were weak, the gods present at the Lingxiao Bao Hall were no 
ordinary people, and they could see everything clearly, despising Heavenly King Li in 
their hearts.. 

Chapter 216: Mysterious patterns on the Luck Jade Seal! 

 

After Heavenly King Li was taken away. 

The conferment and promotion ceremony proceeded as usual, with the Jade Emperor 
raising Xuanqings destiny with a seal and granting him more authority over the rules of 
this Heaven and Earth, under the watchful eyes of all the gods and immortals. 

Thankyou, Jade Emperor! 

Xuanqing had a smile on his face and bowed to the Jade Emperor. 

He could clearly feel the increase of his authority in this Heaven and Earth. If the Three 
Realms were compared to a company, then he had just become a bigger shareholder. 

After the conferment ceremony. 

Just as Xuanqing stepped out of Lingxiao Bao Hall, 

Star Lord Taibai, the three Old Heavenly Masters, and all the immortals who had just 
spoken out in the hall surrounded him. 

Fellow Daoist Xuanqing, now that you have been promoted again, will you be holding 
another banquet? an immortal asked. 

Star Lord Taibai also spoke up, saying, If you want to hold it, you can continue at my 
Star Lord Mansion. At that time, all your fellow colleagues will come to congratulate you! 



Indeed, indeed, that Pagoda-bearing Lis dog is truly hateful. We might as well take this 
opportunity to discuss how to trip him up 

Because of what happened with Pagoda-Bearing Heavenly King Li, many gods and 
immortals had a common topic: to bring him down. 

Facing these enthusiastic gods and immortals, 

Xuanqing felt deeply touched. 

As the saying goes, It takes three to make a good man, and one relies on friends away 
from home. Before transcending the rules, it is always better to have more friends. 

However, 

there was no need for another banquet. 

Moreover, he was still worried that if he held another banquet, he might accidentally be 
promoted again 

Tsk-tsk- That would be too flashy, and its better to be low-key in life. 

With this thought in mind, 

Xuanqing showed a bitter smile on his face, and then bowed slightly to the gods before 
saying: 

Fellow Daoist Friends, Im truly sorry, but I still have a foundation in the human world, 
and one day in Heaven equals a year on Earth 

As soon as these words came out, 

the gods and immortals nodded in understanding, congratulated him, and then didnt 
mention the banquet anymore. 

However, to express their congratulations, they all went with Xuanqing to the Southern 
Heavenly Gate. 

Haha, thank you, fellow Daoist friends, for seeing me off. If you find some spare time, 
please come to visit Black Wind Mountain Im going now! 

Xuanqing laughed heartily. 

He then stepped through the Southern Heavenly Gate, and his figure disappeared from 
Heavenly Court. 



After watching Xuanqing leave, 

all the gods exchanged greetings with each other, then dispersed in pairs and alone. 

On this side, 

Black Wind Mountain. 

A lucky cloud descended from the sky. 

As Xuanqing set foot on the ground of Black Wind Mountain, he felt a tremor in the Luck 
Jade Seal at his brow, as if something had changed. 

Huh? 

He landed on the ground. 

Luck Jade Seal! Xuanqing took out the Luck Jade Seal and examined it carefully. He 
found that an additional five-pointed star pattern had appeared on its side. 

Not only that, 

the National Destiny Power contained within had increased at least tenfold compared to 
before, making ones heart palpitate just by looking at it. 

So much growth in National Destiny Power, and the appearance of a star pattern what 
is its purpose?bender 

Xuanqing had some doubts in his heart. 

He stared at the star pattern on the Luck Jade Seal and studied it for a while, but 
couldnt find anything unusual about it. 

Perhaps this star engraving pattern is a display of a certain level? 

Just like when the national luck reaches a certain level, a star will appear, and when 
enough stars accumulate, they will turn into the moon? 

Mysterious. 

This strange idea emerged in his mind. 

Puff- Forget it, if I cant figure it out, I wont think about it. 

Xuanqing shook his head with a smile. 



Although he couldnt understand the meaning of the appearance of this star, he could 
feel that it wasnt a bad thing, so he just gave up the idea of continuing to study it. 

As the saying goes, one day in heaven and one year on earth, he had been in Heavenly 
Court for almost two and a half days, so it was equivalent to a Kun year (two and a half 
years) in the human world! 

He didnt know how the development of Black Wind Mountain had gone after such a 
long time. 

With a thought. 

He immediately used the Immortal Official Record to send a secret message to 
Gentleman Bai She, asking him to come to Black Wind Mountain. 

Moments later. 

Greetings, Sir! Gentleman Bai She, in a black dragon robe, respectfully bowed. 

Hmm! 

Xuanqing nodded slightly, then asked, Qingxu, tell me how the Black Wind Mountain is 
now. 

Yes, Sir! 

Gentleman Bai She bowed slightly and then began to recount. 

Now the population of Black Wind Mountain has exceeded 10 million, most of them 
have been extradited from the Kingdom of Wusi Tibetan, and a small part from 
Westside Hami 

Currently, fifteen new big factories have been added to the country mainly steel mills, 
cement mills, daily chemicals, glass etc. 

Old Master, you also gave the divine book, about the research on engines, has already 
been put on the agenda, but due to the technology level of the Ministry of Works, we 
have not been able to make a breakthrough and still need 

Regarding trade, the main focus is on exports to Wusi Tibetan Country, as well as some 
smuggling in West Hami side and the border of Tang Dynasty 

With Gentleman Bai Shes explanation. 

A thriving country, in a rocket-like rise, was fully displayed before him. 



Not bad, not bad, its no wonder that the national luck has increased so much, Qingxu 
youve worked hard! Xuanqing patted his shoulder. 

Gentleman Bai She quickly straightened up, his face filled with pride. 

Seeing that. 

Qingxu, keep up the good work, if it goes on like this, I should be able to condense the 
Divines flower in ten years. 

When I achieve the Divines flower, I will help you achieve the Destiny Golden Dragon 
body, wash your blood, and completely transform your snake body! 

Xuanqing said earnestly. 

Upon hearing those words. 

Yes, Sir, if theres nothing else, Id like to handle official documents now. Gentleman Bai 
She was excited. 

Hmm go, keep working hard, I believe in you! 

Watching Gentleman Bai She leave and looking at his spirited figure. 

Xuanqing nodded in satisfaction. 

The promise he made to Gentleman Bai She was not just pie in the sky but something 
he could truly do and intended to do. 

The development of Black Wind Country with Gentleman Bai She in charge, he didnt 
have to worry about anything except enemy invasions. 

Now. 

Its time to consider the harvest from this trip to the Heavenly Court and the follow-up 
plans. 

In the real world, its been more than seventy days, the incense has accumulated 
hundreds of millions, and it has been promoted to the fourth-rank, it looks like the Taoist 
gate is doing well. 

The incense in reality doesnt have legs, so it wont run away. I dont have to hurry. 

So, next get the Ancestral Dragon Crystal first, then put the Heavenly Merit in, and 
finally upload it to the Mall! 



So where to get the Ancestral Dragon Crystal? 

Xuanqing frowned slightly.. 

Chapter 217: Daoist Friend, feel free to take whatever you need. 

 

According to the Ancestor Master. 

The Ancestral Dragon Crystal is formed from the blood of the Ancestral Dragon who fell 
during the ancient Dragon Phoenix era when they ruled Heaven and Earth. 

It possesses the formidable effects of enhancing the blood of the Dragon Clan, purifying 
bloodlines, and carrying Heavenly Merit. 

Not to mention whether the Ancestral Dragon Crystal has been consumed over the 
years, even if there is still some left, it must be an exceptionally precious treasure 
among the Dragon Clan. 

The Dragon Clan is currently divided into the East, South, West, and NorthFour Seas, 
and I have dealt with West Sea Dragon King Ao Run. 

Xuanqing still remembered it clearly. 

At that time, during the banquet he held on Black Wind Mountain, West Sea Dragon 
King Ao Run brought his son Ao Moang to celebrate, and even offered a generous gift, 
hoping that Ao Moang would become his disciple! 

However, 

He did not agree to the West Sea Dragon King at that time, because he knew very well 
that the other party only wanted to use his personal background to their advantage. 

Its a bit difficult but the Ancestral Dragon Crystal is related to whether I can exchange 
Ingot for Heavenly Merit, so I have to try anyway, Xuanqing thought to himself. 

Even if the West Sea Dragon King used Ao Moangs apprenticeship as a condition, he 
was willing to accept it, because the Ancestral Dragon Crystal was too important for 
him. 

Lets go, its time to visit the West Sea! 

Xuanqing stood up, swinging the whisk in his hand, and a lucky cloud appeared under 
his feet, carrying him in the direction of the West Sea at great speed. 



The boundless ocean.bender 

Turbulent waves came from the horizon, bright waves surged and chased each other, 
like a vast army, bearing a roar like thunder as they galloped towards them. 

Along with the rolling waves, there were many shrimp and crab people with arms and 
legs hidden in the spray. 

These Shrimp Soldiers and Crab Generals were led by a Great White Shark spirit, its 
sharp and fierce teeth gleaming with cold light. 

Suddenly, 

A lucky cloud sped by in the distance, drawing the attention of the Great White Shark, 
who immediately ordered its subordinates not to move with a swing of its fins. 

Looking closely, 

On the lucky cloud stood a young Taoist priest of extraordinary temperament, holding a 
feather duster. 

Taoist Priest, please stop. This is a crucial entrance to the West Sea. May I ask who 
you are and what brings you here? 

The Great White Shark made a salute gesture with its short fins. 

Although the Four Seas Dragon Tribe is still powerful, their decline has led to their 
inability to stand up to figures who present themselves as part of the Taoist sect. 

Immeasurable Longevity and Fortune, I am the Left Envoy Immortal and Five Thunder 
Ambassador. I have come today with something to discuss with the West Sea Dragon 
King, said Xuanqing, waving the whisk in his hand. 

Upon hearing, 

Taoist Priest, please wait a moment. I will go and report this immediately! 

The Great White Shark became even more respectful and quickly instructed its 
subordinates to wait at the entrance before diving into the sea to report the situation. 

After a while, 

The waves churned. 

The West Sea Dragon King appeared from the seabed, wearing a golden dragon robe 
and with deer antlers on his head. 



Hahaha- A rare guesta rare guest indeed. This morning I felt a lucky aura over the 
Dragon Palace, and so it turns out to be Daoist Priest Xuanqing gracing us with his 
presence! 

West Sea Dragon King laughed heartily, speaking words of courtesy. 

There was no way he could help it. 

Since the decline of the Dragon Clan, the once mighty clan that roamed the Three 
Realms has gradually become smoother in character. 

Dragon King Ao Run, youre too courteous! Xuanqing smiled slightly and returned the 
salute. 

Please, please, Daoist Priest Xuanqing, come in! 

West Sea Dragon King waved his sleeve and made a welcoming gesture, then turned to 
the patrolling Great White Shark and commanded: 

You really have no vision. From now on, when Daoist Xuanqing arrives, there will be no 
need for reporting, just a salutedo you understand? 

Its a subordinates fault, I understand! The Great White Shark shuddered and quickly 
knelt on the ground. 

Seeing this scene, 

Xuanqing paused for a moment and couldnt help but smile. This West Sea Dragon King 
is indeed an interesting person. 

About ten thousand meters deep into the sea. 

An transparent shield emitting faint light could be seen. 

Whooosh- 

Passing through the shield. 

In an instant. 

Colorful lights, luminous pearls, and various coral reefs came into view. 

Even the randomly growing plants along the roadside were exuding a powerful 
medicinal aura, giving the impression of thousand-year-old ginseng. 



Tsk tsk No wonder the Dragon Clan is said to be rich. These roadside weeds can 
actually compare to thousand-year-old ginseng! Xuanqing marveled in his heart. 

As expected of the Dragon Clan, which is known as the wealthiest in the Three Realms. 
Even in decline, they still relied on the wealth of the Four Seas to remain so 
domineering. 

Hehe, the Dragon Palace Great Hall of the West Sea is just up ahead! The West Sea 
Dragon King reached out his right hand and introduced with a cheerful laugh. 

Dragon Palace Great Hall. 

Brightly lit and splendidly decorated, every pillar was extraordinary and could be 
considered a precious treasure. 

Besides that. 

Inside the great hall there stood a noble and elegant woman with dragon horns on her 
head, as well as a handsome young man. 

He recognized the good-looking young man with a mole on his brow it was Ao Moang, 
whom he had met once on Black Wind Mountain. 

As for the other dignified woman, he didnt know who she was, but she must also be a 
member of the Dragon Clan. 

Its worth mentioning that. 

The Dragon Clan has a peculiar characteristic. After transforming into human form, 
males would usually keep their dragon heads. 

Meanwhile, upon transforming, female dragons would have dragon horns on their 
foreheads, which symbolized the Dragon Clan, but otherwise, they were 
indistinguishable from humans. 

Haha, this is my wife, Lady Ao of the West Sea, and you already know Ao Moang, my 
son, whom you met on Black Wind Mountain! The West Sea Dragon King introduced 
them. 

Dragon Queen? 

Xuanqing wondered in his heart, Dragon King Ao Run, didnt you mention last time that 
Ao Moangs mother is a human? 



Ah, youve misunderstood, Daoist friend. After giving birth to Ao Moang, his mother 
passed away. This is my legal wife. The West Sea Dragon King replied with a bitter 
smile, explaining. 

Upon hearing this. 

So thats how it is! Xuanqing suddenly realized. 

He didnt think of this earlier. Even mortals had multiple wives and concubines, let alone 
the pleasure-seeking Dragon Clan. 

Afterward. 

The West Sea Dragon King ordered a teapot to be served. 

Daoist friend, this is a special ocean product, Coral Abalone Spirit Tea. It has a unique 
taste salty with a touch of freshness. 

Thank you, Dragon King Ao Run, please- Xuanqing bowed his hands and took a sip. 

Hmm 

the taste had a hint of damp saltiness, which felt quite strange. 

After some tea-drinking and small talk. 

The West Sea Dragon King curiously asked, By the way, Daoist friend Xuanqing, may I 
know what brings you to my West Sea? 

Seeing the conversation enter the main topic. 

Xuanqings spirit was lifted, and he immediately spoke: Ao Run Dragon King, do you 
know of a treasure called the Ancestral Dragon Crystal? 

Ancestral Dragon Crystal? 

Upon hearing the term, 

The West Sea Dragon Kings eyes shifted as he thought So this Daoist Xuanqing came 
for this item. 

It is the supreme treasure of the Dragon Clan. Of course, I know it, and 

At this point, after a brief pause, he continued: 



Moreover there is still one last Ancestral Dragon Crystal in the Dragon Tomb in the 
West Sea. 

Originally, I planned to use the Ancestral Dragon Crystal for Moangs cultivation, but if 
you need it, Daoist friend, just take it.. 

Chapter 218: Upload the Ancestral Dragon Crystal, and add another child. 

 

Upon hearing the words of the West Sea Dragon King. 

There was some surprise in Xuanqings heart. 

He had thought that the other party would use the Ancestral Dragon Crystal as a threat 
and take the opportunity to propose that Ao Moang be brought into Black Wind 
Mountain. 

In that case thank you, Dragon King Ao Run. However, I only need to borrow the 
Ancestral Dragon Crystal and observe it for a while. 

Xuanqing said indifferently. 

Hearing this. 

This please! 

The West Sea Dragon King was startled, and a bitter smile appeared on his face, but he 
didnt explain anything and directly made a gesture of invitation. 

Upon seeing this. 

Xuanqing raised an eyebrow, wondering why the West Sea Dragon King had such a 
strange expression on his face. Was there some hidden secret? 

Dragon Tomb. 

This is the place specifically for burying the Dragon Clan. 

Most of the burial places inside were for the dragons who perished in the catastrophe of 
that year. 

Once inside the Dragon Tomb, there was a completely different world. 

In the boundless plain, countless huge dragon bones stood erect, some thousands of 
feet tall and some even tens of thousands of feet tall.bender 



Cave World? 

Xuanqing couldnt help blurting out. 

Hahaha- Daoist friend has a good eye. The Dragon Tomb of the Four Seas is actually a 
separate Cave World. East Sea Dragon King nodded and laughed. 

Its worth mentioning that. 

The so-called Cave World has an essential difference from the Cave heaven and 
blessed land. The former refers to an independent world, while the latter merely refers 
to a particular cultivation land. 

Daoist friend, please follow me. The Ancestral Dragon Crystal is sealed ahead. West 
Sea Dragon King pointed to the front and then stepped forward. 

Xuanqing followed closely behind. 

After walking for dozens of miles 

They saw a gigantic dragon skeleton that reached the sky. Even though the body was 
dead and only bones remained, the momentum was still majestic and grand. 

More importantly. 

There was a fist-sized, blood-red crystal bead emitting a strong blood qi in the chest 
cavity of the dragon skeleton. 

Daoist Friend Xuanqing, this is the Ancestral Dragon Crystal formed by the condensed 
blood of the Ancestral Dragon. To prevent the Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi from 
overflowing, it is sealed within this dragon bone. 

Once the seal is opened, you must use it as soon as possible, otherwise, the Ancestral 
Dragon Blood Qi contained in it will quickly vanish. 

At that time this Ancestral Dragon Crystal will only have an empty shell left, without 
Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi. West Sea Dragon King explained. 

Upon hearing this. 

Xuanqing suddenly realized. 

No wonder the other party had a strange expression when he said he would only borrow 
the Ancestral Dragon Crystal. 



For him, what he valued was the Ancestral Dragon Crystal itself. As long as it could 
carry the Heavenly Merit, it didnt matter whether there was Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi 
or not. 

But for the Dragon Clan, the preciousness of this Ancestral Dragon Crystal was the 
Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi inside it, which was used to enhance the bloodline strength. 

With this thought in mind. 

Xuanqing raised an eyebrow and asked, If thats the case after I use this Ancestral 
Dragon Crystal, wont Ao Moang have nothing left to use? 

No problem- Although the Ancestral Dragon Crystal is precious, it is nothing compared 
to the friendship of Daoist Xuanqing! 

The West Sea Dragon King laughingly said. 

At this moment. 

Although his words sounded like flattery, they did indeed make people feel comfortable. 
Moreover, it wasnt empty talk, as he actually followed through with his words. 

At this moment. 

Hearing these words. 

Xuanqing nodded slightly and made a decision in his heart to accept Ao Moang. 

His character was just like that, although he couldnt repay a favor with a spring, he 
could still return others kindness with his own.. 

If you are good to me.. I will naturally be good to you as well! 

Then I will trouble Dragon King Ao Run to remove the seal! 

Alright, Daoist friend, please wait a moment! 

West Sea Dragon King agreed. 

Afterwards. 

The West Sea Dragon King stretched out his right hand, and squeezed a drop of blood 
essence from his fingertip, shooting it at the giant dragon bone. 

The tiny drop of blood disappeared instantly upon contact with the huge dragon bone. 



Buzz buzz- 

A series of mysterious fluctuations spread through the air. 

The shield originally covering the Ancestral Dragon Crystal slowly melted away, 
eventually dissipating completely. 

Ding dong- 

The Ancestral Dragon Crystal fell from the hollow part of the dragon bone, hitting the 
ground with a crisp sound. 

The West Sea Dragon King mobilized the dragon power in his body and formed an 
illusory hand, grabbing the Ancestral Dragon Crystal. 

Friend Xuanqing, this Ancestral Dragon Crystal is now entrusted to you! 

Thank you, Dragon King! 

Xuanqing took the Ancestral Dragon Crystal, bowed his thanks, and without any 
hesitation, immediately muttered in his heart 

Upload! 

[Product uploading1%.2%.3%] 

Accompanied by the upload command, an illusory progress bar appeared before his 
eyes. 

The upload speed was a bit slow, but at least he could see the progress bar moving. 
According to this situation, it should be done in two or three days. 

Xuanqing let out a sigh of relief in his heart. 

He was really worried that the Ancestral Dragon Crystal would be like the Ginseng Fruit 
he uploaded before, with the progress bar not moving at all. 

Next. 

It was just a matter of waiting for the thing to finish uploading. 

Hahaha, Friend Xuanqing rarely visits the West Sea, and since the Ancestral Dragon 
Crystal has been obtained How about going to the Dragon Palace Great Hall for a 
banquet? The West Sea Dragon King suggested with a smile on his face. 

Alright! 



Xuanqing nodded his head. 

While uploading the Ancestral Dragon Crystal, he followed the West Sea Dragon King 
and left the Dragon Tomb, where the Dragon Clan was buried. 

Inside the main hall of the Dragon Palace. 

The round table was filled with precious dishes, including various deep-sea specialties 
and some rare land-based foods. 

In front of the dining table. 

In addition to the West Sea Dragon King, his wives, concubines, and dragon children 
were all present, looking curiously at the human Taoist who their Father Emperor 
respected so much. 

Children, let me introduce him to you. 

The West Sea Dragon King stood up and pointed to Xuanqing, saying, This is Daoist 
Xuanqing, a brother of the same generation as me, and you should call him uncle. 

Your Uncle Xuanqing is remarkable, a disciple of the Old Lord, and Great Immortal 
Zhenyuan of Longevity Mountain is his elder as well. His good friends are scattered 
among the gods of the Heavenly Court 

Upon hearing this. 

All the dragon children, including Ao Moang, widened their eyes. 

They finally understood why their father valued Daoist Xuanqing so much. 

They never expected Daoist Xuanqings background to be so profound. 

Immediately. 

Ao Moang, the Crown Prince, picked up his wine cup, stood up and said loudly, I didnt 
expect Uncle Xuanqing to have such an amazing background. Moang toasts to you! 

Since big brother raised his cup. 

The other dragon children naturally couldnt just watch. They quickly followed suit, 
picking up their wine cups and standing up to toast Xuanqing. 

This scene made the West Sea Dragon King on the side feel gratified, thinking that his 
children had finally grown up and become sensible. 



At this moment. 

Xuanqing held the Ancestral Dragon Crystal in one hand, gently rubbing it, and with the 
other hand, he raised the wine cup, took a sip, and responded to the toast from the 
dragon children. 

His gaze turned to the West Sea Dragon King, and he didnt bother to mince words, 
speaking in a gloomy tone: 

Ao Run, although I have no intention of taking disciples, I am lacking a personal 
attendant. If you dont mind, you could send Moang over.. 

Chapter 219: What Can the Disciple Do? 

 

Not accepting a disciple but accepting as a child under ones seat? 

West Sea Dragon King was slightly stunned, and hurriedly nodded in agreement: 
Willing, naturally willing. 

Truth be told, 

He didnt intend for Ao Moang to learn any skills, because the cultivation of the Dragon 
Clan is an innate inheritance, not acquired through practice. 

The reason for wanting to become a disciple was merely to take advantage of the 
opponents profound background, aiming to climb up Douluo Palace and cling to the 
thigh of Great Immortal Zhenyuan. 

On this side, 

Seeing his father nod, 

Ao Moang had no hesitation. 

He immediately stood up and took a step backkneeling down, Ao 

Moangkowtows to Sir! 

Immeasurable Longevity and Fortune Moang, get up! Xuanqing nodded slightly and 
accepted Ao Moangs bow, then helped him up. 

There are not many rules under my tutelage, just respect your teacher and the Tao, and 
act with a clear conscience! 



Xuanqing said indifferently, You have a senior sister above you, who is from the Four 
Sacred Beasts White Tiger Clan, called Bai Linger. I will introduce you to her when we 
go back to the mountain. 

Yes Sir! Ao Moang nodded solemnly, and his address changed to Sir as well. Seeing 
this scene, 

Hahaha, good, good- Moang joining Daoist Friends tutelage today is indeed a great 
fortune for the West Sea. 

Servant! The West Sea Dragon King was overjoyed, waving his hand to summon an 
attendant, Go to the West Sea Treasure House and bring out the Deep Sea Ice 
Crystals, one hundred thousand years worth for this King. Yes! 

Moments later, 

A clam spirit came over with a Sumeru Bag, Your Majesty, the treasures are all in here. 

The West Sea Dragon King nodded and then approached Xuanqing. 

Moang has joined Daoist Friends tutelage, and this King has no precious treasures. 
These are all I have as gifts, please do not refuse, Daoist Friend! This all right! 

Xuanqing hesitated a little, but finally accepted the items. 

Seeing this, 

The West Sea Dragon King smiled and quickly invited Xuanqing back to the dining 
table, ordering his subordinates to bring up some more good wine and dishes. 

Daoist Friend Xuanqing, I entrust my child to you If he disobeys you in the future, feel 
free to punish him, this King will not say a word 

This King toasts Daoist Friend Come, lets drink up! 

Drain! 

With one gulp, it was extremely refreshing. 

Ao Moang at the side was very observant and immediately picked up the wine pot, 
pouring more wine for the West Sea Dragon King and Xuanqing. 

Four hours later, 

On the sea surface, 



The West Sea Dragon King, a group of Dragon Princes, and the Dragon Consorts 
floated. 

Moang, when you go to Black Wind Mountain, listen to Daoist Friend Xuanqings words 

I understand, Father Emperor, you can escort us only up to here. We will meet again! 
Ao Moang clasped his fists and bowed. 

Then, 

He transformed into a mini white dragon several meters long and flew up to the sky, 
circling around a patch of lucky clouds. 

Sir, we can set off now! Ao Moang said to the Taoist priest on the lucky cloud. 

Okay! 

Xuanqing nodded slightly and then drove the lucky cloud towards the direction of Black 
Wind Nation. 

Black Wind Mountain. 

In the courtyard of the Taoist temple, 

A petite white tiger was chasing after a fluttering butterfly in the air. After catching it, she 
let it go, then continued to chase it, playing repeatedly like this. 

Huh- Butterfly butterfly, you fly faster, tiger is coming to chase you, hehe~ Bai Linger 
caught the butterfly once again and giggled to herself. 

Suddenly. 

It seemed as if she felt something. 

Bai Linger tossed the butterfly in her hand and a gust of Qingfeng breeze slipped under 
her feet, turning into a laser flying into the sky. 

Xuanqing Brother huh why is there a dragon too? 

She who originally planned to jump directly into Sirs arms stopped abruptly with a hard 
brake. 

Sir- 

In front of outsiders, Bai Linger still knew whats important and immediately lowered her 
head, calling Sir softly to show respect. 



Bai Linger, come here! 

Xuanqing waved the whisk in his hand and caught the little kitty White Tiger in his hand, 
petting it fondly before putting it on his shoulder. 

Let me introduce you, this is my newly accepted disciple Ao Moang. Xuanqing tilted his 
head and spoke to the little kitty on his shoulder. 

Then. 

He turned his head again and looked at Ao Moang beside him. 

Moang, the one on my shoulder is Bai Linger. She joined before you, you can just call 
her Senior Sister Linger. 

Upon hearing this. 

Ao~ 

Ao Moangs dragon body tumbled, transforming into a human shape, and respectfully 
bowed with a fist, giving his courtesy to the little kitten on Sirs shoulder. 

I am Moang Greetings to Senior Sister Linger! 

Hmm so youre the new junior brother Sir took in. You better listen to your senior sister 
from now on, understand? 

Bai Linger stood up on Xuanqings shoulder, swinging her tiger paws. 

Pfft~ 

Seeing the cheap senior sister trying so hard to look serious but acting somewhat 
ridiculous, even Ao Moang couldnt help but burst out laughing. 

??? 

Bai Linger was stunned, then she became furious, Ao~ she jumped off from Xuanqings 
body and tried to scratch her junior brother with her claws. 

No laughing, or Ill scratch you to death!bender 

Junior Brother admits his mistake, I was wrong. Its just that Senior Sister was so 
adorable, it reminded me of my little sister back home, I couldnt help it! 

Ao Moang controlled his expression and made himself look serious. 



Hmph Ill let you off this time, but dont laugh next time- Bai Linger snorted coldly, 
stomping her tiger paw fiercely. 

Witnessing this scene, 

Xuanqing shook his head helplessly. 

He usually spoiled Bai Linger a lot since, as Ao Moang pointed out, she was simply 
adorable, which made her somewhat unruly now. 

Alright, Bai Linger, I have something to talk to Moang about, you go play on your own 
for now! 

With that said, 

Xuanqing pulled the little kitten on his shoulder into his hand and threw it towards the 
distance. 

This action caused Bai Linger to wail in grievance, flying into the courtyard without 
looking back, and hmph she went to play with butterflies on her own 

After Little White Tiger left, 

Xuanqing looked at Ao Moang and spoke calmly, Your Dragon Clan cultivates Dragon 
Yuan, and I cant help you with that. 

But I have a method that can transform you into a Destiny Golden Dragon body. Then, 
combined with your White Dragon Bloodline, youll be able to 

He had said these words to Gentleman Bai She before, and now he repeated them to 
Ao Moang. 

After listening, 

Ao Moang was not only astonished but also overjoyed. 

He hadnt expected that after joining Xuanqing Sirs sect, he would gain such unexpected 
benefits. 

Thank you, Sir! 

Dont thank me just yet. To condense a Destiny Golden Dragon body, youll need the 
help of Black Wind Countrys National Luck. 

Xuanqing shook his head and then explained, Youll have to wait until I condense the 
Divines flower and another disciple Gentleman Bai She to condense their Destiny 



Golden Dragon body first, then itll be your turn! However, if the national luck of Black 
Wind Country becomes strong enough, it can greatly shorten the time for you to 
condense a Destiny Golden Dragon body! 

Hearing these words, 

Ao Moang was slightly taken aback and then quickly asked, Sir, how can we improve 
the national luck of Black Wind Country, and what can I do? 
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What can I do? 

Upon hearing this, 

Xuanqing said, My Black Wind Country focuses on industrial production, absorbing the 
population of neighboring kingdoms as a foundation, and the main strategy is 
commercial development. 

What you can do is to help the Black Wind Country establish ocean transport routes in 
commerce. The specifics must be discussed with the King of Black Wind Kingdom who 
is also my disciple Qingxu. 

Ao Moang understood, and then clasped his fists, I understand, and Ill discuss it with 
Senior Brother Qingxu! 

Hmm go on. 

Xuanqing nodded slightly and waved to Ao Moang. 

After he left, 

Xuanqing withdrew his gaze and focused on the Ancestral Dragon Crystal in his hand. 

In more than half a day, the upload progress has reached more than 30%. 

West Sea Dragon King, you are quite clever- 

Xuanqing sighed with admiration. 

He intended to give Ao Moang a few of the Ancestral Dragon Crystals to try after they 
were uploaded, as long as the price was not too high. 

Even so, 



Even if the West Sea Dragon King was demanding with the Ancestral Dragon Crystal, 
he would eventually agree to accept Ao Moang as his disciple). 

However, he would never be as dedicated as he is now, even thinking about making 
him condense the Destiny Golden Dragon body and exchanging the Ancestral Dragon 
Crystal. 

This is the intelligence of the West Sea Dragon King. The same thing, dealt with in 
different ways, the eventual result is naturally poles apart. 

Two days later. 

[Upload progress: 97%98%99%1OO%] 

[Ding- Congratulations, upload successful, Mall increment: Ancestral Dragon Crystal 
(1,000,000)] 

Listening to the prompt in his mind, 

Xuanqings spirit lifted. 

One million its a bit expensive. It must be because it contains Ancestral Dragon Blood 
Qi. If the Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi is released, it should be cheaper. 

Check Ancestral Dragon Crystal! 

[Ancestral Dragon Crystal]: A crystal containing a weak strand of Ancestral Dragon 
Blood Qi, which has the effect of purifying the physical body and strengthening 
bloodline. 

As expected, 

The information displayed was a crystal containing Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi. 

In order to accommodate Heavenly Merit, the Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi inside must be 
released first 

He didnt need these Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi. It would be a bit of a waste to just let 
them dissipate. 

After thinking about it, 

Xuanqing brought out the Immortal Official Document, and lightly touched the summon 
instructions for Gentleman Bai She. 

Moments later, 



A figure rushed from the bottom of the mountain, and it was Gentleman Bai She who 
had received the message. 

Greetings, Sir Huh? What is this? 

He had just reached the top of the mountain and performed a salute before noticing the 
floating Ancestral Dragon Crystal. 

The aura emanating from it made Gentleman Bai Shes heart race, as an irresistible 
temptation from bloodline continuously stimulated his nerves. 

Qingxu, youre here! 

Xuanqing nodded slightly and pointed to the floating Ancestral Dragon Crystal, This is 
the Ancestral Dragon Crystal, formed from the blood of a fallen Ancestral Dragon in 
ancient times 

You have the White Snake origin, and I believe this will be of use to you! 

When these words were spoken, 

Hiss- 

Almost unable to tear his eyes away from the Ancestral Dragon Crystal. 

Gasping deeply and swallowing, he then struggled to open his mouth, Sir, this item is 
too precious to simply give to a subordinate like me 

The legendary powerful creature, the Ancient Ancestral Dragon this Ancestral Dragon 
Crystal contains Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi, and he couldnt imagine this treasure just 
being given to him by his Sir. 

Seeing this, 

Xuanqing laughed lightly, speaking faintly, Over these years, you have worked 
wholeheartedly and diligently to develop the Black Wind Kingdom. I have seen it and 
remembered it. 

In a while, I will release the Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi inside, so you need to be 
prepared to absorb it! 

Hearing this, 

Gentleman Bai Shes body trembled, overwhelmed with gratitude. He never expected 
that Sir had been paying attention to him all this time. 



Thank you, Sir! 

After deeply bowing, he immediately concentrated and sat down cross-legged, ready to 
absorb the Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi. 

Seeing that Gentleman Bai She was prepared, 

Xuanqing nodded slightly. 

Then, 

Qi Flowers power burst forth, transforming into an incredibly vast force, pouring into the 
Ancestral Dragon Crystal seed. 

What a domineering Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi! 

Xuanqing was a little surprised. 

He felt that the power of his Qi Flower was like being trapped in a quagmire within the 
Ancestral Dragon Crystal seed, filled with resistance. 

However, thinking about it this situation was perfectly normal. After all, it was Ancestral 
Dragon Blood Qi; even if it was only a faint bit, its quality dwarfed that of the Qi Flower 
despite being inferior in quantity. 

About an hour later, 

Get ready; its coming out! Xuanqing shouted softly. 

As soon as his words fell, 

Boom- 

The faint strand of Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi inside the Ancestral Dragon Crystal was 
forcefully squeezed out by the Qi Flower. 

The moment this strand of Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi emerged, the surrounding 
Heaven and Earth spiritual energy seemed to sense something terrifying and fled in an 
instant. 

Even the air itself was slightly torn apart. 

On the side, 

Gentleman Bai She could no longer suppress the temptation within his bloodline, 
opened his mouth, and fiercely inhaled the Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi. 



Slurp- 

Like noodles, it was instantly absorbed into his body. 

In an instant, 

A tearing pain swept over him. 

Ah~ Gentleman Bai She let out a miserable scream, falling to the ground and writhing 
continuously. 

Under the influence of the domineering Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi, his physical body 
gradually could not withstand it and began to melt, starting from the skin. 

Following that, 

His meridians, blood, bones, and internal organs were all forcibly evolved into the 
Dragon Clan bloodline under the influence of the Ancestral Dragon Blood Qi. 

The entire process was incredibly painful, but the benefits were also evident.bender 

Gentleman Bai Shes aura visibly increased at an astonishing speed. 

Originally a mere Profound Immortal (just after condensing the Immortal Body) realm, 
he soared to the level of a Golden Immortal in a short time. 

Two hours later, 

the metamorphosis ended. 

Gentleman Bai She lay sprawled on the ground, soaked in a mixture of blood and 
sweat. During the transformation process, his black dragon robe had become tattered 
and ragged. 

Pant- pant 

He gasped for breath heavily, feeling like he had survived a disaster. After quite some 
time, he finally came back to his senses. 

Then, he noticed the enormous change in his body. 

I My My subordinates bloodline has transformed! A white dragon! Its actually an Azure-
eyed White Dragon bloodline! My subordinate has transformed into an Azure-eyed 
White Dragon! 



Gentleman Bai Shes eyes widened, his whole being immersed in ecstasy. But when he 
saw Sir with a faint smile on the side, he reacted immediately. 

Thud- 

Thank you for your grace, Sir! Thank you for your grace! Gentleman Bai She knelt on 
the ground, kowtowing sincerely from the heart. 

Seeing this, 

Xuanqing smiled and nodded. Then, with a wave of his right hand, he cast a gentle 
breeze to help him up. 

Its just an Azure-eyed White Dragon. Work hard and develop the Black Wind Kingdom 
diligently.. Behind this, there is still a Luck Golden Dragon waiting for you- 

 


