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Collin: “You…what did you say?”

Dalia also suddenly looked up at Kraig: “You…what did you say?”

Kraig’s voice is very lonely: “Woman! I said you are vicious, you still
don’t admit it! Look at this farce of yours. I originally came here for an
emergency defense. All of your troubles fell short. “

Dalia: “…”

Elden’s courage who did not know where he was reaching out, he
immediately wiped a tear from his eyes, and stepped forward to
support Dalia: “Madam, no…that Miss Du, you…you misunderstood
Our lord, he is not here to find you, he has other things to arm here.”

Dalia: “Really…really?”

Kraig: “You have been with me for seven or eight years, and you don’t
even know me a little bit? When will I kill people like Arron, and you
think of me that way?”

“Return how I will torture you!”

“Woman, you can get pregnant as soon as you are pregnant, so you
don’t get masochistic fantasy, right?”

Dalia: “…”

“My surname Jun is not so stingy, just a woman, not to mention that
you have been so good to me for seven years with me. Go, take your
man and leave this city and live in another city, because I want to live
in this city. The city is armed.”

Dalia was stunned for a long time.

Kraig smiled peacefully: “Why, don’t you believe it?”



Dalia shook his head, and then immediately said: “No…I don’t believe
it, I…I believe it, I believe it.”

As long as she spoke, she went to Collin as if fleeing for her life.

The shocking experience just made her unable to stand and walk, so
she just climbed all the way towards Collin.

Collin also rushed over to hug Dalia.

The two cried in each other’s arms.

“Uuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuuu
uuuuu, is this true, I…I don’t have to die anymore?”

Collin hugged Dalia: “Yes, Xiaoshan, Mr. Jun let us go, Mr. Jun is a
good person…”

“I… Am I not dreaming?”

“No.”

“I… my child, the child in my stomach is still there?”

“Here, touch it.” Collin said with a smile.

Dalia sat on the ground and immediately touched her pregnant belly
with her hands. After touching for a while, she suddenly smiled at
Collin: “Brother Dashan, move, the baby kicked me in my stomach, ha
ha ha… .Listen, you touch it, really. He kicked me, hehehe.”

At this moment, Dalia’s happy look gave Kraig another sight.

He thought, he was fantasizing! If Dalia was nestled in his arms and
said this to him, how good would it be?

How good is it?

She was clearly carrying his Kraig’s child in her belly!

His hands clenched fists fiercely, trying to restrain himself and not let
himself be impulsive.



He told himself over and over again: “Let her go, let her go, let her
go…”

Dalia touched his pregnant belly, was happy, and then looked back at
Kraig: “You…what you said is true?”

“Don’t get out! Both of you are dead without a place to be buried!”
Kraig said viciously.

Dalia immediately nodded like a chicken pecking at rice:
“Master…Thank you, thank you…Thank you, I will thank you for life.
By the way, don’t worry, I will never take a child in this life. Seeing you,
I don’t think it’s the kind of person who uses kids as a bargaining chip.
Don’t worry.”

“Go!”

D*mn it!

Shouldn’t you bring your children to find Lao Tzu!

You are pregnant with Lao Tzu’s seed!

Lao Tzu’s!

“Get out!” Kraig said again.

Chapter 1499

“Okay, okay, let’s…get out now!” Dalia and Du Collin supported each
other.

The two had just sold a leg, Dalia suddenly paused: “Wait.”

Collin asked: “What’s wrong?”

“Cooking, our food, the food that the proprietress gave us, Dashan, I
definitely can’t do this job. Lord, he asked us to leave the city. Let’s
eat a full meal before we leave. My food……” Until this moment, Dalia
did not think of the vegetables in her vest bag.

She suddenly turned her head and looked at the vegetables she had
thrown on the ground.



It was in the vest bag and it was liquid food, and it fell to the ground
and it was obviously spilled on the ground.

There is not much left in the vest belt now.

But even so, Dalia was reluctant to throw it away.

Having spent seven years with Kraig, she has almost forgotten the
sadness of the hard life.

Going forward, when she was imprisoned by that nameless
husband’s murderer, she had been hungry for three days and three
nights, and the taste was sweet and sweet to some pig food.

Later, they fled with Collin, and the three of them pressed their hungry
chests on their backs in the mountains. The young sprouts of the
willow trees in the mountains were all picked up and eaten.

What’s more, there are delicious food in the vest bag?

Does anyone else have leftovers? Is it all dirty?

What happened then?

When you go home, it’s hot, it’s so hot, there will be nothing to kill and
sterilize.

Being able to be with Dashan and his mother, to be able to hold the
child in his stomach, and to eat leftovers from the boss’s wife for no
money, this is Dalia’s happiest and happiest life in this life.

She didn’t even care that Kraig was still there, and there were so
many people watching her next to her.

She didn’t care about her decentness at all. To say decentness, she
had already lost her tears when she kneeled in front of Kraig and
cried.

At this moment, Dalia turned his head without hesitation and rushed
to the bag of leftovers she had just dropped. Unfortunately, his tone
was dead: “Brother Dashan, Cai, our food…”

Collin: “……”



After a few seconds: “Xiao Shan, let’s go!”

Dalia looked back at Collin pitifully: “Brother Dashan, I’m hungry, my
child needs to eat. Look, you can eat in this vest bag, and there are
two chicken legs on the ground. Do you have paper in your pocket?
Bring it. Go home and wash…”

Collin: “……”

Everyone present: “…”

Kraig: “…”

Seeing that Collin was not moving, Dalia picked it up on her own. She
picked up the two chicken legs exposed in the bag. There was no
place to put it. Later, she just slammed into the pocket directly, and
then picked up the few vegetables left in the vest bag. , It is a pity to
sigh straight.

Behind her, Elden cried again.

Not only Elden, but also some other subordinates.

Dalia is Kraig’s leading lover, everyone knows.

They all knew how decent and thoughtful she was before.

It’s not a good feeling to let these people really feel like this now.
Many people even slandered Kraig in their hearts: “Master, you are
really blind! Why are you blinded by Elma’s shit! You even drove such
a good wife away.”

“It’s easy for you to drive away. If you want to turn back again, can
you get breasts?”

“Huh!”

The subordinates only sighed secretly, but no one dared to speak.

They all watched Dalia very sadly picking up the leftovers on the
ground, but Dalia didn’t notice it at all.

Knowing that a pair of feet stood in front of her.



She looked up at Kraig, swallowed her throat and said, “I picked up
the vegetables and will leave immediately.”

Kraig bent down and handed Dalia a card.

“Wha…what is this?” Dalia asked.
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