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Chapter 1575

Hearing Ye Tian’s words, Denren was like a kitten stepped on its tail, and immediately
yelled at Ye Tian angrily.

Before he left, he had already told his father to be kind to Mark’s cousin and stop
offending him.

However, Denren didn’t expect that her father didn’t even hear a word.

Now that the military district leader is in front, he wants to ask Mark for something, but
his father is still saying this to insult Mark, isn’t this slap her in the face?

After Denren yelled at her father angrily, she turned her head and looked at Mark
apologetically: “Brother Mark, I’m sorry.”

“My dad is old and a little confused.”

“I hope you don’t have the same knowledge as him. “Denren said apologetically.

But Mark had already seen through the minds of these people.

Faced with Denren’s apology, Mark ignored it, but smiled faintly, “Why waste time by
turning around?” “You came from afar today and suddenly descended to Yeyang Town.
You should still ask me to give it to you. Martial Special Team, be the captain, right?”
“Don’t waste your efforts, I won’t be the captain of a small special team.”

“So, please come back.”

Before Denren could speak, Mark was the first to mention it. This matter.

He shook his head, just like last time, and refused directly.

Markgui is the lord of Noirfork, the captain of a small special team, of course he can’t
see it.

However, upon hearing Mark’s words, Rong An, the commander-in-chief of the military
region, was not only not angry, but also smiled.



Lu Tianhe and Fang Shaohong looked at each other and laughed.

“Haha~” “Mr. Chu, I think you should have misunderstood.”

“You are so majestic and stunned, how can we ask you to be the captain of a small
special team?” “Isn’t this a stubborn talent?” “What our commander-in-chief meant is to
invite you to the Gritsberg Military Region to serve as the chief instructor of the three
services.”

Lu Tianhe smiled and said to Mark.

At this time, Rong An also nodded and smiled: “Yes, Mr. Chu.”

“I heard Tianhe say that you are so majestic at a young age, and a hero is young.”

“I have you in Vietnam, but it is the honor of Vietnam. “Today, on behalf of the Gritsberg
Military Region, I sincerely invite you to come to our military region to serve as the chief
instructor of the armed forces, teach the armed forces, and confer the title of lieutenant
general!”

Rong An’s words are only if the boulder falls into the sea, causing a huge wave.

After hearing this, everyone was shocked again.

“Three… Chief Instructor of the Three Armed Forces?” …. “Lieutenant….Lieutenant
General?” …. Damn!

Am I going to special?

Can you go against the sky?

Everyone here is undoubtedly shaking mad.

Mark is just a young man in his early twenties.

At this age, many people are still in college.

But now, Rong An and the others are asking him to teach the three armies and to be
appointed to worship generals?

Be a young general?

“My God, this Ye family really has a real dragon!” “Young general, Guangzong Yaozu?”
“Old man, your Ye family really will rise because of this this time?” “Haha~”
“Unexpectedly, I, Yeyang Town, would be lucky enough to be able to walk out of a
general?” In the Ye Family’s old house, the crowd suddenly boiled.

It’s like a bomb exploded.



Apart from the tremors and emotions of the people, the neighbors and villagers
expressed their congratulations to Mr. Ye.

Chapter 1576 Don’t mess with me

But Ye Ya, Samantha Ye and others have been lost for a long time, and couldn’t be
happy.

The brothers and sisters Ye Jian and Jiang Yulang were even more frustrated.

With trepidation, they looked at the thin and delicate young man in front of him.

“Ye… Mark?” “General… General?” Ye Jian’s red lips trembled, and he said aloud.
There was a deep sadness and loss in his eyebrows.

A few minutes ago, Ye Jian still roared with pride, thirty years in Hedong and thirty years
in Hexi, vowing that he would surpass Mark.

But now, as they learn more about Mark, they discover more and more that this man is
like a ten thousand renminbi mountain. His achievements and height are almost beyond
the reach of him!

The Lord of Noirfork, the young general…

Perhaps, in his lifetime, it is difficult to reach even half of Mark’s height, right?

“No wonder you are not afraid of everyone?” “No wonder, my family is full of guests and
you are indifferent?” “No wonder you are not afraid of uncles, sisters, and everyone in
the Ye family.”

“It turns out that this is you. Reliance.”

Ye Jian shook his head and smiled, full of depression.

Brother Jiang Yulang was also full of frustration and whispered sadly.

“Mark, you are right.”

“Xia Chong can’t talk about it.”

“Compared with you, we are indeed the frog at the bottom of the well, and indeed the ant
rat generation.”

“You alone can indeed withstand tens of thousands of people!” ~ The cold wind blows
up the wind and sand.



The leaves are fluttering and the vegetation is miserable.

Ye Jian and others were filled with misery and speechless for a long time.

In Nuo Da’s Ye Family Residence, only Ye Tian yelled unwillingly.

“No!” “Impossible?” “He is an abandoned son of the Chu family and a son-in-law. How
can he be worthy of being a general?” “It’s wrong, Commander Rong, you must be
mistaken.”

“You must have my daughter. Confused with him.”

“It’s my daughter, not him, not him!” Ye Tian’s complexion looked mad, and he ran over
and shouted at Rong An and the others.

Denren was his last pride.

In his dream, he was waiting for the day when his daughter became a general.

However, Ye Tian didn’t expect it.

In the end, Mark turned out to be the one who was appointed to worship.

It was the nephew he looked down upon since childhood, Mark!

Such a change naturally made Ye Tian unacceptable.

However, just when Ye Tian seemed to be mad, Chong Rongan and others shouted,
Denren ran over and pulled Ye Tian back.

With red eyes, she yelled at Ye Tian: “Dad, have you made enough trouble?” “Why are
you so stubborn and refuse to recognize my brother Mark’s excellence?” “Yes, I know
You want your son to become a dragon, and you want your daughter to become a
phoenix.”

“But you have to accept the facts.”

“Dad, daughter, please, don’t mess with me!” Denren’s beautiful eyes were red, and her
heart was angry and angry. Roaring at Ye Tian.

She never thought that her father would be so unreasonable.

Until now, have not seen the situation clearly yet?

Still talking nonsense here, insulting Mark.

Isn’t this messing with her?



“No, it’s impossible, I don’t believe it…”

Ye Tian was still unwilling to accept the reality, still shaking his head and saying.

Snap~ Suddenly, with a crisp sound, I saw Dongmei stepped forward for some unknown
time, and furiously instigated Ye Tian’s face.

Ye Tian covered his face and looked at his wife and daughter, but he was stunned and
silent for a long time.
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