
Catch Me If You Love Me Chapter 161
Beep…

A loud car horn suddenly sounded outside the window, which interrupted Liam Lu’s
words in an instant.

He frowned, let go of Zoey Gu and got up and walked to the floor-to-ceiling window. He
saw the car slowly driving into the courtyard from outside, his eyes darkened, and his
entire face suddenly became tight.

Zoey Gu on the bed realized that something was wrong with him, turned to look at him,
and asked softly.

“What’s the matter? Who is here?”

Liam Lu’s thin lips lightly opened, “Old lady.”

Zoey Gu’s face changed, she suddenly opened the quilt and jumped out of the bed in a
panic, bent over to pick up the clothes scattered on the floor and put it on her body, not
forgetting to ask Liam Lu nervously.

“What to do? If the old lady finds me here, will she directly kill me?”

Liam Lu let out a “sneer” laugh, seeing that she was jumping on the floor and putting on
shoes like a person who had been arrested for stealing, and couldn’t help teasing her.

“Who said that I must stay by my side? I’m afraid it will happen if I only say that the old
lady is here?”

Zoey Gu was startled.

Liam Lu had already walked over, reached out and pressed her into his arms, and said
solemnly.

“With me, don’t worry. Even if it’s just to make you my Mrs. Lu, I will never let you have
trouble.”

Zoey Gu closed her eyes, leaning on the man’s arms obediently without breaking free,
but suddenly raised her head to look at him and said suddenly.

“You misunderstood. I mean, I don’t want you to be controlled by her anymore.”

Not long after, Mrs. Lu’s car slowly drove into the courtyard.

When the car door opened, the first to stand was a faucet crutch glowing with cold light.



Immediately, a silver-haired, majestic old lady came out of the car and walked slowly
into the living room.

Along the way, the servants who were busy in the courtyard saw her, and all stopped
working, bent over and greeted her respectfully.

“Good old lady.”

“Good old lady.”

“Good old lady!”

The Lu family’s business empire has been passed down for several generations, and
the old lady Lu has participated. Her life has been turbulent, and she has mastered the
final decision-making power of Lu Family International with one hand.

The old lady entered the living room, her eyes fell on the broken crystal chandelier first,
her eyebrows wrinkled immediately.

In the next second, she heard the door shutting upstairs.

As soon as she looked up, she saw a girl walking out of Liam Lu’s room holding a tray.

The other party kept her head down and walked carefully downstairs.

Seeing the old lady, buried her head lower, she shouted respectfully.

“Good old lady.”

The old lady frowned.

“This is the person who takes care of Liam in place of Xiaolan? Lift your head.”

Zoey Gu held the tray tightly, hesitated for a moment while pursing her lips, then raised
her head obediently.

With her eyes facing each other, she could clearly feel a cold flash in the old lady’s eyes.

Zoey Gu became nervous suddenly, for fear that the old lady would suddenly see
something.

But seeing the old lady squinting her eyes and staring at her freckles for a long while,
she immediately raised her hand and turned her head away in a flash.

Zoey Gu subconsciously breathed a sigh of relief, and instantly turned around holding
the tray as if she was about to amnesty!

After a few steps, the old lady’s voice came from behind him coldly.



“stop.”
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