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Chapter 2457

Mark still shook his head, while tasting the special tea, he smiled and replied, “What are
you talking about?”

“I, Mark, came from a mediocre background, and my mother is just a farmer.”

“Since I was young, I also grew up in the country.”

“By chance, I just entered the martial arts.”

“It’s only my luck to have today’s results.”

Mark didn’t conceal it, but he confessed his origin frankly.

There is no need to hide it, and it’s not a shameful thing.

Mark has never been taboo about his ordinary background, let alone feel ashamed.

They wanted to know, Mark said frankly.

“Ok?”

“The farmer’s child?” Lu Hua frowned.

“A countryman?” Lu Yanxi was also taken aback.

“Mark, are you kidding us?”

“If you don’t have anything to do with your background, how could the Martial God
Temple let us take you out to meet the world?” Lu Yanxi was a little skeptical.

Mark spread his hands and slowly said, “Why should I be joking with you?”

“As for why you said I would join this operation, it is probably because of the power in my
hands.”

“Only I am here to help you win the soul fruit.”



“And only I can protect you from returning safely.”

“Otherwise, just with the power of a few of you, this trip will definitely be more fortunate.”

Mark’s words were plain, but the arrogance in his tone was very clear.

When Lv Hua and others heard this, their faces were suddenly covered with black lines.

“just you?”

“Still power?”

“Also shelter us?”

“You are a bastard, starting from your mother’s womb, how much power can you
master?”

“The person is not big, but the bragging ability is not small!”

“by!”

“God of War, why would they choose you to join the team?”

Lu Hua rolled his eyes at Mark, and then didn’t bother to care about him, turned his head
and sat in front of the cabin.

After learning that Mark had no background and was just a soil bun from the countryside,
Lu Hua naturally had no interest in him anymore.

He was so warm and polite to Mark just now, just because he was afraid of the
background behind Mark.

But now it seems that they are thinking too much!

This guy is just a narcissistic idiot from a poor background.

Lu Yanxi also glanced at Mark with displeased eyes. It was obvious that the arrogant
words that Mark just said made Lu Yanxi very disgusted.

If Kong Lao said these words, Lu Hua and the others would naturally not think that there
is anything inappropriate.

But a nasty bastard, who is utterly talking here, is it strange that they are not annoyed?

“I advise you to come to America for a while and curb your arrogant temperament.”

“Otherwise, if you provoke someone, don’t blame us for not being saved!”



Lu Yanxi solemnly warned Mark, and then left here, walked to the front row and sat
down next to Lu Hua.

Kong Ming didn’t speak, but shook his head in disappointment, then continued to close
his eyes and meditate, sitting quietly.

In this way, Lu Hua and the others, who were talking and laughing with Mark just now,
were not even willing to talk to Mark, so they just left him here and ignored him.

In this regard, Mark just gave a bitter smile helplessly.

Sure enough, neither the secular world nor the martial arts world has changed the
nature of people who dislike the poor and love the rich.

After that, Mark didn’t say anything.

Lu Hua and the others were unwilling to talk to themselves, and Mark naturally couldn’t
put his hot face on his cold ass.

…..

Chapter 2458

“Damn, I thought that after Mark was the God of War, after doing this for a long time, he
was just a turtle from the countryside.”

“Is there really no one in my hot summer martial arts, and let a turtle come to participate
in such an important action?”

“I hope it’s not an oil bottle, right?”

…..

“I think it shouldn’t be possible.”

“Although this guy came from a humble background, I think he still has some strength.”

“Otherwise, the instructors of the military district will not lose to him.” Although Lu Yanxi
didn’t have a good impression of Mark, the words Lu Tianhe told her before leaving, Lu
Yanxi undoubtedly Still remember it.

“Han Ping and Zhu Rong, right?”

“These people are all people who seek fame and honour.”

“I’m a little fancy, I don’t have any real skills at all.”



“Let’s say Han Ping, he is fifth on the grandmaster list, the nephew of Han Xianren.”

“As long as he has a bit of martial arts talent, Han Xianren will never pass on his unique
wealth to people of a foreign surname, and accept others as his own disciples?”

“These people, I defeat them, I can only defeat a dog.”

“What can’t be proved by defeating them?”

“What’s more, your father said that Han Ping was defeated by Mark, and you didn’t say
that this stinky boy won by any means.”

“What if he used treacherous means to secretly attack it?”

“In short, he is just a little boy in his early twenties, and he is destined to not have any
great skills.”

“It was a wrong choice to let him go to America with us in the Temple of War God!”

Lu Hua said in a deep voice, his voice was not small, as if he was not afraid of Mark’s
hearing.

Lu Yanxi also nodded in agreement: “Well, letting a young man go with the team is really
wrong.”

“However, this is the end of the matter, and we can’t help it.”

“Forget it, don’t think about it.”

“Lu Hua, eat something.”

“This is the fruit my mother brought me, try it.”

While talking, Lu Yanxi took the fruit from the backpack beside him and handed it to Lu
Hua.

“Old Kong, you can eat some too.”

After that, Lu Yanxi gave Kong Ming some past.

But Mark was automatically ignored by Lu Yanxi.

“Well, it’s delicious.”

“It’s nice to have a mother. Unlike me, my mother died early…”

Here, Lu Hua and others were chatting and laughing.



But Mark sat alone, sipping tea there, quietly looking at the sky outside the dazzling
window. But it didn’t mean to take the initiative to approach Lu Hua and others.

“This bastard is quite arrogant.”

Seeing Mark doing this, Lu Hua shook his head and sneered.

While talking, he picked up the teapot and was about to fill it up, and suddenly found that
there was no water in the teapot. ,

“I’ll do it.”

Lu Yanxi got up and was about to go to the front of the tea and water, but was stopped
by Lu Hua.

“Yan Xi, just sit down.”

“Let the bastard do this kind of errands.”

“Always let him start working.”

Lu Hua chuckled, then turned around and looked at Mark: “Hey, kid, come over and get
us a pot of water.”

Lu Hua shouted, but no one responded.

“Ok?”

“I’m talking to you, didn’t you hear me?”

“Hurry up and get me water!”

Lu Hua was already a little unhappy.

But Mark still turned a deaf ear, sitting there calmly, ignoring Lu Hua.

“Ciao!”

“A country turtle, dare to put on airs at me?”

“You really want to die, don’t you?”
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