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Then, he slapped Ke Zhesheng back with brute force.

“Old Yan, what are you doing?” Ke Zhe asked immediately after he stabilized his figure.

“Calm down.”

“Don’t forget, this woman is a member of the Truth.”

“We caught her. It’s okay to say that there is still room for change.”

“But if you kill her, the consequences will be uncontrollable.” “

The overall situation is important!” After

all, the unfairness is the first place on the Grand Master’s list, and it is much more
rigorous to consider things.

At least, the forces behind Meng Wanyu are not something they can ignore.

“Huh~”

“Smelly girl, this time the old lady will spare you a death.”

“However, capital offenses are forgiven, and living offenses are inevitable.”

“You trespassed into the hot summer without permission and caused many incidents in
Noirfork.”

“Today, I’ll catch you later, and I will ask about your sins on Yanshan Mountain!”

Ke Zhe obviously still hates the incident of Meng Wanyu hurting him just now, and at this
time he speaks with anger and resentment.

After speaking, Ke Zhe was like a dog, grabbed Meng Wanyu with one hand, turned and
left.

Of course, they also took Mark’s wife, Helen Qiu.



“Stop!”

“You can’t catch him~”

….

“He is a woman, how can you~”

….

Seeing Helen Qiu’s suffering, Ericson Li and others were somewhat bloody.

Although he was terrified, he still blocked it.

“If you don’t want to die, get out!”

Ke Zhe yelled angrily, waved his sleeves, and directly retreated Ericson Li and others.

Then, a group of five people grabbed Helen Qiu and left.

“Tongshan, Qingtan, stop them~”

Xu Lei couldn’t turn a blind eye to this situation.

After giving the order, the several powerhouses he brought from Yanjing immediately
took action.

Not only them, Mark left behind the Qinglong people in Wrilfill, and they also took action.

For a time, more than a dozen warriors rushed forward.

“Huh, it’s just a chicken and dog~”

Ke Zhe sneered, and then smashed it directly with random moves.

There was no need for anyone else to take action. Just Ke Zhe blocked everyone’s
attack.

In a scream, Tongshan and others vomited blood and flew out.

The gap is too big!

The master is like a dragon.

Once stepping into the realm of the master, that strength will be qualitatively improved.



Unless people with amazing talents like Meng Wanyu, who practice martial arts skills
are all the best, it is possible to fight at a higher level.

Otherwise, the martial artist under the master is ten people together, and it is difficult to
compete with the master.

“A group of mobs, dare to stop us?”

Ke Zhe was condescending, looking at the defeated men in front of him, and said
proudly.

After speaking, Ke Zhe looked at the unequal people on the side: “Old Yan, I think this
Noirfork Buddhism world should take a good look.”

“The warrior here seems to have only Mark in his eyes, but nothing. . Wu Temple “

.” only at home, without the country ” ,”

Under such circumstances, the authority of the Temple Wu majesty what I summer
Budokan, how in “??

Introduction injustice nodded:”. indeed etc. Yanshan back after this, I made Juggernaut
and others put forward suggestions to reorganize Noirfork Budao.”

After speaking, the unfair party also took Helen Qiu and Meng Wanyu back to the land of
Yanjing.

Behind them, Xu Xin and others were extremely anxious, but they were helpless.

In the face of absolute power, no matter how large their numbers are, it will be futile after
all.

I can only watch the injustices to them and take them away.

“Hey~”

“Who is it

to blame ?” “To blame, I can only blame Mark.”

“I did evil outside, but his wife was responsible for the consequences.”

“This kind of person is really disgusting~”

Trivan Lake When many people felt sorry for Helen Qiu and the others, they did not
forget to attack Mark.

However, just when everyone thought that this farce would end with this.



Who could have imagined that in the depths of the night, a cold storm suddenly started.

Then, a thin figure, like a ghost, stepped forward from the long night.

Every time his footsteps fall, he strikes the world like thunder.

The entire Wrilfill City trembled.

In nine days, black clouds rolled wildly.

The rain falls violently by the cloud lake.

In this iron rain curtain, a young figure walked alone.

Like a demon from the abyss, come to the world and reap life.

The world suddenly became quiet.

Everyone just feels shrouded in a kind of ignorant fear.

Chapter 3215

Woo~ The

cold wind was stern, engulfing the sky and rain, sweeping the whole world.

In the depths of the dark night, as the figure approached, an invisible majesty
descended here like an ocean storm.

When Ke Zhe talked about unequal people, he was stunned.

An unparalleled dignity suddenly appeared on their foreheads.

“Yan…Yan old, then…who is that?”

An old man asked in a low voice with fear.

The words were not peaceful, but the old eyes stared at the figure in front of him.

For some reason, when I saw this person, I just felt that a big mountain was
overwhelming.

Even breathing, feels heavy and depressed.

This is true even for people who say that they are unequal, let alone those worldly
people like Ericson Li and Lei Lao San.



That huge sense of oppression almost suffocated them.

“It’s a powerful coercion.”

“This feeling, could it be…”

Thinking of this, Ericson Li among the crowd suddenly raised his head, his old eyes
suddenly tightened, and the whole person almost jumped up because of his excitement.

“Second, you mean…”

Seeing Ericson Li’s appearance, Lei Lao San and Wang Jiexi also realized something
instantly.

The whole person was also horrified, and his old eyes suddenly widened.

Not only them, at this moment, Xu Lei and the others also seemed to have a feeling,
looking into the beautiful eyes ahead, surprise and expectation suddenly appeared.

It was He Yurou who had been standing silently by the river and watching. Her calm
heart suddenly caused waves.

She stood on tiptoe and looked at from a distance with her eyes wide open, trying her
best to see the person’s face clearly through the darkness.

“Will it be him?”

“It should be him.”

“It must be~”

He Yurou didn’t know why she expected him so much, let alone why she was so excited.

Obviously, she and the boy are not even friends, and they have almost nothing to do.

However, at this moment, He Yurou still hopes that the boy will come as scheduled!

For a time, many people became nervous by the side of Trivan Lake and held their
breath in excitement.

Obviously no one can see the face of that figure, but in many people’s minds, the
handsome face of a young man has emerged involuntarily.

“In broad daylight, the sky is bright, who is making the mystery there.”

“I don’t want to quickly report the name!”



When everyone was waiting, Ke Zhe frowned, facing the figure in the depths of the
night. , Asked angrily.

One second~

two seconds~

a full ten seconds passed, and no one responded.

Yes, it’s just the sound of rain that filled the sky, and the footsteps that trembled.

It wasn’t until Ke Zhe could wait to be ready to ask again, a faint voice quietly sounded in
this rainy night.

“Noirfork, Mark.”

Boom ~

Few words, but the words are extremely powerful.

Especially when the word Mark fell, it exploded like thunder here.

The whole body trembled at the injustice, and Ke Zhe’s eyes widened.

As for Helen Qiu, who was captured by Ke Zhe, her delicate body trembled, and her
beautiful eyes turned red.

“Haha~”

“Mr. Chu!”

“It’s Mr. Chu.”

“Mr. Chu is here.”

“We, the emperor of Noirfork, are back~”

“Quickly~”

“Wrilfill belongs, let me worship Mr. Chu!”

Someone Some people worry about joy.

When he said that the face of inequality was like death, Ericson Li went crazy, shouting,
and rushing over desperately, facing the dark shadow in the night, bowing down.

“Wrilfill Ericson Li, welcome Mr. Chu~”



Like a boulder falling into the sea, a thousand layers of waves are set off.

With Ericson Li taking the lead, Lei Laosan, Wang Jiexi and others were naturally
unwilling to lag behind, and came forward to worship each other one after another.

“Jingzhou Lei San~”

…

“Jianxi Wang Jiexi~”

” Gong Ying Mr. Chu!”

…

the voices of the sky converged into a stream, impacting the world.
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