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“I remember that this set of swordsmanship was only you who practiced it for 
more than half a year before you mastered it to this level.” 

“As for my daughter-in-law, she started from scratch and had no martial arts 
foundation before that. In this case, it only took half a year longer than you.” 

“My daughter-in-law here is a good material for natural cultivation!” 

The man said that proudly. From a long distance, he kept looking at the 
woman dancing with a sword in the dense forest in front of him. The more he 
watched, the happier he became. 

This time, the graceful woman did not pour cold water on her anymore. 

On that icy pretty face, there was a rare hint of approval. 

“Um.” 

“This girl’s understanding is indeed extremely rare.” 

“With such qualifications, if he started twenty years earlier, his current 
achievements may not necessarily be lower than your bastard son.” 

“It can only be said that he was delayed by your bastard son.” 

The woman said coldly. 

At the end, there was a bit of resentment in his tone. 

“As the old saying goes, like father, like son.” 

“Being a father is not a good thing, and the son he gave birth to is really a 
bastard.” 

The woman said coldly. 



The smile on the face of the middle-aged man next to him disappeared 
instantly, and his body trembled unconsciously. 

That feeling is like being stared at by a tigress, and the gravel will be 
swallowed up. 

“Well, over there in Qingdi City, I still have something to do, so I’ll leave first.” 

“My daughter-in-law is entrusted to you to take care of.” 

After the man finished speaking, he ran away quickly. 

It seems that I am afraid that I will be eaten. 

Naturally, Helen Qiu didn’t know about the conversation here. 

She still forgot to sleep and eat, practicing sword hard day after day. 

But suddenly 

When Helen Qiu practiced the sword, for some reason, she suddenly felt a 
sharp pain in her chest. 

At that moment, it was as if my heart was empty in an instant. 

There was a huge hole in her heart. 

Sadness and loneliness are overwhelming. 

That kind of feeling, as if, there is a very important person in life, at this time, 
lost. 

That tingling feeling lasted for a long time. 

The feeling of heartache made Helen Qiu almost unable to breathe. 

At the end, Helen Qiu’s delicate body trembled. 

With a mouthful of bright red, she vomited all over the floor. 

She lay limp on the ground, tears streaming down her face uncontrollably. 



She raised her head, looked into the distance, and murmured in a low voice, 
“Ye Yefan, is that you?” 

————— 

————— 

Although the matter of the nuclear bombing was deliberately covered up. 

However, the news of Mark’s killing was deliberately publicized by the Temple 
of Valkyrie. 

Mark’s death was not only spread throughout the martial arts world, but even 
in the secular world, almost everyone knew about it. 

Chapter 4513 

On the news and newspapers, with the headline “Skynet is restored, it is 
sparse but not missing”, it reported Mark’s sinful life, and the story of Mark 
being bombarded and killed on the border by the righteous army at the end. 

Chen Jiuzhou, Mu Zihua and others became heroes who acted on behalf of 
the heavens. 

Mark, on the other hand, was completely nailed to the pillar of shame in 
human history. 

For most people, they don’t care or know who Mark is. They didn’t care about 
who Brian Chu was, and they didn’t even know. 

Most people have never seen Mark in their life. 

However, it doesn’t matter. 

It is enough to know that he is a bad guy. 

As for whether it is true or false, few people will explore it. 

History is written by the victors. 

Evaluating a person in history is a scum and a sin, and future generations will 
naturally think so when they see it. 



Yes, to most people, Mark is a stranger, a person who has never been in 
contact with. 

However, in the hearts of others, Mark is a real person. 

After returning from the border that day, Xu Lei vomited blood and soon fell 
into a coma and was admitted to the hospital. 

In a coma, tears continued. 

Even when he was half asleep and half awake, he was still calling, brother 
Mark’s name. 

When Ericson Li saw this disappeared, he was still in the hospital for 
treatment. Jin Bao and Yin Bao ran to the hospital, knelt in front of Ericson Li’s 
hospital bed, and cried and told Ericson Li, “Second Master, Mr. Chu Chu, he 
is gone.” 

Ericson Liyi listened at first, but didn’t believe it at all. 

After all, it’s not once or twice. 

For so many years, following Mark. 

I don’t know how many times I have died. 

Every time it is said that Mr. Chu is dead, but which time is he not living well. 

Therefore, Ericson Li directly scolded these two things. 

“Get out!” 

“Stop talking nonsense here, you will die if you say something auspicious!” 

Ericson Li let them go. 

But Jinbao and Yinbao knelt down and couldn’t afford it, “Second Master, this 
time it’s true.” 

“They said that the four giants of the God List joined forces to kill them. In the 
end, the Yanxia military dropped a nuclear bomb on the border. There was no 
grass left in the area, and Mr. Chu was directly blown to ashes.” 



Jinbao and Yinbao were crying. 

Ericson Li was stunned. 

“What are you talking about?” 

“The Big Four of the God List” 

“Nuclear bomb?” 

Ericson Li’s old face was pale, and his cloudy old eyes gradually lost their 
luster, as if he had aged ten years in an instant. 

Same day. 

Chen Ao and his daughter Cynthia drove to the southwest border like crazy. 

“No, no” 

“I do not believe” 

“I don’t believe that the country will use nuclear bombs against Brother Mark” 

Cynthia kept crying along the way, she couldn’t accept this matter. 

The day before, she and Mark hugged each other to say goodbye. 

But now, Yin and Yang are separated. 
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When Cynthia’s family was rushing to the frontier, Lu Tianhe, commander-in-
chief of the Noirfork Military Region, also got the news of Mark’s death. 

For a moment, he also trembled. 

“how so?” 

“Back then when he fought against Trumen, how heroic was General Chu?” 



“Use one person’s power to turn the tide and save the country from life to 
death!” 

“How long has it been? How did it end like this?” 

“During this time, what happened?” 

Lu Tianhe was full of grief, his old face was full of unspeakable shock and 
disbelief. 

During this period of time, Lu Tianhe has been in charge of military affairs and 
training special forces. 

Therefore, he has no time to get in touch with and understand the affairs of 
the martial arts world. 

Unexpectedly, after such a long time, the first news about the world of martial 
arts was the news of Mark’s death! 

“General Lu, it’s not good.” 

“Captain Ye and the others left their posts without authorization and led the 
Qinglong team. Where did they go?” 

At this time, all the subordinates suddenly came to report. 

When Lu Tianhe heard this, his face immediately changed. 

“not good!” 

“Stop them!” 

Lu Tianhe turned pale with shock, and then personally led people to chase 
after him. 

Soon, Lu Tianhe stopped Denren Ye and others on the wasteland. 

“General Lu, please don’t stop us?” 

“Instructor Chu died unjustly, we are going to avenge Instructor Chu!” 

Denren Ye, Gao Dazhuang and the others had red eyes and shouted angrily. 



The Qinglong team has now become the strongest team in the entire army. 

Back then, this team was brought together by Mark. 

Later, he followed Mark all the time. 

But ever since Mark decided to disband the Dragon Temple, Mark asked 
Denren Ye to lead the Azure Dragon Team to join the Noirfork Military Region. 

After all, Lu Tianhe and Mark are old acquaintances, and the Qinglong team 
can be regarded as coming from Noirfork. 

Mark felt relieved that the Qinglong team was handed over to Lu Tianhe. 

Now, after learning that Mark lost his life and was listed as a scum of the 
country, he said that he deserved to die. 

Denren Ye and the others naturally would not agree. 

After all, it was Mark who led them to the light when they were at their darkest. 

To them, Mark not only gave them the grace of teaching, but also the grace of 
support, and the grace of rebuilding for them. 

He is their teacher and their idol. 

Now, Denren Ye and the others are naturally filled with righteous indignation 
when they see their idol fall and be insulted as sinners through the ages and 
scum of the country after death! ! 

Chapter 4515 

“It’s just nonsense!!” 

“Even your instructor Chu died at their hands, so what if you go?” 

“Isn’t he taking his life for nothing?!” 

Lu Tianhe was furious. 

“I do not care!” 

“We must not see our instructor Chu die in vain like this!” 



“We must give Instructor Chu justice!” 

Denren Ye and the others blushed, almost crying. 

“enough!” 

“Justice?” 

“You have been with your instructor Chu for so long, don’t you know that there 
is no justice in this world?” 

“The strong prey on the weak, this has been the case since ancient times!!” 

“If you go, it won’t change anything, it’s just a few more dead souls!” 

“If you still want to die, then don’t bother, I, Lu Tianhe, can send you on your 
way right now!” 

Lu Tianhe roared with anger, and his powerful words shook the world. 

Facing Lu Tianhe’s reprimand, Denren Ye and the others finally lowered their 
heads. 

However, tears flowed out without disappointment. 

“General Lu, I and we are just not worth it for Instructor Chu.” 

“He obviously worked so hard to protect the country.” 

“But why?” 

“Why it came out like this?” 

“Why are good people not rewarded.” 

“Why do people who really work hard end up dying in the end?” 

Unwilling, angry, wronged. 

All kinds of emotions filled everyone in the Qinglong team. 

Others may not understand Mark, but they do. 



Their instructor Chu may be arrogant or domineering, but he has never done 
anything heinous. 

All his life, he just wanted to protect his wife, his relatives, and his friends. 

Even if the Martial God Temple treated him like that, their Chu instructors still 
repayed their grievances with virtue, and saved the Juggernaut from Truman, 
the King of Fighters, and the country’s martial arts. 

He has obviously been protecting the country and the people in his own way. 

In the end, it ended like this. 

In this way, Denren Ye and the others wouldn’t feel wronged for Mark. 

Lu Tianhe didn’t reprimand them any more, went forward, took Denren Ye into 
his arms, and comforted them. 

“Silly girl, I know, I know what you’re talking about” 
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“But please believe me, this world will not remain so dark forever.” 

“One day, someone like you instructor Chu will appear again. Like a 
thunderbolt, it will explode in this hot summer land, and it will also sweep 
away the dark clouds and darkness covering our heads, and set things right.” 

Lu Tianhe comforted them and finally brought them back to the military area. 

After returning to the military area, Lu Tianhe ordered that all the officers and 
men of the army wear white collars on their sleeves, and mourn for Major 
General Qinglong for three days. 

“General, no!” 



“Major General Qinglong is now listed as a national sinner. At this time, we 
hold a mourning ceremony. Once it gets out, it will inevitably lead to disaster.” 
The subordinates tried to persuade them. 

“Brian Chu is a major general who came out of our Noirfork Military Region. 
He made great contributions to protecting the country in the battle of Chumen. 
It is only natural for the soldiers of our military region to mourn spontaneously. 
Who dares to criticize?” 

“According to my order, the whole army will issue!” 

“If there are real consequences, I, Lu Tianhe, will bear it alone!” 

Lu Tianhe’s domineering side leaked, and he tried his best to reject all 
opinions. 

In the next few days, tens of thousands of generals in the Noirfork Military 
Region set up mausoleums to mourn, and the sound of mourning shook the 
heavens and the earth. 

Here, most people may not have seen Mark at all. 

However, the legend of Major General Qinglong has always existed. 

They don’t care what Mark has done outside, and they don’t care what the 
world thinks of him, they only know that Major General Qinglong is a great 
hero from their Noirfork Military Region! 

Of course, it is not just the Noirfork Military Region that holds the mourning 
activities. 

People in the major cities in Noirfork, as well as the Jiangbei area and the two 
major provinces and cities in Yanxia spontaneously mourned. 

They scatter flowers into the Yangtze River and Yellow River during the day, 
and light candles at night to mourn the sky. 

In the land of Noirfork, countless citizens cried bitterly. 

The soul returns to the nine heavens and mourns the moon at night, and the 
fragrance flows for a hundred generations to recall the spring breeze. 

The streets and alleys are filled with the wailing of “Mr. Chu through the ages”. 



As the momentum of the mourning activities became more and more 
powerful, it finally spread to the land of Yanshan. 

As the master of the Martial God Hall, Chen Jiuzhou was furious, and asked 
the little boxing king Mo Wuya and his confidant Zhao Zhenlu to lead the 
strong to Noirfork to quell the chaos. 

“Those who are stubborn, kill without mercy!” 

“From now on, I will let Jiang Dong, no one will dare to mention Brian Chu 
again!” 

With Chen Jiuzhou’s order, Zhao Zhenlu led the Wushen Temple law 
enforcement team into Noirfork. 

In just a few days, nearly a thousand people were arrested. 

But fortunately, Mo Wuya got in the way and did not cause too many 
casualties in Noirfork. 

For Mo Wuya, Mark is his lifelong enemy. 

When he was alive, Mo Wuya wished he could hit Mark eight times a day. 

However, when Mark died, Mo Wuya couldn’t help feeling a little sad. 

What’s more, he and Mark didn’t have any deep hatred. Now that the 
generation of heroes has fallen like this, Mo Wuya is a little sad. 

In addition to these, the impact of Mark’s fall is still continuing to ferment. 

Even the supreme god of the Japanese kingdom, Shen Yuedu, directly killed 
Yanshan, threatening to destroy the Martial God Palace. 

But was blocked by Mu Zihua, the queen of the wind. 

The strongest fighters in martial arts from the two countries fought on the 
shore of the East China Sea. 

In the end, the Moon God was defeated, and was thrown into the deep sea of 
Jiuyou by the palm of Mu Zihua, the queen of the wind, and his life and death 
were unknown. 



Chapter 4517 

The setting sun is setting, and the setting sun is like blood. 

The afterglow of the setting sun dyes the coast of the East China Sea red in 
the hot summer. 

On the coastline, Chen Jiuzhou leader Yan Xia was waiting anxiously on the 
coast. 

“Master Chen, tell me, can Queen Feng win?” 

“It is said that the moon god of the Japanese kingdom is the reincarnation of a 
strong man in the divine realm.” 

“The background is profound and the strength is extremely powerful.” 

“I don’t know if Feng Hou is the opponent of the Sun Moon God.” 

At this moment, the subordinates are still anxiously waiting for the final result. 

Chen Jiuzhou looked equally dignified. 

Although he has great confidence in his teacher. 

However, Tsukiyomi is the supreme god of Japan after all, and a famous 
strong man in history. 

Although the reincarnated body, the physical body cannot be compared with 
the main body, which restricts the strength of the Moon God to a certain 
extent. 

However, don’t forget that she is a person with a thousand years of history. 

Her combat experience, as well as some skills, are unmatched by anyone in 
today’s world. 

Therefore, Chen Jiuzhou was also worried that his teacher would suffer a loss 
in combat experience. 

Just like that, while Chen Jiuzhou and the others waited anxiously, at the last 
moment of dusk, they saw the beautiful figure walking slowly towards the sea. 



The fiery hope stretched that figure for a long, long time above the sea. 

“This is?” 

The moment they saw this person, Chen Jiuzhou and other strong men in the 
Martial God Hall all held their breath. 

Because, they don’t know who is walking back at this time. 

Is it Luna? 

Or, after the wind? 

“It’s the queen of the wind!!” 

“Hahaha” 

“Master Chen, it’s Queen Feng.” 

“The one who came back is the Queen of the Wind” 

On the coastline, everyone suddenly erupted with joy. 

The stone in my heart immediately fell to the ground. 

A smile appeared on Chen Jiuzhou’s serious face at this moment, as if 
relieved. 

It seemed that the person who had the last laugh was his teacher. 

“Teacher, congratulations.” 

“Brian Chu is dead, and Japan’s Yueyue has been defeated. In this Asia-
Pacific region, there is no one who can match you.” 

“My Yanxia Martial Arts, I will be the absolute overlord of the Asia-Pacific 
region in the future!” 

Chen Jiuzhou held a bouquet of flowers and dedicated it to Fenghou. 
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After the wind, Mu Zihua’s face was pale, and her indifferent eyes glanced at 
Chen Jiuzhou and others in front of her. 

She did not accept the congratulations and flowers from Chen Jiuzhou and 
others, and said coldly, “If you have this time, it’s better to focus on the 
business. I have cleared the last obstacle, and there should be no one to 
disturb the Longmen experience plan in the future.” 

When Chen Jiuzhou heard the words, he immediately agreed, “What the 
teacher instructed is that in the future, the disciple will definitely use 12% 
energy to accelerate the advancement of the Longmen plan, and ensure that 
the task of cultivating the strong will be completed as scheduled.” 

Feng Hou then nodded, “Well. For the next period of time, I will temporarily 
retreat. If there is nothing important, don’t bother me.” 

After Fenghou finished speaking, she immediately walked away and returned 
to the land of Yanshan. 

It was already late at night when I returned to Yanshan residence after the 
wind. 

The door of the room is closed tightly, and the bright moonlight outside is like 
water. 

As soon as Feng Hou entered the door, he drank a glass of water. 

However, before the glass of water was drunk, Fenghou’s tender body 
trembled, and a mouthful of blood was spit out immediately. 

“Are you hurt?” 

Suddenly, a deep voice came from the depths of the room. 

Feng Hou raised his head suddenly, and saw a figure in the corner, like a 
ghost, standing in the darkness. 

The watery moonlight outside came in and fell on his body, casting shadows 
all over the ground. 



Feng Hou was taken aback at first, but only after seeing the figure of the other 
party did he respectfully say, “Master, you are here.” 

“Yeah.” The red-robed figure turned his head, walked over, seemed to comfort 
him, and stroked the back of his head, “This time, it’s hard for you.” 

Feng Hou shook his head, “What did the master say? It’s Zihua’s lack of 
ability, which made the master worry. If it wasn’t for the critical moment, the 
master came to help, this time, Zihua should not be able to complete the 
master’s task.” 

Feng Hou knelt on the ground, saying respectfully in gratitude. 

Yes. Before the First World War in the East China Sea. 

The reason why Feng Hou won was entire that the master joined the battle at 
a critical moment, which reversed the situation and finally defeated the Moon 
God. 

But even so, Mu Zihua still suffered serious injuries after the wind. 

“Don’t blame yourself.” 

“Niguni Tsukiyomi’s strength has exceeded my expectations.” 

“It stands to reason that she was reborn with a new body, and her spiritual 
strength is certainly strong, but her physical body ultimately restrained his 
strength.” 

“I guessed before that her strength should be similar to that of Mark. But to my 
surprise, this time in the East China Sea battle, Yue Du’s physical strength 
has obviously improved a lot compared to last time.” 

“So much so that her strength is already above yours.” 

The man in the red robe said in a deep voice. 

“Okay, you should rest and recuperate first.” 

“Now that we have removed the two thorns in our eyes, we can rest easy on 
our Longmen project in the future.” 



When he said this, a fiery look appeared in the eyes of the man in the red 
robe. 

It was like, looking forward to the complete completion of the Longmen 
Project. 

“Yes, master.” 

Feng Hou respectfully replied. 

Afterwards, the man in red flashed away. 

Here the world returns to silence. 

Chapter 4519 

Just like that, following the failure of Mark and Luna, for a long period of time, 
this martial arts world fell into a long-lost harmony. 

The four giants on the list of gods have completely become the martial arts 
leaders of all mankind. 

No one will challenge their authority or threaten their position. Even dare not 
say harsh words. 

All over the world, there is worship and admiration for the four giants of the 
god list. 

Even the martial arts forces in various countries obeyed the orders of the four 
giants of the God List. 

It can be said that Asura, the giant Ymir and others have completely become 
the co-lords of the global martial arts world. 

After all, in the eyes of the world, the four of them have saved the world three 
times. 

The first time, they worked together to kill Chu Qitian. 

The second time, they worked together to kill the human scum, Brian Chu. 

The third time, the four of them single-handedly promoted the Longmen 
Project to benefit the world. 



In the eyes of the world, the Longmen project is a matter of merit in the 
present and benefit in the future. 

Because of the Longmen, those with poor aptitude may also have the 
possibility of hitting the Grandmaster. 

Also because of the Longmen, those elders who have been trapped in the 
bottleneck for decades can also break through the shackles and achieve titles. 

It can be said that the Big Four on the God List have completely changed the 
entire world. 

It is them, let everyone in this world become a dragon! 

It is precisely because of this that the Longmen project is becoming more and 
more popular. 

Martial arts from all over the world wanted to go crazy, and they wanted to 
rush into the dragon gate and get the chance of a carp jumping over the 
dragon gate. 

That’s it, the second batch, the third batch 

As more and more people accepted the Longmen Project, the world’s martial 
arts experts also began to explode like a blowout. 

The entire martial arts world presents a scene of prosperity rarely seen in 
thousands of years. 

Like a raging fire, like oil, like a flower blooming brocade. 

Everyone felt that the prosperous age of warriors had arrived. 

Only in the land of Noirfork, an old woman in the old house of the Chu family, 
lamented endlessly. 

“Grandma, why are you sighing?” 

In the courtyard, a little guy raised his head, his clear eyes were full of novelty. 

In the face of disasters, why do people rush forward like moths to a flame. 

Isn’t it just for these little guys? 



They are the future, they are the tomorrow of mankind. 

“Hey Xiaolin, grandma just thinks that this world is too dark. I can’t see any 
light.” 

“No, isn’t the sun here?” The little guy pointed to the sun above his head, 
becoming even more puzzled. 

The old man shook his head. 

“It’s gone, it’s gone. The stupid people of the world, they mistook the darkness 
for the light. They sunk their sun into the abyss with their own hands.” 

“Xiao Lin, you remember, your father is great.” 

“He’s right up to everyone in the world.” 

“It’s this world, sorry for him.” 
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Facing Grandma Grandma’s words, Chu Lin nodded half-understanding. 

Perhaps, he didn’t know what the sun in grandma’s mouth meant. 

But that’s not important, what’s important is that as long as he knows that his 
father is a great hero, that’s enough. 

“But Grandma, I miss Dad.” 

“When will Dad pick me up?” 

“Also, where is my mother?”‘ 

“Xiao Lin also misses her mother and grandma.” 

The little guy’s mood suddenly dropped. 

The little guy can’t remember many things from his childhood. 



However, he remembers his grandmother who loves him, his mother who is 
strict but loves her, and his father who doesn’t go home often and doesn’t see 
him a few times a year, but is respected by everyone. 

He misses them. 

He wants to eat grandma’s baked goods, he wants to hear his mother’s 
bedtime stories, and he wants to ride on his father’s shoulders to see the big 
world. 

But why, his favorite relatives, one by one, left him. 

First, grandma is gone, then mother is gone, and now I can’t even see my 
father. 

Seeing the little guy’s face full of tears, grandma’s heart ached with pity. 

She put the little guy in her arms and comforted her, “Good boy, your father 
and mother are saving the world. You know, the work of saving the world is 
very busy. When they finish their work, they will come back to pick you up. ” 

“Grandma Zu, is what you said true? Can Xiaolin really see her father and 
mother?” The little guy raised his head, his big eyes were filled with tears, his 
pitiful appearance was almost heartbreaking . 

“it is true.” 

“Xiao Lin is so obedient, how could grandma be willing to lie to you?” 
Grandma tried her best to put on a kind smile. 

But in his heart, he only felt extremely guilty and pity. 

Once, the old man remembered that when she saw Mark for the first time, she 
was very happy and very proud, and told Mark that she belonged to the Chu 
family and kept the noble lineage of the Chu family. 

At that time, she felt that Mark should be proud of his status as a descendant 
of the Chu family, because it could bring him strength, power and wealth. 

But now it seems that this identity brings only profound disasters to Mark. 

Not only did Mark cry, but also his children. 



If Mark wasn’t from the Chu family, but just an ordinary person like those 
thousands of passers-by outside the door, there shouldn’t be so many 
sufferings and so many separations. 

Just like this little guy, although he came into this world only for a few short 
years. 

But in the past few years, I have been experiencing loss. 

First he lost his grandma, then his mother, and now even his father is gone. 

Alone, thrown into this old house that was almost forgotten by the years. 

Maybe, she can give this little guy shelter and safety, but after all, she can’t 
make him happy. 

Chapter 4521 

Thinking of this, grandma’s indebtedness to this little guy undoubtedly became 
stronger. 

“Grandma, I want to learn martial arts.” 

“I want to be as good as my dad!” 

“I want to be a hero like my father!” 

When grandma felt guilty, Xiao Chulin suddenly wiped away her tears, gritted 
her teeth and looked at her grandma with firm eyes. 

Grandma was taken aback. 

“Xiao Lin, have you really thought it through?” 

“Warriors will certainly gain strength along the way, but at the same time they 
will be accompanied by death and danger.” 

“When your father handed you over to me, he didn’t want you to get involved 
in martial arts. He hoped that you could be an ordinary person and grow up 
safely.” 

Grandma asked the little guy. 



She could see that this little guy was extremely talented, and he was a good 
sign of martial arts. Moreover, there seems to be an extremely powerful force 
hidden in his body. Once developed, his power will undoubtedly far surpass 
Mark. If he is guided further, the height of this little guy in the future may not 
surpass his. Father. 

According to the past, grandma probably taught this little guy martial arts a 
long time ago. 

However, when Mark entrusted Chu Lin to himself, he made it clear that he 
did not want Chu Lin to go his own way, so as not to repeat the same 
mistakes. 

Mark, after all, was completely disappointed in the martial arts world. 

He didn’t want to let his son set foot in this filthy world again. 

“Grandma, I want to learn!” 

“I want to become stronger, I want to help my father!” 

“I’m going to protect Dad!” 

The little guy said stubbornly, and his immature words made his grandma 
show a gratified smile. 

“If your father hears it, he will definitely be very happy.” 

“However, it is enough to have this heart.” 

“Listen to your father, just stay safe and be an ordinary person.” 

After all, it was Mark’s son, and grandma did not violate Mark’s intention. 

While talking, the old man in the courtyard seemed to have noticed 
something. 

Her expression changed suddenly, and she raised her head suddenly. 

All I could hear was the sound of footsteps outside the door. 

Both feet stepped on the ground, leaving a rustling sound. 



somebody is coming. 

“Did you find this so quickly?” 

“It’s good to come.” 

 


