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Amber didn’t turn around until he couldn’t be seen. He felt that his body was 
wet with sweat. Although she didn’t show it on her face just now, she was 
extremely nervous in her heart. 

It was unfair to him to use Carlos as a shield, but Amber had no choice. 
Rodney had come to her to ask for an explanation, so she could only use 
Carlos’s matter as an excuse. 

At that time, she did talk about marriage with Carlos. All the neighbors 
regarded her as Carlos’s fiancee. All the children thought that they were 
Carlos’s. At that time, Rodney would definitely find out all this if he sent 
someone to investigate. He had no choice but to believe it. 

Rodney immediately asked Deon to investigate everything Amber said. The 
answer he got was that Amber and Carlos were about to get married. Carlos 
did not get married until he saw justice and courage. 

When he heard that Mel’s household register was now transferred from the 
Wilkinson family’s household register, Rodney’s heart was full of mixed 
feelings. He never dreamed that he would force Amber to risk everything to 
get married in order to force Amber to turn back. 

He had thought of giving her endless love and wanted to hold hands with her 
to watch the sunset. But why did everything become like this? 

He loved her. From the first time he saw her, he fell in love with her. In order 
to win her heart, he knew that her family background was not good. But so 
what? For him, having her was enough. 

He had appeared in her life after she broke up with Pierce. In order to be with 
her, he had done everything he could. Finally, she saw his existence. In order 
to be with her, he had tried every means to say that his mother accepted her 
existence. 

The days of marriage were sweet at first, but then it began to change. The 
result of his marriage with her was related to the child. The Barron family had 
been single for several generations, and her mother urgently needed to see 
him have children. 



At first, he had been putting the blame on himself until his mother forced them 
to go to the hospital for an examination. 

The results of the examination surprised him and Amber. There was nothing 
wrong with his body, but Amber couldn’t have an affair. If he couldn’t have an 
affair, it meant that he couldn’t have a baby. 

Her mother was unhappy at that time, and Amber was also listless. That night, 
her mother found an excuse and began to vent her anger. Amber did not say 
a word and endured it alone. 

Later, in order to get pregnant, she began to take medicine. He couldn’t 
remember how many traditional medicine Amber had taken. Anyway, he 
remembered that he could smell the smell of medicine every day when he 
returned home. At the beginning of his mother’s illness, she went around to 
find ways to cure Amber’s stomach disease. 

She found some partial prescriptions, and Amber was very cooperative. But 
after two years, Amber’s situation did not improve at all. Her mother began to 
lose patience, and her words became more and more unpleasant. 

When he got home, it was the first time he had heard a quarrel. Amber began 
to talk back. His mother was so angry that she burst into tears and broke a lot 
of things. 

The pressure was too great, and her mother was unreasonable. He knew that 
she had a hard time. For a period of time, she asked him all day long, 
“Rodney, if I can’t cure this disease in my life, will you abandon me?” 

He hugged her and comforted her. “I only want you. It’s enough to have you!” 
This was his sincere words. For him, the child was really not important. The 
important person was her! 

Later, the conflict between his mother and her became sharper and sharper. 
The quarrel became a family dinner. Every time they quarreled, his mother 
would grab him and cry. Rodney was caught in a dilemma. He comforted his 
mother and then comforted her. 

When another quarrel came, they would no longer accept his comfort. Her 
mother insisted on his divorce. She also told him that she was very tired and 
did not want to drink those bitter traditional medicine anymore. She would 



never do those creepy tests and bear her mother’s blame. She wanted to 
divorce! 

Rodney’s heart turned cold. When he heard that the woman he loved the most 
was about to divorce him, he almost broke down. He hugged her and pleaded, 
“Give me some more time. I will convince my mother. Amber begs you!” 

She didn’t waver in the slightest. “I’ve had enough. Rodney, you can’t live 
without a child. Your mother won’t allow you to live without a child. We can’t 
see the future!” 

That night, he begged her, begged her to stay, and said all kinds of good 
words. Finally, she stopped mentioning the divorce. 

Rodney made up his mind to find his mother and move her out. Her mother 
was very sad and disappointed. His attitude was very firm. Finally, her mother 
agreed to compromise and let them move out. 

On the third month after she moved out, her mother suddenly came to her. 
She threw a group of photos and a recording pen in front of Rodney. “Look, 
this is your favorite wife. Look at what she has done behind your back!” 

Rodney looked at the photo of Amber and Pierce hugging each other in 
shock. No! Amber wouldn’t betray her! This must be a mistake! When his 
mother turned on the recording, he clearly heard the voices of Amber and 
Pierce. 

She was complaining to Pierce about how her mother had abused her and 
said that she had lived enough of this kind of life. She also said that she was 
going to divorce. Pierce was comforting her. Rodney was unwilling to listen to 
everything that happened after that. 

That was the sound that every man was unwilling to hear. He jumped up 
crazily and smashed the recording pen on the ground. 

At that moment, his heart was broken into pieces! Blood was all over the 
place! He was trying to find a way to give her a home with only two people, 
but she was already ready to give up on him. She had a secret date with 
Pierce behind his back. 

Her mother cursed him viciously and forced him to divorce Amber. She 
couldn’t wait for a minute. She had to divorce him! 



But he couldn’t bear it. He really couldn’t stand the days without her. It was 
ridiculous. It was hard to imagine that he would choose to tolerate it after he 
heard his wife cheating with another man. 

He could tolerate his mother, but he couldn’t. “Rodney, what’s so good about 
Amber? She can’t give birth and is unreasonable. She’s even cheating on 
you. The Barron family can’t afford such a woman. If you still have me in your 
heart, you can divorce her immediately!” His mother slammed the table and 
shouted at him, gnashing her teeth. 

“Mom, it’s all because of you! It’s all because of you that Amber is in a bad 
mood. It’s not her fault that she can’t give birth. How can you provoke her like 
this! If you hadn’t forced her like this, she wouldn’t have done this!” For the 
first time, he was angry with his mother. 

“Am I wrong? Is it reasonable that she can’t give birth to a child? The Barron 
family has been single for several generations. Is it over in your hands? Since 
she can’t give birth to a child, she should have a place. What’s the point of her 
taking the position like this?” Rachel was angry. “The key is that she stole 
people. Why do you keep such a woman who doesn’t behave like a woman? 
You must divorce her. I will tell her in person!” 

“Mom!” Rodney stopped Rachel. “I will solve this problem!” 

“Let me tell you, I won’t give up. As long as she doesn’t divorce you, I will fight 
her to the end. I want to see how much face she has left in our house!” 

“Mom, don’t force me!” 

After a few days, his mother came to him again. “I can prevent you from 
getting a divorce with that b***h, but I have a request that you must promise 
me.” 

“What request?” 

“I want a grandson!” 

“No! I won’t betray her!” He shook his head firmly. 

“Silly child, she has cheated with another man behind your back. Why don’t 
you give up?” 



“Mom, I won’t betray her! I won’t!” 

“Silly child, do you think you have to have a relationship with a child? There 
are so many young women out there who are pregnant…” Her mother stared 
at him aggressively. “Rodney, as long as you give me a grandson, I will do 
whatever you want! I will never force you again!” 

He looked at his mother’s face and was silent for a long time. Finally, he said, 
“Okay!” 

But he never dreamed that things would turn out like this. It turned out to be 
Celia. Her mother had been doing a good job of keeping secrets. He didn’t 
know until Celia was pregnant. 

Rodney was really shocked. He didn’t know why Celia would agree to do such 
a thing. As the daughter of the secretary, it was incredible for her to do such a 
thing. 

Celia told him that she loved him and had always loved him. She knew that 
she could not be with him for the rest of her life. She heard that her mother 
had decided to give birth to a child for him after she got pregnant. 

Celia also said that she would never disturb his and Amber’s lives and let him 
rest assured. 

The development of the matter had gone beyond Rodney’s plan. He was 
shocked and blamed himself. After knowing that Celia was pregnant, he was 
at a loss. His mother and Celia both thought that the child was his. 

Only he knew that it was not. He found the s***m from the s***m store just to 
give an explanation to his mother and give her a peaceful life. 

In the whole thing, he felt that the person he was most sorry for was Celia. 
Celia knew him much earlier than Amber. He knew that Celia had a good 
impression of him. 

Because Celia was gentle and kind, and because she was the secretary’s 
daughter, her mother always wanted her to marry Celia so that she could help 
her. 



But he didn’t love Celia. He only had a friendship with her and had no love at 
all. He didn’t know how his mother persuaded Celia to agree to take over the 
baby. 

How much courage did an unmarried woman need to replace someone else’s 
pregnancy? The reason why Celia was willing to do all this for herself was that 
she liked herself. If she knew that the s***m was not her, it would be a big 
blow to her. 

Rodney was in a dilemma, but because of Celia’s pregnancy, his mother 
began to make other plans. She kept asking him to divorce Amber, but he 
firmly disagreed. 

After Celia was pregnant, she had to have a checkup. Her mother lied to him 
and went to the hospital, saying that she couldn’t let a big girl like Celia be 
despised by the doctor and that he had to sign on the checkup. He couldn’t 
refuse, so he had to go to the hospital and sign on it. 

The anxiety in his heart became more and more serious. What would Amber 
think if he knew that Celia was pregnant? He really wanted to tell Amber about 
it, but he was afraid that Amber would have other thoughts. 

He began to fear going home and subconsciously avoid it. He didn’t expect 
that this matter would be exposed so quickly. 

Amber actually knew that Celia was pregnant. She hit Celia and the child was 
gone. 

His mother’s hopes were shattered and he was forced to get a divorce. On 
one hand, it was his mother who gave birth to him. On the other hand, it was 
someone whom he swore to love for the rest of his life. He really could not 
choose. He could not watch his mother die, nor could he lose her. His mother 
used a knife to force him to find a lawyer to sign a divorce agreement. 

His heart was cold. He still had one last glimmer of hope, which was to do 
something to the divorce agreement. If the divorce agreement was written so 
that people could not bear it, she would definitely not agree to sign it, so there 
were harsh conditions on the divorce agreement. 

That night, he sat in the car and waited for the result. His heart was colder 
than anyone else’s. 



He held the last hope that she might make a concession for him. 

However, she was so straightforward that she quickly disappeared after 
signing the contract. 

It was not until she disappeared that he realized that there had never been a 
trace of him in her heart. 

What happened to Celia was not his wish, but there was a reason for it. As 
long as she had him in her heart, she would not sentence him to death without 
a reason. 

She signed so quickly that she had to leave without hesitation. 

A few days later, Ashton came looking for him. “Mr. Barron, Amber asked me 
to take the divorce certificate and her ring.” 

Ashton’s expression was very calm, without any resentment or anger. It was 
as if he was facing an irrelevant person. And this Mr. Barron only felt that it 
was extremely ironic in his ears. Since his marriage with Amber, Ashton had 
always called him Mr. Barron as if he knew that this day would come. 

“Where is she?” He gnashed his teeth. “A divorce is a matter between two 
people. Without her presence, there’s no way to get a divorce certificate.” 

Ashton’s voice was faint as he said, “I understand! Let’s put aside the matter 
of the divorce certificate. Amber didn’t take any chance to take Mr. Barron 
away, so please return the ring to me. Amber spent 5,000 yuan on that ring. 
Mr. Barron doesn’t care about this amount of money, but we can’t afford to 
ignore it.” 

These words made him almost choked to death. He had to return the ring to 
Ashton. Ashton took the ring and turned to leave. Later, he saw the ring 
appear in the pawn shop. When Amber bought it, he spent more than 5,000 
yuan, and the pawn only earned 800 yuan. 

This was Amber. He was a decisive person. Ever since she used the ring of 
love, Rodney had never stopped hating her! 

He wanted to break her wings and let her come back willingly, so Amber could 
not find a job after the divorce. 



Rodney thought that he would force her to come back, but she suddenly 
disappeared. Rodney thought that she would go to find Pierce. Didn’t she 
want to be with him? He didn’t like it. Rodney went straight to Madam 
Hammond. Madam Hammond answered firmly. Amber wanted to be with 
Pierce, unless she closed her eyes. 

With Madam Hammond’s answer, he was still worried. He had been staring at 
Pierce, but she had never appeared beside him. 
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Rodney had never dreamed that she would stay in the countryside of South 
City to have children. If he hadn’t forced her like that, she wouldn’t have 
chosen to get married, would she? 

She and he hadn’t been pregnant for three years, but she got pregnant very 
quickly after leaving him. This was undoubtedly the greatest irony for Rodney, 
because he had read many books about pregnancy before. He knew that 
women were under great pressure and it wasn’t easy to get pregnant. Her 
pressure should come from her mother. 

Thinking that her pregnancy might have been caused by the great pressure 
from her mother, Rodney wanted to die. He should have moved her out 
earlier. If he had brought her out earlier, everything would not have been like 
this. She would definitely have had a lively and lovely child with him. 

As long as she had a child, her mother would never make things difficult for 
her. But it was too late to say anything now. It was his fault. It was his 
hesitation that caused all this. 

Rodney didn’t want to go home. He drove alone to the bar. He leaned against 
the sofa silently and drank. He heard his phone ringing, but he didn’t want to 
answer it at all. 

He drank a lot of wine in the bar, and in the end, it was the designated driver 
of the bar who sent him home. 

It was already midnight, and the lights in the living room were still on. Because 
he did not go home, nor did he pick up the phone, Rachel was worried and 
kept waiting. 



Seeing Rodney standing at the door with his hand on the door frame, Rachel 
turned her head and complained, “Rodney, why didn’t you answer the phone? 
Celia has been waiting here for you for several hours.” 

“I didn’t ask her to wait!” Rodney replied impatiently. 

“What’s wrong? What happened?” Rachel looked at her son. 

Rodney staggered over to her and sat down opposite her. “Mom, do you really 
love me?” 

“Child, what are you talking about? Do you have a mother who doesn’t love 
her son?” Rachel replied. She frowned when she smelled the smell of alcohol. 
“Why do you drink when you don’t have a good stomach?” 

Rodney leaned back on the sofa and muttered to himself, “If you really love 
me, why can’t you see my sadness? Why?” 

Without Amber, he didn’t believe that Rachel wouldn’t have been able to see 
his life. It was said that love is the same as love. He had given up on his 
mother because of filial piety. Why couldn’t his mother accept Amber because 
of love? This was what he wanted to know the most. 

“Rodney, you drank too much!” Rachel did not take his question to heart. She 
was worried that her son would hurt his stomach, so she immediately ordered 
the auntie to cook the soup for Rodney. 

After all these years with his mother, he knew how capable she was to change 
the topic. Seeing Rachel calling him Aunt, he struggled to get up and went 
upstairs. 

That night, Amber was lying on the bed, tossing and turning, unable to fall 
asleep. She hated Rodney. She hated him as much as she loved him. As long 
as she thought that he said that he loved her and cheated on her, she could 
not forgive him. 

When she thought of the scene of Rodney and Celia carrying her behind their 
backs, she felt as if her heart had been cut. In addition to the pain of living a 
life worse than death, there was also incomparable humiliation. Amber wished 
to kill them. 



She had tried her best to treat her child and suffered from Rachel’s humiliation 
and t*****e, but he had begun to have his own child outside. 

Amber felt a chill down his spine as soon as he thought of how Rodney was 
pretending to hug her to comfort her. “I only want you. I don’t want children!” 

“How disgusting is he? How shameless is he to coax me like this?” Amber felt 
a chill on her face when she thought of how ruthless he was to her after the 
incident was exposed. 

She would not forgive him. In this lifetime, he would never know that he had 
another son! This was his retribution, his retribution for having an affair! 

Probably due to the unaccustomed climate, Mel felt a little uncomfortable 
recently and began to have a fever again. Amber took him to the hospital for 
an infusion. After two days of infusion in the hospital, the fever was finally 
controlled. Amber took Mel out of the hospital. 

When she was waiting for the elevator, she ran into Celia and Zoe. Celia got 
up this morning and found her throat uncomfortable, so she asked Zoe to 
accompany her to the hospital. 

They didn’t expect to meet Amber, so they were shocked. Looking at her 
holding the child, they looked at each other in surprise. 

Amber didn’t know how to give birth. How could he appear with a child? Who 
was the child? It couldn’t be hers! 

The two of them looked at each other as they thought about it. Zoe curled her 
lips. Celia would naturally not do such an impolite thing, but she felt very 
uncomfortable. 

Amber’s delicate skin made her extremely jealous. Amber was famous for his 
beauty. Many boys in college called her goddess. 

Because of Amber, the goddess, Celia had to stand aside. At that time, she 
was very unhappy. 

After all these years, she had lived a comfortable life and Amber had drifted 
away. She had thought that she would age, but she had never thought that 
her beauty would be rooted in her. She was exactly the same as before. 



Celia was so jealous that she sneered in her heart. “What’s the use of being 
beautiful? Can’t I have a baby?” Thinking of this, she felt much more 
comfortable. 

On the one hand, Zoe was jealous of Amber’s beauty. On the other hand, she 
was upset about being poured with food by Amber last time. She snorted at 
Amber provocatively. 

Amber turned a blind eye to her dissatisfaction. For a slave like Zoe, ignoring 
her was like putting gold on her face. 

The elevator arrived. Amber didn’t look at the two of them and entered the 
elevator first. Zoe and Celia looked strange and followed him into the elevator. 

“Some people are despicable. The more you ignore her, the more she takes 
you seriously. Zoe is such a b*tch. Think about what happened last time. 
Since we met this time, we have to find her.” 

Amber wouldn’t be driven out of the Barron family because he didn’t know 
how to give birth to a child. It was better to use the kid to provoke her. 
Thinking of this, she sneered. “Celia, how painful do you think a woman won’t 
have a child? She must be envious and jealous when she sees someone 
else’s child. Will she want to raise someone else’s child?” 

Celia was also happy. Zoe was really her bosom friend. She said what she 
wanted to say. She didn’t answer but smiled gently. 

Celia’s smile was a kind of encouragement to Zoe, and Zoe became more and 
more proud. “It’s useless no matter how beautiful a woman is. Life is 
incomplete, which is equivalent to being half disabled!” 

As soon as she finished speaking, the little girl in Amber’s hand said in a 
childish voice, “Mom! Hungry!” 

Zoe suspected that something was wrong with her ears, so did Celia. They 
looked at each other in surprise, suspecting that something was wrong with 
their ears. 

Although they heard the child call her mother, they still didn’t believe that the 
child would be Amber’s. 



“It must be an acquaintance.” Mel fell into a position in Amber’s arms and 
turned her face back. Seeing Mel’s face, Zoe and Celia looked at each other 
again. 

Zoe couldn’t say a word. Celia was no longer smiling. She stared at Mel in 
astonishment and then looked at Amber’s face. 

Eyes, nose, and mouth… This child resembled Amber so much! 

“Is he really Amber’s child? How is that possible?” 

Celia’s stunned expression amused Amber. She withdrew her gaze and 
looked at Mel, her eyes full of tenderness and love. “Good girl, I’ll take you to 
eat delicious food later!” 

Celia heard this sentence clearly. She and Zoe were staring at each other and 
couldn’t speak at all. 

The air became silent. Zoe, who used to mock Amber, couldn’t find a reason, 
and Celia’s heart was also spinning. 

Finally, the elevator door opened, and Amber strode out with Mel in his arms. 
Celia and Zoe followed. Watching Amber’s back as he walked away, Zoe 
lowered her voice and said, “Celia, isn’t she… can’t she give birth? What’s 
wrong with this child?” 

“How would I know?” Celia’s face darkened. 

She was more anxious and worried than Zoe when she suddenly became so 
angry. 

“I don’t know if Rodney knows that she has a child…” Zoe brought it up. 

“Shut up!” There was a hint of anger on Celia’s face. She interrupted Zoe 
harshly. Zoe had never seen such a Celia, so she was shocked. Celia ignored 
Zoe and said, “Take a taxi home. I have something to do, so I have to go first!” 

Zoe watched Celia drive away. Although she didn’t know why she was angry, 
it must have something to do with the child in Amber’s hands. It seemed that 
something bad was going to happen! 

Celia parked the car at the door and rushed into the house. She didn’t look 
like a lady at all. In the living room, Shannon was watching TV on the sofa. 



When she heard the sound of the door opening, she saw her daughter 
panting. She frowned and said, “Why are you running so fast? It’s improper to 
let people see you.” 

“Mom! It’s not good!” Celia rushed to her. “Amber… Amber has a baby!” 

“What did you say?” Shannon sat up straight. “How is that possible? You must 
be mistaken!” 

“I didn’t see wrongly. The child looked very similar to her, as if they were 
carved out of the same mold.” 

Shannon couldn’t believe it. “How come?” 

“Mom! What should we do?” Celia was very anxious. “Didn’t you say that she 
wouldn’t have a baby? What’s wrong with this child? If Rodney knows that she 
will have a baby, what should we do?” 

“Shut up!” Shannon shouted at her daughter. “Why are you making such a 
fuss?” 

“Mom! I’m scared!” Celia bit her lip. She was really scared. At that time, 
Amber and Rodney broke up because of their broken-up. If Rodney knew that 
Amber would have a child, everything she had painstakingly planned would be 
over. Last time, she said that she had a child on a blind date show, but we 
didn’t believe it. It turned out that she really had a child. 

“Let me think about it! Let me think about it!” Shannon also knew the 
seriousness of the matter. She stood up and walked around the room. “How 
old is the child?” 

“Two or three years old!” Celia did not know the exact age. 

“Two or three years old? Could it be Rodney’s?” Shannon’s face became 
serious. The appearance of this child was strange! If it was Rodney’s child, it 
would be a waste. 

“No way.” Celia was uncertain. “If the child was really Rodney’s, why did she 
have to divorce him?” 



“That’s not necessarily true. Amber and Ashley are as stubborn as they are. 
They don’t tolerate sand in their eyes, and they view love so sacred. Maybe 
this child really belongs to Rodney.” 

“Then what should we do?” Celia was anxious. She had not yet recovered 
from the shock that Amber could give birth to a child. If this child belonged to 
Rodney, she could say that there was no hope at all. 

Shannon didn’t say anything, which scared her. She walked around the room 
with an angry look on her face. She picked up her phone and dialed. A soft 
voice came from the other side. “What’s the matter, Shannon?” 

“It’s a big deal. Do you know that Amber has a child?” 

The other party was stunned. “How come?” 

“Celia saw it with her own eyes today.” Shannon lowered her voice and said 
fiercely, “Didn’t you say it was all right? How could it become like this now?” 

The other party was silent for a moment. “Shannon, there’s always an 
accident…” 

“How dare you say that!” Shannon was furious. “Didn’t you tell me that she 
wouldn’t get pregnant in her whole life after the surgery? How can you explain 
it now?” 

“This is not absolutely absolute. There is such a case that she will still be 
pregnant after having an abortion. Amber may be like this.” 

“An accident? It’s really surprising!” Shannon gnashed her teeth and said, 
“The Barron family will definitely know about it. If someone comes to 
investigate, do you know how to answer?” 

“Don’t worry! I’ve already dealt with it!” The other party promised. 
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These words made Shannon feel a little relieved. It had been so many years 
since Amber had secretly had an abortion operation. The doctor who had 
performed the surgery had already died in a car accident. Even if this matter 



was investigated into, it would only be a medical problem at most. They would 
never be involved. 

However, this wasn’t what she had to face right now. If Rodney knew that she 
could give birth to a child, it would be incredible! 

Celia saw that her mother looked more and more anxious, and she kept 
muttering, “How could this be? Mom, what should we do now? What should I 
do if the child is Rodney’s?” 

Shannon had no time to comfort her. She knew that things had become very 
serious, but now was not the time to panic. She had to find a way. 

Shannon was different from Celia. After all, she had experienced many things, 
so she soon calmed down. What she was most worried about now was not 
Amber’s child, but the birth father of the child. 

As long as the child was not Rodney, everything would be fine. On the other 
hand, everything would be over. 

Elliot had been angry for many days since his last confession was messed up 
by Rodney. However, he had always been a person who was good at 
adjusting himself. He immediately adjusted his mentality and was ready to 
attack again. 

The appearance of Mel made Elliot know that he not only wanted to please 
Amber, but also wanted to please her. 

As long as Mel liked him, Amber would definitely love him. Therefore, Elliot 
began to visit Amber’s new home frequently. 

Every time he went there, he would bring interesting toys and the snacks that 
Mel liked. Children were the best. Mel began to like Elliot. 

Elliot took the opportunity to ask Mel to be his father. Mel hesitated and said, 
“What if you are my father, Uncle Pierce? I prefer him being my father.” 

Upon hearing this, Elliot felt greatly hurt. “This little guy has no conscience. 
I’ve already hugged you like this. Why are you still thinking about Pierce?” Of 
course, he dared to say this out loud, so he had to be careful . “Mom doesn’t 
like Uncle Pierce. Mom likes me. Do you understand?” 



“Mom really likes you?” Mel asked in disbelief. 

“Of course it’s true. You see, I’m more handsome and smart than Uncle 
Pierce. Mom must like me!” 

“You are not more handsome than Uncle Pierce.” Mel shook his head. In his 
heart, Pierce was the most handsome. “But if mom likes you, I will recognize 
you as my father.” 

Elliot had heard from Mel that he did not have Pierce’s handsome face, but 
Mel said happily, “Mel is so good. I’ll take you to the amusement park on 
Monday.” 

“Is it really okay?” Mel became happy as soon as she heard the amusement 
park. “Mom, are you going too?” 

“Mom will go too. We’ll all go.” Elliot was extremely pleased. 

Elliot came back early in the morning after a rest on Monday. Regardless of 
Amber’s opposition, he took Mel to the amusement park. Mel was so happy to 
hear that they were going to the amusement park. When she saw Amber’s 
gloomy face, she immediately stopped smiling and asked carefully, “Mom, I 
want to go to the amusement park. Shall we go together?” 

Looking at his bright and pleading eyes, Amber’s heart softened and he 
agreed. 

Mel excitedly requested to ride the roller coaster. “Mom, mom, I’m going to 
play roller coaster. Can you accompany me?” 

Amber was afraid of heights. She shook her head. “Go sit with Uncle Mr. 
Thomson. Mom won’t go!” 

Mel looked disappointed. Elliot picked him up and said, “Mom is afraid. Let’s 
go!” 

Amber looked at his handsome face and was slightly absent-minded. 

If it weren’t for his prominent family background, Elliot would have been a 
good person. 



At noon in the amusement park, Mel was clamoring to go to the buffet. The 
two adults naturally cooperated with each other. Elliot was so kind to Mel that 
he did everything himself. 

She met Rachel when she brought Mel to get some food. Rachel was very 
surprised to see him with the child. The child was so beautiful, but he looked 
so familiar. She couldn’t help but reach out and touch Mel’s head. “What a 
pretty child!” 

Elliot said proudly, “My son!” 

“Your son?” Rachel was very surprised. She had never heard of Elliot’s 
marriage. Why did he suddenly have a son? Thinking that Elliot’s private life 
was full of people, this child must be an illegitimate child, so she did not say 
much and returned to her seat with food politely. 

After sitting down, she looked at Elliot and the child, only to find Amber. When 
she saw Amber, Rachel was stunned. Only then did she remember why the 
child looked so familiar. The child looked really like Amber. Was it Amber’s 
child? It was impossible. If Amber had a child, she would not force her to 
divorce Rodney. 

While thinking about it, Elliot and Amber took the food with them and sat not 
far away from her. The three of them began to eat. Mel happily ate the food on 
the plate. Amber watched him wolf down the food and reminded him softly, 
“Slow down, don’t choke!” 

Looking at Amber’s concern for Mel, Rachel felt more and more strange. The 
child looked so similar to her. Was it really her child? 

But it was impossible! The doctor had already said that she would never get 
pregnant! Thinking of this, she suddenly heard the child say in a childish 
voice, “Mom! I want to eat the sweet pepper view on your plate!” 

“Okay!” Amber took the sweet pepper cane from the plate and fed it into Mel’s 
mouth. Mel ate one piece and smacked her lips. “I want more!” 

Amber fed her another piece. “I can’t eat any more. I want something else!” 

Mel obediently began to eat something else. Looking at the natural maternal 
light in Amber’s eyes, Rachel was shocked. It was really her child! She could 
even have a baby! 



Back then, she was certain that Amber would not give birth to a child, so she 
tried her best to make Amber and Rodney divorce. In order to get Rodney to 
agree to the divorce, she wanted to destroy her brain. In the end, she even 
used such a dirty trick. 

Of course, it was Celia’s words that reminded her of the dirty tricks she used. 
She said that there was a story between Amber and Pierce. Then, she was 
instigated by Itzel, Amber’s attending doctor. She then thought of framing 
Amber and Pierce for having an affair. Itzel gave her several ideas. First of all, 
it was to slander Amber for having an affair. Men couldn’t stand the fact that a 
woman was having an affair. As long as they gave those things to Rodney, he 
would definitely get a divorce. 

Those photos and recordings were edited. Rachel thought that her son would 
divorce Amber because of this, but she didn’t expect that her son was willing 
to be a cuckold and wouldn’t divorce her. 

She had no choice but to accept Itzel’s second suggestion. She had to take 
another shortcut and find someone to replace her pregnancy. 

At that time, although she liked Celia, she had never thought of letting Celia 
get pregnant on her behalf. After all, Celia’s identity was there. How could the 
daughter of the secretary do something like that? 

Itzel tried to persuade her that this was a very profitable thing. Wasn’t she 
interested in Celia being her daughter-in-law? As long as she convinced 
Rodney to agree to let another woman have a child, she would then send 
Celia to his bed. At that time, if Amber found out that Rodney and Celia were 
in bed, she would definitely propose a divorce. 

Therefore, according to Itzel’s instructions, she went to her son and told him 
that she would have someone to replace her. Her son would not betray the 
marriage no matter what. In the end, Itzel also told him that she would use a 
man-made method to replace the pregnancy. 

She thought that Celia was pregnant with her son’s child, and that her son 
would distance himself from Amber because of the child. However, after Celia 
got pregnant, her son did not change at all. 

One of the most important reasons why she persuaded Celia to get pregnant 
was that she promised that her son would divorce Amber. Now her son had 
no choice but to divorce Rachel. 



Amber and Celia ran into each other in the hospital when they were in a mess. 
They even pushed Celia into a miscarriage. 

Knowing that the child couldn’t protect the hatred in her heart, she couldn’t 
help punching and kicking Amber and forcing her son to divorce Amber with 
her life. 

Thinking of what had happened in the past, Rachel could no longer eat. While 
Elliot took Mel to the bathroom, she walked up to Amber and asked, “Is that 
your child?” 

Amber looked up at Rachel and answered coldly, “Yes!” 

“You gave birth to Mel?” 

“Yes!” Amber replied simply. 

“How is that possible?” Rachel couldn’t imagine it. She mustered up the 
courage to ask Amber if he was still thinking of taking care of the child. Didn’t 
people say that the child they were taking care of would look like their 
adoptive parents? 

“Why not?” Amber sneered. “Don’t tell me that Mrs. Barron hopes that I won’t 
have a child for the rest of my life? Or is it because I, a hen that doesn’t know 
how to make an egg, have an egg that makes you very uneasy?” 

Amber’s sarcasm made Rachel blush. In the past, she used to insult Amber 
like this. She didn’t expect that one day, Amber would give her these words 
back. She had nothing to say. She blushed and left the restaurant. 

In the elevator, Rachel was really upset. “It shouldn’t have happened. How 
could someone who doesn’t know how to give birth to a baby?” Amber’s 
sarcasm was not important. What she was most worried about was her son. If 
Rodney knew that Amber would have a baby, it would be troublesome. 

She had to ask Itzel what was going on. Rachel drove to the hospital. 

Entering the hospital building, Rachel went directly to the experts’ clinic of the 
Department of Yin and Yang. Many people were waiting for her at the door of 
Itzel’s office. Rachel pushed the door open and rushed in. 
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Seeing that she suddenly appeared and was seeing the patient, Itzel stood up 
with a smile. “Why are you so busy today?” 

“I have something to talk to you about!” Rachel’s face darkened. 

Itzel immediately told the patient to go out first. After the patient went out, Itzel 
closed the door. Rachel sat down with a sullen face. “I have something to ask 
you. Is Amber really not good at giving birth?” 

Fortunately, Shannon had already informed Itzel. Otherwise, she would have 
been caught off guard by Rachel’s sudden visit. Itzel pulled Rachel to sit down 
and asked, “What happened?” 

“Amber has a child now, but didn’t you say that she couldn’t get pregnant at 
that time?” Rachel asked. 

“Amber has a child? Are you sure?” Itzel had already received Shannon’s hint. 
She had a way to deal with it and looked surprised. “It’s impossible. She can’t 
have an affair with a child.” 

“How would I know? Back then, you said that it was impossible for her to be 
pregnant.” Rachel stared at Itzel. “Because I trusted your medical skills, I 
forced her to divorce Rodney.” 

“It’s too surprising! It’s really surprising! I’ve seen so many infertility diseases 
and cured so many diseases. I’ve never seen such a situation like her. I’m just 
telling the truth. You know that women can’t have children if they can’t get 
engaged. After so many treatments, she still can’t get pregnant. You want a 
child so much, so…” 

“But why is she giving birth now?” 

“I don’t know much about this. There are many cases of a woman’s 
pregnancy. Not only her own problems, but also the outside environment will 
be affected. For example, the pressure can cause the pregnancy. I once 
treated a white-collar worker. Her pregnancy rate was too big, which led to ten 
years of pregnancy after marriage. Later, she quit her job and became 
pregnant for a year. There was another reason why a patient got pregnant 
because of her mother-in-law’s pressure. Later, the little couple moved out 
and became pregnant.” Itzel spoke with confidence. 



“In your opinion, Amber won’t have a baby because of me?” Rachel was very 
angry. 

“That’s not what I meant. Didn’t Amber take so much medicine at that time? 
Maybe the medicine was effective. After all, she didn’t come to me for a 
check-up later, so I don’t know the specific situation of her,” Itzel replied. 

Ever since Amber and Rodney had moved out of the hospital, they had never 
come to the hospital for an examination. Indeed, she did not know Amber’s 
situation. It was Amber’s good luck that she had come to the hospital to do a 
medical check-up. If she showed signs of having an affair with him, she would 
definitely make her unable to continue. Of course, she was just saying the 
latter part of the sentence in her stomach. 

“But you didn’t say that at that time. You said that her illness couldn’t be 
cured. I have been friends with you for so many years, and I believe in your 
medical skills. I began to think of a way because you said that she couldn’t 
cure her illness.” Rachel stared at Itzel. If Itzel hadn’t said that, she wouldn’t 
have been desperate and naturally wouldn’t have treated Amber like that. 

“My dear Mrs. Barron, why are you so angry? Amber’s status doesn’t match 
Rodney’s at all. Besides, she is not filial to you and often makes you angry. 
Isn’t it good to divorce her? Look at your current future daughter-in-law. She 
has a good appearance, a good family background, and she is also filial to 
you. You can’t find such a daughter-in-law. Why are you angry with a 
unworthy woman?” Itzel said with a smile. 

“That’s true, but you don’t know how distant Rodney and I are because of that 
woman. I only have one son, how can I bear to make him sad?” 

“We’ve been friends for so many years. I thought of these ideas when I saw 
that you were anxious for your good. If it weren’t for our good relationship, 
could I have said these words to you?” Itzel looked aggrieved. 

Rachel thought about it and agreed. Itzel had known her for so many years 
and had always been on good terms with her. If she hadn’t been in a bad 
mood, she wouldn’t have taken the initiative to think of a way for herself. 
Thinking of this, she sighed faintly. “I’m mainly worried. You said that if 
Rodney knew that woman would have a baby, he wouldn’t know what he 
would do with me.” 

“Don’t let him know.” 



“How could Rodney not know when we meet in a city?” Rachel sighed. 

“Then you should get him engaged to Celia as soon as possible. Rodney 
values friendship. As long as he is engaged, he won’t think about it anymore.” 

“This is the only way.” 

After leaving, Rachel immediately picked up the phone and called Shannon. 
“Rachel also knows about that. You have to find a way quickly.” 

“So fast!” Shannon was shocked. “It’s true that paper can’t hold fire! What did 
she say?” 

“I’ve already tricked her into asking about what happened to me. She’s just 
worried that her son will know the consequences of this matter. You have to 
find a way to get Celia and the engagement done before Rodney finds out.” 

“I know. I’m trying to figure it out.” Shannon hung up the phone and said to 
Celia, “Go and buy some of Rachel’s favorite fruit to see her immediately. By 
the way, find out what she’s up to.” 

When Rachel returned home, she was surprised to find that Celia was 
chatting with her aunt in her own house. When she saw Rachel, she stood up 
from the sofa and said, “I’ve been busy these days and have no time to see 
you. I happened to be free today, so I came directly without making a call. Ms. 
Grant, you won’t blame me for being rude, will you?” 

“Celia bought a lot of your favorite fruits.” The auntie showed the fruits that 
Celia bought to Rachel. 

Rachel was in a better mood because of Celia’s arrival. She sat down and 
said, “Just come here. Why do you want to buy fruit?” Then she ordered the 
auntie, “Go buy some dishes that Celia likes to eat immediately.” 

The auntie agreed. Celia stood up thoughtfully and said, “I’ll wash the fruit for 
you.” 

“No.” Rachel stopped Celia and sighed slightly. Celia took the opportunity to 
ask, “You don’t look well. Did you encounter something troublesome?” 

Rachel nodded. “Yes, I met Amber in the restaurant today.” 

“Did she say something unpleasant to you?” 



“No. Celia, Amber has a child.” 

“Ah!” Celia looked surprised. “Amber gave birth to a baby? Is there a 
mistake?” 

“I’ve asked her. It’s her child. She looks very much like her.” Rachel felt a little 
upset when she thought of Amber’s sarcasm of her. She knew nothing about 
giving birth to a beautiful son, but his son was still single. The grandson she 
wanted to hug was still missing. She was really unwilling to give up. 

“Rodney, do you know about this?” 

“I don’t think you know what’s going on right now. You know Rodney’s temper. 
He’s like a son to Amber. If he knew that she could give birth to a child, he 
would definitely make a scene with me!” After saying that, he remembered 
that his future daughter-in-law was sitting in front of him and comforted her. 
“Don’t worry. Even if Rodney knew, it wouldn’t be a big deal. Since she has a 
child, she must be married. It won’t affect you.” 

Rachel didn’t have the confidence to finish the last sentence. 

Celia remained silent. What she was worried about right now was not whether 
Amber would give birth to a child, but whether the child was Rodney. It 
seemed that Rachel had not thought about it in this way, but it did not mean 
that she had always thought otherwise. Sooner or later, she would doubt it. 

Rachel loved the child so much, and Amber gave birth to another son. If the 
child was really Rodney’s, Rachel would be happy and faint. At that time, she 
would see her grandson in her heart, so she would naturally not help her. 

Without Rachel’s support, it would be daydreaming for her to be together with 
Rodney. 

Seeing that Celia was silent, Rachel knew that she must be worried. “Don’t 
worry. I will keep an eye on Rodney. Your relationship with Rodney will not 
change.” 

Rachel’s words of comfort had no effect on Celia, but now she could only 
stabilize Rachel and let Rachel feel guilty about herself. She had no time to 
think about the problem of the child. She sighed deeply and said, “If I knew 
that she would have a baby, I shouldn’t have been pregnant on behalf of her. 
If I hadn’t, she wouldn’t have divorced Rodney. It’s all my fault.” 



Rachel was very satisfied with Celia’s kindness. What she wanted was such a 
obedient and filial daughter-in-law. “This has nothing to do with you. Don’t be 
burdened. I’m telling you this because we are going to be a family soon. I 
have to let you know what you should know. Don’t say that Rodney doesn’t 
know that Amber has a child. Even if he knows, what can he do? I will never 
let such a woman who has no respect for others enter the Barron family 
again!” 

Celia looked grateful. “I know that Ms. Grant is good to me. I will be filial to 
you in the future!” 

As she spoke, the auntie returned with some groceries. Rachel ended the 
topic and picked up the phone. “I’ll call Rodney to come back for dinner 
tonight.” 

The phone was quickly connected. Rodney’s faint voice sounded. “Mom, 
what’s the matter?” 

“Child, can’t I call you if nothing happens?” Rachel’s tone was full of blame. 

“I’m very busy!” Rodney replied. 

“No matter how busy you are, you have to eat. I asked my aunt to buy your 
favorite dishes. You come back to eat. By the way, Celia is here.” Rachel 
didn’t mention Celia, but when she mentioned Celia, Rodney frowned and 
said, “Mom, I really don’t have time today. I still have a lot of things to deal 
with!” 

Rachel was unhappy. “You haven’t been home for a long time, so make an 
exception today. Keep your work until tomorrow.” 

“This won’t do. After today’s matter is over, let’s talk about this very important 
matter. We can’t drag things out!” Rodney did not give him any face at all. “I’m 
hanging up!” 

Rodney hung up the phone without saying anything, and Rachel’s face 
darkened. Celia comforted him obediently, “Rodney must be very busy with 
work. Don’t be angry, I’ll just eat with you!” 

Celia’s obedience made Rachel even angrier. “I don’t believe that he will be 
so busy that he doesn’t even have time to eat. Celia, wait at home. I have to 
go to the company and call him back!” 



Rachel went to the company angrily. When she arrived at the company, she 
found that Rodney was not in the company at all. So she immediately called 
him, but he directly hung up her phone. Rachel called him again, but he 
turned off the phone. 

Rachel was so angry that she had no place to vent her anger if she couldn’t 
find her son, so she had to ask the driver to drive home. 

After returning home, the aunt had already prepared the meal. Celia heard the 
sound of the car and came to open the door with a smile. When she saw 
Rachel come in alone with a gloomy face, she was extremely disappointed. 

Rachel and Celia did not have a good time eating this meal, and both of them 
felt uncomfortable. Rachel was angry that her son was disobedient, while 
Celia was worried about her situation. 

Rodney had always been obedient to Rachel. Now that Rachel had not 
brought her back to the company, he knew very well that something that they 
did not know had happened. 

What exactly was going on? Could it be that Rodney already knew that Amber 
would give birth to a child? 

Rodney had always been very concerned about Amber. He should be paying 
attention to every move of hers. The matter of the child could not be hidden 
from him. However, since he knew that Amber had a child, why was it so 
calm? 

There was only one way to explain that the child was not Rodney. Her heart 
was in a mess and naturally, she was not in the mood to stay in the Barron 
family. 

After dinner, Celia sat with Rachel for a while and said goodbye. Rachel was 
in no mood to ask her to stay and asked the auntie to send Celia out. 

Auntie sent Celia to the door and took the initiative to say, “Don’t worry. I’ll 
help you with anything.” 

Celia nodded. “Thank you very much!” 
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Rachel and Celia were unhappy, but Rodney had never felt better. Since he 
knew that Amber divorced and had a baby with someone else, he had never 
been calm in his heart. 

He had always thought that Amber was just making up the numbers on the 
blind date show. Now it seemed that she really wanted to find a father for her 
child, so she chose someone like Casen. 

Thinking that Amber was almost destroyed, he was full of remorse and hatred. 
He was the cause of Amber’s current situation. He had to find a way to make 
up for it. 

Because of this idea, Rodney had not been in the mood to work for the past 
few days. Instead of going home after work, he drove to Amber’s 
neighborhood to take a stroll. After that, he found that Elliot had become a 
frequent visitor of Amber’s family. 

Watching Elliot swagger in and out of Amber’s house and accompany Mel for 
a walk, Rodney felt inexplicably depressed. 

Elliot looked at Amber with burning eyes. Even a blind man could feel it. It was 
impossible that Amber didn’t know. 

She had allowed Elliot to enter and leave her house freely without any refusal. 
She must have had feelings for Elliot as well. Rodney’s heart was filled with 
pain, anxiety, and anger. 

How could Amber meet one love after another? The most important thing was 
that he asked Deon to reveal the news of Elliot and Amber to Brian. Why 
didn’t the Hammond family take action? 

Rodney felt uncomfortable, but he had no choice. He stayed in Amber’s 
neighborhood every day. 

They watched as Elliot sent Amber home. After they finished their meal, they 
saw Elliot holding Mel. Amber and Ashton followed several people out for a 
walk to digest food. 

They looked happy and happy, but he was like a thousand arrows piercing his 
heart. He was in so much pain that he wanted to die. 



However, no matter how painful it was, he could not leave. He was still 
worried. Only when he saw Elliot leave with his own eyes did he let go of his 
hanging heart. 

Rodney knew that his actions were laughable. He was now just a ex-husband 
who had made a mistake after a divorce. He had no reason to interfere with 
Amber’s freedom. Staying here and watch everything, he was just looking for 
trouble. He knew everything, but he could not control his actions. 

It was already ten o’clock when Rodney returned home. When he entered the 
room, he saw Rachel sitting in the living room with a gloomy face. He was 
tired and ordered the auntie, “Help me prepare some food. I’ll take a shower 
and come out to eat.” 

Seeing him go upstairs, Rachel stopped him. “Why didn’t you answer my 
phone?” 

“Didn’t I tell you? I’m very busy. I don’t have time to eat with you.” 

“I asked your secretary. They said that you had nothing important to do today, 
but you said that you were very busy and didn’t even have time to eat. Why 
did you lie to me?” Rachel’s face darkened. 

“Don’t you think it’s too much?” 

“You’re my son, so it’s only right and proper for me to control you,” Rachel 
said with confidence. 

“So I’m your son? I thought it was your pet.” Rodney was in a bad mood and 
his words were particularly sharp. 

“Since you want to control everything about me, why don’t you lock me at 
home with a chain? In this way, you don’t have to spend so much effort all day 
under your nose.” 

Rachel was almost choked to death, but Rodney ignored her and went 
upstairs. 

The next day, Rodney was still in no mood to work. He drove to Bradoob Hill. 
Unexpectedly, he saw Mel playing ball on the lawn of the community alone. 



When he saw Mel, Rodney’s heart softened. He didn’t belong to the kind of 
person who liked children very much, but when he saw Mel, he felt very kind 
and comfortable. That familiar feeling made him very surprised. He thought 
that probably because he loved Amber, he liked his son. 

Mel didn’t notice that Rodney was standing quietly beside him and watching 
him. He was focused on playing the ball, counting “One, two, three…” 

As he patted it, the ball in his hand rolled to one side. Just then, a bald man 
came over with his son. The son was older than Mel. When he saw the ball, 
he immediately picked it up and held it in his hand. 

Mel saw someone running over with his ball. “Give it back to me.” 

“I won’t give it to you!” The child was very arrogant because of the adults. The 
bald man saw that his child would not suffer losses and did not stop him. He 
only focused on playing with his mobile phone. 

“This is my ball. Give it back to me!” Mel was anxious. 

“I won’t give it to you.” Seeing Mel reaching out to grab it, the child gave him a 
push and Mel fell to the ground. Seeing this, Rodney hurried over. 

Mel did not cry like an ordinary child after falling to the ground. Instead, she 
got up and threw herself at the child. The child reached out to push him, and 
he fell to the ground again. This time, Mel was furious. She got up and 
grabbed the child’s hand and took a bite. 

The child let go of the ball in one bite and burst into tears. He immediately 
stopped playing with his phone with his bald head. Seeing that his child’s 
hand was bitten two teeth marks, the bald man got angry. “Brat, I’ll beat you to 
death!” 

As he said this, he reached out to grab Mel, but unexpectedly, a hand reached 
out from the side and twisted the bald man’s hand backward. Rodney looked 
at him coldly. “You are an adult bullying a child, aren’t you?” 

“Let go of me! It hurts so much!” Rodney used quite a bit of strength and 
shouted with a headache. 



Rodney loosened his grip and the bald man was pushed out. He staggered a 
few steps before regaining his footing. “Is this your child? Look at how he bit 
my son’s hand.” The bald man was bluffing. 

“When your son bullied him just now, he didn’t see you being so angry?” 
Rodney sneered. 

“That… that son just pushed him a little, but your son bit my son. What if he is 
infected?” The bald man argued. “My son was bitten, so I have to take him to 
the hospital for a shot. You pay for it.” 

Looking at the bald, rogue figure, Rodney was furious. “Get out of here with 
your son before I lose my temper! Otherwise, you’ll have to bear the 
consequences!” 

The bald man couldn’t help but shiver when he saw the coldness in Rodney’s 
eyes. The person in front of him didn’t look like someone he could provoke. 
After weighing the situation, he left resentfully with his son. 

The bald man walked away with the child. Rodney picked up the ball and 
handed it to Mel. Mel looked at Rodney with admiration. “Uncle, are you a 
policeman?” 

“No.” 

“Why would the bad guy be afraid of you if he wasn’t a policeman?” 

“Because he did something wrong and felt guilty.” 

“Oh.” Mel didn’t fully understand. “Uncle, you must be good at fighting, right? 
Can you teach me?” 

“Why do you want to learn how to fight?” 

“You can protect your mother and grandfather from being bullied just because 
you’re good at fighting!” Hearing this, Rodney felt a little sad. When he was 
about to speak, he heard Ashton’s voice. “Mel! Mel!” 

“Grandpa called me. I’m leaving! Uncle, remember to teach me in the future!” 
Before leaving, Mel did not forget to let him teach him. 

In the evening, Amber came back and told Amber that he was bullied during 
the day. Amber was a little scared after hearing that. “Mel, you must be with 



your grandfather when you go out in the future. And don’t bite anyone. It’s 
wrong to bite someone.” 

“He robbed me of my things and hit me. Mom, I’m not wrong.” 

“Mom knows you’re right. We’re all kids. If he likes to play, I’ll play with him for 
a while.” 

“But after he took the ball away, I won’t play anymore. In this way, I’ll have to 
spend money to buy it. I’m very tired. I don’t want to spend money randomly.” 

Amber sighed. “It’s all my fault. I can make Mel feel the adult’s financial 
pressure at such a young age. I swear in my heart that I will never mention 
money in front of Mel in the future.” “Mom has money. What does Mel want? 
Mommy can buy it for Mel.” 

On Monday, Elliot took Felix on a business trip. At noon, he called Amber and 
said that a document was in the safe. He asked Amber to go to the company 
to find the fax for him. 

Ashton had something to do and went out. Amber was alone at home with 
Mel. After receiving a call from Elliot, he hurriedly took a taxi with Mel to the 
company. 

After entering the office, Amber ordered Mel to sit on the sofa in the lounge 
and play. Amber opened the safe box and began to search for documents for 
fax. It was the first time for Mel to go to the company, so she felt fresh 
everywhere. She touched and looked there. 

She walked out of the door with her short legs and slowly walked to the door 
of the elevator. There was a sightseeing elevator in the building where Elliot 
lived. Mel was very curious, so she pressed the button and entered the 
elevator. 

Standing in the elevator, he looked out curiously. This elevator was really fun. 
He could even see clearly that it was as fun as a sightseeing car. 

Mel took the sightseeing elevator from upstairs to downstairs in high spirits. 
When the elevator door opened, the security guard in the lobby on the first 
floor saw that he was the only child in the elevator and was shocked. 



He immediately brought Mel out. “Where’s your master? How can I let you 
take the elevator alone?” 

“My mom is working upstairs,” answered Mel in a childish voice. 

“Kid, you can’t take the elevator alone at such a young age, understand?” 

Mel shook its head. “Isn’t it just taking the elevator? It’s so fun. Why can’t I?” 

“I’m going to find mom. My mom should be anxious if she can’t find me.” 

“Tell me my mom’s phone number and name. I’ll call her to pick you up.” The 
security guard was worried about letting such a young child take the elevator. 

“My mom’s name is Amber. I don’t know her phone number,” Mel replied. 

“Then wait here. If your mother can’t find you, she will come down to pick you 
up.” 

“No, I’m looking for my mom!” Mel shook her head. 

“Listen to uncle! We’ll stay here and wait for Mom to come to you!” The 
security guard tried to appease him. How could Mel listen to him? Mom often 
said that children could not go around, and they would meet bad people. 

The bad guy especially stole children and sold them far away. He could no 
longer find his mother. 

Thinking of this, Mel began to feel scared. “Is the uncle in front of me a bad 
guy?” 

He remembered what his mother often said to him. Her mother said that when 
there were bad people, she must shout for help, so that someone would come 
to save him when they heard it. 

But there was no one around, and no one would hear him calling for help. Mel 
began to nervously think of a solution. 

Mom said she wanted to calm down and numb the bad guys. 

Mel asked herself to sit on the sofa in the hall obediently. Seeing that he was 
obedient, the security guard was very happy. After a few words with him, he 
no longer paid attention to him. 



Seeing the security guard making a phone call, Mel stood up from the sofa 
quietly and ran out. 

 


