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At five or six in the evening, the sun has lazily exuded a charming golden light.

In the lake, covered with a layer of golden lake water waves.

In a small fishing boat, Wu Xiuxin, who was in despair, and Wei Wei, a sullen agent. As of 
yesterday, they were just the right little fresh meat and an excited agent.

But I never imagined that life was like an ebb and flow and suddenly fell to the bottom. They are 
now street mice that everyone shouts and kills.

Wu Xiuxin did not dare to stay on the shore, because in a short period of time, more than a thousand 
fans have gathered in the ancient town of Danghu, no, more than a thousand former fans, to be 
exact.

They all want to come to Wu Xiuxin for justice.

The nearest media channels have also dispatched powerful officers to quickly chase him down. Ask 
embarrassing questions that made him speechless and difficult to answer.

After thinking about it, Wu Xiuxin and the agent can only temporarily ran to the center of the lake. 
It is hoped that the company can act quickly to eliminate the negative impact. At least, the **** 
who dares to discredit and step on his own must be dragged into the water to bring about a chaotic 
tearing war.

As long as the pattern of chaos can be formed, he is not afraid. Reversing black and white, out of 
nothing is the usual tearing trick. He Wu Xiuxin can also take the opportunity to expand his 
influence.



“Hey.” Wei Wei received a call from the company via satellite phone, and said with a beam of joy, 
“The public relations department has already begun to act? Spend money, throw money, we are not 
afraid of … what !?”

Only halfway through the words, Wei Wei’s face froze. Then it became pig liver color, stuttered and 
said: “You, what are you talking about? Not informed by higher authorities, do not create rumors? I 
rely on, obviously the other party discredited … Hey, hey!

Hearing these words, Wu Xiuxin and Wei Wei looked at each other, and they both saw the look of 
despair in the other person’s eyes. If even the company abandons them, then they are really the dogs 
of the family.

They were shrouded in despair, not paying attention to the fishing boat, a huge dark shadow was 
slowly diving.

“What’s the point of the kid falling down!” Wu Xiuxin finally gave a man a hand, and the 
unconvinced Yang Tian shouted.

His roar seemed to detonate the anger of the shadow below. Shadows quickly dived, and a splash of 
water splashed. Its wide back hit the bottom of the fishing boat hard.

The fishing boat rocked violently, and Wu Xiuxin and Wei Wei could not stand steadily on the boat, 
and they staggered. Scared of face, he screamed: “What’s the situation?”

Responding to them was the next violent bang.

“Boom!”

The fishing boat trembled violently. Wei Wei’s satellite phone flew out, and disappeared without a 
trace.

“Wow!”



A huge black figure leaped from the water and jumped to a height of three or four meters before 
hitting the water. Tons of heavy weight set off a huge wave, and the water wave rolled into the 
cabin, so that the two were wet.

“Oh, blame, monster!”

Wu Xiuxin Wei Wei screamed sternly, his legs fell softly into the cabin. They are all scared and 
faceless, fighting straight.

Everyone has seen the horror movie, but if you really want to be in it, the taste will be ecstasy.

See, hell.

What kind of monster is this? Is it a prop arranged by the film crew? No, the surroundings were 
empty and half a boat was not seen.

“Wow!”

The monster came out of the water again, and the huge body was lying on the side of the ship. The 
poor fishing boat was slanted at sixty degrees. Their lives are at stake, and in anxiety, some 
potential has erupted. They grabbed the groove on the other side of the ship to avoid the tragedy of 
sliding directly into the monster’s mouth.

It was at this moment that they really saw the monster’s appearance.

It was a giant catfish that was dark and ridiculously large, and its tentacles were as thick as a child’s 
arms. Its open **** mouth could easily swallow a strong man.

It twisted its huge body, trying to overturn the fishing boat with its weight. The fishing boat creaked 
every time it was shaken.

“Help me.” Wei Wei screamed like a soprano.

But he just called twice, but he found that Wu Xiuxin was breaking his finger.



“Xiu Xin, you, what are you doing?” Wei Wei resisted diligently.

“You are fatter, and it will leave when it is full.” Wu Xiuxin’s handsome face was full of terrifying 
colors. “Wei Wei, didn’t you say that you are willing to do anything for me? Not happy. Let go! “

“I ~ **** ~” Wei Wei was angry, and his voice growled sharply, “Do you have a conscience for 
your ****, Lao Tzu has kept the wind and the rain covered for so long for your back and forth. Your 
mother actually wanted me Go feed the monster? Lao Tzu fights with you. “

“Wei Wei, what are you doing? No bite …”

“I’ll just bite me, bite, what can you do with me … ah ~ youma ~ forced to a wolf?”

With life at stake, a pair of allies who had previously been embarrassed by the crime began a torture 
war.

…

“Buzz!”

A speedboat is flying fast against the water.

Wearing a pair of small sunglasses, the little ferret stood on the bridge and pulled the steering wheel 
with two claws, driving the speedboat skillfully. Look at its calm and calm look, the appearance of 
the old god, obviously these days have not done such a thing.

As for the throttle, its short legs are out of reach, so it uses a fluffy tail to roll a thick and long stick 
against the throttle.

By the way, it took time to take a sip of Coke.

“Go behind it.” Wang Yan gestured. Wearing sunglasses, naked upper body, showing a sturdy but 
beautiful muscle. The big box he had been carrying had been opened, and one of them was a giant 
sniper cannon.



It uses a folding “portable” design, the barrel and **** can be folded to save space. This is also the 
helplessness of the designer, because once the sniper gun is fully deployed, the total length reaches 
an astonishing 3.87 meters.

A gun of nearly four meters, the appearance is indeed a gun. But in fact, it has left the scope of the 
gun, and it can be called a gun! It weighs only 136 kilograms just by the weight of the empty box.

This is not a gun designed for ordinary people. Even if the weightlifting champion comes, it can 
barely lift this gun, and it can’t suppress its terrible recoil.

Wang Yan held a cigarette in the corner of his mouth, enjoying the cool and comfortable feeling of 
water drops hitting his body. Just ten seconds later, he unfolded the gun and placed it behind the 
speedboat.

Then he pushed a box of bullets into the magazine from the bottom.

Bullets, no, or shells. It has a diameter of 5 cm and a length of nearly 40 cm. A magazine and three 
shells add up to more than ten kilograms.

“Buzz!”

Driven by the little ferret, the speedboat made a huge arc on the water. A flick of the tail stirred up a 
large splash. Then he slowed down and pointed the giant catfish at the tail of the speedboat.

Wang Yan smothered the cigarette butts and lay down on the boat with his shoulder against the butt. 
The two legs even touched the stainless steel legs of the speedboat chair.

Then, through the sight, he put the middle cross on the head of the catfish.

“Xiao Xue, remember to record!”

Wang Yan shouted and made a gesture. He is prepared to leave some evidence. Because this giant 
catfish is the D-class demon he has been looking for for several days. News from some inquiries, 
and today I saw it attacking human beings.



As a member of the National African Affairs Bureau, he has the right to arrest, try, or kill him on the 
spot.

However, in order to be cautious, Wang Yan asked Xiao Ferret to record a picture on the side, so as 
not to be unreasonable.

“Squeak ~” Little Ferret held a mobile phone and turned on the video mode. Made an OK gesture to 
Wang Yan.

One person and one mink ears, some cotton cloth has been stuffed in advance.

“boom!”

Wang Yan fired a shot without hesitation, and three or four meters of flame erupted from the 
muzzle.

The loud noise caused a buzz in his ears.

The huge recoil, shocked Wang Yan’s body full of blood, like a punch. Fortunately, his posture was 
very stable and connected with the boat.

Recoil through his body, acting on the speedboat, clattering it forward a dozen meters.

At the same time, the bullet flew over the surface of the water at tens of centimeters at a speed that 
was invisible to the naked eye, and the airflow formed by the violent rotation stirred a clear white 
mark on the water surface.

As if it were just a moment, the head of the giant catfish opposite exploded.

Blood, minced meat, splattered all over the sky.
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The head of the catfish ’s water tank was directly shattered into pieces. The bullet remained 
unrelenting, and a basketball-sized hole burst out of the bottom of the fishing boat, and FRP 
fragments splashed around.

The world seemed to be silent for a moment under this shot. The catfish essence without his head 
can no longer catch the fishing boat, and his body slowly slips into the lake, stirring up a splash.

“Slam!”

The fishing boat, which was almost upright, fell back into the lake with a loud noise. Wu Xiuxin 
and Wei Wei fell into the guise of Venus, and they had eight kinds of meat. Their eyes were sullenly 
and stupidly sitting in the boat with blood and flesh on their faces.

The tremendous changes one after another seemed to have crushed their wits.

Guru!

In the big hole in the bottom of the ship, the lake water poured back and forth, and the fishing boat 
sank slowly.

“call!”

Wang Yan took out the cotton cloth in his ear and sighed heavily. Even if cotton was stuffed in the 
ear, the gunshot almost shattered the ear drum.

fierce!

This power is too fierce.

Wang Yan dares to make sure that even if a tank is in front of him, he is confident that he will shoot 
a pair in a single shot. He could n’t even believe that there was anything else in the world that could 
block the gun.



This D-class demon, in fact, can already be regarded as a master in the water. But under such a 
powerful sniper gun, it is as fragile as tofu.

The only distressed thing is that this bullet went down and 50,000 yuan was gone.

“Squeak!” The little ferret fell into the cabin and climbed up, shaking like drunk old wine. Eyed 
Venus to creak and protest.

“Okay, this D-class inner dan of this catfish essence, after refining into the essence of inner dan, all 
belong to you.” Wang Yan drew a cigarette and said generously, “Shall we go sailing soon?”

“Squeak!”

Little Ferret jumped into the driver’s seat with a smile on his eyebrows, drove away in an arc on the 
speedboat.

“It’s cheaper for you, two million is better.” Wang Yan stood at the stern, his feet like nails on the 
ship, and his lines were still.

“Squeak!” Little Ferret’s smile came to an abrupt end, squeaky protests, and raised a paw.

“One million? Too little, too little.” Wang Yan shook his head and said, “A D-class inner dan, the 
market price is between 80 and 1.2 million, and the refining and processing fee is 200,000. You are 
now anyway How much does it cost me to make a lot of money? I’m almost too poor to sell my 
kidneys. One and a half million, Xiao Xue, I find you look pretty. “

“Tell.” Little Ferret pouted his lips and creaked with a series of claws on his hips. In this task, it also 
contributes. It should be considered a team, nothing is useless.

“I haven’t heard of it in my life, and it’s also a team to play war darlings to do tasks.” Wang Yan 
shrugged and said.

“Squeak ~” Little Ferret hugged his paws and rolled his eyes. “Tell ~” said that she hadn’t heard of 
it in her life, and she was so poor that she would come to fight against the owner of pet food.



Wang Yan’s face blushed and was despised by a small mink. It’s really a poor man with short hair 
and long hair. But there is no way, who calls himself poor. In desperation, he shouted his old face 
and said, “It’s done, it’s because of our relationship, the price of friendship is 1.2 million.”

“Squeak ~~” Little Ferret smirked with pride. It means that the sister is afraid of you, 1.2 million is 
1.2 million.

At this time, the fishing boat had sunk into the water. Wu Xiuxin and Wei Wei recovered their 
minds and jumped out one step in advance. But they were all glaring at each other in the water, and 
no one dared to get close to them.

A “buzz” sound. The little ferret drove the speedboat, and a beautiful side-sliding boat stopped.

“It turns out you!” Wang Yan threw a rope and rescued them all. Strangely said, “Don’t your team 
want to shoot a TV series, how come you have time to fish in the lake?”

Wu Xiuxin and Wei Wei, who climbed onto the speedboat, looked at each other, and their tears were 
about to fall. Then they looked at Wang Yan very disgustedly. What is free fishing? Not all because 
of you …

However, they saw Wang Yan’s “giant cannon” erected on the stern, but they didn’t dare to put one 
fart. I have seen the power of this “big gun” before, and the head of such a powerful monster 
suddenly disappeared.

If this guy sent evil spirits together, would n’t they find the body?

Seeing their strange expressions, Wang Yan was too lazy to ask. Beginning to deal with the body of 
catfish essence, first contacted the director Zhao of the unit through a phone with satellite function.

Trouble sending him a logistics staff to handle the follow-up matters.

For example, this catfish essence is a D-class monster, and it still has some research value. There 
are also two guys, Wu Xiuxin, who have witnessed the incident from beginning to end and have had 
close contact with Catfish Essence.



According to some disposal procedures of the National African Bureau, they need to be quarantined 
for a period of time. Because some supernatural creatures may carry some super strong viruses and 
bacteria. Or maybe they will have some weird spells, hypnotize, seize and so on.

And they have to receive certain psychotherapy and confidential education. In short, they don’t 
want to return to society in a short time. Even after going through the process and returning to the 
society, there will be various restrictions within a few years, and the National African Bureau has 
specialized personnel to follow up on these matters.

Of course, these jobs have nothing to do with Wang Yan. He belongs to the front-line combatants 
and only needs to do his own job. No need to deal with those trivial sequelae.

After making a phone call, Wang Yan jumped into the lake, picked up the body of the catfish 
essence, and tied the body to the side of the speedboat with a rope. Then he broke open his chest 
and abdomen and took out an egg the size of which had a faint glimmer of Nedan.

Sure enough, it was only D-class Neidan, whether in terms of appearance or head, it was far worse 
than the original two-tailed fox.

Such a **** and cruel process fell in the eyes of Wu Xiuxin and Wei Wei, and even scared them to 
look pale and silent.

Wang Yan carefully collected the million-dollar inner princess, and had nothing to do with it. He 
focused on Wu Xiuxin and looked at it with his chin in his eyes.

Is this a big star? I heard that big stars are very rich. Earn tens of millions of billions a year, just like 
playing.

Six million yuan owed to the unit, Wang Yan was so poor that his eyes were red.

“You, what do you want to do?” Wu Xiuxin, who is like a chicken, is sitting on a chair with his legs, 
his eyes scared like a little rabbit.

In my heart, this murderous horror demon doesn’t have that orientation, right? Woo, sometimes it ’s 
a tragedy that a man looks beautiful.



Fortunately, Wang Yan did not understand the mind-reading ability, otherwise he would really throw 
him back into the lake and let him die.

“Cough!” Wang Yan said solemnly, “You two, do you know that there is a quality in this world, 
called the Eng Tuanbao? Forget it, just look at the two of you and you know, it must be the kind 
After crossing the river and demolishing the bridge, the villain turned over and refused to recognize 
the second-hand goods. Even if you fight to save you, you will not be grateful. “

Wang Yan said that he must throw the two of them off the boat.

“Big brother, please. Don’t, please, please.” Wu Xiuxin was so scared that he was peeing, and 
begged pitifully, “I know what I’m grateful for, thank you, big brother, for saving me. I, I’m willing 
to agree with myself.”

“Yes, yes. Brother, you are a **** soldier, and you are brave. People are grateful for you, and they 
can do anything.” Weiwei, the little fat man, is also flattering and flattering.

Wang Yan’s face is dark. Why are these two brain circuits so strange? One must agree with one’s 
own body, and the other one can ask others to do anything.

“Forget it, my boat is too small for you two big Buddhas.” Wang Yan waved his hands impatiently 
and said, “Come on and find your own fishing boat.”

Wu Xiuxin and Wei Wei were so scared that they were out of their bodies. What kind of joke? Has 
the fishing boat sank to the bottom of the lake now? What’s more, this lake is too terrible. There are 
such monsters three to four meters long and one or two tons in the lake!

Let them go to the lake, this is to kill them. At this moment, they were full of fear for the lake water. 
Then they are begging for mercy.

Wang Yan is almost losing patience. It’s really not easy for these two goods to be mixed up to the 
point where they are today. There is not even a little vision. Without saying a word, he started 
rubbing his “big gun” aside!

Fortunately, Wei Wei’s eyes lighted up and smiled: “Brother, I’m sorry for your life-saving grace. I 
think your speedboat is too small to meet your heroic identity and temperament. Well, the younger 
brother is willing to contribute one million and talk about losing filial piety. “



This is ridiculous.

Wang Yan looked at him just now, lit a cigarette and pondered and said, “I’m a small boat, but it’s 
okay to take another one.”

This time, Wu Xiuxin was also revealed. Hurry to say: “What a joke! One million, one million can 
buy a decent ship? How can a man with a hero like a big brother be so stubborn? The younger 
brother is willing to take out two million to buy equipment for the big brother. . “

In a word, it was stern and generous. It is worthy of being an actor. Some acting skills are not based 
solely on eating.

“Good, but I can take one more person in this boat.” Wang Yan said embarrassedly, “I just promised 
a little fat just now.”

Wei Wei felt excited and hurriedly said, “Brother, I am willing to pay 2.5 million.”

“Three million!” Wu Xiuxin looked at him proudly.

Wei Wei’s face suddenly turned pale, and he couldn’t afford any more money. After thinking for a 
while, he simply said horizontally: “Brother, 2.5 million is all my cash flow. I support my brother to 
buy equipment and fight monsters, and contribute to the motherland and the people. But Wu Xiuxin 
debuted for three years and his net worth At least hundreds of millions of dollars. Even if the 
current working capital in the bank card is at least 8 million or 9 million! Three million, he is 
looking down on you, brother! “

“Huh?” Wang Yan glanced at him. If nothing happened, he lifted a large gun of a few hundred 
kilograms and spit out the smoke ring. “Xiu Xin, do you really look down on me?”

…
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Wu Xiuxin was full of excitement, and his face was covered with pleasing colors: “Big Brother, Big 
Brother! I just prepared to say that I would donate 8 million of working capital to Big Brother to 
buy equipment. If it is not enough, I can Some real estate, funds, etc.

Useless things are sold. “

If you do n’t have any money, you can make it again, but there is only one life. In this vast lake, he 
was going to do something to destroy the corpse, it was too easy.

“It’s almost enough.” Wang Yan wiped the big gun away from the water stains and threw it aside. 
Threw the satellite phone to Wu Xiuxin, “Is this not blackmailing you?”

“No, absolutely not.” Wu Xiuxin and Wei Wei shook their heads like rattles, and said sincerely, 
“I’m thanking Brother for his life-saving grace and willing to support Brother’s just cause.”

Just kidding, now it’s the man who made the knife and I made the fish. Dare to say a blackmail, 
where can there be a life?

Little Ferret took a mobile phone and recorded this scene. By then, even if they wanted to rake, they 
wouldn’t have the chance.

“Little fat man, you have to keep some cash for yourself.” Wang Yan patted his shoulder with care 
and said, “Keep your own half a million.”

“Big Brother! You are so good.” Wei Wei burst into tears and choked with excitement. If this scene 
is seen by people who don’t know the details, they really think it is a pair of good brothers with 
deep affection.

“Xiu Xin, are you hungry? I will catch a fish for you to eat.” Wang Yan was also kind to Wu Xiuxin, 
who contributed 8 million yuan.

“Brother, you are so kind to me. Woo ~” Wu Xiuxin thought of the catfish essence as soon as he 
heard eating fish. But had to pretend to be a magnificent pair of emperors, grateful.



Then transfer money or something, all in five or six minutes. On Wang Yan’s bank card, 10 million 
yuan was suddenly added. This made him unable to sigh with emotion. This group of entertainers is 
really rich.

If you encounter this a few days earlier, you do n’t have to ask the unit to borrow money when 
buying a house.

After more than an hour.

An armed transport helicopter drove by, and the fully-armed secret service personnel filled the ice 
catfish body with some ice packs and packed them away. Also taken away were Wu Xiuxin and Wei 
Wei.

“Brother ~ Take care.” “Brother ~ I will miss you.”

On the helicopter, they waved goodbye to Wang Yan. Really reveal the true feelings, acting 
bursting. There was no way, those guys who were fully armed special forces even had to salute him. 
They can see that the “donated” money is

Don’t want to come back again. Rather than this, it is better to establish some “friendship” with him 
honestly!

…

As the helicopter gradually went away in the roar of the propeller, Danghu also returned to 
tranquility.

The setting sun had reached the horizon, reflecting the whole lake with red, as if covered with a 
magnificent red gauze. A group of egrets soared in groups in the sky towards the habitat.

Wang Yan was driving the boat, and the little ferret snuggled on his shoulders.

One person, one mink, and one lone boat, heading towards the ancient town of Danghu in the light 
of the setting sun.



…

In a high-end business office building in a big city.

A beautiful girl in a white shirt with a pleated pattern and a pleated plain skirt is calmly packing up 
her desk and preparing to go home from work. When she saw a ceramic cup beside the monitor, a 
faint mist filled her eyes unstoppably.

That’s a cup with hot water on it, and patterns will appear. It has been months since the incident, 
and she still remembers clearly what he said when he gave him this cup: “Xiaowei. You are not 
allowed to eat cold drinks when you work in the company.

Drink more hot water or your stomach will hurt again. I will definitely look at you. “

She hesitated and poured a glass of boiling water with a water dispenser. On the plain white cup, a 
boy with a very sunny smile gradually appeared, and he was also accompanied by the side, 
“Xiaowei is good ~~ praise one.”

For a time, her tear glands did not know what was poked. Tears sourly that tears are coming out.

It’s been several months since I broke up, and I don’t know what happened to him. Have you found 
a good job, have you talked about a new girlfriend, and have you taken good care of yourself.

The scenes of the past are clearly like what happened yesterday.

“Wow ~ Someone broke a new picture of the goddess of the lake.” Several girls in the company 
formed a group and screamed excitedly. “It’s so handsome, this look is really ecstatic.” . “

Another goddess of the lake!

Xiaowei couldn’t help but shook her head. The women in the company were crazy this afternoon, 
brushing their phones and forums endlessly. Focusing on the so-called Danghu male god. In her 
ears, calluses were almost heard.



“Xiaowei Xiaowei, come and see, this male **** is really handsome and handsome.” A girl jumped 
excitedly there, “No, no, tomorrow is exactly Saturday, I quickly book a ticket to live in Danghu 
Ancient Town In two days, I might meet my male god.

As long as I can see him with my own eyes, I will be worth it if I do n’t marry someone in my life. “

“You are so crazy, it’s a good idea not to go to the ancient town of Danghu.” Another girl was also 
excited, “If I can meet him, I will rush to hug him. With my beautiful appearance, maybe Let him 
fall in love with me. “

“Cut …” A group of beautiful young girls condemned her. Then they invited Xiaowei to go 
together.

“You go play, I still haven’t finished reading the book at home.” Xiao Wei quietly refused with a 
smile, and then took her bag and took the cup and said goodbye to leave.

Her departure, though, made the girls feel a little sorry. But soon, he fell into a fierce discussion on 
various data and intelligence of the Danghu male god.

…

Wang Yan returned the speedboat, and then fled in embarrassment. He finally escaped from the 
ancient town of Danghu and drove the Land Rover to find his way home. On the way back, he still 
felt a little nervous.

He hasn’t encountered it in his life, and he was chased and blocked by the army of two or three 
thousand women on the pier. The dense crowd surrounded him on the pier, shouting various slogans 
in his mouth.

Danghu male god?

Wang Yan’s mouth twitched uncontrollably. Who nicknamed him for this? It’s really incredible!

Fortunately, some of Wang Yan’s previous initiatives still have some effect. At least when the gangs 
were besieging the wharf, they were still very disciplinary and took the initiative to abide by the 
security and civil police order maintenance.



When they evacuated themselves, they did not act excessively. It seems that under their influence, 
their overall quality has improved a lot.

…

Almost at the same time, in the waters where Wang Yan snatched the catfish essence.

A torrent of water spewed out of the water, a fountain was held on the water by an invisible force, 
and the waves continued to spray in all directions.

On the transparent umbrella-shaped spray, stood a sturdy man stepping on King Kong boots, 
wearing golden scale armor, and holding a three-pointed two-edged sword in his hand. He had bare 
hair on his head, a square face, and thick lips. If it’s not a thick layer next to the ear

Heavy and dense scale armor, the skin showed a light golden color.

It looks like a general in a costume drama.

What it looks like now is more like some monsters in the old version of “Journey to the West”.

He arched his nose, smelled the slight **** smell, and immediately showed his sorrowful color: 
“Brother Catfish, my brother came a step late, and you were harmed by an adulterer. The younger 
brother, the younger brother, will definitely replace You revenge. “

With his sorrowful cry, the water around the body was turbulent, the waves rolled, and a cloud of 
hundreds of meters in diameter gradually condensed. Soon there was a rain in the ground.

“Damn mankind, I must take your head and pay tribute to my catfish brothers!”

…
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The next day.

It started the first rain after Liqiu.

The abundant rainwater took away the heat accumulated in the hot summer.

Throughout the morning, it was cool, clean and comfortable. On the balcony of the house, there was 
dripping rain outside the window. Wang Yan and his dad took a pot of tea one by one, set up the 
chess game, and enjoyed the coolness after the autumn rain.

There is not much talk between father and son, and they don’t care about winning or losing in the 
game. They are more enjoying the rare peace between father and son. Of course, the little ferret is 
not so elegant. At the moment, he was lying lazily on the sofa, tilting Erlang’s legs, holding a jar of 
Coke, and watching a bubble romance.

Seeing the strong feelings, he also pretended to take a tissue and wiped the corners of his eyes. God 
knows whether it is wiping tears or shit. Because it immediately opened a tube of potato chips with 
its claws, it was really joyous to crunch and eat.

A few games on the balcony.

Wang Yan took out a box of cigarettes and habitually handed one. The dad hesitated for a moment 
and then picked it up. This is also based on his son’s situation, he dare to smoke at home.

“It’s almost ten o’clock, hasn’t my mother returned from shopping?” Wang Yan asked, drinking tea 
slightly strangely.

“She, I like to choose dishes in the activity center these days.” The dad said lightly. “It’s just a few 
dishes, and I have to go back and forth to choose each time. One choice is most of the morning.”

Ha ha! Wang Yan couldn’t help but laugh. The activity center of the community has always been the 
concentration of three aunts and six wives of each household. In the morning, a group of aunts 



usually gossiping about gossip and choosing food together. In the afternoon, it was chess playing 
chess, Mahjong Mahjong. In the evening, the activity center began to gather for leisure and cool, 
dancing square dance.

As far as Wang Yan knows, my mother used to rarely take part in gathering and choosing dishes and 
gossip. The reason is very simple. In the past, the house was poorly mixed and the conditions were 
average. Others will always think, alas, Aunt Wang’s family, you’re too good at living, just buy this 
a la carte at home? In other words, Aunt Wang ’s family, I just bought some organic vegetables. You 
take a handful of them back to stir fry with Lao Wang and give him some freshness.

Oh, aunt Wang, my wild eel will not kill me, can you do me a favor?

Hey, this is the boss of the construction team under my husband, a few native chickens brought 
from his hometown. Tell him not to take it or not, it’s bothersome to death.

At this time, there will always be ten thousand grass and mud horses running wildly in my mother’s 
heart.

Well now, my son has a good time. Since the Secretary of the Municipal Party Committee came to 
visit, various families have come to give gifts, and the relationship between them has continued.

This mother, who has suppressed for many years, will naturally not miss this rare opportunity to 
show off.

Wang Yan is talking to his father. The mother is carrying a large vegetable basket and carrying a 
large cloth bag, breathlessly returning: “Lao Wang Lao Wang, you don’t even know that you have a 
wooden pimple to help me carry things , Exhausted me. “

The dad choked off the cigarette as soon as he obeyed, and Fartdian ran over to help. Carrying the 
big cloth bag and finding it dead, he wondered strangely: “Xiaoying, what are these big bags?”

“Don’t bother me, let me take a sip first.” My mother took a pot of Longjing tea as barley herbal tea 
and poured half of the pot. His face glowed and said, “Some of it was wild pork brought by 
relatives in the old Xie family’s mountain. The old Xie family’s daughter-in-law said that they 
couldn’t eat so much at home. They were afraid of waste and gave me a fat leg. Son, for a while 
Your mother got you braised wild boar. “



The old Xie family is a cadre, and the old Xie family’s daughter-in-law has always looked like a 
superior. She knew very well in her heart, it was the old Xie family’s vigorous stunt her.

She was so refreshed that she was full of blood and blood, and she was full of energy. He turned 
over the cloth bag again and said, “This is some nutritional and health care products sent back from 
abroad by the children of Lao Zhou’s family. It is said that it is very good to eat people. This is a 
relative of Lao Li’s country. The native chicken has been killed and washed. It is said to supplement 
Xiao Yan’s body. “

Wang Yan was almost laughing. It’s no wonder that my mom went out to choose a meal all 
morning. This feeling is to choose and choose other people’s dishes.

But she just likes it. Wang Yan is also happy when she looks at her eyebrows and smiles.

While she started to cook, Wang Yan helped her and said, “Mom. The developer, Mr. Zheng, called 
to say that Villa No. 1 of Shanshui Renjia has been picked up and we can move in anytime.”

In fact, the villa I bought could have been moved in at any time. However, Wang Yan had to solve 
the monster’s things first before he could rest assured.

“Move the villa to live?” Mom, who was still excited a few days ago, hesitated and said, “Shall we 
not be so anxious? Anyway, this old house is quite used to living.”

Zhimu Moruozi. Where did Wang Yan still not know his mother ’s thoughts, she could n’t help but 
say with a smile: “It ’s not that you do n’t want to move out of the country to live, you ca n’t bear 
the neighbors, you can come back and see it anytime.

“There are no buses there, which is quite inconvenient.” Mom just got all the attention and 
flattering. If you want to live by the lake, you can’t bear the spiritual enjoyment here.

“It’s simple, I remember Dad has a driver’s license?” Wang Yan said with a smile, “When we buy a 
car, when do you want to come back and choose a dish? Just let Dad take you back, but it’s just 
twenty Minute drive. “

Yesterday, Wu Xiuxin received a total of 10 million yuan in life-saving money. Even if the company 
paid back 6 million, there are still 4 million left. In this small place in our house, I want to buy more 
than 4 million luxury cars without buying them.



The mother was a little emotional and shouted, “Lao Wang, what do you think?”

Wang Yan knew that Dad could n’t have an idea, so he said, “Mom, you ca n’t let me buy a house 
and throw it there and get moldy, right? You also saw that house, and the vacant land on the right 
side of the lake and mountains belongs Our family. In the circle, we can develop a small private 
vegetable garden, grow some organic vegetables, and raise chickens, ducks, geese and other poultry. 
“

My mother’s eyes lighted up at once. I have lived in the city for so many years. I have been working 
in the unit for a long time.

Only this year, it is not easy for the people in the city to live the idyllic life in Nanshan.

“We still have a wharf in my house. I can get a small boat for my dad to play with.” Wang Yan said 
with a smile. “Let him go fishing and catch shrimp. They are all wild and nutritious good things, 
even buying food. You can save. “

Dad’s eyes also showed the yearning. I have worked hard all my life, and I have thought about the 
leisure time without worrying about money and taking care of myself.

It’s such a pleasant life to fish and fish, climb mountains and flowers.

As for going to work, Wang Yan has already put it on the laid-off list anyway, so for now. Tired for 
most of my life, why not take a vacation?

The family moved together and moved to the villa this afternoon.

At noon, Wang Yan received another phone call during dinner, which was called by Secretary Sun 
Zhihui. As soon as he connected the phone, he smiled and said: “Danghu male god, congratulations 
and congratulations.”

After this period of contact, Wang Yan was very familiar with Sun Zhizhi, and said with a helpless 
smile: “Brother Sun, are you ridiculing me? I am bothered by the annoyance. Now I go fishing in 
the ancient town of Danghu. Dare. “



“Just talk about it, success is a good thing how many people can’t think of it.” Sun Zhizhi said with 
a smile, “Secretary Tian asked me to give you a call to express my gratitude and condolences. 
Thank you yesterday, otherwise If there is a stampede, the trouble will be even greater. Besides, 
thanks to your blessing, the number of tourists in the ancient town of Danghu has doubled 
yesterday. According to estimates, the number of tourists will surge to a brand new peak in this 
small holiday this and tomorrow , Most of them came to you. “

Wang Yan was also a little crying and laughing, originally intended to solve small things, but did 
not expect to cause such a sensational effect. He checked this morning. Yesterday, the search 
volume of Danghu male **** as a keyword of the character reached the first in the character search 
list, and the second in the total search list.

And the event is still fermenting, Wang Yan has every reason to believe that this search volume will 
reach the first in the entire network. This is really terrible data, and it can be seen from this that the 
speed of information dissemination is so fast that it is astonishing.

Thanks to Wang Yan’s blessings, the search volume for the few words of Danghu Ancient Town and 
the city’s name also increased significantly.

No wonder Sun Zhizhi would laugh so happy, obviously Secretary Tian is also very concerned 
about this.

“Secretary Tian said, I want to hire you as the official image spokesperson of the ancient town of 
Danghu.” Sun Zhizhi slightly ridiculed and said, “You are a wizard who can drive the rapid growth 
of our city’s GDP by your face. Make some contribution. “

Wang Yan’s face is all black, what is this called? Pull GPD on your face! Is this what a municipal 
party secretary should say?
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But then again, you can eat on your face. How many men are you dreaming of? Wang Yan couldn’t 
help but think about it. If he can really pull the GDP of his hometown, it will be a win-win situation.



Money is a good thing. If you have a lot of money, you can collect more essence of Neidan to help 
you accelerate your cultivation and growth. With greater strength, you can better protect yourself, 
protect your family, and contribute to the bureau and the country.

What’s more, even if you don’t want to be famous, you are now famous. Now that you have 
enjoyed the “troubles” of celebrities, why can’t you earn some celebrity benefits?

After thinking for a while, Wang Yan said: “I will go back and ask the leader of the unit. If the 
leader thinks there is no problem, I will try it. But the ugly saying is that in the front, the 
contribution is the contribution. The money can’t be less.

“Then how could it save you money.” Sun Zhizhi patted his chest over the phone and said, “I will 
leave this matter to me, and I will come up with a cooperation plan.”

After talking with Secretary Sun, the family members had eaten after dinner. The mother went out 
and bought some foil paper, and the incense candles and the like came back and recruited three 
aunts and six wives to fold some paper ingots together.

In the afternoon, the family drove directly to the villa area of Shanshui Renjia.

Xiao Li, as the director, and Zheng Tiesheng came to greet him. After a simple superstition, the 
mother started to pick up the house.

As a luxuriously decorated villa, basic living facilities are readily available. The lamps, sanitary 
ware and decorative materials used are all international famous brand materials with guaranteed 
quality.

To this end, Zheng Tiesheng also brought a set of materials list. Some closets, doors, windows, and 
floors are made of rosewood. In the words of Zheng Tiesheng, the prices of raw materials for 
mahogany have fallen in recent years, and he has taken advantage of a large number of them.

If there is a need for Wang Yan, he still has some more authentic red rosewood logs, which can be 
cheaply transferred to Wang Yan to build some Chinese furniture.

As for wanting some better rosewood furniture, Huanghuali furniture or something, there is no raw 
material to build. I can only go to Amoy …



Wang Yan can only sigh about it. The rich people of this year are really extravagant. Fortunately, he 
has no demand for those precious furniture. Even if he has money, he should use it on the blade. It 
is the last thing to think of ways to improve his strength.

…

at the same time.

In a remote small fishing village in Danghu, a group of girls from a big city appeared in a car. This 
is almost never happened in such a small village.

A leading apple-faced girl negotiated with an honest fisherman uncle for a moment, and 
successfully wrapped the uncle’s fishing boat with a thousand dollars for two days.

Then a group of youthful and beautiful girls gathered on the fishing boat, and began to enjoy a trip 
to the lake.

“Sisters, is my plan okay?” The girl with apple face enjoys the fresh and natural air on the lake after 
the rain, and said slightly, “Now the ancient town of Danghu is overcrowded, even if the inn can’t 
even increase the price at night There are more and more male **** fans. You said, in this case, 
give the Danghu male **** a few guts, he would not dare to go to the ancient town! “

“Xiao Yun is right. According to the analysis of the data, the male **** is dressed in a casual sun, 
carrying a fishing gear bag, and likes to drive a speedboat out of the lake.” A girl with glasses and a 
serious analysis said, “He should be a more enjoyable boat. I do n’t like the lively people. We will 
ask the fisherman uncle a while later, where are there often big fish? We go to those places more 
often, and the chance of encountering a male **** is higher. “

The girls expressed their opinions eloquently.

But speaking of it, it’s better to say that they came to engage in activities together rather than seeing 
the male **** of Danghu. Playing in this pleasant lake with fresh air, even if you can’t meet the 
male god, is also a journey worth remembering.



“Xiaowei, what are you in a daze?” The glasses girl nudged a plain skirt girl wearing a sunhat. 
“Sometimes you come out to play, don’t blame your face all day long.”

“Well.” Xiaowei tried hard to make a smile. In fact, now she can’t laugh even if she wants to laugh. 
Originally, she didn’t care about the goddess of Danghu at all, and yesterday she rejected the 
proposal of her colleagues to invite her to play in Danghu.

Unexpectedly, after returning home from work, the news hype overwhelmingly inevitably caused 
the screen of friends to be bombarded. It was a picture of him docked in a pier on a speedboat, 
wearing a sun hat and holding a cute little pet.

Under the setting sun, the red sunlight shone brightly on his face. Even though he was wearing 
sunglasses, Xiaowei recognized him at a glance. Since my sophomore year, I have talked about my 
boyfriend for three years. Even if the change is great, the temperament is still hard to admit.

After stunned for more than ten seconds, she could not believe that she began to study in detail the 
various data of the male **** of the lake.

Today’s human flesh search engine has reached the point of reaching its peak, and some of Wang 
Yan’s information has become more and more perfect. For example, his name is his native place, 
and he graduated from a certain university. The current occupation is the commissioner of the 
inspection team of the State Council in East China, and is a cadre at the department level!

Xiaowei is 100% sure that the goddess Danghu is his boyfriend, no, Wang Yan, his ex-boyfriend!

She was a little bit unimaginable. It took only a few months to break up. How could he have such a 
drastic change? The image, height and temperament have become so perfect. And also admitted to 
the civil service, directly jumped to the level of the department.

It’s as weird as dreaming.

Obsessed, Xiaowei didn’t know what psychology he was out of, so he decided to come to Danghu 
with his colleagues to see what happened.

I don’t know whether it is joy or sorrow.



“Look, look, the egrets who catch fish in the shore plants?”

“so beautiful.”

The girls picked up the phone camera and took pictures one after another.

At this time, the rain was over and the sun was shining. It is the most refreshing and comfortable 
time on the lake. Especially the water vapor on the lake is plentiful, and a rainbow is set off under 
the vision.

“Wow!”

A big fish jumped out of the water to ventilate, and the tom fell into the water again, splashing a 
huge wave.

Such a beautiful scene was taken by a girl and posted to a forum on the Internet called Danghu 
Male God Base Camp. To be blunt, this time, even if I can’t see the male **** of Danghu and can 
enjoy such a wonderful lake view, it is worthwhile.

This post has received many people’s approval and reply, and a small fire has also added some 
popularity to the ancient town of Danghu.

“Wow, look, a beautiful villa complex.”

Turn around a long beach poking straight into the lake. In a harbour with dense woods and 
mountains and water, a cluster of villas is looming in the clouds. This made the girls all kinds of 
marvels, but also some envy.

If you can hide in such a landscape like a fairyland, that kind of life would be perfect.

“Buzz!”

A roar of the engine of a white fishing boat pulled out a long white water mark and drilled into a 
pier extending from the villa complex.



“The days of the rich are really at ease.” The apple-faced girl said with some jealousy. “We rarely 
enjoy this beautiful lake view, we are so happy to keep up with heaven. People live in fairyland 
every day . “

…

At this time, when Wang Yan and his father and mother started to push their new homes, Director 
Liu of the police station called and said that he had arrived. Wang Yan put down his work, took a 
cigarette and took the little ferret, and walked out of his villa to the dock.

Before going to the ancient town of Danghu, Wang Yan had no choice but to call Director Liu and 
ask him to help hire a speedboat. Over the past few days, Wang Yan has been out of the lake 
frequently. Wang Yan enjoys the quiet and comfortable feeling of being at ease.

Since the holiday is not over yet, just simply play and relax.

As soon as Wang Yan walked to the pier, Director Liu jumped from the fishing boat and said with a 
red face: “Brother Wang, there are too many people coming to the lake today to play. Seven or eight 
speedboats It ’s all for everyone. This fishing boat is my friend ’s, and I borrowed it directly. 
Forgive me. “

At first glance, Wang Yan saw that the fishing boat had to be more than six meters long, and there 
was a cabin for overnight stay in the water. Compared to ordinary speedboats, this is many times 
stronger. Obviously, this is what Director Liu came to show off.

Wang Yan is not an irrational person. He put a cigarette in the past and said, “Director Liu, you have 
worked hard. You are too tired to drive yourself.”

“Brother Wang, what are you talking about? You are now a good person. Our ancient town of 
Danghu takes up your glory.” Director Liu pushed the cigarette and said, “I do something for you, 
so I take it for granted. If you do n’t dislike, you should call me old Liu. “

When Wang Yan just wanted to speak.

Little ferret’s hair suddenly exploded, staring at the lake with vigilance and fright, and screamed 
squeakyly.



I saw the lake surface where the microwave was calm, and suddenly a black strong wind blew, and 
for a time the waves rose and the clouds were thick. Wang Yan’s heart tightened heavily, and the 
secret road was not good!

…
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“Huh?” Director Liu said with a strange expression, “Why is this weather so strange today? It was 
fine just now, and the evil wind came up in a blink of an eye.”

Wang Yan frowned, because he felt an angry and repressed breath from the black wind, and gently 
patted the little ferret to appease: “Director Liu, please wait here for a moment.”

Subsequently, Wang Yan ran into the car, lifted the rear seat, and removed the weight and a large 
box from the mezzanine above the chassis.

at the same time.

The fishing boat where the girls were, was beaten violently by the sudden waves, and the thick 
black mist cloud covered a hundred meters, blocking the sun.

“What’s going on?” “It’s getting dark!” “It’s a big storm, I can’t stand it anymore.”

The girls were horrified and inexplicable, and all kinds of panic cries were coming one after 
another.

“Wow!”



A thick column of water was rising from the lake, and a bald man wearing golden scales stepped on 
the water column like a flat ground. He carried a three-pointed, two-edged knife and shouted 
angrily: “You These hateful human beings, the God of the Lake, has been conservatively guarding 
this land and water for 600 years. Why did he kill my virtuous brother while the Ben Lake God 
closed up and practice !?

On the fishing boat, after being shocked for seven or eight seconds, the girls began to scream in a 
variety of ways.

“Gosh, is this filming!” My neighbor is a banshee “? This special effect is worth at least five 
dollars!”

“You stupid, special effects are added later, this is called the scene set. Unexpectedly, this crew is 
willing to spend so much attention on the set, I must have a good look at the drama.”

“How do the dark mist, the wind and the waves, and the water column come true? Are you a science 
girl, glasses girl? I heard that I also read a female doctor. Give science and science to sisters and 
sisters.”

“This …” The glasses sister dripped cold sweat.

“This bald uncle’s face is quite correct, but his lips are thicker, and it’s pretty nice to look at it 
carefully. The acting style is also good, give it a thumbs up.”

A group of girls forgot the bumps, forgot the fear, squeaked in excitement, and had a lot of talk. At 
the same time using the mobile phone, the camera began to snap on the bald man.

“Uncle Bald, take a more domineering posture and look back and I’ll make you a fan.”

The sky is dim and the automatic flashing light keeps flashing.

The bald man raised his hand to block his eyes, and roared and yelled, “What awful women do you 
use to attack the Benhu God? If you don’t stop, you will blame the Benhu God for being rude.” 
Three-pointed two-edged sword in the hands.



He has been closed for a long time in the last sixty or seventy years. He only appeared outside by 
chance. Where have he seen such a battle?

“Uncle ~ You’re quite involved in the show? Enough dedicated work.” Apple-faced girl said with a 
grin, “You are really chic, can you get closer, can we take a selfie?”

“Uncle, we are all little girls, where are women now?” A girl hummed, “Uncle, you are bad, others 
don’t depend on you.”

“Ridiculous, ridiculous.” The bald-headed man stood on the water column and stomped his feet 
angrily. “It should have been a woman and a mother at the age of seeing you. But one by one, it’s 
undressable, and the words are frivolous.

In this way, the girls were not happy. What does it mean to be exposed? Do you want to wrap it into 
a dumpling in summer? What is a woman, a mother? Everyone is a girl who has just graduated from 
university, and life is just beginning.

“Uncle, you’re acting back to acting, not taking you so hurtful.”

“I think it’s a neurosis.”

Just as the girls collectively condemned the bald man, the glasses sister gently pulled Xiaowei who 
had a better relationship and whispered: “Xiaowei, me, I dare to guarantee that this is not a scene 
set.”

“Are you sure?” Xiaowei, who was so worried, naturally would not be as lively and active as they 
were, and she seemed to see a little something wrong, her face pale.

“Of course I’m sure, if the level of special effects in our country can reach this level.” The glasses 
sister took Xiaowei’s hand, and her teeth trembled slightly. “You’ve swept across Asia and crushed 
Hollywood. You , You see behind his ears, okay, it seems, there are gills … “

“Then, what do you mean …” Xiao Wei’s voice trembled, and there was panic in his eyes.

“Lake, Lord Lake God.” The old fisherman who helped the boat did not recover until he was 
shocked for a while. On the deck of the ship, I bowed my head and worshipped, “Li Ren, a 



fisherman in the village of Lugou, honestly worshipped and met Lord Lake God. The villain would 
not dare to be disrespectful to Lord Lake God. A small sacrifice at the boat. Also, I hope Lord God 
of the Lake will be angry. “

The bald-headed man heard a lot of sullen looks: “Li honestly, you are a fisherman. If you don’t 
honestly fish, why do you want to carry these fireworks women on the lake? It’s impossible. For 
decades, the lake **** closed its doors. Is the popular customs around Danghu bad? “

In the memory of the bald man, ordinary women are dressed conservatively and conduct behavioral 
checks. But this group of “women” are all exposed, dressed or enchanted or weird. Several of the 
thighs with white flowers were exposed, and two even had navel eyes outside. Not even the 
firework woman in his memory!

“Smoke, firework girl?” The girls who hadn’t noticed the truth of the incident were really unhappy 
and started scolding.

“Shut up for the lake god.” The bald man was angry, waved his hand, and a column of water rose 
from the lake out of nowhere, and hit the fishing boat.

“boom!”

The fishing boat swayed violently in an instant, and the girls suddenly fell into a halo, screaming. 
Only the glasses girl and Xiaowei, who had been paying attention to it for a long time, grabbed the 
fixed object in advance and did not fall.

“Who dares to speak again, the lake **** throws her down to the lake to feed the fish.” The bald 
man looked powerful and pointed at Li honestly. “You said, who are these women? Why are the 
accent behavior so strange?”

“Qi, Qi Yun, Lord Hushen.” Li honestly bowed down obediently. “They are all girls from the city, 
and they said that they are from the company. Come to our lake, yes, I want to see the swing Lake 
Man God. “

“Danghu male god?” Said the bald man with a strange expression on his face. “Since you want to 
worship the Benhu god, why don’t you bow down? Instead, you are frivolous to the Benhu god.”



“Yes, it’s the male **** of Danghu …” The girl in glasses swallowed a little and said carefully, 
“You’re not Lord Lake God.”

“Ridiculous, there is only one lake **** in Danghu. Where is the male god?” The bald-headed man 
couldn’t reveal his anger. “Can it be the wild demon who flew here when the lake **** closed its 
gates? Is this justified?

“Lake, Lord Lake God. Dang, Danghu male **** is just an ordinary human being.” The glasses girl 
remained rational and decided to save herself, said hardly, “Also, there are. We are not, not 
fireworks women. I, we are, Is a reader. “

The glasses sister analyzed that the knowledge of the **** of the lake and the lake seems to stay in 
the ancient times, and does not know much about the modern situation, and in ancient times, the 
readers were the most respected.

Do you not see Liao Zhai Zhi Yizhong, and all the female demon female ghost Qing Qing me, are 
you all scholars? Don’t worry about ghosts or monsters, all of them pay tribute to the readers.

“Student?” The bald-headed man’s face was astonished. “You are a girl from a wealthy family, and 
you are studying at a girls’ school in the city?” He remembered the era of war and chaos. City Girls’ 
School.

At that time, he had more activities abroad, and many things were not unfamiliar.

“Yes, we all graduated from girls’ school.” The glasses girl said seriously, “I started studying at the 
age of six. I have been studying in elementary school for four years, junior high school for five 
years, university for four years, and graduate students. Two years, three years of doctorate. Only 
twenty-four years old this year, but after reading eighteen years, she is a female doctor with eight 
children. “

Reading eighteen years?

The bald man has a sense of awe and respect. This must be a learned woman. Doctor, yes, female 
doctor. It sounds very tall.

“This female doctor is polite.” The bald man treated her kindly.



“Lord God is polite.” The spectacled woman relieved herself secretly. Sure enough, some guys with 
classical thinking still have some cultural worship.

The rest of the girls also felt that something was wrong, and it didn’t matter anyway. They talked 
about how many years they have read and are serious college students.

Where did the bald man expect that college students are now worthless? Apart from being amazed, 
he laughed aloud: “Well, since you are all talents, take the lake **** to take you all down, and you 
are not afraid of the **** who dares to kill me.

Suddenly, the dense black mist swirled violently, forming a huge vortex.

what’s the situation?

Yingyingyanyan have lost their looks. This, this bald uncle, is it really Lake God? And also kidnap 
them! What happened to this world?

“Honestly, Li, go to the government office and let the government office immediately issue a 
notice!” Said the bald-headed man loudly. “To save these precious female doctors and female 
university students. Just capture the Benhu God and dare to kill my catfish brother The murderer 
came to redeem the hostages on Huxin Island. Otherwise, he would blame the lake **** for turning 
his heart ruthlessly. “

He said nothing, rolled up a dark cloud, and stepped on the water quickly. As for the eight girls, 
they were wrapped in black clouds and thick fog, and no one was seen.

“Carefully, strictly abide by the law of the lake god, the purpose of the law.” Li honestly looked 
ashamed and sweaty.

…
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“Om ~~”

A white fishing boat galvanized several feet of water to the edge of the fishing boat. Sitting in the 
cabin, Wang Yan has already set up a giant sniper rifle, with a thick barrel for the rice bowl and 
bowl, majestic and majestic.

The situation forced Wang Yan to play a twelve-point spirit. From the feedback of the little ferret, 
and his rough judgment, this new monster is not only a D-class catfish essence.

“Fellow, I saw the thick clouds here just now.” Director Liu of the police station shouted while 
steering the steering wheel of the fishing boat. “What the **** happened?”

Director Liu was also surprised by a series of things, first the strange vision in the lake. Secondly, 
Wang Yan took out a terrible weapon, and ordered him to help him by the side, helping to sail the 
boat.

At the same time, Wang Yan also revealed his true identity. A member of the National Bureau of 
Abnormal Incident Security, is now temporarily recruiting him, the director of the police station, to 
assist him.

National African Bureau!

Director Liu has lived for most of his life and has never heard of this department. But soon, Wang 
Yan called Secretary Tian. Then Secretary Tian personally ordered him to obey Wang Yan’s 
command.

Moreover, Secretary Tian said that he would immediately notify the armed police forces to evacuate 
tourists from the ancient town of Danghu and blockades the entrances and exits extensively to avoid 
accidents.

This shocked Director Liu and had to honestly listen to Wang Yan’s dispatch.

“It’s a lake, Lord Lake God.” Li honestly knelt on the deck and shouted slightly, “Master Lake God 
showed his spirit.”



“What a mess !?” Director Liu said with mighty anger. “I am the police station director Liu Baomin. 
Tell me honestly, what happened?” Liu Baomin, as the director of the Danghu ancient town police 
station, naturally heard of Danghu Lake Legend of God.

But as a party member, he certainly does not believe in such absurd rumors. At least, it seems 
unbelievable.

Sure enough, the director of the police station is still quite deterrent in the eyes of ordinary people. 
Li honestly was scared back to the soul, and then stuttered to tell what happened just now.

“Ridiculous, it’s ridiculous.” Liu Baomin just wanted to blame Li when he heard the scalp tingling. 
Wang Yan stopped him, and then let him drive the boat in the direction that Li honestly pointed.

“Brother Wang, wouldn’t you really believe that there is a lake god?” Liu Baomin said while 
swallowing the boat, “This is all nonsense from the villagers. How can there be any gods, ghosts, 
and ghosts?” “

While speaking, he also sneaked a glance at Wang Yan’s “giant gun”. Is this really a gun? How to 
look like a gun. What exactly do you want to fight, you need to use such exaggerated weapons?

Wang Yan ignored him, but picked up the satellite phone with a heavy face, dialed the headquarters 
phone, and quickly connected Feng Yuande: “Master, something happened. In addition to the catfish 
essence, there is one more powerful in the lake. The monster. According to preliminary judgment, it 
is a monster who owns the realm. “

“Domain level !?” Feng Yuande originally had a leisurely tone, and his time became heavy. “Xiao 
Yan, a monster who can master the domain, at least a B-level evaluation, far from what you can deal 
with. You must not be greedy. Go ahead and wait for the follow-up support on the spot. “

“Senior man, that monster claims to be the God of Lake Danghu.” Wang Yan said in a voice, 
“According to some of the information I collected, he is a carp sperm. And near the Lake Dang, the 
word of mouth is very good, it should not be that kind. A fierce, unreasonable monster. He made a 
big splash this time because he killed his young catfish cub. So he entrapped eight female tourists in 
order to force me to appear as a murderer. “

Wang Yan said the follow-up of the matter originally.



“I don’t care whether the monster is good or evil. In short, you leave Lao Tzu in the safe and wait 
for reinforcements.” Feng Yuande said solemnly and seriously, “Wang Yan. You have to remember 
that we are an organization, not a hero in spite of everything. The individual of the doctrine. Your 
life, Wang Yan, belongs not only to yourself, but also to the country and the people. “

“Yes, I get it.” Wang Yan gestured to Liu Baomin and stopped him. I also answered seriously, 
“Senior man, I promise not to be impulsive. But you can’t deduct me from the mission merits. I am 
now too poor to owe six million units.”

“Your boy!” Feng Yuande said with a dumb smile. “Don’t think I don’t know that Wu Xiuxin and 
Wei Wei donated your 10 million dollars to buy equipment. You are so bold that you dare to 
threaten civilians. Forget it, anyway. The two are not good things. As soon as they have contributed 
to the country, I am too lazy to care about your kid. In addition, you can rest assured that you have 
found an unregistered wild monster and should be the leader of the mission. If you Can convince 
the monster to surrender in the course of the mission, the merit value must be your highest. “

Wang Yan was overjoyed: “Thank you for your advice.” After hanging up the phone, Wang Yan 
directed Liu Baomin to go to the lake. There you can attack and retreat. It’s really not possible, but 
it can still run to the shore.

Although the carp essence has the field, it is only an aquatic monster after all, how much combat 
power can it exert on the shore? Maybe he can get rid of him with one shot and one hammer.

In the lake bay, Liu Baomin said with a pale complexion, smoking: “Wang, brother Wang. Then, 
that lake **** is really, really a monster?”

“Yes, it should be a very powerful monster.” Wang Yan also smoked and said, “Why, Director Liu, 
are you afraid? If you are afraid, you can go back first.”

“Afraid! Of course I’m afraid.” Liu Baomin smoked a fierce cigarette. “But as a policeman, I dare 
not say how clean I am. But at least, as a policeman, there are still some responsibilities. This piece 
is mine. Jurisdiction. Now that such a big thing is happening, no matter whether it is responsibility 
or conscience, I ca n’t go. Is n’t it a monster? I do n’t believe he can go up to heaven. “

In fact, he knew better that if he dared to take a step back at this critical moment, then his career 
would be completely over. The best ending is also to be transferred to the game to hang out, and 
then eat and wait for retirement.



“Old Liu, I can’t see that you are still a bit bloody.” Wang Yan smiled and patted him on the 
shoulder. “It’s like a policeman. We eat public meals. We can’t retreat when we are in danger. . “

“Nonsense, I had just been a policeman. I have been angry and young …” Liu Baomin grumbled 
angrily.

“Oh. Anyway, idle and idle, fishing and quiet.” Wang Yan turned out two sets of lures from the 
fishing boat cabin. Set one by one and start fishing.

“Brother Wang, I am convinced. Your calmness is really ashamed of me.” Affected by Wang Yan, 
Liu Baomin also calmed down a lot. “I grew up by the water, these two years Also played Luya. “

Then the two started playing Luya on the lake.

To say that Danghu’s aquatic resources are still very rich, within three hours, Wang Yan came on the 
road with three big billfish, the largest of which reached one meter and weighed more than ten 
pounds.

Liu Bao’s anger is also good, two three or four pounds of splayed mouth, and the car accident hook 
came up with a large catfish weighing more than ten pounds. The so-called car accident is because 
the original silver carp did not eat lure bait. It was accidentally caught by Luya’s fish hook and 
happened to be hooked.

Little Ferret is used to eating Wang Yan’s grilled fish these days, and his mouth is so greedy that he 
jumps up and down and squeaks and asks Wang Yan to grill fish. Wang Yan had no way to grind it, 
so he cleaned up his mouth slightly. With both palms and his luck, the two groups of flames 
wrapped it up.

“This …” Liu Baomin could stare out his eyes, “Wang, Brother Wang! You, this is a special 
function?”

“Oh, anyway, you are also an insider now. If you don’t have any special skills, how can you join the 
National African Affairs Bureau and deal with abnormal affairs?” Wang Yan said indifferently.



In fact, Liu Baomin knew the National African Affairs Bureau and took part in this task. Looking 
back, there will definitely be a special staff to educate him on confidentiality. Wang Yan was too 
lazy to hide and tuck, and used the flame to grill the fish.

But then again, since acquiring the flame ability, Wang Yan has not used it in actual combat once. 
But in the career of lighting cigarettes and roasting fish, he is moving away.

Wang Yan, who was already able to master the fire, was able to take control of the flames. Once the 
flames in his palms were over, a ten-pound roasted fish tender in the outer coke was just fine. The 
skin color is golden, the fragrance is overflowing, the meat is tender and juicy.

Wang Yan was deeply moved with emotion, and when he retired and had nothing to do, it seemed to 
be a good idea to open a grilled fish shop.

Just as two people and one mink started to enjoy grilled fish, the roar of the engines of the three 
armed helicopters appeared in the field of vision. Within minutes, the helicopter reached the sky.

“Wow!”

Before the helicopter landed, a white figure emerged from the helicopter. He was extremely fast, 
with a distance of hundreds of meters within a few seconds.

Then, his face with a cruel emergency stop hovering above the fishing boat, a pair of snow-white 
wings slowly flapping the air.

Liu Baomin was dumbfounded at the same time. Wang Yan also froze, this, is this a joke? This, this 
is the follow-up reinforcement?

Lei Bang!

Boom brother! No, yeah ~

Wang Yan’s mind was full of memories of him. The man who drank a few bottles of Erguotou and 
ran to the table for a big striptease dance, madly showing the unnatural rhythm of the bottom line.
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However, the thunder at this time is completely two extreme states when drunk. He has a sharp 
eyebrow and a cold face, and he continues to wear a dazzling male white suit.

The lake wind blew his long blond hair back and swayed slightly.

“Lead the way.” Lei Hong’s voice was calm without half a touch of emotion. He glanced at Wang 
Yan lightly without any strange appearance.

This breath! ? While Wang Yan was eating grilled fish, he was speechless. A few days ago, when I 
ate brother’s trotters, my brother and his elder brother were short, so they had to bow to themselves. 
As soon as this wine wakes up, it turns over and does not recognize anyone?

“Squeak ~” Holding a fragrant grilled fish, the little ferret eating happily glanced at him angrily. 
The attitude was very disdainful, and pointed to Wang Yan, “twitter.”

Its expression is very clear, what is the murderer of alcoholism wings? This task is led by Lord Yan.

God, angel!

Director Liu Baomin is going to faint. Although it may be a freak concentration camp for the 
National African Affairs Bureau, it is already psychologically prepared. However, when an angel-
like guy appeared, he still defeated his belief in life.

But before he got dizzy, he jumped out of the helicopter, a long-haired woman in an OL suit.

Fortunately, this woman is quite normal, without wings!

But the moment she was about to fall into the water, it was contrary to physics, and the speed of 
falling suddenly slowed down. At the same time, a cold bitter frost filled her.

“Wow!”



A water column spewed out of the lake. When the water column touched the bottom of her foot, it 
quickly condensed into a icicle. The ice continued to spread along the icicles, and within a few 
seconds, a thick layer of ice had formed in the water within a radius of more than ten meters.

She was wearing black super sunglasses, standing on the icicle so beautifully, her hair fluttering like 
a fairy. But this fairy is wearing a cool OL suit, like the beauty president of a big company.

“Sister Nanlian.” Wang Yan said with a happy expression, “I didn’t expect the old man to send you, 
and the carp was dead.”

Carp essence should be a B-level evaluation, and sister Nan Lian is also a B-level master who has 
mastered the ice field. If she cooperates, it is not a problem for a carp essence to collapse.

Nan Lian, who was in a cold atmosphere, raised a smile in his mouth when facing Wang Yan: “The 
death of the old man urged me and Lei Hong to speed up, just because you are young and 
impulsive. A monster of class B. I didn’t expect you to be quite honest and comfortable. You are 
comfortable fishing and grilling fish here. “

“I’m not ignorant of the stunned head. Seeing the oppression of Sister Nanlian’s aura, I know how 
powerful the monsters rated B are. When it comes to grilling fish, would Sister Nanlian try it?” 
Wang Yan He smiled and said, “I have roasted the fish until the fire is perfect in the past few days.”

“Wait until you finish the task.” Nan Lian glanced at Lei Hong lightly and said, “Otherwise this guy 
will go mad. The old man sent us this time, mainly to help you fight, everything is dominated by 
you. Mission. The monster of class B, killing or catching, depends on you. “

Sure enough, it was good to say hello to Mr. Feng in advance. Otherwise, as soon as the strong 
reinforcements arrive, they will directly take over the tasks that they first discovered, and there is no 
reason to talk about them.

This is a B-level task. The merits are astronomical.

Next, under the command of Wang Yan, the fishing boat headed for the destination Huxin Island. 
The three armed helicopters are in the shape of a letter and follow behind.



Each armed helicopter is loaded with a 23mm machine gun, although its single power is far from 
comparable to Wang Yan’s sniper gun. But with its advantage in speed of fire, its power should not 
be underestimated.

In addition, the helicopter also hangs two quadruple-mounted anti-tank missile nests and two seven-
packed rocket gun nests.

For hard fire support, it is very fierce.

It can also be reflected from this that Father Feng attaches great importance to Wang Yan’s task this 
time.

The army pressed against the lake’s heart island, and it was magnificent. At the same time, 
Secretary Tian also called to say that the armed police forces have all been in place and the 
blockade has been completed on all roads.

Most of the tourists in Danghu Ancient Town were withdrawn to the urban area and placed in 
hotels. Most of the speedboats and fishing boats playing in Danghu were also recruited back.

Of course, the entire operation was given the name of disaster prevention drill. As for tourists, 
believe it or not, Wang Yan can’t take care of it. He is a front-line combatant and is responsible for 
the combat component, not the secret service personnel handling follow-up matters. All he can do is 
eliminate the enemy as soon as possible and protect the safety of the people’s property.

…

at the same time.

On Huxin Island, on a cliff near the water.

The eight girls sat together in a trembling manner, staring at each other, and they all saw the fear in 
their eyes.

The matter is quite clear now. The bald man in golden scales standing on the edge of the cliff like a 
sculpture is clearly a legendary monster.



Not only would he scream wind and rain, but he would also blow out a strange black wind, which 
would wrap them up on the desert island.

This gives the impression that it is like a monster in the Journey to the West who likes to encase the 
girl. If you look closely, you can still see the gills behind his ears and the golden scales on his neck.

The bald man’s breath is very dignified, giving a strong sense of depression.

As for the girls ’mobile phones and other electronic products, they were confiscated by the bald 
man. The reason is that these instruments are so weird that they cannot be carried around.

In fact, it is useless even if it is carried. There is no signal base station for this kind of desert island 
where there is no shop before the village.

“Xiaowei, you, you said this monster. Will you eat it and eat us?” The apple-faced girl tremblingly 
lowered her voice and said, “I, I heard that monsters are all cannibals.”

“Don’t talk nonsense, we have to believe in the government and the country.” Xiao Wei said with a 
pale face, “I believe that government departments will not ignore this kind of thing.”

“Yeah, but this is a monster.” The apple-faced girl said desperately, “It’s not a general kidnapper. 
Woo, I haven’t married a man yet, I haven’t hugged a male **** yet. So dead , It’s a pity. “

“Xiao Yun.” The glasses sister pushed the frame and said, “Since there is a monster in this world, 
then theoretically there will be a second and a third. It can also be inferred that there are monsters in 
our world. Normal events. “

“Sister glasses, what do you mean?”

“It’s very simple, since there are monsters that are the norm, and now it is humans who rule the 
world.” The glasses girl said confidently, “then it can be inferred that there must be organizations or 
institutions that specialize in fighting monsters among humans.



“I know, it must be the Heavenly Master of Demons and Demons, Maoshan School, Shaolin Temple 
…” The apple-faced girl prayed with bright eyes. “No matter who it is, please come quickly …”

Suddenly, at this moment.

A few black spots appeared in the sky, and after a while, the roar of the helicopter’s wings rang 
away.

“Huh?” The bald man, who had been quiet for a while, raised his eyebrows, a little puzzled. What 
are the monsters flying in the sky?

“Helicopter, the government helicopter is here to save us.” The Apple-faced girl whispered 
excitedly, praying that it really worked. Then, she began to pray in a low voice, I want to be 
embraced by the male god, I want to be embraced by the male god.

“Chicken?”

The bald man curled his eyebrows and snorted coldly: “Whether it’s a helicopter or a dog, the lake 
**** has been doing it for six hundred years. Will he be afraid of you?”

…

Wang Yan’s ship was very fast, and in less than fifteen minutes, he reached the periphery of Huxin 
Island on the GPS map. From his point of view, Huxin Island is just an ordinary island. On the outer 
side of the island, there are broad reeds. The island is lined with trees, lush, and flourishing birds. In 
addition to the flocks of egrets flying in groups, from time to time there will be a group of mallards 
flying from the reeds, stepping on the water.

Liu Baomin drove the fishing boat with enthusiasm, rolled up a wave of flowers on the lake, and 
walked around the lake. The previous fear of monsters has long disappeared.

Think about it, the three masters of the National African Affairs Bureau are present, and they are 
supported by armed helicopters full of missiles. A monster, can it be turned upside down?

This other Liu Baomin assisted throughout the process, without credit or hard work? There is no 
limit to the future.



Wang Yan’s eyesight was extraordinary, and from afar he saw a strange person standing on the cliff. 
His appearance and the fisherman Lee Honest portrayed the God of Danghu Lake did not differ.

Directing Liu Baomin to lean over and stop more than 30 meters away, he shouted loudly: “Are you 
the God of Danghuhuhu? Have you heard of the National Bureau of Abnormal Incident Security?”

The bald man poked the handle of the three-pointed, two-edged knife on the ground and shouted in 
response: “I haven’t heard of that game. Are you a man in the government?”

Official, official manpower! ?

Wang Yan slipped with a drop of cold sweat. How many years has this carp essence not been in 
contact with the outside world?
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But think about it, according to intelligence from previous investigations, Lake God has rarely 
appeared in recent decades. It was more active in the Ming and Qing Dynasties, leaving many 
legends.

So his thoughts are relatively old, but it is reasonable.

Of course, there was also a fight against the Japanese army that time, it seems to have been quite 
violent. In the end, the Japanese army walked around the lake, so Wang Yan still had some good 
feelings about this carp essence.

“Yes, I am from the mansion.” Wang Yan can pass the sound in this open land without using a 
loudspeaker. “Hushen, I have heard of your deeds and have been conscientiously maintaining. 
People around Danghu Lake. Why do you want to be so impulsive this time to do something 
illegal? You let the people go and everything is easy to discuss. “



“Very good, it’s really the government mansion. No, the people of the government come to save 
us.” The girls all wept with excitement.

“This, this voice …” Xiao Wei’s face was slightly white, and there was an incredible look in his 
eyes.

“Huh? The man talking on the ship, it seems …” Although the silhouette was blurred after several 
tens of meters. But the apple-faced girl, her eyes lit up, “It seems like the goddess of the lake.”

“Really? Is it really the goddess Danghu who came to rescue us?” The other girls stared at Wang 
Yan from afar. I do n’t know if it ’s conjecture or what the situation is.

As they talked and talked, the bald man turned back and glared: “Shut up, otherwise the lake **** 
will throw you down to the lake to feed the fish and fish.”

The fierce look on the face scared the girls one after another. They remembered their identity as 
hostages now, and showed fear in their eyes.

The bald man shouted again to the lake: “You also said that the **** of the lake has always been 
guarding the side and protecting the people’s safety. Why do you humans kill me the catfish sage? If 
you know, you will take the murderer to me. Otherwise, Hugh blames Ben Lake God for turning his 
head ruthlessly. “

“Oh, are you talking about the cannibal catfish?” Wang Yan said aloud, “The murderer doesn’t have 
to catch it because it’s right in front of you.”

“What !?” It took a few seconds for the bald-headed man to be angry, “You mean, you killed my 
catfish brother?”

“The catfish essence attacked humans and violated the principle of peaceful coexistence of the 
shemales. I slaughtered it, and it was reasonable and legal.” Wang Yan said calmly, “Carp essence, I 
think that you have always been kind to people and protect the one side. If you kidnap eight girls 
and threaten the government, I have the right to blow you up. “

“Wow wow wow, you bullshit, my catfish sage won’t eat people. I’m so angry …” The bald man 
grabbed a three-pointed two-edged knife and jumped from a cliff over ten meters high.



Before his feet landed, the surrounding lake water surged, and the impact formed a water column to 
hold him high. The bald man stepped on the water with his feet on his feet, roaring toward Wang 
Yan with a roar, “I’m going to take your head on the head and sacrifice my virtuous brother.”

Wang Yan ’s face did n’t change at all, and Shen Sheng said: “Since you ’re obsessed, do n’t blame 
me for being welcome. Start, fire!”

Before coming, Wang Yan had already planned. To persuade, it is definitely necessary. But looking 
at ancient and modern China and foreign countries, Wang Yan has not heard that the strong will 
surrender to the weak.

and so. We must show our strength and show our fists to the enemy. No matter in what era, the 
statement that the fist is the truth is never wrong.

As Wang Yan’s words fell, three armed helicopters opened fire at the same time.

“Da da da!”

The 23-mm machine gun bullets, intertwined at a rate of hundreds of rounds per minute, poured 
towards the carp. Large-caliber bullets in the air, drawn a bright red drag light.

“Gun? What’s the use of guns !?” Carp Jing snorted coldly, and suddenly a blue barrier like a wave 
formed around his body, forming a thick shield.

From the point of view of Leiyu Jing, when he destroyed a Japanese unit, he learned the power of 
guns. At that time, the self-cultivation was not as high as it is now, but as soon as the “Kwai Water 
Guard” came out, those bullets could not get close.

Wang Yan’s eyes also shined, knowing that the monster who owns the domain will not be that 
simple. But I didn’t expect that it would be able to cast a general spell, condensing the domain 
barrier.

I just do n’t know if the 23mm cannon bullet can penetrate that weak barrier.



All ideas are just in one thought.

咄咄 咄 ~ Several machine gun bullets have already hit the Kwai Shui protective wall, making a dull 
impact. The speed of the warhead suddenly diminished, splashing a cyan “water splash”.

Wang Yan’s increasingly dynamic vision captured such a scene. Although the 23mm bullet was 
blocked, it still used strong kinetic energy to penetrate the blue barrier and bombarded his golden 
scale armor.

Bang Bang Bang Bang!

With a few muffled sounds, the carp seems to have been hit with a few punches, stepping 
backwards on the water. There were several fist-sized craters on the majestic golden scales.

For the remaining bullets, every bullet hit the water and a high splash was splashed. Other bullets 
hit the bare reef, and the reef was torn apart and the debris flew across.

The carp was so disbelief that he could n’t believe it. When fighting with the Japanese, the bullets 
could not penetrate his Kwai water wall. These guns were so powerful that they almost penetrated 
even his golden scale armor, which had been cultivating for hundreds of years.

You should know that this armor is the gold scale of his natal life that has fallen off for many years. 
Collect the refined baby of natal life, soft in the middle and hard in the middle. I don’t know how 
many times the protective power exceeds ordinary fine iron.

Where can he expect the rapid development of human weapons? With a 23mm cannon, armored 
vehicles can also penetrate, and the aircraft can also be shot down.

“Suddenly ~”

The three machine gun bullets blasted a splash of water and continued to chase after the carp spirit. 
Where do you dare to carry the carp essence after a big loss? Stepping on the surface of the water 
keeps moving around.

His speed is extremely fast, like a golden afterimage on the water. Occasionally a bullet was hit, but 
it was just a stagger, it didn’t matter.



Although it has long been expected that the B-level powerhouse is not that simple, but it is such a 
scene. Wang Yan was still dumbfounded and palpitated. So strong …

No wonder, the starting merit of a B-level mission is 500 points, which is five times that of ordinary 
C-level missions. This is not an exaggeration. If Wang Yan has a choice, he would rather do five C-
level tasks than face a B-level monster.

However, the 23mm cannon bullet can cause some damage to the carp. Well, with his protective 
power, he can’t stop his 50mm super sniper rifle.

Wang Yan already has some preliminary concepts about the strength of the B-level monsters. No 
wonder the coquette said that after growing the third tail, the world can go wherever he goes.

If the B-level monster intends to escape, it is really not very easy to deal with.

“Ahh ~ Damn it!” The carp spirit, who was chased by three machine guns like maggots, was 
furious. There was an instantaneous black wind blowing around, just a few seconds, and a layer of 
black mist enveloped a few hundred meters.

The sun was blocked, and the light on the lake within the range became extremely dim.

“Fluffy ~”

The searchlights of the three armed helicopters turned on and continued to stare at the carp on the 
lake.

“Try a rocket launcher!” Wang Yan commanded through the headset.

“Receive, aim at the enemy and fire!”

“咻咻 咻 ~” Three armed helicopters fired rocket shells at almost the same time. A total of six 
rockets dragged a long flame tail in the dark and directly hit the surface target.



Boom!

In a series of violent explosions, the splash splashed into the air, and it was like a heavy rain. The 
fishing boat tens of meters away was also violently turbulent by the turbulent waves and almost 
turned over.

I don’t know if I was hit from the front, but I saw the carp body flew out of a dozen meters by the 
shock wave and fell into the water with a pop.

“Damn monster!”

He was extremely tenacious and finally broke out completely. After a roar, his body twisted for a 
while, and his original shape suddenly appeared.

“Coax!”

A golden carp that is more than eight meters long, like the size of a yacht, jumped out of the water 
and crashed into the water. Huge water splashed more than ten meters high, and ripples formed a 
huge wave spreading out in all directions.

“I’m just going to do it.” Wang Yan was speechless. Although he had expected it for a long time, if 
he really saw the original form of carp, he couldn’t help but feel shocked.

This physique can keep up with the whales in the sea. The catfish essence was fierce enough before, 
but compared to this carp essence, it was as small as a baby.

Moreover, Wang Yan has every reason to believe that even if the overlord whale in the sea touches 
him, it is estimated that he was shot to death a few times.

“puff!”

The carp’s wide, thick mouth spouted a thick water column in the water tank and drove straight 
towards the helicopter in midair. He hated the abominable “helicopters” and gave him a lot of 
suffering.



“Sister Nanlian, pay attention to the rescue!”

Wang Yan’s heart tightened and he whispered.

“Reassure.” Sister Nan Lian, who took off her sunglasses, had two ice-colored swirls in her eyes. 
Suddenly he jumped out of the helicopter and went straight to the water column. The silver bracelet 
on his wrist burst into a cold awn, and in a flash, a kite-shaped ice shield was supported on her left 
wrist.

Say it sooner or later.

Sister Nanlian even hit the water column with a shield, and blocked it all. The impact of the water 
column supported her suspension in mid-air. Time seemed to freeze and freeze, sister Nan Lian’s 
eyes glowed, her hair fluttered with the wind, and her majesty was majestic.

…
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The splashing waterdrops, like a torrential rain in the surrounding area. It fell slightly on the face 
and body.

There is a gap between the strong B-level and the C-level.

Wang Yan also understood that with the power of modern weapons, why should he recruit the 
strong to join the State Administration of African Affairs to enforce the law? The reason is that what 
we see is that modern weapons are indeed very strong, which can cause lethal damage to the B-level 
monsters. But if three armed helicopters were to be used alone to deal with this carp sperm, the only 
ending would be to destroy them.

It is no wonder that a small group of Japanese soldiers of the 100th will be completely destroyed in 
the lake, and later, the Japanese headquarters will also be able to lose sight of things here.



If there is no corresponding superpower to suppress, relying on the ordinary army alone, it is too 
difficult to deal with.

This is only a monster rated B, so it is so difficult to deal with. According to the naming rules, there 
must be stronger B + level monsters, even A level monsters.

Although Wang Yan has never seen a Class A strongman, I believe that in the eyes of Class A 
strongmen, these powerful gunships are no different from toys.

“Break me!”

Nanlian, who was almost in the air, sighed dullly, and the water column condensed into an icicle. 
Being slammed by Nanlian, the icicles turned into countless fragments and instead enveloped 
towards the carp essence on the water.

The borneol was like a blade, hitting the carp’s fine gold scales, and cut a wound.

The carp spirit mourned and sank into the lake. A huge water wave was drawn on the water surface, 
and he directly rushed to Wang Yan’s fishing boat. Obviously at this moment, he had not forgotten 
to avenge the catfish elder brother.

“Humph!”

A dull cold hum sounded, and Lei Hong spread his wings and fell from the sky like a lightning, 
hitting the water with a punch. In an instant, a bright silver current wriggled through the water 
precisely, and the target pointed directly at the carp essence.

“Wow ~”

The carp essence, as strong as a whale, was lifted up from the water by electricity and jumped tens 
of meters high. Originally Jin Cancan, the majestic fish scales, there were scars everywhere at this 
time, and it was blackened by electricity.



This is the first time Wang Yan has seen Lei Bang’s shot. Sure enough, this guy’s strength is not that 
simple. The momentum that erupted from the whole body was nothing more than that of Nanlian 
who had evolved to B level.

In addition to his flying ability, he also has the power of thunder and lightning. This ability is 
simply the nemesis of aquatic organisms, and the power of electricity in water is much stronger than 
in the air.

Sure enough, we have a lot of talents in the National African Bureau.

Nan Lian fell straight into the water from the air, her feet stomped on the water, and she leaned 
forward halfway forward. Every time a step was taken, the water surface under her feet quickly 
condensed into ice.

When the long hair was flying, the palms were filled with cold fog and pushed to the surface of the 
water. While the lake water was swaying upwards, the creaky coagulated into a white ice cone.

In just a few seconds, she made a tens of meters square ice block, on the surface of the ice block, 
there is a cold ice cone.

“Boom!”

The huge carp was hit on the ice and smashed together with the ice cone. Water splashes, ice cubes 
flying all over the sky, floating and floating in the water with the waves.

Poor carp spirit, seven or eight holes were drilled by ice cones on his body. Half-floating on the 
water, the blood stained the surface of the lake, obviously was not hurt lightly.

“Master Lake God, can we talk now?” Wang Yan held the sniper cannon and said aloud, “Don’t be 
convinced, I have already shown mercy to my men just now. I don’t believe you see the power of 
my gun.”

Wang Yan said, firing a shot at a bare one-man high rock by the lake.

The sound of the gunshot stunned the ears. The bullet hit the rock like a galloping meteor in the dim 
environment.



Boom ~ The upper half of the rock was directly twisted into rubble by giant bullets, and it fell on 
the water surface, splashing countless splashes. At the same time, the fishing boat ate recoil and slid 
a few meters back.

Even prepared Liu Baomin was almost thrown out of the ship by shock.

With this gun, Wang Yan did not dare to cross it on the ship. Not to mention that the length is not 
enough, the strong recoil may turn the fishing boat sideways.

I originally wanted to resist the carp essence again. The eyes of the fish in the basin were glared, 
and the face of the fish showed a personified surprise. Obviously, the power of Wang Yan’s super 
sniper rifle is not something he can resist.

Not only the carp essence, but Lei Hong and Nan Lian were also taken aback. At their level, as long 
as they are prepared, ordinary firearms are not effective.

But the power of this sniper rifle is clearly beyond the scope of ordinary people can understand.

“How? Just now I was going to shoot you in the head while I was flying in the air.” Wang Yan said 
with a smile, “I can guarantee you are now a dead body.”

The carp is reluctant to reappear as a humanoid. It was only at this moment that he no longer had 
the former golden armor and his majesty.

The golden scales were covered with potholes and scars everywhere, and even the bright head was 
black, and the corners of the mouth were covered with blood. Some dissatisfied mouths grunted: 
“You are ruthless. You can take away these precious female doctors and female college students.”

“I said Lord Lake God, don’t you think that’s the matter?” Wang Yan lighted a cigarette and said 
leisurely.

“Of course it won’t be the case. My hatred of the catfish hasn’t been reported yet.” Carp King 
Hengmei said angrily.



Wang Yan was almost choked, and said angrily: “Your carp essence is really an elm pimple head. If 
you really want to avenge me, why do you say it at this time? You are not afraid that I will kill you 
with one shot. , Let’s get rid of the grass? “

“Kill kill, I’m afraid you won’t succeed.” The carp said with impatience.

“Come on, it’s because of your loyalty and doing a lot of good deeds.” Wang Yan shook his head 
helplessly, “I will explain one or two with you, Xiaoxue, and show him the video.”

“Squeak ~” Little Ferret pulled out his phone and played a video of the beheaded catfish.

“This is …” Lei Jingjing ran over the water, looked at it several times, scratched his head and 
wondered, “What is this?”

No culture is terrible! If it was n’t for him to guard the party, it ’s honest. I really wanted to kill him 
a hundred times in a shot, and I can get an extra B-level inner dan.

Even though Wang Yan has never seen a B-level inner dan, he knows that the B-level inner dan is 
far more valuable than the C-level inner dan.

However, these two goods killed the Japanese detachment during the war of resistance against 
Japan and guarded one side of the soil and water. Wang Yan was really unable to deal with him. He 
had to patiently explain to him.

Also demonstrated the video function several times with the mobile phone. And it was said that the 
fishermen had heard from the fishermen that the catfish essence had not attacked human beings for 
the first time.

If he still does not believe it, he can find a fisherman to face off on the spot.

The carp essence, who understood the truth, said angrily: “A catfish dares to eat people, and it is a 
disaster in the hometown. Not only that, but it has always lied to me that when I retreat, I will help 
the people around Zhaohu Lake. Really You’re the worst, you don’t kill it, I will kill it myself. I’m 
sorry, little brother, I didn’t get the truth … Fortunately … “he looked annoyed during the speech.



“Since the misunderstanding has been solved, it’s okay.” Wang Yan said, patting his shoulder 
indifferently. “Actually, I admire you too. Ever since I opened my mind, I have been shining on the 
people along the lake for six hundred years. Unwilling to have an endless conflict with you. “

“Actually, it’s nothing.” Carpfish said with some blushing, “When I was wise, I was caught by a 
fisherman and sold to the town. Fortunately, a rich young lady had mercy and bought me After the 
release. Because I am grateful to her, she has been caressing her clan descendants. Gradually, 
everyone regards me as a lake god, and sacrifices every year. So, I will help you with what I can do. 
“

“It turns out you are still a monster with a story.” Wang Yan smiled. “But the story is touching. 
Since you have committed something, you have to accept the legal sanctions of our country.”

Liu Baomin, who was on the side, saw it today and couldn’t help but faint. Our National African 
Bureau is really a cow, and even monsters must abide by the law.
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